Demolition of Blighted/Unsafe Structures - Phase 2
IFB#10-1850DC
Bid Tabulation

de 2122 Third St. E, |2622 & 2622A Fifth| 2503 Sixth Ave E, [2816 Seventh St. E, 523 21st St E,
I er Bradenton St East, Bradenton Palmetto Bradenton Palmetto
Cheaves Masonry &
Construction, Palmetto, || S 7,300.00 | S 7,300.00 | S 2,300.00 | S 3,500.00 3,500.00
FL
Forristall Enterprises,
i S 5,920.00 | S 5,670.00 | S 4,650.00 | $ 5,370.00 4,540.00
Palmetto, FL
J Michael Group,
! up S 6,400.00 | S 6,700.00 | S 3,750.00 | S 3,900.00 3,800.00
Palmetto, FL
Kimmins Contracting,
& S 9,030.00 | S 8,225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Creative Homes of
Central FL, St. S 8,300.00 | S 9,400.00 | S 2,600.00 | S 7,300.00 3,800.00
Petersburg, FL
Environmental
Construction Inc, S 5,295.00 | S 5,790.00 | S 3,130.00 | $ 3,460.00 2,840.00
Tampa, FL
G & S Construction,
uett $ 6,975.00 | $ 6,310.00 | ¢ 3,490.00 | $ 4,110.00 3,620.00
Bradenton, FL
RQ Land Services Inc,
S 7,600.00 | S 9,600.00 | $ 3,600.00 | S 6,100.00 3,100.00
Bradenton, FL
Tri-Tech Construction,
' uett $ 8,300.00 | $ 8,300.00 | $ 3,610.00 | $ 3,910.00 3,650.00

Bradenton, FL
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Demolition of Blighted/Unsafe Structures - Phase 2
IFB#10-1850DC
Bid Tabulation

610 21st St. E.,

508 25th Ave. E.,

3518 27th St. E,

604 30th St. E.,

11805 71st St. E,,

Bidder Palmetto Bradenton Bradenton Palmetto Parrish
Cheaves Masonry &
Construction, Palmetto, 3,000.00 | S 3,100.00 No Bid 4,100.00 | $ 2,300.00
FL
Forristall Enterprises,
P 3,620.00 | S 3,980.00 | S 4,590.00 4,640.00 | S 3,750.00
Palmetto, FL
J Michael Group,
! P 4,100.00 | 3,700.00 | $ 4,200.00 4,100.00 | 2,700.00
Palmetto, FL
Kimmins Contracting, . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Creative Homes of
Central FL, St. 3,900.00 | S 2,300.00 | S 5,600.00 5,800.00 | S 2,650.00
Petersburg, FL
Environmental
Construction Inc, 2,660.00 | S 2,670.00 2,655.00 3,640.00 | S 2,840.00
Tampa, FL
G & S Construction,
onstruction 2,850.00 | $ 3,890.00 4,050.00 3,450.00 | $ 1,550.00
Bradenton, FL
RQ Land Services Inc, .
2,600.00 | S 5,200.00 No Bid 4,100.00 | S 2,500.00
Bradenton, FL
Tri-Tech Construction,
! uctt 3,650.00 | $ 3,710.00 7,800.00 7,100.00 | $ 4,410.00

Bradenton, FL
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Demolition of Blighted/Unsafe Structures - Phase 2
IFB#10-1850DC
Bid Tabulation

1601 72nd St. Ct.

2107 2nd Ave. W,

2010 5th Ave E.,

2408 5th Ave Dr E,

116 37th St Ct E,

Bidder E., Rubonia Palmetto Palmetto Palmetto Palmetto
Cheaves Masonry &
Construction, Palmetto, | S 2,300.00 | S 5,000.00 | S 1,300.00 | S 3,500.00 | S 2,500.00
FL
Forristall Enterprises,
S 3,660.00 | S 4,110.00 | $ 3,080.00 | S 3,640.00 | S 3,750.00
Palmetto, FL
J Michael Group,
! up S 3,200.00 | S 3,700.00 | S 3,850.00 | S 4,200.00 | $ 3,800.00
Palmetto, FL
Kimmins Contracting, . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Creative Homes of
Central FL, St. S 4,700.00 | $ 5,200.00 | S 4,800.00 | $ 4,600.00 | S 5,300.00
Petersburg, FL
Environmental
Construction Inc, S 2,670.00 | $ 3,650.00 | S 3,420.00 | S 3,490.00 | S 4,870.00
Tampa, FL
G & S Construction,
uett $ 2,050.00 | $ 3,500.00 | ¢ 2,050.00 | $ 2,350.00 | ¢ 4,310.00
Bradenton, FL
RQ Land Services Inc,
Q S 2,500.00 | S 6,100.00 | S 2,300.00 | S 2,800.00 | S 3,600.00
Bradenton, FL
Tri-Tech Construction,
! uctt $ 4,410.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 4,400.00 | ¢ 6,800.00

Bradenton, FL
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