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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Thomas Scientific,
Environmental Express and Qorpak for the provision of Laboratory Sample Containers.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26.

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

The Manatee County Utilities Department collects samples at multiple facilities throughout the County as required for
analytical testing per Florida Department of Environmental Protection (FDEP) issued permits. Awarded suppliers shall

furnish all materials, labor, equipment and transportation required to deliver laboratory sample containers that meet

the requirements of the County.

The solicitation was advertised on January 24, 2019 on the Manatee County website. Responses were received from
the following firms:

1. Thomas Scientific Swedesboro, NJ 08085
2. Environmental Express Charleston, SC 29492
3. Qorpak Bridgeville, PA 15017

EVALUATION RESULTS SUMMARY:

Thomas Scientific, Environmental Express and Qorpak was the lowest responsive, responsible bidder. A bid tabulation
of the results is attached to this Notice of Intent to Award.

The Procurement Division and the Utilities Division recommend award to Thomas Scientific, Environmental Express
and Qorpak.

ATTACHMENTS Bid Tabulation NAME OF FUNDING SOURCE
(List in order of attached)

$10,000 / Estimate
COST Annual FUNDS VERIFIED

Yes
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Bid Tab ITQ 19-R070814SR
Lab Sampling Containers

Thomas Scientific, LLC Environmental Express Qorpak
1654 High Hill Rd 2345-A Charleston Regional Pwy 1195 Washington Pike
Swedesboro, NJ 08085 Charleston, SC 29492 Bridgeville, PA 15017
. . EPA. Containers | Price Per EPA Containers | Price Per EPA Containers | Price Per
Item Container Description Cleaning Cleaning Cleaning
Per Case Case Per Case Case Per Case Case
Procedure Procedure Procedure
1 125 mL HDPE wide mouth; unpreserved C 24 $13.49 C 48 $17.75 C 24 $46.00
250 mL amber glass wide mouth jar; pre-
2 preserved w/ 2mL 1:1 H2S04 c—A 24 $24.21 C 24 $38.50 c—A 24 $25.00
g |?°0 mL amber glass wide mouth jar; c—A 24 $20.99 C 24 $2389 [ c—A 24 $22.00
unpreserved
250 mL HDPE wide mouth; pre-preserved w/
4 omL 1:1 HNO3 C 24 $35.00 C 24 $29.00 S 24 $36.00
250 mL HDPE wide mouth; pre-preserved w/
5 omL 1-1 H2S04 C 24 $35.88 C 24 $22.00 S 24 $37.00
6 ]250 mL HDPE wide mouth; unpreserved C 24 $15.35 C 24 $16.00 C 24 $16.00
7 ]|500 mL HDPE wide mouth; unpreserved C 24 $20.99 C 24 $21.00 C 24 $22.00
500 mL HDPE wide mouth; pre-preserved w/
8 AmL 11 HNO3 C 24 $57.72 C 24 $31.00 S 24 $59.00
9 |1 Liter HDPE wide mouth; unpreserved & 12 $13.73 C 12 $12.60 & 12 $14.00
1 Liter clear glass straight side (tall); pre-
10 preserved w/ 5mL 1:1 H2S04 c—A 12 $32.41 C 12 $32.00 c—A 12 $33.00
1 Liter clear glass straight side (tall); pre-
11 preserved w/ 5mL 1:1 HC| c—A 12 $32.43 C 12 $32.00 c—A 12 $33.00
12 1 Liter clear glass straight side (tall); c A 12 $29.73 c 12 $27.00 c_A 12 $30.00
unpreserved
13 |2 Liter HDPE bleach jug; unpreserved C 60 $94.38 C 6 $7.67 C 60 $96.00
14 |2 Liter HDPE wide mouth; unpreserved C 40 $79.40 C 8 $14.00 C 40 $81.00
15 |4 Liter HDPE wide mouth; unpreserved C 4 $11.49 C 6 $9.15 C 4 $12.00
4 Liter clear glass straight side (tall); pre-
16 preserved w/ 8mL 1:1 H2S04 C N/A NO BID C 4 $27.00 @ N/A NO BID
4 Liter clear glass straight side (tall) pre-
17 preserved w/ 8mL 1:1 HC| C N/A NO BID C 4 $27.00 @ N/A NO BID
18 40 mL amber glass VOA vial w/ 0.060 septum B 80 $45.27 B 72 $46.00 B 80 $46.00
unpreserved

ITQ 19-R0708SR Laboratory Sample Container




. . EPA. Containers | Price Per EPA Containers | Price Per EPA Containers | Price Per
Item Container Description Cleaning Cleaning Cleaning
Per Case Case Per Case Case Per Case Case
Procedure Procedure Procedure
19 40 mL amber glass VOA vial w/ 0.125 septum; B 80 $41.49 B 72 $46.00 B 80 $42.00
unpreserved
20 40 mL amber Tqla.ss VOA vial w/ 0.060 septum; B N/A NO BID B 72 $60.00 B N/A NO BID
pre-preserved; 1:1 HCI
40 mL amber glass VOA vial w/ .125"
21 Teflon/Silicon Septa; pre-preserved ; 1:1 HCI i A MY e (e SIEO & Y HAELD
22 40 mL amber ?qla.ss VOA vial w/ 0.125 septum; B 80 $45.31 B 72 $60.00 B N/A NO BID
pre-preserved; 1:1 HCI
40 mL amber glass VOA vial w/ 0.060 septum;
23 pre-preserved: 1:1 H2504 B N/A NO BID B 72 $60.00 B 80 $49.00
40 mL amber glass VOA vial w/.125
24 |Teflon/Silicone Septa; pre-preserved; 1:1 B N/A NO BID B 72 $55.86 B N/A NO BID
H2S04
40 mL amber glass VOA vial w/ 0.125 septum;
25 pre-preserved: 1:1 H2504 B 80 $47.62 B 72 $55.86 B 80 $49.00
26 [*0 ML amber glass VOA vial w/ 0.060 septum; B N/A NO BID B 72 $55.86 B N/A NO BID
w/sodium thiosulfate
27 40nﬂiambergbssVCM\V@IW/O&ZSSepwnn B 80 $42.98 B 72 $55.86 B 80 $44.00
w/ sodium thiosulfate
o8 2§0nu_ambergbssvwdernouﬂnwﬂsodmnw B 24 $22.99 B 24 $34.00 24 $24.00
thiosulfate
29 ]1-gallon HDPE 38mm mouth; unpreserved C 48 $69.96 C 6 $9.12 C 48 $71.00
g0 |LLier-1000mL Amber glass, 33mm c—A 12 $21.19 C 12 $23.00 | ©—A 12 $22.00
Boston/Round unpreserved
500mL HDPE wide mouth, pre-preserved w/ 4
31 mL 1:1 H2S04 C 24 $25.17 C 24 $46.00 S 24 $26.00
500mL HDPE wide mouth, pre-preserved w/ 4
32 mL 1:1 H2S04: leakproof C N/A NO BID C 24 $60.00 S N/A NO BID
33 i;%r:L HDPE wide mouth, pre-preserved with C 24 $17.46 C 24 $18.00 C 24 $18.00
34 250 m!_ HDPE wide mouth, pre-preserved with c N/A NO BID c 24 $44.00 c N/A NO BID
NaOH; leakproof
35 500 mL HDPE wide mouth, pre-preserved with C 24 $23.63 C 24 $38.00 c 24 $24.00

NaOH
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. . EPA. Containers | Price Per EPA Containers | Price Per EPA Containers | Price Per
Item Container Description Cleaning Cleaning Cleaning
Per Case Case Per Case Case Per Case Case
Procedure Procedure Procedure

36 500 mL HDPE wide mouth, pre-preserved with NaOH; c N/A NO BID C 2 $62.00 C N/A NO BID
leakproof

37 |1 Liter amber glass wide mouth; unpreserved A 12 $19.90 A 12 $20.00 A 12 $20.00

38 1 _L|ter amber glass wide mouth w/sodium A 12 $20.78 A 12 $28.00 A 12 $21.00
thiosulfate
1 Liter amber glass wide mouth pre-preserved

39 W/ 8mL 11 H2S04 c—A 12 $24.20 C 12 $33.00 c—A 12 $25.00

40 |t Hiter HDPE narrow mouth bottles C 12 $46.90 c 12 $11.75 C 12 $48.00
unpreserved

a1 32 o0z./ 1 Liter, amber glass, Boston Round, c_A 12 $19.69 C 12 $32.00 c_A 12 $20.00
pre-preserved w/ 2 mL H2S04

42 250 mL Natl HDPE Sterile 1-CHEM Certified c 60 $167.90 C 68 $170.00 c N/A NO BID
For group(s) 1

43 Whirl-pak (unpreserved) sampling bags, 500 $62.59 500 $92.00 N/A NO BID
300mL capacity

44 Whirl-pak w/ Sodlum Thiosulfate sampling . 100 $44.14 100 $49.00 . N/A NO BID
bags, 300mL capacity

45 |LLiter glass pre-preserved w/ H2SO4 (not c—A 12 $20.78 c 12 $3200 | c—A 12 $22.00
straight side tall)

46 |4 Liter glass straight side (tall), unpreserved C N/A NO BID C 4 $18.00 C N/A NO BID

47 Coliform water sampling and analysis vial . N/A NO BID N/A NO BID . N/A NO BID
(unpreserved), 2300mL

48 Coliform water sampling and analysis vial w/ . 300 $272.00 N/A NO BID . 300 $276.00

Sodium Thiosulfate, 2300mL
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