

**IFB#10-1124JS
Temporary Employment Services
Bid Tabulation**

Item No.	Position	Abie Body Labor	Academy Design	Adecco	AdVance Talent Sol.	Aerotek	AUE Staffing	CareersUSA Inc	Compass Medical	Express Employment	HH Staffing	JuriStaff	Kelly Services	KeyStaff, Inc	SkillStorm	Spartan Staffing	Tampa Service Co.	Tri-State Employment	US Tech Solutions
		Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate
1	Administrative Assistant	\$ 12.75	\$ 11.44	\$ 16.70	\$ 13.89	\$ 16.45	\$ 16.10	\$ 16.46	\$ 14.70	\$ 14.39	\$ 18.75	\$ 20.72	\$ 14.85	\$ 12.40	\$ 17.80	No Bid	\$ 12.85	\$ 13.58	\$ 18.00
2	Administrative Specialist	\$ 19.35	\$ 11.77	\$ 18.01	\$ 14.78	\$ 17.44	\$ 17.16	\$ 17.44	\$ 16.01	\$ 15.49	\$ 19.50	\$ 21.83	\$ 15.52	\$ 13.64	\$ 18.79	No Bid	\$ 12.78	\$ 14.75	\$ 19.00
3	Administrative Services Coordinator	\$ 23.27	\$ 17.22	\$ 21.31	\$ 18.91	\$ 21.53	\$ 21.58	\$ 22.02	\$ 16.59	\$ 17.89	\$ 24.75	\$ 27.75	\$ 18.22	\$ 12.40	\$ 23.36	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.44	\$ 25.00
4	Algal Control Specialist/Laboratory Assistant	No Bid	\$ 14.48	No Bid	\$ 16.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.48	\$ 17.90	\$ 16.89	\$ 21.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.97	\$ 20.00
5	Animal Care Specialist I	\$ 12.82	\$ 11.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.19	No Bid	\$ 14.29	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.02	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.68	\$ 13.58	\$ 15.00
6	Animal Care Specialist II	\$ 14.12	\$ 12.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.10	No Bid	\$ 15.09	\$ 19.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.76	\$ 14.02	\$ 15.00
7	Building Trades Worker	\$ 17.57	\$ 12.98	No Bid	\$ 15.45	\$ 16.45	No Bid	\$ 17.07	No Bid	\$ 17.89	\$ 22.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.01	\$ 15.00
8	Computer Operations Support Technician I	No Bid	\$ 14.58	\$ 19.17	\$ 15.78	No Bid	\$ 19.14	\$ 18.38	\$ 18.00	\$ 16.99	\$ 22.50	\$ 23.68	\$ 18.90	\$ 14.88	\$ 19.77	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.70	\$ 20.00
9	Construction Coordinator	\$ 28.12	\$ 18.85	No Bid	\$ 24.27	No Bid	\$ 29.13	\$ 27.19	No Bid	\$ 26.84	\$ 29.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.94	\$ 27.56	No Bid	\$ 24.75	\$ 25.64	\$ 29.00
10	Construction Inspection Officer II	No Bid	\$ 18.47	No Bid	\$ 22.72	No Bid	\$ 26.41	\$ 25.65	No Bid	\$ 25.49	\$ 31.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.95	\$ 26.00
11	Cook	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.05	No Bid	\$ 10.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.47	No Bid	\$ 12.44	\$ 13.57	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.54	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.30	\$ 11.34	\$ 12.00
12	Custodian	\$ 10.84	\$ 11.66	No Bid	\$ 11.52	\$ 13.03	\$ 15.29	\$ 13.51	\$ 11.48	\$ 12.74	\$ 15.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.54	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.30	\$ 11.58	\$ 14.00
13	Data Entry Operator	\$ 13.12	\$ 12.98	\$ 16.08	\$ 13.02	\$ 15.53	\$ 15.51	\$ 15.53	\$ 13.69	\$ 13.99	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.76	\$ 13.50	\$ 12.40	\$ 16.87	No Bid	\$ 13.10	\$ 13.67	\$ 17.00
14	Engineering Technician II	No Bid	\$ 15.74	\$ 21.04	\$ 28.11	No Bid	\$ 19.47	\$ 19.59	\$ 19.10	\$ 16.89	\$ 24.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.64	\$ 20.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.25	\$ 20.00
15	Engineering Technician III	No Bid	\$ 16.88	\$ 22.30	\$ 19.00	No Bid	\$ 20.38	\$ 20.76	\$ 20.00	\$ 17.24	\$ 27.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.88	\$ 21.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.45	\$ 23.00
16	Equipment Operator	\$ 17.53	\$ 14.37	No Bid	\$ 17.44	\$ 18.73	No Bid	\$ 18.09	\$ 17.10	\$ 18.99	\$ 24.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.81	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.40	\$ 17.36	\$ 17.00
17	Event Specialist	\$ 15.12	\$ 12.17	\$ 19.60	\$ 13.95	No Bid	\$ 16.50	\$ 15.19	\$ 17.53	\$ 16.09	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.85	\$ 17.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.19	\$ 15.00
18	Event Supervisor	\$ 17.50	\$ 15.24	\$ 25.20	\$ 17.40	No Bid	\$ 19.14	\$ 19.17	\$ 12.10	\$ 16.99	\$ 21.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.16	\$ 20.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.60	\$ 19.00
19	Event Technician I	\$ 10.45	\$ 9.87	\$ 12.81	\$ 10.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.16	\$ 10.33	\$ 10.94	\$ 12.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.44	\$ 10.03	\$ 16.00
20	Event Technician II	\$ 11.25	\$ 10.48	\$ 12.81	\$ 10.95	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.80	\$ 11.10	\$ 11.94	\$ 12.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.80	\$ 11.13	\$ 17.00
21	Executive Assistant	\$ 18.47	\$ 15.69	\$ 23.10	\$ 16.75	\$ 18.86	\$ 20.13	\$ 19.59	\$ 18.01	\$ 17.49	\$ 21.00	\$ 24.05	\$ 18.22	\$ 14.57	\$ 20.93	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.10	\$ 22.00
22	Fiscal Analyst	No Bid	\$ 19.96	\$ 33.60	\$ 21.08	No Bid	\$ 25.08	\$ 24.73	\$ 18.01	\$ 21.89	\$ 28.00	\$ 31.08	\$ 24.65	\$ 18.60	\$ 26.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 21.90	\$ 26.00
23	Fiscal Specialist	No Bid	\$ 17.38	\$ 28.00	\$ 17.84	No Bid	\$ 20.33	\$ 20.76	\$ 19.50	\$ 17.24	\$ 25.25	\$ 25.90	\$ 22.47	\$ 13.95	\$ 22.11	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.45	\$ 23.00
24	Fiscal Technician	No Bid	\$ 13.91	\$ 19.60	\$ 13.92	No Bid	\$ 17.16	\$ 17.04	\$ 17.50	\$ 15.89	\$ 18.85	\$ 22.20	\$ 17.55	\$ 12.40	\$ 18.79	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.70	\$ 17.00
25	Fleet Maintenance Technician Trainee	\$ 16.97	\$ 13.09	No Bid	\$ 15.45	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.07	No Bid	\$ 17.89	\$ 21.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.84	\$ 17.00
26	Fleet Maintenance Technician I	\$ 18.12	\$ 14.38	No Bid	\$ 17.23	\$ 19.17	No Bid	\$ 19.17	No Bid	\$ 18.39	\$ 22.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.70	\$ 21.00
27	Fleet Maintenance Technician II	\$ 19.84	\$ 15.89	No Bid	\$ 19.60	\$ 21.53	No Bid	\$ 21.53	No Bid	\$ 19.09	\$ 25.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.43	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.76	\$ 21.00
28	Fleet Maintenance Technician III	\$ 20.59	\$ 18.57	No Bid	\$ 22.11	\$ 24.19	No Bid	\$ 24.19	No Bid	\$ 21.09	\$ 25.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 21.08	\$ 22.00
29	Food Server	\$ 10.68	\$ 9.87	No Bid	\$ 10.80	No Bid	\$ 11.80	\$ 11.58	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.79	\$ 12.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.44	\$ 9.56	\$ 12.00
30	Golf Attendant	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.97	No Bid	\$ 11.16	No Bid	\$ 12.21	\$ 12.03	\$ 11.10	\$ 11.54	\$ 13.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.44	\$ 10.30	\$ 12.00
31	Greenskeeper	\$ 12.71	\$ 12.97	No Bid	\$ 14.72	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.10	\$ 13.58	\$ 13.59	\$ 18.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.47	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.44	\$ 13.80	\$ 12.00
32	Instrument Technician	No Bid	\$ 17.54	\$ 25.38	\$ 18.09	No Bid	\$ 17.82	\$ 21.53	No Bid	\$ 17.89	\$ 24.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.12	\$ 21.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.45	\$ 23.00
33	Irrigation Technician	\$ 13.12	\$ 13.87	No Bid	\$ 17.03	\$ 18.73	No Bid	\$ 18.09	No Bid	\$ 16.99	\$ 19.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.76	\$ 17.00
34	Landfill Attendant	\$ 14.14	\$ 13.18	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.89	No Bid	\$ 17.07	No Bid	\$ 16.39	\$ 21.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.52	\$ 14.87	\$ 17.00
35	Landfill Operator	\$ 16.96	\$ 15.22	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.49	No Bid	\$ 20.31	No Bid	\$ 18.29	\$ 22.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.26	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.76	\$ 19.70	\$ 22.00
36	Legal Assistant	\$ 22.27	\$ 18.32	\$ 37.50	\$ 20.16	No Bid	\$ 24.09	\$ 23.09	\$ 16.50	\$ 20.59	\$ 26.00	\$ 28.12	\$ 21.75	\$ 14.88	\$ 24.43	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.29	\$ 22.00
37	Law Office Assistant	\$ 14.12	\$ 14.32	\$ 28.00	\$ 16.74	No Bid	\$ 18.48	\$ 18.70	\$ 17.00	\$ 18.34	\$ 20.30	\$ 22.57	\$ 18.22	\$ 13.64	\$ 20.04	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.62	\$ 22.00
38	Mail Services Technician	\$ 15.62	\$ 12.25	\$ 18.20	\$ 13.02	\$ 16.68	\$ 15.18	\$ 15.53	\$ 16.30	\$ 14.89	\$ 18.00	\$ 17.02	\$ 13.50	\$ 10.54	\$ 16.87	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.68	\$ 18.00
39	Maintenance Data Coordinator	\$ 15.26	\$ 19.96	\$ 26.60	\$ 21.08	\$ 25.06	\$ 23.10	\$ 23.33	\$ 14.59	\$ 21.19	\$ 26.00	\$ 28.50	\$ 21.75	\$ 12.40	\$ 24.67	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.73	\$ 26.00
40	Office Assistant	\$ 11.27	\$ 12.26	\$ 15.40	\$ 12.40	\$ 13.81	\$ 14.19	\$ 13.81	\$ 11.10	\$ 14.89	\$ 15.95	\$ 16.28	\$ 14.17	\$ 12.09	\$ 15.16	No Bid	\$ 10.44	\$ 11.98	\$ 15.00

**IFB#10-1124JS
Temporary Employment Services
Bid Tabulation**

Item No.	Position	Able Body Labor	Academy Design	Adecco	AdVance Talent Sol.	Aerotek	AUE Staffing	CareersUSA Inc	Compass Medical	Express Employment	HH Staffing	JuriStaff	Kelly Services	KeyStaff, Inc	SkillStorm	Spartan Staffing	Tampa Service Co.	Tri-State Employment	US Tech Solutions
		Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate
41	Office Specialist	\$ 13.95	\$ 13.27	\$ 19.60	\$ 13.89	\$ 15.53	\$ 15.51	\$ 15.53	\$ 10.83	\$ 15.89	\$ 17.40	\$ 17.02	\$ 14.85	\$ 13.64	\$ 16.87	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.19	\$ 19.00
42	Paralegal	No Bid	\$ 20.95	No Bid	\$ 20.89	No Bid	\$ 27.06	\$ 25.45	\$ 18.70	\$ 22.39	\$ 28.55	\$ 31.08	\$ 23.20	\$ 17.36	\$ 26.79	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.60	\$ 32.00
43	Parks Maintenance Groundskeeper	\$ 12.85	\$ 12.27	No Bid	\$ 14.64	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.19	No Bid	\$ 14.39	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.71	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.50	\$ 13.85	\$ 16.00
44	Plans Examiner	No Bid	\$ 21.96	No Bid	\$ 23.70	No Bid	\$ 27.72	\$ 27.19	No Bid	\$ 23.89	\$ 28.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.30	\$ 27.00
45	Public Works Maintenance Technician Trainee	\$ 12.45	\$ 12.29	No Bid	\$ 14.49	\$ 17.83	No Bid	\$ 16.10	No Bid	\$ 14.29	\$ 19.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.64	\$ 19.00
46	Public Works Maintenance Technician I	\$ 14.65	\$ 13.71	No Bid	\$ 16.28	\$ 20.03	No Bid	\$ 18.09	No Bid	\$ 15.29	\$ 21.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.24	\$ 19.00
47	Public Works Maintenance Technician II	\$ 17.58	\$ 15.22	No Bid	\$ 16.87	\$ 21.22	No Bid	\$ 19.17	No Bid	\$ 16.29	\$ 22.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.75	\$ 20.00
48	Public Works Maintenance Technician III	\$ 21.12	\$ 16.25	No Bid	\$ 17.90	\$ 22.49	No Bid	\$ 20.31	No Bid	\$ 17.29	\$ 24.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.16	\$ 22.00
49	Radio Technician II	No Bid	\$ 16.88	\$ 29.00	\$ 20.49	No Bid	\$ 22.44	\$ 22.83	No Bid	\$ 20.24	\$ 27.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.60	\$ 22.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.22	\$ 22.00
50	Radio Technician Supervisor	No Bid	\$ 21.97	\$ 33.82	\$ 25.30	No Bid	\$ 27.39	\$ 28.81	No Bid	\$ 24.89	\$ 31.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.32	\$ 28.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.04	\$ 31.00
51	Senior Building Trades Worker	\$ 21.97	\$ 15.94	No Bid	\$ 19.18	\$ 22.49	No Bid	\$ 20.31	No Bid	\$ 19.29	\$ 24.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.43	\$ 21.00
52	Senior Fleet Maintenance Technician	\$ 24.86	\$ 19.14	No Bid	\$ 23.06	\$ 28.40	No Bid	\$ 25.65	No Bid	\$ 21.49	\$ 28.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.19	\$ 28.00
53	Small Engine Repair Technician	\$ 17.15	\$ 14.98	No Bid	\$ 16.58	\$ 20.03	No Bid	\$ 18.09	No Bid	\$ 16.99	\$ 19.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.00
54	Stores/Warehouse Technician	\$ 14.44	\$ 13.21	\$ 18.85	\$ 14.46	\$ 16.68	\$ 17.03	\$ 16.10	No Bid	\$ 14.99	\$ 18.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.02	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.75	\$ 14.37	\$ 18.00
55	Systems Analyst I	No Bid	\$ 22.47	\$ 39.76	\$ 22.94	No Bid	\$ 26.73	\$ 26.27	\$ 27.10	\$ 26.84	\$ 30.00	\$ 31.08	\$ 27.55	\$ 18.60	\$ 28.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.30	\$ 31.00
56	Systems Analyst II	No Bid	\$ 24.93	\$ 34.08	\$ 25.82	No Bid	\$ 29.04	\$ 29.46	\$ 28.10	\$ 27.84	\$ 33.00	\$ 35.78	\$ 30.45	\$ 19.84	\$ 30.36	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.18	\$ 33.00
57	Systems Analyst III	No Bid	\$ 26.84	\$ 49.70	\$ 29.06	No Bid	\$ 33.33	\$ 33.10	\$ 30.10	\$ 28.84	\$ 37.50	\$ 42.60	\$ 34.80	\$ 21.08	\$ 31.74	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.42	\$ 37.00
58	Telecommunications Technician	No Bid	\$ 17.84	No Bid	\$ 21.39	No Bid	\$ 24.09	\$ 24.19	\$ 23.00	\$ 21.89	\$ 27.00	\$ 30.50	\$ 24.65	\$ 18.91	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.73	\$ 26.00
59	Ticket Seller	\$ 10.94	\$ 9.87	\$ 13.87	\$ 10.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.03	\$ 11.00	\$ 12.44	\$ 13.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.92	\$ 13.50	No Bid	\$ 11.00	\$ 10.95	\$ 14.00
60	Ticket Taker	\$ 10.45	\$ 9.75	\$ 13.05	\$ 10.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.76	\$ 11.00	\$ 10.64	\$ 12.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.61	\$ 13.50	No Bid	\$ 10.30	\$ 10.05	\$ 12.00
61	Utilities Maintenance Technician Trainee	\$ 12.93	\$ 12.57	No Bid	\$ 14.11	\$ 17.25	No Bid	\$ 16.10	No Bid	\$ 15.39	\$ 17.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.00	\$ 17.00
62	Utilities Maintenance Technician I	\$ 14.37	\$ 13.34	No Bid	\$ 15.90	\$ 20.03	No Bid	\$ 18.09	No Bid	\$ 16.29	\$ 19.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.25	\$ 17.00
63	Utilities Maintenance Technician II	\$ 17.25	\$ 14.52	No Bid	\$ 16.87	\$ 20.54	No Bid	\$ 19.17	No Bid	\$ 17.39	\$ 21.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.50	\$ 20.00
64	Utilities Maintenance Technician III	\$ 18.68	\$ 15.83	No Bid	\$ 17.90	\$ 21.77	No Bid	\$ 20.31	No Bid	\$ 18.29	\$ 22.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.75	\$ 22.00
	Acknowledge Addendum	Yes	Yes	Yes	No	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	No	No	No	Yes	Yes	No Bid	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Attachments Included	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	No	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	Yes	Yes	Yes

Note: Adecco pending review of Special Terms & Conditions

3/24/10
Date

3/24/10
Date

Keyed By

Checked By