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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Notice of Intent to Award Invitation for Bid 17-0820GC: Force Main 23A Replacement, to the lowest responsive and
responsible bidder, Harris-McBurney Company, Tampa, FL for a total bid of $486,249.50 based on a completion time

of 260 calendar days.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY
Federai/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.

Manatee County Code of Laws

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

The Work in this project consists of the construction of approximately 150 LF of 8" PVC, 100 LF" steel casing and 8" PVC
by jack and bore, and 1130 LF of 8" HDPE force main for Force Main 23A.The project also includes the abandonment of
the existing Force Main 23A in place and grout fill, restoration of all pavement and concrete disturbed during construction
of force main, jack and bores, bypassing, horizontal directional drills, rehabilitation of existing manholes, and existing force
main extensions and connections.

As a result of formal competitive sealed bid procedures, a total of two (2) bidders submitted a sealed bid for consideration.
Please refer to the attached bid tabulation for the breakdown of the bids received.

On April 25, 2017 a memorandum was received from the Public Works Department recommending award to Harris-
McBurney Company, Tampa, FL for a total bid amount of $486,249.50 based on a 260 calendar day completion time.

Budget Amendment (BA) B-17-046/2 will be presented to the BCC on May 9, 2017 to fully fund this project.

Funding for this project is provided by Utility Rates in the budget account key 4046022488-534000/6022488-0004
(SewerRehab: Force23A).

4046022488.534000/6022488.0

ATTACHMENTS . 004
(Listinorderof * Department Recommendation FUNDING SOURCE Funds Verified
attached) ¢ Cost Tabulation {Acct Number & Name) [] Insufficient Funds
AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING
COST $486,249.50 COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact N/A

Statement)




MEMORANDUM

To:
Fro Streitmatter Il P E. Pro;ect Management Div. Manager"’
Dat April 21, 2017

Subject: FM 23A Rehabilitation
Harris-McBumey Company
Recommendation for Award - IFB#17-0820GC

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation form is
attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract, with a construction time of 260
Days be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, Harris-McBurney Company in the
amount of $486,249.50 and in accordance with the terms and conditions of the bid package. Upon
completion of project award, please provide a copy of the purchase order assigned to the
contractor. The funding source for this contract is Utility Rates.

The amount currently encumbered is less than the proposed contract amount, and a budget
amendment will be prepared to fully fund the project prior to the contract award.

Please contact Michael L. Sturm, P_E., Project Manager, if you have any questions regarding the
attached documents.

Thank you for your continued assistance.

JS/ms

cc: Mike Gore, Director, Utilities
Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works
Sia Mollanazar, P.E., Deputy Director, Engineering Services
Michael L. Sturm, P.E., Project Manager,
Project File: 6022488 1.1

Public Works Department
Project Management Division
1022 26t Avenue Last, Bradenton, FL 34208-3926
Phane number: (941) 708-7450
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BID TABULATION FOR

IFB #17-0820GC
Force Main 23A Rehabilitation . -
BID "A" - 200 CALENDAR DAYS z}:mamﬁupﬂ;g 1 “""?f%f";‘:.‘ﬁ"&"f’”
Tamps, FL 33619 Palmesto, FL 34220
ITEM DESCRIPTION EsT.QTv. | um | BPTRCEPER Tn::'.::m e m:::é:m
1 Mobilization 1 LS NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
2 Mainicasnce of Traffic 1 LS NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Eroslon and Sediment Coatrol 1 L5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 |Miscellaneous Work aad Clean Up 1 LS NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
. SUBTOTAL (ITEMS 1-4) NO BID NO BID
s By-Pass for Manhale Rebabiliation 3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 &7 PVC €900 DR 18 (Direct Bury) 150 LF NOBID NO BID ND BID NO BID
1 8" HDPE DR 11 DIPS (HOD) 1,130 LF NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
B 2' by 2 Subsurfaze Utility Exploration 1 EA NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 FDOT - Pavement Restoration - Soil 96% Compactk 2 oy NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
it PDOT - Pavemen Restoratlon - 10" P 12.5 025 ™ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
N FDOT - Favement Restoration - 1.5 Average Depth Mill 134 sy NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
1 FDOT - Pavement Resiomfion - 13" FC 12.8 Friction Course 11 ™ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Jack and Bore with 1K Steel Caslng 100 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
14 H°BVC Carvier Pipe 100 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 Al Refease Valves 3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 7D Fittinga - 11.25 doy 2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 B DA Fittings - 45 deg 7 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
it §” DI Fittings » 90 deg 2 EA NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
5 §” DI Fitlings - Tec ) EA NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
20 8° Bell Joiru Pipe Reatraints 9 EA NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
21 Pipc Adeptens 2 EA NG BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
n 1" PVC ASTM D 2241 SDR 21 Force Muin 40 LF NOBID NO BID NO BID NORID
b1} 2" PYC ASTM [ 2241 SDR 21 43 Degree Bend 2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 2* PVC Plug Valve with Flangs Joint Adaplers 1 EA NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
2 Force Main Connections and Lifl Station Shutdown 1 Ls NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
2% Grout Fill Abandoned 6” & §* Forcemain 1 cv NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
27 Mushol Rehsbililation 3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
28 Driveway Pavement Regtorstion - Crushed Concrete Base Muerial 9.2 cy NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tl Driveway Pavement Restoration - 1,5* Average Depéh Mill 4l sy NO BID NORID NOBID NO BID
30 Drivenay Pavement Restoration - 1.5 FC 12.5 Friction Course 34 ™ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Sodding 160 sy NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
SUBTOTAL (ITEMS 5-31) NO BID NOBID
>
2 (umgmcm%?ﬁov - 10% of TOTAL BASE BID NO BID NOBID
TOTAL OFFER FOR BID “A"
with Contract Contingency NO BID NO BID
Based on Time of 200 Calendni Days
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BID TABULATION FOR

IFB #17-0820GC
Force Main 23A Rehabilitation
1 2z
BID "B" - 260 CALENDAR DAYS ol :h‘:v’?:;‘g, W‘“"P%m‘?'&"f""‘
Tampa. FL 33619 Palmetto, FL34220
e RS EsT.qrv. | une | MOTRICEPER [ ToTALBD [BPRICERER | TOTAL B
) Mobilization ) 1s [s  s4moe|s  samoe[s  sooooo|s  ssooeso
2 Maimemacz of Traffic ] 1s |s  2s00000|s 2600000|s a120000|s 4120000
3 Erasiot and Sedimcrs Comtrol I 1s |5 samoo|s  spoco0|s  izesco|s 1,265.00
4 Miscellzneous Work and Clean Up 1 s ($ waeo0 |s  s37d000|s 500008 21750000
SUBTOTAL (ITEMS 1) 5 9535100 T
s By-Pass for Manhole Rehabilfution 3 B s 2a0000)s  maonoo|s  sasoo0|s  asasom
6 §° PYC 500 DR 18 (Diect Bury) 150 | 1300 (5 4995000 |8 msoo|s 172w
7 £ HDPE DR 11 DIFS (HDD) we | oweo s s00|s w0000 | 8675]s  ogomso
1 2 by T Sebsurfuce Uity Expleration ! EA |5 700000 |5 700000|s  e4es00 s 6.465.00
s FDOT - Pavemest Restorajion - Sofl 98% Compaction 2 o |s gso0|s 125000 s w0a s 400.00
) FDOT - Pavemen Reswrstion - 10° SP 125 028 ™ |s ssonools  1amson|s  1asoo|s .95
1 FDOT - Pavemnen Restoration - 1.5* Average Depth h1ifl 14 sy s 20001 8 12,060,00 | § 8800 | § 11,792.00
n FDOT - Paversent Resboration - 15" FC 1225 Friction Conrae 1 ™ s 0000(s 444000 |5 nso0|s 796,50
1 Jack anc Bore with 18° Swd Crsing 10 o[ s o1800fs 9180000 S eonoe|s 900000
14 § PVC Crrice Pipe 10 o[ s2oals 420000 s aom|s 4,300.00
Is Al Relcase Valves ) eA |8 somoo|s  wmmoe|s  smoco|s  aieso
15 8" DI Finings - 11,25 deg 2 BA S ss600 |5 192008 46500 | 3 930,00
" £ DI Ftigs - 45 deg : B s 60600 |5 424200 ars00 | s 132500
N £ DI Fitings - ¥ deg. 2 EA | @m0 |s 1254005 o0 |s 998.00
1 £ DI Fitngs - Tee ) B |s Lo | s | s 0000 | § 60000
2 5 Bell Joint Pipe Restrabnt ) B s wso0 |5 1ese0|s 17500 | s 1,375.00
21 Pipe Adepiers 2 BA | s B6E00 |5 10600 s 25800 | § 510.00
2 2" PUC ASTBL D 2241 SDR 21 Force Main ® s go|s 338000 (s 1550 | 5 510,00
n Z"PVC ASTM D 2241 SDR 21 45 Degrec Bend 2 EA $ 26600 ] § 53200 | 5 24600 | § 492.00
2 2" PA'C Plug Valve with Plange Joirt Adsplers ! g s 5o s 1sMoo|s 1500008 1,500.00
2 Force Main Comections nd il Sation Shudown ' s s 080000 |5 980000|S 18000000 S 180,000.00
2 Grout Fil Abandoned 6 & " Forcemaln " cr |s 500 |8 98000 58000 { § 6960.00
2 Marle Reabilintion 2 T seoon | s iesor]s  smooo|s 1740000
» Driveway Pavemsxt Restorasion - Crushed Concrete Base Marcria] 02 or |s s6500 |5 s9800 |8 1350 ] s 12420
» Deveway Pavemen Resioraion - 1.5* Average Depth il al sy |s %00|s 36900 (% 23 |s 296225
0 Drivewsy Pavemes: Restoragon. 1,57 FC 125 Frictbn Counse 34 ™ |s w0003 136000 18500 | s 9.0
3 Sodding 160 s |s 705 1as00(s 3008 480.00
SUBTOTAL (ITEMS $31) S 33,788.00 S 428020
Bﬂ:‘:cmnggmxﬁi‘ § 44204500 s 2520
1 R A e S RBRIVALS 10% of TOTAL BASE BID § 4420450 s mans
TOTAL OFFER FOR BID "B"
with Cantract Conttugency $ 48624950 s msen
Based b0 Completion Time of 260 Calesdar Days




BID TABULATION
FOR
IFB #17-0820GC

Force Main 23A Rehabilitation

BID "B"
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 260 CALENDAR DAYS

PREPARED BY:
(Project Engineer)

REVIEWED BY:
(Project Manager) Michael Sturm, P.E., Project Manager

s Licls D W
%;BEGEU BY:
(Purchasing) GinaGoiiins,

GW[:) D&Zd‘y --4,4"5", Mﬂwﬁévﬂ"

Page 3

4/20/2017
Date

_‘HZ’( 1!7

Date
;SZZ”/?
Date

412012017



