MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

INTENT TO AWARD L
No Lead Brass Water, MC A e W1 lfio
SUBJECT Sewer, and Backflow DATE POSTED DS XSt & \1liL
Products CC_ ol
Bonnie Sietman, Contingent upon the
PURCHASING DATE CONTRACT .
Sr. Buyer acceptance of Purchasing
REPRESENTATIVE o4, SHALL BE AWARDED Official (7 days)
_— CONSEQUENCES IF
DEPARTMENT Utilities, Warehouse DEFERRED N/A ~
SOLICITATION IFB #16-1733BLS AuTHonizeDeY /LT ﬂka / o
: DATE Mm‘l S, 90/
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD S footle

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid #16-1733BLS, No Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products to
the bidders (primary and secondary) with the lowest, responsive, responsible bidders (by group, subtotal) Ferguson
Waterworks , Fortiline Inc. and Municipal Water Works, LLC.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code,
ordinances, resolutions, policy.

e R M S Ay R

Manatee County Code of Laws

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

» This procurement is for no-lead brass water, sewer, and backflow products for the Utilities Maintenance
Warehouse Department. -

» The intent of this Invitation for Bid (IFB) is to establish a primary and secondary award to the two lowest,
responsive, responsible bidders meeting specifications by group, subtotal.

» The annual estimated expenditure is $285,000.00

» The County solicited Invitation for Bid #16-1733BLS from July 15, 2016 through August 2, 2016, appropriate
bid procedures were followed.

» Notice of IFB #16-1733BLS was solicited on Demand Star (ten planholders), MyManatee.org, and the
Manatee County Chamber.

» Five bids were received from Ferguson Waterworks, Fortiline Inc., and HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.,
Municipal Water Works, LLC, and Southern Supply Company.

ATTACHMENTS FUNDING SOURCE é Funds Verified
(List in order of attached) e {Acct Number & Name) [] Insufficient Funds
AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING
Annual Estimate COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact

COST $285,000.00 Statement) 5010003698-595000
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» August 16, 2016 received a memorandum from C. Mike Gore, Utilities Director to award by group as

follows:

GROUP PRIMARY SECONDARY

A (Misc brass) Fortiline ($9,830.70) Ferguson ($10,034.20)

B (Brass line fittings) Ferguson ($76,631.00) Municipal WaterWorks ($81,698.25)
C (Brass backflow devices) Ferguson ($144,172.00) Municipal WaterWorks($146,710.00)

*each group has a fixed percentage discount off published manufacturer’s price list for like items not

specifically identified.

GROUP PRIMARY SECONDARY

A (Misc brass) Fortiline - 60% Ferguson — 61%

B (Brass line fittings) Ferguson — 55% Municipal Water Works — 53%

C (Brass backflow devices) Ferguson — 55% Municipal Water Works — 48%



IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. | Municipal Water Works, LLC Southern Supply Company
Note: This excel spreadsheet is inter-active. Insert unit price in column H and extended pricing and grand total pricin
will automatically extend and populate; Bidder to verify accuracy! Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL Sanford, FL Sarasota, FL

=| || PRODUCT uf EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
B | Numeer PRODUCT DESCRIPTION c?—;l M MFG [ PART # UNIT PRICE PRICE UNITPRICEf| = | UNITPRICE] =o= === [|UNITPRICEf =50 == [[UNITPRICE] =" o -
GROUP A
MISCELLANEOUS BRASS *no-lead brass*
Water and Sewer Products
Al | 381400 |BRASS ELL 90 va 20 | EA|Drass [ i.57 2740 | B 1.40 | » 25. 41 262008 30| ¢ 27000 5 203| 5 40.60
AZ | 3B1415 |BRASS ELL 90 % 50 | EA|Brass $ 27909 13950 || $ 29918 14950 I $ 2.80[$ 14450 $ 2.75] 137.50 | § 419 % 209.50
A3 | 3B1420 |BRASS ELL 90 1 20 | EA|Brass $ 431 % 86.20 || $ 447 1§ 89.40[I'$ 4468 8920 1| § 425(% 85.00]| $ 6.41]% 128.20
Ad | 3B1422 |BRASS ELL 90 1-1/4" | 15 | EA|Brass 3 6.83 (% 102.45 | $ 6.91 % 103.65 || § 7.10 | $ 106.50 | $ 6.75] $ 101.25 1 $ 1022 $ 153.30
A5 | 3B1430 |BRASS ELL 90 2 15 | EA [Brass 3 1390 | $ 20850 I $ 14.04 [ $ 210.60 || $ 1442 [ $ 216.30 1 $ 13.75 | § 208.25 | $ 2076 | $ 311.40
A6 | 3B1170 |BRASS ELL 90 Streset % 20 | EA|Brass 3 36319 72.60 || $ 377($% 7540 || $ 3.77 | $ 75.40 || $ 36015 72.00 0% 543 | $ 108.60
A7 | _3B1175 |BRASSELL 90 Street 1 50 | EA|Brass $ 6011$ 300.50 || $ 6.24|$ 312.00 || $ 623 $ 311.50 | $ 6.00}% 300.00 f $ 8439 421.50
AB | 3B1179 |BRASS ELL 90 Street 2 25 | EA|Brass $ 20.30 | $ 507.50 || $ 2052 | $ 513.00 || $ 2107 | $ 526.75 || § 20.00 [ $ 500.00 [['$ 2408 | $ 602.00
A9 | 3B1390_ |BRASSELL 45 % 10 | EA[Brass 3 279(% 27.90|$ 299(% 20.90 | $ 289§ 28001 $ 275| % 27501 $ 419 | $ 41.90
A10| 3B1397 |BRASS ELL 45 > 20 ( EA|Brass $ 15.28 | § 305.60 || $ 1544 | $ 308.80 || $ 1587 | $ 31740 $ 15.25 | $ 305.00 1 $ 18.12 [ $ 362.40
A11]_ 381320 |BRASS TEE A 10 [ EA[Brass $ 1.88 | & 18.80  $ 2025 20.20 |$ 197 [ $ 19.70 1 $ 185 % 1850 $ 283(% 28.30 ||
A12] 381335 |BRASS TEE % 25 | EA[Brass $ 341 (% 85.95 |1 § 35718 89.25 (% 356 % 89.00H $ 3.40 | % 85.00 | $ 512 | $ 128.00
A13| 3B1340 |BRASS TEE 1 15 | EA|Brass $ GUB | S 9120 $ 6.32 | $ 94.80 || $ 6.32] % 94.80 4 $ 6.00 | % 00.00 | § 911 (% 136.65
A14| 3B1350 |BRASSTEE _ 2 15 | EA|Brass $ 1923 [ § 28845 $ 19.44 [ $ 291.60 [ $ 1997 | $ 299551 $ 19.00 | $ 285.004 $ 2877 % 43155
A15| 3B1135 |BRASS COUPLING % 25 | EA|Brass $ 226 % 56.50 || $ 241 % 60.25 || $ 23419 5850 || $ 220§ 55.00 1| $ 3571 9% 89.25
A16| 3B1140 [BRASS COUPLING 1 25 | EA|Brass $ 3425 8550 | S 357 % 89.25 I $ 356 % 89.00 || $ 325 % 81.251 $ 542§ 135.50
A17| 3B1142_|BRASS COUPLING 1-1/4"_| 10 | EA|Brass $ 535]% 5350 | $ 557 | $ 55.70 1 $ 556 | $ 55.60 || $ 5259 52.50 || $ 84719 84.70
A18| 3B1150 |BRASS COUPLING 2 10 | EA|Brass $ 11.97 | § 119.70 | $ 12.10 { $ 12100 $ 1243 [ $ 124301 % 11.75 | $ 117.50 f $ 18.93 [ $ 189.30
A19| 3B1075 {BRASS REDUCING BUSHING % x % | 20 | EA|Brass $ 0.96 [ § 19.201 $ 0.98 % 1960 $ 0865 17.20 |3 1101 % 22.000% 139§ 27.80
A20] 3B1090_|BRASS REDUCING BUSHING V%ax% | 10 | EA|Brass $ 108§ $ 10801 $ T15] % 11.50 || $ 112 | $ 112013 110 $ 1100 $ 171 % 17.10
A21| 3B1085 |BRASS REDUCING BUSHING % x % | 20 | EA|Brass $ 1081 $ 2160 $ 1151 % 23.001$ 112§ 22401'$ 110 | $ 220015 171 | $ 34.20 ||
A22| 3B1095 |BRASS REDUCING BUSHING % x% | 15 | EA|Brass $ 181[ % 2715 $ 1.93[% 28.95 1| $ 187 % 28051 $ 180 | $ 27.00 | $ 284 % 42.60
A23| 3B1100 |BRASS REDUCING BUSHING %x% | 15 | EA|Brass $ 149 [ $ 22351'% 159 | $ 23.85( $ 155§ 23.25 | $ 150 | $ 2250 || $ 2371 % 35.55
A24| 3B1035 |BRASS REDUCING BUSHING 1x% | 75 | EA|Brass $ 2961 % 169.50 [ $ 24118% 180.75 || $ 234 % 17550 4 $ 225 % 168.75 | 357 % 267.75
A25| 3B1043 |BRASS REDUCING BUSHING 1% x1 | 20 | EA[Brass $ 385(% 7700 |'$ 400 [ % 80.00 || $ 300 (% 7980 § $ 375 % 75.00 || $ 6.08 | § 121.60
A26| 3B1365 |BRASS REDUCING BUSHING 1% x1_| 20 | EA|Brass $ 491 % 98.20 || $ 511 | $ 10220 $ 510 | $ 10200 $ 485 $ 97.00 || $ 777 % 155.40
A27| 3B1355_|BRASS REDUCING BUSHING 2x% | 10 | EA|Brass $ 8.76 | $ 87.60 || 5 8.86 | $ 88.60|[$ 0.00 | $ 90.90 || $ 8751 % 87501 % 125[ % 112.50
A28| 3B1360 |BRASS REDUCING BUSHING 2x1_| 45 | EA|Brass $ 8.76 | § 39420 1| $ 8.86 | $ 398.70 I 9.09 (% 400.05 | $ 8751 % 393751 $ 13.85 | $ 623.25
A29| 3B1375 |BRASS REDUCING BUSHING 2x1% | 20 | EA|Brass $ 7.28 [ $ 14560 || $ 8.86 | $ 177.20 || $ 755 $ 151.00 | $ 725( % 14500 1 $ 11491 % 220.80
A30| 3B1285 |BRASS PLUG, SOLID % 10 | EA[Brass $ 1.43 | § 14.30[1'$ 153 9% 15.30 || $ 1.77 | $ 17.70 $ 150 $ 15.00 || $ 231 % 23.10 ||
A31| 3B1290 |BRASS PLUG, SOLID % 20 | EA|Brass $ 163§ 3260 174 | $ 3480 $ 231 $ 46201 § 2251 % 45.00 | $ 245§ 49.00
A32| 3B1300 |BRASS PLUG, SOLID 1 15 | EA|Brass 3 216 $ 3240 $ 231 $ 3465 $ 304 | $ 50101 $ 38019 57.00 1 $ 321( 8% 48.15
A33| 3B1315_ |BRASS PLUG, SOLID 2 50 | EA|Brass [3 6435 32150 || $ 6690 % 334501 $ 14.64| S 73200 || $ 14.00 | $ 700.00 { $ 260 |5 480.00
A34| 3B1180_|BRASS NIPPLE % x2_| 25 | EA|Brass [ 0.82[% 20.50 || $ 098 (% 24.50 || $ 0.85|% 21.251 $ 0.80 | $ 2000 || $ 147 | $ 36.75
A35] 381185 |BRASS NIPPLE %x3 | 25 | EA|Brass $ 1.04 [ $ 26.00| $ 124 | $ 31.00[[$ 1095 272501 $ 100§ 25.00 [[ $ 188 (% 47.00
A36| 3B1200 |BRASS NIPPLE % x2 | 25 | EA|Brass 3 0.92]% 23.00|'$ 1111 % 27.75 | $ 097 | $ 24951% 090 % 2250 || $ 168 | % 42 00
A37] 3B1215 |BRASS NIPPLE % x2 | 25 | EA|Brass $ 117§ 2925 || $ 1401 % 3500 $ 123[$ 30,750 $ 1.15 | § 28.75 | $ 2110 $ 52.75 ||
A38| 3B1235 |BRASS NIPPLE % xCL | 50 | EA|Brass $ 1241 § 62.00 || $ 148 [$ 74004 % 1301 % 65.00 1| $ 125 % 62.50 | $ 224 $ 112.00 ||
A30| 3B1240 |BRASS NIPPLE %x2 | 30 | EA|Brass 3 1.56 | § 46.80 || $ 187 | $ 56.10 | $ 2869 85.80 | $ 150 % 4500 | $ 2835 84.90
A40| 3B1245 |BRASS NIPPLE %x4 | 30 | EA|Brass $ 2.71 [ $ 81.30 || $ 326 % 9780 || $ 286 $ 8580 $ 265]9% 79.50“3 493[% 147.90
fA41| 3B1250 |BRASS NIPPLE %x6 | 15 | EA|Brass $ 306 & 50.40 || 462 | $ 69.30| $ 417 | $ 62.56 || $ 395[$ 59.25 || $ 7.20 | $ 108.00
A42| 3B1255 |BRASS NIPPLE 1xCL | 20 | EA|Brass $ 183 % 36.60 || $ 219 | $ 43.8011'$ 102 $ 3840 $ 1.80 [ $ 36.00 || $ 330§ 66.00
A43| 3B1260_|BRASS NIPPLE _ 1x2_| 20 | EA|Brass $ 225 % 4500 $ 269 (9% 53.80 || $ 236 % 4720 % 225(% 45.00|'S 4.07 | $ 81.40
A44| 3B1265 |BRASS NIPPLE 1x4 | 20 | EA|Brass 3 394 [$ 78.80 1 458 (9% 91601 $ 414§ 8280 || $ 385]9% 77.001$ 714 $ 142.80
A45| 3B1270 |BRASS NIPPLE 1x6 | 10 | EA|Brass 3 5.78 [ § 578013 6.74 | $ 67401 $ 6.00{$% 60.90 | 5.75 | $ 5750 § 1050 | § 105.00
A46| 3B1060_|BRASS NIPPLE 2xCL_| 30 | EA[Brass 3 545§ 163.50 || $ 6.34 | $ 190.20 [ $ 5721% 17160 $ 550 | § 165.00 | $ 987 | § 296.10
A47|__3B1065 |BRASS NIPPLE 2x4_| 30 | EA|Brass 3 886 % 265.80 | $ 10.06 | § 301.80 || $ 933§ 279.90 15 875 % 262501 $ 16.10 | $ 483.00
A48| 3B1070 |BRASS NIPPLE 2x6_| 30 | EA|Brass $ 1295 § 38850 | § 14.83 | $ 444.90 | $ 13.78 | § 413.40 | $ 13.00 | $ 390.00 | $ 2377 | $ 71310
A40| 3B1072 |BRASS NIPPLE 2x12 | 15 | EA|Brass 3 2550 [ $ 382.50 || $ 2923 [ % 438.45 || $ 2523 | $ 378.45 || $ 2550 | $ 38250 || § 37.381 $ 560.70
A50| 3V1200 |VALVES-BRASS-FULL PORT-BALL VALVE BRASS FIPXFIP % 15 | EA|Red-White Valve Corjl $ 345§ 51.90 | $ 340 | $ 51001 $ 578 | $ 86.70 | $ 450 | § 67501 $ 639§ gs.gll
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IFB #16 1733BLS No- Lead Brass Water Sewer, and Backflow Products

Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks, Lid. ‘ Municipal Water Works, LLC}j Southern Supply Company

PRODUC
Mﬂas e Il‘ M
3V1205_ | BALL VALVE BRASS FIP x FIP__ % AJRed-White Valve Corf] 5 $ ] 340(8% 68.00 [ $ 115. 60 $ $ 79.00['$ $ 100.20
A52| 3v1210_| BALL VALVE BRASS FIP x FIP % EA[Red-White Valve Corfj} $ 506 $ $ 499|8% 7485] $ 817]$% 122.55 { $ $ 91501 $ 8.86 [ § 132.90
A53| 3v1215 | BALL VALVE BRASS FIP x FIP 1 30 EA|Red-White Valve Corl $ 85819 $ 847[S 254101 $ 1235 | $ 37050 | $ $ 270.00J|$  13.57[$ 407.10
A54| 3v1217 | BALL VALVE BRASS FIP x FiP 1% | 10 | EA|Red-White Valve Cor{ § 1700 {$ $ 1640]5S 1640041 2837 [$ 283.70 'S 25]$ 222501$ 31899 318.90
A55| 3v1218 | BALL VALVE BRASS FIP x FIP 2 10 | EA[Red-White Valve Corf{ § 3155 | § $  27721]% 27720)1$ 4266 % 4266018  20.00[% 290.00[f$ 5007 | % 500.70 |
1 200
A56| 3v1270 |CHECK SWING THREADED - 125#WSP W.0.G. | 5 |EA|PROFLO 31 E 820|$ $ 8.07|$ 403518 282419 1412048 9.20|$% 46.00 \ $ 1768($ 88.40
1% 200 i
A57| 3v1275 |CHECK SWING THREADED - 125#WSP W.0.G. | 5 | EA|PROFLO 31 $ 13.75 | § $ 13245 66.20/|$  3879]% 193.950 $ 13.00 | § 65.001$ 2016 |$ 145.80
2 200 |
A58 | 3v1285 |CHECK SWING THREADED - 125#WSP _ W.0.G. | 5 | EA|PROFLO 31 $ 2755|% $ 25758 12875||$  89.98|8§ 449.90 | $§ 2800(8$ 1400018  59.79|$ 298.95
GATE THREAD - FULL PORT- FORGED BRASS OR CAST |
A59| 3v1310 |BRONZE, 200PSI W.0.G. - NRS ASTM B 62 Y 5 | EA|KITZ -07 $ 485(% 24251 $ 432 8% 216018  13.09]% 65.45 || $ 775|8% 3875|1 $ 852§ 42.60 ||
GATE THREAD - FULL PORT- FORGED BRASS OR CAST ||
A60 | 3v1305 |BRONZE, 200PSI W.0.G. - NRS ASTM B 62 % 5 | EA|KITZ -07 $ 6.45] $ 3225( % 628|% 314018  1708]$ 85401 § 9.75| § 4875|118  1151]$ 57.55
GATE THREAD - FULL PORT- FORGED BRASS OR CAST ;
AB1| 3v1315 |BRONZE, 200PSI W.0.G. - NRS ASTM B 62 1 5 | EA|KITZ -07 ‘ $ 8.85| % 4425 $ 9.96| % 4980J1$  28.19|$ 140.95 || $ 13.00 | § 65.00|$ 1750} $% 87.95
GATE THREAD - FULL PORT- FORGED BRASS OR CAST 1
A62| 3v1320 |BRONZE, 200PSI W.0.G. - NRS ASTM B 62 1% 5 | EA|KITZ -07 |8 13808 69.00 | $ 13.70 | § 68.50|$  35.86|$% 179.30 | § 19.00 | $ 95.00/1$ 2563 |% 128.15
GATE THREAD - FULL PORT- FORGED BRASS OR CAST | ' |
A63| 3Vv1325 |BRONZE, 200PS|I W.O.G. - NRS ASTM B 62 1% | 5 |EA|KITZ-07 1$  18.00]S$ 9000$ 174518 872518  4325|$ 2162548 2450 ($ 122508 3079 § 153.95
GATE THREAD - FULL PORT- FORGED BRASS OR CAST l | | ; |
A64| 3v1330 |BRONZE, 200PS| W.0.G. - NRS ASTM B 62 2 15 | EA|KITZ -07 $ 2355]|% 353.25(%  2283[§% 34245(1$  51.23|$ 768.45 | $ 3300|$% 49500}1$ 48649 729.60
GATE THREAD - FULL PORT- FORGED BRASS OR CAST ‘ | l
Ag5| 3v1340 |BRONZE, 200PSI W.0.G. - NRS ASTM B 62 S 2% 5 |EAIKITZ-07 $ 6000]8 300001  5187[$ 250.35[1$ 63598 317.95 ‘ §  47.25|8% 236.2511$  6585]|§% 329.25
|| GATE THREAD - FULL PORT- FORGED BRASS OR CAST |
A66 | 3v1345 |BRONZE, 200PSI W.0.G. - NRS ASTM B 62 3 10 | EA|KITZ -07 $§ 8500]8% 850.00[l$  6384($ 63840113  87.29]$ 8729018 6950 % 695.00 85.86 | $ 858.60
| A67| 3v1355 |HOSE BIBB WITH TEE HANDLE 3001 EA|S | $ : $ __1,266.0011 § 321/ 963.001$ 191§ 21570039 $ 975.00 | $ $  2,466.00
: _ ‘ s 10,034.20 9,830.70 | 13. 51010 10,235.50 | 15,202.30 |

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP A, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED AT A .
FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submita $5,000.00 [ 5 (3.05000 [5  Gowof o% |_ 66% | 0% ]_
detailed attachment is applicabla. (estimated amount)

S s ——— | | $__6,984.20 | | $  6,830.70 | 5 13,510.10 } 6,935.50 | ,,,,l
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GROUP B

BRASS SERVICE LINE FITTINGS & ACCESSORIES

Ford #C-38-23-1.437
NL or Mueller

l NDED ‘
PRICE

500.40 § §

274.00 |

|
3B1005 COUPLING, METER %" 40 i #H10890-18N 3/4" ‘ $ 6.35]|9% 254.00 NO BID NO BID 5 12511 % : b 6.85| % NO ﬂ) NO BID
3B1006 COUPLING, METER 1" x 34" 240 |EA |Ford #C-38-24-2.5 NL}| $ 035]|% 2,244.00 ‘ NO BID NO BID 5 05719 2,296.800 % 935 % 2,244.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #C-38-23-2.5 | | ‘
NL or Mueller |
IB3 [3B1015 COUPLING METER, % 240 |EA {H10890N 3/4" 4 $ 6.01|9% 1,44240ff NOBID NO BID $ 582|% 1,396.80 1 $ 6.00| % 1,440.00 NO BID NO BID
! | ; A
Ford #C-38-44-2.625 :
B4 |3B1020 COUPLING METER, 1 40 |EA {NL or H10890N 1" $ 0241% 369.60ff NOBID NO BID $ 8.95| % 358.00 | $ 9251 % 370.00 | NO BID NO BID
Ford #C-84-33 NL or
Mueller P15428N i
B5 |3C1025 ADAPTER - MIP x CTS COMPRESSION % 105 |EA |3/4" $ 9241% 970.20 NO BID NO BID $ 032|% 978.60 l: $ 9251 % 971.25 | NO BID NO BID
|
Ford #C-84-44-NL or |
B6 [3C1030 ADAPTER - MIP x CTS COMPRESSION 1 30 |EA |Mueller P15428N 1" || $ 10904 | $ 328.20 NO BID NO BID $ 11.03 | $ 330.90 i $ 1095 | $ 328.50 ) NO BID NO BID
Ford #c-84-66 NL or i I
Mueller P15428N :
B7 {3C1035 ADAPTER - MIP x CTS COMPRESSION 1% 10 |EA |1.5" $ 20031 % 299 30 NO BID NO BID $ 30471 % 304700 $ 30.00 | $ 300.00 | NO BID NQ BID
Ford #C-84-77 NL or fi
8 |3C1040 ADAPTER - MIP x CTS COMPRESSION 2 40 |EA |Mueller P15428N 2" || § 436119 1,744 40 NO BID NO BID $ 4438 | % 1,775.20 i $ 43751 % 1,750.00 ! NO BID NO BID
Ford #C-87-77 NL or
B9 |3C1042 ADAPTER BRASS MIP X PVC COMP 2" 40 |EA |Mueller V15440N 2" || $ 5448 | % 2,179.20 NO BID NO BID $ 5204 | $ 2,081.60§ $ 54751% 2,190.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #C-14-33 NL or
Mueller P15451N
B10 [3C1045 ADAPTER - FIP x CTS COMPRESSION A 40 |EA [3/4" $ 972 % 388.80 NO BID NO BID $ 099 % 39960 || $ 9751 % 390.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #C-14-44 NL or ‘
B11 |3C1050 ADAPTER - FIP x CTS COMPRESSION 1 60 |EA |Mueller P15451N 1" Il $ 1318 | $ 790.80 NO BID NO BID $ 14291 $ 857.40 $ 13.20 | $ 792.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #C-14-66 NL or
3C1055 ADAPTER - FIP x CTS COMPRESSION 1% 5 EA |Mueller P15451 1.5" || $ 3829 | % 191.45 NO BID NO BID $ 3896 | $ 194.80 38.50 | $ 192.50 | NO BID NQ BID
Ford #C-14-77 NL or “
3C1060 ADAPTER - FIP x CTS COMPRESSION: 2 25 |EA [Mueller P15451IN 2" || $ 4558 | $ 1,139.50 NO BID NO BID $ 4642 | $ 1,160.50 1 $ 4580 | % 1,145.00 | NO BID NO BID
Ford #C-17-77 NL or i
3C1062 ADAPTER BRASS FIP X PvC COMP 2" 15 |EA |Mueller V15442N 2" || $ 62591 % 938.85 NO BID NO BID $ 5980 | % 897.00 | $ 62.75{ % 941.25 ] NO BID NO BID
3C1065 LOC-PAC, 112" 35 |EA |Ford #CT-35-66 NL $ 39941% 1,397.90 NO BID NO BID $ 4048 | $ 1416801 $ 54.00 | $ 1,890.00 NQO BID NO BID
3C1070 LOC-PAC, 2" 30 |EA |Ford #CT--35-77 NL || $ 58.12| % 1,743.60 NO BID NO BID $ 5891 | % 176730 $ 79.00 1 § 2,370.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #T-444-333 NL
or Mueller P15381N ‘ ‘
3C1075 TEE CTS COMPRESSION 3% 10 |EA |3/4" $ 27191 % 271.90 NO BID NO BID $ 26151 % 261501 $ 27.25| % 272.50 | NO BID NO BID
Ford #T-444-334 NL :
3C1080 TEE CTS COMPRESSION % x% x 1§10 |EA |or Mueller P15381N || $ 28871 % 289.70 NO BID NO BID $ 27891 % 278900 % 20.00| % 290.00 | NO BID NO BID
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IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. [[Municipal Water Works, LLC|| Southern Supply Company
B T T ey e e
i PROD ENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED

— PRODUCT DESCRIPTION 'IE@- @@J@W

Ford #T-444-444 NL

or Mueller P15381N ‘

B19 |3C1090 TEE CTS COMPRESSION 1 40 |EA |1" $ 29.10 | § 1,164.00 NO BID NO BID $ 36.27 | $ 1,450.80 * $ 29.00] % 1,160.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #C-44-33 NL or i

Mueller P15403N i
B20 |3C1115 COUPLING - CTS COMP. x CTS COMP. % 80 |EA |3/4" $ 1125] § 900.00 NO BID NO BID $ 1137 | § 909.60 § $ 1125]| % 900.00 NO BID NO BID

Ford #C-44-44 NL or

3C1120 COUPLING - CTS COMP. x CTS COMP. 1 80 |EA |Mueller P15403N 1" I § 1287 | $ 1,029.60 NO BID NO BID $ 12411 $ 9928011 $ 1290 | $ 1,032.00 NO BID NO BID

Ford #Y-44-243 NL
3C1135 WYE CTS COMPRESSION 1x% 100 |EA |or Mueller P15343N || $ 2326 | $ 2,326.00

NO BID NO BID $ 22381 % 2,238.00 || $ 23.30 | $ 2,330.00 NO BID NO BID

Ford #C-44-34 NL or

Mueller P15403N $ 1307 | $ 980.25 NO BID NO BID $ 12.55 | $ 941.25 |

g

$ 13.00 | $ 975.00 NO BID NO BID

3C1117 COUPLING, %" x 1" CTS 75

Ford #C-77-77 NL or

Mueller V15401N $ 8220 | § 822.00 NO BID NO BID $ 84.74 | $ 847408 $ 82.501 § 825.00 NO BID NO BID

2

3C1132 UNION CMPS. BRASS 2" PVC X PVC X COMP 10

Ford #Y-44-274 NL
or Mueller P15343N
[Ford #FNG-D4 NL
Ford #NG-FF4 NL
Ford #NG-F4 NL

65.30
3.40
525
5.25

66.50
3.05
4.68
3.47

ea

SRR | R R

1,950.00 | NOBID NO BID
340.00 [ _NOBID NO BID
656.25 || NO BID NOBD |
420.00 | NOBID NOBD |

65.00
2.99
4.58
3.40

1,950.00 f NOBID NO BID
299.00 | NOBID NO BID
57250 | NOBID NOBID
27200 | NOBID NOBID

1,995.00
305.00
585.00
277.60

3C1138 WYE 2 x1 COMP 30
3C1221 BELL NUT, FNG D4 34" CRB/CRP 100
3C1222 BELL NUT, 1" NG-FF4 FOR CORPS 125
3C1223 BELL NUT, 1" NG-F4 FOR CURBSTOPS 80

IR B

EEE
€Al en|en|eH
Rler|h|es
SR ep|Bles

olenlenles
SRR

enlenlen

L8
CA &

Ford #FB1000-3 NL
or Mueller P2500 3/4"|| $ 2903 |$ 435.45
Ford #FB1000-4 NL
or Mueller P25008N
e $ 38189 763.60
Ford #FB1700-6 NL
or Mueller B20046N
3C1225 |CORP-BALL - MIPT x FIPT 1% 20 | EA|1.5" $ 82771% 1,655.40
Ford #FB1600-6 NL
or Museller B20045N
B32| 3C1226 |CORP-BALL-CC x FIPT 1% 10 | EA|1.5" $ 82771 % 827.70
Ford #FB1600-7 NL
or Mueller B20045N
B33| 3C1228 |CORP -BALL -CC x FIPT 2 10 | EA]2" $ 133.91 | $ 1,339.10
Ford #FB1700-7 NL
or Mueller B20046N
B34| 3C1230 |CORP -BALL - MIP x FIP, 2 35 | EA|2" $ 13728 | $ 4,804.80
Ford #FB1100-3 NL
or Mueller P25028N
B35| 3C1235 |CORP - MIPT x CTS COMPRESSION, FULL PORT 300 PSI % 50 | EA}3/4" $ 29.03|$% 1,451.50
Ford #FB1100-4NL
or Mueller P25028N
B36| 3C1243 |CORP.STOP 1", FULL PORT 300 PSI, 80 | EAJ1" $ 33.15{ % 3,132.00 NO BID NO BID $ 39.10| $ 3,128.00 |
Ford #FB41-333W
NL or Mueller
B37| 3C1250 |CURB BALL FULL PORT CTS COMP. x FIP W/LOCK WINGS  |3% 80 | EA|P25170N 3/4" $ 37.08 1 % 2,966.40 NO BID NO BID $ 37251 % 2,980.001 $ 3725| % 2,980.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #FB41-444W
NL or Mueller
B38| 3C1255 |CURB BALL FULL PORT CTS COMP. x FIP W/LOCK WINGS |1 75 | EAJP25170N 1" $ 56.24 | $ 4,218.00 NOBID NO BID ‘

b

NO BID NO BID $ 29.71| $ 445651 $ 30.00| $ 450.00 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $ 39.10 | $ 782.00 $ 39.50 | $ 790.00 NO BID NO BID io

3C1215 |CORP - CC x CTS COMPRESSION- FULL PORT 300 PSI, % 15

g

3C1220 |CORP - CC x CTS COMPRESSION- FULL PORT 300 PSlI, 1 20

NO BID NO BID $ 85.31]9% 1,706.20 | $ 8525 | 9% 1,705.00 NO BID NOBID

NO BID NOBID $ 8531 | % 853.10 | $ 85.25] % 852.50 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NOBID $ 138.01 | $ 1,380.10 $ 138.00 | $ 1,380.00 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $ 138.01 1 % 48303511 § 138.00 | $ 4,830.00 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID 29.71 ] % 1,485.50 || § 30.00 | $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID

-

$ 39.00 | $ 3,120.00 NO BID NO BID

$ 56.46 | § 4,23450] $ 56.50 | $ 4,237.50 NO BID NO BID
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l Southern Supply Company \

‘ Sarasota, FL |
EXTENDED
==————— || UNIT PRICE _—PRICE

IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline, Inc. ‘HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.| Municipal Water Works, LLC
Note This excel spreadshest is inter-active. Insert unit price in column H and extended pricing and grand total pricing | \
will automatically extend and populate; Bidder to verify accuracy! Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL
PRODUCT u EXTENDED ENDED EXTENDED
. PRODUCT DESCRIPTION . l Mm UNIT PRICE PRI e

Sanford, FL

Ford #FB1 1-333W
NL or Mueller ‘

B3g| 3C1260 [CURE BALL FIPT x FIPT FULL PORT W/LOCK WINGS % 40 | EA|B20200N 3/4" $ 3297195 1 ,318.80 NO BID NO BID $ 3311 ] % 1,324.40 ' $ 33.00 | § 1,320.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #FB11-444W '
NL or Mueller

B40| 3C1265 [CURB BALL FIPT x FIPT FULL PORT W/LOCK WINGS 1 15 | EA|B20300N 1" $ 50.51 | $ 757.65 NO BID NO BID | § 50.70 | § 760.50 || $ 5075 | $ 761.25 NO BID NO BID
Ford #FB11-666W
NL or Mueller

B41| 3C1270 |CURB BALL FIPT x FIPT FULL PORT W/LOCK WINGS 1% 16 | EA|B20300N 1.5" $ 102.05 | $ 1,630.75 NO BID NO BID $ 103.33 | § 1,549.95 1 $ 102.50 | $ 1,5637.50 NOC BID NOBID
Ford #FB11-777W .
NL or Mueller

B42| 3C1275 |CURB BALL FIPT x FIPT FULL PORT W/LOCK WINGS 2 25 | EA|B20300N 2" $ 148.65| $ 3,716.25 NO BID NO BID $ 15044 | 3,761.00 1 $ 149.50 | $ 3,737 50 NO BID NO BID
Ford #FB71-333W
NL or Mueller

B43| 3C1248 |PVC CURBSTOPS, w lock rings, 3/4" 40 | EA|E25196N 3/4" $ 43321 % 1,732.80 NO BID NO BID s 4344 | § 1,737.60 || § 4350 | $ 1,740.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #FB71-444W
NL or Mueller

B44|] 3C1253 ({Valve Curb 1" w/ lock wing PVC 1" 40 | EA{V25108N 1" $ 6095 | § 2,438.00 NO BID NO BID | $ 4018 | § 1,867.20 )| $ 61.25 | § 2,450.00 NO BID NO BID
Ford #L44-44 NL or

B45| 3C1105 |ELLS CTS COMPRESSION 1 35 | EA|Mueller P16526N 1" || $ 18.66 | § 653.10 NO BID NO BID $ 17951 % 6282511 $ 18.75 | § 656.25 NO BID NO BID
Ford #C47-33 NL or
Mueller E15443N

B46| 3C1256 |COUPLING, 3/4 CTS. X 3/4" PVC 10  EA|3/4" $ 1520 | $ 152.00 NO BID NO BID $ 14.68 | § 146.80 1525 | § 152.50 NO BID NO BID
Ford #CA7-44 NL or

B47| 3C1257 |COUPLING, 1" CTS x1" PVC 20 | EA|Mueller VI5441N 1" )| $ 21961 % 439.20 NOBID NO BID $ 2082 % 416.40 22001 % 440.00 NO BID NO BID

B48{ 3C1280 |"Y" BRANCH, 2" x (FOUR) 1" 10 | EA|Ford #Y11-474 NL 3 45351 9% 453.50 NO BID NO BID $ 46.49 | $ 464 90 4550 | $ 455.00 NO BID NO BID
Mueller B2434F or

B49] 3wW1155 |Meter VB42-7W Reset 150 | EA |Ford VB42 7W NL $ 6368 |3 9,552.00 NO BID NO BID $ 8306 % 12,458.00 78751 % 11,812.50 NO BID NO BID
Mueller B2434F or “ ||

B50| 3w1160 |Meter VB42-9W Reset 40 | EA|Ford VB42 9W NL $ 64.42 | % 2,576.80 NO BID NO BID $ 8495| % 3,398.00 7950 | $ 3,180.00 NO BID NO BID
Mueller B2434F or

B51| 3W1165 |Meter FVB4212W 3/4” x 12" Resst 10 |EA|Ford VB42 12W NL [ $ 66.53 | $ 665.30 NO BID NO BID $ 8788|% 878.80 8150 | 815.00 NO BID NO BID

il Mueller B2434F or || || ’I

B52 | 3W1225 |Meter FVB4215W 3/4" x 15" Reset 5 |EA|Ford VB42 18SW NL || $ 67.00 | $ 335.00 NO BID NO BID $ 9086 | % 454.30 84.00 | $ 420.00 NO BID NQ BID
Mueller B2434F or ||

B53| 3w1170 |Meter FYB4218W 3/4" x 18" Resst 10 | EA|Ford VB42Z 1BW NL || $ 75.80 | $ 758.00 NO BID NO BID 3 g97.87 | % 978.70 9250 | $ 925.00 NO BID NO BID
Mueller B2434F or

B54| 3w1180 |Meter VB44 1" x 10" W Reset 5 | EA|Ford VB44 10W NL |l § 131751 % 658.75 NO BID NO BID $ 1489118 749.55 14050 | § 702.50 NO BID NO BID Il
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IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products \ Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. r Municipal Water Works, LLC|| Southern Supply Company
Note: This excel spreadsheet is inter-active. Insert unit price in column H and extended pricing and grand total pricing | ' ‘
will automatically extend and populate; Bidder to verify accuracyl! Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL Sanford, FL Sarasota, FL
u EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED

— I _ _ B s 76.531.00 (NN  noBiD | lls 8130000 fls 81.608.25 il noBD |
| |

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP B, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED AT A | = | = !

FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submita $5,000.00 5 {2 ' % |’ 4% |5 (1.700,00 s 0% |

detailed attachment is applicable. ‘ " | - : : i
{estimated amount) |

GRAND TOTAL GROUP B I N v

GROUP C
BRASS BACKFLOW PREVENTION DEVICES

Ci | 3viZz30 |DOUBLE CHECK VALVE 34" 4 | EA|WILKINS 34-850XL | 3 85.00 | ® 3400015  B3.77 | % 335.08 || & 67.91] b 351 64 6250 | % J300001s 10000 % 400.00
C2 | 3V1235 |DOUBLE CHECK VALVE 1.0" 4 [EA[WILKINS 1-050XL ||$ 100.00[$ 40000)'$ 103.66 | $ 41464||$ 108.79[$ 435.16 1§ 102.00 [ $ 408.00[|8 12375[§ 495.00
C3 | 3V1245 |DOUBLE CHECK VALVE 15" 4 [EAJWILKINS 112-950XLJ[$ 226.00 | $ 904008 —23037][$ 921.48[$ 24176 $ 067.04[Is 225.00[% 900.00||$ 275.00 [ § 1,100.00
C4 | 3v1240 |DOUBLE CHECK VALVE 2.0" 4 [EA[WILKINS 2-950XL [|$ 263.00 | § 1,05200[l$ 27225[% 1,08900/[§ 28571} % 1,142.84||$  268.00 | § 1,072.00018  312.00[$ 1,248.00
C5 | 3v1020 |DOUBLE CHECKVALVE 3.0" 4 |EAJWILKINS 3-350 AOSY[$ 967.00 [ $ 3,868.00[$ ©994.76 | % 3,979.04 1S 1,043.96 | § 417584 1S 980.00[§ 3,920.00$ 118750 [ § 4,750.00
C6 | 3v1020D |DOUBLE CHECK VALVE W/DETECTOR 3.0" 4 | EA|WILKINS 3-350ADA-4{$ 1,21000 | $ 4,840.00||$ 1,25654 [ $ 502616 ||$ 1,31868 | % 5274.72|$ 122500 [ % 4900.00|[$ 1,500.00] % 6,000.00 |
C7 | _3v1025_|DOUBLE CHECK VALVE 4.0 4 | EA|[WILKINS 4-350A0SY||$ 1,136.00 | $ 4,544.00||$ 1,178.01 [ $ 4712.04[[$ 123626 % 4945048 1,160.00 | § 4640.00||$ 1,40625] % 5,625.00
C8 | 3v1025D0_|DOUBLE CHECK VALVE W/DETECTOR 4.0 4 | EA|WILKINS 4-350ADA-{$ 1,302.00 | $ 5208.00[[$ 1.350.79 (% 540316 ||$ 141758 | $ 5670.32[$ 1.32500]% 5300008 1.61250[$ 6,450.00
C9 | 3v1035_|DOUBLE CHECK VALVE 6.0" 4 | EA|WILKINS 6-350A0SY||$ 1,741.00 [ § 6,064.00[[$ 1,80628[§ 722512 ||$ 1.895.60 | $ 7582403 1,77500[$ 7.100.00||$ 2,15625| $ 8,625.00
C10| 3v1035D |DOUBLE CHECK VALVE W/DETECTOR 6.0" 4 |EA|WILKINS 6-350ADA-3|$ 1,934.00 [ $ 7.736.00[$ 2,006.28 | § 8,025.12[[$ 2,10549]$ 8421961l 197500 | % 7.000.00l|$ 239500 % 9,580.00
C11| 3v1030 |DOUBLE CHECK VALVE 8.0" 4 |EA|WILKINS 8-350A0SY||$ 3,17500[$ 12,700.00|$ 3,298.43[$ 13,19372[$ 346154 |$ 13.846.16 % 3.24500[% 12,980.00[$ 3,93750|$ 15,750.00
Cc12| 3v1030D |DOUBLE CHECK VALVE W/DETECTOR 8.0° 4 Emele 8-350ADA-4|$ 3,650.00[$ 14,600.00||$ 3,790.58|$ 15162.32||$ 3,97802|$ 15912.08||$ 3,72500|% 14,900.00|$§ 4,525.00|$ 18,100.00
C13| 3v1360 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE 3/4" 4 [EA|WILKINS 34-975XL [|$  146.00 | $ 58400)|$ 14764 % 590.56 || $ 8791 $ 35164[[§ 14500 $ 580.00|$ 176.25| % 705,00 ||
C14| 3v1365 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE 13 4 |EAJWILKINS 1-975XL |3 156.00 | § 624.00[|$ 153.93[$ 615.72[|$ 16154 | $ 646.16||$  150.00] $ 600.00$  183.75]$ 735.00
C15| 3v1370 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE 15" 4 |EAJWILKINS 112-975XL ||$  299.00] § 1,196.00 ||$ 29948 [ % 1,197.921% 31429 $ 1,257.16 {8 295.00] % 1,180.00f$ 35750 % 1,430.00
C16] 3v1375 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE 2.0" 4 [EAJWILKINS 2-975XL ||$ 333.00] % 1,332.001$ 34346} $ 1,37384[[$ 36044 $ 144176 |$ 33500] % 1,34000l$ 41000] $ 1,640 00
C17| 3v1005 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE 3.0" 4 | EAJWILKINS 3-375A08Y]|$ 1,129.00 [ $ 4516.00||$ 1,16963 ] $ 467852||$ 1227471 $ 490988115 115000 % 4600.001|$ 1,396.25 [ $ 5,585.00
C18| 3v10050 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE W/DETECTOR 3.0" 4 | EAJWILKINS 3-375ADA-4[$ 1,669.00 | $ 6,676.00 | 3 1,724.61| % 6,808.44|$ 1,800.89]§ 723956||$ 1,695.00] % 6,780.00||$ 2,05875] % 8.235.00
C19| 3v1010 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE 4.0" 4 | EAIWILKINS 4-375A0SWY|$ 1,305.00 | $ 522000 f$ 1,353.93 [ § 5415.72||$ 142088 $ 5683526 1330.00[$ 5320.00||$ 161625[$ 6,465.&"
C20| 3v1010D0_|REDUCED PRESSURE TYPW W/DETECTOR 40" 4 |EA[WILKINS 4-375ADA-|$ 1.780.00 [ § 7120003 1,846.07 [ § 738428 1,937.36 [ % 7749445 181500 $ 7.260.00||$ 2,20375[ % 8,815.00
C21| 3v1015 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE 6.0" 4 |EA[WILKINS 6-375A0SYY|$ 2,162.00 [ § 8648001 2.24293% 8971.72||3 2,35385[$ 9,41540|[$ 2,20000 [ $ 8,800.00|$ 267750[$% 10,710.00
C22| 3v1015D_|REDUCED PRESSURE TYPW W/DETECTOR 6.0" 4 |EA|WILKINS 6-375ADA-§{$ 2,539.00|$ 10,156.00[|$ 262827 [$ 10,513.08||$ 275824 % 11,032.96{$ 257500]$ 10,300.00[[$ 3,13750|$ 12,550.00
C23| 3V1017 |REDUCED PRESSURE TYPE 8.0" 4 |EA]WILKINS 8-375A0SY|$ 4,069.00 [$  16,276.001$ 422199|$ 16,887.96||$ 443077 [$ 17,723.08[{$ 4,150.00]$% 16,600.00]f$ 504000 |$  20,160.00
C24| 3v1017D IREDUCED PRESSURE TYPE W/DETECTOR 8.0" 4 | EAIWILKINS 8-375ADA-dI$ 466700 | 18,6800 4831411% 10,3256411$ 5070331% 20,281.320% 4750001% 19,000.000% 5767501%  23,070.00

SUB TOTAL, GROUP C & 144,172.00 § 14924028 $  156.457.08 § 148710.00 $ 178.223.00
FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP C, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED AT A _ :

FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submit & 55,000.00 55% § (2.750.00) 52% § (280000 56% § (2.800.00) 48% (240000 0% g
detailed attachment is applicable. (estimatad amount)
GRAND TOTAL., GROUP C $ 141,422.00 % 148,740.28 $ 153,657.08 $ 144,310.00 $ 178,223.00
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