MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

INTENT TO AWARD
Mc _Hzb|i, K<
SUBJECT Auto and Truck Parts DATE POSTED ce /A
PURCHASING Ceorge Earnest CPPB, DATE CONTRACT ...
REPRESENTATIVE PH (941) 749-3044 SHALL BE AWARDED

CONSEQUENCES IF Inability to repair light and

DEPARTMENT Public Works, Fleet Division DEFERRED heavy vehicles

George Earnest CPPB,
RFQ #16-1331GE Auto and AUTHORIZED BY Buyer %-:

POMSTATON. Truck Parts DATE  April 26, 2016

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Manatee County intends to award Blanket Purchase Orders (for four years) to Auto Plus Auto Parts (Pep Boys), Fleet
Pride, Inc., Fleet Products, Genuine Automotive Supply and The Parts House per the terms, conditions and
specifications of RFQ 16-1732GE as indicated on the attached Quote Response Tabulation.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.

Manatee County Code of Laws

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION
On March 17, 2016 RFQ 16-1331GE for Auto and Truck Parts was issued. There were no addendums.
On March 30, 2016 eight (8) quote responses were received: Auto Plus Auto Parts (Pep Boys), Fleet
Pride, Inc., Fleet Products, Genuine Automotive Supply (NAPA), Northside Auto Parts, O’Reilly Auto
Parts, Original Equipment Company, and The Parts House.
After an evaluation, Auto Plus Auto Parts (Pep Boys), Fleet Pride, Inc., Fleet Products, Genuine Automotive
Supply and The Parts House, as the lowest responsive and responsible quoters on Group-By-Group
basis, will be awarded a Blanket Purchase Order per the Quote Response Tabulation attached.

QUOTER LOCATION

Auto Plus Auto Parts (Pep Boys), Moorestown, NJ
Fleet Pride, Inc., Bradenton, FL
Fleet Products, Tampa, FL
LIST: Genuine Automotive Supply (NAPA), Bradenton, FL
Northside Auto Parts, Palmetto, FL
O’Reilly Auto Parts, Springfield, MO
Original Equipment Company, Belle Glade, FL
The Parts House, Bradenton, FL




QUOTE RESPONSE TABULATION

RFQ #16-1331GE, AUTO AND TRUCK PARTS

e ; Fleet Genuine Northside O’Reill Original The Parts
Deserpuen AltorPlus Flset Pride Products Parts Auto Parts Auto Pau\'/ts Equipment House
SECTIGH $2,304.76 Incomplete | $2,390.31 $2,224.90 $2,692.30 Incomplete | Incomplete | $2,115.82

Group 1-A/C Parts g e e e —
SECTION A:
Group 2 — Light Duty | $21,555.10 | No Bid $21,212.54 | $18,523.54 | $24,824.34 | Incomplete | Incomplete | $20,917.82
Brakes
GrojngloE'I\leﬁt.rical No Bid Incomplete | $3,290.00 $4,643.29 $5,947.36 Incomplete | Incomplete | $4,186.37
SECTION A: Group 4 (awarded as one Group with three components)
Belts $3,152.01 $3,057.17 $3,053.37 $3,062.68 $4,261.32 $3,579.28 Incomplete | No Bid
Hose $1,735.69 Incomplete | $2,046.05 $1,528.60 $2,172.93 Incomplete | Incomplete | $1,289.50
Caps $488.22 Incomplete | $423.88 $605.32 $741.52 $684.70 $590.96 $611.64
Gr(s)igtllo-[i:t.als $5,375.92 Incomplete | $5,523.30 $5,196.60 $7,175.77 Incomplete | Incomplete | Incomplete
HEEAICH A $10,023.07 | Incomplete | $17,622.95 | $21,440.03 | $27,931.37 | Incomplete | Incomplete | $18,697.26
Group 5 — Chemicals i e e e T
SEETIHIEE No Bid $6,302.60 $7,493.04 No Bid $8,880.78 Incomplete | Incomplete | $6,530.23
Group 1 —Seals i s A e
SECTION B:
Raupe= No Bid $1,083.18 | $1,478.50 | No Bid $1,901.38 | Incomplete | No Bid $1,516.58
Gaskets/Hubodometer/ a— T S e
Brake Tubing/U-Joints
SECTION B:
Group 3 — Heavy No Bid $41,000.68 | $44,949.69 | No Bid $57,661.11 | Incomplete | No Bid $43,668.59

Duty Brakes




