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DTE .,.....u 

\ 
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid (IFB) 15-1599BLS, Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole 
Rehabilitation Services (as required) to multiple lowest responsive, responsible bidders by group. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, 
resolutions, policy. 

Manatee County Code of Laws 

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION 

~ It is the intent of the County to establish an agreement to procure, on an "as required" basis Sanitary Sewer Systems, 
Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole Rehabilitation Services. The proposed work may include, but not limited to, 
6"-72" Cured in Place (CIPP), TV inspection and computerized analysis, smoke testing, trench less reconstruction, 
manhole, and lateral rehabilitation which may include cleaning and inspection, sewage bypass pumping, reestablishing 
service connections, maintenance of traffic, surface restoration and any associated work required to complete a project 
in accordance with this IFB specification. The underground infrastructure includes underground sewer and stormwater 
lines, manholes / wet wells throughout the County. 

~ The County solicited bids for Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole Rehabilitation Services 
(as required). Notice of IFB 15-1599BLS was solicited on MyManatee.org, Manatee County Chamber, and to 42 
plan holders on Demand Star. 

~ Formal competitive sealed bid procedures were followed resulting in seven (7) bids (see attachment). 

~ Group 4 - The County is not awarding Group 4 due to a unit of measure error on the bid form which prevented viable 
bids. The County will issue a new IFB solicitation for Group 4 only. 

~ BLD Services, LLC, Insituform Technologies, LLC, and Lanzo Trenchless Technologies exceeded the maximum 5% 
markup on mobilization and demobilization and therefore have been deemed non-responsive in Groups 1, 2, and 3. 

~ February 16, 2016, received letters from William Elmore, Utilities Supervisor and Paul D. Smith, Public Works Division 
Manager - Field Maintenance recommending awards for Groups 1, 2, and 3. 

ATIACHMENTS FUNDING SOURCE 
xD Funds Verified 

(List in order of attached) • tabulation (Acct Number & Name) 0 Insufficient Funds 
Various Account 

Annual Estimate AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING COSTS Numbers (Sanitary, 
COST $1 ,700,000.00 (Attach Fiscal Impact Statement) Storm & Manhole Rehab) 
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Agenda 
February 23, 2016 - Regular Meeting 

Category 
B. CONSENT AGENDA 

Sub·Category 
Financial Management 

Approval Path 
FM (Purchasing-Dennis) 

Subject 

rJ1111ent 

IFB 15-1599BLS, Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line &. Manhole Rehabilitation Services 

Briefings 
None 

Contact and/or Presenter Information 
Bonnie Sletman, Sr. Buyer, FMD, Purchasing Division, x3046 
Rob Shankle, Division Manager, utilities, Underground Maintenance, x5275 
Paul "Danny" Smith, Division Manager, Public Works, Maintenance, x7494 

Action Requested 
Authorization to award Invitation for Bid (IFB) 15-1599BLS, Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line 
and Manhole Rehabilitation Services to multiple responsive, responsible bidders by group as indicated. 

GROUP 1 ~ Sanitary Sewer & Stormwater 
1) lTV Incorporated, St. Petersburg, FL 
2) GML Coatings LLC, Lakewood R.anch, FL 
3) Hinterland Group Inc., ruviera Seach, FL 
4) VacVlslon Environmental LLC, Tampa, FL 

GROUP 2 - Sanitary Sewer Systems 
1) Hinterland Group Inc. 

GROUP 3 ~ Line & Manhole Rehabilitation 
1) GML Coatings LLC, Lakewood Ranch, FL 
2) Hinterland Group Inc., Riviera Beach, FL 
3) VacVlslon Environmental LLC, Tampa, FL 

Enabling/Regulating Authority 
Manatee County Code of Laws 

Background Discussion 
It is the Intent of the County to establish an annual agreement to procure, on an "as required" baSis, Sanitary 
Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole Rehabilitation Services. The underground Infrastructure 
includes underground sewer and stormwater lines, manholes I wet wells throughout the County. The proposed 
work may include, but not be limited to, 6"~72n Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP), TV Inspection and computerized 
analYSiS, smoke testing, trench less reconstruction, manhole, and lateral rehabilitation which may Include cleaning 
and inspection, sewage bypass pumping, reestablishing service connections, maintenance of traffiC, surface 
restoration and any associated work required to complete a project in accordance with the Invitation for Bid. 

help 

The County solicited bids for Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole Rehabilitation 
Services. Notice of JFB 15-1599BLS was solicited on MyManatee.org, Manatee County Chamber, and Demand Star. 

2117/20163:41 PM 
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Formal competitive sealed bid procedures were followed resulting in seven (7) bids as Identified on the attached bid 
tabulation. 

county Attorney Review 
Not Reviewed (No apparent legal Issues) 

Explanation of Other 

Reviewing Attorney 
N/A 

Instructions to Board Records 
Please send a stamped approved copy of this item to: 
bonnie s!etman@mymanatee Org 

Cost and Funds Source Account Number and Name 
Sanitary, Storm, Manhole Rehab (various account numbers); Estimated annual budgets: Utilities storm water 
laterlals, manholes, main line lining - $1,200,000; Public Works - sanitary sewer - $500,000; 

Amount and Frequency of Recurring Costs 
N/A 

Attachments: (Jist) 

Bonnie Sletman • () 
Role ; Item Author 

Ltr recommendation, 
Public Works. pdf 

Version: 1.2.1.3 - 1.2.7.5 

Ltr recommendation, 
Utilities, pdf 

IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer 
~~ormwater Line Man..hole R,~_hab 

Serv,pdf 

Close Edit Delete 

log out 

© 2002-2016, Idea Integration Corp. 
All Rights Reserved 

2/ 17120163:41 PM 



BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation , BLD Servi .... LLC I to. <:""'-~ Hinterlaad Group, InC., lnsituform. TeclmOlOgiefi' l J.T.V. Incorporated 

Lanzo Trenchltll 
Tedmologia South 

L FT, Services) I li' ........... 'T . .t. .... _ .... 0 ........ 

Est. 

Size 
1"""0,'/ u~,.r I , fJ __ ~ , / hnoMd 

Otv Meoure PrlclDu. PrlrI"D'II',' ...... ........ 

GROUP 1 _ SECTION A 

SANITARY SEWER & STORMWATER 

L. FL LL(' ChC!l:erfieJd. MO ~t_P..t"'l'IiIhllro_ FT. 

E:rtended / II EIIended I II EIlended 
Fl'frinl I Prlcln2 Prie1n2 Pridna Priml Pricinv: 

E ..... ded 
JliridU'li!' I 1"dfim~' 

LLC Ta.'Ilp&, FL 

EIlended 
r lidna· I Pricia2 

Sewer I Jne CIVR!p: .Ad 'p'QP5dgn I 

1 LO tCleanin '''toll'' diameter 10000 IiIlearfoot $0.00 -NO IJlJ) 1 ~~.I 50.50 $ 5,000.0,," ~ 1...11.1': 11;fti*-'.1II 51.00 S 10,000.0'" '5:!J!91 S 3O,OOO.1KT S1.!O t l{!l,l!I~fUIO I 
14" to 18" diameter 8000 Iinearfoot $0.00 NODID tUJ , 1M. $0.60 $ 4.800.00 S 2.40 S 19.200.00 52.00 S 1 000.00 $5.00 S 40000.00 52.00 $ 16.000.00 
20"to24" diallltter 8000 lillearfoot 50.00 NOBID S $1.00 S 1,000.00 S 3.20 S 25,600.00 $3.00 S :UOOD.OO 54.00 5 32000.00 $1.00 S 16.000.00 
27"1041" dI.meter 3000 liDearloot 50.00 NO BID MM S lJMa $2.00 $ 6.000.00 5 5.20 $ 15.,600.00 54.00 $ 12000.00 $!'-OO $ 27000.00 $2.00 $ 6,000.00 

2 

13 !HI!H,",v 

5 

• II Cuttinv: 

3000 Ilaearlool SO.OO NO BID S ~ 53.00 $ 9000.00 $ 9.10 $ 27,300.00 513.00 $ 39000.00 $n.oo 5 36.000.00 $2.00 5 6.000.00 
l:-!<I" .l!lameter 2000 linear foot 50.00 NO WD 1II • .s ~ 54.00 $ 8000.00 $ 14.30 5 2&.600.00 515.00 $ ~A_MA_AA ~'1.U'" 

6" to 12" lalDeter 10000 llnear foot < $0.00 NO BID I I $l.00 5 20000.00 $ 2.10 5 21.000.00 51.00 $ 10000.00 54.00 5 
14" to 13" diameter 5000 lInur rool 50.00 NO BID I $2.00 $ 10000.00 $ 2.60 $ 13,000.00 $2.00 $ 10000.00 $6.00 5 
20"t024" diameter 5000 llnearloot $0.00 NOBID II ' $2.50 $ 12.500.00 $ 3.90 $ 19,500.00 $3.00 $ 15.000.00 $8.00 5 
27"t042" diameter 3000 liaearfoot $0.00 NOBID $3.00 $ 9000.00 $ 7.110 $ 23,400.00 $04.00 $ 12,000.00 $10.00 5 
43" to 54" d.lameter 3008 lbaearlool 50.00 NO BID S 1i $4.00 5 n.8oo.oo 5 11.70 $ 35,100.00 $13.00 $ 39000.00 $14.00 5 
> 54" llIameter 2000 liDearlool 50.00 NO BID 10,. , $5.00 5 10 00.00 5 16.90 $ 33.100.0(1 $15.00 $ 30.000.00 $32.00 $ 

40,000.00 
30.000.00 
40,000.00 
30,000.00 
42,000.00 
64 •••• .0. 

$3.0. 15,000. 
54.00 
57.00 

113."11 3' 
$20.00 $ 41 

...J!i" 10 12" d..iIImete.- 5000 Ib!.ur fool SO.OO NO BID J 54.00 $ 20 000.00 $ 2.30 5 n.500.0'l 52.00 $ 10,000.00 $B.OO 5 40000.00 Sl.OO 5 10000.00 
dlameler 5000 llDear foot $0.00 NO BID ..JI:!!. •. ._. 54.00 5 20 000.00 $ 2.90 5 14,500.00 $3.00 5 15 000.00 512.00 $ 60.800.00 $5.00 5 15 000.00 
dlameter SOOO lInur fool $0.00 NO BID ~ S • 54.00 $ 20 000.00 $ 4.20 5 21.000.Of[ 54.00 $ 20 000.00 516.00 $ 10,000.00 $7.00 $ 35000.00 
diameler 3000 linear foot SO.OO NO BID _1'" S ' $5.00 $ 15.000.00 "i B.4O $ 25.200.00 510.00 $ 30000.00 524.00 S 72,000.00 512.00 $ 36.000.00 
diameter 2000 linear fool 50.00 NO BID , 56.00 S 12.000.00 ."i 13.00 S 26.000.0{! 518.00 $ 36000.00 $44.00 $ 00.00 m.oo S 50.000.00 

1>54" diameter 1000 Ilaearfoot $0.00 NOBID == 'I $7.00 5 7000.01) S 21.40 $ 21,400.81 525.00 5 25000.00 S80.00 5 80000.00 540.00 S 40000.00 

Ir foot ' $0.00 NO BID S _~ $4.00 5 12,000.011 +i 5.20 $ 15.600.0_ 51.00 $ 3000.00 55.00 $ 15 OOO.OU $2.00 5 6.000.00 
:.l!'-iameter 3000 ll1Iurfool $0.00 NOBID ..!:!:!! , 56.00 $ 18.000.00-.5 7.10 $ 23,400.01) 52.00 $ 6.000.00 510.00 $ 30000.00 $2.00 $ 000.00 

3000 liaear foot $0.00 NO BID ~, _~! 58.00 $ 24,000.00 $ 9.70 $ 29.100.Of) 53.00 $ 9000.00 $15.00 5 45.000.00 53.00 $ 9000.00 
dlameler 3000 liaear foot $0.00 NO BID u..-Su.; I 510.00 5 30 000.00 $ 19.50 $ 58.500.011 54.00 $ 12 000.00 520.00 5 60 000.00 55.00 $ 15000.00 
dlalJleler 2000 liaH.r foot SO.OO NO BID ... I $18.00 $ 20 000.00 $ 25.90 $ 51,800.0~ $12.00 5 24 000.00 525.00 5 50 000.00 57.00 $ 14000.00 

j,l~m"u 1. 2.00 -. roo< S.... NO BID I $14... $ 28 000." I 37.60 I 75.2..... 115... I 3. ...... ISO." I 1 ....... 00 17... I 14 ••.•• 

.J!" to 12" d!amel..- 3000 linurloot SO.OO NO BID II $10.00 5 30000.00 $ 11.70 5 35,100.00 518.00 $ 54 000.00 $20.00 $ 60 000.00 $20.00 5 
dlameler 3000 linear foot SO.OO NO BID S $12.00 5 3 000.00 5 15.60 $ 46.,800.00 520.00 $ 60 000.00 $30.00 $ 90,000.00 527.00 $ 

diameter 2000 IiDear fool $0.00 NO BID S ~J $16.00 $ 32.000.00 $ 23.30 5 46.600.OU $25.00 $ 50 000.00 540.00 $ 80 000.00 535.00 $ 70.000.00 
dlameler 1000 Hnur foot $0.00 NO BID J •• S20.00 $ 20000.00 5 31.10 5 31100.0f) $28.00 $ _28,000.00 S60.00 5 60 000.00 $60.00 S 60 000.00 
dlameler 1000 Unur foot $0.00 NO BID J 520.00 $ 20 000.00 $ 38.90 $ 38.900.00- $30.00 5 30000.00 $90.00 S 90 000.00 $70.00 $ 70 000.00 

> 54" diameler 2000 HnH.r fool $0.00 NO BID ,..."..... . 520.00 S 40 000.00 $ 70.00 $ 140 000.00 $35.00 5 70 000.00 $120.00 5 240 000.00 $ao.oo $ 160,000.00 

1>54" 

I 
-l!" to 12" ~iameter I 3000 Unelrfool 50.00 NO BID 1'''' " $10.00 $ 30.000.00 $ 5.20 $ 15,600.00 56.00 $ 1 000.00 $20.00 $ 60 000.00 $20.00 $ 60 000.00 

3000 liRur foot 50.00 NO BID S 512.00 $ 36000.00 $ 7.80 $ 23,400.00 $8.00 $ 24000.00 530.00 $ 90 000.00 $20.00 $ 60.800.00 
2&" to 24" diameter 1000 lianr foot 50.00 NO BID I.UI S _ $16.00 5 16000.00 $ 18.20 5 111,200.00 510.00 $ 10000.00 540.00 5 40000.00 520.00 $ 20000.00 
27" to 42" diameter 1000 llD.ear foot $0.00 NO BID U5i I $20.00 $ 20000.00 $ 28.50 5 28,500.00 $15.00 5 15000.00 560.00 5 60 000.00 520.00 5 20 000.00 
43" to 54" diameler 1000 llDear fool $0.00 NO BID .... S" $20.00 $ 20000.00 $ 41.50 5 41.soo.00 518.00 $ 18,000.00 $90.00 $ 90,000.00 520.00 $ 20 000.00 
;.. 54" dlam~l~r 2008 lInur fool 'M. _ _ ' lJ, SlO.8O $ .o(G,oeo.eo 5 75.» $ $20.00 $ 40 000.00$120.80 $ 248.01 $20.00 $ 40.000.00 

IFa 15-1599aLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx 



BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS Lanzo T ... cbleIt 
TodmoIogIa South (Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation BLDs.rnc..,LLC CMl.COIIIIqo.UC I _t..I.udGrotIPoIlle-!m_onnTedm ......... 1 J.T.V.lncorporated ._._--_._---

8fj 
1 1i"-54" 4 

8 IPnmn Sd-lln 

9 IPumol r/Bero.mo) 

I 10 lTv InspedioD - Sewer Lateral 
LateraJ.IDJDectioa 01 to.l!:....-

12 

uI Lateralmlnectioo. > 3CI' 

CleuWI 

6" to 12" 
I"" to 18" 
20" to 24" 
37" to 54" , 
43" to 54" 
~ 

ISmnb TKtinp 

TOTAL - GROUP I, 

(Items 1-12l 

A 

Kennel". LA I 7 ' ..... n Rlvlera Beacb. F1.. LLC ChMterfieId. MO St.PebnburIL FL ,m LLC 1 aJII.DL FL .. ,. 
Si7-" 

1_"'1 tho,,,, I II E ..... ded 
Otw M___ Pririn. Prici_ I ...... ...... ....... Prim1! 

EDadcd 
Prkbur rririu 

Edmded 
PrIdu PridD. 

EU ... ded ......... ........... Eslmded ......... . ......... ~ded ....... 
.. _ On 1100 ....... foot saM 

S" _DMr1 3001 DMaTr.. $0.00 
10" MWernow 3000 Uua:rroot . $0.00 
Jl" _ flow 3000 lID .. r root $0.00 
15" _ fknr 4000 lliI"r rem SO.OO 
I'" RWel'fknr 4000 llaearfoot SO.OO 
0" __ n... 4000 IIaar root SO.OO 

,24" -.en.... 4000 llaa.rt.... SO.OO 
iJO' ~ _ 400t 
~ __ lOll .... ,_~ $0 ... ..1 
42" 1010 ~ ..... 
W 1100 1IDta .. rOO' 58.00 
54" _ now 1 000 b .. r root $0.00 
>54" _ 1000 IlDtarroot $0.00 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NOBJD A.. -
NO BID at. 
NOBm _ J '" 

IBID 11» J II. 
I BID "-». . Q 
~ --- ... _.. .. 

~ 
tIW 

4" 5 aU $0.00 NO BID 

'" IUIIp 5 IJIG' cadi; $0.00 NO BID 
." 5..a SO.to NO BID :::JIii . I )J 
I." 5 '-" ad! st.OO NO BID ...!!:iItI!I L.L 6 

II" .... 5 Dft"~ $1.00 NO BID ~T. 

4'" 6 .-Ollt $0.08 NO BID II 
'" IlIDp 6 botU' $0.00 NO BID 
8" IUDP 6 boa.. $0.00 NO BID • 
10" 6 b01l.. $0.00 NO BID ... 
,II" pump 6 bour SO.OO NO BID -... 

10 
10 Ihftr r..t 

1000 lJaear root 

8000 llDear foot 

5000 Dna.r (oot 

2000 IlDear foot 

2000 u.-r Coot 

2HO ....... r. 
I "'-_ 

$0." 
~.OI 

-'ill. 
-ill!!!. 
-'ill. 
-!!&! 

SO.OO 

$0." 
$0." 

:- ESI] III 

NO RID 
NOBlD 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NOBI» 

...am 

....!Ill!! 
III 

~~:~ I 4:11 '" 

IZJ 
_ _ S 

.VII ~ .... S ~ r---'suo s .00 14.. $ 1.10 SUO S 54.10 

.01 $ 3.20 5 ~ 51Jl0 5 ~.OI 54.10 S I _.00 1.00 5 3,101.01 

.80 5 5.70 5 17.101.01 52." $ ~OI .III S I 000.01 1.00. 3_.01 

.III 5 9.10 5 36.410.01 53.01 5 12 010.80 11.00 S ...... 01 II 5 .... M 
54.00 

... 5 14.30 5 S7.2".0I .... 16.010.10 10.00 5 .. ...... 10. .. ..... 0 

... 5 21.18 5 ......... 57." 5 ,.,...... 510.GI 5 ......... $2." $ ..... .10 
012 ... 1 S .01 5 32.41 $ 129.000." SUO 5~.111 510.00 S ~ S3JIO S ~ 
!.I2.II!../-S ....... .01 5 3.... $ I......... 515.00 5 oO;iiI.oo S20.11 $ III;iiO:iI S3JIO $ ~ 

- -00.00 511.00 $ 11.00l.0I S2o.Io 5 2OJII8.ot ~1.90 S 5 ..... .00 115.00 $ I~ ... 1 $ .... 
52UO 5 .......... $ 64.10 S 520.01 S ~ "'.III $ -..:iiiiiiiiii S31'" 5 ........... -
521.00 $ 20.100'" S 17J111 5 17-.!!!..oo 520.01 S 211iii[.... SII.oo S~.OI S40'" 5 ~ iI. 521.00 $ 21....... 5 91.10 5 ~~OI $2511 S 25;0i0.10 ...iJ20.00 5 12I,6iI'" .10 5 5O,IIOjjj] 

• • 520.00 S 21.000." 5 129.70 5 129.710.01 S21.'" 21.100." $240.01 5 241....... S60.oo s ......... R 
..J 

57SO.lO S 3 7".01 5 1.037.01 S 5.115... 5101.00 5 
S7SO." 5 3,7".01 5 I 7.11 S 5,115.00 5201.00 $ 1,101.01 51 ... $ .00 $1 .00 

~ . n .... .111 S ~.OI S 1.137.10 S 5.115.00 S3IO.oo S ~.oo~.111 $ Io!!!!!.-JII $!!!!!.r.-
-- --IJIO S ~.IO 5 1137.00 S I..... 54SO.oo $ ~.oo -B.!!. ... $ :.!!!!!:! !!!,!!.~ 

-. 

.. .. 5 7 ....... 51,837.80 5 5.1..... _.11 S 3,010'" S3.lIO.oo S 1 _.00 5 

1.01 5 3,910.10 535.10 5 210... ~OI 5 ...... $250.00 5 ........ 
_. > -r000.00 5 660.00 S 3,!1OO." S.OO 5 271.00 ~... ...... S351.OI. 2.101.01 
:510." 5 3, .... 01 S 660'" 5 3"..... $$5.00 5 331.00 SII." $ .... 00 SSll~ --
:510." 5 3010.01 I 6SO." S 3.,...00 56S.00 S 391.01 SII." S .... 00 S5II'" 

0.10 S 3MO.0I S 650.10 S 3 901.00 $15.01 S 450.01 UI.ID S .go.Oft SYO.II.l S 3.010.10 

54:': 15 S20JlI 5 
1'7.01 S 

S351.oo $ 3,S00." 5 272.00 1 S >,720.00 54SO.oo 1 S ........ 
StIMI $ I..... S 1.70 1 5 17.00 51 ... 15 
01.00 1 $ 5JIOO.IO 5 4.18 1 5 20-'10.10 53.10 1 5 

St." 5 1 oeo.ot 5 1.10 S 

~ 
211 ... '=1: 

«JIll • 

~ 
~ 

15JIOOJ 

t'MJ . 51.15 S 10000.01 $ 1.30 S .1.,401.00 $2..(11 S 16 000.01 53.10 S 14 001.01 53.10 S 14 .IU 

b!IU. 52.00 5 10100.00 5 2AO S 1 000.01 52.25 S 11,250.01 55.00 5 25 .... 01 .. 5 1 100." 
~ .00 5 ... 5 2.90 S .01 52'" 5 010." .IIO 5 14... .00 5 .N 
.. . 54.ot 5 ~.. 5 3.90 5 7.01 53." 5 6,000." 59.01 5 1I,0I0.'' .00 S i,OOI.ot 

• -5.01 S I~.IO 5 4.28 5 ...00 53'" S 7.. 513.G1 S 2UOO.IO S3JII S 6JIII.ot 
0'" 5 ... .00 5 660.00 5 650.10 S25.oo S 25.00 52.100-01 $ S7!1'" 5 7 .. .00 

I I .5001 llinear r... I 50.00 I NO BID .. Jot I , trit'l 10.151 s IS 0-'0 I S 3,101.00 II .1.011 S S5.IO I 5 .... 0 15 5.100'" 

NO BID .. w oS 1 AT), .. II , ,,. ]f. 

IFB 15-1S99BLS Sanitary SewerStormwater Une Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx 



BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS :" Luzo Treachletll 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation , BLD Suvi..., LI,C mnC ........ LLC Hinterlmd Group, Iae. mdtuform Tedmolop ... J.T.V.Incorporated Tedm ....... S ..... VacViIion E:avironmeotal 

Services) Kamer LA I";"'n. RlvI .... lIeodLFL lie €~_.rfIdd.MO St.P-.bu",- FL Doerf\eId. FL LLC Taml!:~FL .... 
i ...... Valle( E .... ded 1::J:..' E_dcd E_ded E:..teaded E ..... ded E .... dcd I 

DeKrintiOD Size ~ -.... PridDg Priclo. .- Pridtl. Priclo. Prida. Prldn. Priclo. Priclol Pridao PrIclo. ",icina Pricittl 
I 

s:lBWlE J.5Et:[12tI II 
:lulU!:! 5m'ta 5mrm!!:1B!: 5ldemtl 
bbl~ R,Ita!!ilill&istn - Methgd 1~ SJU 

{C. __ In-Pl .... Pi ... ' 

1 Saul SewerMablI 
15.0mm normaltltldtncu (.197) "" ---- SO."I NO BID _U m._ $l6.IO IS 1l0.l00.'' S 3<).7t I $ 153.soo.lO 535.8. 1 S 17S.100.lO 564.10 I S 321.000.00 S45JlI I s U5.IOI.oo 

1 Sanitary Sewer Main. 
17.5mm Ilormal thidmesl (.295) I" 1 .... 10. '00< 51.00 I '<0 BID • 'I SZ6.00 $ 261 001.01 5 31.40 $ 3lA,OOIJl1 $25.00 5 251011.00 $31.00 $ 320 ... 532." S 311 001.10 

3 Sanltarv Sewer Main. 
17.5mm normal thickness (.295) 10" kw-_ I 10M lu-fMt $0.00 I "0 BID _IS ~ $31." I 5 256.810.00 S 37~ $ 3<)1.010.00 525.00 I $ 210000." $36." I $ 2"000.00 $35.00 $ 280000.01 

4 SaultaJy Sewer Mains 
19.0mm normal thickness (.354 12" Idla:Mter I 1000 11luu root 50.00 I NO BID l0-III11 - $38.00 5 304 000.00 5 43.90 5 3SI,200.00 537.00 I $ 296 000.00 544.00 5 35 00.00 $39.00 S 311.000.00 

S SanItary Sewer Main. 
19.0mm normal thickness .354 1!" ' ........ _L5OOI ...... rMt 51.00 NO RID , 548.00 $ 241001.01 5 63.40 S 317DOt.0I 54S.00 IS 115,010." $66'" $ 3J<) 000.10 S60.00 S 310010." 

, Sultan' Sewer Mains 
110.5mM normal thickness (.413) Ill" J.a...,. I 5OtO 1Mu ... $0." NO BID m_., 556.11 S 280.100.00 S 83M $ 411.010.10 555." $ 175,000.10 SIO.OO 5 401.000.110 SIll." $ 400.I00.'' 

7 Sanitary Sewer Maia. 
J2.0o:un normal tbicknen (An) 12." 

"'"-I !lOG __ 
SO.lO I NO BID _It S75.IO s 375.801.10 J n2.!O I S 56UOO.oo S75.1O S 375, ... .00 $96.00 S _ ... _ .. I $ 47s.ooo.lO 

8 SlDitary Sewer Maills 
113.5Dl1D :D.ormal thidalesa .531 Z4" _1- 1501 u.., fMI $1.00 1\'0 BID • • - $85.IlO $ 127,S11'" • 131.10 S 1_." 195.00 I 5 14l,51O." 512.4.01 S I .10 5130.10 5 I_.at 
115.0mm normal thiclm.eu 591) l4" I6-cer I ]501 ___ feet $0.00 NO BID I._It "'-01$ 12I.DIG ... .. 137.00 5 2OS ....... 5105.00 5 157.510'" 51].4..01 5 111.000.10 5135.110 $ 21%.500'" 

9 SanitarY Sewer Mains 

S_,: == 113.5mm normal thiclmess (.531) 27" " 2810 ...,foaI SO.OO NOBm 1110.10 5 200 100.10 5 "0.91 $ 111.100.10 51:25.01 5 150.800.10 5115.10 S 151DOt.0I $13S ... S Z7t .00 
115.Dmm normal thiekness (.591) 117" _11100 ......... $0.10 NO RID SI00.1O S 200 &00.10 5 147." I $ 1!l4,8OO.00 513<)." 5 260 100.10 5135.00 S 17tDOt ... $1".00 I S 1I 001.10 

10 SanitarY Sewer MaiJu 
15.0mm normal tbickne8li .<,.59U_ 130" .... "'*' L 2000 u..... (DOt 50.00 NO RID S 1._" 5145.00 S 290000.00 5 161.SO I $ 323.000.00 5145.00 S 290 000.00 51450.00 5 310,000.00 5145.00 I $ 290000.00 

11 SanitarY Sewer Mains 
lCi.5DlDl normal thidmess (.650) 136" IGuoetw I 1010 1 __ , feet $0.110 NO BID :=1':= Sl85 ... 15 1115,100." $ 1K~IS 106.510.00 5Ui5.00 5 165,010.00 $110." I 5 210 000.10 5165.011 S 165, .... 00 
18.0mm normal thiclmess .70 " 1010 IIIttar foal $0." NOBm _ 51SS.1O S 185,100.10 5 119.H $ 1" .10 5170.08 $ 170010.10 $110.10 5 111 000.00 517S."1 S 175101.00 

1l SanitarY Sewer Main. 
16.5mm normal thidmen (.Ci50) 142" _11100 _roo< $0.00 I NO BID =: n=: S225.IO I 5 ~oo 5 135." 1$ 235,100.10 $170.101 S 170 101.00 sw.oo I S 

~.: SZJ<l.00 I $ ~ 
18.0mM normal daicJmess (.709 141" - 1008 I~,... $0.001 NO BID S225.IlO S .00 $ 250.40 S 250.401.00 5110.10 S 1 .00 nao.oo S S250.00 $ 

13 Sanltarv Sewer Maiu 
16.5mJn nonoal tbidat ... (.650) ~. _ I 1010 1-.._ SO.OO I ~'O BID NSI .. U 11'- $245.011 S lA~r$ Z71.1O I S 17~ $191.00 I $ "'.DIG'" S350 ... 1 s 

~ SZ55.OII$ ~ 
18.0mm DOrmal thidalen (.709) ~" t..- I 1010 1-.. .... .. .. I 

"" BIll 
_II -.. sus.oel S lAS. .eo DU. $ S2OO.oo I 210.010.00 S3'7UI S SU5.OII $ 2M. ... 

IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwster Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx 



BID FORM - IFB #1S-I599BLS 
, 

LanzoT_ 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater. LIne &, Manhole Rebabilitadon 'I BLD Sen>i_ LLC CM1.C ....... UC _Group, 1M- lDIltaIOI'III T .... oaope., J .T.V.I..mporated TcdmolopeoSoutli VKvt.ioII iEDYil'UlUlleatlil 

Scrvica) KMaer LA . . ...... .. RI ...... -.n. UCCb MO St.1'daw"";'" FL n. LLC'T ....... n. 
EoL 

I .... -vaX .r Enended I •• 11 E_okd E_ E .... ded E_ed E_ 
DeocriotiOD Size <>tv Mn_ Pricloll ~ril:i •• ..... - P·rida. Prldu I'ridno PridJu! Prldu Prida. PrIdu Pridaor Pridu Pridour 

• 14 Sanitary Sewer Mains 
116.Smm normal tbldmess .650 I"· " ... - 1000 lllDHr foot $0.00 NO BID n71. I • 5395.10 5 3 .10 I 32!!.20 5 3 .10 5355.10 $ 3 .III 1501.00 5 510 .10 2S.IMI 5 ~oot.Of 
118.0mm normal thlclm.eu: C.709 I .. • ......... ~ 1000 hour foot $0.00 I NO BID 1M I • 5395.10 I , :!9!,oot.Of I JoI3'" 1 JoI3.500.1O 5370.10 I 1 37O.MO.II _.0011 6IO,ooe.00 S351.III 5 35I,00I.00 

15 Sanitarv Sewer Mala. 
'1' ~ _.lilts _.111 18.0ram .ormal tbidatesl ,.... !1IIa __ I [NO I~ r. SO,OO I NO BID '" 'i.6Q U ." .... ..,. -.1111$ _.III. _ .. Ii """-001 f _.I., 

TOTAL - GROUP I, SECTION B 1 NOBID Is II. 5."I.!eO.I~, h .IIQ II. !!.296.00IAO I. "57-'" Is 
(It .... I-IS) I 

I 

!iROUP I, 5E~nON c , 

Sanitaa 5ewe:: '~!l!!l!!ter SIstemS 
Line Rebabrut.tltan. BV~Pll_ Pamnin .. 

"~" ~ ~.oo s ~II ~ ~.III I. ~ ~IO ~ I Tanker lnack tank 000 ulla. ca d 5 Mo' $0.00 NOBm -
2 Studard service J'tC:ODlIeetion 5 _do Si.OO NODI» • J S251.oo S I S W.II S I 125.00 1258.00 S I _.III • 

~.III 
.10 • .10 

3 Service with PRlsun lUOutinsr: 5 trlld! SO.OO NOBJD " _.III S 17SO.lll I 4Z5.IO I 1.125.00 S251.oo I 1,2SII.IO 
_ .... 

SJOO.IO $ ...... .11 

• Lateral rdnstatemeot cutting of defective 
NO RID II J. 7.- SJOO.IO • I I 010.00 S315.1O _.10 lateral oJ)tDine: 5 ",,- $0.00 1.510.10 5 5.100.00 5 1915.00 ....,M 5 z.ooo.1O $ 2.5Of.0f 

5 Trenchless lateral cleaning and 
reconstrudion system UD to 30 linear feet 50 Uaarfoot $0.00 Nosm Is _ 

I .115.10 $ 5.751.01 $ 102.11 S 5.10..00 ... .111 , '.100.10 _.00 • 30 ooo.Of '1_ • !.251U1 

• Trenchln. lateral deuiag and 
ncoaltnlctlon Hltem over 30 linear fed: SO _r ... so.oo NO BID Ihlllt = 111 ..... 5.750.11 $ llUIO $ 5.110 ... $II'" $ 

~ 
.,.... . .10 $1_ Is 

~ 7 Full wrap at maID ad 24" u conDedioa 2" ......... SO.IO NO BID 10 ... S S S .., ... II ... S .10 S .10 ... $ 

I 
Additioul; clean out installation up to 4' 

NOBlD 
deep. ..... sed ..... 10 undo $0.00 .- • 11.200.10 S 12.l1li.00 I IJlIS.OO S 10 0!e.1O 51110.10 $ 17.100.10 .S3.000 ... I 30 000.00 $I ,".10 $ 17.100.10 

• Additional; clHJl opt installation greater 
NOSm than 4' deep .... _ area • erHm $0.00 .- I S3IO.III $ 600.00 $ 1'10.10 $ ..... 00 53.101.00 S 6.000.00 1<.100.10 S IIMIt.Of 1<010.111 's 8.OOO.Of 

10 
Additional; deaa out installation up to 4' 

NO BID 
d .. p.p.ved ..... 10 1Po,- $0.00 J'-- I 11.610.111 • lLOIO." I IAl5.00 S 14,350.00 S2.5OO.III $ 2!!.ooo.oo 55.OM.OO S _.10 S2.!e0.oe S _25,010.00 

11 
Additional; clean out 'OD greater 

NOBJD ... ...... 4' deep. paved area 3 ......... SO.OIl I . I -.00 $ , .... .10 ! LOI!Ul!I ~ SA3II.lO 53710.10 $ lLlIO.eo S6.IIIO", $ 1&.100..., "_.10 $ lL111O.11 

TOTAL - GROUP I. SECJ10N C NOHW II .,,_, l • .....-1 \ S23,30S.,u S S 1,147_ S 491,111O.O1! 

0 ..... 1-11) I 

IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary SewerStormwater Une Manhole Rehab Serv.ldsx 



BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation 

I 
1 
3 

• 

Serviea) 

GROUP I, SECTION D 

Sanitary Sewer Joint Air Testine. 

Joint Greutin§', end LateraI Gn tins 
Ii" dill. unibn sewer 

8-11'" d1a, II3Illtarv 
L11"di .. 

5 i.lnint T...tin ... , 
7 

• 
• 
I. 
11 IJOint 
12 _Inlnf 

13 
14 I.t.:.;n~j 
IS 
16 

" 

Ill!, !Il!W'Y acweJ' 
, dia, .... itary sewer 

. . ... nnrv 1IiIf'Wf'r 

~ 
ft"di 

y sewer 
v_",r 

ma, !!I'Y sewer 
d 12" dia, sanitary leWef 

;, 15" dia. unitarY xwer 
M15" 

5 over 2.5 en .. 
TOTAL - GROUP I, : 

(Item. I-Iii 

Sb,. 

ioty<!O 

~ 
1<50 

;

> .. 
<51 
> .. 

<50 
n .... :.ltn 

Oho> .. 

BLD ServI .... LLC 
ll" ... n .. r I .... 

E.L 

1 ...... ,1 V .. " I 1 Eneaded 
Otv _....... Pridn. P~ ..... 

20 .do 

20 .. ell 

20 tlcb 

21 acll 

20 """ 
20 """ 
20 ... 
20 -.rllo 

20 cub 

20 acb 

20 each ,. "'" ,. """ 
20 ." 
:II .... 
21 _do. 

NO RID 

) BID - , 

J81D 

~BID 
~BID 
181D 
lBID 
lBID 
181D 

.NO BID 
NOBI~ 

CIIIL C ...... LLC" I Hlnterlmd Gl'OUp, Inc. II .u __ , 
.~"--.....L'" IUvI_lIIIPlIaclt..FI, M I.LC~ 

----
LMO 

J .T.V. Incorporated 
,lIT 

Lazo Trmdalcn 
TedmoIoIl" Soutb 

,~ 

-_ .. --------. 
'.J.r T ... ns. FJ. 

......... 1 ~ 1-.....11 ~ I ......... 
E_ 
......... Enaded 

p .... _II ....... -.......... II I'JKI.. 
R ........... 

1'00 .. i _ 

-

LL $ 7,,*,.. SO.... $ .0Il S3!1.OO $ 7,000." ... $ 13 ..... 10 S3!1'" $ 
) I $ ~... S 409." $ 1,110... $3!0." S ~OO ....... $ I~.IO S3!1.IO $ 

~.. $ 454.10 $ ........ WO." $ 5:iiiG... S550.IO $ li:iiiI.oo S 7 ....... 
6,IOO.JO $ .n.oo $ 1,440." mo. .. $ ..... .10 S551." $ I~'" ....... $ ~ 

__ $ 70l.OI $ 36.10 $ 736... $IMO $ _.. $111.00 $ UiI... 151.01 S 1;ii8.iO 
I3MO $ .... $ 31.61 $ on... $15.00 $ ,...01 $110.00 $ ~... S51'" $ ~ 

135.00 S 710.01 $ :!6.10 S 736.00 $1".00 I .. .III 1310'" $ ;00:10 Ilze... S ~ 
IZMO $ !to.OO I Z6.3O $ '16.00 $100." $ --" !!!.OO 1310'" I 6 100.10 me,,, $ ~ 
015.00 $ ...... $ ..... $ ICIO." UO.81 $ I ~IO .10 $ , ... $120... $ 2;iOijO 
11.... $ ...... I 19.5() $ ......~.. ~ I ..... ..B!!!:" $ '"..... $120." $ 18O,!!! 
115.11 S 501.00 S .. 1.10 S 142.to ~OO $ 1 00.10 ~80 S .ot Sl18.D1 S 
130.10 $ 601... S 31.61 $ on... $61." I I ...... _.00 $ 1.11 ... SIze... I 
.... S 610'" I 45.38 $ 9&6.10 511.00 I 1,601'" $510'" $ 10.10 .10 1m... I 

na__ S 610.01 S 42.10 $ I4l.OO SII.8I S iMi.. $510.81 S] StD.tO S 
$ 7I0.IO I SUO $ 1.151.01 $10'" $ ~.oo 5600.10 S ~ $150.10 $ 

n!ltftil I 700.. I ~_90 S U§&JaI 180.10 $ "i'MO.IO UOIM $ L!.!!!!:!!!! I.SUO S 
• 1100,1') ste.!9 S 1 __ .00 $SO.OI I • 1 ___ 

It II S 33 601 ... 1 I , ... _IU I I .......... , I'!IUIOO." $ ....... Of , 

IFB 15-1S99BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Une Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx 



BID FORM -IFB #1S-IS99BLS 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwattr, Line &: Maohole Rehabilitation 

Services) 

GROUP I. SECTIDJI! 

• 'tsm-

I 
.. __ ~ _____ DDg lor crase or mineral 

1 depositl (beavier procell th.u. root cuttla.g, 
not as beavy u tuberculation wttin, (&l1 
m7R!11l 

1 Main line air testing and lJ'Outing of Joints 
8" - 24") 

3 Void ID'OUtin1! bv the I 

TraIIk: Co, 
4 lFhu!man (each) 
5 
6 
7 L .... divid .... .LndlL 
8 Variable JIleilue board 
9 LI ttow 

110 Easement access, additional less than 11" 

11 hi'~
Il 

13 
8lld _. 

Mobil 
]4 less tl. 

.d 

Ligrutertbm 

111 Demobilization (Projed.1D 
10,000), i 
it Bo.cl. 

ft I Demobilization (projects 
10.000), without Performance 
It Bond 

TOTAL - GROUP I, SECTION E 

0 ..... 1-14) 

Size 

BLD Sorvi-. LLC CMLc: .......... L_ 
1£_ ...... I ............. a-... •• 

"t. 

lllaterlaa.d Group, IDeo II IIutnIform Tedmologies, II J.T.V.I.corporated 
Rlviera~ FL LLLC CHltafi~ U S;t p..,.-t.. ...... iii. 

L..."T ...... :b1 ... 
TccImoIocIeo _ 

tn. 
... _---_._--
LLCT_FL 

I AnnUlI! u .... r I II Enmdod 
Otv U MftlllU'II Pricln2 Prime 

'-oW _ I _ E ..... ded II I En_dod I II E .... ded 
Priem. ~ I'ridD& W Prldnl Pridnt: p~ Prldn. 

Entllded 
Prldno i Prldn. 

E .... ded 
Prldn. i Prldno 

30 II1aear root 

...!!!!!... 
1 

1 ",da, 

1 ud 

2 er'.y 
4 _"', 

4 ,.,"" 
1 Derd.'V 

100 IIlMar loot 

100 IllBtar 1M!: 

,~ 

125000 

50.00 I NO BID 

$0.00 I NO BID 

$0.00 NO BID 

NO RID 

" ... 1 , ...-1 $lO.DO I 5 '0 ... 0 II 5 110M I 5 3.300.DO II 515.DO I 5 451.00 ! 5S1l.'" I S BOO." 

_I: = 151:=1: 4:::1: 1::: 59 390:1 ~::I! 100=11 =1: ~o:::ll= 
s 

510 ... 1 S .IIUt 

'.00 I S ISIl,lO!!.Dt 
'.111 S 601.80 

.-!!!:!!!. 
~ 
...lli!!!. 
~ 
....!ill. 

NO BID .... 1' 1 5150.00 I 5 '0.0011 S 1,300.00 I 5 1,600." " $35.00 5 70.00 5150.00 5 300.00 SSIlO.OO 5 1.000.' 
NOSlD eM Sl5.IO , ).110 51.10 5 4.01 $51.111 S 100J 
NO BID Sl5.8O S iioo 5 3lAO 5 11UO SlOO.oo S 401'" mo.eo S 1.100." 5100.00 5 4IOJ 
NORm 

_ $351.00 
0'" S 650.110 5 ZMt..oo $55.01' no... 5S1l1'" S .10 SI00.10 5 4IOJ 

SO.OO NORJD _ 51so ... ls 0.01 5 195.10 5 3tO.to 515.to S SIl.1O 5150.10 5 311.00 S5II.OI 5 1.101 

SO.OO NO RID lUI .. _ I 510 ... 1 S 1,001.10 II 5 5.1.1 5 Slt.oo SI~ 5 151.08 5S1l.00 S s.ooo." 510.10 S 1.000.11 

SO.OO 
PID BID 

so.oo I NO BID 

so.OO I NO BID 

.NO H:I) 

!:t'1 ! ~·I JI· ... I· 1.000'" ! S 6$0 I 5 650"'11 $1-" I 5 l!O.'" i SSIl.oo I S ~.oo II $51.1111 s ~.oo .. ,p ~4tO.1O $ 5.400.00 S 4,5:!!.OO S 4.540." 54.500." S 4.500.10 $2',010.10 S 2OjIO.oe 510,110. S llOO1.to 

• ,J s ........ ~ ... ;.I S ~ _ 1_" _' 

3.0%1 5 751.00 ! 11\ or 
15 6MIO.0I 

Z%,: !lit .. 

I 

III.I)WI ~I 

!.QW IIh 

I ~ ~:;::~8.o ·1 

5.0%1 5 ~ ...... 

5"%1' S l.2§O.OI 

IS 

""-I. ',\_~I t UOI..M 

lS (w,! t 6.15u ' >If .,00%1 ~ 1,251.01 

.... ·. J'l I. 

IFB 15-15998LS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx 



BID FORM -IFB #15-lmBLS 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation 

Elt. 

BLD Sen>keo, LLC 
KCDDeJ". LA 

~c ...... u . 
"',,-,n. 

Hlater:land Grwp, I,lIC., II JutltufoJ'Dl 
RIvIIM'A Reach. FL_ U LLC ~ 

J:r.v.1Dcorpo.ntod 
on CtP..t .. _ .......... 1i'T 

Lu.zo Treodalea 
TeduloJoPa Sooth 

,FL 
VacViIloD. 

LLC TamDLFL 

Size 
1_'/ ... 01 / / E_dcd / / a...... / II E_ / II E ..... dod / II EUencIed II I E>"'dcd / II EUmded 

(ky ~ I'ridafl Pric:iDR ....... ..... Pricinlf I Pricia2 Pririlia. M PridnR. Pri •• H Prir:t.tr: Pric:iu: Pridn. PrIdaR Prill .. 

GROUP 2. SECTION A 

Sanitary Sewer. RehahiUtation

Methodl 

REPAIR SLEEVE Tmtsbke 

fiDe KecoDltnldktn - CIPP 

1 SaDltary seWer mains 
7.5mm normal thidmftS (.295) 

I~: -~~ 
." ....... u 

T ... _.... SO.OI NOBm •• 

501 ..... i00i SO.OI NO BID ..... ' 
10'-12' 501 _,'" $UG NOBlD ~::j 
J3'-15' seo _.... 51.801 NOBID ::M 
16' .20' !to Uaeu reot 50.00 NO BID ~ ----; 
21' -lS' SOO IiDnr foot $0.00 NO BID .... ----: 
26' - 30' 500 hnr i0oi SO.Of NO DIU .... 

1 Smituy sewer mains 
7.5 .... DOrmaI thic:kneM t.29Sl 
3'-! 
6' -! 
10' -

"" 
_K 
~ hhlearfoot 

SIll 

j' -~::~: I I I E E~ . 
3 Sanitary KWH malo. 11" ...... K 

Imm normal ... ; .. Irn ..... I -:a.cA\ 

~ 
5UO 

~ 
~ 

SO.Ol 

!.!!e. 
!.!!e. ) BID __ 

NOBm 
NOBm 
NO BID 

S4l'.OO 5 21Q,iiG.1O S - NO BID st.OO NO oui- $0.00 NO BID SO.. NO Bli.-
~ s.ne.oo S llt1!!!...oo S - NO RID SO.OONOOID $f.of NO RID 10M NOBID 
!-!!- _$420.00 S lli.OOi::.oe S - NO BID 50." NO BID Sf'" NO BID ".00 NO BID 
,_ S4lO." S lI. 010.01 $ - NO BID $0.10 NO BID SO.IO NO BID $1.00 NO BID 

~ 5GO.eo $ 2JO 000.00 $ - NO BID ,..00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 
~ _ 5420.00 $ 210 000.00 S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID SO.OO NO BID 
, .. $421.00 $ 218 .01 S - NO BID $OM NO BID $1.11 NO BID SO.OO NO BID 

W •. oo I 5 210.'01.10 II 5 - I NO BID II SO.oo I NO Bm 
14l0.00 S l10 000.00 $ - NO BID SO.OO NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 

5420.00 $ 218000.GI $ - NO BID 0.80 NO BID SO.OO NO BID 58.00 NO BID 
5420.10 $ 2JO .00 $ - NO BID $1.00 NO BID SO.OO NO BID 50." NO BID 
SC2t.OO S 2Jo.. .10 S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID SO.DI NO RID SOM NOBm 
S4U.oo S :UO .00 S - NO BID 10M NO BID st... NO BID st.OO NO BID 

.00 S 1I. OOI.ot S - NO BID $0-,-10 NO BID 51.10 NO BID $1.00 NO BID 

-S' seo ~ .... so.OII. NO 
$0.01 

.. 11.00 $ 210 I ilrs - NO Bm SO.OI NO BID SOM NO BlD - SO.OO NO ~ 

)' ' - , 
2!L ;i00i 

501 
1420.00 S 11. 
5420M 5 11 

, U S - ,NO BID SD.IO NO BID SO.IO NO BID $1.00 NO BID 
- NO BID H .eo NO BID SO.oo NO BID ... NO BID 

-g I. arc .. ~ _ 5420.10 5 iTs - NO BID SO.OO NO BID SO.OO NO BID SO.IO NO BID 

I' . 
!III 
500 

$0.00 541'.00 • 
5420.00 

~~ NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.01 NO BID SO.OO NO BID 
10 BID ~.OO NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 126'-' 

YO I"'rfoot $0.01 I NI ._1 NO. I 5410.1111 $ ilrs . T NO Bm SO.IO NO BID SO.IO NO BID SO.OI NO BID 

4 Sanitary sewer mat... 
10.§1II111.0 ..... 

OS" ... -
_ S' - . - -.510 ... ~-;:;- \ SO.OO NO BID .. 

- 9' 580 u-.r foat SO.OO NO BID 
lu'-Il' SOO IiMl.rroot $0.00 NO BID 
13' - 15' 501 IQear r..t $1.00 NO BID fIIiiI .., 
16' - 20' 501 ~ flNt SO.OO NO BID PIO 
21' - 25' !III .... _ SO.oo NO BID " .1 --

26'-30' !III -...... Il10_ ~ 

r S!tO.OO S Z!O 001.08 S - NO BID SO.DI NO BID SO.IO ~ BID ----so:o. NO 8&., 
I 5500.001 5 250 0001.00 S - NO BID 501.010 NO BID SO.OO NO Bm SO.oG NO Bm 

$SOO.oO S 250 000.00 $ - NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID SO.OO NO BIll 
5501.10 S 250 • . " S - NO BID SO.OO NO BID $I." NO BID H .IID NO BID 
S5OI.oo S lSO,.lOI.1O S - NO BID $0.01 NO BID 51.00 NO BID $1.00 NO BID 
sseo.oo S ~.OI S - NO BID SO.IO NO BlD $'1.10 NO BID SO.Ol NO BID 

$ ~ot S - 110_ SO.IO NO BID SO." NOBID j!l.lO NO BID 

IFB 15-1599Bl.S Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Une Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx 



BID FORM -IFB #1S-1599BLS 
, 

LaazoT ........... 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole RebabilitaCioD , BLD Soniceo, LLC GMI. ( ·-.,.UC 1IIa_ Gnap, Inc. 11IIituf0l1ll T ............. J.T.V. lnOOl)lOf1llod T~Soatb 

V" ___ I 
s.rne..) Kena~ LA • , ......... n. _-'FL LLC MO 

, SU_ ..... FL DcortWd,n. LLCT_FL .... 
""""'" V_ltoC E ..... ded E";" _dod EJtmdcd E_dod E_ded :1 • Size (lOy - .Pridn. Priciu ..... ...-.. - Prida - - Prleill2 - - -

5 SlIDitary sewer mains 18" ....... ~ 
13.5mm normal thidmnl (.531) 
)'-5' 510 -, ... SO.OO NO RID !=i S600M 

$ -
..... $ - NOBID $1.00 NOSm SO'" NO BID - NO BID 

6'-9' 500 _'oot , ... 0 NORlD _.00 , JOt .10 , - NORm SO.Ol NO BID SO.lO NO BID '1.10 NO BID 
10' -12' 500 Ua"rfoot SO.OO NO RID _.01 S J4 .00 $ - NO RID SO.OO NOBJD SUO NO BID so.o. NORm 
13' - IS' see .. _ .... 

SO.OO NO BID -.eo S J4 ~ S - NOBID SI.OO NORm SO.Ol NO BID - NO BID 
16' -20' 500 .. rf ... SO.oo NOBJD ;-. _.00 

$ J4 S - NORm SO.Ol NO BID SO.lO NO BID - ",'0 BID 
21'·2S' 500 lIII"rfoot SO.OO NORm 110_ S6OO.oo , JOt 001.00 S - NOBID SO ... NOBID ..00 NOBID •• 01 NO BID 
26'·30' 500 .... , ... $0.00 NO RID ,.., .. -... $ _.01 $ - NO OlD SUO NO BID SO.Ol NO BID SO." NO RID 

• B 
6" .ewunow 1000 -, ... SO.OO NO RID - 54." S .00 S - NO BID suo NO BID SO.OO NO BID SO.OI NO BID 
8" .ewer flow 3000 """'foot SO.OO NO RID 54.00 S 1 .10 S - NO BID SO.oo NOBlD ~ ... NO RID SO.OO NOBlD 
10" .ewer flow 3001 -, ... SUO NO BID - S4.OO , .10 S - NO BID - NOBlD suo NOBlD SI.OO NO BID 
12" RWa-Bow 3011 ......... st.OO NO BID 54." S 1 .00 S - NO BID - NO BID SO.oo NO BID SO.OO NOBlD 
15" ltWerflow 4000 ..... , ... SO.OO NOBlD - IS.SO $ .01 $ - NO BID SO.oo NOBJD so ... NO BID SO.OO NOBlD 
18" .ewer flow 4000 llanr foat $0.00 NO BIB $5.00 S 2t 000.00 S - NO RID SO ... NO BID st.OO NO RID st.OO NOBm 
20" sewer flow - llMarloot St.OO ~OBID • SSM $ 2t .00 S - NO RID St.oo NO BID SO.oo NO BID SO.Ol NO BID 
24" ItWtr Dow --, ... $<l.00 NO RID H ' t2.OO $ .01 $ - NO BID SO.oo NOBlD so ... NO BID so.oo NOBJD 
30" MWeJ" flow 4009 ....." ... SO.OO NO BID $u.oo $ .... .00 S - NO RID SO.OO NO BID st.OO NORm $41.00 NO BID 
36" sewer flow 4000 lIDurloot $0.00 NO BID .20.01 S It 001.00 S - NOBm SO.OO NO BID 18.00 NO BID St.Ol NO BID 
42" !eWer flow --., ... SO.OO NO BID II&lIl 520 ... s 10, .01 • - NO BID St.oo NO RID SO.Ol NO BID $0.00 NOBlD 
48" ICWU Dow 4000 -- SO.OO NORlD .., S2I.OO S 10, UO S - NOBlD SO.Ol NOBID $41.10 NOBlD - NOBID 
54" .ewer flow 4000 Ibnrloot $0.00 NO BID •. - no.oo $ .. .00 , - NOBlD SO ... NO BID •• 00 NO BID St.Ol NO BID 
>54" ttwerflow 1000 llaw.r lDOt SO.OO NO BID II M,_ no." • 10 .00 • - NOBIO St.OO NOBm SO.Ol NO BID SO.IO NO BID 

7 B omol". 
_ ... 

4" pump 5 ",tatb. SO.OO NO RID 5750." • 751.00 $ - NO RID •. 00 NO BID ~ ... NO BID SO.Ol NO BID 
6" DumP 5 1_- $0.00 NO BID 

=!~ 
5751.00 $ 750 ... $ - ~ORID SO.OO NOBJD $UO NORm SO.lO NO BID 

8" pump 5 100-- SO.IO ~OBm n .... jIO $ $ - NO BID SO.Ol NORJD St ... NOBlD St.Ol NOBlD 
10" owno 5 I_~'" $41.00 NO RID ~.OI S 

.10 S - NOBlD SO ... _NO BID ,..01 NO BID SO.Ol NOBID 
12" pump 5 crfllldl SO.OO NOBlD S1 .00 $ 7 .01 • - NO BID SO.OO NO BID SO." NO BID SO.OO NO BID 

• Pump J!lLeratioD M' ..... '" """" 
4" POIDP • 100- ... , SO.OO NO RID -§II 

1500.10 S .00 S - NO BID $41.00 NO BID SO'" NO BID SO.OO NO BID 
6"pum • ... , $(1.00 NORm S5OI.OO S 3 ... S - NORm so.oo NOBJD 10.00 NORm $41.00 NO BID 
8"pump 6 1_.- SO.OO NO RID - S5OO.oo S 3 .00 S - NO BID SO.IO NOBlD H.OO NO BID SO.Ol NO BID 
10" DumP • .- SO.oo NO RID :II 1500'" S 3 1.00 • - NO BID St.lO NOBID SO.Ol NO BID so.oo NO BID 

UlD - N D S - , 
TOTAL - GROUP 2, SECTION A NORlD $ 8.037 .'0 NO RID NOBm NORlD NO BID 

1It .... 1-8l 
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BID FORM -IFB #15-1599BLS Lanzo Trsdl..l_ 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stonnwater, Llne & Mauhole Rehabilitation , BLDS~LLC (aiL C!-... UC- Hm.land Gro.p, Inc. iIIdtuform TodI • ...,...., J_T.V. JllCOrporated TedJJaoIoiin So.tIt VaeVIllon Eal'iro •• eatal 

Senica) .' KC'l!!JU'L" I fJ. RM .... _FL I.LC Ch . MO St.P FL FL LLCT ....... FL .... ....... , uan ... £Jt.oooHtl - E_ded E_ E .......... E_ded E_ 

Deseriotlon Size 0 .. -- Prianli!: rri<ln., - - Pri<i •• PrIdmI .... r .. Pricing PrIdmI Prlc10g PrIdmI PrIdmI PrIdu PrIdmI 

!iRQUP:!. SEmON B 
MlKeUaneou, Items 

MeclIanlca1 tutting for greue OJ' mineral 

1 
depositl (heavier process than root euttiOIt 
not a. beavy as tuberculation euttiDg (all 
Iiza) 3lJ .... , .... SO.OO NO BID - ~- 03"'0 0 ,.. ... 0 - NO BID SO'" NO BID - NOBm ..... NOBm 

1 
Main line alr teniDg and pouting of joinb 

NO BID NO BID NO BID 
8" -24") 1000 a---.f!p.ejolat 50.00 - ...... 0 '''010.00 5 - NOBJD 50.00 $1.01 NO BID 51.00 

3 Void uoudne bv the cubic yard 2 "' DilMIolat $0.00 NORm - 100 S1.l0UO S l.OOO." S - NO BID $0.11 NOBJD SO.IO NO BID SOM NOBm , L.teral d...m. 1000 IlDqrfoot $0.00 NO BID - 11.00 S 1 1108'" S - NO SID SO.IO NOBm suo NO BID ..... NO BID 

Traffic eo.trot 

til 
• - NO BID 

• Fl ...... ( ...... ) 2 50.00 NOBlD S!IIO.II • 1.010.01 S - NO BID SO.Ol NO BID SO.Ol NOBm - NO am 
6 Arrowboanl (each 1 I",.." 50.00 NO DID 'l!UO S 500.00 $ - NO BID $0,11 NOBlD ~IO NOBJD IO~II NO BID 
7 Barricades ~ach) 2 d. SO.OO NO om 525.00 S 50.10 S - NO BID SO.OO NO BID SO.IO NORJD .UO NO BID 
8 Lane divide... eac:h) 4 I",.." SO.OO NOBJD 525.01 • UMI.oo S - NOBJD .. .00 NOBm $1.00 NO BID .. .00 NOBID , Variable D.eI~ board • ,.., SO.OO NORJD • Sl5O.H • tAO.III , - NOBm SO.lll NO BID SO.Ol NO BID SO.Ol NO BID 

10 LiRhttower 1 _d" $0.00 NO RID - ~~ '150.tO S 310.00 S - NOBID SO.lO NOBm SO.tO NO BID SO.ll NOBm 

11 Hammer tap removal • 1 ... -
50.00 NO RID SJIMI.OO S 1~1O S - NO BID .00 NO BID .10 NO BID .00 NO BID 

Il 
Easement accels, additional less than 12" 

NORlO 100_ S10.ll 1~.OI 
NOBJO 

SO.OO mGt "OBm 
diameter 100 Ilaur Coot $0.00 - s • - NOBID SO.OO NOBW 

13 
Euement aceen, additional greater than 

NO BID - NO_ m.oo NO BID NO BID 
12" diameter 100 llDeuCoot 50.00 S 1 toO.to , - NO BID SO.tO SO.tO NO BID so.oo 

I' Blind shot set u 50 _n<b 50.00 NOBm - ::=: $511.00 , l5 OIMI.IO • - NO BID $1.00 NO BID SUII NOBm ... 00 NO BID 

IS WellpomtiDg/dew.terin. 1 IllIDpnm $0.00 NORm ... S . .. • - NO BID .011 NOBlO ... NOBW SO ... NO BID 

16 
MobiliutioD I DemobiliutJo. (p",;-" 
ucess of5100.000), iDduding Perfonnanee 
and Payment Bond 100000 % 50.00 NO RID - 110_ 4.rli. S 4.000.00 S . NO RID so.oo ~OBJO ..... NOBJD SO." NOBI» 

Mobilization I Dem.oblllzatlon (projects 

17 lal than $100,000), without Performan«: 
and PaYJll"" Bond 25IlOO '" S'.Il(l ~,>Am - ....... 3.8% S , .. ..., , - NO BID .. .00 NOBm ,..00 NOBm " .00 NO BID 

TOTAL - GROUP Z, SEeMON B , ~OJlw 110_ • 99,900 ... NOBm NO BID MOBJO NO BID 

(I'em. 1-17l 
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BID FORM - IFB #1S-lS99BLS I BLD Servlceo, LLC 

LamoT ... _ 

(Suitary Sewer, StonDwatu. Lint & Manhole Rebabilltado. GMl.C ........ UC H_dGnJap, ..... IDIiIufonaT ............... U .V.l __ T ............. _ VIC __ 

S.me .. ) Kenner. LA •• n. llM ... -.FL LLC a-t.rlIeId. MO StP-.b ..... FL FL LLCT ....... FL .... ....... . .. " E_ ..... . ....... E_ EDadod E_ E_ E_ 
Description Size Qty Ma~ Prldn2 -. - - PrIdD. P- rrlclq PrIda. PrIda. PrIdn. Prida. P- Pdc," Prlda 

GROUP 3 _ SlCUON A 

LiDs Ii M!!!bo1e Rd!ylli!aliO 
Mctltpd 1 

Manhole Surf_WI 

Corrosion Protection of Manholea 

I COITO.iou. protedioD 
1/4" tbiclmeu 16mlll) - 48" 4l) vertlcal root 50.00 NORm -'. snt.lll 5 ~.IlGS 231.10 S 9.l1O.IlG SO.OI NO BID 50.00 NO BID SJIO.oo 5 I~ 1/4" tbidmess (6mrn) - 60" 20 vertic.1 foot 50.00 NO BID 

-...: 7,; 
5320 .. 5 .10 5 m.llG 5 !,46O.IO SCI.IO NO BID 5 ..... NO BID 5375.11 5 7 .10 

114" tllidaun (6 .. .:11) -72" 15 ....... , ... .UO NO BID S45O.OO 5 7SO.OI 5 330.10 5 4-'5I-0Il 5UO .~OBlD - NO BID $452.10 S 6.11I0.0I 

1 Infection Groutinl! 
Manhole depth - 0' to S' 20 $ •• 10 NOBlD S 5751.00 5 !$,OIO.III 5 :m.oo 5 6.M.OI $1.111 NO BID - NO BID S35I.OO 5 7,00 .... 
Manhole deotlt - 5'1" to 10' 20 UlmDllole 50.00 NO BID 

iatif5 

17 ..... 10 5 615.01 5 12.310.10 SO.IO NO BID 10.00 NO BID S5IO.III S I~~ Manhole depth -10'1" to 15' 20 [per maa.boJe - SO.OO NORm S '1!,2OO.1O 5 24 001.00 5 1.1115.00 5 20.100.10 $1.00 NO BID SO.OI NO BID S6OO.1O S III .111 
Manhole death - 15' 1" to 20' 20 k ........ 50.00 N"O BID S I .005 ~OI S 1"".10 5 ~.111 $1.111 NOBIO - NO BID 5701.00 5 14.OGI.III 
Manhole depth - 20'1" and OVtI' 20 ~ .. ...,~ SO.OO ISO BID S .01 5 1!1 .10 5 1.675.01 5 ~ .10 SO.lO NO BID $1.00 NO BID ~ ... S _.10 

3 IVa ..... jet deuUns! I I I .. 1...-....... 50.00 NOBJD ~It ...... S25t.lllS 1 ...... 01 S 167.50 I S 6."".111 so.OII NO BID -I NO BID 5150.01 5 6,001.10 

4 IRemovai of eDsdn2 liner I I I 20 _w ... 50.00 NO RID _It 5150.00 5 3,010.01 5 6.10 I 5 122.00 51.1HI1 NO BID SOMI NO BID 5175.00 5 "soun 

5 VoiduoutiA2 I I .. !<uk_ so.an, NO R11) _ .IS SI5O.IO 5 --"", !1m_nt' , so.oo I NO BID 50.1111 N'OBID S2OI.IO IS --... 
TOTAL - GROUP 3, SECTION A I\U Rio Is 9f"".,.1 : ~ 234JJ50.0o ! J 145991.001 I NO BID n NO BID ! S 116.711.10 

, ...... 1-5) I 
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~ 

BID FORM - IFB #1S-IS99BLS 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation BLD ServI .... LLC 

11'_ .. _' " 
GMt. Co, : __ L~ I H':~~~:-=P;'I.ne. II lultllform TI 

Eo •• 

LMO 
J.T.V. Ja"o'1>'''''tcd 
~P----"_ n 

LIDZO TreadtI_ 
TeeboJoaleo Sooth 

,~ 

VaeVbioa E.vUoa:._tal~ 
1.IL'T ____ Ii'1 . 

1 ........ 1 .ok" 1 II E ..... dod I I ....... I II E_ I II E_cled I i E_ I I - I II E_od 
Size Qty MeIi..,. Pridnl! Priciu: ..... ,... Prir:iH PridIu!: POOn. U Pridu Prla..: Pric:IM: yrldal!.. Pric:but: Prlt:m.: Pricfa.-

GRffiJP 3, SECIJON B 

Line & Manhole RelJabWtatiop -

MeIbod 2 

Manhole Surf!SiJl&i 
~, 

1 lieatiOD 

iR",nrh 

IlID"OU~ 
I&O'toS' 
b-S'l"to]~ 

11-10'1" to 15' 
lI.l!1i'l " to 20' 

" .... d ... " .. r 

,. 
:I 
I 

T40 
110 

120 

~ 
~ 

20 
..1!. IDH--.b. 

211 

I IVoid. :r 
:r ,. 

20 !cKWl:nN 

• 

alln .. r 

~ 
TTo" 

1·72" ~ 

8" sewer flow 3000 Uaeu- loot 

10" .ewerflow 3000 Unesrroot 
11" MlWtr Dow 3001 lMv r..t 
15" sewer flow 4000 1:bI.eu- foot 

18" lewer flow 4000 dBe&r foot 

20" N'Wtr flow -4011 JIaear C .... 

24" KWerflow 4000 UnarrOllt 

00" sewer flo.... 4001 bnr foot 
",.11 ....... fI ... _ 4000 IIaBr f _ 

_ er flow I I I 4000 dael.r foot 

.. ftn.. .1 ...l '- 4010 t.ar (_ 
4000 UneIIr Cout 

r fI...... I I I 2000 UaH.r root 

I :.L. _.n 
III -20 

.. rio .. 

~ 
TOTAL - GROUP 3, SEcnON B 

fit",mtl l.J1l 

12 
15 t:.dI 

15 lpueacll 
ISlIa'ftdr. 

'11:0 .1 

N~:: 1 :=;1: = 1 :1: :::::~: ~I: 1#1011$ NOBID A .... I NnRm II --..... 1. ,UtlUl ur J&UtI:' 7J60M~S NOBID!:::: " =:: 1::11 

Noon 
NOBU 

~ 
NO BII 
NORIn 

=-ihi 
""I NflRIn .... _1. 

-'.IOls 

!'!oc).IO I S 
:t.CAllflIIl: 

aMnnl" 

, ... 
!.!!! 
1.10 

I $ 251-" I $ s.o26.00 HOBID 

- NI ....... 
fi'" $ 1.10 - NO BID $.... NOBID S50IM S .. 1.10 

IS 
$ ,. IIM.OO Is - NO BID <0.00 NO BID S6IO.111 $ I ~ 
$ 26.106.111 $ - NO BID suo NO BID $1llI.OO S I.!!!:!!!. 
$ J3,SOI.OO $ - NO BID so... NO BID ........ I 20.001'" 

II!. llLlIIl t. 6...l&6..IO ill NIl Rin 

01 NOBID ..... 1 t. .uiItJIii I c'tOO."" I t. 4.100.1111 t. l"_Vl I !I: 3oW1.1O lrl NO BID 

NflAln 

$1M I NOBID 

$I.IKI I NO BID II5IM I $ 3, ..... 10 

NClRm I! taMt SIIO.1ft 15 %,IOOJ)l111 05..10 i !Ii 122.08 tI en.,. i NnRIn tl'7C nn II 'UOII..lO 

) BID fl.- I $4.10 S I Il00.10 $ .... $ 25.200.10 $ - NO BID st.1KI NO BID 52.01 $ 
N9 BID I $4.01 $ I .00 $ 1.90 $ 26.*.00 $ - NO BID $OM NO BID $2'" $ 6,!IIO.0I 
'iO BID _ $ • $4.10 I I .01 $ 1I.lO $ ~.OI $ -NO BID $0.10 NO BID S2.OO $ 6.100.IO 
N9 BID , $4.00 $ I .10 $ 1'.01 $ !<i.OOUO $ - NO BID st.OI NO BID SUO $ 10 IMIIM 

1!0 BID ~ S. S5.OI $ M $ 1 • .10 $ _.01 S - NO BID so.oo NO BID suo $ ...!!:!!!; 
) BID _. S5.IO $ .10 $ 21.90 $ 13.600.10 - NO BID 11.0. NO BID ,..... , !:!!!. 
) BID : , $5.01 $ 10 .00 $ 20.90 $ 13 ..... 00 $ - NO BID $0.01 NO BID $20.10 $ 10 .III 

) BID • LD' Ul 112.10 S .., _ S 3UO $ 1_.01 $ - NO BID ,..10 NO BID $WIll S 

) BID I W' Uoi ~2.0I $ @,IlOIAO $ 3UO S I_.IKI $ - NO BID $0.0. NO BID $30.00 $ 

NO BID !&iUt I ...... 1.10_10 S to.IOO.OI S 35.10 S 140.,100.01 5 _ NO SID 10.10 NO BID IKIM! S 

NO BID , S2I.8O $ $ 37.... S 15I.l00.10 $ NO BID _ NO BID $!1M I' ~ ... I' 
NO BID ~ I $211'" $ 10 M $ '1.30 $ 165,210.00 S NO BID $1U0 NO BID $75.10 $ 300#.10 
NnRm _tt • <211111' .......... S ".'" S 19""'.10' NORm aM NnRm ....... 

NOBlD 
NOBlD S 
NO BID 
NO BID 

Mibm I 

$ 

II ,"$ ~"'$ 
I 1.005.28 $ 15.171.10 $ 

.. .oot- , ..... '" ~ 15,0"-00 ,. 

" 

IF815-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater line Manhole Rehab Serv.x1sx 

NOBm 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NOBID 

Nn.ln 

--l!!!. 
~ .... ~ ) BID 

NO BID 

NnRm 

51..101.01 I 5 

'II .10 S 19 
1.01$1' 

IL1IO.1O S 19 

• I 



BID FORM -IFB #lSo1599BLS 
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line &: Manhole Rdaabilltation 

,OlJP 3. SECTION 

BID FORM SUMMARY 

GROUPl 

GROUP 1 

Group 1, Section A 
Group 1, Sectloa B 
Group 1, Semon C 
Group I, SedioD D 
Group I, SecdOD E 

Group 2, Section B 

Group 3, Section B 
Group 3, SectiOD. C 

u .. or 

BLD s..:v;..., LLC 

NO RID 

NO BID 

BLD_ 

NOBJD 

"lOBID 

r.-..1. ( __ Ill' 

I 

c;M&.('_ 

'lTM'''. 
"'" -

Hlaterlud G .... p, 1 .... II la_ ..... Tecb .......... 

Hf.a:rIaad Gro.p [_ 

57 ,433,5S1.oo 

Sl,930,910'" 

I_ltuf_ Tecla 

'" ,~ '1',1 
NO BID 

r 1·1~.6KI 

, ,e'"I}pM"fbiJ' 

IF815-15998lS SanItary Sewer Stormwat~ Une Manhole Rehab SeN.xlS)( 

J.T.V. lacorponted 

E_ded 

NO BID 

1'110 BID 

NORm 

J"I"\' loe 

57,.41,956.00 

NO BID 

Ntt 

Lauo Trenchleu 
TccImoIo&Ieo Sooth E_ 

Lumr .......... 

;'J;.4!;"4t'4.'lt) 

NO RID 

J 
$ 

E_od 

v_v...~ 

51,325,951.01 

N081D 


