
Manatee County Govemment Administrative Center 
Commission Chambers, First Roor 

9:00 a.m. - November 17, 2015 

November 17, 2015 - Regular Meeting 
Agenda Item #16 

Subject 
IFB 15-25130V, Robinson Preserve Expansion Phase II Restoratiorn,.;,.B.ra;.d.e.n.to .. n .. ,.F.L .... ____ ........ __ ..... 

Briefinas 
None 

Contact and/or Presenter Information 

APPROVED in Open Session 
November 17. 2015 

Manatee County Board of County 
Commiss ioners 

Contact: Olga Valdch, Finandal Management Department, Purchasing Division, Ext. 3048. 

Presenter: Charlie Hunsicker, Director, Parks and Natural Resources Department, Ext. 6001. 

Action Requested 

Award IFB 15-25130V, Robinson Preserve Expansion Phase II Restoration, Bradenton, FL, to the lowest, 
responsive, and responsible bidder, E. T. MacKenzie of Florida, Inc., Bradenton, FL, for a total of 
$3,976,972.67 with a not to exceed 300 calendar day completion. 

Authorize the County Administrator, or designee, to execute the Agreement and accept and date the 
performance and payment bonds. 

Enabling/Regulating Authoritv 

Manatee County Code of Laws 

Background Discussion 

The work consists of the construction of 58 acres of lakes and freshwater ponds and the dredging of 0.39 
acres of other surface waters to create habitat and conduct restoration work with existing disturbed uplands 
and spoils areas in this phase of restoration activities. This project is funded in the FY 2016-20 Capital 
Improvement Program (CIP). 

The project also includes the construction of 6 acres of passive recreational improvements (I.e. trails, kayak 
launches, storage tubes, etc.) that will allow public access to foster public education, awareness, and passive 
recreation on the site. This public access will be equipped with a parking area and paved access drive which 
will be routed to a dry detention pond with effluent filtration to provide quality treatment. 

Formal, competitive sealed bid procedures were followed resulting in a total of six (6) bidders submitting a 
sealed bid for consideration. 



Manatee County 
E.T. MacKenzie of Florida, Inc. 
Woodruff & Sons, Inc. 
Westra Construction Corp. 
Tampa Contracting Services, Inc. 

Okeechobee County 
Enviro-Tech Systems, Inc. 

Polk County 
Bul-Hed Corporation 

Manatee County Government Administrative Center 
Commission Chambers, First Floor 

9:00 a.m. - November 17, 2015 

$3,976,972.67 
$4,554,619.30 
$4,696,809.48 
$4,735,957.60 

$4,217,135.12 

$4,118,118.11 

Parks and Natural Resources Department recommends award to E. T. MacKenzie of Aorida, Inc., Bradenton, 
FL, for a total bid amount of $3,976,972.67 with a project completion time of not to exceed 300 calendar 
days. 

Purchasing Division has reviewed E.T.Mackenzie of Florida, Inc.'s bonding capacity and current status of 
contracts on hand and verified that they are satisfactorily equipped and financed to perform the work. 

County Attorney Review 
Not Reviewed (No apparent legal Issues) 

Explanation of Other 

Reviewing Attorney 
N/A 

Instructions to Board Records 

Original to Board Records 

Copies to: 
E.T. MacKenzie of Florida, Inc., 6212 33rd Street East, Bradenton, FL (shuber@mackenzieco.com), 
Towanda Brinson a owanda.brioson@manateeclerk.com), Accounts Payable Rnance Department, 
Olga Valdch (olga.Valclch@mymanatee.ora), Purchasing Division, 
Charlie HunSicker, Parks and Natural Resources (Charlie.Hunsjcker@mymanatee.ora) 

Cost and Funds Source Account Number and Name 
3036085208, 3036085209, 3036085211, (303) Parks Capital Proj. Fund. 

Amount and Freqyency of Recurring Costs 
N/A 



Attachment: Agenda Tabulation 2 Pages.pdf 

Manatee County Government Administrative Center 
Commission Chambers, First Floor 

9:00 a.m. - November 17, 2015 

Attachment: Agenda Recommendation from CH via Email.pdf 
Attachment: Agenda Two Party Agreement-Cert-Pub Bnd-Insur-Pwr of Att.pdf 
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Olga Vakich 

From: 
Sent 
TO! 
Cc: 

Charlie Hunsicker 
Wednesday, October 21, 2015 11:11 AM 
Olga Valcich 
Andrews. Beth; Stephanie Powers; Burton, Mike 

Subject: Re: Recommendation of Award - Robinson Preserve Phase IT - IFB 15-25130V 
(215510578) letter and Tabulation 

I concur with the engineers recommendation for award. 

Sent from my iPhone 
Charlie Hunsicker, Director 
Parks and Natural Resources Dept. 
Bradenton, Fl. 
941-737-4765 

On Oct 21, 2015. at 11 :08 AM, Olga Valcich <olga.vglcich@mymanatee.org> wrote: 

Hello and thank you. 

I do have notes for myself ensuring that we include Stephanie at SWFWMD once the Bee approves the 
agenda motion and my manager signs off on the contracts, etc .•. 

Before end of day, I will forward a copy ofthe Intent to Award that will be issued to E.T. MacKenzie. 

Best, 
Olga. 

From: Andrews, Beth [mailto:Beth.Andrews@stantec.coml 
Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2015 11:05 AM 
To: Chartle Hunsicker 
Cc: Olga Valcich; Stephanie Powers; Burton. Mike 
Subject: FW: Recommendation of Award - Robinson Preserve Phase II - IFB 15-25130V (215510578) 
letter and Tabulation 
Importance: High 

Charlie: Alfached is the final Recommendation of Award and Bid Tabulation for your formal 
approval and forwarding to Olga. 

Olga: Please note that Stephanie at SWFWMD will need a copy of the e)(ecuted con1ractor 
contract and the NTP lelferwhen completed. 

Please let us know if you need anything further re: the attached documenls. 

Thank-you 
Beth 

8eth Andrews 
Sr. Project Manager, Environmental Services 
Stantec 
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6900 Professional Parkway East Sarasota FL 34240-a414 
Phone: 1941) 907-6900 x 247 
Cell: (941) 228-1988 
Beth.Andrews@stantec.com 

The content of this emoll i5 the confidential pmperty of Stantec: and should not be copect. rnoctfled, relransmHted. or used for any 
purpose except with Stcnfec's Vo11tten authorization. If you ore not,he Intended reclptent. please delete oR copies and notfty us 
Im""""QleIy. 
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