IFB #09-2455JS CISCO SYSTEM I-NET CONDUIT PROJECT EQUIPMENT BID TABULATION

Coleman Technologies, inc.

Presidio Networked Solutions

Agilysys, Inc. Bell South Communications Canon Business Systems
Tampa, FL 33607 Tampa, FL 33607 Sarasota, FL 34236 Tampa, FL 33602 Greenbelt, MD 20770
(813) 864-3494 (813) 402-5171 (941) 358-1636 (813) 416-3095 (301) 313-2000
Item # |Description Part # Qty][Unit Price | Extended Price |[Unit Price | Extended Price | UnitPrice | Extended Price | UnitPrice [ Extended Price | UnitPrice | Extended Price
1 |12 X2-based 10 Gigabit Ethernet Port WS-C3560E-12D-E 1 $19,656.00 $19,656.00] $15,673.60 $15,673.60 No Bid No Bid|| $14,848.00 $14,848.00 $14,493.69 $14,493.69
12 SFP based Gigabit Ethernet ports + 2 X2-
2 [based 10 Gigabit Ethernet Ports WS-C3560E-12SD-E 2 $12,281.93 $24,563.86|| $9,793.55 $19,587.10 No Bid No Bid" $9,277.68 $18,555.36 $9,056.29 $18,112.58
48 10/100/1000 ports + 2 X2-based 10
3 |Gigabit Ethernet Ports WS-C3750E-48TD-S 4 $11,667.68 $46,670.72 $9,303.76 $37,215.00 No Bid No Bid" $8,813.68 $35,254.72 $8,603.36 $34,413.44
24 10/100/1000 ports + 2 X2-based 10
4 |Gigabit Ethernet ports WS-C3750E-24TD-S 4 $5,832.31 $23,329.24]f $4,650.65 $18,602.60 No Bid No Bid|| $4,405.68 $17,622.72 $4,300.55 $17,202.20
5 |StackWise 1M Stacking Cable CAB-STACK-1M 2 $122.85 $245.70 $48.98 $97.96 No Bid No Bid $46.40 $92.80 $90.59 $181.18
Catalyst 6500 Enhanced 9-slot chassis, ||
6 |15RU, no PS, no Fan Tray WS-C6509-E 2 $5,835.38 $11,670.76)] $4,653.10 $9,306.20 No Bid No Bid|| $4,408.00 $8,816.00 $4,302.81 $8,605.62
7 |Bootflash for SUP720-64MB-RP BF-S720-64MB-RP 2 No Bid No Bid $97.96 $195.92 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8 |Catalyst 6500 Compact Flash Memory 1GB [MEM-C6K-CPTFL1GB | 2 $672.60 $1,345.20 $536.33 $1,072.66 No Bid No Bid" $508.08 $1,016.16 $495.96 $991.92
Catalyst 6500 Central Fwd Card for WS-
9 [X67xx modules WS-F6700-CFC 2 $122.58 $245.16| $3,673.50 $7,347.00 No Bid No Bid" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10 |6500 Dist Fwd Card for WS-X67xx Modules |WS-F6700-DFC3C 2 $4,606.88 $9,213.76)] $3,673.50 $7,347.00" No Bid No Bid" $3,480.00 $6,960.00|| $3,396.96 $6,793.92
Catalyst 6500 256MB DDR, xCEF720 (67xx
11 |interface, DFC3A) MEM-XCEF720-256M 2 $0.00 $0A00|| $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid" $0.00 $0.00" $0.00 $0.00
12 |Multilayer Switch Feature Card Ill MSFC 2 No Bid No Bid|| $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid| $0.00 $0.00]| $0.00 $0.00||
NA (Locking) 200-240 VAC Operation
13 [NEMA L6-20 CAB-AC-C6K-TWLK 4 No Bid No Bid $22.04 $88.16) No Bid No Bid" $0.00 $0.00“ $0.00 $0.00
14 |AC Power Cord North America (110V) CAB-7513AC 4 No Bid No Bid $12.25 $49.00 No Bid No Bid|| $0.00 $0.00f $0.00 $0.00]|
15 |SP Adapter for SUP720 and SUP720-10G |CF-ADAPTER-SP 2 No Bid No Bid| $487.35 $974.70| No Bid No Bid“ $0.00 $0.00" $0.00 $0.00"
16 |Cisco CAT6000-VSS720 IOS IP Services  |SV331S-12233SXH 2 $0.00 $0.00|| $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid|| $0.00 $0.00]| $0.00 $0.00
CAT 6500 Supervisor 720 with 2 ports
17 |[10GbE and MSFC3 PFC3C VS-§720-10G-3¢ 2 || $23,341.50 $46,683.00) $18,612.40 $37,224.80 No Bid No Bid" $17,632.00 $35,264.00 $17,211.26 $34,422.52
18 |Catalyst 6509-E Chassis Fan Tray WS-C6509-E-FAN 2 $304.06 $608.12 $242.45 $484.90|  NoBid NoBid[  $229.68 $459.36 $224.20 $448.40
19 | CAT 6500 6000W AC Power Supply WS-CAC-6000W 4 $3,071.25 $12,285.00| $2,449.00 $9,796A00|| No Bid No Bid|| $2,320.00 $9,280.00)  $2,264.64 $9,058.56
Catalyst 6500 16 port 10 Gigabit Ethernet
20 |w/DFC3C (req X2) WS-X6716-10G-3C 2 || $24,570.00 $49,140.00|| $19,592.00 $39,184.00|I No Bid No Bid" $18,560.00 $37,120.00" $18,117.11 $36,234.22
Catalyst 6500 16 port 10 GigE Mod: fabric-
21 |enabled (req SFPs) WS-X6724-SFP 2 $9,213.75 $18,427.50| $7,347.00 $14,694.00II No Bid No Bid" $6,960.00 $13,820.00 $6,793.92 $13,587.84
Catalyst C3560 24 Port IP Service Feature
22 |Set WS-C3560-24TS-E 5 $3,065.11 $15,325.55{ $2,444.10 $12,220.50| No Bid No Bid" $2,315.36 $11 ,576.80“ $2,260.11 $11,300.55
100 Prepaid Training Credits Redeem
23 |w/Cisco Learning TRN-CLC-001 2 $9,895.28 $19,790.56| $6,898.00 $13,796.00 No Bid No Bid“ $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
40 Hours Onsite Configuration in 8 hour
Blocks as needed. Minimum CCNP 3 years
experience for Cisco 6500. Must have
experience with Virtual Switching System
24 |(VSS) 40 hours 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid||  $5,000.00 $5,000.00{f $5,360.00 $5,360.00
25 |Cisco TwinGig Convert Mod CVR-X2-SFP 14 $119.77 $1,676.78 $95.51 $1,337.14 No Bid No Bid|| $90.48 $1,266.72 $88.32 $1,236.48
26 |10GBASE-LRM X2 Module X2-10GB-LRM 15 $918.31 $13,774.65 $732.25 $10,983.75 No Bid No Bid|| $693.68 $10,405.20 $677.13 $10,156.95
27 |GB SFP LC Conn. SX Trans GLC-SX-MM 24 $307.13 $7,371.12 $244.90 $5.877.60( No Bid No Bid“ $232.00 $5,568.00|| $226.46 $5,435.04
28 |10GBASE-ER X2 Module X2-10GB-ER 6 $6,142.50 $36,855.00| $4,898.00 $29,388.00|| No Bid No Bid|  $4,640.00 $27,840.00] $4,529.28 $27,175.68
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IFB #09-2455JS CISCO SYSTEM I-NET CONDUIT PROJECT EQUIPMENT BID TABULATION

Agilysys, Inc. Bell South Communications Canon Business Systems Coleman Technologies, Inc. Presidio Networked Solutions
Tampa, FL 33607 Tampa, FL 33607 Sarasota, FL 34236 Tampa, FL 33602 Greenbelt, MD 20770
(813) 864-3494 (813)402-5171 (941) 358-1636 (813) 416-3095 (301) 313-2000
Item # |Description Part # Qty|[Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
N5000 1RU Chassis no PS 2 Fan Modules
29 |20 ports (req SFP+) N5K-C5010P-BF 2 $10,595.81 $21,191.62| $8,449.05 $16,898.10 No Bid No Bid||  $8,004.00 $16,008.00| $7,813.01 $15,626.02
Nexus 5000 Base OS Software Release
30 |4.00N1(2a) N5KUKS-401AN2.1 2 No Bid No Bid]i $48.98 $97.96 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
31 |[10GBASE-CU SFP+Cable 5 Meter SFP-H10GB-CU5M 20 $159.71 $3,194.20 $127.35 $2,547.00 No Bid No Bid $120.64 $2,412.80|| $117.76 $2,355.20
32 [10GBASE-CU SFP+Cable 3 Meter SFP-H10GB-CU3M 15 $128.99 $1,934.85 $102.86 $1,542.90| No Bid No Bid $97.44 $1,461 .60“ $95.11 $1,426.65
33 |10GBASE-CU SFP+Cable 1 Meter SFP-H10GB-CU1M 15 $92.14 $1,382.10 $73.47 $1,102.05 No Bid No Bid $69.60 $1,044.00 $67.94 $1,019.10
Nexus 5010 PSU module, 100-240VAC
34 |550W N5K-PAC-550W 4 No Bid No Bid $367.35 $1,469.40 No Bid No Bid $348.00 $1,392.00 $339.70 $1,358.80
Power Cord, 125V 12A North America
35 |NEMA 5-15 Plug 2.5M CAB-9K12A-NA 4 No Bid No Bid $22.04 $88.16 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
36 |GB SFP LC Conn. LX Trans-CAT GLC-LH-SM 14 $611.17 $8,556.38 $487.35 $6,822.90 No Bid No Bid $461.68 $6,463.52 $450.66 $6,309.24
37 |Nexus 5010 Accessory Kit Option N5010-ACC-KIT 2 No Bid No Bid $48.98 $97.96 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|
38 |N5000 1000 Series Expansion Module Biank|M5K-M1-BLNK No Bid No Bid $36.74 $73.48 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00"
Sub Total $329,283.50 i $289,647.76 $283,305.80||
Minus Trade-In CTMP #06222009- ’
11976322 -$21,500.00 | -$21,499 $0.00
TOTAL OFFER $400,156.70] $307,783.50 | $268,147.78 $283,305.80||
* Total Offer differs from Sub
Total due to mathematical error.
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