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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid # 14-2696-DS, Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides, and Other Related Aquatic
Chemicals, for purchase on an as required basis, to the lowest responsive, responsible multiple bidders meeting

specifications.

Award to: Alligare LLC, Opelika, AL; Dieter’'s Sod Services, Inc. Bradenton, FL; Florida Irrigation Supply Inc., dba FIS
Outdoor, Clearwater FL; Helena Chemical Chemical Company, Dade City, FL; Red River Specialties, Shreveport, LA;
Southern Agricultural Insecticides, Inc. Palmetto FL; Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co., Inc.; Winfield Solutions, LLC.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.

Manatee County Code of Laws

e The contract provides for the procurement of sod, seed, fertilizers, herbicides, and other related aquatic chemicals by
various departments, on an “as required basis”, for aquatic control of the stormwater system and landscaping

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

maintenance performed by County staff.

¢ The procurement of these items is funded from various funding sources such as Transportation Trust Fund, General

Fund, Utility Fund, Enterprise Fund, etc., with various operating accounts for each Department.

e This contract is for a twenty four (24) month period with one (1) twenty four (24) month renewal period not to exceed total

contract duration of forty eight (48) months.

e Background/ discussion information continued on page 2.

e Bid Tabulation of all

Various Sources &
Operating Accounts

Bids
ATTACHMENTS ¢ Award Tabulation FUNDING SOURCE =
i X  Funds Verified
(List in order of attached) Sheet (Acct Number & Name) [ lnsifficlent Fusids
$550,000

COST

(2 year contract
estimate)

AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING COSTS

(Attach Fiscal Impact Statement)




INTENT TO AWARD (continued) Page 2

e Appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability advertised on DemandStar,
mymanatee.org and the Manatee Chamber of Commerce.

e Nine (9) Bids were received.

e Basis of award for IFB #14-2696-DS as stated in Article C.01 of the bid documents, is a line item by
line item basis to the lowest responsive, responsible multiple bidders meeting specifications for
each item as listed on the Bid Form. Award shall be to a Primary (lowest, responsive, responsible
bidder), and Secondary (second lowest responsible bidder).

e |tis the intent to place release orders with the lowest priced bidder, who can provide the products at
the time needed. Should the lowest priced bidder be unable to supply the products due to
availability, a contingency plan has been established to contact the next lowest bidder.

F:\Donna Stevens\IFB's for FY 2014\14-2696-DS SOD, SEED, HERBICIDES ETC\11.6.2014 INTENT TO AWARD.docx



BID TABULATION

TABULATION Alligare LLE Dieter's Sad Service, Inc. Florida Irrigation Supply Inc. DBA FIS Qutdoor Helena Chemical Company Red River Speciaities, Inc.
IFB# 14-2696-DS 13 N. 8th Stroet 2315 Zipperer Road 1740 Calumet Street P.O. Box 1758 1324 North Hearne Avenue, Suite 120
Sod, Fertilizer, Herhicides and other related Aquatic Chemicals Opelika, AL 36801 Bradanten, FL 34212 Clearwater, FL 33765 Dade City, FL 33526-1758 | Office in Paimetto FL ) Shreveport, LA 71107
{Out of state firm} {Manatee County Firm}) {Pinallas County Firm) {Pasco County Firm {0ut, of state firm})
EXTENDED
ITEM IDESCRIPTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER 31ZE ALTERMATE ESTIMATED €Y ufm UNITPRICE || EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY u/m UNITPRICE |  EXTENDED PRKCE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED CTY u/m UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRKE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED GTY um UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE| ALTERNATE ESTIMATED Ty um UNIT PRICE PRICE
1 BAHIA SOD
A |2-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 5F}
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 6,000 SF No Bid 6,000 5F 5 02708 1,620.00 6,000 SF No Bid 6,000 SF No Bid 6,000 SF Ne Bld
b. COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF No Bid BOD 5F 5 019505 156.00 8 SF Ne Bid 800 SF No Bld 800 SF Ne Bld
=L -
c DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 4,000 SF Ho Bid 4,000 SF 5 o0a3ls 1,320.00 4,000 SF No Bld 4,000 SF No Bid 4,000 SF No Eld
-
B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 5F)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 5,600 SF No Bid 5,600 SF § oasjs 1,400.00 5,600 SE No Bid 5,600 SF No Bid 5,600 SF No Bid
i | — 25
b. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) 7,600 SF No Bid 7,600 SF $ oa]s 2,128.00 7,600 SF No Bid 7,600 SF No Bid 7,600 SF No Bid
e — = 2
. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION {Pallet Sod) 1,200 SF No Bid 1,800 SF 5 o032)s 576.00 1,800 SF No Bid 1,800 SF No 1,300 SF No Bid
. === = = = 2= = =
C  |10-24 PALLETS [4,000 SF - 9,999 5F)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 4,000 5F No Bid 4,000 SF 5 02205 820.00 4,000 SF No Bld 4,000 SF No Bld 4000 SF No Bld
b. DELIVERED &, INSTALLED [Pallet Sod) 8,000 SF Ne Bid 8,000 SF 5 o02]s 2,080.00 8,000 SF No Bld _B000 SF No Bid 8,000 SF No Bid
= R
c. SLOPE DELIVERY & JNSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 12,500 SF No Bld 12,500 SF 5 02908 3,625.00 12,500 SF No Bid 12,500 ] ' SF No Bid 12,500 SF No Bid
L == === = —— 2< =
D |25 PALLETS OR MORE {10,000 SF OR MORE)
a. DELIVERED B. INSTALLED {Fallet Sod} 225,000 SF No Bld 225,000 SF $ o218 4725000 225,000 SF Ne Bid 225,000 SF No 8id 225,000 SF No Bid
b. SLOPE DELWERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod 400,000 SF No Bid 400,000 SF $ 02945 11600000 400,000 SF No Bid 400,000 SF Na Bid 400,000 SF Ne Bid
— S ——— p
12 ST. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM
A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 5F}
. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 7,600 SF Na Bid 7,600 SE § o3sf]s 2,736.00 7,600 SF No Bid 7,600 SF No Bid 7,600 SF No Bid
== —1C - S
b. COUNTY PICK UP 8OO SF No Bid 8O0 SF $ oa]s 208.00 B0G SF No 800 SF No Bid 800 SF Ne Bid
=S =l =]
c. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 3,200 SF No Bld 3,200 SF 5 os2]s 1,664.00 3,200 SF No Bid 3,200 SF No Bld 3,200 SF No Bid
d. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION {Pallet Sad) 250 SF No Bld 250 SF 5 058)% 145,00 250 SF No Bld 250 SF No Bld 250 SF No Bid
= = = = —=2 s o
B |5-9 PALLETS {2,000 5F - 3,999 5F]
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 2,500 SF No Bid 2,500 SF $ o3afs 975.00 2,500 SF No Bid 2,500 SF No Bid 2500 SF No Bid
b. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 4,800 SF Ne Bld 4,800 SF 5 048 . $ 2,304.00 4,800 SF No Bid 4,300 SF No Bid 4,800 SF No Bld
3 418 BERMUDA 80D
A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 500 SF No Bid 500 5F $ 04405 220.00 500 SF No Bid 500 SF No Bid 500 SF No Bid
= —
b. COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF No Bid BOD SF S o036)s 288.00 800 S5F No Bid 800 SF No Bid 800 SF No Bld
1: 2 = el st =2 == =
c. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod 1,600 SF No Bld 1,600 SF 5 04afs 704.00 1,600 SF No Bld 1,600 SF No Bid 1,600 5F No Bid
= — = =

IFB #14-2696-DS



BID TABULATION

TABULATION Alligare LLC Dieter's Sod Service, Inc. Florida Irrigation Supply Inc. DBA FIS Outdoor Helena Chemlcal Company Red River Speciaities, inc.
IFB# 14-2696-DS 13 N. Bth Street 2315 Zipperer Roag 1740 Calumet Street P.0.Box 1758 1324 North Heamne Avenue, Suite 120
Sodl, Fertilizer, Herbicides and other related Aquatic Chamicals Opelika, AL 36301 Bradenton, FL 34212 Clearwater, FL 33765 Dade Clty, FL 33526-1758 [ Office in Palmetto FL ) Shreveport, LA 71107
{Out of state firm) {Manatee County Firm) {Pinellas County Firm} {Pasco County Firm| {Qut of state firm)
EXTENDED
ITEM JDESCRIFTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED OQTY uM UNITPRICE || EXTENDED PRKCE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED arY u/mM UNITPRECE | EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY UM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED aTY Ui UNITPRKE § EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY um UNIT PRICE PRICE
d. ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 200 SF No Bid 200 5F 3 oas]s 92.00 200 SF No Bid 200 SF No Bld 200 SF Ne: Bid
— = == == ==
B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF}
2. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) £,000 SF No Bid 5,000 SF $ 043]8 3,440.00 8,000 SF Ne Bid 13&00 S N& Bld 8,000 SF No Bid
b. ROLLED 500- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF No Bid 4,000 SF 5 045]% 1,800.00 iF Ng Bld 4,000 SF No Blid 4,000 SF No Bid
€ |10-24 PALLETS {4,000 5F - 2,990 SF)
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 12,000 SF No 12.000 SF s oa]s 4,920.00 12,000 SF No Bld 12,000 SF No Bid 12,000 SF Ne Bld
4,000 SF No Bid 4,000 SF $ oaz]s £80.00 4,000 SF No Bid 4,000 SF No 4,000 SF No Bid
. i
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) 38,000 SF No Bid 38,000 SF $ o03sls 1482000 38,000 SF Ne Bid 38,000 SE No 38,000 SF No Bid
st = B tee] —
| ROILED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED: 1,000 SF No Bid 1,000 SF $ oal)s 410.00 1,000 SF No Bld 1,000 SE No 1,000 SF No__
4 STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)
a. STAPLES {COUNTY SUPPLIED] 1 EA No Bid 1 EA s 006)3 0.06 1 EA No Bld 1 EA No Bid 1 EA No
|b. STAPLES {VENDOR SUPPLIED} 10,000 SF No Bld 10,000 SF 5 o12]3 1,200.00 10,000 SF No Bid 10,000 SF Ne Bid 10,000 SF No L
{SEEDS & MULCH
1 SEEDS (50 POUND BAGS)
a. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 08  BAG No Bid 400 BAG No Bid 400 BAG $ 142528 $ s7o011200 400 BAG No Bid 400 BAG No Bid
& —— o= = ==
b. RYE GRASS (QCT THRU MARCH)] 3401 BAG Na Bid 340 BAG No Bid 340 BAG S 32183 [l $ 10942220 340 BAG No Bid 340|  BAG No Bid
. BROWN TOP MILLET {APRIL THRU SEPT.) 340 | Bag No Bid 340 BAG No Bid 340 BAG $  32183[|$ 10942220 340 BAG No Bid 340 BAG No Bid
= — B = == l— —_
¢ BERMUDA SEED {HULLED) 500  Bas No Bld 500 BAG No Bid 500 BAG $ 313793 $ 15689650 500 BAG No Bl 500 _ BAG No Bid
= e = e - =,
12 MULCH (2.0 cu ft BAGS)
a. CELLULOSE MULCH{FOR HYDRO SEEDING), 60% PAPER, 40%
\WOoOD FIBER BALES] 300 | BAG No Bld 300 BAG No Bid 300 BAG $ 10865f % 3289500 300 BAG No Bid 300( BAG No Bid
JooD FIBER (GOLE RALES] = == e R R R e
JFERTILIZERS
16-2-16 FERTILIZER, w/ Slow Release Ritrogen (NO 30000 522515/50
i SUBSTITUTIONS) 30,000 LB No. Bid 30,000 LB Ne Bid {504 bags) [} Ib bag $13,509.60 30,000 LB No Bid 30,000 LB No Bid
15-0-15 FERTILZER W/ .67% RONSTAR AND $LOW RELEASE 20000 629 216/
NITROGEN (NO SUBSTITUTIONS 20,000 LB No Bid 20,000 L8 No Bid (50# bags) LB solb §  11,92640 20,600 LB No Bld 20,000 LB No Bid
= - - A =TT =
HERBICIDES! ALGICIDES
Rangemaster 2.5/
u VETERAN 720 2.5 GAL 2 EA No Bid 2 EA No Bid gallon contziner 2 EA § 83.05 || § 166.10 2 EA 5 P43 || 16876 2 EA § 9162 5 18324
= === ==
Alligare
Glyphosate
12 |/SOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE 2.5 GAL 4 plus 24 EA $ 36825[S $70.00 24 A No Bid 24 EA 5 4787l $ _ 1,148.88 Range Pro 24 EA 5 3625 & 870.00 Alecto 415 24 EA S 4000 $ 96000
Alligare
Ghyphosate Iscpropylamine Saft of
13 ROUNDUP PRO 2.5 GAL 4 plus 200 EA $_3625H¢ 725000 200 EA No Bid =“phosate (2.5 gallon) 200 EA § A787]| $  9574.00 Range Pro 200 EA § 4688) 5 9,376.00 flasts 415 200 EA $ 40004 800000
4 [a. WEEDAR 64 {AQUATIC LABEL) {NO SUBS) 15 EA No Bid 15 EA No Bld 15 EA s 42833( 5§ 64249 15 EA $ 46138 699 15 EA Ne Bld
= — e == =
b. WEEDAR 64 {AQUATIC LABEL) {NO SUBS) 10 EA Mo Bid 10 EA No Bld 10 EA No Bld 10 EA 5 5415008 541500 10 EA No Bid
——— = = —— e

IFB #14-2698-D5



BID TABULATION

TABULATION Alligare LLC Dieter's Sod Service, Inc. Florida irrigation Supply Inc. DBA FIS Qutdoor Helena Chemical Company Red River Speclalties, Inc.
IFB# 14-2696-DS 13 N. Bth Street 2315 Zipperer Road 1740 Calumet Strest P.0. Box 1758 1324 Nerth Heame Avenue, Sulte 120
Sod, Fertllizer, Herbicides and other related Aquatic Chemlcals. Opellka, AL 36801 Bradenton, FL 34212 Clearwater, FL 33765 Dade City, FL 33526-1758 [ Office in Palmetto FL } Shreveport, LA 71107
{Out of state firm} {Manatee County Firm} {PInellas County Firm) {Pasco County Firm {Out of state firm)
EXTENDED
ITEM || DESCRIPTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED OT¥ um UNIT PRKE {| EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED aT? uim UNITPRKE |  EXTENDED FRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED OTY UM UNIT PRICE EXTENDEL: PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY UM LINIT FRICE ICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED ary UM UNIT PRICE PRICE
———
Alligare
Glyphosate
Is 5. RODED, AQUA CLEAR 2.5 GAL 54 10 EA 5 a3on]s 430,00 10 EA No Bld 10 EA s 65.67 f 5 £56.70 Roden 10 EA 4 4500)% 45000 10 EA $ 5170l § 517.00
= ==t s L
b. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR (RETURNABLE CONTAINER) 30 GAL 70 €A No Bid 70 EA No Bld 70 EA S5 63646 § 4455220 Ridas 70 EA $ 535350||3 37,485.00 70 EA 5 60360 [ 5 42,252.00
44 LB container
30 ea required EA|
{offerin BLB | (xibscontainer
Is |SONAR G (NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 4018 30 EA No Bid 30 EA No Bid “antainer only) cucted) $ 46577 8139731 30 EA $ 1,152.80 || $ 34,584.00 30 EA No Bid
5
lofferin 1 QT GL
7 |SOMNAR {4.5) (N© SUBSTITUTIONS) 1GAL 5 5L No Bid 5 GL Mo Bld nitainer enly} 21 $ 810477 || 24052385 5 GL $ 190236 [$ 951180 5 [ No Bld
Alkgars Cagul
8 SILKEN, KINETIC 1Gal Q53INE 150 6L $ 38z0)3% 5730.00 150 GL No Bld | § Guallpn wesntamat | 150 6L S 799885 11908200 150 GL $ .80 |[ S 987000 Fhve Rl 150 6L § 4058 % 6,087.00
Ie |SENCOR 75 TURF {NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5LB 4 EA No Bld 4 EA Mo Bid 4 EA $ 400072 ( 5 1604288 4 EA 5 334505 1,338.00 4 EA No Bld
24 - Damine
10 MEC AMINE-D 2.5 GAL 20 EA No Bid 20 EA No Bld {2.5 Gallon container) 20 EA - 4523 [ 3 904.50 Endrun 20 EA $ BB75[S 1775.00 20 EA No Bld
Alligare
Triclopyr
11 (GARLON 4 {GENERICS ALLOWED} 2.5 GAL 4EC 12 EA $ 11618 $  1,394.16 12 EA No Bid 12 EA $§ 217.05| 5 260450 Element 4 12 EA $ 13235005 1590.00 Element 4 12 EA § 13380 § 160560
Alllgare
Tricopyr
12 a. GARLON 3A [GENERICS ALLOWED] 2.5 GAL 35L 400 EA $ 9108) $ 3643200 400 EA No Bid 400 EA 5 192444 |5 76977.600 Element 3 A 400 EA & 116885 4675200 | Element 3A 400 EA $ 110303 § 44,120.00
T o Co—— == =y
Alligare
Tridopyr
b. GARLON 3A {GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 5 20 EA S 108180 || §  21,636.00 20 EA Na Bid 20 EA S 256100305 51,220.00 Flamant 14 20 EA 5 139500 § 27.900.00 Element 34 ] EA $ 1,323.60 || 5§ 26,472.00
= e = =
50 50
| only offer 1 jromes in 5 Gal
Gallen kantalner- cost,
13 PLATEAL (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 GAL 50 EA No Bld s0 EA No Bld containers) EA 5 _aso7Bl[ S 7.939. 50 EA § 354634 17,731.50 15 2525 gal) EA $  S93.00f & 35l
14 |MILESTONE [NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 GAL 50 EA No Bid 50 EA No Bid 50 EA 5 8583334 5 42,916.65! 50 EA $ 74933 | & 37,466.50 50 EA § 77250 § 38,625.00
Alligare
ISOPROPYL AMINE SALT of IMAZAPYR 28,1% A. {active Ingredient) Ecomazapyr Nufarm Polarls 2
15 Jgasuzmcs ALLOWED) 25GAL 25L 10 EA $ 11698l 115080 10 EA No Bid { 2.5 Gallon containat) 10 EA 5 156004 5 560.00 Arsenal 10 EA 5 15613 1§ 156130 || Arsenal Herbicide| 10 EA $ 13855 % 138550
= = = = s ===t
|FUNGICIDES
{Only offer 5 LB
1 ALIETTE WDG {GENERICS ALLOWED) 5.5LB 5 EA No Bid 5 EA No N container} 5 EA § 77434 5 387.15 Alfiette WDG 5 EA $ 13365)/6  668.25 5 EA No Bid
|INSECTICIDES
Acephate 90
1 (ORTHENE 1B 10 EA No Bid 10 EA No Bld {1 LB contalnar} 10 EA ] 10.00 |f § 100.00 | Acephate 97 UP 10 EA $ 50 S 89.00 10 EA No Bid
= == = = =
Acephate 90
B : 41 rantainar)
1 ORTHENE 1018 10 EA o Bid 10 EA Na Bid QL2 cont: 10 EA $ 7163 5 71630 § Aeaphara a7UD 10 EA $ BLOBfS 81000 10 EA No Bld
a. AMDRO 1LB {NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1Le 10 LB No Bid 10 LB No Bld 10 L8 5 10615 106,10 10 LB No Eid 1 LB No Bid
s _ g —] L—= =l
b. AMDRO 25LB {(NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2518 20 EA No Bld 20 EA Ne Bld 20 EA S 275.78 || 5 5,515.611 20 EA $ 21875018 437500 20 EA No Bid
= = . ==LsS———8 3, = b =
Bifenthrin 7.9
| TALSTAR F 1 GAL 40 GL No Bld 40 GL No Bid {1 Gallon eontainer) 20 GL H 3287 || 1,314.80 Bifin I/T u 40 GL § 2785]% 1,114.00 Bifin /T n a0 6L 5 3330 & 133200
== e —=
ADJUVANTS & ADDITIVES
Foarmbuster required as
Alligare {only offered n 1 arTs ar
1 DEFOAMER 1 Quart Anti-Foamer 120 aT H 452 0 § 542.40 120 [1) No Bid 120 | Qr E 5.75 § & 690,00 | pint contamer} 120 lpiny & 635 $762.00 120 ar 5 82805 93360
LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1GAL 500 GL No Bid 500 GL No pid 500 6L 5 1807 $  9,035.00 Inlet 500 L s 1330Q% 665000 500 GL § 4058 | § 20,290.00
— A C— e — N
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAXE, AIRTIGHT (NO:
SUBSTITUTIONS! 1Quart 2,000 ar No Bid 2,000 =1 No Bid 2,000 ar No Bld 2000 ar % 1060 | 5 21,200.00 2,000 QT No Bld

IFB #14-2666-DS



BID TABULATION

TABULATION Alligare LLC Dleter's Sod Service, Inc. Florida Irrigation Supply Inc. DBA FIS Qutdoor Helena Chemical Company Red River Speclalties, Inc.
IFB# 14-2696-D5 13 N, Bth Street 2315 Zipperer Road 1740 Calumet Street P.0. Bax 1758 1324 North Hearne Avenue, Sulte 120
Sodl, Fertllizer, Herbicldes and other related Aquatic Chemicals Opelika, AL 35801 Bradenton, FL 34212 Clearwater, FL 33765 Dade City, FL 33526-1758 { Office in Palmetto FL ) Shreveport, LA 71107
{Out of state firm) {Manatee County Firm} {PIneilas County Firm) {Pasco County Firm {Out of state flrm)
EXTENDED
[TEM | DESCRIPTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINERSIZE | ALTERNATE ESTIMATED OTY um UNITPRICE | EXTENDED FAICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QY u/m UNITPRICE §  EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QY ufm UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTEMATED <Y UM UNITPRKE JEXTENDED PRICE]  ALTERNATE ESTIMATED ary u/m UNIT PRICE PRICE
Alligare Trace
Cide Kick GA
2120 Cide Kick {affered In 2.5 gatlon (25 g3l
OIL OF LIMONENE (GENERICS ALLOWED]} 1 GAL container 8 GA S 1265 5 101.20 B GA No Bid {1 Gallon cotalner) 8 GA 5 19733 ) § 157.664 contalnet} g | cmaner) |5 3038 S 31504 CldeKick 2 GA 5 211745 16938
Alllgare Super JRRSI VM Marking]
|SPRAY INDICATOR/MARKER DYE (BLUE} {GENERICS ALLOWED} 1 GAL Marker Dye 8 GA S 284516 227.60 8 GA No Bid 8 GA 3 $3.80 f| $ 270.40 [|5pec Spray Indlcator, 8 GA 16.65f|5 13320 Dye 3 GA § 21435 16942
— = = S e
Acknewiedged Addendum ¥ 1 Yas i Yes 1 Yag Yes Yas
Affidavit as 1o Local Business m‘“
Public Contracting and Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes _n Yes Yes Yesg

|IFB #14-2696-DS



BID TABULATION
TABULATION thern Agricultural icides Inc. Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co., Inc. Univar USA Winfleld Solutions, LLC
IFB# 14-2696-DS P.D. Box 218 819 9th Street NE 3801 Corporex Park Drive, Ste 280 4034 Paul Buchman Hwy
Sod, Fertilizer, Herblcides and other related Aquatic Chemicals Palmetto, FL 33220 Ruskin, FL 33570 Tampa FL 33619 Plant City FL 33555
{Manatee County Firm} {Manatee County Firm} {Hlllsberough County Firm) {Hillsbarough County Firm)
[TEM ||DESCRIFTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER $1ZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY uM LINIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY um UNITPRICE || EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED GQTY Ui UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED GV 177 LINIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE|
- -
SODS ]
1 BAHIA S0OD
A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)
2. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 5,000 SF No Bid 6,000 SF s 0305 180000 5,000 SF No Bid 5,000 SF No Bid
b. COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF No Bid SF Na Bitk 800 SF No Bid 800 SF No Bid
. DELIVERED & INSTALLED [Pallet Sod] 4,000 SF No Bd 4,000 SF S 035[$ 140000 4,000 SF No Bid 4,000 SF No gid
=30 i === — —
B |5-9 PALLETS {2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND 5POT PLACED 5,600 5F No Bld 5,500 SF $ 025(%  1,400.00 5,600 SF No B 5,600 SF No Bid
A= -
b. DELIVERED: & INSTALLED (Pallet Sad) 7,600 SF No Bld 7,600 SE $ o030f% 228000 7,600 SF No Bid 7,600 SF No Bld
. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION {Paflet Sod) 1,800 SF No Bicl 1,800 SF 5 0335 594.00 1,800 5F No Bid 130 SF No Bid
€ |30-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 5F)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 4000 SF No Bid ao00f sk Bs 018)$ 720.00 Aooof  sF No Bid 4,000 SF No
b. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod} 8,000 SF No Bl 8,000 SF $ 020085  1,600.00 s000| SF No D 8,000 SF Ne Bid
L=t
. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sad) 12,500 SF No Bid 12,500 SF S 023)$  2,875.00 12,500 SF No Bid 12,500 sF No Bld
— =55k ==t =t =
p |25 PALLETS OR MORE {10,000 SF OR MORE}
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 225,000 SF No Bid 225,000 SF $ 019] 5  42,750.00 225,000 SF No Bid 225,000 SF No Bid
b. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION {Pallet Sod) 400,000 SF No Bid 400,000 SF 5 0195[ 5  78,000.00 400,000 5F No Bid 400,000 SF No Bid
Jz 8T. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM
A |1-4 PALLETS {400 SF - 1,999 5F)
2. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 7,600 SF No aid 7,600 SF § _040D) 3  3,040.00 7,600 SF No Bld 7500 SF Ne Bld
b. COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF No Bld 800 SF No Bid 800 SF Na Bld 800 SF No Bid
c. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 3200 _sF No Bid 3200] sF § 0453 144000 3,200 SF No Bid 3200 _SF No Bd |
d. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION [Pallet Sod) 250 SF No Bid 250 SF 5 o045l 11250 250 SF No Eid 250 SF No Bid
vl L. 2l =t = e e =
8 |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 2,500 SF No Bld 2,500 SF $ 035]% 875.00 2,500 SF No _Bid 2,500 SE No Bld
|b. DEUVERED & INSTALLED (Palict Sod} 4,800 SF No Bld 4,800 SF S 040035 19200 4,800 SF No Bld 4,800 SF No Bid
s —L — P !
k] 419 BERMUDA 50D
A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 500 SF No Bid 500 SF $ 032)% 160.00 500 SF Ne Bld 500 SF No Bid
b. COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF No Bid BOD SF Ho Bid 800 SF No Bld 800 SF No Bid
— - =
c. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) 1,600 SF No Bid 1,600 SF 5 0a37]ls 592.00 1,500 SF No Bid 1,600 5F No Bid
=R —_ ceLES B

IFB #14-2696-DS



BID TABULATION
TABULATION Southern Agricultural Insecticides Inc. Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co., Inc. Univar USA Winfield Solutions, LLC
IFBJ¥ 14-2696-DS P.O. Box 212 819 9th Street NE 3801 Corporex Park Drive, Ste 280 4094 Paul Buchman Hwy
Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides and other related Aquatic Chemicals Palmetto, FL 34220 Ruskin, FL 33570 Tampa FL 33619 Plant City FL 33565
{Manatee Coantty Firm} {Manatee County Firm) {Hillsborough County Firm) [Hitlsborough County Firm}
MEM | DESCRIPTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED CTY u/M UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRKE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED ciTY UM UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED FRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY um UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QT uim UNIT FRIE || EXFENDED PRICE]
d. ROLLED 50D- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 200 SF No Bld 008 _sE 3 04508 90.00 200 SF No Bid 200 SF No Bld
B |58 PALLETS (2,000 5F - 3,989 5F)
a. DEUVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod} 8,000 5F No Bid £,000 5F $ oao]s 3,200.00 £,800 SF No Bid 2,000 SF No Bid
b. ROLLED $OD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF No Bicl 4,000} SF S 040)$ 160000 4,000 SF No Bld 4,000 SF No Bid
c 10-24 PALLETS {4,000 SF - 9,599 5F)
a. DEUWERED & INSTALLED {Pallet $od) 120008 SF No Bid 2000 SF 3 o03s]% 456000 12,000 SF No Bld 12,000 SF No Bid
4,000 SF No Bid 4,000 SF 5 033]% 152000 4,000 SF No Bld 4,000 SF No Bid
22,000 SF No Bld 38,000 SE $ 035] 5 1330000 32,000 SF No Bid 38,000 SF No Bid
1,000 SF No Bld 1,000 SF s 035]$ 350.00 1,000 SF No Bid 1,000 SF Ko Bid
—D= =
STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR})
a. STAPLES [COUNTY SUPPLIED} 1 EA No Bid 1 EA $ oo|s 0.02 1 EA No Bid 1 EA No Bid
b. STAPLES {VENDOR SUPPLIED) 10,000 SF Ho Bid 10,000 SF $_Dosis 500.00 10,000 SF No Bld 10,000 SF Ho_ Bid
SEEDS & MULCH
u 'SEEDS (50 POUND BAGS)
a. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 400 BAG | % 13500 § 5400000 400 BAG Ne Bid 400 | BAG No Bit 400 ]  BaG No fid
L = =
b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 340 (annual BaG | 3 2473) § 540820 340 BAG No Bid 3| BAG No Bld 340 |  BAG Ne Bld
c. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEPT.} 3q0) Bac JS 3400 § 11,560.00 340]  pas No Bid 3a0| BAG No Bid 340]  BaG No Bld
d. BERMUDA SEED (HULLED} so0f Bas S 278.00 ) § 139,000.00 So0f  BAG No Bid 500 BAG No Bid seo | BAG Ne Bld
2 MULGH (2.0 cu it BAGS)
a. CELLULOSE MULCH({FOR HYDRO SEEDING), 60% PAPER, 40%
WOOD FIRER {50 LB BAIES) 300 | BAG No Bid 300 | BAG e Bid 300 | BAG Ne Bid 300 | BAG No Bid
TIZERS
16-2-16 FERTILIZER, w/ Slow Release Nitrogen {NO
u SUESTITUTIONS) 30,000 LB Mo Bid 30,000 LB No Bid 30,000 LB No Eid 30,000 LB Ne Bld
15-0-15 FERTILIZER W/ .67% RONSTAR AMD SLOW RELEASE
2 NITROGEN (RO SUBSTITUTIONS} 20,000 LB No Bid 20,000 LB No fird 20,000 LB No Bid 20,000 LB Ne Bid
ERBICIDES! ALGICIDES
1 VETERAN 720 25 GAL Rangestar 2 EA S 1a=.gg E 156.00 2 EA No Bid 2 EA No Bid 2 EA Mo Bld
|2 ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT GF GLYPHOSATE 2.5 GAL Range Pre 24 EA H 4550 )| §  1,082.00 24 EA No Bid Martins Eraser § 803281 24 EA 3 2906] 3 117744 24 EA
Max # 780571 {offering 1.67
Roundup Pro gal) priding
9 |rcuUNDUP PRO 2.5 GAL Coneentrate 200 EA 3 5225 || § 10,450.00 200 EA No Bid reflects size 200 EA, 5 7771l $ 15542.00 Raneer Pro 200 EA S 39.20| § 7.840.00
~3 S
0 2. WEEDAR 64 [AQUATIC LABEL} {NO SUBS) 2.5 GAL 15 EA No Bid 15 EA No Bld ; 15 EA Ne Bid 15 EA $ 3655)|§ 54825
b. WEEDAR 54 {AQUATIC LABEL} {(ND SUBS) 30 GAL 1% EA No Bid 10 EA, No Bid 10 EA No Bid 10 EA $ 4a2840f & 4,284.00
— e

IFB #14-2696-DS



BID TABULATION

TABULATION hern A cticides Inc. Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co., Inc. Unlvar USA Wirfleld Solutlons, LLC
IFB# 14-2696-DS P.O. Box 218 819 9th Street NE 3801 Corporex Park Drive, Ste 280 4094 Paul Buchman Hwy
Sod, Fertllizer, Herbicides and other related Aquatic Chemicals Palmatta, FL 34220 Ruskin, FL 33570 Tampa FL 33619 Plant City FL 33565
[Manates County Firm) {Manatee County Firm} {Hillshorough County Firm) [Hillshareugh County Firm}
HEM IDEscmp'noN / PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERNATE esTmaTeD Ty um UNITPRICE || EXTENDED PRICEY  ALTERNATE esTmatEDary | u/M UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED FRICE ALTERNATE EBSTIMATERATY | um UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE estMATED ATY | WM UNIFPRICE [{ EXTENDED PRICE
Rodeo Herb # 425070 10 EA $70.70 §707,00
Is a. RODEQ, AQUA CLEAR 2.58AL Roundup Custom 10 EA 3 5235 || § 52250 10 EA No Bld Aquaneat # 753659 10 EA $73.83 5738.30 10 EA $ spsofls  sos.oo
= = =t e
b. RODED, AGUA CLEAR {RETURNABLE CONTAINER) 30GAL Bounidis CustoT 70 EA_||$ 60000 5 4200000 L EA No Bld 70 [} Na Bid 70 EA $ 57450 [ $ 40,215.00
Is SONAR Q (ND SUBSITUTITIONS) 40 LB 30 EA No Bid 30 EA No Bld 30 EA Na Bid 3n EA 4 1,176.00 || 5 35,280.00
= —— EELUR LN A
H SONAR {A.5] {NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1GAL 5 GL No Bid 5 GL No Bld 5 GL No Bid 5 GL 51,94041 | §  9,702.05
g = = = == e
8 SILKEN, KINETIC 1Gal Capal [ 150 GL § 8138 || § 12.207.00 150 6L No Bid 150 GL No Bid Eimar 150 GL 5 3500) % 5,250.00
o = e = e soille deme |
| ] SENCOR 75 TURF {NQ SUBSTITUTIONS) 5B 4 EA $ 35465 §  1,458.50 q En No 8id 4 EA $ 37300 6§ 149200 4 EA $ 373400 $ 149360
A
10 MEC AMINE-D 2.5 GAL 20 EA E 68.75 || 5 75.00 20 EA No Bid 20 EA No Bid Strike 3 20 EA $ 5413)| % 108260
= = e
11 GARLON 4 {GENERICS ALLOWED) 25 GAL Element 4 12 A }}$  19s.25)|$  2343.00 12 EA No Bid Ultra & 787593 12 EA )| $ 20915 § 250980 Element 4 12 EA Il § 148475 § 178170
= =3 = ]
12 2. GARLON 3A {GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 GAL Element 400 EA 5 14085 || 4 56,260.00 400 EA No Bid 400 EA No Bld Element 3A 400 EA $ 133.475 [| § 53,390.00
— o X E—— e —
b. GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 20 GAL Elpment 20 EA 5 1687.80 | $ 33,756.00 20 EA No Bld 20 EA No Bid Element 34 20 EA 5 1,601.70 f{ $ 32,034.00
13 PLATEAU {NO SUBSTITUTIONS} 25 GAL 50 EA No Bid 50 EA Ne Bid 50 EA No Bid 50 EA No Bid
14 |MILESTONE {NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 GAL 50 EA No Bid L EA Ho Bid 50 EA No Bid_ 50 EA 5 749325 || § 37,466.25
ISOPROPYL AMINE SALT of IMAZAPYR 28,1% A, {active ingredient)
15 {GENERICS ALLOWED}) 2.5 GAL Polaris 25P 10 E& 5 18750 | 8 1875.00 10 EA HNo Bid 10 EA No Bid 10 EA No Bld
- S=i —— == = — —r—
|FUNGICIDES
Chipco Signature WDG
k! ALIETTE WDG (GENERICS ALLOWED} 5518 Fosetyl-ALSD 5 EA § 11633) 3 SBLSS 5 EA No Bid # 678563 5 EA $ 14619 § 73095 5 EA No Bld
INSECTICIDES
Acephate 97UP #
u ORTHENE 1LB Acephate 57 10 EA - 9,69 [l § 96,00 10 EA No Bid 807324 10 EA 5 973|l% 57.90 10 EA 5 720 5 72.00
Acephate 97UP #
788871
1 ORTHENE 1018 Acephate 57 10 EA 3 B7.50 | §  &75.00 10 EA Ko Bld 10 EA $ 9990 §  999.00 Bratket 10 EA S 7050) § 70500
| 7] a. AMDRO 1LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 118 10 LB 3 10581 § 10580 10 LB No Bld 10 LB 5§ 1236[| 5 12360 10 1] 5 12195 12190
=t L =ttt =SS = sasplle feted]
b, AMDRO 25LB {NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2518 | 20 EA $ 22450 §  4,430.00 ) EA No Bid 20 EA $ 22350 § 4470.00 oo EA $ 21775 (| 3 4,855.00
n Masterine 737 To0817 | [ Gl 20.95 $1194.00
a TALSTARE 1 GAL Bifin Upstar H a0 GL 5 290018 116000 40 Gl No Bid PRO # 754966 || 40 $42.02 || $1680.80 Talstar Select | a0 5L s sa52]ls a3e080
= e — e
ADJUVANTS & ADDITIVES
1 DEFOAMER 1 Quart 120 [s1) $ 6360 & 823.20 120 ar No Bid #772764 120 or S 614015 73680 Fast Break 120 ar $ 18as5[5 277400
Guffstream
2 LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER. 1GAL Surf-AC910 500 GL 5 11250 $  5,625.00 500 GL No Bld Big et ¥ £22003 500 GL 5 35.44( 5 17,720.00 Egah 500 GL 5  2985] % 14,925.00
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT [NO —
3 SUBSTITUTIONS] 1 Quart 2,000 ar No Bid 2,000 ar No Bid 2,000 ar No Bld 2,000 ar No Bid
) =2 s e =

IFB #14-2696-D8



BID TABULATION

TABULATION

hern Agricultural

Inc.

Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co., Inc. Unlvar USA Winfield Solutions, LLC
IFB# 14-2696-DS P.0. Box 218 819 th Street NE 3801 Corporex Park Drive, Ste 280 4094 Paul Buchman H
wy
Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides and other related Aquatic Chemicals Palmetto, FL 34220 Ruskin, FL 33570 Tampa FL 33619 Plant City FL 33585
{Manatee County Firm) {Manatee County Flrm}) {Hllisborough County Firm}) {Hillsborough County Firm)
ITEM ||DESCRIPTION; PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED Ty U/ UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY ufm UNITPAICE | EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY ufm UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QY L/ UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE]
4 OIL OF IMONENE [GENERICS ALLOWED) 1GAL CideNick 8 GA s 10248 15392 8 GA No Bid B GA No Bid 8 GA No Bid
SPRAY INDICATOR/MARKER DYE (BLUE) {GENERICS ALLOWED, 1 GAL Blue Dye 3 GA 5 37.00( 5 29600 8 GA No Bid B GA $ 4469] § 35752 Mystlc 2.5 gal 8 GA No Bid
== 2l s = = —_ = =
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Affidavit as to Local Business
Public Contracting and Envirenmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes

IFB #14-2696-DS



BID TABULATION IFB #14-26%6-DS

TABULATION AWARD SHEET Alligare LLC Dieter's Sod Service, Inc. Florida Irrigation Supply Ine. DBA FIS Outdoor Helena Chemical Company Red River Spacistties, Inc.
IFB# 14-2696-DS 13 N. 8th Street 2315 Zipperer Road 1740 Calumet Street P.0. Box 1758 1324 North Hearne Avenue, Suite 120
Sod, Fertllizer, Herbicides and other ralated Aquatic Chemicals Opalika, AL 36801 Bradenton, FL 33212 Clearwater, FL 33765 Dade City, FL33526-1758 { Office in Palmatto FL ) Shraveport, LA 71107
{Out of state firm) {Manates County Firm} {Pinellas Caunty Firm} [Pasco County Firm) {Out of state firm})
- EXYENDED
FEM JDESCRIPTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERMATE ESTIMATED TY uim UR(TPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE ALTERHATE ESTIMATED QTY UM UNIT PRICE | EXTENOED PRICE ALTERMATE ESTIMATED GTY UM UNIT FRICE EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED OTY u/m UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE| ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY ufta UNIT PRICE PRICE
1 BAHIA SOD {1 PALLET = 400 Squara Feet} {1 PALLET = 400 Square Feet)

A [1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND 5POT PLACED 6,000 SF $ _ox|s 1,620.00
b. COUNTY PICK UP 800 SE 3 _0a850¢ 156.00
c. GELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paitet Sad) 4,000 5F i - 2] 1,320.00

B 5-O PALLETS (2,000 5F - 3,999 5F)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 5,500 SF__§$ o025)s 100,00
b. DEUVERED & INSTALLED (Palist Sod) 7.500 SF s o2a)s 123,00
c. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION {Pallet Sod) 1,800 SE $§ D32R3 575.00

£ 16-24 PALLETS {4,000 SF - 9,999 5F)

3. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED _agal w Iy anls ases
b. DEUVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) R w i am]t
. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION {Pallet Sod) puu] w s

b 25 PALLETS DR MORE (19,000 SF OR MORE)

. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod)

Ih.SLOPEDElIVERV&INSTALLATIDN[PalletSud) i § amii

2 5T. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM {1 PALLET = 400 S¢juare Feet)

A 14 PALLETS (400 5F - 1,959 5F) :

SF 3 036]% 2,736.00

2. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 7,600

b. COUNTY PICK UP ) s ls nrells 208.60
. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) sl w e oir -
d, SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Paliet Sod) 2 i | 573 K |

B |58 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)
2. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED P o LT H
b. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sad} LS L_nsis L

s 418 BERMUDA 500 1 PALLET = 500 Sq. F1, § Roll = 30 5q. FT

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 5F - 1,959 5F)

. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED wml W Ji selli [y
|, COUNTY PIEK UP 800 = 1 amls 24 )

S cne il 2 ) . ——
d. ROLLED $OC- DELIVERED & INSTALLED iy = P amiE T3




BID TABULATION

TABULATION AWARD SHEET Alligare LLC Dieter’s Sod Service, inc. Florida rrigation Supply Inc. BBA FIS Cutdnor Helana Chemical Company Red Rivar Specialtias, Inc.
IFB# 14-2696-D5 13 N. 8th Strest 2315 Zipperer Road 1740 Calumet Straet P.O. Box 1758 1324 North Hearne Avenue, Suite 126
Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides and other relsted Aguatic Chemicals Cpelika, AL 36801 Bradenton, FL 34212 Clearwater, FL 33765 " Dade City, FL 33526-1758 { Office in Palmetto FL) Shreveport, LA 71107
(Out of state firm) {Manatee County Firm} {Pineilas Courty Firm} (Pasco County Firm| {Out of state firm)
EXTENDED
ITEM IDESCRIPTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED CTY: UM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QT¥ (U] UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED OTY Ui UNIT PRICE EXTENOED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY UM UNITPRICE JEXTENDED PRICE] ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY UM UNIT PRICE PRICE
e L. = —_
B |59 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 5F)
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) ian) o £ G R
b. ACLLED SOD- DELIVERED & JNSTALLED w13 i
€ |10-24 PALLETS (4,000 5F - 9,999 5F)
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) m A Ll A
diem ) b § kil
_—— —
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) Momy W 1%
|b. ROLLED SOD- DEIVERED & INSTALLED we) Wi s
4 STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)
1)
A L A
I, STAPLES {VENDOR SUPPLIEC) ] ‘=i (L[t
|SEEDS & MULCH
1 SEEDS (50 POUND BAGS)
2. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 400 BAG 5 142528 || § 57.011200
b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 340 BAG £ 32483 § 10992220
c. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEFT.) 340 BAG 3 32183 [[§ 10942220
d. BERMUDA SEED (HULLED) 500 BAG 5 313783 | § 15689650
e
2 MULCH (2.0 cu ft BAGS)
a. CELLULOSE MULCH{FOR HYDRO SEEDING), 60% PAPER, 40%
WOOD FIBER (50 LB 300 BAG ) 10965 || $  3,289.500
FERFILIZERS
16-2-16 FERTILIZER, w/ Slow Release Nitrogen (NO 30000 $22.516/501h
1 SUBSTITUTIONS) [50# bags| LB bag $1£3,509.60
15-0-15 FERTILIZER W/ .67% RONSTAR AND SLOW HELEASE 20000 $29.8165/ 50
Iz NITROGEN (NQ SUBSTITUTIONS) (50% bags) LB Ib $ 1192640
HERBICIDES/ ALGICIDES
Rangemaster 2.5/
u VETERAN 720 2.5 GAL gallon container 2 EA [ 23.05 )| § 166.10 2 EA 3 sa3sfls  1ea7s 2 EA $  o1e2l[s  1m32a
g 1
| ISOPRGPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHDSATE AT A 2] s i = 24 EA E 4787 | § 1,148.88 Range Pro i 24 Ee 362578  870.00 Alecto 415 24 EA § 40,00 $ _ 950.00
Bisgarn i
Glyphanals i Isopropylamine Sakt of
a ROUNDUP FRO 2.5GAL izi= 200 A $ 3s2s)(§ 728000 Eivphazats 8 5 galian) 200 EA H 4737 | § 957400 Bangs Prg 200 EA $ 453818 937600 Alactesis 200 ER $_ 4000)¢ 300000
4 a. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) {NC SUBS) 25GAL ] (2] ¥ awE] 1 [ 15 EA $ 4613|l8  sg19s
b, WEEDAR 64 [AGUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 30GAL 10 EA $ snsoll$ saiso0

IFB #14-2696-DS



BID TABULATION

IFB #14-2696-DS

TABULATION AWARD SHEET Alligare LLC Dieter's Sod Service, Inc. Florida Irrigation Supply Inc. DBA FIS Outdoor Helena Chemical Company Red River Spedalties, Inc.
1FB# 14-2696-DS 13 N. 8th Strast 2315 Zipperer Road 1740 Calumat Street P.0. Box 1758 1324 North Heame Avenue, Sulte 120
Sod, Fertifizer, Harbicides and other related Aquatic Chemical Opelika, AL 36801 Bradenton, FL 34212 Clearwater, FL 33765 Dade City, FL 33526-1753 ( Office in Palmstto FL) Shreveport, LA 71107
{Out of state firm) {Manatee County Firm} {pinellas County Firm) {Pusco County Firm| {Out of state firm}
EXTENDED
ITEM DESCNP‘HDM PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED GTY| UM URIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED OTY UM UNITPRICE | EXTENDZED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMAYED OTY Ui UNITFRICE EXTENDEL: PRKE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY UM UNITPRICE JEXTENDED PRICEl  ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY U/M UNIT PRICE PRICE
Alligare
Glyphosate
5 2. RODED, AQUA CLEAR 2.5 GAL 5.4 1t EA 43 5 430.00 10 EA 5 65.67f 5 656,70 i i = 1 EA $  s170)|§ 51700
|b. RODEO, AQUA ELEAR (RETURMABLE CONTAINER] 30.GAL 70 EA H 63695 il i 3 ssesnld e 0 EA $ 603.60( 4 4225200
30 ea 40 LB container
foffered In 8 [lrpouied  Ea|  $96577
LB i Py {non h
tl SONAR O {NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 4018 only) quoted) no substitutions)
5
{offered In
1 AT contalner| 6L none
? SONAR [A.5) (MO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1GAL - : _ 5 6L No Bid only) 3] 810477 052,385 . [0 oo |
Ehg o f L Cays
B SILKEN, KINETIC I r —— - . o .- 11 ViR TR | 150 ﬂ' 8 79988 || 5 11,998.200 I 65.80 || & 92.011 Bl Pl yd 12 GL 5 4058 || §  6,087.00
] SENCOR 75 TURF (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 518 4 EA S 401072 Ea_l14 33as0l[$ 133eoc
24 Lamme
10 MEC AMINE-D 2.5 GAL {2.5 Gallan container) 20 EA 5 4623 & 904.60 st 0 EA s ea75l8 177s.00
- e SR
Alligare
Triclopyr :
11 GARLOM 4 {GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 GAL 4EC 12 EA f% 16383 394.16 12 EA ] H705($ 260460 e 4 uy b Element 4 12 B |s 1ss.80 1,605.60
Alligore = = — g ———
Triclopyr
12 5. GARLOW 3A {GENERICS ALLOWED} 2.5GAL asL 400 EA $ 91083 asdz200 400 EA § 192444 || & 76.977.600 Element 3 A 400 EA $ 11688 || § 4575200
= P e
Alligare
Triclopyr
b, GARLON 34 {GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL asl 20 EA $ 1081803 2163600 ’io EA s 2561000 5 5122000 0 EA $ 1,395.00
W 50
o ol somes In 5 Gall
Ll = . ¥ rontakver- cost|
s PLATEAU [NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 25GAL w ) s a0y | s0] Ea Mls asasz s 2545 gal) EA §§ 50300 5 3sma500
14 MILESTONE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 GAL 50 EA $ 858333 | & 42 916,650 - [ ] Jensy | = 50 EA § 77250 jj § 38,625.00
Al : Zhe
Alligara
\SDPROPYL AMINE SALT of IMAZAFYR 28.1% A.l, (active Ingredient} Ecomazapyr Nufarm Polaris 2 . . el
15 {GENERICS ALLOWED} 2.5 GAL 25l 10 En_ {3 wmeoe]s 189.40 (2.5 Gallon container) 10 EA 3 156000 5 156000 Arsenal 10 EA % 15643 [|$  1,561.30 J|Arsenal Herblide| w
| 1 1 | | =l I ; | |
5.5 18 eontalner} 5 EA H 77430 & 38715 Alliette WDG 5 EA 5 13365[ S 66825
Acephate 90
il [ORTHENE 1L8 (1 LE container) 10 EA 3 10,00 100.00 | Acephate 97 UP 10 EA 3 B8.90| 5 83,00
d ORTHENE 1018 1 . 10 EA 4 8100(5 81000
2 2. AMDRG 1LB (NQ SUBSTITUTIONS) 118 " i m
& ]
b. AMDRO 2518 (NO SUBSTITUTIDNS) 2518 20 EA H 257813 551560 = =
i i Aiiprrerm 13 i
| &l TALSTAR F 1GAL |1 Galir pretaner 4D GL ] 2878 131980 Bifin YT 40 G iz arssfle p114e0 Bifin |fT " a0 6L $§ 330l $ 13200
ADJUVANTS & ADDITIVES -
f T E - . - =
3 : Foambuster required as
Aligare | i o llil] - § lonlyofferedin 1 ans ar
4 |DEFOAMER 1 Quart Anti-Foamer 120 ar s 45219 § 54240 — - — - — pint container) 120 {pint}) {5 6.35 762.00 120 ar 3 82815 993.60
2 LOVELAND %-77 SPREADER 16AL 500 &L $ worls  epsen | Wl ‘wm] a i daf Ellie el soof o s sosels sezocn
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTVGHT {NO
d |SUBSTITUTIONS) 1Quert 2 i
i
Alligare Trace || Ode Kk
CIL OF LIMONENE (GENERICS ALLOWED) 1 GAL 21/2gallon ] GA § 126503 10120 [1 Gallon contalner) ] GA $ 197331 5 ¢ A w—t" d Ltk & GA § 21170% 16935
el
Alligare Super “. | Rt 1
Is |SPRAY INDICATOR/MARKER, DYE [BLUE) {GENERICS ALLOWED] 1GAL Marker Dye afl Ga Qs 2sasfls 227m0 ] <Y H] 3ze0)$ 270.40 J5pec Spray Indlcator B oa fs 1es5]ls 1zac0f B8 8 6l w3 nujs
PRIMARY VENDOR
I <:con:sv vENDoR




BID TABULATION
TABULATION AWARD SHEET Southarn Agricultural Insecticides Inc. Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co., Inc. Univar USA Winfiekd Solutions, LLC
IFB# 14-26596-DS P.0. Box 218 $19 9th Street NE 3801 Corparex Park Drive, Ste 280 4094 Paul Buchman Hwy
Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides and other related Aguatic Chemicals Palmetta, FL 34220 Ruskin, FL 33570 Tampa FL 33619 Plant City FL 33565
{Manatee County Firm) {Manatee County Firm) {Hlllsborough County Firm} (Milsborough County Firm}
EXTENDED
ITEM BDESCRIPTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER S1IZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED O ufmM UNITPRICE || EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QY upa URITPRICE || FXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QTY WM UNIT PAICE || EXTENDED PRICE| ALTERNATE ESTIMATED Q7Y ufp UNIT PRICE PRICE
S0DS _ :
1 BAHIA SOD {1 PALLET = 400 Square Feet) (1 PALLET = 400 Square Feet}

A 1-4 PALLETS {400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a, DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED E w i ‘=

o, COUNTY PICK UP

. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pabet Sad) £ ¥ :_=umjr cema
B 5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,959 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED ‘= i

b. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod} 5 G Ry 1)

<. SLOPE DELIVERY B [NSTALLATION {Pallet Sed) =
€ 10-24 PALLETS {4,000 5F - 9,999 5F)

a. DELIVERED AND SPQT PLACED 4,000 5F $ _oxajfs 720.00

Jb; DEUVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) ,000 SF 3 _o20|$ 160000

c. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Fallet Sod) 12,500 SF 5_023)% 2,875.00

D 25 PALLETS OR MORE {10,000 SF OR MORE)

& DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod}

225,000 SF $ oa9fi3 4275000

400,000 SF $ DISS|lS  Taosono

Ib. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION {Pallet Sod)

2 ST, AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM {1 PALLET = 400 Square Feet)
A |1-8 PALLETS (400 5F - 1,398 5F)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED L L] : L P T
b. COUNTY PICK UP
¢ DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) 3,200 SF S owasls 1,440.00
d. SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATICN (Pallet Sod} 250 SF 3 o4s || 8 112:50
B 5-9 PALLETS {2,000 SF - 1,999 SF)
3. DELIVERED AND 5POT PLACED 2,500 SF S o35S 875.00
b DELIVERED & MSTALLED (Patiet Sorl) 4800/ s {3 odolis 193000
-3 419 BERMUDA SOD 1 PALLET = 400 5q Ft, 1 Roll =300 Sq FT
A |1-4PALLETS {400 5% - 1,999 5F)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED soofl sr (3 om:zfs 160,00
b. COUNTY PICK LP
. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod) 1600) s[5 ear)s 592.00
d. ROLLED S00- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 200l sF s oashs 20,00

IFB #14-2696-05



BID TABULATION

TABULATION AWARD SHEET

Inc.

Sl Sod & Grasding (s, ino

hubear riA

Wiifimld Selile—", LT

IFB# 14-2656-D5

Sad, Fertilizer, des and other related Aquatic Ct

P.O. Box 218

Palmetto, FL 34220
[Manatee County Firm)

Wid fivh Siemet Wi

Ruskin, FL 33570

| Wl rerni Cuipinty Firm|

and £orpeerws Park Demee., B1e TR

Tampa FL 33619

[Millsbistiigh Comnty § =)

AL Taiil Bachmss Her

Phaint City FL 33565
| aifuieruugh Comby Firm)

TEM |DBCR[PTI0N,‘I PRODLICT NAME

ALTERMATE

ESTIMATED QTY

uw

LNIT PRICE

EXTERDED I'T77 !

B TEARRTL

PR Rt

i

B TEARATT P T Y i il e CEERELL FEL

i tERRE]

TR
sy

5-9 PALLETS {2,000 SF - 3,999 5F)

CONTAINER SEZE
—

s, DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

5,200.00

b, ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

]

L BN

10-24 PALLETS 3,000 SF - 8,999 SF)

3. DELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pellet Sod)

1 22,000

S

.
b=
i
=

& 3600

D

4

1B ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED:

II:. ROLLED 500- DEH!EEEE gmﬂgm

4,002

LR

25 PALLETS OR MORE (10.000 5F OR MORE

a. GELIVERED & INSTALLED {Pallet Sod}

44,250

13,0000

£

35850

STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)

SEEDS &

§ _am

ot )

300,80

& MULCH

[SEEDS (S0 POUND BAGS)

9. PENSACOLA BAHLA SEED

13500

b. RYE GRASS (OCT THAU MARCH)

340 (annual

c. BROWN TOP MILLET {APRIL THRU SEPT.}

| _BAG |[§

E]

24.73

d. BERMUIDA SEED (HULLED]

$

278.00

34.00
=

§ 5400000

§ 8400

$ 1156000

§ 139,000 (K

|FERTILIZERS

16-2-16 FERTILIZER, w Stow Release Nitrogen {NO

Ly

TUTIONS)

15-0-15 FERTILZER W/ .67% RONSTAR AND SLOW RELEASE
2 NITROGEN (NO SUBSTITUTIONS|

J|HERBICIDES! ALGICIDES

VETERAN 720

Rangestar

[ 13

3 aseo

ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE

Range Pro

24

$ 1omce

Waarii Eraser 8 BESEED M A auoa g LIrtda

ROUNDUP PRO

2.5 GAL

a, WEEDAR 64 {AGUATIC LABEL) {NO SUBS)

2.5GAL

b, WEEDAR 64 [AQUATIC LABEL] (NO SUBS)

30 GAL

Roundup Pro
Tt lapin

$

4 1045000

efien B FHTE T Y

will

LAT
#iamg
PHfeEr RIIE ) TA d TRTIgN INARIDO

sl ea |5 sess

4 4140

$ 54825

5__4,284.00

IFB #14-2698-DS



BID TABULATION
TABULATION AWARD SHEET rehem Agricultural Insecticides Inc. Sunbeh Sod & Grading Co,, Ine. Unvar Usa, Winfield Solutlons, LLC
IFBi# 14-2695-DS P.0. Box 218 819 9th Strest NE 3801 Corporex Perk Drive, Ste 280 4094 Paul Buchman Hwy
Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides and other related Aquatic Chemicals Paimstto, FL 34220 Ruzkin, FL 33570 Tampa FL 33619 Plant City FL 33565
{Manatee County Flrm) {Manztee County Firm) {Hillsborough County Finm) {HHIsborough County Firm}
EXTENDED
ITEM _|DESCRIPTION/ PRODUCT NAME CONTAINER SIZE ALTERNATE ESTIMATED QY um UNIT PRICE || EXTENDEL: PRICE! ALTERNATE ESTIMATED GTY UM UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE ESTIMAT ED gy 17,73 UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE| ALTERMATE ESTIMATED &TY ujM UNIT PRICE PRICE
Rodea Herb & 425070 0 EA $70.70 $707.00
6 2. RODEG, AQUA CLEAR 2.5GAL Roundup Custom 10 EA $ 522503 s2250 Aquaneat # Y5365% 10 EA §73.83 $732.30 10 EA $ 50500% 50500
b. RODED, AQUA CLEAR (RETURNABLE CONTAINER) 30 GAL 0 EA § 600005 . ] T i sl A
s SONAR @ (NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 4018 30 En l$117500 8 3528000
7 SOMAR {4.5] (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1GAL 5 GL $19sa1 0 8 9.702.05
8 SILKEN, KINETIC & Canak ol 6L St 150 6L [|§ 3s00($ 525000
o SENCOR 75 TURF [NO SUBSTITUTIONS] 5LB ) w4k 4 EA_J§§ 373000 % 149200 4 EA $ 37340 5 1,493.60
0 MEC AMINE-D 2.5 GAL 20 EA $ 867511 S 137500 i -] 'E _l_ﬂ _L_E
11 GARLON 4 [GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 GAL Element 4 12 En 5 1s52sflg 234300 Uttrn # 767593 12 EA_N$ 20915§ $ 2,509.80 Element 4 12 EA § 14BA7S 781.70
12 . GARLON 3A [(GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 GAL Element 400 EA $ 140.65 55,260.00 Element 3A 00 EA 4 133,475 § 53,390.00
b, GARLON 34 {GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL Element 20 EA 5 168780 5 23375600 Elgreant 34 20 EA $ 160170 3 .00
12 [PLATEAU {NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5GAL
14 MELESTONE {NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 GAL 50 €h || § 7a9325 () § 37,466.25
ISOPROPYL AMINE SALT of IMAZAPYR 26.1% AJ. {sctive ingradiant)
45 I ALLOWED} 2.5 GAL Polarls 25P 10 EA s 18750 8 1,875.0
bt
[FUNGICIDES
f 1 H Chipco Slgnature WOG # || H “ ||
il IALIETTE WDG [GENERICS ALLOWED} 5518 —'w- — _— 678563 5 EA $ 146.19 |8 73095
|INSECTICIDES :
Acephate S7UP &
1 |ORTHENE 1B Acephate 97 10 EA 3 969 ) § 96.90 807324 10 EA $ oM s 97.50 10 E4 H 20| 5 T200
Avephate 97UP #
4 ORTHEME 101 acephate 97 10 EA H 87501 5 #75.00 720821 10 EA 10 EA § 7050035  705.00
2 5. AMDRO 118 {NO SUBSTITUTIONS} 118 10 8 $ 58l s 10580 1 LB $ nigjls 219
= s
b. AMDRO 258 {NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 251D 20 EA $§ 224500 4% asgnnn 0 EA_ [ § 22350 $ AUTIS| S 435500
= = 3 I iasicimie 7.5 /5ol 40 6L 29.95 n
) PRO# 754966 40 $42.02
E TA_I_"»‘TAIl F 1GAL Bifin Upstar & g-.] A1 TalstarSelect a0 Gl 5  3452| & 1,380.80
ADJUVANTS & ADDITIVES
1 1Quar ol or fis (2] E 5] #772764 120 ar |53 614 1895 ) §  2,274.00
LOVELAND %-77 SPREADER 1GAL Seerf-ALHAL 500 6L $ 1125[1$ 562500 iy e 23055 500 GL__§§ 3544 29.85 | § 14,925.00
PROMIATE ACEURALY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT {NO
F‘ SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 Quart
4 OIL OF LIMONENE {GENERICS ALLOWED) 16AL Cldekk 8 [T ] 192418 15392
5 SPRAY INDICATOR/MARKER OYE {BLUE) [GENERICS ALLDWED] 1GAL Blue Dye ] GA 3 37.00f§ § 296.00 8 GA § 44E3H8 35752 Mystic 2.5 gal
I__ [SPRAY INDICATOR/MARKER DYE (BLUE) (GENERICS ALLOWED) S =t = ARl

PRIMARY VENDOR
SECONDARY VENDOR

IFB #14-2696-DS
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