MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

LY
Southwest Water MC \
Reclamation Facility
SUBJECT  pchabilitation Main Plant and DATE POSTED gg L0z O
Belt Filter Press Drain Station
PURCHASING . DATE CONTRACT
REPRESENTATIVE Cl9a Vaicich, Ext 3055 SHALL BE AWARDED
. CONSEQUENCES IF
DEPARTMENT Public Works Department DEFERRED /C
N/
AUTHORIZED BY MelissaW
SOLICITATION IFB #14-1713-OV DATE October 2014

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Notice of Intent to Award Invitation for Bid #14-1713-0V, Southwest Water Reclamation Facility, Rehabilitation Main
Plant and Belt Filter Press Drain Station to the lowest, responsive and responsible bidder, CEC Motor and Utility
Services, LLC, 1751 12" Street East, Palmetto, FL 34221, for a Grand Total amount of $457,532.79 (Bid “A”) and a
completion time of 180 calendar days.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY
Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resclutions, policy.

Manatee County Code of Laws

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION
This project consists of the rehabilitation of the existing main plant and belt filter press drain stations, which consists
of, but not limited to, by-pass pumping, replacement of discharge piping, fittings, valves, swing valves, guide rails,
pipe bracing, base ells, mounting plates, wet well cleaning, and/or control panel replacement. Individual plans for
the rehabilitation requirements at each drain station were made a part of the Bid package.

Successful Contractor shall furnish and install all materials, equipment and labor required to perform this project in
accordance with the specifications and plans provided with the Invitation for Bid.

Appropriate Bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availabilty was advertised on mymanatee.org,
DemandStar and the Manatee Chamber of Commerce.

Four (4) bids were received: (Bids are listed in ascending order)

Manatee County BID “A” {180 Calendar Days) BID “B” {120 Calendar Days)
CEC Motor and LHtility Services, LL.C
Palmetto, FL $457.532.79 NO BID
Pasco County
RTD Construction
Zephyrhills, FL $495,702.35 $496,989.35
Manatee County
TLC Diversified, Inc., Palmetto, FL $480,800.10 NO BID
Polk County
Vogel Bros. Bldg., Co., Lakeland, FL $646,624.02 $646,525.00

ATTACHMENTS: * g:ggrr:]’:‘nfa’:daﬁon FUNDING SOURCE .

{List in order as attached) e tabulation {Acct Number & Name) E:?g: Verified, Utility
AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING
Sl % 457,552.78 COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact "




INTENT TO AWARD (continued) Page 2

Statement)

IFB#14-1713-0OV, Southwest Water Reclamation Facility (SWWRF), Southwest Water Reclamation
Southwest Water Reclamation Facility Rehabilitation Main Plant and Belt Filter Press Drain Station

Page 2

On October 23, 2014, a memorandum from Project Management Division was received recommending award to
CEC Motor and Utility Services, LLC, the lowest, responsive and responsible bidder for a Grand Total award of
$457,532.79, with a completion time of 180 calendar days (Bid “A”).

S:\Olga Valcich\PublicWorks.Proj.Mgmt\IFB.FY.2014\IFB#14-1713-OV.SWWRF.MAIN.PL.BELT.FIL.PR.DRAIN.STA\Intent to
Award. 10.24.2014.#14-1713-0V..docx




To: Melissa M. Wendel, CPPO, Purchasing Official * = ,g.

From: Jeff Streitmatter lll, P. E., Project Management -  FManatee
Division Manager \ -~

Date: October 20, 2014

Subject: SWWRF - Main Plant & Belt Filter Press
Drain Station Rehabilitation
Project #'s: 5128183 & 5128184
CEC Motor and Utility Services, Inc.
Recommendation for Award - IFB # 14-1713-0V

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation form
is attached for your review. it is recommended that the contract Bid "A”, with a construction time
of 180 Calendar Days be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, CEC Motor and
Utitity Services, LLC in the amount of $457,532.79 and in accordance with the terms and
conditions of the bid package. Upon completion of project award, please provide a copy of the
purchase order assigned to the contractor. The funding source for this contract is Utility Rates.

Please contact Brian P. Bates, P.E., Project Manager if you have any questions regarding the
attached documents.

Thank you for your continued assistance.

JS/bb Gn

cc: Mike Gore, Director, Utilities
Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works
Sia Mollanazar, P.E., Deputy Director, Engineering Services
Brian P. Bates, P.E., Project Manager
Prony Bonnaire Fils, Engineering Specialist ll, w/attachments
Project File: 5128183 & 5128184 9.2

IHstrict 1



IFB # 14-1713-0V
SWWRF - MAIN PLANT AND BELT FILTER PRESS DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

BIDS RECEIVED FROM: BID “A" 180 CALENDAR DAYS  BID "B" 120 CALENDAR DAYS
1 CECMOTOR AND UTILITY SERVICES $457,532.79 NO BID
2 RTD CONSTRUCTION, INC. $495,702.35 5496,989.35
3 TLC DIVERSIFIED, INC. $480,800.10 NOQ BiD
4 VOGEL BROS. BUILDING CO. $646,624.02 $646,525.00

PAGE 1 5/23/2014



IFB #14-1713-0V
WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128183
SWWRF BELT FILTER PRESS DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

BID "A" - BASED ON 180 CALENDAR DAYS

1 L 3
BID "A" CEC Motor and Uthilty Services|  RTD Construction, Inc. TLC Diversified, Inc. Vogel Bros. Bullding Co.
1751 12th St E, Palmetto, FL 85344 9th Streat 2716 17th Street East 2720 Drane Fiokd Roed
180 CALENDAR DAYS 34221 Zephyrhilis, FL 33542 Paimettn, FL 34221 Lakeland, FL 33811
Tiem Unit Extonded UnRt Bxianded Unit Extanded | OUnt | Extended |
L] um ) o 1 Price Price Pricg Prigg Brigs Prico Prics Prico
1 [Wetwell Cleaning SF | 605 $4.50 $2.722.50 $6.00 $3,830.00 $6.00 $3,630.00 $13.08 $7.919.45
2 [ o HOPE Piping LE | e $15.85 $1,070.95 $36.00 $2,484.00 $91.00 $6,278.00 $104.46 $7,207.74
3 |8" HOPE Flange Adapters wiBackup Ring EA] 6 $200.00 $1.20000 |  $580.00 s34e000|  $830.00 $4980.00|  $480.40 $2,762.40
4 |o" HDPE Fittings e | 120 $41.25 $4950.00| 1620 $194400]  $13.00 $1,560.00 $27.80 $3,336.00
5 [Pump Base Etls, BPIL1S eal 3 $715.00 $2205.00| $740.00 $222000( $2,500.00 s750000|  $m.10 $2,373.30
[ —1_..5-. Basza Ell Mounting Plate EA 3 $520.00 $1,560.00 $640.00 $1,920.00 $870.00 $2,610.00 $566.63 $1,700.49
7 —m.m. Pipe Bracing, 10 Fi. Dia. EA 2 $1,750.00 $3,500.00 | $1,850.00 $3,700.00 | $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,355.95 $4,711.90
8 _»._ 8.5. Pump Guide Rall Systam LF | a5 $95.00 $4,275.00 $90.00 $4,050.00|  $100.00 $4,500.00 $127.74 $5,748.30
8 [Resitient (Link) Seals wiCarrier Pipe Eal ¢ $150.00 ss00.00 |  $550.00 s330000]  $s0000 $3,000.00 $473.92 $2,543.52
10 __.%n: Ex. Liner, (Excl. Bid ltema § & 11} sF | 20 $75.00 $1,500.00| $1%0.00 $3,80000]  $230.00 $4,600.00 $63.90 $1,278.00
11 |Remave & Repiace Ex. PVC Drain Line & P-Trap EA | 1 $75.00 $75.00} $1,160.00 s1,16000 | $1,700.00 $1,70000| $1,965.14 $1,965.14
12 _n- Flanged Plug Valve EA 3 $4,910.00 $14,730.00 $960.00 $2,940.00| $1,000.00 $3,000,00 $1,933.95 $5,801.85
13 T.. Flanged Swing Check Valve EA <] £5,008.00 $15,024.00 | $2,760.00 $8,28D.00| $3,000.00 $9,000.00 3542265 $16,267.95
14 [INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
18 [Puctile ran Fittings 18 [ 225 $8.00 $1,60000] 500 s1,12500]  s17.00 s382500|  stan $3.197.25
16 —_—q._,mz._.-oz.:_._..\ LEFT BLANK
7 _-.. Mals Aluminum Quick Coupler Adapiar EA | 1 $1,000.00 $1,00000  $670.00 $670.00 | $1,200.00 $1,200.00 | $1,203.45 $1,203.45
18 [5.5. Adjustable Valva Supparis ea| s $185.00 $555.00]  $560.00 $1,68000 |  $400.00 s1a0000]  $215.4 $645.42
19 _8.. Gate Valve, M Ea | 1 $1,636.00 $1.636.00] $2,430.00 $2,430.00 | $1,600.00 $1,60000 | $1.874.10 $1,874.10
20 [" Leas infiuent Line Plug ea] 2 $300.00 550000 |  $490.00 saa0.00|  $600.00 st20000| srarse $1,482.76
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IFB #14-1713-0V
WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128183
SWWRF BELT FILTER PRESS DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

BID "A” - BASED ON 180 CALENDAR DAYS

1 ‘ 2 3 —3
BID "A" CEC Motor and Utility Services|  RTD Construction, inc. TLG Diversified, Inc. Vogel Bros. Bullding Ca.
1751 12th St E, Palmetio, FL 5344 8th Strast 2119 17th Streat-East 2720 Drans Flald Rond
180 CALENDAR DAYS 34221 Zaphyrhills, FL 33542 Paimatio, FL 34221 Lakeland, FL 33811
Tom Unk Exiendad Unit Extonded Unkt “Exianded Dnit Extended
No. | Line item um | oty | pricg | Prica Prige Price —rrice Price Erice Price
21 J12" Inflyent Line Plug EA 1 $500.00 $500.00 $960.00 $960.00 $375.00 $375.00 $861.97 $861.97
22 |vENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK _
23 [6y-Pass Purping s ] 1 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 | $25,680.00 $25,680,00 | $18,000.00 s19,000.00 | ss2.828.40 |  $52,628.40
24 Tn.:eg_. By-Pess Pumip Operatar LS 1 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 | $£8,200.00 $6,40000 ¢ $3,900.00 $3,800,00 | $33,266.08 $33,266.08
25 |Remove & Ropiace Fused Safety Switch (Disconnect) Ea | & | s210000 $3,400.00 $1,810.00 §7.24000| $2,500.00 $10,000.00 )  $1,776.89 $7,115.56
26 [INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
oy -u-:nc_. = Sch 80, PYC Electrical Condeit (2" min){Addandum LF 50 $53.00 $2,650.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $45.00 $2.250.00 $29.65 $1,492.50
26 [Remova & Reploce Electrical Mounting Siruciure eaf 1 $3,71200 s371200| $3,140.00 $3,140.00| $1,800.00 $1,800.00 | $3,557.78 $3,557.79
28 [Install New Float Swiches e ] e $76.00 $456.00|  $210.00 s128000) 7000 $a2000( 15672 $940.32
30 |Pumps, Hydromatic S6L2000M4-4, 20 HP, 1750 APM ea | 3 | s1334000 $40,020.00 | $22,610.00 $67,830.00 | $16,000.00 s4oc0.00| $1545573(  $46,367.19
T e e s ev | 2 $275.00 ssso.on|  so10.00 s1,820.00 | $2,000.00 $4,00000 | $1,574.87 $3,140.74
32 |Mew Concrete Wet Wel Flaor, 4,000 psl, Type Il, with Reint. | cv | 3 $350.00 s1.05000] s810.00 s2,73000 | $1,600.00 $4,800.00 | $1,104.57 $3.313.1
21 [Brick & Mortor Valve Supports, Max 6" High v 3 $32.00 sos.00| s520.00 $1,565000]  $285.00 sasso0|  $242.97 $726.99
[sueToraL consTrucTioN cosT $128,946.35 $172,913.00 $157,884.00 $225,731.19
42 [Mabilization s | 1 $6,100.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $22,779.86
43 |Miscallaneous Work & Cleanup s |1 $32,000.00 $156,360,00 $16,300.00 $17,886.01
44 |Record Drawings TIE $1,200.00 $6020.00 $700.00 $592.95
%Nw%h»%éwmwﬂuﬂ_u Ny T o e e $160,246.35 $196,593.00 $190,384.00 $267,000.02
a5 omea..m__ne_._au.:a. Work (Used anly with County} , 1 .4 $16,924.64 $19,659.90 $19,038.40 $26,700.00
TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST - BID A $186,170.99 $216,252.30 $209,422.40 $203,700.02

THEMATIGAL ERRORS OF THE INVITATION TO BID

9231014



BID TABULATION
FOR
IFB #14-1713-0V

WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128183
SWWRF BELT FILTER PRESS DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

m-u ->=
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 180 CALENDAR DAYS

PREPARED BY: A= Aaci
(Project Management)  Brian P. Bates, P.E., Project Manager Date
REVIEWED BY: g soflif o
(Project Engineer) J. Shea Shoun, P.E., Project Engineer Dafe
APPROVED BY: / \ \& s @ Y
(Purchasing) Olga Valgjth, Contract Specialist D

PAGE 3 9/2372014



PAGE 3

IFB #14-1713-0V
WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128184

SWWRF Maln Plant Draln Statlon Rehabilitation

BID "A" - BASED ON 180 CALENDAR DAYS

1 N 3 ]
BID "A" CEC Motor and Utllty Sarvices | RTD Canstruction, inc. TLC Diverstfisd, nc. Vogel Sros. Bullding Co.
1751 12th St E, Palmetto, FL 5344 8th Streat 2719 17th Strwst Enst 2720 Drane Floid Road
180 CALENDAR DAYS 34221 Zaphyrhills, FL 33542 Palmetto, FL 34221 Lokeland, Ft 33811
Tt ‘ Gnit | Extended Unit Extandad Unit Extended | Uit | Extondad
No. | Line item um | aty Price Prige Pricg Prics —Frige Pice 1 Price |  Price
1 [Wetwel Cleaning sr | &5 $4.50 $2,722.50 $6.00 $3,630.00 $6.00 $3,630.00 $12.71|  $7,669.55
2 o DR-11 HOPE Piping lF | & $1565 $692.05 $19.00 $1,083.00 $31.00 $1,767.00 sa324| 160468
3 ___.. HDPE Flange Adapters w/Backup Ring EA | & $200.00 $1,200.00 $550.00 $3480.00 $700.00 $4,200,00 $42624 |  $2,557.44
4 —u.. HDPE Filtings Le 120 $41.25 $4,950.00 $16.20 $1,944.00 $13.00 %$1,560.00 $27.07 $3,240.40
5 |pump Base Ells BPIUL16 EAl 2 $1,220.00 $3,660.00|  $1,180.00 $3,640.00] $3,000.00 sp00000| $1,26762| $3,779.45
6 [Pump Base Ell Mounting Plale EA ] 3 $520.00 $1,560.00 $550.00 s1a5000 |  $870.00 s261000| sa51.04|  $1,655.82
7 |6.5. Pipe Bracing, 10 F1. Dia Er | 2 $1,750.00 $350000|  $1,170.00 $2,34000 |  $1,000.00 $200000 | $226473 |  $4,52046
8 [ 5.5. Pump Guide Refl Sysiem s $95.00 $4,275.00 $90.00 sa,05000|  s100.00 sas00.00| s1wa70| s4,93650
9 |Resiliont (Link) Saals wiCarrier Pipe EA] o $150.00 $1,350.00 $90.00 s81000|  $435.00 sagtsoo|  saonas]  sis048
10 [INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
11 _xuaﬁi & Heplaca Ex. PYC Drain Line & P-Trap EA 1 $75.00 $75.00 $520,00 $820.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $1,443.82 $1,443.82
12 [8” Flanged Plug Veive ea| s $4,910.00 s1a73000|  $980.00 $2,940.00 |  $1,000.00 $2,00000] sis8316|  ss.640.48
13 |5~ Flanged Swing Chreck Valve ea| 3 $5,008.00 s1502400)  $2,790.00 sa3roon|  s2.70000 $8,10000f 528025 $15,84075
14 iz DL Pipe WF} s $256.00 $1,538.00 $100.00 $600.00|  $130.00 s7en00]  s2e877)  s1,72062
15 |Ductile Iron Filtings e | 1,300 $8.00 $11,120.00 $3.15 $4,3578.50 $3.50 $4,865.00 $13.21 | $10,361.90
16 [12" 0. Flanged Adsgters Eal 1 $140.00 $140.00 $820.00 ss2000 | $3,20000 $3,200,00 $R13.97 $813.97
17 —u.. Male Aluminum Quick Couplsr Adapter EA 1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,340.00 $1,340.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,1711.82 $1,171.52
18 [.5. Adjustabls Vaive Supports eA | 3 $185.00 $555.00 $770.00 8231000  $400.00 $1,20000f  s$200.40 $628.47
18 |12* Gale Vaive, iJ eal 2 $1,980.00 $3.960.00 |  $2.000.00 $4,160.00 |  $2,000.00 sa00000] $184280] s$3eBsE0
20 |B"%& Less Influent Line Plug EA 5 $300.00 $1,500.00 $480.00 %$2,400.00 $875.00 $4,375.00 $392.05 $1,960.25
21 —.—N.. Influent Line Plug EA 3 $500.00 $1,500.00 $940.00 $2,820.00 $875.00 $2,625.00 $663.84 $1,981.52

/232014



PAGEZ

IFB #14-1713-0V

WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128184
SWWRF Main Plant Drain Station Rehabilitatlon

"A" - BASED ON 180 CALENDAR DAYS

BID

.—

32

3

CEC Motor and Utillty Services

Yogel Bros. Bullding Co.

BID "A" 1761 12th St E, Palmatto, FL oo 1 o b (5 A 2720 Drane Fleld Hoad
180 CALENDAR DAYS 34221 r Zephyrhiils, Fi 33542 Palmetto, FL 34221 Lakeland, Ft. 33811
hem{ Tnit Extended Unit | Extonded Unit Extended Urd Extended
Ko. | Linia tem W) Qly Prica Price Brice Price Erice Price Price Pricg
22 18" Influent Line Plug EA 1 $900.00 $900.00 $1,510.00 $1,510.00 $875.00 $875.00 $1,238.22 $1,238.32
23 [8y-Pass Pumping s | 1 $17,400.00 s1740000)] $34880.00|  sa4680.00| $2700000|  s2700000) $51,20654) 951,246.34
24 _ufzu-_- By-Pass Pump Operator Ls 1 $7,200.00 $7.200.00 $6,400.00 $6,400.00 | $5,000.00 $5,000.00 | $32,332.49 | $32,392.49
28 [INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
26 [Remave & Replace Canicel Panel EA] 1 $36,104.00 $36,104.00 | $31,580.00 s31,58000 | s3600000|  $3600000| $e1,36520| sa1.385.20
27 _mna...a & Replace Sch B0 PVC Condult (Addandum #1) LF | so $57.00 $2,850.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $46.00 $2,300.00 $20.97 |  $1,443.50
28 [Remove & Replsce Eleairucs) Mounting Strucur EAQ 1 $3,715.00 $a71500|  $3,140.00 $3.14000] $5,500.00 $5,50000 | $3.46436| $3,464.36
28 [install How Ficat Swhtchea ea| 6 $76.00 $456.00|  s160.00 o000 | 5000 ssoo00| s1are2|  sewmse
k01 —v.____.._.ta. Hydromatic S6A3000M3-4, 30 HP, 1750 RPM EA 3 $15,974.0D0 $47,922.00 $26,840.00 $80,520,00 | $19,000.00 $654.000.00 | $19,842.30 $585,526.90
a n.w_.nﬁw Fillet, 3,000 psi, Typs I, No Relnt., Remave & evl 2 $275.00 $550,00 $910.00 $1,820.00]  $1,000.00 s3800.00| $107557| $2151.04
32 [New Concrete Wit Watl Floor, 4,000 psi, Typell, wih Rwint. | cv | 2 $350.00 $1,050.00 $910.00 s2,730.00 |  $1,400.00 $420000) $1,07556)  $3,206.68
33 [Briok & Mortor Valve Supports, Mex 6° High v 3 $32.00 $95.00 $520.00 $1,560.00 $285.00 $855.00 §236.50 $T08.77
[suaToTAL consTRUCTION COST $193,492.55 $223,205.50 $209,107.00 $279,956,17
42 [Mobilization K $11,000.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $22,32599
43 —z_onn__naoo._w Work & Cleanup IS 1 $41,000.00 $22,450.00 $22,000.00 $17,980.45
42 |Record Drawings N E $1,200.00 $800.00 $600.00 $577.39
muﬂw%hﬂ.&w.mﬂﬂ n_ﬂ“..m.o.mm__.ws B~ [FSen | goC $246,602.55 $254,045.50 $246,707.00 $320,840.00
& _§v9==§=n< Wark (iizad oty with County] o, | o $24,669.26 $25,404.55 $24,670.70 $32,084.00
TOTAL CONSTRUGTION COST - BID A $271,361.81 $279,450.05 $271,377.70 $352,924.00

s/asfans



BID TABULATION
FOR
IFB #14-1713-0V

WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128184
SWWRF MAIN PLANT DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

m—c ->—-
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 180 CALENDAR DAYS

PREPARED BY: BR% asfl
(Project Management)  Brian P. Bates, P.E., Project Manager " Date
REVIEWED BY: %&P\n\ﬁ pudiphe
(Project Engineer) J. Shea Shoun, P.E., Project Englneer "Date
APPROVED BY: . g % Het
(Purchasing) , Corftract Specialist “ Dafe
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FAGE 1

IFB #14-1713-0V
WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128183

BID "B" - BASED ON 120 CALENDAR DAYS

SWWRF BELT FILTER PRESS DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

- - 1 m 3 J
BID EB ﬁ.nmn Motor and Utllity Sarvinaa ATD Canstruction, Inc. ‘TLC Diversified, Inc. Vogel Bros. Butlding Co.
1751 12th St E, Paimetto, FL 5344 9th Strest 2718 17th Street East 2720 Orane Fisld Road
120 CALENDAR DAYS 34221 Zophyrhils, FL 33542 Palmettn, FL 34221 Laksland, FL 33811
[fem unit Extendad Unit Exignded Unit Exterdied Uit Extonded
No. | Line liem WM | aly Price Price Piice Price Price Price Price Prige |
1 |Wetwett Cleaning ar | 605 NO BID NO 81| $6.00 s353000] NOBID nos|  $13.09 $7,910.45
2 |- oret1 HoPe Piping tr | &8 NO BID no ainf $36.00 s248¢00|  NOBID NOBID]  $104.46|  $7.207.74
3 |6” HOPE Flange Adapiers w/Backup Ring EA | s NO BID NOBID}  §580.00 s348000] NOBID noBio|  s46040 $2,762.40
a 6" HOPE Fnings e | 120 NO BID) %o BID} $16.20 s19400] woe NOBID| 2740  $3,336.00
5 [Pump Base Ens, BPILL1G Enl 3 NO BID| NO BID) $740.00 $222000| NOBID NoBID|  §791.10 $2,373.30
§ |Pump Base E# sounting Piste eal s NO BID No Binf $640.00 s1,92000] NoBID NOBID|  3566.03 $1,700.49
7 |5:5. Pipe Bracing, 10 F1. Oia, K NO BID woBw| siasoco]  s3zono0| woBw NoBiD| spasses|  se7nse
& 2% 8.5, Pump Gulde Rail System e 4 NO BID no aio| £90.00 sacs000{ NOBID noBiD|  $127.74 $5,748.30
3 {Restlient (Link) Seals wiCamier Pipe Al & NO BID noBm|  $55000 s33c000] nNOBID NOBID]  $47392 $2,84352
10 |Repair Ex. Liner, {€xcl. 8id hems 8 & 11) o | 2 NO BID| Noeio|  $190.00 sE0000] NoBw nosi|  seaso $1,278.00
11 [Remova & Replace Ex. PVC Drain Line & P-Trap ea] 1 NO BID NOEID|  $1.150.00 s16000] NOBWB noBiD|  $t,965.14 $1,965.14
12 _m.. Flanged Plug Vaive EA | 3 NO BID NO m_c_ $380.00 $2,240.00 NO BID NO m_u_ $1,932.95 $5.801.85
13 |or Flanged Swin Check Vaive ea| s NO BID nosim|  s2760.00 $6,28000f NOBID noBiD| $s42268|  $16:267.95
14 [INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
15 _u_.o:s Iron Fitlings g | 228 NO BID} NO EtD| $5.00 $1,125.00 NO B1D NO BID $14.21 $3,197.28
16 INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
17 [8" Male Aluminum Quick Coupter Adapter EA | 1 NO BID noBiD]  $670.00 s67000| noBID noBiD| 120243 $1,208.43
18 [8.5. Adjustable Valve Supporta eal 3 NO BID no BiD| $560.00 $1,680,00 NO BID NO mE_ $215.14 $645.42
19 10" Gate vaive, My Eal 1 NG BID noBml| sasonoa ssgo000] nNoBID NOBID] $1,674.10 $1.874.10
20 [6"& Less Influent Lino Plug Eal 2 NO BID) NO BID) $490.00 soso00| NoBID noeio|  s741.38 $1,462.76




IFB #14-1713-0QV

WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128183
SWWRF BELT FILTER PRESS DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

BID "B"” - BASED ON 120 CALENDAR DAYS
9 2 3
BiD "B" CEC Motor and Utllity Services|  RTD Corstruction, Inc. TLC Diversifiad, Ine. Vogs! Bros. Bullding Co.
1751 12th St E, Paimatio, FL 5344 9th Streat 2718 17th Street Eest 2720 Drana Field Road
120 CALENDAR DAYS 34221 Zaphyrhills, FL 33542 Paimettn, FL 34221 Lakaland, FL 33811
Tom ~Unit Extendad Unit ~ Extonded | UnH ] GExtendod } UnE | Extended
No. | Lina ltem um | oy Pricg Price Price Pricy | Prico Price Pricg Pricg
21 [12" tntiusnt Line Plug Ea [ 1 NO BID NOB $960.00 $8s000] NOBM NoBID|  $861.97 $861.97
a2 _—z._.mz._.-Dz_P_._-< LEFT BLANK
23 [By-Pass Pumping 5| 1 NO BtD)| NoBID| s2s6s000]  soses000|  womn) NOBID| $82,620.40 |  $52,628.40
24 [24-Hour By-Pass Pump Operator Y K NG BID) NOBID|  $4.400.00 saa0000|  nNoeID) noBiD| 3326608  $33,266.08
25 |Remave & Replace Fused Safety Switch (Disconmect) EA | 4 NO BID) NOBID]  $1,810.00 $72a000] NOBID noBIo| $1,778.89 $7,115.56
26 [INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
il - Sch 83, PVC Electrical Condult (2" mini{Addendum| ~ =1~ 2y NO BID No sio| $50.00 s250000]  NoOBID NOBID|  s20.65 $1,482.50
28 |[Remove & Replace Electrical Mouniing Structure Ea | 1 NO BID NOBID]  $3.140.00 $314000f NOBID No Bip| $3,557.79 $3,557.79
20 [install New Ficet Switches ea| s NO BID noBio|  szioo0|  suzs00|  NomD NoBID| 15672 $940.32
30 [Pumps, Hydromatic SEL2000M4-4, 20 HP, 1750 APK ean| 3 NO BID noem| sezeloon| sezeoco| noEID) No®iD| s134s573| 4836719
31 _mnoa_nhh- O O P, S O VTA: cr| 2 NO BID NOBI $910.00 $1.82000]  NOBID NO m__..._ $1,574.87 $3149.74
32 |New Concrata Wet Well Floor, 4,000 psi, Typa I, with Reinf. | ¢¥ | 3 NO BID no Bio| $910.00 $2,730.00 NO BID NoBiD| $1.104.57 $3,313.74
33 [Brick & Mortor Valve Supporis, Max 8" High v s NO BID NO u_u_ $520.00 $1,560.00 NO BID| NC w_u_ $242.97 $728.91
SUBTOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST NO BiDf $174,083.00 NO BIDf $225,731.17
42 [pebillzation s | 1 No ai0] $7,500.00 no Bio $22,779.86
43 |Miscolloneous Work & Cleanup is | 1 No aip| $15,380.00 no eio] $17,886.01
44 [Record Drawings s | 1 no sin} $800.00 o BiD) $582.96
wuﬂﬂ#&mﬂﬂﬂ %.ﬁo..n_ﬂm:o..w... - ESoad_Sn Ty NO w_u_ $197,763.00 NO BID) $267,000.00
% m_.wuaﬂs_a.:noa_.au.é WOGHS [NAGEd) it WL BEIALY o | g NO w_o_ $19,776.30 no ein| $26,700.00
TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST - BID B NO BID] $217,530.30 NO BID] $293,700.00
‘ |

ynzna



BID TABULATION
FOR
IFB #14-1713-0V

WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128183
SWWRF BELT FILTER PRESS DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

BID "B"
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 120 CALENDAR DAYS

PREPARED BY: 3 9l
(Project Management)  Brian P. Bates, P.E., Project Manager ‘Date
REVIEWED BY: =7 AT Py
(Praject Engineer) SheaShoun, P.E., Project Engineer " Date
APPROVED BY: W\ \N & 227
(Purchasing) Qiga-Vakich, Contract muwo_m__ﬂ “ Date

PAGE 3 9232014



PAGE X

IFB #14-1713-OV

WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128184
SWWRF Main Plant Drain Station Rehabilitation

BID "B" - BASED ON 120 CALENDAR DAYS

T W 3 3
W_U ..W.. CEC Motor and UtliRy Sarvicas RATD Construction, inc. TLC Diversifiad, inc. Vogal Brog. Bullding Co.
1751 12th St E, Paimetto, FL, 5344 91h Strest 2719 17th Streat East 2720 Drane Fisid Road
120 CALENDAR DAYS 34221 Zaphyrhills, FL. 33542 Palmetto, FL 34221 Lakeland, FL 33811
[am Unit Exiantad Unit Extended | Unit | Extendad | Unkt Extanded
No. | Line item um| aty | price Prigp Pricg )| Price | ®rice Price Brice Frice _
1 [Wetwetl Cleaning sF | &05 NO BID) NO B $6.00 $3,830.00 NO BID noB| 12 $7,880.55
2 [¢ oA-11 HoPE Piping F | s NO BID noBiof  $15.00 $1,083.00 NO BID NO BID| $313.24 $1,894.68
3 |8 HOPE Flango Adapiers w/Backup Ring eA| & NO BID) noaio|  $680.00 $3,460.00 NO BID NOBID|  $426.24 $2,557.44
a_[e" Hope Fittings 18 | 120 NO BID noBm|  s20| s19u00]  womip NOBID|  $2747|  $3.24840
5 |Pump Base Ells BFIU 16 A | 3 NO BID NOBID|  $1,180.00 $3,540.00 NO BID NOBID|  $1,257.82 $3,773.46
& [Pump Baze Ell Mounting Plate EA | o NO BID NOBID|  $650.00 £1,950.00 NG BID NOBID] 55194  $1,65582
7 [5.5. Pipa Bracing, 10 F1. Dia. eal 2 NO BID NoBiD| s1a7000|  s2340.00]  NOBID NOBID| $226473| 54,5204
8 b 5.5 Pump Guide Ruil Systam LF [ 45 NO BID Noswo]  ssam0]  ssosaon]  NoBID noBiD|  swoavm|  $49%50
8 |Resifent (Link) Saals wiCarrier Pipe EA | 9 NO BID) NoBID|  $90.00 $610.00 NO BID NOBID|  $201.16 $1,810.44
10 [NTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
11 |Romave & Replace Ex. FYC Drain Line & P-Trap Ba [ 1 NO BID noBio|  $s20.00 $920.00 NO BID NOBID] $1.442.62 $1.443.82
12 |6" Flanged Piug Valve EA | 3 NO BID| noein] 390000 $2,840.00 NO BID NOBID|  $7.883.16 $5.649.48
13 |6~ Flanged Swing Check Valve EA| 3 NO BID NOBID| $2,750.00 $8,370.00 NO BID NoBID| $528025| $15840.75
14 112~ D.1. Pipe LF & NO BIB NO u_u_ $100.00 $600.00 NO BID NO BID $206.77 §1,720.62
15 {Ductile Iran Fittings 8 [ 1290 NO BID o BiD| 5315 $4,378.50 NO BID No Bio| $13.21|  $18,361.90
15 [12" DAFlanged Adapters ga | 1 NO BID noBiD|  $820.00 $820.00 NO BID Noew|  ss13.sy $613.97
17 {2~ Male Aluminum Quick Coupler Acapter EA| 1 NO BID NOBID|  $1,340.00 $1,340.00 HO BID noBiof sui7tez|  s11782
18 [5.5. Adjusiable Valve Supports ea| 3 NO BID noei|  5770.00 $2,310.00 NO BID NOBIDf  $20549 san.47
18 [12" Gata Valve, MJ EA | 2 NG BID noBiD| $2,080.00 $4,160.00 NO BID! noeipf graezen) 388560
20 [6"& Lesa Infiuamt Line Piug ea| s NG BID noBD|  s8000(  s240000]  NOBID nombf  s:9205]|  §1,96038
21 [12” Inttuem Line Piug Al 3 NG BID noBw|  s2a0.00 $2,820,00 NO BID NOBID}  $63.64|  shaors

9f13fa004



PAGE 2

IFB #14-1713-0V
WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128184
SWWRF Main Plant Drain Station Rehabilitation

BID "B" - BASED ON 120 CALENDAR DAYS
1 2 _ 3 3
BID "B" CEC Mator and Utility Services |  RTD Construction, inc. TLE Diversified, inc. Voges Bros. Buliding Co.
1751 12th St E, Palmetto, FL 5344 Bth Stroet 2719 17th Sireat Enat 2720 Drena Fioid Road
120 CALENDAR DAYS aen Zaphyrhifls, FL. 33542 Palmetto; R, 34221 Laketand, FL 33511
Unit Extanded Unll ~ Extendsd Unit “Exianced Unkt

No. | Line ttom um | oy | price Prics pace | Price | erice Prigg | piios | Prics |
22 (18" influent Line Plug EA| 1 NO BID NOBID| $1,510.00 $1,510.00 NO BID noBiD| siz3s32| 123832
23 [By-Pasa Fumping s | 1 NO BID noem| sass000| 53468000 NO BID NoBID| $51245.34] 5124634
2a [24-Hour By-Pass Pump Operator s | 1 NO BID NOBID| 58400.00 $8,400.00 NO BID)| NOBID| $3239248| $a2,382.49
25 INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
25 [Remove & Replaca Control Panel ea ] 1 NO BID NoBID{ $31,580.00|  §31,5%0.00 NO BID noBiD| s41,385.20( s41,365.20
27 |Remove & Replace Sch 8 PVC Condult {Addendur #1) 1f | s NO BID noBiD|  $50.00 $2,500.00 NO BID noeip]  sE7|  $1.44350
28 [Remove & Replace Elecirucal Mounting Structire Eal 1 NO BID, NOBD| $3,140.00 $3,140.00 NG BID NOBID| $346438|  s$3ds4.36
29 [install New Fioat Switches Ea | s NO BID)| noein]  sis0go $250.00 NO BID NomID|  $137.82 $827.52
30 [Pumps, Hydromatic S6A3000M3-4 30 HP, 1750 RFM en| 3 NO BID. NoBID| $26840.00|  $80.520.00 NO BID No | sieps2a0| ssess0
a1 W.ﬁﬂ- Fllat, 3,000 psi, Type I, No Reint., Remava & ev | 2 NO BID noem| ssoo| sen0| Noen noein| siorasr| 521501
32 [New Concrete Wet Well Floor, 4,000 psl, Type Il, with Reint. | CY 3 NO EiD NO w_e_ $910.00 $2,730.00 NO BID NG w_u_ $1,075.58 $3,226.58
33 [Brick & Martor Valve Supports, Max 1" High vl 3 NO BID noeio|  $52000 $1,560.00 NO BID) noeio]  $235.59 $700.77

JsusToTAL CoNsTRUCTION COST NO BiD| $023,205.50 no eiof $279,865.17
42 |Mobillzation s | 1 No aio| $7,500.00 NO BID} $22,325.99
43 _-.__uo-__u_!..___m Work & Cleanup Ls 1 NG w_u_ $22,450.00 NO w_u_ $17,980.45
44 [Recard Drawings s f 1 no Bip| $600.00 no &inf 8577.39

[ ey R n e ciwesi o O No BID 25404550 o) ss2075000
a5 hﬂa?é&wﬂ« Work {Used only with County} o, | no | $25,404.55 NO w_u_ $32,075.00

[roTaL consTRucTION COST - BID B NO BiD| $279,450.05 NO BID] $352,825.00

9233018
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WASTEWATER PROJECT NO. 5128184
SWWRF MAIN PLANT DRAIN STATION REHABILITATION

BID "B"
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 120 CALENDAR DAYS

PREPARED BY: ¥ Ly

(Project Management) Brian P. Bates, P.E., Project Manager Date

REVIEWED BY: WWN &n“\ﬁ o m\
{Project Engineer} Shéa Shoun, P.E., Project Enginser " Date

APPROVED BY: - Y

{Purchasing) cich, Coniract Specialist at

PAGE 3 9232014



