MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

INTENT TO AWARD
Neal Preserve Trail from ' of f
Causeway Path Boardwalk mc 191 é”? ‘/
SUBJECT (FDOT LAP PROJECT) DATE POSTED DS 042 ¢
' (Financial Project ID # - CC Eﬁ‘fl m v’f‘;kﬁ
428133-1-58-01)
PURCHAS!NG‘ DATE CONTRACT
REPRESENTATIVE Donna M. Stevens, Ext.3045 SHALL BE AWARDED Seven days from date posted

CONSEQUENCES IF . .
DEEERRED Delay in project

-

DEPARTMENT Public Works Department

 AUTHORIZED BY Mdissa Wendel
SOLICITATION IFB # 13-1272-DS e rlesaWep

, 2013

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid # 13-1272-DS, Neal Preserve Trail from Causeway Path Boardwalk to the lowest,
responsive and responsible bidder, Westra Construction Corp.,1263 12" Avenue East, Palmetto, Florida 34221 for a total base
bid of $375,117.25 (Option “B”) for a completion time of 120 calendar days.

ENABLINGIREGULATSNG AUTHORITY

Federal/State Iaw(s), admlmstratlve rulmg(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordmances, .
_ resolutions, pollcy

Manatee County Code of Law

BACKGROUND/D?SCUSSION

The work mcluded in the this contract consists of the connection of Neal Preserve to the exrstmg sidewalk on the north srde of
SR64 with approximately 2,080 LF (linear feet) of 10’ trail and 79 LF (linear feet) of 8 trail under the bridge . The work shall be
performed in accordance with the related standards and specifications noted in the solicitation.

Appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability advertised on DemandStar, mymanatee.org and
the Manatee Chamber of Commerce.

Five (5) bids were received.

Manatee County Firm Bid Offering 90 days Bid Offering 120 days
Westra Construction Corp. no bid $375,117.25
Hillsborough County Firm Bid Offering 90 days Bid Offering 120 days
Florida Safety Contractors, Inc. $383,581.60 $383,581.60
Cone & Graham, Inc. no bid $447,984.50
Pinellas County Firm Bid Offering 90 days Bid Offering 120 days
Olympus Painting Contractors, Inc. $420,085.25 $420,085.25
Southern Road & Bridge, LLC. $650,795.50 $593,905.00

On October 2, 2013 received from the Public Works Department confirmation that funds were available for this project in addition
to the recommendation to award dated September 9, 2013 after the successful Budget Amendment approval on September 24,
2013 to Westra Construction Corp. located at 1263 12" Avenue East, Palmetto, Florida 34221 for a total base bid of
$375.,117.25 (Option “B”) with a 120 calendar day completion.

The funding source for this Agreement (Neal Preserve Trail- 3096068711-534000/6068711-0004)

Department
Recommendation ’

. . | FUNDING SOURCE s verified
Bid Tabulation (Acct Number & Name] |0 ricient Funds

AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING COSTS
COST $375,117.25 (Attach Fiscal Impact Statement)




MEMORANDUM

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

Project Management B / Phone: 941-708-7450

1022 26th Avenue E. x-S Fax: 941-708-7549
Bradenton, FL 34208 MANATEE COUNTY WWW.Invinanatee. ory
FLORIDA

To: Melissa M. Wendel, CPPO, Purchasing Official
From: Jeff Streitmatter 1, P.E., Project Management Division Manager
Date: September 9, 2013

Subject:  Neal Preserve Trail from Causeway Path Boardwalk
(FDOT LAP Project - FPN: 428133-1-58-01)
Westra Construction Corp.
Recommendation for Award - IFB #13-1272-DS

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation form is
attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract Bid “B”, with a construction time of 120
calendar days be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, Westra Construction Corp. in
the amount of $375,117.25 and in accordance with the terms and conditions of the bid package.
Upon completion of project award, please provide a copy of the Purchase Order assigned to the
contractor. The funding source for this contract is Gas Taxes.

Please contact Sherri Robinson, Assessment Coordinator, if you have any questions regarding the
attached documents.

Thank you for your continued assistance.

JS/sr

cc:  Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works
Sia Mollanazar, P.E., Deputy Director, Engineering Services
Chris Mowbray, P.E., Engineering Division Manager
Brian Martineau, Sr. Engineering Specialist, w/attachments
Prony Bonnaire Fils, Engineering Specialist |l, w/attachments
Sherri Robinson, Assessment Coordinator ﬁ@
Project File: 6068711

LARRY BUSTLE * MICHAEL GALLEN * JOHN CHAPPIE * ROBIN DISABATING * VANESSABAUGH * CAROL WHITMORE * BETSY BENAC
[strict | Dustrice 2 District 3 Dustrict 4 District 5 Dustrict 6 Prstrict 7

et N T T e Y b rovomsiendiation toe asvand o



IFB #13-1272-DS
MANATEE COUNTY PROJECT NO. 6068711
LAP AGREEMENT (FINANCIAL ID NO. 428133-1-58-01)

NEAL PRESERVE TRAIL FROM CAUSEWAY PATH BOARDWALK

3

BID "A" o L T | o0 e e [ iy i et
em| FDOT n.llll_.ﬂnll-ur.fl1 Unit Extended Ll..lEll:& Extended lcj%ilr |ﬁE§& mmu_lﬂa,._nll
o3 Bu Mo, peem Descripeoe i 2 : Price Price Price Price Price price
1 101-1  |[Mobilization LS 1 No Bid $27.,000.00 $27,000.00 | $38,000.00 $38,000.00 No Bid $55,000.00 $55,000.00
2 | 1021 |Maintenance of Tratfic s 1 No Bid $9,300.00 |  $9,300.00 | $38.000.00 |  $38,000.00 No Bid $22,000.00 |  $22,000.00
3 | 1046 |Sandbags (Addendum #1) LF | 387 No Bid $13.00 $5,031.00 $29.00| $11,223.00 No Bid $550 [ $2.128.50
4 104-11  |Floating Turbidy Barrier (Addendum #3) LF | 400 No Bid $20.00 $8.000.00 $25.00 $10,000.00 No Bid $16.50 $6,600.00
5 | 104-10-3 [Sediment Barrier LF | 2,00 No Bid $1.00 $2,003.00 $3.75 $7.511.25 No Bid $3.30 $6,609.90
6 | 110141 [Clearing & Grubbing ac| 1 No Bid $23,000.00 | $23,000.00| $19.800.00| $19,800.00 No Bid $38,500.00 | $38,500.00
7 | 1104 |Removal of existing Concrete Pavement (Addendm #1) sv | 7es No Bid $16.00 | $12,256.00 $16.50 | $12,639.00 No Bid $2200 | $16,852.00
8 | 1201 |Regular Excavation (Addendum #1) cy | %0 No Bid $14.00|  $9,660.00 $14.50 | $10,005.00 No Bid $55.00 | $37,950.00
9 | 1206 |Embankment (Addendum #1) cy | 17 No Bid $24.00 |  $4,272.00 $35.00 |  $6,230.00 No Bid $110.00 | §19,580.00
10 | 12072 [Gravel Fill No. 24 Stone (Under the Trai) (Addendum #1) cy| 40 No Bid $230.00 $9,200.00 $420.00 | $16,800.00 No Bid $110.00 $4,400.00
11 | 12072 [Gravel Fill (No. 57 Stone) (Addendum #1) cy| sa No Bid $138.00 |  $7,452.00 $420.00 |  $22,680.00 No Bid $137.50 |  $7.425.00
12 | 4001-25 ete Class | (Addendum #1) cy| 10 No Bid $440.00 $4,400.00 $375.00 $3,750.00 No Bid $1,650.00 | $16.,500.00
13 | 4006 |Anchor Beams Repair (Addendum #1) Ea| 40 No Bid $257.50 | $10,300.00 $200.00 $8,000.00 No Bid $2,200.00 | $88,000.00
14 | 514-71-2 |Plastic Filter Fabric (Addendum #1) sY 734 No Bid $3.55 $2,605.70 $4.00 $2,936.00 No Bid $11.00 $8,074.00
15 | 515-2-302 [Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing, Aluminum Only - 54" Type 1 LF | ars No Bid $82.50 $34,687.50 $05.00 $35,625.00 No Bid $93.50 $35,062.50
16 522-1  |Sidewalk Concrete - 4" Thick sy | =2 No Bid $37.20 $30,950.40 $27.50 $22,880.00 No Bid $52.80 $43,929.60
17 | 5222 |Sidewalk Concrete - 6° Thick sy | 2420 No Bid $29.00 | $70,180.00 $32.50 |  $78,650.00 No Bid $64.90 | $157,058.00
18 | 5301 |Rip-Rap, Sand-Cement (Addendum #1) cy| 70 No Bid $420.00 |  $29,400.00 $265.00 |  $18,550.00 No Bid $132.00 |  $9,240.00
19 | 5302 |Rip-Rap Bank Shore (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) ™| 143 No Bid $138.00 | $19,734.00 $43.00 $6,149.00 No Bid $137.50 | $19.662.50
20 | 5303 |Rip-Rap Fal Ditch Lining (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) ™| 19 No Bid $150.00 | $17,850.00 $43.00 $5,117.00 No Bid $126.50 | $15,053.50
21 | 570-1-2 |Sodding (Performance Turf) (Addendum #1) sy | 4,000 No Bid $4.20| $16,800.00 $365| $14,600.00 No Bid $3.30| $13,200.00
22 | 700-20-12 [single Post Sign, &I, 12-20 SF as| o No Bid $500.00 |  $4,500.00 $660.00 | $5,940.00 No Bid $330.00 |  $2.970.00
_ |SUBTOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST No Bid $358,581.60 $395,085.25 No Bid $625,795.50
|DISCRETIONARY WORK No Bid $25,000.00 $25,000.00 No Bid $25,000.00
TOTAL BID PRICE "A" - 90 Calendar Days No Bid $383,581.60 $420,085.25 No Bid $650,795.50
Acknowledged Addendum #1, #2 and #3 No Bid Yes Yes No Bid Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire No Bid Yes Yes No Bid Yes
4 Years - CGC (CGC1516846) 2 Years - CGC (CGC15211684) 1 Year - CGC (CGC1521093)
License Information No Bid 5 Years - FOOT Pre-Qualified 18 Years - FDOT Pre-Qualified No Bid 1 Year - FDOT Pre-Qualified
Site Visit No Bid s Ve s No Bid -
Florida Trench Safety Act No Bid Yes Yes No Bid Yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes No Bid Yes Yes No Bid Yes
Bid Bond No Bid Yes Yes No Bid Yes
Affidavit for Local Business (if applicable) No Bid No No No Bid No
Notes: No Bid N/A NA No Bid NA
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BID FORM - SUBCONTRACTOR'S PERCENTAGE

IFB #13-1272-DS

MANATEE COUNTY PROJECT NO. 6068711
LAP AGREEMENT (FINANCIAL ID NO. 428133-1-58-01)
NEAL PRESERVE TRAIL FROM CAUSEWAY PATH BOARDWALK

BID "A" R e || g e | Chmeys Piving Contsios [ Co kG e || Sowlr s Sas
OO O >—|mZU PI _U ><m Palmetto, FL 34221 ..qmsvm. FL 33687 ._.m_ﬁo.‘_ Springs, FL 34689 .qm.svm. FL 33610 Am_ﬁoa Springs, FL. 34689
(Manatee County (Hillsborough County) (Pinellas County) (Hillsborough County) (Pinellas County)
tem} FDOT MBE / | Description of Work MBE / | Description of Work MBE/ ;cmmomuao: of Work MBE / | Description of Work MBE / | Description of Work by
No. | item No. || Item Description % | DBE. | by Subcontractor || % | DBE | by Subcontractor || % | DBE | by Subcontractor | % | DBE | by Subcontractor % DBE Subcontractor
1 101-1 Mobilization No Bid N/A| N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD 8D
2 102-1 Maintenance of Traffic No Bid N/AL N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
3 104-6 | Sand Bags (Addendum #1) No Bid N/AL N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid T8D | TBD 8D
4 104-11 | Floating Turbidy Barrier (Addendum #3) No Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid T8D | TBD TBD
5 104-10-3 || Sediment Barrier No Bid N/A| N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | T8BD TBD
6 110-1-1 | Clearing & Grubbing No Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid T8D | TBD TBD
7 110-4 Removal of existing Concrete Pavement (Addendum #1) No Bid N/AT NA N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
8 1201 Regular Excavation (Addendum #1) No Bid N/AT NA N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
9 120-6 Embankment (Addendum #1) No Bid N/AT NA N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
10 120-72 | Gravel Fill No. 24 Stone (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) No Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
11 120-72 | Gravel Fill No. 57 Stone (Addendum #1) = No Bid N/AT NA N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
12 | 400-1-25 | Concrete Class | (Addendum #1) No Bid N/A| NA N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
13 400-6 Anchor Beams Repair (Addendum #1) No Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD 8D
14 | 514-71-2 | Plastic Filter Fabric (Addendum #1) No Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD 8D
15 || 515-2-302 || Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing, Aluminum Only - 54" Type 1 No Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
16 522-1 Sidewalk Concrete - 4" Thick No Bid N/A| N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD 78D
17 522-2 || Sidewalk Concrete - 6" Thick Nao Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD TBD
18 530-1 Rip-Rap, Sand-Cement (Addendum #1) No Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid T™BD | TBD ™D
19 530-2 Rip-Rap Bank Shore (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) No Bid 1% | DBE Hauling Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD 8D
20 530-3 Rip-Rap F&l Ditch Lining (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) No Bid 1% | DBE Hauting Did Not Provide No Bid TBD 8D TBD
21 570-1-2 | Sodding (Performance Turf) (Addendum #1) No Bid N/A T N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD TBD TBD
22 || 700-20-12 | Single Post Sign, F&, 12-20 SF No Bid N/AT N/A N/A Did Not Provide No Bid TBD | TBD 78D
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PREPARED BY:
(Project Management)

REVIEWED BY:
(Project Engineer)

REVIEWED BY:
(Project Manager)

APPROVED BY:
(Purchasing)
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BID TABULATION
FOR
IFB #13-1272-DS

MANATEE COUNTY PROJECT NO. 6068711
LAP AGREEMENT (FINANCIAL ID NO. 428133-1-58-01)
NEAL PRESERVE TRAIL FROM CAUSEWAY PATH BOARDWALK

m—c =>=
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 90 CALENDAR DAYS

Shu Robumsen 28/13
Sherri Robinson, Assessment Coordinator Date
&&% Q\h%\ £ [28 \ (3
Rﬂ(m >:o%m50e_‘_tmm=8w_ Engineering Specialist | ' Dafe
Brian Martineau, Sr. Engineering Specialist Date
g?o 13

Donna Stevens, Contract Specialist

te

8/28/2013



IFB #13-1272-DS
MANATEE COUNTY PROJECT NO. 6068711
LAP AGREEMENT (FINANCIAL 1D NO. 428133-1-58-01)
NEAL PRESERVE TRAIL FROM CAUSEWAY PATH BOARDWALK

1 2 3 4 5
g Westra Construction Corp. | Florida Safety Contractors, Inc. | Olympus Painting Contractors, inc. Cone & Graham, Inc. Southern Road & Bridge, LLC. |
BID "B 1263 12th Avenue East P.0. Box 16628 556 Anclote Road 5101 Cone Road 731 Wesley Avenue
flem| FDOT __i._ :EEIIIEE&& IEE:! muis.a" - LE:;. muz.aa_. ed | E:a. Emi_ : L|§= " | Extended
No. | hem No. jttem Description Unit] oty | Pprice Price. Price Price | Price Price | Prico Price Price [ Price
1 101-1 _to!_i.g Ls| 1 $62,000.00 $62,000.00 | $27,000.00 $27,000.00 | $38,000.00 $38,000.00 | $44,000.00 $44,000.00 | $50,000.00 $50,000.00
2 1021 _:-_2!._3. of Traffic Ls| 1 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $9.300.00 $9,300.00 | $38,000.00 $38,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 | $20,000.00 [ $20,000.00
3 104-6 T-:.ES- (Addendum #1) LF | 387 $7.00 $2,709.00 $13.00 $5,031.00 $29.00 $11,223.00 $15.00 $5,805.00 $5.00 $1,935.00
i 104-11 —3.!_3 Turbidy Barrier (Addendum #3) LF | 400 $12.00 $4,800.00 $20.00 $8.000.00 $25.00 $10,000.00 $28.75 $11,500.00 $15.00 $6,000.00
5 | 104103 —m_..u.ia Barrier LF |2,003 $1.85 $3,705.55 $1.00 $2,003.00 $3.75 $7,511.25 $1.00 $2,003.00 $3.00 $6,009.00
[ 110-1-1 _0.-!_3 & Grubbing AC| 1 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 | $23,000.00 $23,000.00 | $19,800.00 $10,800.00 | $40,000.00 $40,000.00 | $35,000.00 $35,000.00
7 1104 —x!..ni of existing Concrete Pavement (Addendm #1) SY | 766 $6.50 $4,979.00 $16.00 | $12,256.00 $16.50 | $12,639.00 $10.75 $8,234.50 $20.00 | $15.320.00
] 12041 |Regular Excavation (Addendum #1) CY | 690 $9.00 $6,210.00 $14.00 $9,660.00 $14.50 $10,005.00 $31.50 $21,735.00 $50.00 $34,500.00
9 120-6 _mau.__.....ia (Addendum #1) CcY | 178 $2.65 $471.70 $24.00 §4.272.00 $35.00 $6,230.00 $23.00 $4,094.00 $100.00 | $17.800.00
10 | 12072 |Gravel Fill No. 24 Stone (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) cy| 40 $82.00 $3,280.00 $230.00 |  $9,200.00 $420.00 |  $16,800.00 $154.00 $6,160.00 $100.00 | $4.000.00
1 120-72 —o-.i_ Fill (No. 57 Stone) (Addendum #1) CY| 54 $82.00 $4,428.00 $138.00 §7,452.00 $420.00 $22,680.00 $141.00 $7,614.00 $125.00 $6,750.00
12 | 400125 |Concrete Class | (Addendum #1) Cy| 10 $350.00 $3,500.00 $440.00 $4,400.00 $375.00 $3.750.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00
13 400-6 Beams Repair (Addendum #1) EA| 40 $240.00 $9,600.00 $257.50 | $10,300.00 $200.00 $8,000.00 $920.00 $36,800.00 $2,000.00 | $80,000.00
14 | 514.71-2 |Plastic Filter Fabric (Addendum #1) SY| 734 $8.50 $6,239.00 $3.55 $2.605.70 $4.00 $2,936.00 $4.00 $2,936.00 $10.00 $7.340.00
15 | 515-2-302 —E_!.i_aﬁ.- Ralling, Aluminum Only - 54" Type 1 LF | 375 $100.00 $37,500.00 $82.50 $34,687.50 $95.00 $35,625.00 $80.00 $30,000.00 $85.00 $31,875.00
16 5221 —wﬁ-ﬂ-_w Concrets - 4° Thick SY | 832 $28.00 $23,296.00 $37.20 $30,950.40 $27.50 $22,880.00 $39.00 $32,448.00 $48.00 $39,936.00
17 522-2 |Sidewalk Concrete - 6" Thick SY |2,420 $35.00 $84,700.00 $29.00 $70,180.00 $32.50 $78,650.00 $38.00 $91,960.00 $59.00 | $142,780.00
18 530-1 Sand-Cement (Addendum #1) Cy| 70 $475.00 $33,250.00 $420.00 $29,400.00 $265.00 $18,550.00 $350.00 $24,500.00 $120.00 $8,400.00
19 530-2 |Rip-Rap Bank Shore (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) TN | 143 $92.00 $13,156.00 $138.00 $19,734.00 $43.00 $6,149.00 $125.00 $17,875.00 $125.00 $17,875.00
20 530-3 _!_?:i F&I Ditch Lining (Under the Trall) (Addendum #1) TN | 119 $92.00 $10,948.00 $150.00 $17.,850.00 $43.00 $5,117.00 $130.00 $15,470.00 $115.00 $13,685.00
n 570-1-2 _wo&x.a (Performance Turf) (Addendum #1) SY |4,000 $3.00 $12,000.00 $4.20 $16,800.00 $3.65 $14,600.00 $3.00 $12,000.00 $3.00 $12,000.00
22 | 700-20-12 [Single Post Sign, Fal, 12-20 SF As| 9 $405.00 $3,645.00 $500.00 |  $4.500.00 $660.00 $5,940.00 $150.00 $1,350.00 $300.00 |  $2,700.00
~ |SUBTOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST $350,117.25 $358,581.60 $395,085.25 $422,984.50 $568,005.00
|DISCRETIONARY WORK $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
TOTAL BID PRICE “B" - 120 Calendar Days —\ $375,117.25 $383,581.60 $420,085.25 $447,984.50 $§593,905.00
Acknowledged Addendum #1, #2 and #3 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
36 Years - CGC (CGC062888) 4 Years - CGC (CGC1516846) 2 Years - CGC (CGC1521164) 34 Years - CGC (CGC038551) 1 Year - CGC (CGC1521083)
License Information 36 Years - FDOT Pre-Qualified :!.m.u.nq!;l!rh 18 Years - FDOT Pre-Qualified 34 Years - FDOT Pre-Qualified ; 1 Year - FOOT Pre-Quaiified
Site Visit Yes - 7/29/13 : Yes - 7/24/13 Yes - 7/29/13 Yes - 8/1/13 Yes
Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Affidavit for Local Business (if applicable) N/A No No Yes No
Notes: N/A NA NA No NA
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BiD FORM - SUBCONTRACTOR'S PERCENTAGE
IFB #13-1272-DS
MANATEE COUNTY PROJECT NO. 6068711
LAP AGREEMENT (FINANCIAL ID NO. 428133-1-58-01)
NEAL PRESERVE TRAIL FROM CAUSEWAY PATH BOARDWALK

BID "B" Tesks Conawusin Co. | Flokda ufoy Coniacior e, || Ohmpu Palifing Consotors © 1ot Cone Road a1 Wosley Avenue
.u NO 0 >—|mz U >m —U ><w Palmetto, FL 34221 .ﬂmanm, FL 33687 qm%o:. Springs, FL 34689 .qmaum, FL 33610 ._.m_ﬁoa Springs, FL 34689
(Manatee County (Hilisborough County) ({Pinellas County) (Hillshborough County) (Pinellas County)

ltem}  FDOT MBE / | Description of Work MBE /| Description of Work MBE /| Description of Work MBE / | Description of Work MBE / | Description of Work by
No. | item No. | Item Description Yo DBE by Subcontractor % DBE by Subcontractor % DBE by Subcontractor % DBE by Subcontractor % DBE Subcontractor

1 101-1 Mobilization 10% ﬁwum\ Survey & Video N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

2 102-1 Maintenance of Traffic N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

3 104-6 Sand Bags (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

4 104-11 Floating Turbidy Barrier (Addendum #3) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

5 104-10-3 || Sediment Barrier N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

6 110-1-1 | Clearing & Grubbing N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

7 110-4 Removal of existing Concrete Pavement (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

8 120-1 Regular Excavation (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

9 120-6 Embankment (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

10 120-72 | Gravel Fill No. 24 Stone (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

1 120-72 | Gravel Fill No. 57 Stone (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

12 | 400-1-25 § Concrete Class | (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

13 400-6 Anchor Beams Repair (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

14 || 514-71-2 | Plastic Filter Fabric (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

15 | 515-2-302 || Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing, Aluminum Only - 54" Type 1 85% | N/A Railing NA | NA N/A Did Not Provide 100% | N/A mcﬂwﬂw%ms: NA | NA N/A

16 522-1 Sidewalk Concrete - 4" Thick 76% N/A Concrete N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide 90% N/A | Form & Pour Sidewalk j N/A N/A N/A

17 522-2 Sidewalk Concrete - 6" Thick 76% N/A Concrete N/A NA N/A Did Not Provide 90% N/A | Form & Pour Sidewalk | N/A N/A N/A

18 530-1 Rip-Rap, Sand-Cement (Addendum #1) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

19 530-2 Rip-Rap Bank Shore {(Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) N/A DBE Hauling 1% DBE Hauling Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

20 530-3 Rip-Rap F&I Ditch Lining (Under the Trail) (Addendum #1) N/A DBE Hauling 1% DBE Hauling Did Not Provide N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

21 | 570-1-2 | Sodding (Performance Turf) (Addendum #1) 50% | N/A Sod NA | NA N/A Did Not Provide 80% | N/A mcswmmOw Place | wya | naA N/A

22 || 700-20-12 | Single Post Sign, F&, 12-20 SF 86% | N/A Signs NA | NA N/A Did Not Provide 100% | N/A msam%omsﬂm,_ NA | NA N/A
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BID TABULATION
FOR
IFB #13-1272-DS

MANATEE COUNTY PROJECT NO. 6068711
LAP AGREEMENT (FINANCIAL ID NO. 428133-1-58-01)
NEAL PRESERVE TRAIL FROM CAUSEWAY PATH BOARDWALK

m—c :m:
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 120 CALENDAR DAYS

PREPARED BY: il Robunson, 8/8/13
(Project Management) Sherri Robinson, Assessment Coordinator Date
'

REVIEWED BY: §§ \\Wﬁ\»\\c J \ 29 \ /2
(Project Engineer) E\m\mﬁ >=ow~m\§o\:mm_iom, Engineering Specialist | ! pate
REVIEWED BY: @( \/Wx g-28-13
(Project Manager) Brian Martineau, Sr. Engineering Specialist Date
APPROVED BY: Onena. Sitns ofaia
(Purchasing) Donna Stevens, Contract Specialist ' Date
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