## MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT SOURCE SELECTION

Revised 3/15/2013

SUBJECT	Issuance of Notice of Intent to Award Force Main Replacement Project (1A, 2A and 16A) (IFB #12-2151-OV)	DATE POSTED	Date Posted on 3/15/13
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE	Olga Valcich, 749-3055	DATE CONTRACT SHALL BE AWARDED	Contingent upon the acceptance by the Board of County Commissioners
DEPARTMENT	Financial Management Dept., Purchasing Division	CONSEQUENCES IF DEFERRED	/
SOURCE RECOMMENDATION	Harris-McBurney Company, Tampa, FL	AUTHORIZED BY DATE	Melissa Wendel, CPPO Date

## **ACTION DESIRED**

Notice of Intent to award Invitation for Bid #12-2151-OV, Force Main Replacement Project (1A, 2A and 16A) to the lowest, responsive and responsible bidder, Harris-McBurney Company, Tampa, FL for a total base bid of \$1,496,211.00 (Option "B", 300 days).

## **ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY**

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.)

Manatee County Code of Law

## **BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION**

- The work consists of the construction of 10 inch, 12 inch, 14 inch and 16 inch sanitary sewer force mains, constructing two (2) new auger borings under 14<sup>th</sup> Street West (US41), and a replacement force main under Bowlees Creek. The work also includes the removal and replacement of existing public and private infrastructure necessary to construct the work and the restoring all public and private infrastructure impacted by the work. Replacement force mains will be installed by horizontal directional drilling (HDD) and open-cut construction methods according to the specifications.
- Background / discussion continued on page 2.

	ne award of Bid #12-2151-OV to Harris placement Project (1A, 2A and 16A).	s-McBurney Company for the
ATTACHMENTS: (List in order as attached)		
Revised Bid Tabulation		
		4146052280-534000-6052280- 0004:
		Funding Source: Utilities 2010A BABS Bonds and Utilities 2010B RZEDB Bonds:
		Funds: Verified
<b>COST</b> \$1,496,211.00	SOURCE (ACCT# & NAME)	
COMMENTS	AMT./FREQ. OF RECURRING COSTS (ATTACH FISCAL IMPACT	

■ *** - 1.00 + *** *** ** *** ** *** *** *** *** *	<ul> <li>In the control of the c</li></ul>
<ul> <li>TO SHALL SUPERATOR OF THE STREET WITH SALES AND STREET</li> </ul>	STATEMENT)
■ To a to the search of the Court of the Paris The Court of the Co	
In a second of the content of the co	
■ ************************************	

(IFB #12-2151-OV)
Force Main Replacement Project (1A, 2A and 16A)
March 1, 2013

- <u>December 4, 2012 to January 29, 2013</u> appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability was broadcast to DemandStar, mymanatee.org and the Chamber of Commerce.
- Five (5) bids were received: Below is a summary of the bids received:

Manatee County Firm(s)	Bid "A" (365 day completion	Bid "B" (300 day completion)
Westra Construction Palmetto, FL	\$1,856,249.30	No Bid
Duval County Firm(s) T B Landmark Construction Jacksonville, FL	\$1,671,454.02	\$1,671,454.02
Hillsborough County Firm(s) Harris-McBurney Company, Tampa, FL	\$1,496,211.00	\$1,496,211.00
Intercounty Engineering Plant City, FL	\$1,994,166.50	\$2,074,164.00
Palm Beach County Firm(s) Danella Utility Construction Boynton Beach, FL	\$1,584,139.00	\$1,584,139.00

- February 28, 2013 received a memorandum from Public Works Department recommending award to
  Harris-McBurney Company, located at 2120 North US Highway 301, Tampa, FL 33619: for a total base bid of
  \$1,496,211.00 with a 300 calendar day completion (Option "B").
- The funding source for this Agreement is Utilities 2010A BABS Bonds and Utilities 2010B RZEDB Bonds, (4146052280-534000-6052280-0004).

Force Main 1A, 2A and 16A Replacement Project Project No. 60522.80 Bid No. 12-2151-OV Bid Price "A" Bid Opening January 29, 2013

	DESCRIPTION (BID A)	UNITS	QTY.	Intercounty Engineering		Danella Utility Construction		TB Landmark Construction	
NO.				UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	Motifization - Demobilization	LB	1	125,350.00		158,000.00		129,103 00	129,103.00
2	FURNISH AND INSTALL PIPE	SSA		60 B 160					
*2A	10 Insh HDPE Pipe - HDD	LF	2370 (Adden.#3)	85.00	201,450.00	60.00	142,200,00	62,00	148,940.00
*28	10 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)	UF	510 (Adden#3)	67.00	34,170.00	110.00	56,100.00	125 00	
-2C	12 Inch HOPE Pipe - HOO	U	1080 (Adden.#3)	145 00	158,800.00	70.00	75,600.00	70.00	75,500.00
*20	12 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #Z)	UF	1145 (Addan.#3)	75.00	85,875.00	60.00	58,700.00	80,00	88,700.00
*2E	14 Inch HDPE Pipe - HDO	UF	965 (Adden.#3)	186.00	179,490.00	90.00		126.58	
*2F	14 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2) 18 Inch HDPE Pipe - HCO	UF	65 (Adden.#3)	127 00				247 83	
2G	18 Inch HDPE Pipe - HDD	UP	770 370 (Adden,#3)	158 00					
3	16 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2) Furnish and Instal Pipe Fittings - Ductile Iron	TON	4.98	11,375.00					
Ť	FURNISH AND INSTALL VALVES	1011	1.00	Name of the last	30,017.30	0,000.00	44,020.00	10,000.00	00,000
44	Furnish and Install 10 Inch Plug Valve	EA		2,740.00					
48	Furnish and install 12 Inch Plug Vetre	EA	2	3,757.00					
4C 4D	Furnish and Install 14 Inch Plug Velve	EA	1	4,444.00 5,789.00	13,332.00				
8	Furnish and Install 16 Inch Plug Velve FURNISH AND INSTALL FORCE MAIN CONNECTIONS	EA	-	3,769.00	3,769.00	5,500.00	5,800 00	4,466.00	1,400 0
SA	Furnish and Install Connections P3 1A	EA	1	12,782,00	12,782.00	4,000.00	4,000 00	6,235.00	6,235.0
58	Furnish and Install Connection PS 2A	EA	1	5,829.00		4,500.00	4,500.00	6,374.00	
5C	Furnish and Install Connections PS 16A	EA	1	9,234.00				6,235.00	
50	Furnish and Install Connections New Discharge Manhole	EA	1	11,669.00	11,669 00	25,000.00	25,000.00	6,361.00	8,3810
*6A	FURNISH AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER PIPE	1 =	40	115.00	4,500.00	300 00	12,000.00	260.51	10,420,4
7	Furnish and Install 24 Inoh PVC Pipe (Addendum 83) FURNISH AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER MANHOLE		200 107 2.25	113.00	4,000.00	30.00	12,000.00	200.01	10,420.4
*7A	Furnish and Install 5 Foot Diameter Turbulent Flow Mahole (Addendum #2)	LS		5,658.00	5,658.00	15,000.00	15,000 00	11,820.00	11,820.0
	FURNISH AND INSTALL AUGER BORING ROAD CROSSING			1 450 18					
*8A	Auger Bore 20" Casing w/10" Cerrier Pipe - Pearl Street At US 41 (Addendum #3)	U	142	678 00	95,992.00	550.00	78,100.00	413.00	58,848.0
- un	Auger Bore 30" Casing w/ 16" Carrier Pipe - 69th Avenue	-	-	0.000	-		10,100.00	710.00	-
*18	West at US 41 (Addendum #3)	LF	150	817 00					
9	FURNISH AND INSTALL AIR RELEASE ASSEMBLY	EA	10	6,427.00	64,270.00	2,500.00	25,000.00	6,508.00	65,080.0
10 10A	GROUT ABANDONED PIPELINES Grout and Abandon 10 Inch Force Main	LF	2.915	13.00	37,895.00	6.00	17,490.00	6 10	17.781.5
108	Grout and Abandon 12 Inch Force Main	Ü	2,050	20 00					
					Protest and the second			THE REAL PROPERTY.	10 ST ST 10 ST
*10C	Grout and Abandon 14 Inch Force Main (Addendum #3)	LF	2250 (Adden.#3)	24 00					
11	Demoition Force Main - Bowless Creek Crossing	LS	1	20,817.00	20,817.00	15,500.00	15,500.00	59,910.00	69,910.0
-12	Demolition of MH on 69th Avenue and By-Pase Pumping ( New Item / Addendum #3)	La		11,500 00	11 500 00	14,960.00	14,960,00	9,420.00	9,420.0
13	Trench Pevement Restoration	SY	2.458	81.00					
14	Pavement Restoration - Milling and Overley	BY	4,350	20.00					
15	Curb Restoration	UF	3,500	10.00	36,000.00	31.75	114,300.00	22.73	81,900.0
18	DRIVEWAY RESTORATION	-			1	17.0			2.625.5
18A 168	Drivewey Restoration - Concrete Drivewey Drivewey Restoration - Asphalt Drivewey	SY	58	45.00 25.00					
6C	Oriveway Restoration - Shall Driveway	SY	20	128 00					
50	Driveway Restoration - Stone Driveway	SY	20	347 00					
17	Sidewalk Restoration	SY	71	40.00					
18	DISCRETIONARY WORK	LB	1 1	160,000 00	160,000 00	160,000.00	160,000.00	150,000.00	160,000
	TOTAL BID PRICE "A"- Based On Completion Time of 365 (	Calendar	Days (Addendum		1,994,168.50		1,584,139.00		1,871,454
	Commments Ses Notes		-		Note 1				
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1		Service A. C.	Yes	- T. II.	Yes	The American	Yes	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 3			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio	n		Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Bid Bond Endersed	100		Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Sits Visit Confirmed			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Affidavit submitted if applicable			Yes		No		Yes	

Reviewed and Approved 1- 3/15/13 The 03/14/2013 alciel 3/15/13 PE/CH2M HILL

Force Main 1A, 2A and 16A Replacement Project Project No. 60522.89 Bid No. 12-2151-OV Bid Price "A" Bid Opening January 29, 2013

WO.	是 第11mm 内层数 (数据数据数据图 ) 医含氧矿物			restile-ence	Surney Company	THE BOY CO	natrueden Cerp.	
	DESCRIPTION (BID A)		QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE		
_			C1 11 15 19	(8)	(8)	(\$)	(\$)	
2	Mobilization - Demobilization	LS	1	130,166.40	130,166.40	185,000 00	185,000 0	
-	PURNISH AND INSTALL PIPE	_		1000				
ZA	10 Inch HOPE Pipe - HOO	LF	2370 (Adden.#3)	52.40	124,188 00	81.00	191,970.00	
78	10 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)	LF	510 (Adden#3)	69.20	35,292.00	74.00	37,740 0	
2C	12 Inch HOPE Pipe - HOO	LF	1080 (Adden,#3)	59.70	84,476.00	114 00	123,120.0	
20	12 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)	U	1145 (Adden #3)	83.00	95,035.00	82.00	93,890.0	
25	14 Inch HOPE Pipe - HOO	LF	985 (Adden.#3)	82.00	79,130.00	115.00	110,875.0	
2F	14 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)	LF	65 (Adden.#3)	159.00	10,335.00	130.00	8,450.0	
NG.	18 Inch HDPE Pipe - HDD	UF	770	101.00	77,770.00	144.00	110,880 0	
2H 3	16 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2) Furnish and Install Pipe Fittings - Ducible Iron	TON	370 (Adden.#3) 4 98	114.00	42,180.00 65,586.60	10,300,00	41,440 0 51,294 0	
i	FURNISH AND INSTALL VALVES	100	7.50	13,170.00	99,000 00	10,000 00	31,254.0	
44	Furnish and Install 10 Inch Plug Valve	EA	6	3,062.00				
48	Furnish and Install 12 Inch Plug Valve	EA	2	3,449.00	6,898.00	2,975,00	5,950.0	
C	Furnish and Install 14 Inch Plug Valve	EA	3	4,510.00	13,530.00	3,995.00	11,685 0	
8	Furnish and Install 16 Inch Plug Valve FURNISH AND INSTALL, FORCE MAIN CONNECTIONS	EA	-	5,466.00	5,488.00	4,675.00	4,575.0	
SA	Furnish and Install Connections PS 1A	EA	1	2,684.00	2,884.00	5,200.00	5,200.0	
58	Furnish and Install Connection PB 2A	EA	1	2,825.00	2,825.00	5,200.00	5,200 0	
SC .	Furnish and Install Connections PB 16A	EA	1	2,584 00	2,684.00	5,200.00		
SO.	Furnish and Install Connections New Discharge Manhole	EA	1	7,744.00	7,744.00	7,200.00	7,200 0	
-	FURNISH AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER PIPE	17	40	202.00	8,080.00	685.00	27 472	
MA.	Furnish and Install 24 Inch PVC Pipe (Addendum #3) FURNISH AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER MANHOLE	-	40	202,00	5,080.00	063.00	27,400.0	
-	Furnish and install 5 Foot Diameter Turbulent Flow Mahole					Maria Control		
TA	(Addendum #2)	LB	1	13,433.00	13,433.00	17,000.00	17,000.0	
		1	CARLEY.	-	The state of	0.00	ALC: N	
	FURNISH AND INSTALL AUGER BORING ROAD CROSSING	1				Total Co.	-	
M	Auger Bore 29" Casing writh" Carrier Pipe - Pearl Street At US 41 (Addendum 63)	UF	142	569 00	80,798.00	655.00	93,010 (	
-	Auger Bore 30" Casing w/ 16" Carrier Pipe - 68th Avenue	-	1-4	308.00	00,190.00	000.00	83,0101	
88	West at US 41 (Addendum #3)	LF	150	795.00	119,250.00	810.00	121,500.0	
9	FURNISH AND INSTALL AIR RELEASE ASSEMBLY	EA	10	3,255.00		3,500.00		
10	GROUT ABANDONED PIPELINES		1000	A PROPERTY.	The Delegation	W. Taran		
AD	Grout and Abandon 10 Inch Force Main	UF	2,915	5.60 7.00				
98	Grout and Abandon 12 Inch Force Main	UF	2,050	7.00	14,350.00	9 15	18,757	
100	Grout and Abandon 14 Inch Force Main (Addendum #3)	LF	2250 [Adden.#3]	9.00	20,250,00	9 00	20,250	
11	Grout and Abandon 14 Inch Force Main (Addendum #3) Demolition Force Main - Bowless Creek Crossing	LB	1	28,483.00				
	Demostion of MH on 89th Avenue and By-Pass Pumping (				In the latest was		Q DANGER OF THE PARTY OF THE PA	
12	New Item / Addendum #3)	LB	2,458	7,760.00	7,760.00			
13	Trench Perement Restoration	8Y 8Y	4,350	22.00	54,078.00 87,000.00	39 10		
15	Pavement Restoration - Milling and Overlay Curb Restoration	UF	3,600	16.00				
16	ORIVEWAY RESTORATION				Charles Co. L.	The second	WHITE STATE	
IGA .	Oriveway Restoration - Concrete Driveway	BY	50	85.00				
8B	Oriveway Restoration - Asphalt Oriveway Driveway Restoration - Shell Oriveway	SY	20	80.00 27.00				
5	Driveway Restoration - Stone Driveway	BY	20	38.00				
17	Sidewalk Restoration	BY	71	55 00				
18	DISCRETIONARY WORK	LS	1	160,000.00	160,000.00	150,000 00	160,000	
-	TOTAL BID PRICE "A"- Based On Completion Time of 365	Calendar	Days (Addendum	1023-0		and the life		
	(3)			1000	1,496,211.00		1,856,249.	
	Commments See Notes			12 m	1000		P. 10	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1	1	S. Charles C. L.C.	Yes	AND PARTIES.	Yes		
				Yes		Yes		
3	Acknowledged Addendum # 2			Yes		Yes		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3			W				
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes				
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes		Yes		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act	<b>31</b>				Yes Yes		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire Public Contractor & Environmental Crimes Certificatio	•		Yes Yes		Yes		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed	,		Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Vialt Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable			Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes		
-16	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed		Tagina L3	Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes		
-16	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Vialt Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable			Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes		
-16	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Viait Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable  sterialed Frice and Total Frice Corrected par Information To	Biginers #		Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes		
-16	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Viait Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable  sterialed Frice and Total Frice Corrected par Information To	Biginers #		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Visit Confirmed Afficient submitted if applicable  Interned Frinz and Total Enrice Correct and pair Information To Reviewed and Approved	Biginers #		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes	٦	Yes Yes		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Viait Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable  sterialed Frice and Total Frice Corrected par Information To	Biginers #		Yes Yes Yes	3	Yes Yes		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Visit Confirmed Afficient submitted if applicable  Interned Frinz and Total Enrice Correct and pair Information To Reviewed and Approved	Biginers #	wDate	Blisti	3	Yes Yes		
'roject	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Pulsic Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Viait Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable  stended Frice and Total Frice Corrected par Information To. Reviewed and Approved	Biginers #	wDate	Blisti	3	Yes Yes		
reject	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Visit Confirmed Afficient submitted if applicable  Interned Frinz and Total Enrice Correct and pair Information To Reviewed and Approved	Biginers #		Blisti	3	Yes Yes		
reject	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Pulsic Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Viait Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable  stended Frice and Total Frice Corrected par Information To. Reviewed and Approved	Biginers #	wDate	Blisti	·3	Yes Yes		
reject	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Pulsic Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Viait Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable  stended Frice and Total Frice Corrected par Information To. Reviewed and Approved	Biginers #	wDate	Blisti	3	Yes Yes		
reject	Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnairs Pulsic Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certificatio Bid Bond Enclosed Bits Viait Confirmed Affidant submitted if applicable  stended Frice and Total Frice Corrected par Information To. Reviewed and Approved	Biginers #	wDate	Blisti	3	Yes Yes		

Force Main 1A, 2A and 16A Replacement Project Project No. 60522.80 Bid No. 12-2161-OV Bid Price "B" Bid Opening January 29, 2013

	DESCRIPTION (BID B)	Toy Carlo		nty Engineering	Danella Utility Construction			sark Construction	
NO.		UNITS	QTY.	FL.	EXTENDED PRICE	Beech, FL	EXTENDED PRICE	FL.	EXTENDED PRICE
				(\$)	(9)	(\$)	(\$)	(6)	(\$)
1	Mobilization - Demobilization	LS	1	131,000.00	131,000.00	158,000 00	158,000.00	129,103 00	129,103.00
. 2	FURNISH AND INSTALL PIPE	-		-					
74	10 Inch HOPE Pipe - HOO	LF	2370 (Adden #3)	88.00	208,560,00	80.00	142,200 00	62 00	148,940.00
*28	10 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Out (Addendum #2)	U	2370 (Adden.#3) 510 (Adden#3)	70.00	35,700.00	110.00	56,100.00	125.00	83,750 00
			The State of the S	100)			Day of Section	3011713	
.3C	12 Insh HDPE Pipe - HDD	LF	1080 (Adden_£3)	150.00	162,000 00	70.00	75,500.00	70 00	75,800.00
*20	12 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)	UP	1145 (Adden #3)	80.00	91,600.00	80.00	68,700 00	80.00	68,700 00
*22	t2 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2) 14 Inch HDPE Pipe - HDD 14 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)	UF	1145 (Adden.#3) 966 (Adden.#3)	193.00	186,245.00	90.00	86,850.00	126 58	122,149 70
*F	14 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)	U	68 (Adden.#3)	132.00		235.00		247 83	16,108.95
2G '2H	18 Inch HDPE Pipe - HDQ 16 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2) Furnish and Install Pipe Fittings - Ductile Iron	UP	770 370 (Acklen, #3)	163.00		120 00	92,400.00 44,400.00	129.13	
1	Furnish and Install Pipe Fittings - Ductile Iron	TON	4.98	12,000 00			44,820.00		
4	FURNISH AND INSTALL VALVES	100	275/77882		THE RESERVE	en Strade	4 1 12 1		
48	Furnish and install 10 Inch Plug Valve	EA	6	2,850,00	17,100.00	2,420.00			
4C	Furnish and Install 12 Inch Plug Valve Furnish and Install 14 Inch Plug Valve Furnish and Install 16 Inch Plug Valve		1	3,900.00		2,600 00 4,350 00		3,550.00	
40	Furnish and Install 16 Inch Plug Valve	EA	1	8,000,00		5,600.00	5,500.00		
5	FURNISH AND INSTALL FORCE MAIN CONNECTIONS			A STATE OF	APPROVED TO	E IVE	THE REAL PROPERTY.		
5A	Furnish and Install Connections PS 1A	EA	1	13,300.00					
58	Furnish and Install Connection PS 2A	EA	1	6,000.00					
5C 5D	Furnish and Install Connections PS 16A Furnish and Install Connections New Discharge Manhola	EA EA	1	9,600.00					
8	FUNDABLY AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER PIPE	EA		12,140.00	12,140.00	25,000 00	25,000 00	6,381.00	6,341.0
	Furnish and lostell 34 look PMC Pine (Addendom 43)	LF	40	120.00	4,800.00	300.00	12,000.00	250.51	10,420.4
7	FURNISH AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER MANHOLE	1000		-	CHAPTER.		THE REAL PROPERTY.		-
	Furnish and install 5 Foot Diameter Turbulent Flow Mahole		100 to 100 less	THE PLAN			1 - X - 1 - X		Mark Sales
*7A	(Addendum RZ)	LB	1	5,890.00	5,890.00	15,000.00	15,000.00	11,820 00	11,820 0
	FURNISH AND INSTALL AUGER BORING ROAD CROSSING	12.72	1000	1					
-	Auger Bore 20" Casing w/10" Carrier Pipe - Pearl Street At				The second second				754 ANS - 755
AS"	US 41 (Addendum #3)	UF	142	704.00	99,968 00	550.00	78,100.00	413.00	58,646 00
	Auger Bore 30" Casing w/ 16" Carrier Pipe - 69th Avenue		7534C 104-12	100	John Visoration		Company and the same		INCO
'88	West at US 41 (Addendum #3)	LF.	150	850.00		600.00	90,000 00		
10	FURNISH AND INSTALL AIR RELEASE ASSEMBLY GROUT ABANDONED PEPELINES	EA	10	6,665.00	68,850 00	2,500 00	25,000.00	8,508.00	65,060.00
10A	Grout and Abendon 10 inch Force Make	U	2,015	15.00	43,725 00	6.00	17,490 00	6 10	17,781.5
108	Grout and Abandon 12 Inch Force Main	UF	2,050	21.00					
						C. W.	THE SHOW!		THE COUNTY
HOC	Growt and Abandon 14 Inch Force Main (Addendum #3)	UF	2250 (Adden.#3)						
11	Completion Force Main - Bowless Creek Crossing Completion of MR on 65th Average and By-Pass Pumping (	LS	1	21,650 00	21,650.00	15,500,00	15,500.00	69,910.00	69,910 0
*12	New Barn / Addendum #3)	LS		12,000 00	12,000.00	14,960.00	14,960.00	9,420 00	9,420 0
3	Trench Pevernent Restoration	SY	2,458	62.00					
14	Personent Restoration - Milling and Overlay	BY	4,350	21 00	91,350.00	16.00	69,600.00	12.60	54,810.0
15	Curb Restoration	U	3,500	11.00	39,500.00	31.75	114,300.00		81,900.0
18	DRIVEWAY RESTORATION					-			2,625.5
168 168	Oniversity Restoration - Concrete Oriversity Oniversity Restoration - Asphalt Disversity	SY	50	47.00 28.00		67.00 55.00			
60	Driveway Restoration - Shell Driveway	SY	20	133.00	2,660.00	40.00			
80	Driveway Restoration - Blone Driveway	SY	20	360.00					590.0
17	Gidewalk Restoration	Y3	71	42.00	-2,982.00	55.00			3,539.3
18	DISCRETIONARY WORK	LS	1 1	160,000.00	160,000.00	160,000.00	160,000.00	180,000.00	160,000.0
					_				_
	TOTAL BID PRICE "B"-Based On Completion Time of 300 ( 83)	Ziendar i	Days (Addendum		2,074,184.00		1,584,139.00		1,671,484.0
	Comments See Notes		Tella .						
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1		W. Halland	Yes	A STATE OF THE STA	Yes	LEIN LIN	Yes	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Adunowledged Addendum # 3			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Contractor's Questionnaire  Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Bid Bond Enclosed	Sec.		Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Site Visit Confirmed			Yes					
	Size Valid Continued								

es S. Brodbury, PE/CH2M HILL

Force Main 1A, 2A and 16A Replacement Project Project No. 50522.80 Bid No. 12-2151-OV Bid Price "B" Bid Opening January 29, 2013

		UNITS	6 6 G	Harris MoBur Tampa FL	ney Company	Westra Construction Corp.		
NO.			QTY.	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE				
1	Mobilization - Demobilization	LS	1	130,166.40	130,186.40		No Bid	
2	FURNISH AND INSTALL PIPE							
*2A	10 Inch HOPE Pipe - HDD	UF	2370 (Adden.#3)	52 40	174 188 00	No Rid	No Bid	
-28	10 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)	OF .	510 (Adden#3)	69.20	124,188 00 35,292 00	No Bid	No Bid	
			THE RESIDENCE OF THE PARTY OF T	SVENDER F		hite-Sales		
JC.	12 Inch HDPE Pipe - HDD	LF	1089 (Adden.#3)	59.70	64,478.00	No Bid	No Bid	
*20	12 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2)		1145 (Adden.#3)	83.00	95,035.00	No Old	No Bld	
*2E	14 Inch HOPE Pipe - HOO	U.	966 (Adden.#3)	82.00	79,130.00	No Bid	No Bld	
*25	14 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2) 16 Inch HDPE Pipe - HDO	LF	65 (Adden.#3)	159 00	10,335 00 77,770 00	No Bid	No 8ld	
2G	16 Inch HDPE Pipe - HDO	UF	770	101.00	77,770.00	No Bid	No Bid	
2H	16 Inch PVC Pipe - Open Cut (Addendum #2) Furnish and Install Pipe Fittings - Ductile Iron	TON	370 (Adden.#3) 4 98	13,170.00	42,190.00 65,586.60	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	
Ť	SE SPANSH AND INSTALL VALVES	TOR	100	13,170.00			Iveo Bio	
44	Brumish and Install 10 Inch Phys Value	EA	8	3,082.00	18,372.00 6,898.00 13,530.00 5,486.00	No Bid	No Bid	
48	Furnish and Install 12 Inch Plug Valve	EA	2	3,449.00	6,898.00	No Bid	No Bid	
4C 4D	Furnish and Install 14 Inch Plug Valve Furnish and Install 18 Inch Plug Valve	EA	3	4,510.00 5,466.00	13,530.00	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	
6	FURNISH AND INSTALL FORCE MAIN CONNECTIONS	50	<del></del>	5,400.00	3,400.00	LAD DET	Led Did	
ŠΑ	Furnish and Install Connections PS 1A	EA	1	2,554.00	2,684.00	No Bid	No Bid	
58	Furnish and Install Connection PS 2A	EA	1	2,825.00	2,825 00 2,584.00	No Bid	No Bid	
5C 5D	Furnish and Install Connections PS 16A Furnish and Install Connections New Discharge Manhole	EA		7,744 00	2,584.00	No Bid	No Bid No Bid	
6	FURNISH AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER PIPE	~	<del> </del>	7,74100	7,744 00	P40 040	II-40 DIG	
MA	Furnish and Install 24 Inch PVC Pipe (Addendum \$3) FURNISH AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER MANHOLE	UF	40	202,00	8,080.00	No Bid	No Bid	
7	FURNISH AND INSTALL GRAVITY SEWER MANHOLE					THE NAME	DAY STATE	
	Furnish and Install 5 Foot Diameter Turbulent Flow Mahole	1200			1000	500		
7A	(Addensture #2)	LS	1	13,433.00	13,433.00	No Bid	No Bid	
	FURNISH AND INSTALL AUGER BORING ROAD CROSSING							
	FURNISH AND INSTALL AUGER BORING ROAD CROSSING Auger Bors 20" Cashing will " Carrier Pipe - Paul Street At			ACTUAL DE		C VALUE	7 ESSENTABLE	
BA.	US 41 (Addendum #3)	LF	142	569.00	60,798.00	No Bid	No Bid	
180	Auger Bore 30" Casing wf 16" Carrier Pipe - 69th Avenue West at US 41 (Addendum 63)	LF	150	795 00	119,250.00	No Dec	No Bld	
9	FURNISH AND INSTALL AIR RELEASE ASSEMBLY	EA	10	3,255.00	32,550.00	No Bid	No Bid	
10	GROUT ABANDONED PIPELINES			THE REAL PROPERTY.	AL III DE LA COMP			
ADI	Grout and Abandon 10 Inch Force Mein	UF	2,915	5.60	16,324.00		No Bid	
108	Grout and Abandon 12 Inch Force Main	UF.	2,050	7.00	14,350.00	No Bid	No Bid	
10C	Grout and Abandon 14 Inoh Force Main (Addendum #3)	UF	2250 (Adden.#3)	9.00	20 250 00	No Bid	No Bld	
11	Campalitan Come Mala Doubers Count Conscion	LB	1	28,483.00	20,250 00 28,483 00	No Bid	No Bid	
	Demoition of Mit on 64th Avenue and By-Pass Pumping (			7850		The Real Property lies		
13	Pierw Rem / Addendum #3)	L8 8Y	2,458	7,760.00	7,750 00	No Bid	No Bid	
14	New Item / Addendum #3) Trench Pevement Restoration Pevement Restoration - Miling and Overlay	8Y	4,350	20.00	7,780 00 54,076 00 87,000 00 57,800 00	No Bid	No Bid	
15	Curb Restoration	UF	3,500	18.00	57,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	
18	DRIVEWAY RESTORATION							
16A 168	Onvewey Restoration - Concrete Driveway Driveway Restoration - Asphalt Driveway	SY	50 58	65.00	3,250.00	No Bid	No Bid	
C	Driveway Restoration - Shell Driveway	8Y	20	27.00	540.00	No Bid	No Bid	
5	Orivewey Restoration - Stone Drivewey	87	20	36.00	720.00	No Bid	No Bld	
17	Skidewalk Restoration	8Y	71	55.00	- 3,905.00		No Bld	
18	DISCRETIONARY WORK	La	1	160,000.00	160,000.00	No 5id	No Bid	
				-		_		
	TOTAL BID PRICE "B"- Based On Completion Time of 300 ( #3)	Zelendar I	Days (Addendum		1,494,211.00		No Bid	
-	Comminents See Notes	_		-		_		
-	Acknowledged Addendum # 1	-01-		Yes		N/A		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2			Yes		NA		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 3			Yes		NA		
	Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes		N/A N/A		
	Contractor's Questionnaire Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification	124		Yes		N/A		
				Yes		NA		
	Bid Bond Enclosed			Yes		NA		
	Site Visit Confirmed					N/A		
				Yes				
	Site Visit Confirmed Affidevit submitted if applicable			Yes	F - 18 40			
te 1 !	Site Visit Confirmed	Distance P	SLA rijegen	Yes				
to 1 5	Site Visit Confirmed Affidevit submitted if applicable	Signetu		Yes				
to 1 !	Site Visit Confirmed Afficient submitted if applicable attended Price and Typis Price Corrected per information To			Yes				
nto 1 2	Site Visit Confirmed Afficient submitted if applicable attended Price and Typis Price Corrected per information To		revDebs					
	Site Visit Confirmed Affident submitted if applicable  arended Price and Typis Price Correctate per triumables To  Reviewed and Approved			15/13				
	Site Visit Confirmed Afficient submitted if applicable attended Price and Typis Price Corrected per information To		revDebs					
	Site Visit Confirmed Affident submitted if applicable  arended Price and Typis Price Correctate per triumables To  Reviewed and Approved		revDebs					
rojec	Reviewed and Approved  Manager - Anthony Senior, P.E.  W.G. S.		revDebs					
rojec	Site Visit Confirmed Affident submitted if applicable  arended Price and Typis Price Correctate per triumables To  Reviewed and Approved		revDebs					
rojec	Reviewed and Approved  Manager - Anthony Senior, P.E.  W.G. S.		revDebs					