MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT
SOURCE SELECTION

Issuance of Notice of Intent to
Award Force Main Replacement
SUBJECT Proiect (1A, 2A and 16A) DATE posTEp Date Posted on § //,3/; 3
(IFB #12-2151-0V) : Mymanatee.org
' Contingent upon the acceptance
PURCHASING DATE CONTRACT by the Board of County
REPRESENTATIVE Olga Valcich, 749-3055 SHALL BE AWARDED Commissioners
Financial Management Dept., - CONSEQUENCES IF
DEPARTMENT Purchasing Division - DEFERRED
SOURCE Harris-McBurney Company, - AUTHORIZED BY i) end7l,/ o
RECOMMENDATION Tampa, FL DATE Date Z
ACTION DESIRED 5
)3

Notice of Intent to award Invitation for Bid #12-2151-OV, Force Main Replacement Project (1A, 2A and 16A) to the lowest,
responsive and responsible bidder, Harris-McBurney Company, Tampa, FL for a total base bid of $1,496,211.00 (Option

“B", 300 days)

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.)

Manatee County Code of Law

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

s The work consists of the construction of 10 mch{ 12 inch, 14 inch and 16 inch sanitary sewer force mains,
constructing two (2) new auger borings under 14" Street West (US41), and a replacement force main under
Bowlees Creek. The work also includes the removal and replacement of existing public and private infrastructure
necessary to construct the work and the restoring all public and private infrastructure impacted by the work.
Replacement force mains will be installed by horizontal directional drilling (HDD) and open-cut construction
methods according to the specifications.

® Background / discussion continued on page 2.

Recommend the award of Bid #12-2151-OV to Harris-McBurney Company for the
SUMMARY Force Main Replacement Project (1A, 2A and 16A).

ATTACHMENTS: (List in order as attached)
+ Bid Tabulation

4146052280-534000-6052280-
0004:

Funding Source: Utilities 2010A
BABS Bonds and Utilities 2010B
RZEDB Bonds:

Funds: Verified

COST $1,496,211.00 - SOURCE (ACCT#&NAME)

AMT./FREQ. OF RECURRING COSTS
(ATTACH FISCAL IMPACT
COMMENTS STATEMENT)




SOURCE SELECTION (continued) Page 2

(IFB #12-2151-0V)
Force Main Replacement Project (1A, 2A and 16A)
March 1, 2013

* December 4, 2012 to January 29, 2013 appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability was
broadcast to DemandStar, mymanatee.org and the Chamber of Commerce.

s Five (b) bids were received: Below is a summary of the bids received:

Manatee County Firm(s) Bid “A” (365 day completion Bid “B” (300 day completion)
Westra Construction
Palmetto, FL $1,856,249.30 No Bid

Duval County Firm(s)
T B Landmark Construction
Jacksonville, FL $1,671,454.02 $1,671,454.02

Hillsborough County Firm(s)
Harris-McBurney Company,
Tampa, FL $1,496,211.00 $1,496,211.00

Intercounty Engineering
Plant City, FL $1,994,166.50 $2,074,164.00

Palm Beach County Firm(s)
Danella Utility Construction $1,584,139.00 $1,584,139.00
Boynton Beach, FL

» February 28, 2013 received a memorandum from Public Works Department recommending award to
Harris-McBurney Company, located at 2120 North US Highway 301, Tampa, FL. 33619: for a total base bid of
$1.496,211.00 with a 300 calendar day completion (Option “B”).

* The funding source for this Agreement is Utilities 2010A BABS Bonds and Utilities 20108 RZEDB Bonds,
(4146052280-534000-6052280-0004).

S$:\Olga Valcich\PublicWorks. Proj. Mgmt\IFB#12-2151-OV.ForceMain [AWhitfield.6.25.2012\Source Selection 3.1.2013.ForceMain..docx



Force Main 1A, 24 and 18A Replacement Project
Project No. 8082280

Bid No. 1221510V
Bid Price "A™
Bid Opening January 29, 2013
':," DESCRIPTION (BID A) unrs | ary. iCE| EXTENDED
£ £ 1] PRICE (£} PRICE (¢ )] PRICE
() ($) ($)
1 [Mobidization-Demobilization LS 1 125.350.00 1 1 00 158.000. 129.103.00 129,103.00
2 Fumish and install Pipe
2A |10 iInch HDPE Pipe - HDD LF 2370 00 201,450.00 8000 142.200.00 8200 146 940,00
28 |10 inch HDPE Pipe - Dpen Cut LF 510 67.00 34.170.00 11000 56,100.00 125.00 63,750 00
2C |[10FPVC Pile - HDD LF 1080 14500 18860000] 7000 75,800.00 70.00 7560000
20 |10 Inch FPVC Pipe - Open Cut LF 1145 75.00 85875.00 60.00 700.00 50.00 68,700.00
2E |12 inch HDPE Pipe - HDD LF 965 186.00 179,480 O 90,00 86,850.00 26 58 122,148.70
2F 112 Inch HDPE Pipe - Open Cut LF a5 127.00 8,255 0 23500 1527500 24783 16,108 .95
2G |12 inch FPVC Pipe - HDD LF iy 156.00 12012000 120.00 6240000 29.12 9,430 10
2H  [12inch FPVC Pipe - Open Cut LF 3r0 98.00 36.260.00 12000 44 40000 98 2¢ 38,367 30
3 |Fumish and Install Pipe Fittings - Ductiskon | 'O | 4% | 447800 84750 | 8,000.00 saz2000 | 1888600 99268
4 Furmish and Install Valves
4A  [Fumiah and Install 10 inch Plug Vaive EA L] 2,740 00 15,440 00 242000 14 520.00 .310.00 13,860 00
48 |Fumish and Install 12 Inch Plug Vale EA 2 3.757.00 7,514, 2,600.00 $,200.00 580.00 5,380.00
4C  [Fumsh and Install 14 inch Plug Valve EA 3 4 444 00 1333200 4,350 00 13,050.00 550 00 10,850.00
4D  JFumish and Install 18 inch Plug Valve EA 1 5.789.00 5788 5,600.00 5 800.00 4 486.00 4 456.00
5  |Fumish and install Force Main Connections
SA  |Fumish and Install Connection PS 1A EA 1 12,782 00 127 4,000 00 400000] 823500 .
58 [Furrish and Install Connection PS 2A EA 1 829.00 5,828.00 4 500,00 4,500.00 6,374.00 ,374.00
5C  |Furmish and install Connection PS18A EA 1 9,234 00 9,234 00 4,00000 4,000.00 623500 235 00
Furmish and install Connection New Dicharge EA 1
50 [MH 11.666.00 11,666.00 § 2500000 000.00 5,381.00 5.381.00
6  [Fumish and install Gravity Sawer Pipe
8a  [Furrish and Install 24 Inch PVC pipe LF 40 11500 4 600.00 300 00 1 00 .51 10,420 40
7 |Fumish and Install Gravity Sewer Marhole
Funish and Install 5 Foot Diameter Turbulent LS 1
TA  |Flow Manhoia 5.658.00 00 15 00} 11 1 00
|Fumish an install Auger Boring Road
8 |Crossing
[Auger Bore 20 " Casing w/10" Carrier Pipe - LF 142
B8A  |Peari Street A1 US41 676.00 95992 00 55000 78,100.00 413.00 58646 00
|Auger Bore 30 “ Casing wiE" Camier Pipe - LF 150
88 Ave West st US41 817.00 122 550.00 600.00 $0,000.00 S00.00 7500000
9 Funmsn and Install Air Release Assembly EA 10 8. 427 .00 84.270.00 $00.00 000.00 6,508.00 65, .00
10 |Growt Abandoned Pipatines
10A  |Grout and Abandon 10 Inch Force Main LF 2015 13.00 37,885.00 .00 17.490.00 L10 17,781,650
108 and Abandon 12 Inch Force Main LF 2050 2000 41,000.00 00 18,400 00 B4 14022 00
10C and Abandon 14 Inch Foros Main LF 2250 2400 54,000 00 .00 20.250.00 -4 19.215.00
{Demalition Force Main - Bowless Croek L8 1
11 |Crossing 20817.00 20817.00 | 15.500.00 1550000 | 69.910.00 608.910.00
Demalition of MH on §9th Avenue and By-Pass L8 1
12 |Pumping 11,800.00 11,600.00 | 14,060 00 1496000 9.420.00 | 9.420.00
13 |Tranch Pavement Restoration sy 2458 61.00 148,938 00 2550 62,679.00 4385 107 783 30
14 [Pavement Restoration - Milling and Overlay L 2000 87.000.00 1800 69,600.00 1260 5481000
15 [Curb Restoration LF 3600 10.00 36.000.00 31.75 114 .00 2275 81,900.00
16  |Drivewsy Restoration
184  |Drveway Rastoration - Concrete Driveway sy 50 4500 250.00 67.00 3,350.00 5251 282550
168  |Driveway Restorstion - Asphalt Driveway §Y 58 2500 1,450.00 5500 3,190.00 11428 562824
16C  |Drivewsy Restoration - Sheil Driveway sY 20 128.00 .580.00 40.00 800.00 26.00 520.00
16D [|Driveway Restoration - Stone Drivewsy 8Y 20 347.00 5,840.00 70.00 1,400.00 29.50 58000
17 |Sicewalk Restoration SY 4} 4000 ,B40.00 | 55,00 3,805.00 | 4985) 353935
18  |Discretionary Work LS 1 160,000.00 160.000.00 | 160,000.00 160,000. 160,000.00 160,000 00
~p0} ; g1 ]
TOTAL PHICE: TS5 T88.50 1H§ TR0 |
—Commmants Ses Notes  LECKA
Acknowiedged Adgendum # 1 Yes Yes Yes
Adknowiedged Addendum ¥ 2 Yeos Yes Yas
Acknowiedged Addendum # 3 Yes Yes Yos
Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yeos Yes
Contractor's Questionnaine Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certfication Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bond Enciosed Yes Yes Yos
Yes Yos Yes
Yos No Yo
Arg) 2t 3

[
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Force Main 1A, 2A and 16A Replacement Project
Project No. 60522.80

Bid No. 12-2151-Qv

Bid Price "A”

Bid Opening January 29, 2013

Engincer - James S. Bradbury, mx‘um RM

Construction Buyer - Olga Valeleh /f (!// txtfc A

20f4

(y;:///j

oy DESCRIPTION (BID A) umrs | arv.
1 jmab ion-D LS 1
2 Furmnish and Install Pipo
2A |10 Inch HDPE Pipa - HOD LF 2370 52 40 124 188 00 B81.00 191,670.00 |
28 |10 Inch HDPE Pipe - Open Cut LF 510 69.20 35292 00 7400 37,740.00
2C |10FPVC Pie - HOD LF 1080 S8.70 B4 476.00 114.00 123,120.90
20 |10 inch FPVC Pipe - Open Cut LF 1145 83.00 9503500 82.00 93,890.00 |
2E |12 Inch HOPE Pipe - HDD LF 965 8200 78,130.00 115.00 110,875.00
2F |12 inch HDPE Pipe - Open Cut LF 65 159.00 10,335.00 130.00 8 450.00
2G |12 inch FPVC Pipe - HDD LF 770 101.00 77.770.00 144.00 110,880.00
2H  |12inch FPVC Fipa - Open Cut LF 3ro 114.00 180.00 112.00 41,440.00
3 [Fumish and Instal Pipe Fittings - Ductie kon | TON | 498
4 Fumish and Install Vaives
44 |Furrish and install 10 inch Plug Vaive EA 8
48 [Fumish and install 12 inch Plug Vale EA 2
4C  |Fumish and install 14 Inch Plug Valve EA 3 1
4D |Fumish and Install 16 inch Plug Valive EA 1
5 Furnish and Install Force Main Connections
5A  |Fumish and Install Connection PS 1A EA 1
58  |Furnsh and install Connection PS 2A EA 1
5C  |Fumish and install Connection PS16A EA 1
Fumish and install Connection New Dicharge
o ] :
6  [Fumish and Install Gravity Sewer Pipe
64  [Furnish and install 24 inch PVC pipe LF 40
7 [Fumish and Install Gravity Sewer Manhole
Funish and Install 5 Foot Diameter Turbulent LS 1
7A  |Fiow Manhole
Furrish and Install Auger Boring Road
8  |Crossing
|Auger Bora 20 " Casing w/10" Carmier Pipe - LE 142
A |Peari Street At US41
lAuger Bore 30 " Casing wi6" Carrier Pipe - LF 150
8B Ave '‘West at US41 795.00 11825000} 810 121,500.00
g Funish and Install Ar Reloase Assembly EA 10 3.2565.00 32 550.00 3.800.00 38 000 00
10  |Grout Abandoned Pipaines
104 and Abandon 10 Inch Force Man LF 2615 5.60 16,324 00 785 23.174.25
108  JGrout and Abandon 12 inch Force Man LF 2050 7.00 14,350.00 815 18,757 50
10C  |Grout and Abandon 14 inch Force Man LF 250 5.00 20.250.00 3.00 20,250 00 |
Demaiition Force Man - Bowless Creek LS 1
11 jCrossing 2848300 26,483.00 | 14.000.00 14,000.00
Demciiion of MH on 69th Averue and By-Pass s 1
12 [Pumping 7.780.00 7.780.00 6,800.00 6,800.00
13 |Trench Pevement Rastoration 8Y 2458 2200 54.076.00 38.10 96.107.80
14 |Pavement Restoration - Milling and Overiay BY =i p a0 2000 87,000.00 2025 087,50
15 |Curb Restoration LF 2600 16.00 57 27 50 9,000 00
16  |Drivewsy Restoration
18A Dnvmy Rmm Concrete Dnnu-y 14 50 8500 3,250.00 7500 3.750.00
168 jon - Aaphalt Dri 8Y 58 60.00 3,480.00 160.00 9.2680.00
16C Dmnm SMIDmMy 8sY 20 27.00 540,00 4210 B42 00
160 |Driverwary R - Stone Driveway sY 20 38.00 72000 4500 800.00
17 Restoration sY 7 55.00 3.805.00 4875 348125
18 F:::lty\’ht LS 1 160,000.00 1330.'?0.%_ 180.000.00 160,000 .00
000
L bii) TR
Yes Yes
Yes Yas
Yes Yos
Yos Yes
Yes Yes
Yes Yes
Yea Yes
Yas MNA
Yeas Yes
e - —
Wi d (2=

:ull%



Force Main 1A, 2A and 16A Replacoment Project

Project No. 60522.80
Bid No. 12-2151.0V
Bid Price "B” :
Bid Opening January 29, 2013
mﬁ DESCRIPTION (BID B) UNITS | QTY
1 Mobikration-Demobitzation Ls 1
2 Fumish and install Pipe
2A |10 inch HDPE Pipe - HDD LF 2370 B8.00 208.580.00 6000 142,200.00 200 146,940 00
28 |10 Inch HOPE Pipe - Open Cut LF 510 70.00 35,700 .00 110.00 56,100.00 126.00 63,750.00
2¢ [10FPVC Pile - HOD LF 1080 150.00 162,000 00 7000| 7560000 70.00 75,600.00
20 |10 inch FPVC Pipe - Opan Cut LF 1145 80.00 91,600.00 8000 68 700.00 6000 68,700.00
2E |12 Inch HDPE Pipe - HOD LF 985 183.00 186,245 00 2000 86,850 00 126 58 122,148 70
2F |12 inch HDPE Pipe - Open Cut LF 85 13200 858000 23500 1527500 247 83 16,108.85
2G |12 Inch FPVC Pipe - HDD LF 7o 163.00 125,510.00 12000 §2,400.00 128.13 99.430.10
2H  [12inch FPVC Pipe - Open Cut LF aro 102.00 37,740.00 12000 44 400.00 9825 363670
3 [Fuman anc instat Pps Fiings - Ductle von TON | 498 | 4500000 59.760.00 | 800000 4482000 | 18888 00 83,992 68
“urnish and  Install Valves
4A  [Furnish andt Install 10 inch Plug Valve EA 5 2,850.00 17,100 00 242000 14,520 00 2.310.00 13,860.00
48  [Furnish and Install 12 inch Plug Vale EA 2 3,600.00 780000 ] 260000 520000] 2660.00 ,380.00
4C  |Fumish and install 14 Inch Plug Vaive EA 3 4,600.00 13,800 00 4 350,00 13,050 00 3,550 00 10,650 00
40 |Furnish and install 16 Inch Plug Valve EA 1 5.000.00 000.00 600.00 560000 ] 448600 4,486 00
5§  |Fumnish and install Foros Main Connections
6A  |Fumish and install Connection PS 1A EA 1 13.300.00 1 4,000.00 4,000.00 6,235 00 623500
5B [Fumish and install Connection PS 2A EA 1 6,000.00 3,000.00 4,500 00 4 500 00 6,374 00 637400
5C  |Fumish and install Connaction PS16A EA 1 $.,600.00 800 00 4,000.00 4 000.00 6.235.00 623500
and Install A
28 “F\:'nﬁl Caonnection New Dicharpe 1
6  |Fumish and install Gravity Sewer Pipe
6A  [Fumish and Install 24 Inch PVC pipe. LF 40 | 120000 480000] 30000]  1200000] 26051] 1042040
7 Fumnish and install Gravity Sewer Manhole
b 1E B ) P I I
7A  [Flow Manhoks 890.00 15,000.00 11.820.00 11,620.00
[Fumish and install Auger Boring Road
8 {Crossing
|Auger Bore 20 " Casing w/10" Camer Pipe - LF 142
8A  |Peari Street At US41 704.00 95,968.00 550.00 78,100 00 413.00 58 646.00
JAuger Bore 30 ° Casing wi16” Camer Pipe - 3 150
88 Ave West at US41 850.00 127.500.00 50000 $0,000.00 500.00 75.000.00
9 unish and Install Air Reioase Assembly EA 10 6.685.00 850.00 500.00 000 00 6.508.00 65,080 00
10 |Grout Abandoned Pipaiines
10A and Abandon 10 inch Force Main LF 2815 15.00 72500 B.00 17,480.00 5.10 17.781.50 |
108 and Abandon 12 Inch Force Main LF 2050 21.00 43,050.00 8.00 16,400.00 B4 14022 00
10C and Abandon 14 Inch Force Main F 2250 250 56.250.00 9.00 20 .00 .54 19.215.00
DI'N_IM Force Main - Bowless Creek LS 1
1t |Crossing 21,650.00 21,850.00 ] 15.500.00 15500.00 § 65.910.00 66,810.00
[Demaiition of MH on 63 Avenue anc By-Pass LS 1
12 fPumping 12,000.00 1200000 | 14,96000 1496000] 942000] 942000
13 [Tranch Pavemant Restoration sy | 243 6200 152,356.00 2550 62679.00 4385 107,783.30
14 |Pavement Restoration - Miling and Overlay 3. 21.00 $1,350.00 16.00 69,600.00 12.80 5481000
16 |Curb Restoration LF 3800 11.00 38,600.00 31.75 114.300.00 2275 81,900 00
16  |Driveway Restoration
18A  [Drivewary Restoration - Concrets Driveway sY 50 A7.00 2,350.00 67.00 3,350.00 52 51 2,625 50
168  |Drivewsy Restoration - Asphalt Driveway 8Y 58 26.00 .S08.00 55.00 3,190.00 11428 6628 24
16C  |Driveway R - Shell Driveway 8sY 0 133.00 2,660.00 40.00 80000 2600 52000
16D  |Drivewsy Restoration - Stone Driveway 8Y 20 360.00 7,200.00 70.00 1,400.00 29.50 560 00 |
17 |Sidewak Restoration sY 4200 298200 55.00 3,905.00 49.85 3,539 35 |
18 |Discrationary Work Ls 160,000 00 19@6‘%’% 160,000 00 MJ%
TR TRTTAECRY]
Yes Ves Yos
Yeos Yos Yes
Yes Yas Yos
Yos Yeos Yeos
Yas Yes Yes
Yos Yes Yos
Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yeos
Yoo No Yos
per Information To :
Signature/Dete
. el
Project Manager - Antbony Benites, P.E. {?}/é"j—\ - 1’3:/‘1‘%
 a—— /*7 :
e -3 V4 P-4
Engiocer - Jumes $. Beadbury, PECHIM RILL < /i~ 7T/ 217 E
p T dad f ¢
Construction Buyer - Olga Valcich ﬁ( 1’{" iuza L'/( s %2// -?
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Forco Main 1A, 2A and 16A Replacement Project
Project No, 80822.80

Bid No. 12-2181-0V

Bid Price "B~

Bid Opening January 29, 2013

s DESCRIPTION (BID B) uNITS
1 [Mobiization-Demobiiization [X] 1 130, 1686.40 130,186.40 |No Bid No B
2 [Fumish and Install Pipe
2A |10 inch HDPE Pipe - HDD LF 2370 5240 124,188 00 Bid No Bid
28 |10 inch HDPE Pipe - Open Cut LF 510 68.20 35.282.00 Bid No Bid
2C |10 FPVC Pile - HOD LF 1080 5870 64,476 00 [No Bid No Bid
20 |10 inch FPVC Pipe - Open Cut LF 1145 83.00 95 035 00 Bid No Bid
26 |12 Inch HOPE Pipe - HDD LF 985 82 00 79,130.00 No Bid No Bid
2F |12 Inch HDPE Pipe - Open Cut LF 85 58.00 1033500 Bid No Bid
2G |12 Inch FPVC Pips - HDD LF 770 01.00 77,770.00 Bid No Bid
2H  |12inch FPVC Pipe - Open Cut LF 370 14.00 42 180.00 Bid No Bid
3 |Fumish and insiall Pipe Fitings - Ductieron | TON | 4% | 4347000 65,506 60 INo Bid__|No Bid
4 [Fumishand Install Vaives
4A  |Fumish and Install 10 inch Plug Valve EA 6 3,062.00 18 No Bid
48  [Fumish and Install 12 Inch Plug Vale EA 2 3,448.00 6.858.00 Bid No Bid
4AC  [Fumish and Install 14 inch Plug Vaive EA 3 451000 13,530 00 Bid No
4D [Fumish and Install 16 Inch Plug Vaive EA 1 5, 468.00 5 466.00 INo Bid No Bid
5 |Fumish and Install Force Main Connections
5A  [Fumish and Install Connection PS 1A EA 1 268400 268400 B No Bd
58 |Fumish and Install Connection PS 2A EA 1 2 82500 2,825.00 Bid No Bid
S5C |Fummsh and Install Connection PS18A EA 1 265400 2684 00 Bid No Bid
Fumsh and Install Connection New Dicharge EA 1
50 [MH T.744 7,744 00 Bid No Bid
6  |Fumish and Install Gravity Sewer Pipe
8A  [Fumish and Install 24 Inch PVC pipe LF 40 00 00 [No Bid No Bid
7 |Fumish and install Gravity Sewor Manhole
[Funsh and Instafl § Foot Diameter Tutulent Ls 3
7A  |Fiow Manhole 13.433.00 13.433 00 No Bid No Bid
IFumish and Install Auger Boring Road
8 |crossing
| Auger Bore 20 * Casing wi10” Carier Pipe - i 10
BA  |Peari Street Al US41 568.00 80,7986.00 Bid No Bid
|Auger Bore 30 * Casing wi18" Carrier Pipe - L 150
88 Ave West at US41 70500 119,250.00 INo Bid No Bid
9 [Furush and Install Air Release Assembly EA 10 3,255 00 .00 ; No B
10 |Grout Abandoned Pipeiines
10A  |Grout and Abandon 10 inch Force Main LF 2915 5,60 6,324.00 No Bid No Bid
108 |Grout and Abandon 12 Inch Foroa Main LF 2050 7.00 14
10C and Abandon 14 Inch Force Main LF 2250 8.00 20.250.00 B No
Demoltion Force Main - Bowless Creak LS 1
11 [Crossing 28,483.00 28,483 00 INo Bid No Bid
Demoltion of MH on 69th Avenue and By-Pass LS 5
12 |Pumping 7,760 00 7,760 00 INo Bid No Bid
13 |Trench Pavement Restoration Y 2458 22 00 54 076.00 Bid No Bid
14  |Pavement Restoration - Millng and Overiay L (e 2000 87.000.00 [NoBid____|No Bid
15  |Curd Restoration LF 3800 16.00 57 600.00 Bid No Bid
18 |Orivewsy Restoration
16A  |Driveway Restoration - Concreta Drivowey sY 50 85.00 3.250.00 Bid No Bid
1688  [Driveway R 1- Asphalt D sY 58 60.00 3,480.00 No B
16C  |Oriveway Restoration - Shell Driveway sy 20 27.00 540 00 Bid No Bid
160 R 1 - Stone Drh sY 0 3600 720.00 INo Bid No Bd
17 |Siewak Restoration sY 4 5500 300500 [NoBd___ [NoBd
18  |Discrationary Work LS 1 180,000 00 1 .00 Bid L
TR
Ves WA
Yes NA
Yos NA
Yos NA
Yes NiA
Yes NA
Yo NA
Yes NA
Yes VA
_— =
- b = 44 ‘26’/7
Engineer - Jamies S. Bradbury, PEACHIM HILL ‘/‘/“‘:7Q F 7" 7/
_r.'l. a F 4 = 1'
Coastruction Buyer - Olga Valcich (} -}/:;ibﬁ{&.. ;l‘?‘[ /»?




