
Section A LIGHT DUTY AUTOMOTIVE PARTS  



Group 1

STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1A1050 EXP TUBE (RED) FAD38635 10
1A1055 EXP TUBE (BLUE) FAD38621 5
1A1115 HEATER VALVE  FAD74661 12
1A1135 FAN SWITCH  FAD35702 6
1A1137 CONNECTOR PLUG FOR 35702 SWITCH 6
1A1140 FAN SWITCH KNOB  1276 AIR SOURCE 6
1A1145 EXP TUBE (WHITE) FAD38623 15
1A1221 OIL CHARGE R134 4ou 4
1A1225 A/C FLUSH 6545 CASTROL 32ou. 6
1A1240 PAG OIL 8ou. 48
1A1275 DASH FAN 12V HD W/SW F320012 6
1A1276 DASH FAN 24V HD W/SW F300024 4
1A1405 CONDENSER FAN 3670 HAYDEN 10
1A1500 A/C COMP 15-20447 DELCO 4
1A1505 ACCUMULATOR 15-31070 DELCO 4
1A1510 A/C HI PRESS SW 15-5687 4
1A1520 A/C COMP 20-46120/010194/58616A 4
1A1525 A/C CYCLE SWITCH 15035084 4
1R2400 A/C COMP 010562/58704 4
1R2300 DRIER, 540192/08853900 PARKER 12
1R2410 EXP BLOCK FAD440030 4
1R2420 DRIER, FAD540021 4
1R2425 EXP BLOCK FAD440022 4
1R2450 A/C COMP SANDEN 4417/SK14417 4

A/C PARTS (A,1)



LIGHT DUTY BRAKE (A,2)
DO NOT CHARGE CORE DEPOSIT

CORES WILL BE RETURNED UPON ORDER
PREMIUM PADS ONLY

PREFER BENDIX/WAGNER/AC DELCO
BRANDS

STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1B1065 SHOES RAF452 BENDIX 5
1B1070 PADS MKD149 4
1B1075 SHOES RAF357 2
1B1080 SHOES RAF358 4
1B1085 SHOES RAF583 3
1B1095 ROTORS BD125471 WAGNER/18A874 AC DELCO 6
1B1100 DRUMS BD60885 WAGNER 4
1B1105 DRUMS 140613 BENDIX 10
1B1140 HARDWARE KIT H7299 2
1B1145 HARDWARE KIT H7181 2
1B1150 HARDWARE KIT H2598 2
1B1155 HARDWARE KIT H2599 2
1B1160 HARDWARE KIT H7046 5
1B1165 HARDWARE KIT H7055 5
1B1170 HARDWARE KIT H2588 4
1B1175 HARDWARE KIT H2589 4
1B1166 HARDWARE KIT H7208 2
1B1167 HARDWARE KIT H7324 2
1B1168 HARDWARE KIT H7411 2
1B1172 HARDWARE KIT H2586 2
1B1173 HARDWARE KIT H2587 2
1B1170 HARDWARE KIT H2588 4
1B1175 HARDWARE KIT H2589 4
1B1180 HARDWARE KIT H2594 2
1B1181 HARDWARE KIT H2595 2
1B1185 HARDWARE KIT H2643 2
1B1186 HARDWARE KIT H2644 2
1B1190 HARDWARE KIT H2685 2
1B1191 HARDWARE KIT H2686 2



1B1305 BRAKE FLUID QUARTS DOT3 60
1B1310 BRAKE FLUID GALLON DOT3 12
1B1340 SHOES RAF263 BENDIX 2
1B1345 PADS MKD154 1
1B1347 PADS MKD184HD 30
1B1350 PADS MKD86 6
1B1365 PADS MKD369 2
1B1366 PADS MKD450FM 2
1B1367 PADS MKD459 20
1B1370 PADS MKD411SM 6
1B1391 PADS MKD477 2
1B1400 PADS MKD632 4
1B1401 PADS MKD652 4
1B1402 PADS MKD655FM 12
1B1406 PADS MKD667 4
1B1411 PADS MKD679 10
1B1415 PADS MKD702 4
1B1420 PADS MKD711 6
1B1425 SHOES RAF723 4
1B1430 PADS MKD758 10
1B1475 CABLE GUIDE H2093 2
1B1440 PADS MKD821 6
1B1445 PADS MKD784 4
1B1450 PADS MKD785 4
1B1455 PADS PD792 WAGNER 2
1B1460 PADS PD795 2
1B1465 PADS PD794 2
1B1470 PADS SX975 2
1B1435 PADS MX802 2
1B1480 PADS PD974 2
1B1485 PADS MX1012 2
1B1490 PADS MX1083 2
1B1495 PADS MX1068 2
1B1500 PADS MX1069 2
1B1505 PADS PD1039 2



ELECTRICAL (A,3)
STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1D1100 BATTERY HOLD DOWN 111702 CHAMP 6
1D1105 BATTERY HOLD DOWN BOLT 737505 POWERPATH 10
1E1110 RELAY 1252 AIR SOURCE 30AMP 10
1E1115 RELAY 1250 AIR SOURCE 40AMP 6
1E1145 SOLENOID 24059 COLE HERSEE 4
1E1150 SOLENOID 24106 COLE HERSEE 2
1E1175 BATTERY SHUT OFF SW 2484 COLE HERSEE 3
1Z1385 RELAY 11-3004 TRUCK AIR PARTS 24V 4
1E1300 FUSE HOLDER 30AMP HD GLASS TYPE 6
1E1305 FUSE HOLDER WATERPROOF BUSS  HHG 20
1E1310 FUSE HOLDER HD BUSS HHD 6
1E1320 TRAILER CONNECTOR 1257 COLE HERSEE 6
1E1325 TRAILER CONNECTOR 1253 COLE HERSEE 6
1E1330 TRAILER CONNECTOR 1235 COLE HERSEE 6
1E1335 TRAILER CONNECTOR 1254 COLE HERSEE 6
1E1340 TRAILER CONNECTOR 11134 COLE HERSEE 4
1E1350 TRAILER CONNECTOR 1255 COLE HERSEE 60
1E1355 TRAILER CONNECTOR 12063 COLE HERSEE 60
1E1378 WIRE LOOM 1/4"  100 FT BOX 1
1E1379 WIRE LOOM 3/8"  100 FT BOX 1
1E1380 WIRE LOOM 1/2"  100 FT BOX 1
1E1381 WIRE LOOM 3/4"  100 FT BOX 1
1E1445 BACK UP ALARM 60-102 STAR 15
1E1700 TRAILER CONNECTOR TC107F BW (RV STYLE) 12
1E1705 TRAILER CONNECTOR TC107M BW (RV STYLE) 12
1E1710 TRAILER CONN BRACKET 11165 COLE HERSEE 6
1I1220 HORN, UNIVERSAL 12V HI NOTE 6
1I1225 HORN, UNIVERSAL 12V LO NOTE 6
1I1230 PUSH BUTTON STARTER SW SSB82 2
1I1265 TOGGLE SWITCH HD 2 POLE S740 BW 10
1L1170 FLASHER HD 12V 262 SIGNAL STAT (ROUND ONLY) 20
1X1400 TARP MOTOR 61L DONOVAN 4
1X1405 TARP MOTOR SWITCH 90005-1 COLE HERSEE 4



BELTS / GATES BRAND ONLY                     
NO SUBSTITUTES (A,4)

STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1G1005 BELT, K061120 GATES 2
1G1010 BELT, K061130 GATES 15
1G1025 BELT, K120606 GATES/3883491 CUMMINS 2
1G1030 BELT, K100610 GATES/3097269 CUMMINS 32
1G1080 BELT, 7350 GATES 2
1G1250 BELT, 9412 GATES 2
1G1256 BELT, 9420 4
1G1262 BELT, 9425 6
1G1263 BELT, 9430 4
1G1267 BELT, 9451 10
1G1273 BELT, 9485 10
1G1325 BELT, 9620 6
1G1420 BELT, K060923 2
1G1430 BELT, K060930 8
1G1450 BELT, K060950 4
1G1460 BELT, K060960 6
1G1490 BELT, K060990 4
1G1825 BELT, K080825 6
1G1900 BELT, K080839 6
1G2020 BELT, K081124 4
1G2060 BELT, K081196 8
1G2090 BELT, K080733 GATES/3289536 CUMMINS 24
1G2095 BELT, K081207 2
1G2007 BELT, K061187 2
1G2115 BELT, 6857 2
1G2125 BELT, 6858 2
1G1905 BELT, K060551 2
1G1410 BELT, K040378 2
1G1910 BELT, K060915 2
1G1950 BELT, K060997 2
1G1965 BELT, K061025 2
1G1990 BELT, K061195 2



HOSE (A,5)
STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1H1010 HOSE, 1" SILICONE 50' ROLL 26254 GATES 1
1H2180 HOSE, 1/8" FUEL  50' ROLL  27000 GATES 1
1H2185 HOSE, 7/64 VAC  50' ROLL 27041 GATES 1
1H2190 HOSE, 1/4" FUEL  50' ROLL 27022 GATES 1
1H2195 HOSE, 5/16" FUEL 50' ROLL 27023 GATES 1
1H2200 HOSE, 3/8" FUEL 50' ROLL 27024 GATES 1
1H2205 HOSE, 5/32" VAC 50' ROLL 27042 GATES 1
1H2210 HOSE, 1/2" MULTI USE 50' ROLL 27411 GATES 1
1H2215 HOSE, 5/8"MULTI USE 50' ROLL 27415 GATES 1
1H2220 HOSE, 3/4" MULTI USE 50' ROLL 27419 GATES 1
1H2225 HOSE, 3/8" POWER STEER 50' ROLL 1
1H2235 HOSE, 1/2" HEATER  50' ROLL 65020 GOODYEAR 1
1H2240 HOSE, 5/8" HEATER 50' ROLL 65023 GOODYEAR 1
1H2245 HOSE, 3/4" HEATER 50' ROLL 65026 GOODYEAR 1
1H2250 HOSE, 5/8" SILICONE 25' ROLL 1
1H2255 HOSE, 34" SILICONE 25' ROLL 26242 GATES 1



HOSE CLAMPS (A,6)
STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1H2340 CLAMPS, 6202 100
1H2345 CLAMPS, 6203 100
1H2350 CLAMPS, 5012 50
1H2355 CLAMPS, 5016 100
1H2360 CLAMPS, 5024 80
1H2365 CLAMPS, 5028 50
1H2370 CLAMPS, 5032 40
1H2375 CLAMPS, 5036 30
1H2380 CLAMPS, 5040 30
1H2385 CLAMPS, 5048 30
1H2390 CLAMPS, 5056 30
1H2395 CLAMPS, 32072 20
1H2400 CLAMPS, 32104 20



CAPS (A,7)
STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1J1045 FUEL CAP 31748 GATES 2
1J1055 RADIATOR CAP 31527 GATES 4
1J1060 RADIATOR CAP 31526 GATES 6
1J1070 RADIATOR CAP 31528 GATES 10
1J1125 THERMOSTAT 33009 GATES 4
1J1145 THERMOSTAT 33509 GATES 4
1J1147 THERMOSTAT 33909 6
1J1149 ORING FOR 33909 RG581/F4TZ8255A 6
1J1150 GASKET 33624 GATES 4
1J1155 GASKET 33633 GATES 4
1J1160 GASKET 33635 GATES 10
1J1194 THERMOSTAT 33963 GATES 2
1J1176 THERMOSTAT 33469 GATES 2
1J1182 THERMOSTAT 33946 GATES 2
1J1186 THERMOSTAT 33947 GATES 2
1J1072 RADIATOR CAP 31532 GATES 2
1J1076 RADIATOR CAP 31406 2



CHEMICALS (A,8)
MUST SUPPLY MSDS SHEETS

STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1X1205 MUD FLAP 24"X36" PLAIN BLACK RUBBER 48
1N1015 ACID CORE SOLDER 1LB 07302 CARQUEST 2
1N1020 ROSIN CORE SOLDER 1LB 07309 CARQUEST 6
1N1025 FORMA GASKET 2C PERMATEX 8
1N1030 WEATHERSTRIP ADH 80 PERMATEX 14
1N1035 RED SILICONE 27BR PERMATEX 10
1N1040 CLEAR SILICONE 66B PERMATEX 20
1N1045 BLUE SILICONE 6B PERMATEX 4
1N1047 BLACK SILICONE 16B PERMATEX 35
1N1055 WD40 12OU  NO SUBSTITUTE 180
1N1056 PB BLASTER 16PB NO SUBSTITUTE 100
1N1065 SEAFOAM SF16 NO SUBSTITUTE 730
1N1075 BATTERY CLEANER 05023 CRC 40
1N1080 BATTERY PROTECTOR 7.5 OU SPRAY 30
1N1085 CARB CLEANER, M48-14 24
1N1095 BELT DRESSING M2-16 6
1N1100 ELECTRA MOTIVE CRC 5018 24
1N1105 BRAKE CLEAN NON CHLORINATED 14OU 100
1N1110 DISC BRAKE QUIET SPRAY 127MA PERMATEX 6
1N1115 ARMORALL PROTECTOR 10OU NO SUBSTITUTE 60
1N1120 POWER STEERING FLUID 12 OU 48
1N1125 TURTLE WAX PASTE T222 36
1N1127 BUGS BE GONE  BBG-1  16OU 24
1N1135 NEVER SIEZE 133K PERMATEX 4
1N1140 LOCTITE RED THREADLOCKER 27140 PERMATEX 6
1N1145 SILICONE SPRAY 05074 CRC 6
1N1155 ELECTRICAL TAPE 24
1N1160 TEFLON TAPE 20
1N1165 WINDOW WASH CONCENTRATE 16OU M5-16 1400
1N1170 FIRE EXTINGUISHER 5LB A:B:C W/MTG BRACKET 94
1N1175 SPRAY WHITE GREASE 14OU 72
1N1180 WHITE LITHIUM GREASE 1LB TUB 6
1N1190 SPRAY PAINT WHITE GLOSS 11OU 6



1N1195 SPRAY PAINT BLACK GLOSS 11OU 12
1N1204 SPRAY PAINT CATERPILLAR YELLOW 11OU 6
1N1210 REARVIEW MIRROR ADHESIVE 81844 PERMATEX 50
1N1215 LOCKTITE BLUE THREADLOCKER 27240 PERMATX 4
1N1220 PIPE JOINT COMPOUND 80044 PERMATEX 4OU 6
1N1230 HYDRO BLAST C2027 CASTLE 12



GROUP TWO

HEAVY DUTY TRUCK 
PARTS (B,1)



SEALS/BEARINGS                                           
BRAND SPECIFIC

STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1S1005 STEMCO CAP 343-4080 16
1S1007 CR CAP 1608 8
1S1010 NATIONAL 4160 NO SUBSTITUTES 8
1S1012 CR CAP 1612 4
1S1018 NATIONAL 380001A NO SUBSTITUE 4
1S1020 NATIONAL 380003A NO SUBSTITUTE 4
1S1024 NATIONAL 380023A NO SUBSTITUE 4
1S1030 CR 40086 NO SUBSTITUTE 10
1S1035 NATIONAL 370195A NO SUBSTITUTE 30
1S1040 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 203FF 30
1S1055 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 552A 6
1S1060 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 557S 6
1S1075 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 653 4
1S1080 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 663 4
1S1095 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 6320 6
1S1100 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 6389 6
1S1105 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 6535 2
1S1110 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 6580 2
1S1125 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 15101 4
1S1130 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 15245 2
1S1164 STEMCO PLUG 359-6125 20
1S1165 STEMCO CAP 340-4009 10
1S1169 STEMCO PLUG KIT 359-5995 2
1S1170 STEMCO PLUG KIT 359-5999 2
1S1177 NATIONAL 4740 NO SUBSTITUTE 8
1S1195 NATIONAL 4148 NO SUBSTITUTE 2
1S1235 NATIONAL 9864S NO SUBSTITUTE 8
1S1240 NATIONAL 370150A NO SUBSTITUTE 12
1S1245 CR 34387 NO SUBSTITUTE 12
1S1260 SEAL, 469694 AC DELCO NO SUBSTITUTE 8
1S1265 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 387AS 6
1S1270 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 382A 6
1S1272 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 3982 10
1S1273 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 3920 10



1S1275 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 15103S 8
1S1280 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 15243 4
1S1282 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 25820 4
1S1283 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 25877 4
1S1287 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 33287 9
1S1288 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 33462 9
1S1295 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY LM102910 4
1S1300 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY LM102949 4
1S1310 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY LM104911 4
1S1315 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY LM104949 4
1S1317 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY JLM207010 6
1S1318 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY JLM207049A 6
1S1320 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY LM501310 4
1S1325 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY LM501349 4



AXLE GASKETS/HUBODOMETER/BRAKE TUBING
STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1W1068 GASKET STEMCO 3009 4
1W1070 GASKET STEMCO 330-3036 10
1W1071 GASKET EUCLID E2431 10
1W1072 GASKET ROCKWELL 2208J426 16
1W1075 GASKET STEMCO 3060 4
1W1077 GASKET STEMCO 330-3091 14
1W1078 GASKET N8092/FREIGHTLINER 11-14418-000 6
1X1150 GASKET FELPRO 55328 6
1X1155 GASKET FELPRO 55350 6
1H0012 AIR BRAKE TUBING, 1/2" (100' ROLL)PRICE PER FOOT 1
1H0014 AIR BRAKE TUBING, 1/4" (100' ROLL)PRICE PER FOOT 1
1H0038 AIR BRAKE TUBING, 3/8" (100' ROLL)PRICE PER FOOT 1
1W1200 HUBODOMETER, 600-9999 STEMCO 12



HEAVY DUTY BRAKES
STOCK NUMBER DESCRIPTION EST. USEAGE
1B1010 GOVENOR 275491 BENDIX 8
1B1050 DRIER ELEMENT 107794X BENDIX 75
1B1052 AD-9 PURGE VALVE 800405 BENDIX 6
1B1055 BRAKE CHAMBER, 36/36 6
1B1056 DRIER R950011 15
1B1120 DRUMS 64117 WEBB 26
1B1125 DRUMS 64115 WEBB 48
1B1240 HARDWARE KIT 6004 MERITOR 30
1B1245 SPRINGS 2258J400  MERITOR 48
1B1255 ROLLERS, 1779U593 MERITOR 100
1B1520 FOOT VALVE 286171 BENDIX 4
1B1900 CALIPER 7802 US BRAKE (STEEL PISTON ONLY) 10
1B1910 ROTOR D6176M GUNITE 14
1B2010 HEIGHT CONTROL VALVE 90054007 NEWAY 32
1B2050 HARWARE KIT KIT8824HD 48

1B2110
DRUM 3754X GUNITE***MUST TURN DRUM 
BEFORE DELIVERY 12

1B2111 MACHINE CHARGE TO TURN 3754X DRUM 12
1B2120 SHOES, 4703  SET OF (4) "GG" LINING 10
1B2130 SHOES, 4704  SET OF (4) "GG" LINING 10
1B2135 DRUM 61510B 16
1B2150 SHOES, 4702  SET OF (4)  "EX" LINING 6
1B2155 SHOES, 4707Q SET OF (4)  "EX" LINING 6
1B2160 DRUM 65545B 14
1B2165 DRUM 66884B 12
1B2180 HARWARE 4515QHD 12

  



     



UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE
$0.00 $2.26 $22.60 $1.71 $17.10 $1.03 $10.30 $0.00 $1.03 $10.30
$0.00 $2.26 $11.30 $1.71 $8.55 $1.03 $5.15 $0.00 $1.03 $5.15
$0.00 $29.91 $358.92 $14.20 $170.40 $31.49 $377.88 $0.00 $29.51 $354.12
$0.00 $7.92 $47.52 $7.11 $42.66 $2.49 $14.94 $0.00 $3.97 $23.82
$0.00 $4.95 $29.70 $5.94 $35.64 $3.99 $23.94 $0.00 $6.18 $37.08
$0.00 $2.24 $13.44 $2.62 $15.72 $3.49 $20.94 $0.00 $0.99 $5.94
$0.00 $2.26 $33.90 $1.71 $25.65 $1.03 $15.45 $0.00 $1.03 $15.45
$0.00 $5.36 $21.44 $8.23 $32.92 $4.99 $19.96 $0.00 $3.77 $15.08
$0.00 $25.65 $153.90 $35.00 $210.00 $12.82 $76.92 $0.00 $8.37 $50.22
$0.00 $12.15 $583.20 $8.14 $390.72 $6.44 $309.12 $0.00 $5.97 $286.56
$0.00 $52.75 $316.50 $24.33 $145.98 $34.95 $209.70 $0.00 $39.66 $237.96
$0.00 $62.89 $251.56 $24.92 $99.68 $39.95 $159.80 $0.00 $64.67 $258.68
$0.00 $64.70 $647.00 $108.00 $1,080.00 $25.71 $257.10 $0.00 $32.47 $324.70
$0.00 $312.00 $1,248.00 $189.28 $757.12 $316.76 $1,267.04 $0.00 $283.10 $1,132.40
$0.00 $43.38 $173.52 $25.91 $103.64 $46.91 $187.64 $0.00 $17.47 $69.88
$0.00 $14.04 $56.16 $10.50 $42.00 $15.99 $63.96 $0.00 $13.77 $55.08
$0.00 $279.64 $1,118.56 $160.00 $640.00 $218.07 $872.28 $0.00 $218.08 $872.32
$0.00 $8.95 $35.80 $13.33 $53.32 $16.19 $64.76 $0.00 $8.07 $32.28
$0.00 $275.00 $1,100.00 $321.62 $1,286.48 $209.37 $837.48 $0.00 $201.89 $807.56
$0.00 $32.79 $393.48 $0.00 $0.00 $11.28 $135.36 $0.00 $10.88 $130.56
$0.00 $25.00 $100.00 $22.66 $90.64 $16.47 $65.88 $0.00 $15.85 $63.40
$0.00 $12.00 $48.00 $14.86 $59.44 $9.74 $38.96 $0.00 $9.40 $37.60
$0.00 $25.00 $100.00 $21.76 $87.04 $16.66 $66.64 $0.00 $16.01 $64.04
$0.00 $227.85 $911.40 $0.00 $0.00 $238.95 $955.80 $0.00 $239.71 $958.84

No Bid $7,775.90 Note-No Bids $5,394.70 $6,057.00 NO BID $5,849.02

SUNSPARTS PROPARDOSNORTHSIDENAPAFLEET PRODUCTS
  

FLEET PRIDE



$0.00 $61.69 $308.45 $40.13 $200.65 $46.44 $232.20 $0.00 $91.56 $457.80 $70.45
$0.00 $26.98 $107.92 $36.77 $147.08 $41.08 $164.32 $0.00 $42.36 $169.44 $32.15
$0.00 $35.02 $70.04 $38.13 $76.26 $27.44 $54.88 $0.00 $51.65 $103.30 $40.01
$0.00 $37.15 $148.60 $31.18 $124.72 $35.13 $140.52 $0.00 $55.77 $223.08 $42.44
$0.00 $44.96 $134.88 $37.96 $113.88 $30.37 $91.11 $0.00 $58.59 $175.77 $51.35
$0.00 $126.61 $759.66 $114.65 $687.90 $63.54 $381.24 $0.00 $211.25 $1,267.50 $156.24
$0.00 $57.25 $229.00 $67.89 $271.56 $57.62 $230.48 $0.00 $61.38 $245.52 $90.25
$0.00 $75.85 $758.50 $107.38 $1,073.80 $94.52 $945.20 $0.00 $95.15 $951.50 $113.59
$0.00 $7.99 $15.98 $14.42 $28.84 $8.83 $17.66 $0.00 $9.40 $18.80 $9.04
$0.00 $7.17 $14.34 $9.34 $18.68 $9.00 $18.00 $0.00 $10.56 $21.12 $11.48
$0.00 $9.49 $18.98 $12.85 $25.70 $20.58 $41.16 $0.00 $17.39 $34.78 $18.89
$0.00 $9.49 $18.98 $12.85 $25.70 $19.95 $39.90 $0.00 $17.39 $34.78 $18.10
$0.00 $6.39 $31.95 $6.09 $30.45 $6.24 $31.20 $0.00 $6.86 $34.30 $7.28
$0.00 $6.97 $34.85 $6.09 $30.45 $6.24 $31.20 $0.00 $7.43 $37.15 $8.08
$0.00 $15.95 $63.80 $15.35 $61.40 $15.21 $60.84 $0.00 $14.01 $56.04 $15.23
$0.00 $15.95 $63.80 $15.35 $61.40 $15.21 $60.84 $0.00 $14.01 $56.04 $15.21
$0.00 $13.50 $27.00 $10.05 $20.10 $6.67 $13.34 $0.00 $6.71 $13.42 $7.20
$0.00 $9.88 $19.76 $8.59 $17.18 $8.83 $17.66 $0.00 $11.02 $22.04 $11.85
$0.00 $5.82 $11.64 $6.76 $13.52 $6.95 $13.90 $0.00 $8.48 $16.96 $9.00
$0.00 $11.74 $23.48 $10.85 $21.70 $13.26 $26.52 $0.00 $11.61 $23.22 $12.60
$0.00 $8.86 $17.72 $14.37 $28.74 $11.48 $22.96 $0.00 $11.61 $23.22 $12.60
$0.00 $15.95 $63.80 $22.00 $88.00 $15.21 $60.84 $0.00 $14.01 $56.04 $15.23
$0.00 $15.95 $63.80 $22.00 $88.00 $15.21 $60.84 $0.00 $14.01 $56.04 $15.21
$0.00 $7.73 $15.46 $10.09 $20.18 $11.48 $22.96 $0.00 $10.00 $20.00 $10.70
$0.00 $7.73 $15.46 $10.09 $20.18 $11.48 $22.96 $0.00 $10.00 $20.00 $10.70
$0.00 $8.30 $16.60 $19.58 $39.16 $18.45 $36.90 $0.00 $15.59 $31.18 $16.35
$0.00 $7.69 $15.38 $11.82 $23.64 $18.45 $36.90 $0.00 $15.59 $31.18 $16.35
$0.00 $11.49 $22.98 $10.67 $21.34 $9.99 $19.98 $0.00 $12.38 $24.76 $12.99
$0.00 $10.93 $21.86 $10.67 $21.34 $9.99 $19.98 $0.00 $12.38 $24.76 $12.99

PARTS PRO SUNSNORTHSIDE PARDOSNAPAFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



$0.00 $5.43 $325.80 $4.24 $254.40 $3.79 $227.40 $0.00 $4.31 $258.60 $4.53
$0.00 $18.95 $227.40 $15.80 $189.60 $13.79 $165.48 $0.00 $19.87 $238.44 $16.14
$0.00 $19.97 $39.94 $18.38 $36.76 $17.57 $35.14 $0.00 $26.26 $52.52 $22.80
$0.00 $21.41 $21.41 $29.34 $29.34 $29.85 $29.85 $0.00 $32.32 $32.32 $24.56
$0.00 $59.90 $1,797.00 $101.11 $3,033.30 $60.97 $1,829.10 $0.00 $68.92 $2,067.60 $81.06
$0.00 $24.85 $149.10 $33.90 $203.40 $39.31 $235.86 $0.00 $41.58 $249.48 $30.70
$0.00 $26.28 $52.56 $33.90 $67.80 $36.02 $72.04 $0.00 $40.43 $80.86 $31.38
$0.00 $38.65 $77.30 $41.87 $83.74 $44.66 $89.32 $0.00 $58.00 $116.00 $45.13
$0.00 $26.28 $525.60 $33.90 $678.00 $41.35 $827.00 $0.00 $42.34 $846.80 $30.89
$0.00 $52.71 $316.26 $70.06 $420.36 $64.37 $386.22 $0.00 $95.11 $570.66 $68.23
$0.00 $26.28 $52.56 $33.90 $67.80 $36.30 $72.60 $0.00 $39.06 $78.12 $29.54
$0.00 $26.28 $105.12 $41.87 $167.48 $41.71 $166.84 $0.00 $35.78 $143.12 $31.16
$0.00 $26.28 $105.12 $41.87 $167.48 $36.86 $147.44 $0.00 $41.82 $167.28 $28.44
$0.00 $33.63 $403.56 $41.87 $502.44 $41.43 $497.16 $0.00 $49.49 $593.88 $46.81
$0.00 $26.28 $105.12 $33.90 $135.60 $39.65 $158.60 $0.00 $42.38 $169.52 $39.24
$0.00 $29.76 $297.60 $49.92 $499.20 $39.65 $396.50 $0.00 $49.91 $499.10 $41.79
$0.00 $29.76 $119.04 $50.35 $201.40 $39.65 $158.60 $0.00 $54.47 $217.88 $44.90
$0.00 $26.28 $157.68 $41.87 $251.22 $43.62 $261.72 $0.00 $45.55 $273.30 $36.23
$0.00 $26.77 $107.08 $36.33 $145.32 $26.52 $106.08 $0.00 $20.43 $81.72 $31.67
$0.00 $29.76 $297.60 $46.63 $466.30 $43.99 $439.90 $0.00 $47.14 $471.40 $39.43
$0.00 $1.64 $3.28 $2.00 $4.00 $1.95 $3.90 $0.00 $3.62 $7.24 $3.86
$0.00 $30.76 $184.56 $47.75 $286.50 $59.10 $354.60 $0.00 $64.68 $388.08 $51.33
$0.00 $26.63 $106.52 $57.84 $231.36 $51.90 $207.60 $0.00 $56.93 $227.72 $45.70
$0.00 $23.82 $95.28 $49.92 $199.68 $44.80 $179.20 $0.00 $38.45 $153.80 $40.05
$0.00 $34.04 $68.08 $33.90 $67.80 $41.17 $82.34 $0.00 $30.42 $60.84 $24.31
$0.00 $38.65 $77.30 $32.43 $64.86 $45.49 $90.98 $0.00 $43.66 $87.32 $17.23
$0.00 $38.65 $77.30 $36.66 $73.32 $39.85 $79.70 $0.00 $43.24 $86.48 $24.31
$0.00 $46.41 $92.82 $56.48 $112.96 $53.59 $107.18 $0.00 $43.52 $87.04 $26.20
$0.00 $38.65 $77.30 $41.87 $83.74 $43.56 $87.12 $0.00 $46.09 $92.18 $32.78
$0.00 $39.57 $79.14 $41.87 $83.74 $41.39 $82.78 $0.00 $43.24 $86.48 $30.50
$0.00 $34.01 $68.02 $33.18 $66.36 $34.48 $68.96 $0.00 $38.08 $76.16 $30.13
$0.00 $34.01 $68.02 $4.87 $9.74 $36.23 $72.46 $0.00 $47.26 $94.52 $35.50
$0.00 $38.32 $76.64 $33.70 $67.40 $44.09 $88.18 $0.00 $44.74 $89.48 $37.01
$0.00 $44.07 $88.14 $36.66 $73.32 $46.36 $92.72 $0.00 $51.57 $103.14 $44.89
$0.00 $44.07 $88.14 $41.87 $83.74 $51.94 $103.88 $0.00 $47.94 $95.88 $34.70

No Bid $9,648.06 $12,511.01 $10,920.94 NO BID $13,194.70



$0.00 $5.29 $31.74 $7.33 $43.98 $3.95 $23.70 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $3.43 $34.30 $1.77 $17.70 $3.30 $33.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $6.37 $63.70 $10.48 $104.80 $8.11 $81.10 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $4.51 $27.06 $13.39 $80.34 $5.74 $34.44 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $17.00 $68.00 $50.90 $203.60 $38.99 $155.96 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $16.00 $32.00 $28.96 $57.92 $40.99 $81.98 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $20.80 $62.40 $93.16 $279.48 $37.40 $112.20 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $17.00 $68.00 $19.06 $76.24 $16.39 $65.56 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $1.75 $10.50 $1.49 $8.94 $2.39 $14.34 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $2.03 $40.60 $4.81 $96.20 $2.39 $47.80 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $1.34 $8.04 $1.49 $8.94 $2.29 $13.74 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $8.62 $51.72 $6.51 $39.06 $5.55 $33.30 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $5.99 $35.94 $3.58 $21.48 $4.65 $27.90 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $8.65 $51.90 $5.58 $33.48 $6.04 $36.24 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $7.75 $46.50 $4.52 $27.12 $4.77 $28.62 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $3.64 $14.56 $2.18 $8.72 $5.79 $23.16 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $6.14 $368.40 $9.37 $562.20 $6.43 $385.80 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $5.95 $357.00 $10.43 $625.80 $7.51 $450.60 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $17.50 $17.50 $20.00 $20.00 $21.00 $21.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $20.00 $20.00 $27.00 $27.00 $30.00 $30.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $24.60 $24.60 $27.00 $27.00 $30.00 $30.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $26.00 $26.00 $35.00 $35.00 $36.00 $36.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $25.00 $375.00 $30.90 $463.50 $32.95 $494.25 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $5.23 $62.76 $3.68 $44.16 $8.39 $100.68 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $3.90 $46.80 $4.27 $51.24 $10.94 $131.28 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $7.03 $42.18 $2.81 $16.86 $3.99 $23.94 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $7.95 $47.70 $13.97 $83.82 $15.30 $91.80 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $7.95 $47.70 $13.69 $82.14 $15.30 $91.80 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $5.95 $11.90 $6.06 $12.12 $5.32 $10.64 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $5.32 $53.20 $5.24 $52.40 $5.26 $52.60 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $9.90 $198.00 $13.53 $270.60 $9.97 $199.40 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $119.00 $476.00 $213.92 $855.68 $269.95 $1,079.80 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $26.83 $107.32 $53.32 $213.28 $37.95 $151.80 $0.00 $0.00

No Bid $2,929.02 $4,550.80 $4,194.43 NO BID NO BID

PARTS PRO SUNSNORTHSIDE PARDOSNAPAFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



31.75 $63.50 $28.84 $57.68 $33.10 $66.20 $37.38 $74.76 $26.18 $52.36 $26.67 $53.34
37.67 $565.05 $34.21 $513.15 $40.52 $607.80 $42.12 $631.80 $31.05 $465.75 $42.71 $640.65
38.2 $76.40 $34.69 $69.38 $39.82 $79.64 $44.97 $89.94 $37.75 $75.50 $43.32 $86.64

28.57 $914.24 $25.95 $830.40 $29.78 $952.96 $31.94 $1,022.08 $28.32 $906.24 $32.39 $1,036.48
7.31 $14.62 $6.64 $13.28 $7.62 $15.24 $8.61 $17.22 $6.19 $12.38 $8.29 $16.58

10.57 $21.14 $9.60 $19.20 $11.03 $22.06 $12.44 $24.88 $10.56 $21.12 $11.99 $23.98
10.63 $42.52 $9.65 $38.60 $11.08 $44.32 $12.50 $50.00 $10.61 $42.44 $12.04 $48.16
10.63 $63.78 $9.66 $57.96 $11.09 $66.54 $12.52 $75.12 $8.94 $53.64 $12.07 $72.42
10.66 $42.64 $9.69 $38.76 $11.13 $44.52 $12.56 $50.24 $10.68 $42.72 $12.10 $48.40
10.22 $102.20 $9.29 $92.90 $10.66 $106.60 $11.43 $114.30 $10.80 $108.00 $11.60 $116.00
11.2 $112.00 $10.17 $101.70 $11.67 $116.70 $12.52 $125.20 $11.18 $111.80 $12.69 $126.90

14.07 $84.42 $12.78 $76.68 $14.67 $88.02 $16.56 $99.36 $14.08 $84.48 $15.96 $95.76
27.73 $55.46 $25.19 $50.38 $28.91 $57.82 $32.65 $65.30 $25.82 $51.64 $31.46 $62.92
27.83 $222.64 $25.10 $200.80 $28.81 $230.48 $32.54 $260.32 $24.67 $197.36 $31.35 $250.80
27.67 $110.68 $25.14 $100.56 $28.65 $114.60 $32.58 $130.32 $25.77 $103.08 $31.39 $125.56
24.98 $149.88 $22.70 $136.20 $26.50 $159.00 $29.42 $176.52 $20.60 $123.60 $28.34 $170.04
21.95 $87.80 $19.93 $79.72 $22.87 $91.48 $25.83 $103.32 $18.09 $72.36 $24.88 $99.52
32.35 $194.10 $29.38 $176.28 $33.72 $202.32 $38.08 $228.48 $31.99 $191.94 $36.68 $220.08
23.52 $141.12 $21.36 $128.16 $24.52 $147.12 $27.69 $166.14 $23.25 $139.50 $26.68 $160.08
27.98 $111.92 $25.42 $101.68 $29.18 $116.72 $32.95 $131.80 $27.16 $108.64 $31.74 $126.96
44.02 $352.16 $39.98 $319.84 $40.82 $326.56 $51.82 $414.56 $36.29 $290.32 $49.92 $399.36
31.88 $765.12 $28.88 $693.12 $33.15 $795.60 $35.55 $853.20 $26.21 $629.04 $36.06 $865.44
55.78 $111.56 $30.24 $60.48 $34.81 $69.62 $39.19 $78.38 $15.84 $31.68 $37.75 $75.50
31.33 $62.66 $27.33 $54.66 $31.37 $62.74 $35.42 $70.84 $33.80 $67.60 $34.11 $68.22

9.97 $19.94 $9.05 $18.10 $10.42 $20.84 $11.74 $23.48 $8.34 $16.68 $11.31 $22.62
10.07 $20.14 $9.15 $18.30 $10.51 $21.02 $11.86 $23.72 $8.42 $16.84 $11.42 $22.84
12.05 $24.10 $10.94 $21.88 $9.92 $19.84 $14.18 $28.36 $9.93 $19.86 $13.66 $27.32
10.72 $21.44 $9.74 $19.48 $11.19 $22.38 $12.63 $25.26 $8.85 $17.70 $12.16 $24.32
29.41 $58.82 $26.72 $53.44 $30.66 $61.32 $34.63 $69.26 $26.99 $53.98 $33.36 $66.72
21.95 $43.90 $19.93 $39.86 $22.87 $45.74 $25.83 $51.66 $18.09 $36.18 $24.88 $49.76
27.66 $55.32 $25.12 $50.24 $28.84 $57.68 $32.56 $65.12 $22.80 $45.60 $31.36 $62.72
25.78 $51.56 $23.44 $46.88 $26.90 $53.80 $30.39 $60.78 $21.77 $43.54 $29.27 $58.54

$4,762.83 $4,279.75 $4,887.28 $5,401.72 $4,233.57 $5,324.63

SUNSPARTS PRONORTHSIDE PARDOSNAPAFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



$0.00 $359.00 $359.00 $412.50 $412.50 $418.50 $418.50 $0.00 $300.92 $300.92 $151.00
$0.00 $23.50 $23.50 $27.00 $27.00 $30.50 $30.50 $0.00 $14.63 $14.63 $22.50
$0.00 $9.50 $9.50 $11.00 $11.00 $11.00 $11.00 $0.00 $10.42 $10.42 $8.00
$0.00 $23.00 $23.00 $28.00 $28.00 $21.50 $21.50 $0.00 $15.13 $15.13 $22.50
$0.00 $25.00 $25.00 $28.50 $28.50 $32.50 $32.50 $0.00 $15.63 $15.63 $27.50
$0.00 $28.50 $28.50 $33.00 $33.00 $24.00 $24.00 $0.00 $17.86 $17.86 $31.50
$0.00 $11.50 $11.50 $23.50 $23.50 $15.00 $15.00 $0.00 $14.39 $14.39 $11.50
$0.00 $124.00 $124.00 $142.50 $142.50 $160.50 $160.50 $0.00 $154.79 $154.79 $249.50
$0.00 $146.50 $146.50 $169.00 $169.00 $190.00 $190.00 $0.00 $183.06 $183.06 $214.50
$0.00 $169.00 $169.00 $194.50 $194.50 $219.00 $219.00 $0.00 $210.84 $210.84 $304.50
$0.00 $193.50 $193.50 $75.50 $75.50 $88.50 $88.50 $0.00 $36.48 $36.48 $46.38
$0.00 $19.00 $19.00 $30.50 $30.50 $32.00 $32.00 $0.00 $30.77 $30.77 $57.50
$0.00 $21.00 $21.00 $33.50 $33.50 $36.50 $36.50 $0.00 $35.22 $35.22 $82.00
$0.00 $26.00 $26.00 $40.50 $40.50 $42.00 $42.00 $0.00 $40.69 $40.69 $114.50
$0.00 $238.00 $238.00 $136.75 $136.75 $336.00 $336.00 $0.00 $148.58 $148.58 $52.75
$0.00 $290.00 $290.00 $166.75 $166.75 $376.00 $376.00 $0.00 $181.08 $181.08 $56.50

No Bid $1,707.00 $1,553.00 $2,033.50 NO BID $1,410.49

PARTS PRO SUNSPARDOSNORTHSIDENAPAFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



$0.00 $0.32 $32.00 $0.35 $35.00 $0.35 $35.00 $0.00 $0.20 $20.00 $0.54
$0.00 $0.32 $32.00 $0.34 $34.00 $0.35 $35.00 $0.00 $0.32 $32.00 $0.80
$0.00 $0.39 $19.50 $0.37 $18.50 $0.49 $24.50 $0.00 $0.32 $16.00 $0.59
$0.00 $0.39 $39.00 $0.39 $39.00 $0.49 $49.00 $0.00 $0.32 $32.00 $0.94
$0.00 $0.45 $36.00 $0.42 $33.60 $0.49 $39.20 $0.00 $0.32 $25.60 $0.94
$0.00 $0.45 $22.50 $0.41 $20.50 $0.49 $24.50 $0.00 $0.32 $16.00 $0.95
$0.00 $0.48 $19.20 $0.37 $14.80 $0.49 $19.60 $0.00 $0.32 $12.80 $0.95
$0.00 $0.48 $14.40 $0.84 $25.20 $0.49 $14.70 $0.00 $0.32 $9.60 $1.00
$0.00 $0.88 $26.40 $0.42 $12.60 $0.92 $27.60 $0.00 $0.56 $16.80 $1.19
$0.00 $0.96 $28.80 $1.14 $34.20 $1.02 $30.60 $0.00 $0.63 $18.90 $1.30
$0.00 $0.99 $29.70 $1.16 $34.80 $1.29 $38.70 $0.00 $0.78 $23.40 $1.39
$0.00 $1.27 $25.40 $0.61 $12.20 $1.99 $39.80 $0.00 $0.72 $14.40 $1.51
$0.00 $1.50 $30.00 $1.30 $26.00 $2.29 $45.80 $0.00 $1.06 $21.20 $1.74

No Bid $354.90 $340.40 $424.00 NO BID $258.70

SUNSNORTHSIDE PARDOS PARTS PRONAPAFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



$0.00 $3.73 $7.46 $4.61 $9.22 $5.70 $11.40 $4.20 $8.40 $4.40 $8.80
$0.00 $2.64 $10.56 $4.65 $18.60 $4.06 $16.24 $3.13 $12.52 $3.12 $12.48
$0.00 $2.64 $15.84 $4.49 $26.94 $4.07 $24.42 $3.13 $18.78 $3.13 $18.78
$0.00 $2.64 $26.40 $4.65 $46.50 $4.06 $40.60 $3.13 $31.30 $3.11 $31.10
$0.00 $3.20 $12.80 $3.95 $15.80 $4.06 $16.24 $3.80 $15.20 $3.35 $13.40
$0.00 $2.60 $10.40 $3.95 $15.80 $2.96 $11.84 $3.08 $12.32 $3.35 $13.40
$0.00 $8.88 $53.28 $9.08 $54.48 $9.05 $54.30 $10.03 $60.18 $9.26 $55.56
$0.00 $1.00 $6.00 $0.62 $3.72 $0.32 $1.92 $1.00 $6.00 $0.47 $2.82
$0.00 $0.25 $1.00 $0.42 $1.68 $0.46 $1.84 $0.28 $1.12 $1.00 $4.00
$0.00 $0.25 $1.00 $0.41 $1.64 $0.46 $1.84 $0.26 $1.04 $1.00 $4.00
$0.00 $0.25 $2.50 $0.73 $7.30 $0.65 $6.50 $0.28 $2.80 $1.31 $13.10
$0.00 $5.21 $10.42 $9.81 $19.62 $7.89 $15.78 $5.88 $11.76 $7.99 $15.98
$0.00 $5.52 $11.04 $7.63 $15.26 $37.10 $74.20 $6.22 $12.44 $5.43 $10.86
$0.00 $16.59 $33.18 $27.30 $54.60 $29.71 $59.42 $18.71 $37.42 $24.17 $48.34
$0.00 $17.21 $34.42 $27.30 $54.60 $30.80 $61.60 $19.42 $38.84 $26.14 $52.28
$0.00 $3.22 $6.44 $5.42 $10.84 $6.65 $13.30 $3.63 $7.26 $4.86 $9.72
$0.00 $2.55 $5.10 $3.71 $7.42 $4.16 $8.32 $2.87 $5.74 $3.04 $6.08

No Bid $247.84 $364.02 $419.76 $283.12 $320.70

SUNSPARTS PRONORTHSIDE PARDOSNAPAFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



$0.00 $6.95 $333.60 $11.00 $528.00 $9.95 $477.60 $0.00 $31.84 $1,528.32
$0.00 $3.38 $6.76 $26.47 $52.94 $7.15 $14.30 $0.00 $8.16 $16.32
$0.00 $6.74 $40.44 $5.91 $35.46 $7.15 $42.90 $0.00 $8.16 $48.96
$0.00 $6.96 $55.68 $8.25 $66.00 $7.74 $61.92 $0.00 $1.98 $15.84
$0.00 $4.15 $58.10 $5.94 $83.16 $4.67 $65.38 $0.00 $2.87 $40.18
$0.00 $4.33 $43.30 $4.61 $46.10 $3.40 $34.00 $0.00 $1.86 $18.60
$0.00 $3.06 $61.20 $2.48 $49.60 $3.65 $73.00 $0.00 $1.86 $37.20
$0.00 $2.95 $11.80 $3.89 $15.56 $3.72 $14.88 $0.00 $1.59 $6.36
$0.00 $2.95 $103.25 $3.59 $125.65 $3.65 $127.75 $0.00 $1.59 $55.65
$0.00 $3.50 $630.00 $6.05 $1,089.00 $6.55 $1,179.00 $0.00 $6.02 $1,083.60
$0.00 $3.50 $350.00 $4.24 $424.00 $4.59 $459.00 $0.00 $3.70 $370.00
$0.00 $6.95 $5,073.50 $7.30 $5,329.00 $6.29 $4,591.70 $0.00 $7.29 $5,321.70
$0.00 $2.95 $118.00 $2.72 $108.80 $2.19 $87.60 $0.00 $2.62 $104.80
$0.00 $4.50 $135.00 $3.77 $113.10 $3.03 $90.90 $0.00 $3.42 $102.60
$0.00 $2.50 $60.00 $3.47 $83.28 $2.99 $71.76 $0.00 $1.81 $43.44
$0.00 $3.75 $22.50 $7.34 $44.04 $2.99 $17.94 $0.00 $2.58 $15.48
$0.00 $3.95 $94.80 $3.85 $92.40 $3.69 $88.56 $0.00 $3.81 $91.44
$0.00 $1.89 $189.00 $2.85 $285.00 $2.49 $249.00 $0.00 $2.21 $221.00
$0.00 $4.95 $29.70 $5.11 $30.66 $5.99 $35.94 $0.00 $5.96 $35.76
$0.00 $7.50 $450.00 $4.05 $243.00 $4.99 $299.40 $0.00 $3.92 $235.20
$0.00 $1.95 $93.60 $1.22 $58.56 $1.59 $76.32 $0.00 $1.37 $65.76
$0.00 $4.95 $178.20 $5.23 $188.28 $6.72 $241.92 $0.00 $4.99 $179.64
$0.00 $8.95 $214.80 $4.89 $117.36 $4.99 $119.76 $0.00 $5.87 $140.88
$0.00 $5.50 $22.00 $9.11 $36.44 $4.99 $19.96 $0.00 $5.13 $20.52
$0.00 $18.95 $113.70 $5.19 $31.14 $23.37 $140.22 $0.00 $19.99 $119.94
$0.00 $3.25 $19.50 $3.04 $18.24 $2.99 $17.94 $0.00 $1.96 $11.76
$0.00 $0.82 $19.68 $0.92 $22.08 $0.99 $23.76 $0.00 $0.96 $23.04
$0.00 $1.25 $25.00 $2.71 $54.20 $0.69 $13.80 $0.00 $0.96 $19.20
$0.00 $1.39 $1,946.00 $1.87 $2,618.00 $1.99 $2,786.00 $0.00 $2.13 $2,982.00
$0.00 $5.62 $528.28 $58.90 $5,536.60 $79.95 $7,515.30 $0.00 $59.99 $5,639.06
$0.00 $3.50 $252.00 $3.66 $263.52 $3.66 $263.52 $0.00 $1.97 $141.84
$0.00 $4.75 $28.50 $3.18 $19.08 $2.35 $14.10 $0.00 $5.92 $35.52
$0.00 $4.95 $29.70 $2.33 $13.98 $3.14 $18.84 $0.00 $2.62 $15.72

PARTS PROPARDOS SUNSNORTHSIDENAPAFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



$0.00 $4.95 $59.40 $2.33 $27.96 $3.14 $37.68 $0.00 $2.62 $31.44
$0.00 $4.95 $29.70 $4.29 $25.74 $3.99 $23.94 $0.00 $3.77 $22.62
$0.00 $2.20 $110.00 $2.28 $114.00 $2.62 $131.00 $0.00 $1.17 $58.50
$0.00 $21.50 $86.00 $5.19 $20.76 $23.37 $93.48 $0.00 $28.13 $112.52
$0.00 $3.21 $19.26 $6.84 $41.04 $7.43 $44.58 $0.00 $7.36 $44.16
$0.00 $11.50 $138.00 $8.96 $107.52 $7.95 $95.40 $0.00 $18.75 $225.00

No Bid $11,779.95 $18,159.25 $19,760.05 NO BID $19,281.57





32.22 $515.52 $38.30 $612.80 $0.00 $42.48 $679.68 $34.12 $545.92 $0.00 $34.89
15.26 $122.08 $17.78 $142.24 $0.00 $21.99 $175.92 $15.03 $120.24 $0.00 $17.54
7.91 $63.28 $9.74 $77.92 $0.00 $3.25 $26.00 $6.70 $53.60 $0.00 $7.91

15.47 $61.88 $19.04 $76.16 $0.00 $21.95 $87.80 $15.23 $60.92 $0.00 $17.79
25.97 $103.88 $30.88 $123.52 $0.00 $36.85 $147.40 $25.37 $101.48 $0.00 $29.51
33.81 $135.24 $34.50 $138.00 $0.00 $46.14 $184.56 $33.02 $132.08 $0.00 $38.43
32.76 $131.04 $34.50 $138.00 $0.00 $54.95 $219.80 $32.00 $128.00 $0.00 $37.23
22.26 $222.60 $27.40 $274.00 $0.00 $29.95 $299.50 $22.14 $221.40 $0.00 $25.59
31.88 $956.40 $34.50 $1,035.00 $0.00 $42.95 $1,288.50 $31.14 $934.20 $0.00 $36.24
6.18 $185.40 $7.56 $226.80 $0.00 $8.39 $251.70 $6.15 $184.50 $0.00 $6.81

13.71 $82.26 $26.10 $156.60 $0.00 $27.53 $165.18 $15.54 $93.24 $0.00 $22.23
35.06 $210.36 $36.50 $219.00 $0.00 $49.95 $299.70 $40.42 $242.52 $0.00 $42.46
12.35 $49.40 $19.95 $79.80 $0.00 $26.95 $107.80 $14.27 $57.08 $0.00 $22.11
21.96 $87.84 $32.10 $128.40 $0.00 $45.89 $183.56 $25.27 $101.08 $0.00 $39.30
32.16 $192.96 $39.90 $239.40 $0.00 $43.95 $263.70 $30.87 $185.22 $0.00 $38.95
82.87 $497.22 $88.00 $528.00 $0.00 $119.48 $716.88 $90.31 $541.86 $0.00 $100.36
44.86 $89.72 $54.50 $109.00 $0.00 $62.95 $125.90 $53.05 $106.10 $0.00 $54.34
79.95 $159.90 $89.95 $179.90 $0.00 $108.15 $216.30 $76.75 $153.50 $0.00 $96.83
8.08 $32.32 $10.58 $42.32 $0.00 $10.89 $43.56 $7.76 $31.04 $0.00 $9.55
3.17 $6.34 $4.15 $8.30 $0.00 $4.49 $8.98 $3.04 $6.08 $0.00 $3.75
8.45 $169.00 $9.25 $185.00 $0.00 $0.25 $5.00 $17.32 $346.40 $0.00 $8.25

11.17 $111.70 $14.00 $140.00 $0.00 $11.99 $119.90 $11.83 $118.30 $0.00 $12.11
4.76 $9.52 $5.84 $11.68 $0.00 $6.69 $13.38 $4.68 $9.36 $0.00 $4.65

5 $10.00 $6.12 $12.24 $0.00 $6.99 $13.98 $4.91 $9.82 $0.00 $4.88
1.56 $12.48 $1.93 $15.44 $0.00 $1.69 $13.52 $1.45 $11.60 $0.00 $1.56
4.77 $9.54 $4.83 $9.66 $0.00 $5.39 $10.78 $4.29 $8.58 $0.00 $4.78
5.67 $45.36 $6.99 $55.92 $0.00 $6.37 $50.96 $4.81 $38.48 $0.00 $5.68
15.9 $190.80 $22.25 $267.00 $0.00 $19.95 $239.40 $15.54 $186.48 $0.00 $18.08

21.07 $252.84 $25.94 $311.28 $0.00 $33.39 $400.68 $20.45 $245.40 $0.00 $24.23
24.07 $192.56 $7.02 $56.16 $0.00 $10.62 $84.96 $5.84 $46.72 $0.00 $6.20
10.38 $62.28 $15.68 $94.08 $0.00 $16.59 $99.54 $11.48 $68.88 $0.00 $14.72
5.86 $35.16 $8.91 $53.46 $0.00 $9.49 $56.94 $6.53 $39.18 $0.00 $13.38

18.26 $182.60 $24.29 $242.90 $0.00 $26.70 $267.00 $17.54 $175.40 $0.00 $22.11
7.02 $70.20 $10.21 $102.10 $0.00 $10.70 $107.00 $7.26 $72.60 $0.00 $9.39

SUNSPARDOS PARTS PRONAPA NORTHSIDEFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



11.73 $93.84 $15.38 $123.04 $0.00 $15.39 $123.12 $11.27 $90.16 $0.00 $13.88
6.7 $26.80 $8.78 $35.12 $0.00 $9.23 $36.92 $6.44 $25.76 $0.00 $7.93

6.88 $27.52 $9.14 $36.56 $0.00 $9.87 $39.48 $6.59 $26.36 $0.00 $10.39
10.55 $42.20 $14.04 $56.16 $0.00 $14.59 $58.36 $10.14 $40.56 $0.00 $11.92
22.7 $204.30 $30.19 $271.71 $0.00 $31.14 $280.26 $21.79 $196.11 $0.00 $20.41

14.67 $132.03 $19.52 $175.68 $0.00 $21.07 $189.63 $14.09 $126.81 $0.00 $17.78
3.97 $15.88 $4.79 $19.16 $0.00 $5.99 $23.96 $3.51 $14.04 $0.00 $4.33
6.57 $26.28 $9.93 $39.72 $0.00 $10.99 $43.96 $7.27 $29.08 $0.00 $8.95
4.55 $18.20 $5.96 $23.84 $0.00 $7.09 $28.36 $4.37 $17.48 $0.00 $5.38
7.98 $31.92 $10.47 $41.88 $0.00 $12.36 $49.44 $7.67 $30.68 $0.00 $9.44
9.16 $54.96 $17.47 $104.82 $0.00 $16.25 $97.50 $11.35 $68.10 $0.00 $11.25
29.8 $178.80 $39.63 $237.78 $0.00 $40.44 $242.64 $28.60 $171.60 $0.00 $28.52
3.26 $13.04 $4.28 $17.12 $0.00 $5.09 $20.36 $3.14 $12.56 $0.00 $3.86
6.71 $26.84 $10.06 $40.24 $0.00 $11.42 $45.68 $7.38 $29.52 $0.00 $9.08

$6,152.29 $7,314.91 NO BID $8,255.13 $6,256.08 NO BID



$0.00 $1.31 $5.24 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.05
$0.00 $1.56 $15.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.24
$0.00 $1.03 $10.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.71
$0.00 $2.28 $36.48 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.39
$0.00 $1.43 $5.72 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.14
$0.00 $1.42 $19.88 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.14
$0.00 $4.80 $28.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.80
$0.00 $3.65 $21.90 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.10
$0.00 $2.56 $15.36 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.10
$0.00 $76.00 $76.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $101.00
$0.00 $25.00 $25.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $46.00
$0.00 $54.00 $54.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $69.00
$0.00 $49.95 $599.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $48.40

No Bid $913.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SUNSPARTS PRONORTHSIDE PARDOSNAPAFLEET PRODUCTSFLEET PRIDE



13.07 $104.56 $12.50 $100.00 $0.00 $0.00 $12.28 $98.24 $0.00 $13.62
23.71 $1,778.25 $22.95 $1,721.25 $0.00 $0.00 $21.55 $1,616.25 $0.00 $23.41

141.88 $851.28 $131.85 $791.10 $0.00 $0.00 $136.04 $816.24 $0.00 $140.39
80.31 $481.86 $128.50 $771.00 $0.00 $0.00 $124.79 $748.74 $0.00 $168.83
45.45 $681.75 $51.65 $774.75 $0.00 $0.00 $56.03 $840.45 $0.00 $57.71

121.68 $3,163.68 $119.80 $3,114.80 $0.00 $0.00 $119.70 $3,112.20 $0.00 $128.55
176.88 $8,490.24 $179.50 $8,616.00 $0.00 $0.00 $189.36 $9,089.28 $0.00 $190.03
29.06 $871.80 $39.06 $1,171.80 $0.00 $0.00 $38.52 $1,155.60 $0.00 $34.85
3.33 $159.84 $5.21 $250.08 $0.00 $0.00 $4.82 $231.36 $0.00 $4.36
4.2 $420.00 $4.98 $498.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.89 $489.00 $0.00 $5.35

39.61 $158.44 $38.90 $155.60 $0.00 $0.00 $39.06 $156.24 $0.00 $75.33
$0.00 $66.48 $664.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $85.44

77.46 $1,084.44 $84.91 $1,188.74 $0.00 $0.00 $92.35 $1,292.90 $0.00 $93.66
77.7 $2,486.40 $48.74 $1,559.68 $0.00 $0.00 $49.32 $1,578.24 $0.00 $48.40
6.38 $306.24 $6.25 $300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6.13 $294.24 $0.00 $6.88

210.37 $2,524.44 $151.55 $1,818.60 $0.00 $0.00 $172.44 $2,069.28 $0.00 $167.25
40 $480.00 $25.00 $300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $14.00

$0.00 $107.80 $1,078.00 $0.00 $0.00 $23.81 $238.10 $0.00 $56.78
$0.00 $126.00 $1,260.00 $0.00 $0.00 $27.50 $275.00 $0.00 $85.83

201.81 $3,228.96 $181.50 $2,904.00 $0.00 $0.00 $198.99 $3,183.84 $0.00 $194.85
$0.00 $75.80 $454.80 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00 $150.00 $0.00 $43.41
$0.00 $79.80 $478.80 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00 $150.00 $0.00 $48.93

112.11 $1,569.54 $119.50 $1,673.00 $0.00 $0.00 $129.70 $1,815.80 $0.00 $131.54
116.68 $1,400.16 $69.95 $839.40 $0.00 $0.00 $125.45 $1,505.40 $0.00 $127.23

4.88 $58.56 $6.61 $79.32 $0.00 $0.00 $7.30 $87.60 $0.00 $8.21
$30,300.44 $32,563.52 NO BID NO BID Note No Bids $30,994.00 NO BID

Note: No Bids

PARTS PRO SUNSNORTHSIDE PARDOSNAPAFLEET PRIDE FLEET PRODUCTS





TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

NO BID NO BID

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$352.25 $0.00
$128.60 $0.00
$80.02 $0.00

$169.76 $0.00
$154.05 $0.00
$937.44 $0.00
$361.00 $0.00

$1,135.90 $0.00
$18.08 $0.00
$22.96 $0.00
$37.78 $0.00
$36.20 $0.00
$36.40 $0.00
$40.40 $0.00
$60.92 $0.00
$60.84 $0.00
$14.40 $0.00
$23.70 $0.00
$18.00 $0.00
$25.20 $0.00
$25.20 $0.00
$60.92 $0.00
$60.84 $0.00
$21.40 $0.00
$21.40 $0.00
$32.70 $0.00
$32.70 $0.00
$25.98 $0.00
$25.98 $0.00

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$271.80 $0.00
$193.68 $0.00
$45.60 $0.00
$24.56 $0.00

$2,431.80 $0.00
$184.20 $0.00
$62.76 $0.00
$90.26 $0.00

$617.80 $0.00
$409.38 $0.00
$59.08 $0.00

$124.64 $0.00
$113.76 $0.00
$561.72 $0.00
$156.96 $0.00
$417.90 $0.00
$179.60 $0.00
$217.38 $0.00
$126.68 $0.00
$394.30 $0.00

$7.72 $0.00
$307.98 $0.00
$182.80 $0.00
$160.20 $0.00
$48.62 $0.00
$34.46 $0.00
$48.62 $0.00
$52.40 $0.00
$65.56 $0.00
$61.00 $0.00
$60.26 $0.00
$71.00 $0.00
$74.02 $0.00
$89.78 $0.00
$69.40 $0.00

$12,038.70 NO BID



$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

NO BID NO BID

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

NO BID NO BID

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$151.00 $0.00
$22.50 $0.00
$8.00 $0.00

$22.50 $0.00
$27.50 $0.00
$31.50 $0.00
$11.50 $0.00

$249.50 $0.00
$214.50 $0.00
$304.50 $0.00
$46.38 $0.00
$57.50 $0.00
$82.00 $0.00

$114.50 $0.00
$52.75 $0.00
$56.50 $0.00

$1,452.63 NO BID

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$54.00 $0.00
$80.00 $0.00
$29.50 $0.00
$94.00 $0.00
$75.20 $0.00
$47.50 $0.00
$38.00 $0.00
$30.00 $0.00
$35.70 $0.00
$39.00 $0.00
$41.70 $0.00
$30.20 $0.00
$34.80 $0.00

$629.60 NO BID

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

NO BID NO BID

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

NO BID NO BID





$558.24 $38.65 $618.40
$140.32 $17.86 $142.88
$63.28 $9.72 $77.76
$71.16 $18.10 $72.40

$118.04 $33.01 $132.04
$153.72 $42.98 $171.92
$148.92 $36.34 $145.36
$255.90 $25.60 $256.00

$1,087.20 $36.10 $1,083.00
$204.30 $6.04 $181.20
$133.38 $14.23 $85.38
$254.76 $36.28 $217.68
$88.44 $13.78 $55.12

$157.20 $24.50 $98.00
$233.70 $33.28 $199.68
$602.16 $85.74 $514.44
$108.68 $46.43 $92.86
$193.66 $84.94 $169.88
$38.20 $8.24 $32.96
$7.50 $3.24 $6.48

$165.00 $10.35 $207.00
$121.10 $4.09 $40.90

$9.30 $5.86 $11.72
$9.76 $6.13 $12.26

$12.48 $1.93 $15.44
$9.56 $5.86 $11.72

$45.44 $7.09 $56.72
$216.96 $18.01 $216.12
$290.76 $24.24 $290.88
$49.60 $8.00 $64.00
$88.32 $12.20 $73.20
$80.28 $6.93 $41.58

$221.10 $18.90 $189.00
$93.90 $8.10 $81.00

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$111.04 $16.86 $134.88
$31.72 $9.64 $38.56
$41.56 $7.11 $28.44
$47.68 $10.93 $43.72

$183.69 $23.48 $211.32
$160.02 $15.19 $136.71
$17.32 $3.83 $15.32
$35.80 $7.93 $31.72
$21.52 $4.76 $19.04
$37.76 $11.48 $45.92
$67.50 $12.24 $73.44

$171.12 $30.82 $184.92
$15.44 $4.69 $18.76
$36.32 $7.83 $31.32

$7,010.81 $6,679.05



$4.20 $0.00
$12.40 $0.00
$7.10 $0.00

$38.24 $0.00
$4.56 $0.00

$15.96 $0.00
$16.80 $0.00
$18.60 $0.00
$18.60 $0.00

$101.00 $0.00
$46.00 $0.00
$69.00 $0.00

$580.80 $0.00
$933.26 NO BID

STATE TAMPA SPRING



$108.96 $9.98 $79.84
$1,755.75 $28.13 $2,109.75

$842.34 $56.45 $338.70
$1,012.98 $152.04 $912.24

$865.65 $19.65 $294.75
$3,342.30 $135.84 $3,531.84
$9,121.44 $195.25 $9,372.00
$1,045.50 $35.48 $1,064.40

$209.28 $6.43 $308.64
$535.00 $5.01 $501.00
$301.32 $43.88 $175.52
$854.40 $68.92 $689.20

$1,311.24 $96.41 $1,349.74
$1,548.80 $46.94 $1,502.08

$330.24 $7.53 $361.44

$2,007.00 $175.00 $2,100.00
$168.00 $30.00 $360.00
$567.80 $121.68 $1,216.80
$858.30 $157.56 $1,575.60

$3,117.60 $210.80 $3,372.80
$260.46 $96.76 $580.56
$293.58 $96.00 $576.00

$1,841.56 $126.94 $1,777.16
$1,526.76 $117.31 $1,407.72

$98.52 $6.93 $83.16
$33,924.78 $35,640.94

STATE TAMPA SPRING
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