

MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

AGENDA MEMORANDUM

SUBJECT	Additional Gasoline & Diesel Fuel Suppliers	TYPE AGENDA ITEM	Consent
DATE REQUESTED	March 17, 2009	DATE SUBMITTED/REVISED	February 24, 2009
BRIEFINGS? Who?	N/A	CONSEQUENCES IF DEFERRED	None
DEPARTMENT/DIVISION	Financial Mgmt/Purchasing	AUTHORIZED BY TITLE	Jim Seuffert, Director <i>JS</i>
CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE/EXTENSION	Bonnie Sietman x 3046	PRESENTER/TITLE TELEPHONE/EXTENSION	R.C. "Rob" Cuthbert, Purchasing Manager x 3014
ADMINISTRATIVE APPROVAL			
ACTION DESIRED			
INDICATE WHETHER 1) REPORT; 2) DISCUSSION; 3) FORM OF MOTION; OR 4) OTHER ACTION REQUIRED			
<p>Authorization to award IFB #09-0400BS for Additional Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Suppliers to the following multiple responsive, responsible bidders meeting specifications, on an as-required basis:</p> <p>Quick Fuel Fleet Services, Tampa FL BV Oil Company, Arcadia, FL Palmdale OFL Company, Ft. Pierce, FL</p>			
ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY			
Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy			
Ordinance 08-43, Resolution R-08-298			
BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION			
<ul style="list-style-type: none"> • IFB #09-0400BS will supplement the three vendors currently supplying fuel for Manatee County (JH Williams Co., Petroleum Traders, and Ward Oil Co). • The intent of this Invitation for Bid is to establish additional sources for fuel which will enable the County to obtain fuels based on product availability; establishing a history from multiple sources, thereby producing a broader base should fuel be allocated in an emergency during periods of shortage. • Three vendors currently supply fuel to the county on Bid IFB #06-2179OV which expires July 10, 2011. The term of this agreement shall also expire on July 10, 2011. 			
COUNTY ATTORNEY REVIEW			
Check appropriate box			
<input type="checkbox"/>	REVIEWED Written Comments: <input type="checkbox"/> Attached <input type="checkbox"/> Available from Attorney (Attorney's initials: <u>PM</u>)		
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	NOT REVIEWED (No apparent legal issues.)		
<input type="checkbox"/>	NOT REVIEWED (Utilizes exact form or procedure previously approved by CAO.)		
ATTACHMENTS: (List in order as attached)		INSTRUCTIONS TO BOARD RECORDS:	
<ol style="list-style-type: none"> 1. Bid Tabulation 2. OPIS Price Information – Current Week 		Original to Board Records; Quick Fuel Fleet Services, Tampa, FL; BV Oil Company, Arcadia, FL; Palmdale OFL Company, Ft. Pierce, FL. Signature page copy to Bonnie Sietman/Purchasing.	
COST:		SOURCE (ACCT # & NAME):	5010003699595000 (for resale)
COMMENTS:	R039083	AMT./FREQ. OF RECURRING COSTS: (ATTACH FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT)	N/A

#3

JS

- The following three additional vendors were chosen by Fuel Services and Purchasing:
 - Quick Fuel Fleet Services, Tampa, FL
 - BV Oil Company, Arcadia, FL
 - Palmdale OFL Company, Ft. Pierce, FL

- The following two vendors were rejected by Fuel Services and Purchasing:
 - Florida Fuel Transporters - pricing was extremely high and “No Bid” all tank wagon loads (see bid tab attached)
 - RKA Petroleum – problems with their terms (see attached letter from Fuel Services)

TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS
ADDITIONAL GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

VENDOR	FIXED MARKUP COST PER GAL.	FIXED TRANSPORT COST PER GAL.
1. GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOADS: REGULAR UNLEADED		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	0.02	0.03
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	0.03	0.04
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	0.0367	0.0257
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	0.25	0.0665
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	0.025	0.007
2. GASOLINE - TANK WAGON LOADS: REGULAR UNLEADED		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.2999	\$10.00
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.135
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	\$0.0634	\$0.0964
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	NO BID	NO BID
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	NO BID	NO BID

on demand star 2/19/09

(B)

TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS
ADDITIONAL GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

VENDOR	FIXED MARKUP COST PER GAL.	FIXED TRANSPORT COST PER GAL.
3. GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOADS: PREMIUM		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.02	\$0.03
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.04
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	0.0367	0.0257
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	0.25	0.0665
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	0.025	0.007
4. GASOLINE - TANK WAGON LOADS: PREMIUM		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.2999	\$10.00
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.135
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	\$0.0634	\$0.0964
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	NO BID	NO BID
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	NO BID	NO BID

TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS
ADDITIONAL GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

VENDOR	FIXED MARKUP COST PER GAL.	FIXED TRANSPORT COST PER GAL.
5. GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOADS: UNLEADED W/10% ETHANOL		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.02	\$0.03
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.04
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	0.0167	0.0257
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	0.25	0.0665
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	0.025	0.007
6. GASOLINE - TANK WAGON LOADS: UNLEADED W/10% ETHANOL		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.2999	\$10.00
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.135
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	\$0.0434	\$0.0964
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	NO BID	NO BID
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	\$0.1125	\$0.01

TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS
ADDITIONAL GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

VENDOR	FIXED MARKUP COST PER GAL.	FIXED TRANSPORT COST PER GAL.
7. GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOADS: PREMIUM W/10% ETHANOL		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.02	\$0.03
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.04
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	0.0167	0.0257
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	0.25	0.0665
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	0.025	0.007
8. GASOLINE - TANK WAGON LOADS: PREMIUM W/10% ETHANOL		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.2999	\$10.00
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.135
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	\$0.0434	\$0.0964
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	NO BID	NO BID
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	\$0.1125	\$0.01

TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS
ADDITIONAL GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

VENDOR	FIXED MARKUP COST PER GAL.	FIXED TRANSPORT COST PER GAL.
9. DIESEL - TRANSPORT LOADS: #2 DIESEL W/ULTRA LOW SULFUR		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.02	\$0.03
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.04
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	0.0367	0.0296
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	0.25	0.0665
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	0.025	0.007
10. DIESEL - TANK WAGON LOADS: #2 DIESEL W/ULTRA LOW SULFUR		
✓ RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, MI 48174	\$0.2999	\$10.00
✓ QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES 1618 S 50th St. Tampa, FL 33619	\$0.03	\$0.135
✓ PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC 911 North 2nd St. Fort Pierce, FL 34950	\$0.0634	\$0.0964
✓ FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC 5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd. Tampa, FL 33619	NO BID	NO BID
✓ BV OIL COMPANY INC. P.O. Box 1018 Arcadia, FL 34265	\$0.1125	\$0.01

KEYED BY: Carol Richards DATE: 2-6-09

CHECKED BY: Louie Autra DATE: 2/9/2009

To: BONNIE
5 PAGES

OPIS Rack Fax

Account #960709

To align the following data, change the font size to 9 in Courier New.

TAMPA, FL

2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

****OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE****
****OPIS GROSS CLEAR PRICES****

	Terms	Unl	Move	Mid	Move	Pre	Move	Date
BP	b 1-10	123.30	+ .50	132.60	+ .50	149.40	+ .50	02/19
BP	u N-10	116.17	+ .94	-- --	-- --	133.07	+ .44	02/19
Chevron	b 1-10	124.30	+ 1.00	133.30	+ 1.00	151.10	+ 1.00	02/19
Citgo	b 1-10	123.00	- 1.00	-- --	-- --	148.65	- 1.00	02/19
Marathon	b 1-10	123.79	+ 1.01	132.31	+ 1.01	147.02	+ 1.01	02/19
Marathon	u N-10	118.60	+ 1.00	125.41	+ 1.00	138.60	+ 1.00	02/19
Murphy	u N-12	118.55	+ 2.95	122.30	+ 2.95	133.30	- .05	02/19
Shell	b 1-10	126.53	+ .76	134.13	+ .76	152.98	+ .76	02/19
Sunoco	b 1-10	124.25	- .75	128.75	- .75	148.25	- .75	02/20
Texaco	b 1-10	124.30	+ 1.00	133.30	+ 1.00	151.10	+ 1.00	02/19
LOW RACK		116.17		122.30		133.07		
HIGH RACK		126.53		134.13		152.98		
RACK AVG		122.28		130.26		145.35		

OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - 02/19

FOB COLONIAL 108.110 -- -- -- --

OPIS GULF WATERBORNE DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)

FOB TAMPA	113.66	116.66	121.16
BRD LOW RACK	123.00	128.75	147.02
BRD HIGH RACK	126.53	134.13	152.98
BRD RACK AVG	124.21	132.40	149.79
UBD LOW RACK	116.17	122.30	133.07
UBD HIGH RACK	118.60	125.41	138.60
UBD RACK AVG	117.77	123.86	134.99
CONT AVG-02/20	122.28	130.26	145.35
CONT LOW-02/20	116.17	122.30	133.07
CONT HIGH-02/20	126.53	134.13	152.98

TAMPA-ST. PETERSBURG-CLEARWATER, FL

LOW RETAIL	182.47
AVG RETAIL	194.44
LOW RETAIL EX-TAX	134.50
AVG RETAIL EX-TAX	147.77

TAMPA, FL

2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

****OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE****
****OPIS GROSS ETHANOL (10%) PRICES****

	Terms	Unl	Move	Mid	Move	Pre	Move	Date
BP	b 1-10	123.30	+ .50	132.60	+ .50	149.40	+ .50	02/19
BP	u N-10	132.80	+ 1.94	136.29	+ 2.50	150.20	+ 3.24	02/19
Chevron	b 1-10	123.90	+ 1.00	132.90	+ 1.00	150.00	+ 1.00	02/19
Citgo	b 1-10	122.82	- 1.00	134.22	- 1.00	149.22	- 1.00	02/19
Citgo	u 1-10	125.32	+ .30	133.22	+ .30	148.32	+ .30	02/19
Colonial	u N-12	120.40	+ 1.25	126.25	+ 1.25	137.90	+ 1.25	02/19
FlntHlsRa	u N-10	120.65	+ 2.00	128.00	+ 2.00	141.65	+ 2.00	02/19
Hess	u 1-10	136.45	+ 1.50	140.20	+ 1.50	159.70	+ 1.50	02/19
Marathon	b 1-10	123.28	+ .45	131.81	+ .46	146.52	+ .46	02/19

Marathon	u N-10	119.35	+ 1.70	126.16	+ 1.70	139.35	+ 1.70	02/19
Murphy	u N-12	119.60	+ 2.95	124.60	+ 4.95	135.60	+ 4.10	02/19
Shell	b 1-10	123.53	+ .76	131.13	+ .76	149.98	+ .76	02/19
Sunoco	b 1-10	123.75	- .75	128.25	- .75	147.75	- .75	02/20
Texaco	b 1-10	123.90	+ 1.00	132.90	+ 1.00	150.00	+ 1.00	02/19
TransMont	u N-10	119.60	+ 1.35	-- --	-- --	139.30	+ 5.85	02/19
Valero	b 1-10	124.85	- 1.20	132.35	- 1.20	143.85	- 1.20	02/19
Valero	u N-10	119.70	+ 1.00	126.70	+ 1.00	139.70	+ 1.00	02/19
XOM	b 1-10	123.50	- 6.05	129.50	- 6.05	149.50	- 6.05	02/18
LOW RACK		119.35		124.60		135.60		
HIGH RACK		136.45		140.20		159.70		
RACK AVG		123.71		131.00		146.00		
OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - 02/19								
FOB COLONIAL		108.110		-- --		-- --		
OPIS GULF WATERBORNE DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)								
FOB TAMPA		119.20		121.90		125.95		
BRD LOW RACK		122.82		128.25		143.85		
BRD HIGH RACK		124.85		134.22		150.00		
BRD RACK AVG		123.65		131.74		148.47		
UBD LOW RACK		119.35		124.60		135.60		
UBD HIGH RACK		136.45		140.20		159.70		
UBD RACK AVG		123.76		130.18		143.52		
CONT AVG-02/20		123.71		131.00		146.00		
CONT LOW-02/20		119.35		124.60		135.60		
CONT HIGH-02/20		136.45		140.20		159.70		

TAMPA, FL 2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

****OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE****
****OPIS GROSS PURE ETHANOL PRICES****

	Terms		Move	Date
Murphy	u N-12	186.15	+ 9.95	02/19
LOW RACK		186.15		
HIGH RACK		186.15		
RACK AVG		186.15		
UBD LOW RACK		186.15		
UBD HIGH RACK		186.15		
UBD RACK AVG		186.15		
CONT AVG-02/20		186.15		
CONT LOW-02/20		186.15		
CONT HIGH-02/20		186.15		

TAMPA, FL 2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

****OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE****
****OPIS GROSS NO.2 DISTILLATE PRICES****

	Terms	No. 2 LS	Move	No. 2 HS	Move	No. 2 ULS	Move	Date
BP	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	131.19	+ 5.19	02/19
BP	u N-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	136.61	+ 5.45	02/19
Chevron	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	128.00	+ 4.90	02/19
Citgo	b 1-10	133.60	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	134.30	+ 5.90	02/19
Citgo	u 1-10	133.60	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	134.30	+ 5.90	02/19
Colonial	u N-12	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	129.10	+ 5.45	02/19
FlntHlsRs	u N-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	129.40	+ 6.00	02/19
Hess	u 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	137.90	+ 5.00	02/19
Marathon	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	129.49	+ 4.14	02/19
Marathon	u N-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	127.35	+ 4.10	02/19
Murphy	u N-12	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	128.35	+ 6.45	02/19
Mystik	b 1-12	133.60	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	134.30	+ 5.90	02/19
Shell	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	130.10	+ 5.87	02/19
Shell	u N-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	128.75	+ 5.81	02/19
Sunoco	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	130.85	+ 4.50	02/20
Texaco	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	128.00	+ 4.90	02/19
TransMont	u N-10	125.130	+ 6.53	-- --	-- --	127.260	+ 5.52	02/19

Valero	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	132.35	+ 6.75	02/19
Valero	u N-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	129.00	+ 7.30	02/19
XOM	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	130.68	+ 4.40	02/20
LOW RACK		133.60		-- --		127.35		
HIGH RACK		133.60		-- --		137.90		
RACK AVG		133.60		-- --		131.05		
OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - 02/19								
FOB COLONIAL		117.450		-- --		120.200		
OPIS GULF WATERBORNE DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)								
FOB TAMPA		123.50		-- --		126.25		
BRD LOW RACK		133.60		-- --		128.00		
BRD HIGH RACK		133.60		-- --		134.30		
BRD RACK AVG		133.60		-- --		130.93		
UBD LOW RACK		133.60		-- --		127.35		
UBD HIGH RACK		133.60		-- --		137.90		
UBD RACK AVG		133.60		-- --		131.20		
CONT AVG-02/20		133.60		-- --		131.05		
CONT LOW-02/20		133.60		-- --		127.35		
CONT HIGH-02/20		133.60		-- --		137.90		

c=out of product

TAMPA, FL

2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE

OPIS GROSS NO.2 NRLM DISTILLATE PRICES

	Terms	NRLM	Move	No2 HS NRLM	Move	ULS NRLM	Move	Date
Citgo	b 1-10	133.60	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
Citgo	u 1-10	133.60	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
Marathon	b 1-10	130.00	+ 4.65	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
Marathon	u N-10	127.85	+ 4.60	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
Mystik	b 1-12	133.60	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
LOW RACK		127.85		-- --		-- --		
HIGH RACK		133.60		-- --		-- --		
RACK AVG		131.73		-- --		-- --		
BRD LOW RACK		130.00		-- --		-- --		
BRD HIGH RACK		133.60		-- --		-- --		
BRD RACK AVG		132.40		-- --		-- --		
UBD LOW RACK		127.85		-- --		-- --		
UBD HIGH RACK		133.60		-- --		-- --		
UBD RACK AVG		130.73		-- --		-- --		
CONT AVG-02/20		131.73		-- --		-- --		
CONT LOW-02/20		127.85		-- --		-- --		
CONT HIGH-02/20		133.60		-- --		-- --		

TAMPA, FL

2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE

OPIS GROSS PREMIUM NO.2 DISTILLATE PRICES

	Terms	No.2 LS Pre	Move	No.2 HS Pre	Move	No.2 ULS Pr	Move	Date
Citgo	b 1-10	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	134.80	+ 5.90	02/19
Citgo	u 1-10	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	134.80	+ 5.90	02/19
Mystik	b 1-12	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	134.80	+ 5.90	02/19
LOW RACK		134.10		-- --		134.80		
HIGH RACK		134.10		-- --		134.80		
RACK AVG		134.10		-- --		134.80		
OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - 02/19								
FOB COLONIAL		117.450		-- --		120.200		
OPIS GULF WATERBORNE DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)								
FOB TAMPA		125.75		-- --		128.50		
BRD LOW RACK		134.10		-- --		134.80		
BRD HIGH RACK		134.10		-- --		134.80		
BRD RACK AVG		134.10		-- --		134.80		
UBD LOW RACK		134.10		-- --		134.80		

UBD HIGH RACK	134.10	-- --	134.80
UBD RACK AVG	134.10	-- --	134.80
CONT AVG-02/20	134.10	-- --	134.80
CONT LOW-02/20	134.10	-- --	134.80
CONT HIGH-02/20	134.10	-- --	134.80

TAMPA, FL

2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE

OPIS GROSS NO.2 RED-DYED DISTILLATE PRICES

	Terms	No.2		Pre		No.2				
		LS	RD	Move	LS	RD	Move	ULS	RD	
BP	b 1-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	131.49	+ 5.19	02/19
BP	u N-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	136.91	+ 5.46	02/19
Chevron	b 1-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	128.50	+ 4.90	02/19
Citgo	b 1-10	--	--	--	134.10	+ 6.30	134.70	+ 5.90	134.70	02/19
Citgo	u 1-10	--	--	--	134.10	+ 6.30	134.70	+ 5.90	134.70	02/19
FlntHlsRs	u N-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	129.80	+ 6.00	02/19
Hess	u 1-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	137.55	+ 5.00	02/19
Marathon	b 1-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	130.00	+ 4.14	02/19
Marathon	u N-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	127.85	+ 4.10	02/19
Murphy	u N-12	--	--	--	--	--	--	128.70	+ 6.45	02/19
Mystik	b 1-12	133.60	+ 6.30	134.10	+ 6.30	134.70	+ 5.90	134.70	+ 5.90	02/19
Shell	u N-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	129.25	+ 5.81	02/19
Sunoco	b 1-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	131.35	+ 4.50	02/20
Texaco	b 1-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	128.50	+ 4.90	02/19
TransMont	u N-10	123.45	+ 5.67	--	--	--	--	127.76	+ 5.52	02/19
Valero	u N-10	--	--	--	--	--	--	129.35	+ 7.30	02/19
LOW RACK		133.60		134.10				127.85		
HIGH RACK		133.60		134.10				137.55		
RACK AVG		133.60		134.10				131.56		
OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - 02/19										
FOB COLONIAL		117.450		117.450				120.200		
OPIS GULF WATERBORNE DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)										
FOB TAMPA		123.85		126.10				126.60		
BRD LOW RACK		133.60		134.10				128.50		
BRD HIGH RACK		133.60		134.10				134.70		
BRD RACK AVG		133.60		134.10				131.32		
UBD LOW RACK		--	--	134.10				127.85		
UBD HIGH RACK		--	--	134.10				137.55		
UBD RACK AVG		--	--	134.10				131.76		
CONT AVG-02/20		133.60		134.10				131.56		
CONT LOW-02/20		133.60		134.10				127.85		
CONT HIGH-02/20		133.60		134.10				137.55		

o=out of product

TAMPA, FL

2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE

OPIS GROSS NO.2 W/LUBRICITY DISTILLATE PRICES

	Terms	No.2		No.2		No.2			
		LS	Move	HS	Move	ULS	Move	Date	
Citgo	b 1-10	133.60	+ 6.30	--	--	--	--	02/19	
Citgo	u 1-10	133.60	+ 6.30	--	--	--	--	02/19	
Mystik	b 1-12	133.60	+ 6.30	--	--	--	--	02/19	
TransMont	u N-10	125.13	+ 6.53	--	--	--	--	02/19	
LOW RACK		133.60		--	--	--	--		
HIGH RACK		133.60		--	--	--	--		
RACK AVG		133.60		--	--	--	--		
OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - 02/19									
FOB COLONIAL		117.450		--	--	--	--		
OPIS GULF WATERBORNE DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)									
FOB TAMPA		123.90		--	--	--	--		
BRD LOW RACK		133.60		--	--	--	--		
BRD HIGH RACK		133.60		--	--	--	--		

BRD RACK AVG	133.60	-- --	-- --
UBD LOW RACK	133.60	-- --	-- --
UBD HIGH RACK	133.60	-- --	-- --
UBD RACK AVG	133.60	-- --	-- --
CONT AVG-02/20	133.60	-- --	-- --
CONT LOW-02/20	133.60	-- --	-- --
CONT HIGH-02/20	133.60	-- --	-- --

o=out of product

TAMPA, FL 2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE

OPIS GROSS PREMIUM NO.2 W/LUBRICITY DISTILLATE PRICES

	Terms	No.2 LS Pre	Move	No.2 HS Pre	Move	No.2 ULS Pr	Move	Date
Citgo	b 1-10	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
Citgo	u 1-10	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
Mystik	b 1-12	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
LOW RACK		134.10		-- --		-- --		
HIGH RACK		134.10		-- --		-- --		
RACK AVG		134.10		-- --		-- --		
OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - 02/19								
FOB COLONIAL		117.450		-- --		-- --		
OPIS GULF WATERBORNE DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)								
FOB TAMPA		126.15		-- --		-- --		
BRD LOW RACK		134.10		-- --		-- --		
BRD HIGH RACK		134.10		-- --		-- --		
BRD RACK AVG		134.10		-- --		-- --		
UBD LOW RACK		134.10		-- --		-- --		
UBD HIGH RACK		134.10		-- --		-- --		
UBD RACK AVG		134.10		-- --		-- --		
CONT AVG-02/20		134.10		-- --		-- --		
CONT LOW-02/20		134.10		-- --		-- --		
CONT HIGH-02/20		134.10		-- --		-- --		

TAMPA, FL 2009-02-20 10:01:10 EST

OPIS CONTRACT BENCHMARK FILE

OPIS GROSS NO.2 RED-DYED W/LUBRICITY DISTILLATE PRICES

	Terms	No.2 LS RD	Move	No.2 LS RD Pre	Move	No.2 ULS RD	Move	Date
Citgo	b 1-10	-- --	-- --	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	02/19
Citgo	u 1-10	-- --	-- --	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	02/19
Mystik	b 1-12	133.60	+ 6.30	134.10	+ 6.30	-- --	-- --	02/19
TransMont	u N-10	123.450	+ 5.67	-- --	-- --	-- --	-- --	02/19
LOW RACK		133.60		134.10		-- --		
HIGH RACK		133.60		134.10		-- --		
RACK AVG		133.60		134.10		-- --		
OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - 02/19								
FOB COLONIAL		117.450		117.450		-- --		
OPIS GULF WATERBORNE DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)								
FOB TAMPA		124.25		126.50		-- --		
BRD LOW RACK		133.60		134.10		-- --		
BRD HIGH RACK		133.60		134.10		-- --		
BRD RACK AVG		133.60		134.10		-- --		
UBD LOW RACK		-- --		134.10		-- --		
UBD HIGH RACK		-- --		134.10		-- --		
UBD RACK AVG		-- --		134.10		-- --		
CONT AVG-02/20		133.60		134.10		-- --		
CONT LOW-02/20		133.60		134.10		-- --		
CONT HIGH-02/20		133.60		134.10		-- --		

o=out of product

Copyright, Oil Price Information Service