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Agenda 
October 30, 2012 Regular Meeting 

Category 
B. CONSENT AGENDA 

Sub-Category 
Financial Management 

Approval Path 
FM (Purch-Melissa) 

Subject 
Award IFB #12 -1938-0V: Erie Road @69th Street East Intersection Improvements, Parrish, flo 

Briefings 
None 

Contact and/or Presenter Information 

Contact: Olga Valcich, Purchasing Division x 3055, Melissa Wendel, Purchasing Official x 3056. 

Presenter: Vincent Canna, Sr. Engineering Specialist, x 7338, leff Streitmatter, P.E., Project Management Division 
Manager x7335. 

Action Requested 

AuthoriZation to award IFB #12-1938-0V, Erie Road @69th Street East Intersection Improvements, Parrish, FL to 
the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder, Gator Grading 8< Paving, LLC of Palmetto, FlOrida for a total base bid of 
$1,005,555.20 (Option "A", 160 calendar days) and for the County Administrator or his designee to execute the 
Agreement and simultaneously accept the performance/payment bonds and the insurance certificate. 

Enabling/ Regulating Authority 

Manatee County Code of Law 

Background Discussion 

help 

The Work shall include the realignment of the 69th Street intersection at Erie Road by constructing two (2) thru 
lanes and a Right / Left turn lane at the new Intersection and the removal of the old intersection. The contractor 
shall reconfigure the existing south portion of 69th Street East and terminate the road north of the Railroad Right­
Of-Way, extending the existing sidewalk to the new intersection; tie the new pavement and sidewalk to the new 
Railroad tub; construct three (3) storm water retention ponds, storm water structures, pipes and roadside swales for 
stormwater management; jack and bore 36" steel casing for storm water pipe, crossing underground of the existing 
Railroad; install water service, reclaim water service and forcemain service and connect to the existing Utility lines. 
All work shall be constructed in accordance with FOOT Standard Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction, 
2010 Edition, Manatee County Highway, TraffiC 8< Stormwater Standards dated 2007 and Manatee County Public 
Works Utility Standards and Spedficatlons dated 2011 for the water main work, reclaimed water main, sanitary 
sewer and force main work. 
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July 20, 2012 - September 5, 2012 appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability was 
broadcast via DemandStar, mymanatee.org and the Manatee Chamber of Commerce. Forty-nine (49) bidders 
obtained copies of the bid from DemandStar. Seven (7) bids were received; three (3) from Manatee County, two 
(2) from Sarasota County, one (1) each from Charlotte and Hillsborough Counties. 

September 14, 2012 - Received recommendation from Project Management Division, Public Works recommending 
award to the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder Gator Grading & Paving, LLC, Palmetto, FL in the amount of 
$1,005,555.20, based on Bid "A", with a construction time of 160 calendar days. 

County Attorney Review 
Not Reviewed (No apparent legal issues) 

Olga ValClch - () 
Role; Iteln Autilor 

Explanation of Other 

Reviewing Attorney 
N/A 

Instructions to Board Records 

Onginal to Board Records and Gator Grading & Paving, LLC, 2704 105th Street East, Palmetto, FL 34221 

Copy to: Olga Valcich, Purchasing Division, Vincent Canna, Kathleen Casey, Marsha Colburn, Johnnie Faye Yetter, 
Project Management Division, Public Works Department. 

Cost and Funds Source Account Number and Name 
Road Impact Fees ( 3806048460/3236048460/4046048470) 

Amount and Frequency of Recurring Costs 
NA 

Attachments: (list) 

Iff:1 ~ 
O/;£,T. 

RECOMMENDATION.BID 
IAJ~J"LLA nON .. QoJ 

~ 
lJL~2.!Ll~SU REIY 

LETTER REF.BOND.pdf 
Re..corqe~tJiQmIs 
Agreement Ins 

Certif.pdf 

~ .£ij 
2J1~LQriQ.. 6011 {;Is 
Agreement.lns 

Certif.pdf 

log out 

Version: 1.2.1.3 - 1.2.7.5 'S' 2002-2012, Idea Integration Corp. 
All Rights Reserved 
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BID"A" 
160 CALENDAR DAYS 

IFB '12·1938-0V 
TRAN8PORTAnON PROJECT NO. 8048480 

ERIE ROAD. 89TH STREET EAST INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 
BID "A"· 81081- 4 

1 . >~ ",: '«, " 'C7 

~w:o.=::.:"':C w"::,, a! ~ir me. 

'::~' e;::~ 

. 
" , .' . ,,':,'; -:,4; " 

~una IMM_, me. 
7_28th Street CoIa1 !aft -::'1SR31-
'==~~ 

PWIIII Gorda, f1. .. 2 
(Ch8rIotte Coumy) 

'",:.r"., ,,":-:,: -< ,:,;~ '" :,'f"C, ':--::>l-'-';:~,':-' ., '':',' ," ,:;c " ,,>,," :, '. ,''': " l:':'w~" <-;'c ,'1>,-, ~, :;' .' '. • : ,,' "., "'"'' ',' c' "; ,"',:l;" ~ ~:,,,,,:, ,l" ~ ":" :;;' '::': 

UnIt ~ Llneltam unit Qty PrIce 
Mobilization La 1 fSII.620.oo fSII,fI2O.oo 

~ of TndtIc (MOl) La 1 134.350,00 134,350.00 

IU81'OTAI.. MOB1IJZAnON AND MOT P2.170.oo ' 

BIIn'IoItcIe, PItmI8IHIIII, Type HI EA 3 1255.00 $785.00 

s.cu-m a.m.r LF 8,1S" $0.110 $7.739.10 

[Aoeune Turbidity a.m.r LF 80 111.00 S650.00 

SOU TI1ICIdng "-lIon OftIce EA 1 $1.780.00 11.780.00 

~--. • ClrubbIng, IftcIudIng A8phaIt Removal AC 11 $8.4110.00 $83.3110.00 

~ of ExIeIIng c-n... plIftfMfII IY 100 515.55 $1.555.00 

~Ibex ("Id) alngle EA 4 $200.00 1800.00 

~Ibox, ReIooe1e EA 1 $81.00 $81.00 
~pecI" ExomIIIon, Inc:IucIe ... "-aI of hlellnS 
~, 80erIty I!xIeIIng a\lllbeee, ~r am: La 1 $21,890.00 $21.8110.00 

All DllIIUrbed Areu, Inc:IucIe Fill 

~--""'n CY 13,034 53.80 ",9,529.20 

SubeaII~ CY 100 $16.70 ".670.00 

~(AIIguter) CY S,327 .... 28 114.139.715 

II" atablllzed 8ubbMe (Type 8) IY 14,082 ... .35 "',126.20 
~ ... Group • - Type 8 12.1 EXCLUDED lot 
CrUIIhed c-nu Under 0r8ded AggregaIe lIeN IY 13,284 111.110 $157.&41.80 
OPl/On. I'OOT ICICI7 8PECIREV 'lie 8I1ALL 8E UIED 
2' T,.,. .., Aep/IIIIt ConcnIte TN 1,409 $71.00 1100.039.00 

I' Type .... A8phaIt c-nu TN 702 5711.00 $55,458.00 

ICemenI ConcnIte PIIftfMfII .... nfonMlCl, " BY 7U $30.00 $21.750.00 

10--CIa. U. TNnCh 8IlIb CY 10 5370.00 53,700.00 

~e (P-1) (<10') - (Addendum 12) EA 1 $2.840.00 $2.840.00 

~ (Jo1) (<10'). (Addendum'2) EA 1 $2.980.00 $2.960.00 

OrIIInItge atructure - MocIIIy I!xIeIIng EA 1 11,235.00 11,235.00 

.... (DItch IIoIIom T,.,. C) (Modify! EA 2 11,990.00 53.960.00 

~ (DItch IIoIIom Type D) (ModIfy) EA 1 53,066.00 53.065.00 

tnIatII (DItch ~T,.,. E) (ModIfy) EA •. _2 ___ $3.600.00 57.200.00 . 

Unit Extended Unit 
Price Price PrIce 

$&4,745.11 $&4,745.11 fSII.433.18 

154,773.77 154,773.77 1130,892.23 

"",1518.18 

1252.02 $768.06 $263.154 

51.00 ".691.00 $1.00 

$10.83 $IS48.50 ".83 
,',1S1SO.28 11.850.28 $1,348.88 

53.059.48 S33.e54.06 .... 410.20 

53.97 S397.oo 516.88 

5223.8& $814.78 595.05 

5142.80 $142.80 5106.01 

$21.688.17 $21.688.17 $28,205.84 

15.30 $69.060.20 15.11 

110.22 51.022.00 $22.49 

53.1S8 $11,844.12 $2.95 

14040 181.828.80 53.98 

"3.84 1163,573.76 $12.70 

$82.78 ,11 8.808.84 183.95 

197.31 166.311.82 1100.25 

135.17 125,498.25 ",'.01 

$453.55 .... 535.50 $300.00 

$2,354.06 $2,31S4.06 $2.080.85 

$2.3154.06 $2,354.06 $2.080.85 

$2,167.43 $2,187.43 $1.384.88 

$2.423.36 14.848.72 11,988.75 

$2.993.58 $2.993.56 $2.688.53 

53.532.71 $7.085.42 
L. .... ~~215:~ 

Emnded 
PrIca 

fSII.433.18 

1130,892.23 

5181,321\.41 

$790.82 

".519.00 

$431.50 

",348.88 

$48,512.20 

$1,688.00 

$380.20 

$106.G1 

$28,205.84 

188,803.74 

$2,249.00 

19.814.85 

$55.928.98 

"89,848.56 

$118,285.55 

$70,375.50 

129,732.25 

53.000.00 

$2.080.85 

$2.080.85 

11,31S4.88 

53.973.50 

$2.886.53 

_ 18.431.?!>. 

unit 
PrIce 

1140,Il00.00 

166,680.00 

$259.00 

$0.70 

".30 
$2.820.00 

$2,235.00 

19.40 

$195.00 

$28.55 

$40.995.00 

.... 70 

$17.80 

.... 10 

15.75 

$14,20 

$74.90 

"9.45 

$38.70 

5371.00 

$2.310.00 

$2.310.00 

11,545.00 

$2,225.00 

53.010.00 

53.600.00 
-~-~-. 

Extended 

~-- ..... ~.-

Price 

1140,900.00 

166.680.00 

1201,480.00 

$777.00 

".019.30 

""5.00 

$2,820.00 

$24,585.00 

5940.00 

5780.00 

528.55 

$40.995.00 

$81,259.60 

11.780.00 

113.840.70 

580.799.00 

1186.348.80 

$105,1S34.10 

$62.793.90 

$28.807 .ISO 

53.710.00 

$2.310.00 

$2,310.00 

$1,545.00 

14,450.00 

13.010.00 

17,200.00 

81712012 
I 



BID "A" 
160 CALENDAR DAYS 

IROADWAY CON'IlNUEO: 
I_I I'Wl 

No. ....No. ILN ....... 
21 10430-1740112 "',.,. CuIveIt AIOOO 12" 10 - (Addendum '2) 

rT I 0430-17J.11'IPIpe CuIveIt AIOOO 1.' CD 

26 I 0430-17J.124 tpJp. CuIveIt AIOOO 24' CD - (Addendum 12) 

21 I 0430-17J.21I1Plpe CuIveIt 12' x 1.' CD RCP - (AdcNndum'2) 

30 I 043CJaIII.121 ~ CRound) (1'") (CD) 

31 I O43CJaIII.I23IMEI (EI/lpClNI)l1Z" x "")lCO) 

32 1 04J0.II40121IMEI CRound) (12") (10) 

33 I 04J0.II401211!MEI (Round) (24") (ID) 

34 I 11122-1 ISldewIIIk ConcNIe .. " ThIck 

35 I 0S30-1 1Rip-Rap. 8aftd.Cement 

31 1 oao-MC 11-2' FIIvw 8Ione wlMInIII1 <ION FIller Pabric 

37 I OIIIO-MC I.,... - (AddIndum'2) 

31 I Dlil6-1-I IJ-k IIIId IIont, Ca8IIIII 01 ......... • 

31 I 0570+2 I&oddIntI ~ Turf) 

Er .=mDt." 
40 I Mc-u.1 .. , I Mc-u.2 

a Mc-u.2 

.u I Mc.u..t 
43a 1 Mc-u.s 

i8UBTOTAL ROADWAY 

Une ....... 

1w-1IetvIce 
I'--IIetvIce 

IIetvIce 
~It~ InoIudIng 24" x.· T_", I ..... 

~uatYIIIva 
'8U8TOTAL U11LI1'Y 

44 I G71»-2Q.11 ising' ..... 1IIgn, ,t.!, Lea v.n ,a 8' 

41 I G71»-2Q.40 ~,... .... IIgn, AIIIooale 

41 I G71»-2NO ISIngle Poet IIgn, Remova 

47 1 I7OO-MC loa--(AddIncIum 12) 

41 I 070W 
<II 0711-11-111 

Pegeaof7 

etro-ReIIecIM "--'t..---. All Colore 

It.ndan:f WhIte, 8oIId. •• 

LI' 1 0Iy 

LF I 112 

LF I 265 

LF I 154 
LFI542 

EA I 2 

EA 1 14 

EA I 8 
EA I 1 
BY I 310 

CY I 11 

CY I 10 

LF I 110 

8Y 112,000 

UnIt I ~_ 
EA I 1 

~ 
EAT1 
EA I 1 

EA I 1 

EA I 17 

EA I 1 
EA I ,. 

EA I 284 
LF 7,834 

·'L_~ 
- --III" PIMnIJLLC 

2704 101th sv.t EDt 
PaInMIIIo. FL M221 

''''1'IIItM CounIYI 
-----

-U-rilt~ ·~1IIed 

Prb I Prb 

137.00 $4.144.00 

$32.00 $9.120.00 

137.00 124.666.00 

133.00 $17.688.00 

$1,370.00 $2.740.00 

1810.00 $11,340.00 

$1,295.00 $7.no.00 
$1,570.00 $1,570.00 

125.00 $7,750.00 

S4OO.oo $4,400.00 

1240.00 12.400.00 

$620.00 $67,200.00 

51.65 $19,800.00 

$7III,m.lS 

2 
-Wic:iGNf1l 8Oi'ilII-;Tnc; 

P.O.1Iox 10127 
BrIIderIIon, FL M212 
~~~. 

Unit 
.PrIce. 

529.33 

$35.05 

$46.39 

$35.09 

$1.064.54 

$658.00 

$758.84 

$1,226.31 

127.82 
$358.03 

1206.68 

1532.60 

12.05 

ExtIIiIiW 
.Prlce 

$3,284.96 

$10,274.26 

$30.602.96 

$20.644.78 

12.129.08 

$9,212.00 

$4,541.04 

$1,226.37 

18.824.20 

$3,1138.33 

12,058.60 

$68,568.00 

12",600.00 ,,'2,a3a.72 

3 ._l.iliiii-,_ 
7401 28th 8tre1t Cowt EDt 

...... FLM2A3 
(~ ..... ~. 

Unit ExtIllCl4lcl 
.PrIce PrIce 

126.00 12.912.00 

133.84 $9.672.90 

$61.&1 $34,259.04 

$37.01 $20.069.42 

$603.27 $1,208.54 

S807.10 18.499.40 

$837.76 13.628.58 
$696.83 1695.83 

$32.50 $10,075.00 

$324.52 $3,569.72 

$140.47 $1,<104.70 

S395.72 1-43.529.20 
12.00 124.000.00 

tm.I87.C1e 

_"" 4. 
Better ROedl, InC. 

'I3t18R31 
PunIa Gorda, FL"2 
..1Charlotle CountY) 

Unit 
PrIce 

529.16 

$35.00 

$67.80 

$41.60 

$874.00 

$678.00 

$712.00 

$777.00 

$26.60 

$363.00 

$167.00 

$466.00 

$1.70 

Eidelidjd 
Prtc. 

$3,2&4.80 

$10,630.00 

$36,379.20 

$22.493.00 

$1,346.00 

$9,492.00 

$4,272.00 

STT7.00 
18,665.00 

$3,993.00 

$Ui70.00 

$61,260.00 

$20,400.00 

"'1"'1.86 
~ "': -~; -r- "<£,*t,, :;' ;:~ ~._~-~i~._,_. ~~ >'~:,;,?;;:-~;-i:~~~; '~-~_~·~~~;':~-:~-:;~·~;',':-~>l\.~;~~:;':;::~~~~~k;;-~P~:-:V -:.~. c'*~ ~ "~* 1; '-;,';-:'::."~:" ~'* :~:~~r :r\:~.:- ~,t~:~ ~~:<~~--~~;'-=:':~~?;\~1'-;~;;: !:;.;c~~ ~ l~;'v J, 

:: &IiiCIiId.j U/iit J EatendIId. I Unit I Gtdd I UnIt I ' ~ 
12,945.00 

12.770.00 

$3.795.00 

$6,500.00 

$535.00 

1280.00 

$175.00 

128.00 

$3.20 

$1.05 

~_. ___ Pm:. __ ... . .. _ .PIIClI _c. Prtc. Prb Prlce. 

12,945.00 

I2,no.oo 
$3,795.00 

$6,500.00 

$6311.00 

" •• 114&.00 

$4.760.00 

$175.00 

$494.00 

$908.60 

18,016.70 

$9,718.42 

$9."94.21 

$7,1183.44 

18,896.21 

$374.44 

1278.27 

$173.28 

$26.26 

$3.15 

$1.05 

$9,718.42 

$9 •• 94.21 

$7,1183.44 

16,896.21 

1374.44 

"."'.72 

$4.730.59 

$173.28 

$498.75 

1894.80 

18.0111.70 

$11,201.79 

$10,826.60 

$10,123.111 

S8,8B3.29 

$358.89 

1204.14 

$90.73 

$1.08 

$4.16 

$1.74 

$11,201.79 

$10,626.80 

110,123.51 

S8,8B3.29 

$358.89 

",423.01 

$3,470.38 

$90.73 

$20.52 

$1,181.44 

113,283,16 

"2,550.00 

$12,130.00 

$11,345.00 

17,7111.00 

$436.00 

$191.00 

182.00 

$71.06 

$4.20 

$1.20 

$12,550.00 

$12,130.00 

$11,345.00 

17.715.00 

$436.00 

...... 171.00 

$3,247.00 

882.00 

$1,349.95 

$1,192,60 

19,160.60 

W712012 
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BIOHA" 
160 CALENDAR DAYS 

~ADWAY: " 'c .'c. :--:',,-~, ''.:c/.;' ,Cr ", ,,;::c,.'· . 
'.' 

,IWII 
No. :~. Uneltem UnIt 

1 0101-1 [MobJliladIon La 

2 0102-1 M..m-nc. of Tr.fflo (MOl) La 

SUBTOTAL MOIIILIZAnON AND MOT 

3 0102-7 ..... C a.rrtceda, ~ Type '" EA 

.. 0104-1o.a ~a.rter LF 

• 0104-11 FfoIIIIng Turbidity a.rter LF 

• 0104-111 ~ T...oIdng "'-"011 DevIoe EA 

7 0111).1-1 Fleulng • Grubblng,lftcIudIng AapIuII\ Removal AC 

• 011004 RemoWI of II!xIIItIng ConcnIe Pa_Mt 8Y 

• 0111).7-1 M.nbolI (f'1d) IIIngle EA 

10 011D-MC ~II/Ibox,""'" EA 

iot2l).1-MC 
~ exr-.uon, InCIUda au. AImOVII of bI8IIns 

11 ~. IIcarIIy EatIng IIubINne, ~ 81111 La 
All Dlaturbad At... InctudIt FIll 

12 012001 ~exr-.uon CY 

13 01ZD-4 "'beoIIl!u8vIdIon CY 

14 012001 (Regular) CY 

1. 011004 r 8tabIIIzed SuIIbue (Type 8) 8Y 

" 02lIl-701 
~ ... Group • - Type 8 12.11 EXCLUDED 101 
CNIIhad ConoNIa Undar Graded AggnIpIe .... OptIon, IY 
fOOT lIOO7 IPECIREY '01 SIW.l. 8E USED 

11 0334-MC 2' Type ... Aaplulll CononIIe TN 
1. 03S7-MC l' Type 1-. Mph8It CononIIe TN 

1. 031002-1 CarMnI ConoNIa ~ Re/n1oroId, ,. 8Y 

20 040D-2-12 c-rate ClaM .. T-'t ,lab CY 

21 04211-2-41 MIIIIItOIe (1)-7) (<10') - (Addendum f2) EA 

21A 04211-2-71 MIIIIItOIe ( .... 7) (<10') - (Adclanclum f2) EA 

22 .... ,1 DnII,...1tructunt - Modify Exl8ll111J EA 

22 04211-1-121 In/eIlI (OIIch Bottom Type C) (Modify) EA 

2A 04211-1-1411 In/eIlI (OIIch Bottom Type D) (Modify) EA 

25 04211-1-118 ~~ Bottom Type I!)JModlfy) EA 

,. ... 017 

TRANSPOFITAnON PROJECT NO. 10484lIO 
ERIE ROAD. 88TH STREET EAST INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 

BID "A"· BIDS &·7 

C: ... '," .11 -,/';:'., " " Ii " 
WMIn ~CO!P. 

12113 12th Avenue Eut 
AlP "!'~ ~ualrIIIII of_l'1O!'da LLC 

,,0 Gene car... Roed 

~:=.~ ==-~ 
.;;. ,', '. "'e', " • -c, '_~ " ;,' -":" ' - _' (.,c" 

:: ~ Unit Extended 
Qty PI1ce PI1ce 

1 11 00,000.00 "00.000,00 $230,000.00 $230.000.00 

1 '93,000.00 193,000.00 1285,000.00 1285,000.00 

I1f13,ooo.OO 1115,000.00 

3 1460.00 $1.380.00 1778.00 12.334.00 

' .. till ".50 $12,898.50 $0.55 $4,129.045 

10 $9.25 $462.50 $8.20 $410.00 

1 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $1.800.00 $1,800.00 

11 18,800.00 194,800.00 $10,500.00 $115,500.00 

100 18.20 $820.00 $14.50 ",450.00 .. $125.00 $500.00 193.50 $374.00 

1 $55.00 155.00 $53.00 $53.00 

1 "8,500.00 "8,500.00 "5,500.00 $15,500.00 

13,OM $3.75 $48,877.50 12.80 133.888.40 

100 $3.75 $375.00 "0.50 ",050.00 

3,327 ".25 $4,158.75 $1.90 18,321.30 

14,012 $7.00 $98,384.00 12.70 137,940.40 

13,214 120.50 1271,912.00 "8.50 1246,384.00 

1,4Oa "0'.00 $142.309.00 $96.50 "35,988.50 
7Q2 "'5.00 $80,730.00 $118.00 193,538.00 

725 $43.40 $31,485.00 134.00 124,850.00 

10 $755.00 $7,150.00 1383.00 $3,830.00 

1 12.800.00 12.800.00 12,950.00 12.950.00 

1 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 12,950.00 $2.950.00 

1 11,740.00 ",740.00 1372.00 1372.00 

2 12,500.00 $5,000.00 11,Il00.00 $3,800.00 

1 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 12.850.00 12.850.00 

2 . $4,000.00 18,000.00 $3,Il00.00 '7.aoo.00 

-',,' ,~., 7 ,.' < ',- c' t:':'~' 

~"~m,lnc. .,01 eonl Roed NoBlddar 
(I T"'FL_!~ HII COlI 

., '"~C'-''' -,< .: -:""./:~ . ,',.': " ,¥ " ",", ,', " >: ,h;:;,'~'~ 
unit ~ 

Unit Extended 
PrIea PrIce PrI ... 

"85,000.00 1185.000.00 NoBlddfr No Bidder 

1242,000.00 1242,000.00 No BIddfr No Bidder 

$407,000.00 NoBldd ... 

1300.00 $900.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

$0.75 $8,449.25 No BIdder NoBtdder 

$8.00 $400.00 No Bidder No Bickler 

12.500.00 12.500.00 No Blddfr No Bickler 

$18,300.00 "79,300.00 No BIddfr No Bidder 

510.00 $1,000.00 No Bidder NoBIddeI 

"25.00 $500.00 No BIdder NoBlddet 

150.00 150.00 No81ddfr No 81ddet 

$47,256.00 $47,258.00 No Blddfr No 81ddet 

$3.64 $48,140.38 No BIddfr No Bidder 

120.00 12.000.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

18.38 121,22828 No Blddfr No Bidder 

$7.75 "08,903.00 NoBlddfr No Bidder 

$18.38 1217.264.32 No Bidder No Bidder 

'78.00 "09,902.00 No Bidder NoBlddet 

192.20 $64,724.40 No BIddfr No 8Iddet 

$40.00 129,000.00 No Bidder No Biddet 

$850.00 $6,500.00 NoBlddfr NoBidd., 

12.950.00 12,950.00 No8lddfr No 81ck1e1 

$3,940.00 $3,940.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

12,500.00 $2.500.00 NoBlddfr No Blddel 

$3,300.00 18,800.00 No8ldder No Blddel 

$4.300.00 $4,300.00 NoBlddfr No Biddet 

$4,700.00 $9,400.00 No Bidder No81ddet 

11712012 



IS ~ 
, II .. 7 '. j , 

BID"A" W..... ~CO!P. Ajax Paving !Mil8!*' O!. FlorIda LLC ~'Qnham, Inc. 
1213 12th A __ 1uI 810 Gene ar-, ROIId 8101 Cone AoIICI Ho8lcldar 

160 CALENDAR DAYS :=~' =:::.~ Tampa,FLI~ {HillabOrOugh 
ROADWAYeotmNUEO:; . '" ", .i •. ··• '. '. . . .:." ,.j • '... c ,. ,. •.•. ; .. " .'.:~., I"'i' .•.• :. '. '" '".' '.' :' '. ," ' .. , ... ~ ." ~..', .' ",." ..:,' .•.•.••. "'.,< •. ,; .".' ,';'0 • 

I'::.' :.:0. :.:. ~ Unit Extendld Una ~ .:'! Extended 
Unehm LF Oty .Prtc. ~ PrIM Price 

• 0431).174-112 Pipe Cutv.I A2GOO 12' ID • (AdlHndum 12) LF 112 $38.00 154,258.00 $23.00 $2,576.00 $40.00 154,480.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

27 0431).171-111 Pipe Cutv.t A2GOO 1r co LF 285 $48.00 $13,660.00 $35,00 $9,975.00 $39.00 $11,115.00 No BIdder NoBIdde( 

• 0431).171-124 PIpe Cutv.t A2GOO 24' Co • (Addendum 12) LF 1184 _00 $38,512.00 $52.50 $34.660.00 $48.00 $30,644.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

21 0431).171-211 Pipe Cutv.t 12' x 1r co ReP· (Addendum 12) LF 1542 $40.00 $21.660.00 $34.00 $16,428.00 $42.00 $22.7&4.00 NoBiddef No BIdde( 

30 D43I).I82.121 ~I!S (Round) (11' (CD) I!A 2 $1.100.00 $2,200.00 $957.00 $1.914.00 $950.00 $1,900.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

31 CI43O-IIIM23 iMl!S (EIIIptIoaI) (12" x 11' (CD) I!A 14 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 5850.00 $11,900.00 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

32 0430-II4-121 iMl!S (Round) (12') (SO) I!A 8 $960.00 $5.760.00 5850.00 $5,100.00 $900.00 $5,400.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

33 0430-II4-121 iMl!S (Round) (24') (ID) I!A 1 $1,445.00 $1.445.00 $1.000.00 $1.000.00 51.100.00 $1,100.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

M 0122-1 ~-nc c-nee'" ThIck 8Y 310 $23.45 $7,269.50 $25.50 $7.905.00 $30.00 $9,300.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

• 0lI30-1 Rlp-Rllp, s.nd-Ctment CY 11 $415.00 $5.335.00 $529.00 $5,619.00 $350.00 $3,850.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

31 0530-MC 1·2' RIvw __ wlMInIfI140N FIller Fabric CY 10 $1110.00 $1,900.00 $124.00 $1,240.00 $65.00 $950.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

37 CJIIO.IIC Delete· (Addendum 12) 

31 0lIl-1-1 ~k lind a-. CaIne DIamtIIer 31' LF 110 $550.00 $60,500.00 $545.00 $59,950.00 $700.00 $77,000.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

39 0170-1-2 ~Ing (Pertormence Tur1) IY 12,000 $2.20 $26,400.00 51.70 $20,400.00 $3.50 $42.000.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

IUBTOTAL ROADWAY $1.045.134.75 '''"110.05 ",on,OOI.19 NoBlclder 

UTILITY >. ~.""'.,' .• ,:.:.101;~ ;,;·r;..·:>;::·,.. .• . ',. j .. ~"::" .: •• ~~4.;: .L'I., "::-;'" Ii~'i: '; ••.. :;.:.,,..,;;;~:.,',.'#;./.;: :j':~", .. ":, 'P;':';,:' .b,;· ;, .. '7":~:;." ,,' •• ./, ,':~<'" ;'A,; .:q;..,;.; li/; r:·'-~>.L~~.·1::;~j ,: ;., ::;r ,,' 

'::.' f'1JOT 
Qty 

Unit IxtIndad .: ExtendId Unit ex::" UnIt Extended 
hmHo. Unehm linn PrIce PrIce PrIce Prll» PrIce PrIce 

40 MC-U-1 WIlIer IIervIoe I!A 1 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $8,750.00 $8,760.00 $24,500.00 $24,500.00 No Biddef No Bidder 

41 Mc-u-2 AWMa.rvtce I!A 1 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 125,000.00 $25,000.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

42 MC-u.a F-.In IIervIoe I!A 1 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $8,100.00 $9.100.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 No Bidder No BIdder 

42 Mc-u.4 HydrMt ~ InoIudIng 24' x I' TIPping _ I!A 1 $8,500.00 $6,500.00 $8,250.00 $9.250.00 $111,500.00 $111,500.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

43e Mc-u-e AdjIlllCYaIw I!A 1 $120.00 $120.00 $266.00 $266.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

iBUBTOTAL Ul1IJTY "'7,120.00 $32.888.00 *,100.00 No BIdder 

~AHOITRIPINQ'/"",p:·· '~""':!;;; .,~.;c~ ... ~."':~,~,p~."; "':"'~':'~' ;'i~·J.c,r [ .. ~~.;t; ,'t'l~", ,,;~' .'-'::1',~ :~"':::!'·.ii· ~,.f::':: ..,: .. \ ..• '! ... :,:.:.:." ":r,[,, ''". • .",~, :';'. y,,'." .• :" "':',:,:;;·,:::'7~.·,;;'1';k ,1"''''7: •• : •. ' ~:,:;:" !f~:::':w",;. :c.:;:-, '; ::~ .• , ,,, .. ·t* ~. 

I'::.' :.:0. Qty 
UnIt ~ Unit ~ Una ~ Unit Extended 

Unehm Unit .. PrIce PrIce PrIce PrIce ......,. 
44 071)0.»11 ~1ngIe Poet lien. F.~ .... hn 12 IF I!A 17 1318.00 56,406.00 $201.00 $3,417.00 $169.00 $3,213.00 No BIdder NoBldder ... 07I)0.J0.40 iSIIIIIta Poet SIgn, I'ItIIOOIIIe I!A 1 $86.75 $86.75 $89.50 $89.50 $84.00 $84.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

... 071)0.20-10 Istne'e Poet SIgn, "-- I!A 19 $58.00 $1,102.00 ".10 $20.110 $1.00 $19.00 No BIdder NoBldder 

47 0700-MC ~. (AdIHndum 12) ... 07IJe.3 ... ~ ........... AllCoIoI1l I!A 2&4 $5.50 $1,154720 $3.20 $906.80 $3.85 $1,093.40 No BIdder NoBldder 

49 0711-11·111 ItandenI WhIte. loUd, I' LF 7,834 $1.05 $9,015.70 $1.10 $8,397.40 $0.96 $7,461.32 No BIdder No BIdder 

..... 5017 111712012 
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BID TABULATION 

FOR 

IFB #12-1938-0V 

TRANSPORTATION PROJECT NO. 6048460 
ERIE ROAD @ 69TH STREET EAST INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 

BID "A" 
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 160 CALENDAR DAYS 

PREPARED BY: 
(ProJect ManagemenQ 

REVIEWED BY: 
(Project Engineer) 

PROJECT MANAGEMENT: 

APPROVED BY: 
(Purchasing) 

Page7ot7 

.5\1WU _'Rob\lJ\:)(f(\ 
Sherrl Robinson, Assessment Coordinator 

~ 
Sunny Fu; Project Engineer II 

I // Ow 1/'-1/ . c!~ 
./ / (A~ : r".I!/~ 

Vincent A. Cann&,Sr. Engineering Specialist 

CVI}/I~ 
Date 

q !/~ II Z 

Date 

9· (rJ 1'--
Date 

9/7!oZO/Z 
7 iSate 

91612012 



SID US" 
200 CALENDAR DAYS 

IFB t12·1g38-0V 
TRANSPORTAnON PROJECT NO. 804a480 

ERIE ROAD. 69TH STREET EAST INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 
BID "S" • BIDS 1 ·4 

1 -2 c 

Gator Gl'IIdln" " Pavtng u.c Wooctrull " Son., Inc. 
2704 105t11 8trMt Iaat P.O. 8p 10127 

PaIIMCto, f'L M221 ~,f'L142I2 
(at.n .. CountvI lMmat CounM 

i c 3 
McUocI Land ......... Inc. 
7. 28th 8IIwt Cowt Iaat 

IarIItoIa, PI. 342ot3 
(SarNobI CounM 

ROADWAYvc-" _"c,_>C ,cce ;., c'C'''''';'~ .. ' ": .C"c ~. ,',-: ·'c ,~ • \;c,,>, / ',' :", ;.' '. : c: . c< 'c -;J: ' .c, • ', __ ,",.' c;-:>,·"c·" 'C,' ", - "goT 
OW ~ ~ :.: ~ .:.:. ~ed 

No. _No. UneINm UnIt Prfeot PrIce 

1 0101-1 MobIIIIaIIon La 1 No81d No81d ~,745.11 ~,745.11 $58,433.18 $58,433.18 

2 0101-1 ~~ 01 TrattIo (MOl) La 1 No81d No81d $54,713.77 $54.713.77 1130.892.23 "30.892.23 

~U8TOTAL MOBllJZAl1ON AND MOT Nolld ,"8,1''''' ".,321.41 

3 0101-7 ..... C '"-anent, Type III SA 3 NoBld No BId 1252.02 $768.08 $283.54 $790.82 

4 011M-104 ~ ...... LF .. - No81d No BId ,UlO 18._.00 51.00 18.599.00 

I 011M-11 I'IoetIng TUItIIdIty ..,.., LF 10 No81d No BId "0.93 1548.10 $8,83 S431.1l0 , 011M-111 ~ TnocIcIng "-Ilon ~ SA 1 No81d No81d ".650.26 11.650.26 51.348.88 ".348.88 

7 0110-1-1 FIeaIInII " GrubbIng, including AaphaII Remowl At: 11 HoBId No Bid 13.059.46 $33,654.08 $4,410.20 148.1112.20 

• 0110-4 It-' 0I1!xI8IIng Concnd. '"--I 8Y 100 No Bid No BId 13.97 $397.00 "8.88 ".888.00 

I 0110-7-1 MtIIbolI (1'&1) Slngl. EA 4 Ho81d No £ltd $223.69 18904.78 196.05 $380.20 

10 0110-Me ~ ... boX, AeIootU SA 1 HoBId No BId "42.60 ,,42.80 "08.01 5108.01 

SpecIal 1bomIIIon, InoIudII ... It-' 01 ExJ.u"ll 
No BId 11 0120-1-MC ~, tIoIIrIty I!xiIIIIng tIubbuIt, "-tI\ouf -S La 1 No Bid 121.668.17 121.888.17 $28,205.84 $28.205.84 

All DIatuttMId ~ Include FBI 

12 0120-1 ~e-tlon CY 13,034 No BId No81d '5.30 $89.080.20 55.11 $89.803.74 

13 0120-4 ~utMoII~ CY 100 No Bid No81d "0.22 11.022.00 522.49 $2,249.00 

14 0120-41 (AeguI.-) CY 3,327 No BId No8k1 ,3.56 "1.844.12 12.95 '9.814.88 

111 0110-4 12°lUlbllbed ...... (Type II) BY 14,1112 Ho81d No BId $4.4<1 581.828.80 13.98 156.828.116 

~ lIeH Group •• Type II 12.1 EXCLUDeD 101 
13,204 18 

__ 701 
(:rwhed ConoNIe Undw GI'IIded ,,"NIl-... OptIon. IY NoBld No Bid "3.84 5183,573.78 512.7i "89.848.58 
f'DOT 2OIJ18PECIREV 'OI1HAU. BE USED 

11 0334-MC ~ Type ... MphIIIt ConofwI. TN 1,4011 No8ld No81d 182.78 5118.808.84 $83.95 "18,285.55 

11 0337-MC ~. Type .... AIIpIwIt ConcrtM TN 702 NoBld No BId $97.31 188,311.82 5100.25 510.375.50 

" 03lI0-2-1 jcem.nt, ConoNIe PIIvwMnI ~ ,. BY 721 No Bid No81d $35.17 125.498.25 541.01 129.732.25 

20 0401).2-12 jconcra c... .. TNnCh tlab CY 10 No81d NoBld $453.55 $4.53UO $300.00 13.000,00 

21 O42I-:Hl Manhole (Po7) (<10') • (Add-Sum 12) SA 1 No Sid NoBle: $2,354.08 12.354.08 12.010.85 $2,010.85 

21" 0421-2-71 MenhoIII (.1-7) «10') - (Addendum 12) EA 1 No Sid No8le 52,354.08 12.354.08 $2.080.88 12.080.88 

22 0421-11 1Dr1dn11f118tNctunI· Modify I!xIIItIng EA 1 No Sid No BId 12. 187 • .c3 12.187 . .c3 11.384.88 51.384.88 

22 O42I-I-12t ItnNU (OIIoIIltotIom Type C) (ModIty) SA 2 No81d No BId $2,423.38 $4.848.72 $1.988.75 13.973.50 

24 0421-1 ...... nItU lOI1ctI Bottom Type 0) (ModIfy) EA 1 NoSld No81e: 12,993.56 12.993.56 $2,888.53 12.888.53 

25 04211-1~~ "'~~ f.IotIoIIt~~ (Modify) SA 2 No81d ~ 13,532.71 '7.085.42 13,212.85 16,425.10 
-, ~-- .. - ..... - .. --.. -~ .. -

... 1of7 

'4 ,c , , 

Belt« Roeda, Inc. 
,., SA,.. 

Punta~ 
'Chartotte 

c~'- " " " ,j ;,. _ J~c ~c 

= Extended 
PrIce 

"8','00.00 "8','00.00 

$87,840.00 187.840.00 

tzal,740.00 

$259.00 $777.00 

$0.70 18.0111.30 

18.30 $4111.00 

12.820.00 12.820.00 

$2,235.00 124.1585.00 

$9.40 $940.00 

"95.00 $780.00 

126.55 128.155 

140,995.00 $40.995.00 

$4.70 181.259.80 

"7.80 ".780.00 

$4.10 "3,840.70 

55.75 $80.799.00 

"4.20 "88.3-48.80 

174.90 "05.634.10 

$89.45 1fl2.793.90 

138.70 126.807.50 

1371.00 $3.710.00 

$2.310.00 12.310.00 

$2,310.00 $2,310.00 

",545.00 '1,545.00 

$2,225.00 54.450.00 

13,010.00 $3.010.00 

S3.I!OO.OO $1,200.00 



BID "B" 
200 CALENDAR DAYS 

ROADWAY CONTINUED: 
Ineml f'PQT 

No. ... No. I Une Item 

2IS I 0430-174-112 ~ Cutv.1 A2000 12" SO • (Addendum 12) 

27 I 043Q017&-11'IPitM Culv.t A2OOO,." CD' 

2IS I 043Q017&-124IP1pe CuIv.t A2000 24" CD· (Addendum 12) 

28 I 043Q017&-218 (PIpe.CuIv.t 12" 111." CD RCP - (Addendum 12) 

~ I 043Q01ll2-121 IMElI (Round) ("") (CD) 

31 I 00Q0.IIIM23 ~E8 (EII1pIIcaI) (12" 111.") (CD) 

32 I 0430-1II4-121 lMes (Round) (12") (SO) 

33 I 0430-III4-129II1El1 (Round) (24") (SO) 

34 I CJS22.1 ~CononIIe4"Thlck 
311 I 011»1 imP-Rap,~.m 
30 I OII3O-MC 11-2" RhIw "-wlMI1'IIII14ON FIII..- Forie 

37 I 0II00MC IDeIIte • (ActdIndum 12) 

30 I 0SIII-1-1 1Jack.tmd Bore, CallIng DIamMw 31" 

31 I I)l7001·2 ISockJIng (PwfomuInoe Turf) 

sUBTOTAL ROADWAY 

UTIUTY 
I Item 1 fllC:JT 

No. ... No. I Une n.m 
40 I MCoIJ.1 IW-r ServIce 

41 MCoIJ.2 ,..,..ServIce 

42 Mc.u.a IF-m..,.. 
43 MCoIJ.4 IHydnmt ~Iy including 24" II'" TIIPPIn9 __ 

4311 MC-U-I lMJultVIIw 

sUBTOTAL UTILITY 

IsiGNINCI AN,D ~ .2.;,-,-~~;q ~-c,;' 
! IteIn I I'PQT 

No. .... No. I Une n.m 
44 I O7OI).zo.11 "Ingle PCMIt 1IIgn, ,.a~ L..a thin 1281' 

46 I 07(1).21).40 Islngle PCMIt Sign, ~ 

46 I O7QO.2HO """"Ie PoIt Sign, "-

41 I 0700-MC IDtIIIta· (AdchncIum 12) 

46 I 070II-3 fRtIIro-AItIectIw '"--t II ....... All Colo ... 4. 0711-11-111 8tandanI WhIte, 8oIId, S· 

p*pZllf7 

lfIlOly 

lfI I 112 

LFI285 

LF I 1184 

LFIII42 
I!A I 2 
I!A I 14 

I!A I I 

I!A I 1 
SY 1 310 

CY I 11 

CY I 10 

lfI I 110 
8Y 112,000 

.-1' 
o.tOr ot.dlnt .. PiiVlng LLC 

J704 101Ch 8IrIIIt bit 
PaImItIo, f'L 14221 
{M~ ClI.MInM 

,0:; "". 

Unit I!xtencIecI 
PrIce PrIce 

No Bldl No Bid 

No Bid! No BId! 

No Bid! No Bid 

No Bldl No Bid 

No BId! No Bid 

No Bid! No Bid 

No BId I No Bid, 

No Bldl No Bldi 
No Bldl No Bid 

No Bldl No Bid 

No Bldl No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

2 
WOOdruff a Ion., Inc. 

P.o. Box 10127 
BrIIdenIon. f'L M282 
(Man"~nM 

Unit 
~. 

$29.33 

$38.05 

$48.39 

$38.09 

",064.64 
$868.00 

$756.84 

$1,226.37 

$27.82 

$358.03 

$205.88 

$S32.80 

Ixttncled 
~ 

$3.284.96 

110,274.26 

$30,802.96 

$20,844.78 

$2,129.08 

59,212.00 

$4,641.04 

11,226.37 

$8,824.20 

$3,936.33 

$2,068.80 

$68,568.00 

~ 
McIAod l:IIild8iivlCiie, Inc. 
74015 28111 8trwt Court Eat 

........ f'LM243 
{ ....... «:oIIrIIy}. 

Unit 
PrIce 

$26.00 

$33.94 

$51.81 

$37.01 

$803.27 

'607.10 
$837.76 

$896.63 

$32.60 

1324.52 

"40.47 

$395.72 

:. ' 

ext.Ided 
PrIce 

12.912.00 

59,872.90 

$34,289.04 

$20,059.42 

$1,208.64 

$8,499.40 

$3,628.58 

$896.63 

110,076.00 

$3,669.72 

11,404.70 

$43,629.20 

.. 4 
IIiiiIi'-AOada, Ino. 

1S3111 8A 31 
Punta Gorda, f'L 33882 
..LChIltotht ~nM 

Unit 
PrIce 

529.16 

$38.00 

$57.80 

$41.50 

$674.00 

$878.00 

$712.00 

$m.oo 
$28.80 

$363.00 

8167.00 

$466.00 

I!lIhInCled 
PrIce 

$3,264.80 

"0,830.00 

$38,379.20 

$22.493.00 

",348.00 
$9,492.00 

$4,272.00 

.m.oo 
$8,888.00 

$3,993.00 

",670.00 

$61,260.00 

No Bid No Bldl $2.05 I $24,800.00 I 82.00 I $24,000.00 I 81.70 I $20,400.00 

No Bletl 1812,333.721 S717.1111.o8 I 181'''''.85 

UnIt ~ -I - ~unlt J Eiiiridid:,! ~ =. ltihlnded 
Unit I Oly I PrIce PrIee ~_. ~._~ Pr\ee JrIC!L PrIce' PrIce 
I!A I 1 No Bid No Bid 59,716.42 59,718.42 811,201.79 811,201.79 $12,660.00 "2,650.00 

I!A I 1 No BId NoBldi 59,494.21 59,494.21 810,826.80 810,826.80 812, 130.00 "2,130.00 

I!A I 1 No BId NoBldi $7,963.44 $7,963.44 "0,'23.6' "0,'23.6' 811,346.00 $11,346.00 

I!A I 1 No Bid No Bid $8,895.21 $8,895.21 $8,883.29 sa,883.20 87,716.00 87,715.00 

EA I 1 No Bid NoBle! $374.44 $374.44 $388.89 $388.89 $438.00 $438.00 

No BId ",485.72 $31,423.08 $44.171.00 

--, 
UnIt I Oly I .:! ·~~l-~- .= ~ ::-c-r ex:::1id .=. ~ 
I!A I 17 I NoBIdI NoBldl $279.271 $4.730.591 $2D4.14 I $3,470.381 $191.001 $3,247.00 

I!A I 1 I No Bldl No Bldl "73.261 8173.261 890.731 890.731 $82.00 1 $112.00 

I!A I ,. I No Bldl No Bldl $26.261 $496.751 81.081 $20.521 871.051 ",349.95 

I!A 284 

lfI 17,134 
No Bid 

No BId 

No Bid 

No Bldl 
$3.15 

81.05 

$894.80 

$8,015.70 

$4.18 

S1.74 

S1,181.44 

$13.263.16 

$4.20 

81.20 

81,192.80 

89,180.80 

Af7nnt .. 
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Blo"B" 
200 CALENDAR DAYS 

ROADWAY: ' Jt '{ d-".'; ; .';;, , 
" 

Item :.:0, No. Uneltwn 

1 0101-1 Mobilization 

2 0102-1 MMn1_ of TI'IIffIc (MOT) 

SUBTOTAL MOBIUZA11ON AND MOT 
3 0102·74-11C a.nIcIIde, ~ Type III 

4 0104-10-3 SedIment a.mer 

• 0104-11 FloaIIIIII Turbidity 8an1« 

• 0104-1. [son TI'IICIdng "'-lIon o.vto. 
7 0110.1·1 ct.rtllll a Grubbing, including MphaJt "-' 

• 011D-4 "-' of ExMtIng ConcnIIe PII-.t 

• 0110.7·1 ~ .. Ibox (Fal) SIngle 

10 011CJ.MC ~"Ibox, RtIIOCIIte 

11 01»1-11C 
~ ... e-.tIon. Includ ..... "-' of I!xIeIIng 
Road. 8caI1fy I!xMtIne 8ubbue, Reoontour _ 

All DIeIutbed Areee, Include FUI 
12 01»1 fleguIar~ 

13 0120.4 Subtloll e-~1dIon 

14 0120-1 !mlNlnIcmen1 (Reg"" ,. 0110.4 r IItlIbIIiqd IIubIMM (Type 8) 

,. 02lIl-701 
= .... Group •• Type a 12.1 EXCLUOI!D tor 

CononIbt Under QI1Idad Aggt'llJllle lIMe OptIon 
!FOOT 1007 8Pt!CIREV 'OI8HALL BI! USED 

17 .... MC ~. Type .... Allphelt CononIIe ,. 0337-11C ~. Type 8-111 AepIIeIt eo-. 
1. 031002-1 ~ Concrebt PII-.t Relnforoed, ,. 

20 040002-1. ~ CIne" TnInch Blab 
21 0421-2-41 ~8111101e (1"-7) (<10'). (Addendum 12) 

21A 0421-2-71 ~1IIhoIe (""7) (<10') • (Addendllm 12) 

22 0421-11 pratnage etrvotu ... Modify IbIIItIng 

22 0421-1-121 "leta (DItch Bottom Type C) (MOdify) 

24 0421-1-141 InIeta (DItch Bottom Type D) (Modify) 

15 0415-1 .... InIeta (DItch Bottom Type ~~~ 
~ -

p.g.o4of7 

TRANSPORTATION PROJECT NO. 8048480 
ERIE ROAD 0 69TH STREET EAST INTERSEcnON IMPROVEMENTS 

BID "B" • BIDS 15 - 7 

0, r' I, .Li ;, ."'. ,'<d<' e , 
WMInI Conetructlon Corp. AID PIIvIng IncIuatrIM of florida LLC 

1213121h A_ .... .,0 ca.ne car-t Ao8CI 
PaInwtto, .... M221 Nokomle,"" ~m 
IMan .... COUnty) f8arnofll COUnty) 

;,. ; ""',::e': .' :; '!:f.:iC,': ,:C, '··'c:'.""". , .... <. ":,J :~::,.:;>,;. J+: 

:.: ~ Unit ex:::' Unit oty PrIee 

La 1 " 00.000.00 $100.000.00 $230.000.00 $230,000.00 

La 1 $93.000.00 $93.000.00 5338,000.00 5338.000.00 

"83,000.00 -.000.00 

EA 3 5460.00 $1,380.00 S795.00 $2,385.00 

LF 1,5118 $1.50 "2,898.60 $0.55 14.729.46 

LF 10 $9.25 $482.50 $8.30 1415.00 

EA 1 15,200.00 $5.200.00 $1.800.00 $1.800.00 

AC 11 $8.800.00 $94.800.00 110,500.00 $115.500.00 

8Y 100 $8.20 $B2O.oo $15.00 $1,500.00 

EA 4 $125.00 $500.00 195.00 $380.00 

EA 1 $55.00 $55.00 154.00 154.00 

La 1 "8,500.00 "8.500.00 $18,000.00 $18.000.00 

CY 13.034 53.75 $48,8n.50 12.80 $33.888.40 

CY 100 53.75 $375.00 "1.00 ".100.00 

CY a,a27 $1.25 14.158.75 ".90 $8,321.30 

8Y 14,012 $7.00 $98,364.00 12.70 $37.1J4O.4O 

BY 11,284 120.60 $211.812.00 $19.00 I252,OHI.oo 

TN 1,401 "01.00 "42,308.00 $18.00 "38.082.00 

TN 702 "'5.00 $BO.730.oo "20.00 $84,240.00 

8Y 725 143.40 $31,485.00 $35.00 $25,375.00 

CY 10 $755.00 $7,55().00 5370.00 $3,700.00 

EA 1 $2,800.00 12.800.00 $3.000.00 53.000.00 

EA 1 $3.400.00 $3,400.00 $3.000.00 $3.000.00 

EA 1 $1.740.00 $1.740.00 $3BO.OO $380,00 

EA 2 12.500.00 15.000.00 $1.900.00 53.800.00 

EA 1 53,700.00 $3,700.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 

EA 2 $4.000.~ , -~ . 
$8,000.00 $4.000,00 $8.000.00 

,,' ·7 ·.fo~· i' ,,,-'8; ..... ,", ' ,",' 
Cone , 0nIIuIm, Inc. 

.,01 Cone Road No8ldder r-pa.1'L _,0 
fHlU8barouah COUnty) 

;.' ,r'; ,::f ' ~ ""'.:.';:.',': '''.; .. ;,;.;;,,,,., ',,'';'''':;' :::,','!;;;';' 

:: ex::" Unit 
-Price PrIce 

$185,000.00 ,'85,000.00 No BIdder NoBldder 

$202,000.00 $202,000.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

$387,000.00 No BlCIder 

$300.00 $900.00 No8ldder No Bidder 

$0.75 $8.449.25 No BIdder NoBIddeI' 

$8.00 S4OO.00 No Bidder No BIdde! 

12,500.00 12,500.00 No BIdder No BIdder 

118,300.00 "19,300.00 No Bidder No8idder 

$10.00 ",000.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

$125.00 1500.00 No BIdder No8idder 

$60.00 $60.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

147,258.00 147,258.00 No BIdder NoBldder 

$3.14 $48,140.36 No BIdder No BIdd81 

120.00 $2,000.00 No BIdder No Biddet 

.U8 121,226.26 No8ldder No8idder 

$7.75 $108.903.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

118.38 1217,284.32 No BIdder No Bidder 

$78.00 '109,802.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

$92.20 154.724.40 No BIdder No BIddet 

$40.00 129,000.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

$850.00 $8,500.00 No BIdder No BIdder 

12.960.00 $2,850.00 No Bidder NoBIddeI 

$3,IJ4O.00 $3,1140.00 No BIdder No BIddet 

12.500.00 12,500.00 No BIdder No Bidder 

$3,300.00 $8.800,00 No Bidder No8idde1 

14,300.00 14.300,00 No BIdder No BIddet 

$4.700,00 $9.400.00 _ NoBldd~ No BIdder , , 

6/7/t'!)ft."" 



SID liS" 
200 CALENDAR DAYS 

ROADWAY CONnNUED:. lit_I 1'U01 
No. ..... No. I Line Item LF I 0Iy 

211 I 0430-174-112 (PIpe CuIvwt A2000 12" 80 • (Addendum 12) LI' I 112 

'Z7 I 0430-171-118 IPlpe Cw-1 A2000 18' CD LI' I 285 

211 I 0430-171-124IP1pe CuIvwt A2000 24' CD - (Addendum 12) LI' I H4 
21 I 0430-171-21IIP1pe Cw-112' x 1r CD RCP - (Addendum 12) LI' I 142 
30 I 0430-I82-1211IMI!S (Round) (1r) (CD) EA I 2 
31 I O43O.fI82.823I1AES (EIIlptIcIIl) (12' x 18') (CD) EA I 14 

32 1 0430-184-121 lYe. (Round) (12') (80) EA I • 

~ 
WeatrI Conlltructlon corp. 

12113 12th Avenue I!ut '''lItO, FL M221 
..1~~ 

Unit 
PrIce 

$38.00 

$48.00 

$58.00 

$40.00 

",100.00 

",000.00 
$1160.00 

II!xtended 
Price 

$4.256.00 

"3,680.00 

$38,512.00 

121,680.00 

S2.2OO.00 

"4,000.00 

15,780.00 

33 I 0430-I84-121IMES (Round) (24') (80) I EA I " ",445.00 I $1,445.00 
34 I 0122-1 isldawlllk Co ___ 'I' ThIck 1 8Y 1 310 I 123.45 I '7,289.50 

31 1 0IS30-1 IRIp-Rep.8IInd-Cement I CY I 11 I $485.00 I 15,335.00 

31 I OIS3O-MC 11.2"Rlvw8tonawIMIndI14ONFiItarFIIbrIo I cy I 10 I "90.00 I ",900.00 

37 I CIIIO-MC IDeIIU • (Addendum 12) 

31 I ...... ,.. IJacltMd 1Iore, CUIng DllImIIIar 31' 1 LI' 1 110 I $550.00 I $60,500.00 

,. I 0570-1-2 ~ng(~Turf) I BY 112,0001 $2.20 I $28,400.00 

IsUBTOTAL ROADWAY ",1)41,1134.75 

U1IUTY-~ 

' .... , "DOT I I I I Unit IxWndtd 
No. ..... No. Line """' UnIt Qty PrIce PrIce 

40 1 MC-U-1 iW-r"" I EA I " "4,000.00 I $14,000.00 

41 I MC-U-Z I.......... I EA I 1 I "3.500.00 I $13,500.00 

4Z I MC-u-a IF--..m...,,.OII lEAl 1 I $13.000.00 I "3.000.00 

4Z I Mc-u-4 ~ ~ including 24' x e· TllPPlnllBIMW I EA I 1 I $8.500.00 I $8,500.00 

43a I MC-u-e iMlUlil Valve I EA I 1 I "20.00 I "20.00 

8UBTOTAL unUTY 147,120.00 

!siGNING ANDIITJIIIPIHO~:''''';"·'-;;i -, 

,---~, 
Ala Paving IridulltrllllS-or I'kirlda u.c .,0 Gent ONM Road 

NoIDmIa,FL34271 
(8IruoII County) 

Unit 
PrIce 

124.00 

$35.00 

153.00 

$35.00 

$975.00 

$865.00 

$865.00 

".050.00 
$28.00 

$540.00 

$125.00 

$555.00 

$1.70 

Extended 
lItrIea 

$2,888.00 

$11,976.00 

$35,182.00 

"8,970.00 

$1,950.00 

"2,110.00 

15,190.00 

",050.00 

$8,060.00 

55,940.00 

",250.00 

$81,050.00 

$20,400.00 

$830,131.55 

7 
Cone a QrIIh8m, Inc:. .,01 Cone Road 

Tampa, FL 331510 
(H1lieborough County) 

unit 
~ 

$40.00 

$39.00 

$48.00 

$42.00 

$1150.00 

$1,000.00 

$Il00.00 

$1,100.00 

$30.00 

$350.00 

$85.00 

S7OO.00 

$3.50 

Extended 
PrIce 

$4,480.00 

"1,115.00 

$30,544.00 

$22,7&4.00 

",900.00 

"4,000.00 

15,400.00 

",100.00 

$11,300.00 

$3,950.00 

$850.00 

.n,ooo.oo 
$42,000.00 

",081,001.18 

8 

NoBldcl« 

Uiilt 

'rice 
No Bidder 

No BIdder 

No Bidder 

No Bidder 

No Bidder 

No Bidder 

No BIdder 

No Bidder 

NoBldde 

No Bidder 

No BIdder 

No BIdder 

No BIdder 

, 
btended 

PrIce 
No Bldderl 

NoBidde 

No BIdde: 

No Bidde 

No Blddei 

No BIddet 
No Bidder 

No Bidder 

NoBldde! 

No Blddei 

NoBIddeI 

No BIddet 
No Bidder 

No Bidder 

:'!----T-~---- r--= -I---~--T-=---:-r- ex:;:ed 
$8,950.00 $8,950.00 $24.500.00 124,500.00 No81dder No81dde, 

'7,800.00 '7,800.00 $25.000.00 $25,000.00 No BIdder No BIdder 

$8,250.00 $8,250.00 "7,500.00 '17,500.00 No Bidder No81dde 

$8,450.00 $8.450.00 '18,500.00 "8,500.00 No BIdder No BIdde, 

S270.oo S270.00 ",000.00 ".000.00 No8ldderl NoBidde 

133,120.00 "",100.00 No Bidder 

rftiml fOOT 
No. ..... No. I line Item UnIt I 0Iy I': ~ 1-'::-1 ex:::!ed-i:-l -::iId r ;:: uT-=-
44 I 0700-20-11 IsJngIe Potd lion, FId. Leu thin 1281' 

41 10700-20-40 t::r Potd SllIn, RIIocIItII 
41 0700-_ Ie Potd SIgn, ~ 

47 I 0700-MC 1DeIIIhI· (Addendum 12) 

41 I CI7OII-3 '"-enl M ..... All Colo,.. 

", 1 0711-11-111 • 8I8ncIanI WhIle, 8oIId, e' 

f'llgtl1I of? 

EA I 17 

.EA.J.......!. 
EAT1i 

EA I 214 

LI' I 7,834 

$318.00 

$81.75 

558.00 

.5.80 

$1.05 

15.408.00 

$86.75 

".'02.00 

".847.20 

$8.016.70 

S205.oo 
$81.00 

'1.10 

13.30 
$1.10 

$3,485.00 

191.00 

$20.90 

$1137.20 

$8.397.40 

"89.00 

'84.00 

".00 

$3.85 

SO.98 

$3,213.00 

184.00 

"9.00 

$1,093.40 

$7,481.32 

No8ldder 

NoBiddeI 

NoBi 

No Bidder 

No Bidder 

NoBIdde, 

No 81dde, 

No Bidde 

NoBldde 

No BIddet 

tar7J::1ft1? 



5 I 205 I a 
BID"B" w ..... ConIlruCflon Corp. AjU Paving IncluatrIes oIl'1or1da u.c Cona a GraIIIm, Inc. 

128312lt1 A_ Eut 110 Gena 0- Road 1101 ConaAolld I NoBIdd« 
200 CALENDAR DAYS PIIrnaao, PL 14221 Nokomla, PL 14271 Tampa, PL _,0 

( ........ County) (Saruota County) IHIIIIbOrouah County) 
[SlQNINO AND STRIPING CONTINUED: . ~ .' , 

" 
0 

.' 
, . ·r, 0" '::,," , ,',; ", " 

l '::.' :.:0. .:! ~ unit Ext_lei Unit ExtancIIeI Unit Extanded 
lIneltam UnIt Oty PrIce PrIce Price Price PrIce PrIce 

10 11711·11-123 IIhIncIanI, WIllie, IoIId, 12' (c.-wa'k) LF 110 53.75 $676.00 $2.30 $414.00 $2.00 $360.00 No Bidder No Bidder 

111 0711·11·125 8tandanI, Whn., IIoIId, 24' (Stop .., J.F 144 $7.50 $1,080.00 $4.20 $604.80 $6.10 $734.40 No Bidder NoBlddeI 

112 11711·11·180 llanclenl, WhIle, ....... (AIR CrouIng) EA 3 $925.00 $2.n5.oo $110.00 $330.00 $265.00 $795.00 No Bidder NoBIddeI 

112 11711·11·170 8tandanI, While, DlnICtIonaI Arrow EA 14 $76.76 ",074.50 $70.00 $980.00 $61.00 $1,134.00 No Bidder NoBIddetj 

114 11711·11·211 8tandanI, Yellow, 8oIId," LF 7.117 $1.05 $6,038.86 $1.10 $6,422.70 $0.98 $7,503.88 No BIdder No Bidder' 

IS 11711·11·234 lIMrmoplaetlo, 8t11nc18rd. YIIIow. Bold, 1.' LI' 308 $5.46 ",878.80 ".80 $664.40 53.80 ",108.80 NoBldder No Bidder 

JUBTOTAL 81QNlNO AND STRIPING 131,180,80 t24,237.AO $23_.71 NO~ 
SUBTOTAL BID PRIce ",317,231.35 '1,1&U88 •• " ,573,035.37 No8idd.~ 

DlSCRI!TIONARY WORK ".000.00 .... 000.00 .... 000.00 No Bid,*; 

~OTAL aiD PRICE "a" ·200 Calendar Dep $1.403.236.35 $1.141,888.85 $1,8511.036.37 NOBldciJ 

~~~h . 
I : '~'~cJ:" r~Addflndum #1 I r_ r_ r_ Nolillddftr 

.~ I'~'~(~:~;;'~ ~~~Unt#2 r_ r .. Y- NoBldriar 

lA/:iImc_.IdAddwldum n y_ r_ r.. No BIdrIar 

IFIorl4M TrwIch ..,., Act 

. " , 'IPubIlc ConITat:tIng • Envlrontnentlll CrImH 

lii::;:J: •.. ·f.~.··1 ".trIdII. vIt tor. '--I BwIn_ (If appIII:abIfI) I' 
f ~_J:..J<'''''""...::cr:~ _____ _ 

," B/dBond ·f I 

I~: 
~'of7 

y_ r_ r_ No BIdrIar 

COO cac COC No BIdrIar 

Y .. r .. 

r .. r_ 

No No 

Y .. r_ 

WA IVA 

r_ 

r .. 

No 

r_ 

~/&ror 
Tt*1 BId PrIce ahould ". 
",168,036.37 for BId "S" 

NoBldriar 

No BIdrIar 

NoBIddar 

NoBlddftr 

NoBlddar 

Dl712ft1~ 



BID TABULATION 

FOR 

IFB #12-1938-0V 

TRANSPORTATION PROJECT NO. 6048460 
ERIE ROAD @ 69TH STREET EAST INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENTS 

BID"B" 
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 200 CALENDAR DAYS 

PREPARED BY: 
(Project Management) 

REVIEWED BY: 
(Project Engineer) 

PROJECT MANAGEMENT: 

APPROVED BY: 
(Purchasing) 

Page7of7 

'jNMi RDb~'Of\ 
Sherr' Robinson, Assessment Coordinator 

~ 
Sunny Fu, Project Engineer II 

~,,5t?&({(~ 
Vincent A. Carma, Sr. Engineering Specialist 

9J!}/J~ 
Date 

q / loll~ 
Date 

~~/- ({J -( '--

Date 

~~£ te 

91612012 



T umer Insurance & Bonding Co. I A dollar's worth of service for every premium dollar 

T 
Alabama 

Birmingham 

Decatur 
Mobile 

Montgomery 

Florida 
PanamaCi!y 

September 25, 2012 

1\ls. Olga Valcich 
Contract Specialist, Purchasing Division 
Manatee County 
Manatee County Government Administration Building 
1112 Manatee Avenue West, Suite 803 
Bradenton, FL 34205 

Re: Authority to Date Bonds and Powers of Attorney 
Principal: Gator Grading & Paving, LLC 
Bond No.: 58699668 - 016051824 
Project: IFB#12-1938-0V - Erie Road @ 69th Street Intersection 

Improvements, Parrish, Florida, Project No.: 380-6048460 

Dear Ms. Valcich: 

Please be advised that we, the Sureties, hereby authorize you to dattt-the bond 
and powers of attorney concurrent with the date of the contract. ~ 3: 

If you need anything further, please contact this office. 

Regards, 

ffM.u~ 
Renee Ellis, Attorney in Fact 

-u 
c:: 
:::0 
("") 

::c 
>­
(f) 

Z 
G? 

Western Surety Company and Uberty Mutual Insurance Company 

Corporate Headquarters: 

= t::-:> 
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0 
c:: 
z 
-I 
-< 

www.tumerfirst.com 
2601 Bell Road Montgomery, AL 36117 PO Drawer 230789 Montgomery. AL 36123 

Tel 3342440004 Fax (insurance) 3342440350 (bonds) 334 244 6556 



e-agenda.NET - Agenda Item Fully Approved 
eAgendaAdmin 
to: 
olga. valcich 
10/231201201:26 PM 
Show Details 

History: This message has been forwarded. 
Agenda Title: October 30, 2012 Regular Meeting 
Meeting Date: 10/30/2012 

Page 1 of 1 

Agenda Item: Award IFB #12-1938-0V: Erie Road @69th Street East Intersection Improvements, 
Parrish, FL. 

The above item has received full approval and will appear on the specified agenda. 

Thank you. 

e-agenda.NET Administrator 
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