MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

SOURCE SELECTION
Heavy Equipment Rental :
| RFQ #12-1956GE DATEPOSTED  [,/27[2. ynéL
PURCHASING  DATE CONTRACT

REPRESENTATIVE George Earnest, 749-3044 SHALL BE AWARDED

- CONSEQUENCES IF

DEPARTMENT  Various Departments DEFERRED N/A
' ~ Dennjs Wallace
SOURCE AUTHORIZED BY
RECOMMENDATION Multiple Suppliers DATE I Wellor
ACTION DESIRED

Authorization to establish annual blanket purchase orders to multiple suppliers, awarded on a line-bg—line basis, for
heavy equipment rental on an “As Required Basis”. These blankets orders will expire in June 2015.

' ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY .
Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code,
ordinances, resolutions, policy.) ,

Manatee Code of Laws

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

¢ Public Works Department, Fieet Sérvices, Property Managemeht or any other department or division
shall place orders among the suppliers based on equipment length of rental time needs, availability
and pricing as per the Quotation Tabulation Form.

« In the event of equipment not being available from the primary source or if for any other reason the
County reserves the right to make an alternate selection from suppliers having submitted aresponse
to the RFQ 12-1956GE.

Recommend issuing blanket orders to all suppliers as awarded in the Quotation
SUMMARY Tabulation Form.

ATTACHMENTS: (List in order as ,
attached) ' INSTRUCTIONS TO BOARD RECORDS:

Quotation Tabulation Form
N/A

COST $100,000 (annual est) SOURCE (ACCT# & NAME) Various Departments

AMT./FREQ. OF RECURRING
COSTS (ATTACH FISCAL
COMMENTS IMPACT STATEMENT) N/A




RFQ 12-1956GE

QUOTATION TABULATION FORM
ltems are awarded to the vendors (shown in bold) as listed at the prices herein.
HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL

DELIVERY &
NO.IEQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES
GROUP A - CRANES
A1 |20 Ton, Hydraulic, Truck Mounted, Rubber Tire
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID kzo BID
Without Operator (Ring Power) NO BID $808.00 $1,870.00 $3,011.00 $2,920.00 $2,920.00 [$100/$100
A2 120 Ton, Hydraulic, Metal Track Crawler
With Operator NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
A3 |25 Ton, Hydraulic, Truck Mounted, Rubber Tire
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $1,100.00 $3,125.00 $6,975.00 $6,900.00 $6,825.00 [$125/8125
A4 |25 Ton, Hydraulic, Metal Track Crawler
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
35 Ton, Hydraulic, Truck Mounted, Rubber
Tire, Boom Length up to 155°, Spreader Bar &
A5 JAccessories
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID
Without Operator (Ring Power) NO BID $1,330.00 $3,230.00 $7,838.00 $7,600.00 $7,600.00 j$100/$100
35 Ton, Hydraulic, Metal Track Crawler, Boom
Length up to 155', Spreader Bar &
A6 JAccessories
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID INO BID NO BID
Without Operator NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
A7 150 Ton, Hydraulic, Truck mounted, Rubber Tire
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator (Ring Power) NO BID NO BID NO BID $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 |$300/$300




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NO.{EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS Lm._oxcm CHARGES
A8 |50 Ton, Hydraulic, Metal Track Crawler

With Operator _zo BID NO BID NO BID _zo BID |nO BID |NO BID NO BID
Without Operator ING BID NO BID NO BID [NOBID [NOBID [NOBID INO BID
A9 |50 Ton, Friction, Metal Track Crawler
With Operator NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID Ino BID INnoBID |NO BID
Without Operator NO BID INO BID INO BID NO BID INO BID Ino BID INnO BID
A10}50 Ton, Friction, Truck Mounted, Rubber Tire g
With Operator kzo BID Ino BID NO BID NO BID Ino BID NO BID NO BID
fthout Operator (Ring Power) [NGBID NO BID [NO BID $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 |$500/3500
{A11]90 Ton, Friction, Truck Mounted, Rubber Tire
E_S Operator NO BID NO BID INO BID NO BID |no BID INnoBID INo BID
fthout Operator (Ring Power) NO BID NO BID [NO BID $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 |$1000/51000
120 Ton, Truck Mounted, for Counter-Weight
A12|Truck
With Operator NO BID |NO BID NO BID NO BID InO BID INo BID NO BID
[Without Operator (Ring Power) [NO BID [NC BID [NO BID 1 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 1@.4 000/31000
GROUP B - LOW BOYS
50 Ton capacity with 12' width, Mack Tractor
B1 |and Roger Trailer or Equal
With Operator (Graber Excavating) $200.00 $1,600.00 $5,600.00 $17,000.00 $50,400.00 $88,000 $250.00
_;z::oc. Operalor (Graber Excavating) NO BID 1,600.00| $5,600.00 $17,000.00 $50,400.00 $88,000.00 $250.00
30 Ton capacity with 10' width, Mack 1ractor
B2 |and Roger Trailer or Equal
With Operator (Graber Excavating) $200.00 $1,600.00 $5,600.00 $17,000.00 $50,400.00 $88,000.00 $250.00
Without Operator (Graber Excavating) |NO BID $1,600.00 $5,600.00 $17,000.00 $50,400.00 $88,000.00 $250.00




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NO.JEQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS  |PICKUP CHARGES
GROUP C - FRONT END WHEEL LOADER
C1 |1.5 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 910F or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $72.00 $576.00 $2,850.00 $11,500.00 $34,000.00 $68,000.00 $250.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) NO BID $288.00 $720.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $10,800.00 $800.00
i
Air Conditioned Cab INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INOBID INO BID |NO BID
Hydraulic Quick Couplers NO BID NO BID INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Forks (Flagler) NO BID $50.00 $100.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 [included
Bucket NO BID NO BID NG BID NG BID [NOBID [NOBID NO BID
Root Rake NO BID INO BID INO BID INO BID [nO BID INO BID NO BID
Grapple Rake NO BID [NO BID INCBID NG BID NG BID NG BID NO BID
Grappler Hooks NO BID [NOBID NO BID [NOBID INOBID [NO BID NO BID
C2 |2.0 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 918F or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $72.00 $576.00 $2,850.00 $11,500.00 $34,000.00 $68,000.00 $250.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) NO BID $500.00 $1,250.00 $3,100.00 $9,300.00 $18,600.00 $800.00
"add"
Air Conditioned Cab INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID |NO BID |NO BID
Hydraulic Quick Couplers NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID |[NO BID INO BID
Forks (Flagler) “INO BID $50.00 $150.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 [inciuded
Bucket _molma NO BID INOBID NO BID INOBID INO BID NO BID
Root Rake (Flagler) NO BID $75.00 $185.00 $550.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 [Included
Grapple Rake NO BID |NCBID NG BID [NOBID NO BID NG BID INO BID
Grappler HOOks NO BID [NGBID NO BID [NO BID NG BID NG BID [NO BID




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NO.IEQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS  |PICKUP CHARGES
C3 |2.5 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 928F or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $72.00 $576.00 $2,850.00 $11,500.00 $34,000.00 68,000.00 $250.00
Without Operator Emﬂﬂmsﬁ: N/A $515.00 $1,255.00 $3,335.00 $10,005.00 $20,010.00 {$100/$100
Tadd"
Air Conditioned Cab NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hydraulic QUICK Couplers NOBID NOTED NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
oTKks (Nett Hental) N/A ~$50.00 ~$100.00 $300.00 $900.00 $1,800.00 |NO BID
Ucket (Neff Rental Included
00T Hake (Neff Rental) N/A ~$75.00 ~$150.00 — $400.00 $1,200.00 $3,400.00 [NO BID
—Grapple Rake (Neff Hental) N/A ~$200.00 $600.00 ~ $1,600.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00 [NO BID
Grappler Hooks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
C4 |3.0 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 938F or Equal
With Operator {(Woodruff & Sons) $80.00 $640.00 $3,100.00 $12,000.00 $35,000.00 $70,000.00 $250.00
Without Operator (H&E Eguipment) NO BID $625.00 $1,600.00 $4,000.00 $10,800.00 $21,600.00 $300.00
*add"
Air Conditioned Cab NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hydraulic Quick Couplers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Forks (H&E Equipment) NO BID $100.00 $250.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 |N/C W/Unit
Bucket NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Root Rake (H&E Equipment) NO BID $100.00 $250.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 |N/C W/Unit
Grapple Rake (H&E Equipment) NO BID $150.00 $300.00 $800.00 $2,400.00 $4,800.00 |N/C W/Unit
Grappler Hooks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
C5 |4.0 Cubic yard Bucket, Cat 950 F or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $90.00 $720.00 $3,500.00 $13,000.00 $38,000.00 $74,000.00 $250.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) NO BID $850.00 $2,100.00 $5,200.00 $15,600.00 $31,200.00 $800.00
*add"
Air Conditioned Cab NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hydraulic Quick Couplers NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Forks (Flagler) NO BID $50.00 $150.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 |NO BID
Bucket (Flagler) Included
Root Rake (Flagler) NO BID $75.00 $185.00 $550.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 |NO BID
Grapple Rake NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Grappler Hooks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NO.[EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (8) MONTHS (6) MONTHS  IPICKUP CHARGES
C6 |5.0 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 966F or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $115.00 $920.00 $4,500.00 $17,000.00 $50,000.00 $100,000.00 $300.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) NO BID $1,150.00 $2,900.00 $7,200.00 $21,600.00 $43,200.00 $800.00
"add"
Air Conditioned Cab NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hydraulic Quick Couplers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID
Forks (Flagler) NOBID $50.00 $150.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 |NO BID
Bucket (Flagler) Included
Root Rake (Flagler) NO BID $75.00 $185.00 $550.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 |[NO BID
Grapple Rake NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Grappler Hooks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7.0 Cubic yard Bucket, Cat 980F, 1H 550, Clark
C7 |175C or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $130.00 $1,040.00 $5,000.00 $19,000.00 $55,000.00 $110,000.00 $350.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) NO BID $1,650.00 $4,200.00 $10,500.00 $31,500.00 $63,000.00 $800.00
"add"
Air Conditioned Cab NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hydraulic Quick Couplers NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Forks (Flagler) NO BID $50.00 $150.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 |NO BID
Bucket (Flagler) Included
Root Rake (Flagler) NO BID $75.00 $185.00 $550.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 |NO BID
Grapple Rake NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Grappler Hooks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
[NO.[EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS _ [PICKUP CHARGES |
GROUP D - FRONT END CRAWLER
LOADER
D1 |3/4 Yard
With Operator NO BID {NO BID |NO BID NO BID InoO BID |nO BID NO BID
Without Operator (H&E Equipment) NO BID $350.00 $785.00 $1,799.00 $5,385.00 $10,770.00 $200.00
| D21 1/4 Yard
With Operator NO BID NO BID INO BID NO BID NO BID |nO BID |NO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID [NOBID INO BID |NO BID
D3 |1 1/2 Yard
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID |NO BID NO BID |NO BID
Without Operator [NO BID [NO BID NO BID INGBID |NO BID INO BID [NO BID
D4 |5 Yard
With Operator INnO BID |NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID |no BID {NO BID
Without Operator [NO BID [NO BID NO BID INO BID INO BID INO BID |NO BID




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
[NO.{EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR F DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS  |PICKUP CHARGES
GROUP E - DUMP TRUCKS
E1 |5 Yard Capacity
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $48.00 $384.00 $1,900.00 $7,200.00 $21,000.00 $42,000.00 |NO BID
ithout Operator (Ring Power) NO BID $177.00 $487.00 $1,760.00 |[NO BID NO BID $100/$100
E2 [Tandem - 15 Yard Capacity
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $68.00 $544.00 2,600.00| $10,000.00 $28,000.00 $56,000.00 |[NO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID Ino BID INnO BID
E3 |Tri-axle - 18 Yard Capacity
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $68.00 $544.00 $2,600.00 $10,000.00 $28,000.00 $56,000.00 |NO BID
Without Operator INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID InO BID INO BID Ino BID
E4 |Semi-tractor trailer dump
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $75.00 $600.00 $2,800.00 $11,000.00 $30,000.00 $60,000.00 |NO BID
Without Operator INO BID INO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID INO BID NO BID
ES5 |Flatbed - 2 Ton Capacity
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $48.00 $384.00 $1,900.00 $7,200.00 $21,000.00 $42,000.00 [NO BID
Without Operator INO BID INO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID |nO BID NO BID
| E6 |30 Ton Dump Truck
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $125.00 $1,000.00 $4,800.00 $18,800.00 $56,000.00 $112,000.00 $400.00
_ Without Operator NO BID INO BID NO BID INO BID INO BID INnO BID |nO BID
| E7 |Articulated Dump Truck, 40-Ton Capacity
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $155.00 $1,240.00 $6,000.00 $22,000.00 $64,000.00 $128,000.00 $400.00
Without Operaor (Flagler Construction) NO BID $1,350.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $36,000.00 $72,000.00 $800.00




RFQ 12-1956GE

_ DELIVERY &
NO.|[EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS  |IPICKUP CHARGES
GROUP F - DRAGLINE - BUCKET &
CLAMSHELL
F1 |3/4 Yard
With Operator NO BID INO BID NO BID |NO BID INO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator NO BID INO BID NO BID NO BID InO BID Ino BID NO BID
F2 |1 1/4 Yard
With Operator NO BID INO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator NO BID [NGBID NO BID INGBID NO BID NG BID NO BID
F3 |2 Yard
With Operator |NO BID |nO BID Ino BID NO BID INo BID {NO BID NO BID
Without Operator |NO BID |NO BID INO BID NO BID INO BID INO BID NO BID
F4 |3-4 Yard
With Operator NO BID NO BID [NO BID NO BID InO BID [NO BID |INO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID ING BID NO BID |NO BID |NO BID INO BID
GROUP G - EXCAVATORS
Excavator with Hydroscopic Boom, 30' Reach,
G1 |Gradall, Badger or Equal
With Operator |[NO BID NO BID |[NO BID NO BID |NO BID |NO BID NO BID
Without Operator INO BID NO BID INO BID NO BID |NO BID INO BID |nO BID
Mini Excavator with Traller, Takeuchi Model
G2 |#TB25 or Equal
With Operator (Graber Excavating) NO BID $275.00 $1,375 $5,500.00 $16,500.00 $33,000.00 $125.00
_Jdmro:_ Operator (Graber Excavating) NO BID $150.00 $550.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $9,500.00 $200.00
Mini Excavator, 11,000 Ibs with Rubber Tracks,
G3 |Kubota V2203-M Model or Equal
With Operator (Graber Excavating) NO BID $285.00 $1,400.00 $5,800.00 $18,000.00 $36,000.00 $125.00
[Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $250.00 $700.00 $1,700.00 $5,100.00 $10,200.00 |$100/$100
G4 |Walkiing Excavator, all wheel drive,
enclosed cab w/AC: Menzi Muck,
Eurotech, or Equal
With Operator |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID |NO BID NO BIiD
Without Operator INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID |NO BID




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NO.J|EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES
GROUP H - BULLDOZERS
H1 |CAT D3CLGP or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $75.00 $600.00 $2,800.00 $11,000.00 $30,000.00 60,000.00 $300.00
Without Operator (Neff Hental) NO BID $455.00 $1,100.00 $3,200.00 $9,600.00 $19,200.00 [$100/$100
H2 |CAT D4HLGP or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $85.00 $680.00 $3,200.00 $12,500.00 $36,000.00 $72,000.00 $300.00
[Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $570.00 $1,365.00 $3,600.00 10,800.00] $21,600.00 |$100/$100
H3 |[CAT D6D or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $110.00 $880.00 $4,200.00 $16,500.00 $49,000.00 $98,000.00 $400.00
Without Operator (Nefl Rental) NO BID $790.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $16,200.00 $32,400.00 |$150/5150
H4 [CAT D6HLGP or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $110.00 $880.00 $4,200.00 $16,500.00 $49,000.00 $98,000.00 $400.00
Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $790.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $16,200.00 $32,400.00 |$150/5150
CAT D7 LGP - With Landfill Package, Enclosed
H5 |Air Conditioned Cab
With Operator NO BID |NO BID NO BID NO BID |no BID |NnO BID NO BID
Tthout Operator (Ring Power) [NO BID [NO BID $5,300.00 $15,200.00 [NO BID [NOBID [$550/5550
H6 [CAT D7H or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $160.00 $1,280.00 $6,400.00 $25,000.00 $72,000.00 $104,000.00 $500.00
[Without Operator (Ring Power) NO BID [NO BID $5,100.00 $14,400.00 [NO BID INO BID $550/$550
H7 |CAT D8n or Equal
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID NO BID |nO BID INO BID
ng Power) NO BID _ NO BID_ $5,500.00 | $15,600.00 [NO BID [NOBID $550/$550
- 50 e




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NO.|EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES
GROUP | - BACKHOE, RUBBER TIRE
11 |3/4 Yard Bucket
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $62.00 $496.00 $2,400.00 $9,400.00 $27,000.00 $54,000.00 $250.00
NO BID $275.00 $575.00 $1,300.00 $3,900.00 $7,800.00 |$100/$100
Rear Bucket |No Charge
eel Drive enta No Charge
Fxiended Boom (Neff Rental) NO BID $20 $50 $200 $600 $1,200 |NO BID
|2 |1 Yard Bucket
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $62.00 $496.00 $2,400.00 $9,400.00 $27,000.00 $54,000.00 $250.00
ithout Operator enta NO BID $275.00 $575.00 $1,300.00 $3,900.00 $7,800.00 |$100/$100
vadd"
Rear Buckel (Neff Rental) |[No Charge
7 Wheel Drive (Neff Rental) |No Charge
Extended Boom (Nefl Rental) NO BID $20.00 $50.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 |No Charge
13 |1 1/4 Yard Bucket
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $62.00 $496.00 $2,400.00 $9,400.00 $27,000.00 $54,000.00 $250.00
ithout rator (Neff Rental) NO BID $325.00 $805.00 $1,840.00 $5,520.00 $11,040.00 |$100/$100
“add"
Rear Bucket (Neff Rental) |No Charge
7 Wheel Drive (Neff Rental) |No Charge
Extended Boom |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [nO BID
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DELIVERY &
NO.|JEQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS  |PICKUP CHARGES
GROUP J - BACKHOE, CRAWLER/METAL
TRACK
CAT E 70 B or Equal. Min 14,500#, Max
J1 17,5004, Min. Digging Depth 15’
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $98.00 $784.00 $3,800.00 $15,000.00 $40,000.00 $80,000.00 $400.00
Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $385.00 $1,000.00 $2,700.00 $8,100.00 $16,200.00 |$100/$100
Min 25,600# - Max 30,000#, Min. Digging
J2 |Depth 18' 4" w/rubber tracks
With Operator (Flagier Construction) NO BID $560.00 $1,400.00 $3,300.00 $9,900.00 $19,800.00 $800.00
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CAT 312L or Equal. Min 26,000#, Max.
J3 |30,000#, Min. Digging Depth 19'
With Operator (Graber Excavating) NO BID $600.00 $2,950.00 $10,500.00 $32,000.00 $64,000.00 $400.00
Without Operator (Sunbelt Rentals) $495.00 $495.00 $1,595.00 $3,295.00 $9,885.00 $19,770.00 {$125/$125
CAT 320L or Equal. Min 42,000#, Max.
Ja |50,000#, Min. Digging Depth 21*
With Operator (Graber Excavating) NO BID $700.00 $3,500.00 $13,000.00 $40,000.00 $80,000.00 $500.00
Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $700.00 $1,780.00 $4,450.00 $13,350.00 $26,700.00 [$125/$125
CAT 320L Long Reach or Equal. , Min.
J5 145,000#, Max. 50,000#, Min. Digging Depth 38'
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $120.00 $960.00 $4,800.00 $19,000.00 $55,000.00 $110,000.00 $400.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) NO BID $1,040.00 $2,600.00 $6,500.00 19,500.00 $39,000.00 $800.00
CAT 325L or Equal. Min. 50,000#, Max.
J6 |60,000#, Min. Digging Depth 24
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $135.00 $1,080.00 $5,200.00 $20,000.00 $58,000.00 116,000.00 $400.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) NO BID $835.00 $2,080.00 $5,200.00 $15,600.00 $31,200.00 $800.00
CAT EL330L or Equal. Min. 65,000#, Max.
J7 |70,000#, Min. Digigng Depth 26’
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $150.00 $1,200.00 $5,500.00 $21,000.00 $60,000.00 $120,000.00 $400.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) NO BID $900.00 $2,240.00 $5,600.00 $16,800.00 $33,600.00 $800.00




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NO.JEQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS  [PICKUP CHARGES
_ AT 350L or Equal. Min. 95,000#, Max.
J8 110,000, Min. Diging Depth 30'
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $220.00 $1,760.00 $8,500.00 $32,000.00 $94,000.00 $188,000.00 $1,500.00
NO BID $1,700.00 $4,200.00 $9,000.00 $25,700.00 $53,400.00 |Quote
CAT 375L or Equal. Min. 170,000#. Max.
J9 |190,000#, Min. Digging Depth 35'
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $330.00 $2,640.00 $13,000.00 $50,000.00 $140,000.00 $280,000.00 $5,000.00
Without Operator (Flagler Construction) [NOBID $2,825.00 $7,040.00 $17,600.00 $52,800.00 $105,600.00 $800.00
GROUP K - TRENCHERS
K1 |Rubber tired, Vermier 450 or Equal.
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $57.00 $456.00 $2,100.00 $8,000.00 $22,000.00 $44,000.00 $250.00
fhout Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $250.00 $550.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $8,100.00 |$85/585
K2 |Crawler/Metal Track or Equal.
| With Operator NO BID |NO BID NO BID |INO BID NO BID kzo BID INO BID
Without Operator (H&E Equipment) NO BID | $130.00 $350.00 | $700.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $160.00
GROUP L - TANKER TRUCKS
L1 |5,000 Gallon Capacity for Clear Water
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $90.00 $720.00 $3,500.00 $13,000.00 $38,000.00 $76,000.00 $400.00
|  [Without Operator (Neff Rental) 4,000 GL NO BID $595.00 $1,575.00 $4,300.00 $12,600.00 $25,200.00 |$100/5100
L2 |Potable Water - Size Available:
With Operator NO BID [NO BID INnO BID NO BID NO BID INo BID NO BID
Without Operator NG BID [NOBID INCBID NO BID ING BID [NOBID NO BID




RFQ 12-1956GE

NO.

EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

HOUR

DAY

WEEK

MONTH

(3) MONTHS

(6) MONTHS

DELIVERY &
PICKUP CHARGES

——

M1

GROUP M - ROLLERS

Static, Double Drum Riding, 30" Drum, Asphait
and SOD

With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$50.00

$400.00

$2,000.00

$7,500.00

$21,000.00

$42,000.00

$250.00

[Wihout Operator (H&E Equipment)

NO BID

$170.00

$450.00

$1,210.00

$3,630.00

$7,260.00

$200.00

M2

Tandem, Riding, Vibratory, Asphalt 30" Drum
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$50.00

$400.00

$2,000.00

$7,500.00

$21,000.00

$42,000.00

$250.00

ithout rator (Sun entals)

$150.00

$150.00

$450.00

$940.00

$2,820.00

$5,640.00

$65/$65

M3

Vibrating, 80" min. Drum with 10 Ton Unit,
Sakai Model SV91D or Equal
With Operator

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

|[NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ithout Operator (Sun entals)

$495.00

$495.00

$1,395.00

$2,495.00

$7,485.00

$14,970.00

$125/$125

Vibrating Sheeploot Roller with 84" Drum, CAT
Model CP563 or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$92.00

$736.00

$3,500.00

$13,000.00

$38,000.00

$76,000.00

$300.00

Thout Operator (Flagler Construction)

$400.00

$1,150.00

$3,400.00

$10,200.00

20,400.00

$800.00

M5

Proumatic. Tired Sakai Model 15150H or
Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$82.00

$656.00

$3,200.00

$12,000.00

$35,000.00

§70,000.00

$300.00

NO BID

$280.00

$700.00

$1,750.00

$5,250.00

$10,500.00

$800.00

N1

GROUP N - CHERRY PICKER

27 1/2 Ton, Rough Terrain Crane, Lorain LRT-
275 or Equal
With Operator

[NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

|nOo BID

NO BID

|NO BID

Without Operator (Ring Power)

NO BID

NO BID

|NO BID

$4,300.00

$12,900.00

$25,800.00

$1,000/$1,000

N2

18/20 Ton mocu—ﬂqﬂ:mm: Crane, Lorain LRT-
18V or Equal
With Operator

NO BID

|nO BID

NO BID

NO BID

{no BID L

NO BID

NO BID

Without Operator Nn__._u Power)

NO BID

[NGBID

NO BID

$3,400.00 |

$10,200.00 |

$20,400.00

$1,000/$1,000




RFQ 12-1956GE

NO.

]

EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

HOUR

DAY

WEEK

MONTH

(3) MONTHS

(6) MONTHS

DELIVERY &
PICKUP CHARGES

o1

GROUP O - SCRAPPER

Scrapper, Caterpillar 615 or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$188.00

$1,500.00

$7,500.00

$30,000.00

$90,000.00

$180,000.00

$400.00

Without Operator (Ring Power)

|[NO BID

NO BID

$3,000.00

$8,300.00 |[NO BID

NO BID

$300/$300

02

Scrapper, Caterpillar 623 or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$270.00

$2,150.00

$10,500.00

$42,000.00 $

125,000.00

$250,000.00

$500.00

[Without Operator (Ring Power)

NO BID

[NGBID

$5,600.00

$15,800.00 |NO BID

NO BID

$425/$425

P1

GROUP P - COMPACTOR

Soil, Vibratory, Riding, Single Drum, 7 Ton or
Greater

With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$88.00

$704.00

$3,500.00

$13,000.00

$38,000.00

$76,000.00

$300.00

Without Operator (Neff Rental)

NO BID

$300.00

$625.00

$1,525.00

$4,500.00

$9,000.00

$100/$100

Double Drum Asphalt, mmﬂmﬁ__mq CB-224-B or
Equal
With Operator

|NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

|NO BID

|NO BID

NO BID

Without Operator (Flagler Construction)

INOBID

$155.00

$385.00

$960.00

$2,880.00

$5,760.00

$800.00

P3

Landfill Package, with Air Conditioned Cab,
CAT 826 or Equal
With Operator

[NO BID

NO BID

[nO BID

[nO BID

{nO BID

[no BID

{no BID

Without Operator (Ring Power)

[NOBID

[NG BID |

$7,000.00 |

$20,000.00 |NO BID

NO BID

|$2,000/$2,000

Q1

GROUP Q - MOTAR MIXERS

6 Cubic Feet
Without Operator (Sunbelt Rentals)

$75.00

$75.00

$210.00

$450.00

$1,350.00

$2,700.00

$50/$50

8 Cubic Feet
Without Operator (Neff Rental)

|no BID

$95.00

$200.00

$500.00

$1,500.00

$3,000.00

$55/$55




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
‘zo‘imoc__uzmz._. DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS ﬂn_oxcv CHARGES
[ o e r—————r e e

GROUP R - AERIAL WORK PLATFORMS
60' One Man Bucket , Simon Model M-P-60 or
R1 |Equal
With Operator NO BID NO BID |[NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
| ithout rator enta NO BID $455.00 $800.00 $1,600.00 $4,800.00 $9,300.00 |$85/$85
160 Two Man Bucket, Simon Model M-P-60 o
R2 |Equal
_ With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID Lzo BID INO BID
Without Operator (Neff Rental) [NO BID $455.00 $800.00 $1,600.00 $4,800.00 $9,300.00 |$85/$85
ACCESSORIES
$1 |4* Pump, wellpoint (Holland Pump) NO BID $161.60 $404.80 $1,012.00 $3,036.00 $6,072.00 |$104/$104
S2 ump, wellpoint (Holland Pump) NO BID $243.20 $608.00 $1,520.80 $4,562.40 $9,124.80 [$104/$104
53 (8 Pump, wellpoint (Holland Pump) NO BID $276.00 $689.60 $1,723.20 $5,169.60 $10,339.20 |$104/$104
s4 1 ump, wellpoint (Holland Pump) NO BID $324.80 $811.20 $2,028.00 $6,084.00 $12,168.00 |$104/$104
_ T2 1. wellpoint (1.5° diameter) with nsers and
g5 |lops (Holland Pump) __.._n_cnon swing $1.53 $3.84 $11.52 $34.56 $69.12 |$104/$104
T2 T wellpomnt (1.5 diameter) with risers and
$6 |lops (Holland Pump) Includes swing $1.53 $3.84 $11.52 $34.56 $69.12 |$104/$104
. wellpoint lameter) with risers and _
s7 |lops (Holland Pump) Includes swing $1.53 $3.84 $11.52 $34.56 $69.12 |$104/$104
Sa [6" Header Pipe (20 1. Tength) (Holland Pump) |NO BID $6.01 $15.04 $37.60 $112.80 $225.80 [$104/$104
S9 eader Pipe “Tength) Holland Pump  |NO BID $3.60 $9.02 $22.56 $67.68 $135.36 [$104/5104
S10 Jscharge Pipe ~Tength) Holland Pump|NO BID $5.76 $14.40 $36.00 $108.00 $216.00 |$104/$104
S11 ischarge Pipe ~Tength)Holland PumgNO BID $7.80 $19.52 $48.80 $146.40 $292.80 |$104/5104
S12[8" Sleeves {Holland Pump) Included W/HDR
[S73[10" Sleeves (Holland Pump) Included W/HDR
S14[8" Dresser Couplings (Holland Pump) NO BID $9.44 $23.60 $59.01 $177.03 $254.06 |$104/$104
S15 resser Gouplings (Holland Pump) NO BID $12.30 $30.75 §$76.88 $230.64 $461.28 |[$104/$104
S16|Hat Plugs (Holland Pump) [included W/HDR
S17/Bwing Joints (Holland Pump) |included W/Point




RFQ 12-1956GE

NO.

EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION
=i

HOUR
——

DAY

WEEK

MONTH

(3) MONTHS

(6) MONTHS
—

DELIVERY &
PICKUP CHARGES

T

GROUP T - MISCELLANEOUS
Motor Grader - JD 670, CAT 120G or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$80.00

$640.00

$3,100.00

$12,000.00

$34,000.00

$68,000.00

$300.00

[Without Operator (Flagler Construction)

NOBID

$800.00

$2,000.00

$5,000.00

$15,000.00

$30,000.00

$800.00

Ti1a

Motor Grader - JD 570 or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$80.00

$640.00

$3,100.00

$12,000.00

$34,000.00

$68,000.00

$300.00

Without Operator (Flagler Construction)

—

NO BID

$480.00

$1,200.00

$3,000.00

$9,000.00

§18,000.00

$800.00

T2

Mowing Tractor, 5' Bushog or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$45.00

$360.00

$1,600.00

$6,200.00

$18,000.00

$36,000.00

$200.00

Without Operator Emm no:c.:

INOBID

$310.00

$900.00

$2,350.00

$6,900.00

$13,650.00 |$95/$95

| T3

Mowing Tractor, 10' Bushog or Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$55.00

$2,100.00

$8,200.00

$24,000.00

$48,000.00

$300.00

Without Operator

|NO BID

NO BID

|[NO BID

NO BID

|[NO BID

|NO BID

[NO BID

T4

Sidewinder Mower Tractor
With Operator

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

{nO BID

InoBID

{no BID

Without Operator

INOBID

NO BID

|NO BID

NO BID

INO BID

INO BID

INO BID

T5

Mower Tractor with side attachment Mowing
Arm

With Operator

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

{nO BID

InoBID

|[NO BID

Without Operator

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

INO BID

INnO BID

NO BID

T6

Soil Stabilizer(Tamper) Bomag MPH-100 or
Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$180.00

$1,440.00

$7,000.00

“”G-g.s

§75,000.00

$150,000.00

$300.00

Without Operator (G.S. Equipment)

NO BID

$1,700.00

$5,000.00

$15,000.00

$45,000.00

$90,000.00

$400.00

Wheel Tractor, w/Broom or w/Blade
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons)

$45.00

$360.00

“d -§.8

$6,200.00

$18,000.00

$36,000.00

$200.00

fthout Operator (H&E Equipment)

NO BID

$175.00

$625.00

$1,295.00

$3,885.00

§7,770.00

$100.00

_-_-m

Rock Breaker, Tractor/Truck Mounted
With Operator

NO BID

|NO BID

{nO BID

NO BID

{no BID

{NO BID

INO BID

Without Operator

NO BID

NG BID

[NO BID

NO BID

|NO BID

INO BID

[NO BID




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NO.JEQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS  |PICKUP CHARGES
T9 | Truck mounted Aerial Lift & Aerial Bucket
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Power Post Hole Digger, Mounted, 6" to 36"
T10|Diameter
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $240.00 $690.00 $1,600.00 $4,050.00 $9,150.00 }$85/$85
T11|Flatbed Tractor Trailer, Long Bed
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
T12|Short Bed
With Operator NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
T13|Bobcat, 700 Series or equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $70.00 $560.00 $2,800.00 $11,000.00 $32,000.00 $64,000.00 $300.00
Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $175.00 $500.00 $1,100.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 |$85/$85
T14|Bobcat, 800 Series or equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $70.00 $560.00 $2,800.00 $11,000.00 $32,000.00 $64,000.00 $300.00
Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $185.00 $510.00 $1,200.00 $3,300.00 $6,600.00 [$85/$85
T15{4" Jet Pump
Without Operator (Holland Pump) NO BID $184.00 $460.00 $1,150.40 $3,451.20 $6,902.40 {$104/$104
T16{Boom Truck, 12 Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
"add"
60' One Man Bucket
With Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Without Operator (Neff Rental) NO BID $48.00 $1,515.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $21,000.00 |$125/$125
374 Ton Pick-Up Truck (4X4), Ford F250 or
T17|Equal
With Operator (Woodruff & Sons) $35.00 $280.00 $1,400.00 $5,500.00 $16,000.00 $32,000.00 {NO BID
Without Operator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
T18]|125 KW Portable Generator, 230/480 Volts (Neff Rental) $300.00 $1,000.00 $2,300.00 $6,600.00 $13,050.00 |$85/$85
750 KW Generator (1ruck Mounted), 480
T19|Volts (Sunbelt Rentals) $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $36,000.00 $72,000.00 |$250/$250
1000 KW Generator {1ruck Mounted), 480
Too|Volts (Sunbelt Rentals) $1,880.00 $1,880.00 $4,700.00 $14,100.00 $42,300.00 $84,600.00 |$250/$250




RFQ 12-1956GE

DELIVERY &
NOJEQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES
1500 KW Generator q ruck Mounted), 4160
T21|Volts (Sunbeit Rentals) $2,720.00 $2,720.00 $6,800.00 $20,400.00 $61,200.00 $122,400.00 {$250/$250
T2215,000 Gallon Water Wagon, Scraper Style (Ring Power) NOBID $2,400.00 $6,300.00 |NO BID NO BID $300/$300
T23]|Ingersoll-Rand 185 Air Comp. (Sunbelt) $100.00 $100.00 $300.00 $435.00 $1,305.00 $2,610.00 |$65/$65
Screening Plant, 1" to 4" Screens, Motor, 47+
T24|HP, Beit, 5' wide NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Conveyor Beit, 40" H, 20" W. Height of
T25|discharge + min. of 30" wide belt. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tos6|Scissor Lift 19-20 ft; must fit door opening
of 74" (safety bars collapse down) (Sunbelt) $115.00 $115.00 $255.00 $340.00 $1,020.00 $2,040.00 1$65/$65




