MANATEE COUNTY (RFQ) #12-0321DC PIPING AND STAIRS
SOUTHEAST WATER RECLAMATION BIO-SOLIDS FACILITY

Beach Construction Co.
Gainesville FL

Brandes Design-Build
Clearwater FL

DB Welding & Fabrication
Sarasota FL

PIPING

EST QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
1 |Mobilization 1 |Ls $ 300.00 no bid $ 2,775.00
2 [Misc Work and Cleanup 1 ]LS $ 100.00 $ 250.00
3 [|8” Stainless Steel Piping 25 1 LF |$ 540.00 | $ 13,500.00 $ 5,350.00
4 JAs-Built Record Drawings 1 ]LS $ 100.00 $ 325.00
TOTAL PRICE - PIPING $ 14,000.00 $ 8,700.00

Completion Days 90 8 - 14 wks

Beach Construction Co. Brandes Design-Build DB Welding & Fabrication

STAIRS Gainesville FL Clearwater FL Sarasota FL
EST QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
1 Mobilization 1 LS $ 3,100.00 no bid $ 16,842.00
2 Misc Work and Cleanup 1 ]LS $ 100.00 $ 475.00
3 Alum Stairs w/Platforms 1 |Ls $ 60,500.00 $ 4,443.51
4 As-Built Record Drawings 1 ]LS $ 100.00 $ 1,040.00
TOTAL PRICE — STAIRS $ 63,800.00 $ 22,800.51

Completion Days 90 8 - 14 wks

Beach Construction Co. Brandes Design-Build DB Welding & Fabrication

PIPING & STAIRS Gainesville FL Clearwater FL Sarasota FL
COMPLETE EST QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
1 [|Mobilization 1 |Ls no bid $ 500.00 $ 19,617.00
2 Misc Work and Cleanup 1 ]LS $ 1,000.00 $ 725.00
3 8" Stainless Steel Piping 25 | LF $ 320.00 | $ 8,000.00 $ 8,700.00
4 Alum Stairs w/Platforms 1 LS $ 46,000.00 $ 4,443.00
5 As-Built Record Drawings 1 ]LS $ 1,000.00 $ 1,365.00
TOTAL PRICE — COMPLETE $ 56,500.00 $ 34,850.00

Completion Days 120 8 - 14 wks




MANATEE COUNTY (RFQ) #12-0321DC PIPING AND STAIRS
SOUTHEAST WATER RECLAMATION BIO-SOLIDS FACILITY

Mullets Aluminum Products

TLC Diversitied Inc.

Sarasota FL Palmetto FL
PIPING
EST QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
1 [Mobilization 1 ]LS no bid $ 800.00
2 |Misc Work and Cleanup 1 |LS $ 400.00
3 8" Stainless Steel Piping 25 | LF $ 452.00 | $ 11,300.00
4 |As-Built Record Drawings 1 |LS $ 850.00
TOTAL PRICE — PIPING $ 13,350.00
Completion Days 90
Mullets Aluminum Products TLC Diversitied Inc.
STAIRS Sarasota FL Palmetto FL
EST QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
1 Mobilization 1 LS $ 300.00 $ 4,500.00
2 Misc Work and Cleanup 1 |LS $ 425.00 $ 3,000.00
3 Alum Stairs w/Platforms 1 ]LS $ 30,393.00 $ 36,000.00
4 As-Built Record Drawings 1 |LS $ 200.00 $ 4,600.00
TOTAL PRICE - STAIRS $ 31,318.00 $ 48,100.00
Completion Days 60 120
Mullets Aluminum Products TLC Diversitied Inc.
PIPING & STAIRS Sarasota FL Palmetto FL
COMPLETE EST QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
1 Mobilization 1 ]LS no bid $ 5,300.00
2 Misc Work and Cleanup 1 |LS $ 3,400.00
3 8" Stainless Steel Piping 25 | LF $ 320.00 | $ 11,300.00
4 Alum Stairs w/Platforms 1 ]LS $ 36,000.00
5 As-Built Record Drawings 1 LS $ 5,450.00
TOTAL PRICE — COMPLETE $ 61,450.00
Completion Days 120
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