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Bid Tabulation
IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase 1A
Bid "A" Based on a completion time of 200 Calendar Days

1 2 4 5
wawn McLeod Land Services Better Roads Inc. Woodruff & Sons, Inc. Frederick Derr & Company | C & M Roadbuliders, Inc.
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
el B ol arv. | el Cemcs PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE | PRICE PRICE
1 101-1 _|Mobilization 1 LS | $66,101.26]  $66,101.26] $208,200.00 $208,20000] $96.35851|  $96,358.51| $78,343.30]  $78,34330| $83,00000]  $83,000.00
2 102-1-1  |Maintenance of Traffic 1 Ls | s24335 $2,43356] $1314500]  $13,14500] $7.403 88 $7,403.88] $4,690.00 $460000] $2,87500  $2,875.00|
3 104-12  |Turbidity Barrier, Staked 200 | LF $2.77 $554.00] $0.60 $120.00} $2.86 $572.00 $2.50 $50000]  $1020  $2,040.00]
4 104-10-3 |Sediment Barrier (Includes Silt Fence & Synthetic Bales) 12807 | LF $124] $1599228 $0.60 $7.738.20)| $096| $12,381.12 $100]  $12,897.00] $105 $13,541.85
5 104-15  |Soil Tracking Prevention Device (Addendum #2) 2 EA | $2027.06 $4,054 12 $895.00 $179000] $2,20026]  $4.40052] $1,950.00 $390000  $82500 $1,650.00
6 104-16  |Rock Bags 600 | EA $559]  $3,354.00] $3.10 $1,860.00| $550|  $330000]  $1060 $6,360.00) $360]  $2,160.00|
7 110-11_ |Clearing and Grubbing 25 | ACc | 103008 s2597700] s275500 se887500]  $901.17| $2252025| $157500] $39,37500] $1,72000]  $43,000.00|
8 1201 |Regular Excavation (Includes Ponds) (Addendum #2) 50117 | CY $178] $105,228 26 $170] $100,498.90| $3.19| $188,583.23) $340| $20099780]  $200] $118,234.00|
8A | 120-1-MC |Excavation (Rocks or Cemented Sand) (Addendum #2) 1200 | cv $2.42 $2,904.00] $6.30 $7,560.00| $21.15|  $25,380.00] $5.20 $6,240.00] $4.00 $4,800.00]
9 ADDENDUM #2 REMOVES LINE 9
10 1204 |Excavation, Subsoil (Roadway) 2215 | cY $2.58 $5.714.70| $1340|  $29,681.00} $8.35  $18,49525 $500]  $11,075.00f $455  $10,078.25
1 1206 |Embankment, Regular 20364 | CY $6.06| $177,94584 $1.85|  $54,323.40| $098|  $28,776.72 $120]  $35236.80) $200|  $58,728.00]
12 1604  |12" Type B Stabilization (LBR 60) 26287 | SY $316]  $83,066.92 $4.00| $105,148.00] $297|  $78,07239) $345|  $90,690.15 $460| $120,920.20}
13 285-706 |8" Limerock, LBR 100 (Addendum #2) 22311 | sy $0.00 $0.00} $8.55| $190,759.05 $0.00 $0.00] $920| $20526120]  $1450| $323,509.50
BID EITHER #13 OR #13A (NOT BOTH) :
13A | 285706 |9" Graded Aggregate Base LBR 120 (Addendum #2) 22311 | sy $9.35| $208,607.85 $0.00 $000]  $1150| $256,576.50 $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00
14 | 331.2MC [2" Type S-1 Asphalt Concrete FDOT 2000 (Add. #2) 2454 | N $7268| $178,356.72 $64.25| $157,66950]  $71.90] $17644260]  $6865| $168467.10]  $7350| $180,369.00)
15 | 337-7MC [1" Asphaltic Friction Course (FC Ill) FDOT 2000 (Add. #2) | 1.228 | TN $117.23| $143,958 44 $107.00| $131,39600]  $93.12| $114351.36]  $91.30] $11211640]  $9540| $117,151.20|
< Single Barrel - 4' x 10' Box Culvert (Includes Wingwalls, 1 1 oo_ 15.00 113.560 oo_
16 | 410-700C [ Wae and Hosdwolt) (Ackdendum #2) 136 | LF $647.66|  $88,081.76 $69200| $9411200] $796.19| $108281.84]  $86000| $116,960. $835, $113,560.
i Double Barrel - 4' x 10' Box Culvert (Includes Wingwalls, 1 | 186.900 1295 181.300.00
17 | 410-70MC |0 alte and Headwalie) (Addeudum #2) wo | tF | s11e128] sie257920] s124000] s17360000] $1.27818| s178.94520] $1335.00] s186.90000] 120500 $181300
18 400-2-2 _M...._,uu-.._._ awﬂ.ﬂﬁs (Endwalis) (includes Reinforced Steele) | o4 | ¢y $58501|  $16,380.28 $62000 $17,36000] $1.11832] $31,31296| $1.16500] $3262000] $139000{ $38,920.00]
Class | Concrete (OCS Concrete Pads and Endwall for 30"
- ; ; 1,118, 946 , 760. 138500  $11,080.00
19 | 400448 L des Retnlorcia Steste) (Adderndum o7 8 cY $402.62 $3,220.96 $44000|  $352000 $1.11832 $8,94656|  $470.00 $376000| |
20 | 425-1-361 |inlets (Curb) (Type P-6) (<10 30 EA | s$233559] $7006770] $258000| $7740000] $246428] $7392840] $371000 $111,30000] $2.29500]  $68,850.00)|
21 | 425-1-543 |inlet (Dt Bot) (Type D Mod. (<10') Outfall Control Structure 3 EA | $382584| $1147752] $405500] $12,16500] $4.22109] $1266327] $277500 $8,32500] $3,280.00 $9,840 00|
o5 | saniviags [0 SONEEREE Cuivert FIC GI0R DR-18 or AZ0N) 166 | LF $3580|  $5957.74 s3870|  s642420|  sa775  s7.92650]  s4660 uw.qwm_mo_ $4200,  $6972 8_
{(24") (Addendum #2)
23 | 430-174-102 |P'Pe Storm Sewer Cuivert (PVC C900 DR-18 or A2000) 222 | LF $5306|  $11,779.32 $67.10| $1267620]  $5589| $12.40758]  $5535|  $12,287 ,3_ $54.00 u:.wmm.oc_
(30") (Addendum #2)
24 |430-175-102-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (36") 7 LF $62 12 $4,410.52 $66 55 $4,72505 $62 61 $4,445 31 $86.60 $6,14860]  $68.00 $4,828 00|
25 |430-175-103-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (42") a4 LF $84 50 $3,718 00} $90.35 $3.97540]  $8533 $375452]  $103.30 $454520]  $88.00 $3,872.00)
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Bid "A" Based on a completion time of 200 Calendar Days

Bid Tabulation

IFB #11-1949-DS

El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase lIA

PAGE 2 OF 7

1 2 3 4 5
AN McLeod Land Services Better Roads Inc. Woodruff & Sons, Inc. Frederick Derr & Company C & M Roadbuilders, Inc.
BID "A 200 CALENDAR DAYS (Sarasota County) (Collier County) {Manatee County) (Sarasota County) (Sarasota County)
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
! ool ool TN eeice PRICE PRICE pRICE | _price PRICE PRICE price | PRICE | PRicE
26 [ 430-175-103-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (48") 384 LF $9653|  $37,067.52]  $103.00] $3955200]  $9691] $37,21344] $11270] $4327680  $99.00|  $38,016.00|
27 | 430-175-104 [Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (RCP) (60") (Addendum #2) 388 LF $131.50|  $51,02200  $142.00]  $5500600] $21566| $83676.08] $16210] $62.89480  $150.00]  $58,200.00|
28 [430-175-104-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (60") 49 LF $146.87 $7,.19663]  $158.00 $7.742.00]  $135.38 $6,63362] $20215 $9.90535|  $182.00 $8,918 00|
29 | 430-175-201 [Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ERCP) (12" x 18") 1185 | LF $2517] $29,826.45 $27.10  $32,113.50 $32.40|  $38,394.00 $3160|  $37.446.00 $30.00] $35,550.00
| /|
30 | 430-175-201 [Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ERCP) (14" x 23") 680 LF $2874|  $19,543 20| $30.90  $21,012.00| $3572| $2428960]  $4120] $2801600]  $3500]  $23,800.00|
31 .u?:u-uovzn_wﬂnmmﬂﬁ Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (42°) (1/2 Section Riser) | EA | s2aras7|  sa74014] s258000  ss16000] s226040|  sasssos| s213500  sa27000] $2.13000  $4.260.00|
32 L_S.:m.nou.zo_m._ﬂoaw_nﬂi Sawer Cutviert (ACCHI) (423 (V2 Saclion Riser) § EA | $262548)  $262548| $184500(  $184500 $242676|  $242676| $228000]  $2,280.00| $239500]  $2,395.00|
33 .ao.:m.u?:o_m_ﬂ»a.wﬁg Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (547) (1/2 Section Riser) | o EA | $365922] $3203208| $3955.00| $3559500] $3.264.53| $2938077| $347000] $31.23000{ $350000  $31,500.00)
34 [430-175-205-MC m__nzww.n.é Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (72°) (1/2 Section Riser) | EA | $461380 5461380 $502000|  $502000| $408502|  $408602| $422000)  $422000| $416500  $4.16500)
35 | 430-982-625 |Mitered End Section, Optional, Elliptical 14" x 23" 15 EA $620.01 $9.300.15]  $676.00]  $10,140.00]  $863.24|  $12,94860] $108500] $16,27500]  $830.00|  $12,450.00|
36 || 430-984-129 | Mitered End Section, Optional - Round/24" 8 EA $305.97 $2.447.76]  $333.00 $2,664.00]  $916.00 $7,328.00] $1,31000]  $10.480.00] $1,120.00 $8,960.00]
37 || 430-984-133 | Mitered End Section, Optional - Round/30" 7 EA $318.31 $2.22817]  $346.00 $2,42200 $1,35565 $9.489.55| $196000] $1372000] $1.89500] $13,265.00]
38 | 515-2-301 |Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing (Aluminum) (Addendum #2) 237 LF $20.25 $4,799.25 $4350]  $10,309.50]  $41.90 $9.930.30]  $3285 $7.785.45 $41.95 $9,942 15
39 520-1-8 |Type AB Special (Curb and Gutter) 1050 | LF $11.00]  $11,550.00 $12.00|  $12,600.00 $7.61 $7,990.50 $7.45 $7,822.50 $6.05 $6,352.50
| | |
40 520-1-10 |[Type F Curb and Gutter 11,296 | LF $8.00]  $90,368.00| $8.95| $101,099.20| $6.35|  $71,729.60| $7.50|  $84,720.00| $6.00|  $67,776.00|
a1 522-1  |4" Concrete Sidewalk 6,276 | SY $25.17| $157,966.92 $17.05| $107,00580]  $1955| $12269580]  $16.95| $106,37820]  $17.00] $106,692.00]
Concrete Ditch Pavement - Non Reinforced - Fabric Formed
42 NG B P T 582 | sy $47.80 $2781960|  $5200 mo.wi,s_ $48 69 «mm.wﬁ.um_ $70.50 r,.oueon_ $52.00 uuo_mﬁ.s_
43 530-34  |Rip-Rap (Rubble) (Ditch Lining) 176 | N $56.45|  $993520f  $61.20) $10771.20]  $69.15|  $12,17040]  $6000]  $10,56000]  $40.00 $7.040.00|
Contractor's Sediment and Erosion Control includes
44 | 908-104-1 _n farin/Sure/Ploe/Sereader, Swain, ok 1 LS $4,738.53 $4,738 53|  $8.285.00 8.~mm_8_ $1,650.20 a..ms_wo_ $6,650.00 $6,650 00| $25,100.00|  $25,100.00
SUBTOTAL ROADWAY $1,912,652.73 $1,983,418.10f $1,991,145.27 $1,995,692.95 $2,027,912 65
45 | 700-20-11 |Sign Single Post, <12 S.F. (Addendum #2) 31 EA $175.84 $5451.04]  $195.00 $6,04500]  $184.81 $572011] s40000| $12,40000{ $185.00 $5,735.00
i |
46 706-3  |Reflective Pavement Marker, All Colors 326 | EA $4.00 $1,304.00 $4.35 $1,418.10| $4.10 $1,336.60] $5.50 $1,793 00} $525 $1,711.50|
47 | 710-12-290 |Reflective Paint (Island Nose) (Yellow) (Addendum #2) 242 | sF $0.91 $220.22 $0.85 $205.70| $0.79 $191.18] $1.10 $266.20) $1.05 $254 10|
4 | Wi EERORR e Tnonpic e e Mo ] w | B $149.20  $283480]  $211.00 2.98.8_ $199 51 uu_qg.mw_ $140.00 au.mmo.oo_ $13125|  $249375
49 | 711-11-170 |Directional Arrows. Thermoplastic 19 EA $79.93 $1.518.67 $59.90 $1.13810]  $56.70 $1,077.30]  $85.00 $161500]  $7875 $1,496.25
50 | 711-11.251 [SNiP Traffic Stripe, 610" Yellow, Thermoplastic, 6 340 | LF $1.07 $363.80 $1.00 $340 00| $0.95 $323 00 $1.00 $340.00 $0.75 $255 00
(Addendum #2)
51 | 711-11-222 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 8" Yellow, Thermoplastic 785 LF $1.12 $879 20| $1.15 $902 75 $1.10 $863 50) $165 $1,295 25 $1.60 $1,256 00|
R/AIP?N14



Vs Bid Tabulation
IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase lIA
Bid "A" Based on a completion time of 200 Calendar Days
1 2 3 4 5
AN McLeod Land Services Better Roads Inc. Woodruff & Sons, Inc. Frederick Derr & camMm Inc.
BID "A" - 200 CALENDAR DAYS (Sarasota County) (Colller County) (Manates County) B!loco% _g
mem | mEM# DESCRIPTION ary. | unirs _ﬁm EXTENDED PRICE 1ﬁ._oqn| EXTENDED PRICE _.ﬁ EXTENDED PRICE vﬂm EXTENDED PRICE k__ml EXTENDED PRICE
52 | 711-11-224 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 18" Yellow, Thermoplastic 531 LF $3.30 $1,752.30| $3.10 $1.646.10| $2.94 $1,561.14 $5.50 $2,920.50| $5.30 $2,814.30|
53 | 711-11-121 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 6" White, Thermoplastic 11,251 | LF $1.08 $12,151.08| $1.00 $11,251.00] $0.92 $10,350.92 $1.00 $11,251.00| $0.75 $8,438.25
54 | 711-11-221 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 6" Yellow, Thermoplastic 10,054 | LF $1.08 $10,858.32 $1.00 $10,054.00| $0.92 $9,249 68| $1.05 $10,556.70| $1.00 $10,054.00
54A | 711-11-123 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 12" White, Thermoplastic (Add. #2) 45 LF $3.68 $165.60| $1.55 $69.75 $147 $66.15 $4.40 $198.00| $4.20 $189.00(
548 | 71111125 wﬂﬁ-ﬂ_ﬂhn__n Mﬂuo. 247 White, Thermoplastic (Stop Bar) | LF $15.45 $77.25 $4.25 $21.25 $4.04 $20.20) $7.65 $38.25 $7.35 $36.75
SUBTOTAL SIGNING AND STRIPING $37,576.28 $37,100.75 $34,550.47 $45,333.90| $34,733.90|
55 | 715-2-11 ﬂw_“_m”u_mhﬂa»ﬂ__ (Electrical, 4° PVC DR 18, ColorWhite) | o4 | $6.22 $1 .twma— $6.95 $1,619.35 $6.41 $140353]  $1080 uw.ma..s_ $8.25 $1,922.25
SUBTOTAL LIGHTING $1,449.26 $1,619.35] $1,403.53 um.m._m_,s_ $1,922.25
56 570-1-1  |Performance Turf (Hydroseed) 12,551 | SY $0.64 $8,032.64 $0.35 $4,392.85 $0.81 $10,166.31 $0.45 $5,647.95| $0.45 $5,647.95
57 570-1-2  |Performance Turf (Bahia Sod) 48,896 | SY $1.60 $78,233.60 $1.20 $58,675.20 $1.70 $83,123.20| $1.85 $90.457 60| $1.40 $68,454.40|
SUBTOTAL LANDSCAPING $86,266.24 $63,068.05 $93,289.51 $96,105.55 $74,102.35
58 3" PVC Casing (Purple, Reclaim Water) 168 LF $6.53 $1,097.04 $7.25 $1,218.00] $4.98 $836.64 $6.70 $1,125.60| $6.00 $1,008.00}
59 12" Ductile Iron Pipe (Reclaim Water) 98 LF $41.97 $4.113.06) $44.70 $4,380.60} $48.09 $4,801.02 $45.15 $4.42470]  $85.00 $8,330.00]
60 12" Caps/Plugs 2 EA $313.48 $626.96]  $340.00 $680.00]  $189.94 $370.88]  $530.00 $1,060.00f  $410.00 $820.00}
61 Joint Restraints 4 EA $161.51 $646.04]  $172.00 $688.00]  $186.01 $744.04]  $210.00 $840.00]  $245.00 $980.00}
SUBTOTAL UTILITY $6,483.10 $6,966 60| $6,761.58) $7,450.30 $11,138.00|
DISCRETIONARY $180,000.00} $1 mo.ooo_oo- $180,000.00 uao.ooo.oo— u._mo.ooo.oo_
TOTAL BID "A" PRICE: $2,224,427.61 $2,272,172.85) $2,307,249.36 $2,327,099.10 $2,329,809.15
Acknowledged Addendum #1 YES YES YES YES YES
Acknowledged Addendum #2 YES YES YES YES YES
Florida Trench Safety Act YES YES YES YES YES
Contractor's Questionnaire YES YES YES YES YES
Drug Free Work Place Certification YES YES YES YES YES
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes YES YES YES YES YES
Affidavit for Local Business (if applicable) NO NO NO YES NO
Notes: Item #32 - Quantity = 1 - Unit
Price = $1,845.00 & Extended
N/A Price = $2,845.00 N/A NA NA
Bid Bond YES YES YES YES YES
Acknowledged Site Visit YES - 7/1/11 7/28/11 YES - 7/25/11 YES - 7/20/11 YES - 6/14/11 & 7/21/11 YES - 7/7/11
e ——————— . e e— e A |
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Bid Tabulation

IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase IIA
Bid "A" Based on a completion time of 200 Calendar Days

6 8 9 10
npn Utility Systems Construction Ajax Paving Industries Gator Grading & Paving A IDDEF
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM ITEM # DESCRIPTION ary. | UNTS | poice | EXTENDED PRICE wnr - pRIcE| “ooce™ | ppice PRICE _PRICE _ PRICE _
1 101-1  |Mobilization 1 LS | $78.880.00 $78,880.00] $114,000.00] $114,00000] $191,90382] $19190382] NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
2 102-1-1  |Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $2,200.00 $2,200.00]  $6,600.00 $6,600.00] $15700.32]  $1570032] NOBID NO BID|] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
3 104-12  |Turbidity Barrier, Staked 200 LF $7.15 $1,430.00} $7.15 $1,430.00 $3.52 $704.00] NOBID NO BID|] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
4 104-10-3 |Sediment Barrier (Includes Silt Fence & Synthetic Bales) 12897 | LF $1.10 $14,186.70] $1.35| $17,410.95 $082| $1057554] NOBID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
5 104-15  |Soil Tracking Prevention Device 2 EA $885.00 $1.770.00]  $1,650.00 $3,300.00]  $1,624.93 $324986] NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
6 104-16  |Rock Bags 600 EA $6.60 $3,960.00{ $4.50 $2,700.00 $4.33 $2,508.00] NOBID NO BID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
7 110-1-1  |Clearing and Grubbing 25 AC $2,515.00 $62,875.00] $2,760.00  $69,000.00 $1,.08320| $27,08225] NOBID NO BID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
8 1201 |Regular Excavation (Includes Ponds) (Addendum #2) 50117 | CY $4.95 $292,629.15 $1.80| $106,410.60 $6.89| $407,31613] NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
8A | 120-1-MC |Excavation (Rocks or Cemented Sand) (Addendum #2) 1200 | cy $19.40 $23,280.00} $20.75|  $24,800.00] $2894| $3472800] NOBID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
@ ADDENDUM #2 REMOVES LINE 9 .
10 1204  |Excavation, Subsoil (Roadway) 2215 | cy $5.60 $12.404.00] $3.10 $6,866.50) $26.48| $58,65320{ NOBID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
1 1206  |Embankment, Regular 20364 | CY $0.65 $19,086.60 $1.00|  $29,364.00| $349 $102,48036] NOBID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
12 1604  |12" Type B Stabilization (LBR 60) 26287 | SY $3.65 $95,947 55 $7.00| $184,009.00 $4.00| $105,14800] NOBID NO BID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
13 285-706 |8" Limerock, LBR 100 (Addendum #2) 22311 | sy $0.00 $0.00] $11.55 $257,692.05 $11.37| $25367607] NOBID NO BID] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
R BID EITHER #13 OR #13A (NOT BOTH)
13A | 285706 |9" Graded Aggregate Base LBR 120 (Addendum #2) 22311 | SY $11.37 $253,676.07 $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00] NOBID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
14 | 331-22MC 2" Type S-1 Asphalt Concrete FDOT 2000 (Add. #2) 2454 | TN $77.15 $189,326.10| $74.60| $183,068.40} $72.72| $178454.88| NOBID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
15 | 337.7-MC |1 Asphaltic Friction Course (FC Iil) FDOT 2000 (Add. #2) | 1228 | TN $100.00 $122,800.00] $96.60| $118,624.80] $112.01| $137,54828] NOBID NO BID] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
. Single Barrel - 4' x 10’ Box Culvert (Includes Wingwalls,
16 | 410-70MC |- 0 ats and Headwalie) (Addendum #2} 136 LF $675.00 $91,800.00 $835.00 $1 a.mmo.oo_ $850.38| $11565168] NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
i Double Barrel - 4' x 10' Box Culvert (Includes Wingwalls, —
17 | 410-70MC [ e ke and Headwalis) (Addendum #2) 140 LF $1,240.00 23.08.8_ $1,297.00] $181,580.00 $132161| $18502540[ NOBID NO BID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
18 | 40022 W_H_n.___ nm_ﬂuﬁs (Endwalis) (includes Reinforced 8teele) | o4 | ¢y $265.00 3.39_8_ $1.13200  $31,696.00| $97496| $27.20888] NOBID NO BID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
Class | Concrete (OCS Concrete Pads and Endwall for 30"
19 00415 | crades Reinforcing Steels) (Addendum #2) 8 cY $1,100.00 um.moo.oo_ $1,132.00 am.omm,oo‘ $974.96 $7,79968] NOBID NO BID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
20 | 425-1-361 |inlets (Curb) (Type P-6) (<10) 30 EA $2,400.00 $72,00000] $294000] $8820000]  $2561.97|  $76,859.10| NO BID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
21 | 425-1-543 |inlet (Dt Bot) (Type D Mod. (<10') Outfall Control Structure 3 EA $4.640.00 $1392000] $343600 $10,308.00]  $1.803.80 $5411.40] NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
22 | asoayenen [ Slomn Sower Culvist FVC CHI0 DRAB o ABOD) 166 | LF $50.45 $8,374.70 $5070]  $8.416.20| $3575  $593450] NOBID|  NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
(24") (Addendum #2)
AV Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (PVC C900 DR-18 or A2000)
23 | 430-174-102 _ (30 (Addendum #2) 222 LF $61.60 ua.ma_mo_ $75.000  $16,65000) $4550|  $10,101.00] NOBID NO m.& NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
24 |430-175-102-Mc|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (36") 7 LF $78.10 $5,545.10] $83.50 $5,928 50] $63.37 $4.499027] NOBID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
25 |430-175-103-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (42") 44 LF $98 50 $4,334.00| $96.00 $4,224.00} $80.38 $3536.72] NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
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Bid Tabulation
IFB #11-1949-DS

El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase IIA
Bid "A" Based on a completion time of 200 Calendar Days

7 8 9 10
UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNT | EXTENDED |  UNIT | EXTENDED |
mem | mEm# DESCRIPTION
_PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE __} PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
26 |430-175-103-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (\CCMP) (48") 384 | LF $110.00 $4224000]  $7150|  $2745600]  $9154]  $3515136] NOBID| _ NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
27 | 430-175-104 |Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (RCP) (60") (Addendum #2) 388 | LF $150.00 $5820000]  $16300] $6324400]  $12099]  $50436.12] NOBID|  NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
28 |430-175-104-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (60°) a9 | LF $155.00 $759500  $16600|  $813400]  $3142|  $1,539.58] NOBID| _ NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
29 | 430-175-201 [Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ERCP) (12" x 18") 1185 | LF $39.00 $4621500]  $3315|  $39.28275]  $3142  $37,232.70] NOBID| _ NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
30 | 430-175-201 |Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ERCP) (14" x 23") 880 | LF $44.00 $2992000]  $4060|  $27.608.00]  $3358)  $22.834.40] NOBID| _ NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
31 .S.:m-na.:o_m_ﬂouwﬁa e & T EA | s2.115.00 $423000] $310000]  $620000 st184150|  s$3e8318] NOBID|  NOBID| NOBIDDER| NOBIDDER
32 .uvﬂqm.su-:o_m_ﬂowﬁé DUNE COlvext (AGGIIF) 18] (12 Saction o) || EA | $2:305.00 $230500| $320000 5320000 $205825|  $205825| NOBID|  NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
33 ;u?:m‘uo._-zo_wﬂow,nﬁi Shwsr Lot ACCNE) (B ) (12 0etiomvee) | 5 | ia | B $3007800] $432500 $38.92500] $301154 $27,10386] NOBID] NOBID| NOBIDDER| NOBIDDER
34 .S-E.ua.zo_wﬂmmﬁé Sewer Cuvart (ACOMF) (12} (12 Seclion Riser) | 4 | ga | s4a40.00 $424000| $510000(  $510000| $348385)  $348385| NOBID|  NOBID| NOBIDDER| NOBIDDER
35 | 430-982-625 |Mitered End Section, Optional, Elliptical 14" x 23" 15 EA $545.00 $8,17500]  $857.00]  $12,855.00]  $649.97 $9,749.55 NO BID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
36 | 430-984-129 | Mitered End Section, Optional - Round/24" 8 | EA $595.00 $476000]  $96000|  $7.68000]  $75830]  $6,06640] NOBID| _ NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
37 | 430-984-133 | Mitered End Section, Optional - Round/30° 7 EA $960.00 $6,72000{ $147500  $10,32500] $163360|  $11.43520] NO BID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
38 | 515-2-301 |Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing (Aluminum) (Addendum #2) 237 | F $88.00 $20.856.00]  $4465|  $10,58205]  $2058)  $4877.46] NOBID| _ NOBID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
39 | 52018 |Type AB Special (Curb and Gutter) 1050 | LF $10.75 $11.28750]  $980|  $10,29000]  $1517|  $1502850] NOBID| _ NOBID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
40 | 520-1-10 |Type F Curb and Gutter 11,206 | LF $7.15 $80,766.40] $8.55|  $96,580.80) $672| $7590912] NOBID|  NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
a1 5221 |4" Concrete Sidewalk 6276 | sY $2000  $12552000]  $1855 $11641980]  $17.33 $108,76308] NOBID|  NOBID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
4 | s [ConomeDReh Fevement - Non Relnkiccéd - Fabrc Famsd: | 550 | gy $76.60 $4458120] $15575| $9064650]  $6391| $37,19562] NOBID|  NO m_c_ NO BIDDER|  NO BIDDER
Concrete Mat - 8" Filter Points

43 | 53034 |Rip-Rap (Rubble) (Ditch Lining) 176 | TN $115.00 $2024000]  $5700]  $1003200]  $9533  $16.778.08] NOBID| _ NOBID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
[Contractor's Sediment and Erosion Control includes l Fina S | _ NOBIDDER|  NO BIDDER

a4 | s0B1041 [oo O mp/Pine/Spreader. Swalo, elc 1 s | $6,05000 $6.050.00] $3,300.00 8.80.8_ $541643|  $541643 NO NO BID
SUBTOTAL ROADWAY $2,128,799.27 $2,182,855.90] $2,447,579.08| NO BIDJ NO BIDDER
45 | 700-20-11 [Sign Single Post, <12 S.F. (Addendum #2) 31 | EA $265.00 $8.21500]  $18700]  $5797.00]  $27062  $8.39542] NOBID| _ NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
46 7063 |Reflective Pavement Marker, All Colors 326 | EA $3.30 $107580]  $415|  $1.35290]  $325|  $1,059.50, NOBID| _ NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
47 | 710-12-290 |Reflective Paint (island Nose) (Yellow) (Addendum #2) 242 | SF $4.40 $106480] 5080 $19360]  $108 $26136] NOBID| _ NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
48 | 711-11-160 _ﬂn«“u..nu:qm".n... Taomepinatc iy Lans IEnge) | o 1 BA $110.00 $2,00000]  $202.00 uw.muo_s_ $25099|  $493981) NOBID|  NOBID| NOBIDDER| NOBIDDER
49 | 71111170 |Directional Arrows, Thermoplastic 19 | EA $66.00 $125400]  $5740]  $100060]  $7583]  $144077] NOBID| _ NOBID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
50 | 711-11-251 .mhuhuﬂ_____” wm:s. S50 Vet Thermagieste. ¢ a0 | LF $1.10 si7a00]  soss $323.00 $1.19 s40460| NOBID|  NO m_c_ NO BIDDER|  NO BIDDER
51 | 711-11-222 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 8" Yellow, Thermoplastic 785 | LF $1.75 $1.373.75 $115 $902 75 $184|  $144440] NOBID|  NOBID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
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Bid Tabulation
IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase lIA

Bid "A" Based on a completion time of 200 Calendar Days

6 7 8 9 10
: Utility Systems Construction | Waestra Construction Corp. Ajax Paving Industries Gator Grading & Paving S5 RiGHRR
(Sumter County) (Manatee County) (Sarasota County) (Manatee County
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
, ITEM # price | EXTENDED PRICE price | EXTENDEDPRICE | ppic | EXTENOEDPRICE | price | “price | pmice PRICE
52 | 711-11-224 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 18" Yellow, Thermoplastic $2.55 $1,354.05 $3.00 $1,593.00| $4.17 $221427] NOBID NO BID|] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
53 | 711-11-121 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 6" White, Thermoplastic $1.25 $14,063.75 $0.95 $10,688 45 $1.19 $13,38869] NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
54 | 711-11-221 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 6" Yellow, Thermoplastic $1.10 $11,059 40} $0.95 $9,551.30] $1.19 $11.96426] NOBID NO BID| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
54A | 711-11-123 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 12" White, Thermoplastic (Add. #2) a5 LF $2.30 $103.50| $1.50 $67.50) $3.25 $14625| NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
548 | 711-11-125 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 24" White, Thermoplastic (Stop Bar) 5 LF $4.40 $22.00| $4.10 aucg_ $5.96 s2080] NOBID| NO m_o_ NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
l(Addendum #2)
SUBTOTAL SIGNING AND STRIPING $42,050.05 $35,418.60) $45,689.13 NO BID| NO BIDDER
56 | 715-2-11 __rhum..__u.mhﬂ._a (Electrical, 4" PVC DR 18, Color White) | 543 | 1 $9.00 52,067.00] $9.70 mm_umo_s— $4.17 so7161] NoBID| NO m_a_ NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
SUBTOTAL LIGHTING $2,097.00 $2,260.10 $971.61 NO BID| NO BIDDER
570-1-1 |Performance Turf (Hydroseed) 12,551 | SY $0.45 $5,647.95 $0.50 $6,275.50] $0.49 $6,149.09] NO BID NOBID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
570-1-2 |Performance Turf (Bahia Sod) 48896 | SY $1.60 $78,233 60| $1.70 $83,123 20| $162 $79.21152] NOBID NO BID] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
SUBTOTAL LANDSCAPING $83,881.55 $89,398.70 $85,361.51 NO BID| NO BIDDER
3" PVC Casing (Purple, Reclaim Water) 168 | LF $7.35 $1,234.80] $6.95 $1,167.60 $7.58 $1.27344] NOBID NOBID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
12" Ductile Iron Pipe (Reclaim Water) 98 LF $36.40 $3,567.20] $4165 $4,081.70 $4333 $424634] NOBID NO BID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
12" Caps/Plugs 2 EA $345.00 $690.00]  $310.00 $620.00 $96 .41 s19282] NOBID NOBID| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
Joint Restraints 4 EA $160.00 $640.00]  $130.00 $52000] $276.24 $1,104.96] NOBID NO BID|] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
SUBTOTAL UTILITY $6,132.00 $6,389.30| $6,817.56| NO BID NO BIDDER
DISCRETIONARY $180,000.00| $180,000.00 m;o.ooo.oo_ NO BID NO BIDDER
TOTAL BID "A" PRICE: $2,442,959.87 $2,496,322.60 $2,766,418.89| NO BID NO BIDDER
Acknowledged Addendum #1 YES YES YES NO BID NO BIDDER
Acknowledged Addendum #2 YES YES YES NO BID NO BIDDER
Florida Trench Safety Act YES YES YES NO BID NO BIDDER
Contractor's Questionnaire YES YES YES NO BID NO BIDDER
Drug Free Work Place Certification YES YES YES NO BID NO BIDDER
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes YES YES YES NO BID NO BIDDER
Affidavit for Local Business (if applicable) NO NO YES NO BID NO BIDDER
Notes Item #13A - Quantity = 22,311 -
Unit Price = §11.370 & Extended
Price = §265,046.07 N/A N/A NO BID NO BIDDER
Bid Bond YES YES YES NO BID NO BIDDER
Acknowledged Site Visit YES - 7/27/11 YES - 7/26/'11 YES - 7/15/11 NO BID NO BIDDER
e e ——— i
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(Engineer)

APPROVED BY:
(Purchasing)
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Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase IlIA
Bid "A" Based on a completion time of 200 Calendar Days
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Date
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Bid Tabulation
IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase lIA
Bid "B" Based on a completion time of 150 Calendar Days

1 2 3 4 5
vy McLeod Land Services Better Roads Inc. Woodruff & Sons, Inc. Frederick Derr & Company C & M Roadbuliders, Inc.
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM ITEM # DESCRIPTION ary. | uniTs
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 101-1  |Mobilization 1 LS | $66.101.26|  $66,101.26] $179,600.00| $179,600.00] $100,334.16| $100,334.16] $78,34330 $78,34330| $83,000.00/  $83,000.00
2 102-1-1  [Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $2,433.56 $2.433.56] $1314500]  $1314500]  $7,403.27 $7,403.27] $4,690.00 $4,690.00] $2,875.00 $2,875.00]
3 104-12  |Turbidity Barrier, Staked 200 LF $2.77 $554.00| $0.60 $120.00} $2 86 $572.00 $2.50 $500.00} $10.20 $2,040.00|
4 104-10-3  |Sediment Barrier (Includes Silt Fence & Synthetic Bales) 12897 | LF $1.24| $1599228 $0.60 $7,738.20| $096  $12.381.12 $1.00 $12,897.00] $1.05| $13541.85
5 104-15  |Soil Tracking Prevention Device (Addendum #2) 2 EA $2,027.06 $4,054.12]  $1,070.00 $2,140.00]  $2,200.08 $4,400.16] $1,950.00 $3,900.00]  $825.00 $1,650.00
5 104-16  |Rock Bags 600 EA $5 59 $3,354.00 $3.10 $1,860.00} $5.50 $330000]  $1060 $6,360.00} $3.60 $2,160.00
7 110-1-1  |Clearing and Grubbing 25 AC $1,039.08) $25977.00] $291000 $72,750.00] $112361 $28,09025 $1,575.00 $39,375.00] $1,72000]  $43,000.00]
8 1201 _:.n_.._-.. Excavation (Includes Ponds) (Addendum #2) 59,117 CY $1.78 w‘_om.mmm.mm_ $2.05| $121,189.85 $4.00| $236,468.00| $3.40 $200,997 mo_ $2.00f §1 m.wuh_oo_
8A | 120-1-MC |Excavation (Rocks or Cemented Sand) (Addendum #2) 1200 | CY $2.42 $2,904.00| $7.45 $8,940.00| $2628|  $31,536.00| $5.20 $6,240.00| $4.00 $4,800.00|
9 ADDENDUM #2 REMOVES LINE 9
10 120-4  |Excavation, Subsoil (Roadway) 2215 | cy $2.58 $5,714.70| $1405  $31,120.75 $1031| $22,836.65 $5.00 $11,075.00] $455  $10,078.25
1 1206  |Embankment, Regular 20364 | CY $6.06| $177,94584 $2.30|  $67,537.20] $1.18)  $34943.16 $1.20 $35,236.80| $2.00|  $58,728.00
12 160-4  [12" Type B Stabilization (LBR 60) 26287 | SY $316|  $83,066.92 $430| $113,034.10| $360|  $94,633.20| $345 $90,690.15 $4.60|  $120,920.20}
13 285-706 |8" Limerock, LBR 100 (Addendum #2) 22311 | sy $0.00 $0.00} $9.00/ $200,799.00 $0.00 $0.00] $9.20|  $205,261.20| $14.50| $323,509.50]
BID EITHER #13 OR #13A (NOT BOTH)
13A | 285706 |9" Graded Aggregate Base LBR 120 (Addendum #2) 22311 | sY $9.35| $208,607.85 $0.00 $0.00} $12.31| $274,648.41 $0.00 $0.00} $0.00 $0.00}
14 | 331-2.MC 2" Type S-1 Asphalt Concrete FDOT 2000 (Add. #2) 2454 | TN $7268 $178,356.72 $65.50|  $160,737.00] $77.16| $189,350.64 $6865  $168,467.10f $73.50|  $180,369.00}
15 | 337-7-MC |1" Asphaltic Friction Course (FC Ill) FDOT 2000 (Add. #2) | 1.228 | TN $117.23| $143.958.44 $110.00|  $135,080.00] $99.94| $122726.32 $91.30|  $112,116.40| $9540 $117,151.20}
i Single Barrel - 4' x 10' Box Culvert (Includes Wingwalls, —
16 | 410-70-MC |8 alle and Hea dwalls) (Addendum #2) 136 LF $647.66 Sm.og.qm_ $720.00 uwwmmo.oo_ $84143| $1 i.._u:m_ $860.00| $116,960.00] $83500| $113,560.00
n |Double Barrel - 4’ x 10' Box Culvert (Includes Wingwalls,
17 | 410-70MC | o e and Hea dwalle) (Addendum #2) 140 LF $1,161.28 23.3@.8_ $1.240.00 $173600.00] $1,341.93 ﬂmﬂ.mqo.no_ $1,335.00] $186,900.00] $1,295.00 ua._.uoo_oo_
18 | 400-22 Mﬂ_ﬂ ..a. nﬂﬂ.uﬁs (Endwalls) (includes Reinforced Steels) | ., | oy $58501| $16,38028]  $62000| $17,360.00] $1,17154| $32.80312] $1,16500  $32.620.00] $1,390.00 wmm.omc_oo_
) Class | Concrete (OCS Concrete Pads and Endwall for 30"
19 400145 | cludes Reinforcing Steels) (Addendum #2) 8 cy $402 62 $3,220.96 $440.00 $352000] $1,171.54 $9.37232|  $470.00 $376000] $1.38500| $11,080 8_
20 | 425-1-361 [inlets (Curb) (Type P-6) (<10 30 EA $233559|  $70,067.70]  $2,580.00|  $77.400.00] $2,639.37|  $79,181.10] $3710.00] $111,30000] $2,20500  $68,850.00]
21 425-1-549 |Inlet (Dt Bot) (Type D Mod. (<10") Outfall Control Structure 3 EA $382584|  $1147752] $405500|  $12,16500] $4.459.90| $13379.70] $2,775.00 $8,325.00] $3,280.00 $9,840.00)
32 1 oATEAH [Toe Mo Sewer SUlvert (FYC G900 DR 18 or AZ00) 66 | LF §3589|  $5957.74 $3870  $6424200  ss125|  sesorso|  sae0|  s773se0|  sa200]  $697200
(24") (Addendum #2)
T Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (PVC C900 DR-18 or A2000)
23 | 430-174-102 (30") (Addendum #2) 222 LF $5306  $11,779.32 $57.10|  $12,676.20| $59.40|  $13,186.80| $55.35 us_um:o_ $5400, $11 ..8m.8_
24 | 430-175-102-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (36") 71 LF $62.12 $4,410.52 $66 55 $4,725.05 $66 65 $4,732.15 $86.60 $6,148 60| $68.00 $4,828.00]
25 |430-175-103-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (42") 44 LF $84 50 $3,718.00} $90 35 $3,975 40} $90.59 $398596|  $103.30 $4,545.20| $88 00 $3,872.00]
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Bid "B" Based on a completion time of 150 Calendar Days

Bid Tabulation

IFB #11-1949-DS

El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase IIA

1 2 3 4 5
e Al McLeod Land Services * Better Roads Inc. Woodruff & Sons, Inc. Frederick Derr & Company | C & M Roadbuilders, Inc.
TEM | ITEM# DESCRIPTION ary. | units

26 [430-175-103-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (48") 384 LF $9653|  $37,067.52 $10300]  $39552.00]  $10261 $3940224]  $11270]  $43,276.80] $99.00|  $38,016.00]
27 | 430-175-104 |Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (RCP) (60") (Addendum #2) 388 LF $131.50]  $5102200] $14200] $5500600] $22398] $8690424]  $16210] $62,804.80]  $150.00|  $58,200.00|
28 |430-175-104-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (60") 49 LF $146.87 $7,196.63 $158.00 $7,74200]  $141.07 $6.912.43 $202.15 $9,90535]  $182.00 $8,918.00)
29 | 430-175-201 [Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ERCP) (12" x 18") 1185 | LF $2517|  $29,826.45 $27.10]  $32,113.50| $35.56|  $42,138.60| $31.60]  $37,446.00] $30.00|  $35,550.00]
30 | 430-175-201 |Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ERCP) (14" x 23") 680 LF $28.74|  $19,543 20| $30.90|  $21,012.00f $38.88|  $26,438.40| $4120|  $28,016.00] $35.00]  $23,800.00}
31 _.S...__m.us.zo_wﬂww..“é Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (42°) (1/2 Section Riser) | EA | $237457 $4,749.14]  $2,580.00 $5.16000 $2.47335 $404670] $2,13500 $427000] $2,130.00 $4.260.00}
32 .aq:vua.zn_m..ﬂunwﬁi Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (48) (1/2 Section Riser) | EA | $262548 $2,62548| $2,845.00 $2,84500] $2,630.61 $263061] $2,280.00 $2,280.00] $2,395.00 $2,395.00|
33 .ao-:vm?zo_wﬂanwﬂ.:: Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (54") (1/2 Section Riser) | ¢ EA | s$365022| 3203208 $395500| $3550500] $346831| $31.21479] $347000 $31.23000] $350000  $31,500.00}
34 ao.:u-si__o_mﬁﬂm,n.? Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (72") (1/2 Section Riser) | EA | s461380 461380 $502000)  $502000] $439175 $4.39175] $4.220.00 $422000| $416500|  $4.165.00
35 | 430-982-625 |Mitered End Section, Optional, Elliptical 14" x 23" 15 EA $620.01 $9,300.15 $676.00]  $10.140.00]  $981.15|  $14717.25| $1,08500 $1627500]  $830.00)  $12,450.00}
36 | 430-984-129 | Mitered End Section, Optional - Round/24" 8 EA $305.97 $2,447.76 $333.00 $2,664.00] $1,033.91 $8,.271.28] $1,31000] $10,480.00] $1,120.00 $8,960.00]
37 | 430-984-133 | Mitered End Section, Optional - Round/30" 7 EA $318.31 $2,228.17 $346.00 $242200] $148763] $1041341] $196000] $13,72000] $1.89500  $13,265.00|
38 515-2-301 |Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing (Aluminum) (Addendum #2) 237 LF $20.25 $4,799.25 $43.50 ﬂo.wom@o— $43.89 $10,401.93| $32.85 $7,785.45 $41.95 $9,942.15
39 520-1-8 [Type AB Special (Curb and Gutter) 1050 | LF $11.00]  $11,550.00] $12.40|  $13,020,00] $8.03 $8.431.50] $7.45 $7,822.50] $6.05 $6,352.50]
40 | 520-1-10 |Type F Curb and Gutter 11,296 | LF $8.00(  $90,368.00] $9.30|  $105,052.80] $6.71|  $75.796.16| $7.50]  $84,720.00| $6.00]  $67,776.00|
41 522-1  |4" Concrete Sidewalk 6276 | SY $25.17| $157,966.92 $17.30|  $108,574.80| $20.72| $130,038.72 $16.95 $106,378.20| $17.00| $106,692.00

Concrete Ditch Pavement - Non Reinforced - Fabric Formed
42 524-MC _ocz..za.w Mt & Eillor st 582 sY $47.80 aﬁ.m_mg_ $52.25 «8.58_8_ $51.35 «B.amm_s_ $70.50|  $41,031 _8_ $52.00|  $30,264.00
43 530-34 [Rip-Rap (Rubble) (Ditch Lining) 176 ™ $56.45 $9,935.20 $61.20]  $10,771.20] $78.56]  $13,826.56 $6000|  $10,560.00| $40.00 $7,040.00}

Contractor's Sediment and Erosion Control includes —
a4 | 9081041 | ering/Sump/Pipe/Spreader. Swale. etc 1 LS $4,738.53 $4,73853| $8,285.00 8.3@8_ $1,650.06 $1,650.06] $6,650.00 mm_m_.s_o% $25,100.00  $25,100.00
= SUBTOTAL ROADWAY $1,912,652.73 $2,031,341.25 $2,179,489.00 $1,995,692.95 $2,027,912.65
45 | 700-20-11 |[Sign Single Post, <12 S.F. (Addendum #2) 31 EA $175.84 $5,451.04 $195.00 $6.04500]  $193 61 $6,001.91 $400.00|  $12,400.00]  $185.00 $5,735.00]
46 706-3  |Reflective Pavement Marker, All Colors 326 EA $4.00 $1,304.00| $4.35 $1.418.10| $4.29 $1,398.54 $5.50 $1,793.00] $5.25 $1,711.50|
47 | 710-12-290 |Refiective Paint (Island Nose) (Yellow) (Addendum #2) 242 SF $0.91 $220.22 $0.85 $205.70{ $0.83 $200.86 $1.10 $266.20] $1.05 $254.10|
48 | 711-11-180 _”.Mumu.au.”%nmﬂ.na. Thermopiastic (B Lans Markings) | 40 | Ea $149.20 $283480] $211.00]  $4.009.00]  $209.01 $397119)  $140.00 «m.mmo_cc_ $131.25|  $2.49375
49 | 711-11-170 |Directional Arrows, Thermoplastic 19 | EA $79.93|  $1.51867 $59.90]  $1,13810]  $5040|  $1,12860]  $8500(  $161500]  $78.75  $1.496.25

Skip Traffic Stripe, 6'-10' Yellow, Thermoplastic, 6"
50 | 711-11-251 __ Addendum #2) 340 LF $1.07 uumm.mo_ $1.00 uu..o.S_ $0.99 $336.60 $1.00 ﬂxo.co_ $075 «Mmm_oo_
51 | 711-11-222 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 8" Yellow, Thermoplastic 785 LF $1.12 $879.20| $1.15 $902.75 $1.16 $910.60| $165 $1,295.25 $1.60 $1,256.00}
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Bid Tabulation
IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase IIA

PAGE 3 OF 7

Bid "B" Based on a completion time of 150 Calendar Days
1 2 3 4 5
.— m O O )—l mz U)” D ><w Z.Mwnwu.wﬁﬂ w“uh.woo o Jmmﬂﬂo_wﬂ-a- Ine. - Woodruff & Sons, Inc. ;13%.‘_2 Derr & ooan!é : C&M ?&f:zmol. Inc.
g ronk itk and St P : 253 .z-szoa County) <2 (Sarasota County) e .Amoamof County) ‘
mem | rEMS  DESCRIPTION ary, | unirs vchmmw EXTENDED PRICE _g..u%w_ EXTENDED PRICE | vﬁmm EXTENDED PRICE | mﬂ,__..um» EXTENDED vmam vﬂamw | EXTENDED PRICE
52 | 711-11-224 mo.a .:%_n msum 18" Yellow, ;Qson_mﬂ_o 531 LF $3.30 $1,752.30 $3.10 $1,646.10] $3.08 $1,635.48 $5.50 $2,920.50 $5.30 $2,814.30
53 | 711-11-121 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 6" White, Thermoplastic 11,251 | LF $1.08 $12,151.08 $1.00 $11,251.00 $0.97 $10,913.47 $1.00 $11,251.00 $0.75 $8,438.25
54 | 711-11-221 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 6" Yellow, Thermoplastic 10,054 | LF $1.08 $10,858.32 $1.00 $10,054.00 $0.97 $9,752.38 $1.05 $10,556.70 $1.00 - $10,054.00
54A | 711-11-123 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 12" White, Thermoplastic (Add. #2) 45 LF $3.68 $165.60] $1.55 $69.75 $1.54 $69.30 $4.40 $198.00 $4.20 $189.00
548 | 711-11-125 Wﬁmﬁhﬁ Mvﬁ pe, 24" White, Thermoplastic (Stop Bar) | LF $15.45 $77.25 $425 $21.25 $4.24 $21.20 $7.65 $38.25 $7.35 $36.75
SUBTOTAL SIGNING AND STRIPING $37,576.28}" $37,100.75§ $36,340.13] - $45,333.900 $34,733.90
5 | 715-2-11 M.\__,wuw_uw%.mwmw.: (Electrical, 4" PVC DR 18, Color White) | .., $1,449.26) $6.95 $1,619.35 $6.98 $1,626.34 $10.80 $2,516.40 $8.25 $1,922.25
SUBTOTAL LIGHTING $1,449.26/ i $1,619.35§"- $1,626.34}" $2,516.40 $1,922.25
56 570-1-1 _ [Performance Turf (Hydroseed) 12,551 | SY $0.64 $8,032.64 $0.35 $4,392.85 $0.85 $10,668.35 $5,647.95 $0.45 $5,647.95
57 570-1-2__ |Performance Turf (Bahia Sod) 48,896 | SY $1.80 $78,233.60 $1.20 $58,675.20} $1.74 $85,079.04 $90,457 .60 $1.40 $68,454.40
SUBTOTAL LANDSCAPING S $86,266.24} o $63,068.05§. s $95,747.39] - $96,105.55] - $74,102.35
3" PVC Casing (Purple, Reclaim Water) 168 LF $6.53 $1,097.04 $7.25 $1,218.00 $5.55 $932.40] $6.70 $1,125.60 $6.00 $1,008.00
12" Ductile Iron Pipe (Reclaim Water) $41.97 $4,113.06 $44.70 $4,380.60) $53.19 $5,212.62 $45.15 $4,424.70 $85.00 $8,330.00
12" Caps/Plugs $313.48 $626.96 $340.00 $680.00 $201.06 $402.12 $530.00 $1,060.00f  $410.00 $820.00
Joint Restraints $161.51 $646.04 $172.00 $688.00 $197.14 $788.56 $210.00 $840.00]  $245.00 $980.00
SUBTOTAL UTILITY $6,483.10 $6,966.60] ol $7,335.70¢ v $7,450.30} $11,138.00
DISCRETIONARY $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $180,000.00} $180,000.00} $180,000.00
- |TOTAL BID "B" PRICE: - 4 ) | $2,224,427.61 $2,320,096.00 ' $2,500,538.56] '$2,327,099.10 ' $2,329,809.15
Acknowledged Addendum #1 YES YES YES YES YES
Acknowledged Addendum #2 YES YES YES YES YES
Florida Trench Safety Act YES YES YES YES YES
Contractor's Questionnaire YES YES YES YES YES
Drug Free Work Place Certification YES YES YES YES YES
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes - YES YES YES YES YES
Affidavit for Local Business (if applicable) NO NO NO YES NO
Notes:
N/A N/A N/A NA N/A
Bid Bond YES YES YES YES YES
bnxaoimqmmq Site Visit YES - 7/1/11 7/28/11 <mm S&: YES - 772011 YES - 6/14/11 & 7727111 YES - 7/7/11
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Bid Tabulation

IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase HA

Bid "B" Based on a completion time of 150 Calendar Days

6 8 9 10
LT - LU Utllity Systems Construction | Westra Construction Corp. AJax Paving Industries Gator Grading & Paving NO BIDDER
UNIT UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT "EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
mem | mEM# DESCRIPTION ary. | uns EXTENDED PRICE UNIT  PRICE
PRICE —PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 1011 |Mobilization 1 LS | $78.880.00 $78,880.00] $264,00000] $264,00000] $191.903 82| $191,903.62 $134.49000] $134.490.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
2 10211 |Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS | $2.20000 $220000] $6,60000]  $6.60000] $1570032]  $1570032] $265000|  $2.650.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
3 10412 |Turbidity Barrier, Staked 200 | LF $7.15 $1,430.00] $715|  $1,430.00] $3.52 $704.00} $1080|  $2,160.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
4 | 104-103 |Sediment Barrier (Includes Silt Fence & Synthetic Bales) 12807 | LF $1.10 $14,186.70 $1.35| $17,410.95 $082|  $10,575.54 $097| $12,51009] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
5 104-15 | Soil Tracking Prevention Device 2 EA $885.00 $177000]  $1.65000]  $3,30000]  $162493]  $324986] $309000|  $6,180.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
6 10416 |Rock Bags 600 | EA $6.60 $3.960.00) $450]  $2,70000] $433|  $2,598.00| $540|  $3.24000] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
7 11011 |Clearing and Grubbing 25 | AC | s2.515.00 $62,87500] $2.760.00]  $69,00000]  $1,08320| $27,08225]  $94500 $23625.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
8 12041 |Regular Excavation (Includes Ponds) (Addendum #2) | 59.117 | CY $495|  $29262015 $1.80] $106,410.60| $6.89| $407,316.13| $530| $313,32010] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
8A | 120-1-MC |Excavation (Rocks or Cemented Sand) (Addendum #2) | 1200 | CY $19.40 $23,280.00 $20.75|  $24,900.00] $28.04|  $34,728.00| $550  $6.600.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
] ADDENDUM #2 REMOVES LINE 9 3 : 3
10 1204 |Excavation, Subsoil (Roadway) 2215 | cY $5.60 $12,404.00| $3.10]  $6.866.50| $2648  $58,653.20 $450  $9.967.50, NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
1 1206 |Embankment, Regular 20384 | CY $0.65 $19,086.60] $1.00]  $29.364.00| $349 $102.480 36| $250| $73.41000] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
12 1604 |12" Type B Stabilization (LBR 60) 26287 | SY $365 $95,947.55 $7.00] $184,009.00| $4.00| $105,148.00| $330] $86.747.10] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
13 | 285708 |8" Limerock, LBR 100 (Addendum #2) 22311 | sy $0.00 $0.00] $11.55| $257,692.05 $11.37| $253676.07 $1193] $266,170.23] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER|
BID EITHER #13 OR #13A (NOT BOTH)
13A | 285.706 |9" Graded Aggregate Base LBR 120 (Addendum #2) 22311 | sY $11.37|  $253,676.07 $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
14 | 331-2MC [2" Type S-1 Asphalt Concrete FDOT 2000 (Add. #2) 2454 | TN $77.15|  $189,326.10 $74.60] $183,068.40| $7272| $178.454 88 $7360| $180,614.40] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
15 | 337-7MC |1" Asphaltic Friction Course (FC Ill) FDOT 2000 (Add. #2) | 1,228 | TN $10000]  $122,800.00] $96.60] $118,624.80| $11201] $137,54828]  $11600| $14244800] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
] Single Barrel - 4' x 10' Box Culvert (Includes Wingwalls, | - N
18 | amnamme: L o o) (At & 136 | LF $675.00 $91,80000]  $83500| $113,560.00 $85038| $11565168]  $850.00| $115600.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
X Double Barrel - 4' x 10' Box Culvert (Includes Wingwalls, D
il [l v dnptiblodudasiodppitottesupens 40 | LF | s1.24000]  s17360000| $1.287.00 a;,.wwo.oo_ $1,321.61 a._um.cum...o_ $1,320.00 ﬁﬁ.moc,ao_ NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
18 | 40022 MH_”._“ amﬂ.ﬁs (Endwalis) (includes Reinforced Steeis) | ,, | cy $265.00 s742000f  $1.13200  $31 .mwm.oo_ $974.96 3388_ $1,150.00 eum_MS.S_ NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
Class | Concrete (OCS Concrete Pads and Endwall for ‘
- ; J : : X ,040. N
1 | OIS | e Moo ciog Ststel (Addamdimn 423 8 cy | $1,100.00 $8.80000] $1,13200]  $9,056 8_ so74.96|  $7.799 8_ $380.00|  $3,040 8_ NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
20 | 425-1-361 |inlets (Curb) (Type P-6) (<10) 30 | EA | $240000 $7200000] $294000] $88.20000]  $2,56197| $76,850.10| $245500| $73,650.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
21 | 425-1-549 |iniet (Dt Bot) (Type D Mod. (<10') Outfall Control Structure 3 EA | $4,64000 $1392000] $343600] $10,30800]  $180380  $5411.40] $445500 $1336500] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
22 | 430-174-101 |P'P® Storm Sewer Culvert (PVC C900 DR-18 or A2000) 166 | LF $50.45 $8,374.70 $5070|  $8.416.20 $35.75|  $5934.50 $4500  $7.470.00| NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
(24") (Addendum #2)
23 | 430-174-102 [ (00 ﬂuﬂwﬂhwmw_?: PYECRONBwANN |22 | F $61.60 ru.mqm_ma_ §75.00]  $16,650 8_ $4550[  $10.101 .8_ $60.00 «a.uno.oa_ NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
24 |430-175-102-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (367) 7 LF $78.10 $5,545 10| $8350|  $5928 50 $6337|  $4.49927 $1800]  $1,278.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
25 |430.175.103:MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (42") s | LF $98 50 $4,334.00] $96.00]  $4,.224.00} $80.38|  $3.536.72 $8600]  $3.784.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
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Bid Tabulation
IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase llIA
Bid "B" Based on a completion time of 150 Calendar Days

6 7 8 9 10
npe Utility Systems Construction | Westra Construction Corp. Ajax Paving Industries Gator Grading & Paving NO BIDDER
- == -— - e ——— o L - —— o ————
UNIT UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
i, (s o Ty QT ) emcp T ST PR ] tnce PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
26 |430.175.103-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (48") 384 | LF $110.00 $4224000]  $71.50  $27,456.00 $91.54|  $35,151.36 $9400|  $36,096.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
27 | 430-175-104 |Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (RCP) (60") (Addendum #2) 388 | LF $150.00 $56.20000]  $16300|  $6324400]  $12999]  $50.436.12]  $210.00]  $8148000] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
28 |430-175-104-MC|Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (60") 49 LF $155.00 $750500]  $16600|  $8,13400]  $3142]  $153958]  $13000]  $6.370.00] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
29 | 430-175-201 |Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ERCP) (12" x 18") 1185 | LF $39.00 $4621500]  $33.15  $39.28275 $3142]  $37.23270]  $3500|  $41,47500] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
30 | 430-175-201 |Pipe Storm Sewer Culvert (ERCP) (14" x 23") 680 | LF $44.00 $2092000]  $4060|  $27.608.00]  $33.58]  $2283440|  $57.00] $38760.00] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
31 _.u?:m.su.:o_m.ﬁoowﬁa Sewer Culvert (\CCMP) (42) (1/2 Section Riser) | EA | $2115.00 r.mS.S_ $310000|  $620000] $184150|  s368318| s249000] s498000] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
32 .uo.:m-su-:n_m.ﬂammﬁg Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (48°) (1/2 Section Riser) | eA | $2305.00 s230500] $320000  $320000] $205825|  $205825| $261000]  $2.610.00] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
33 ..s.:u.ue-;o_m.__ﬂow__ﬂ:: Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (54") (1/2 Section Riser) | g EA | $3.442.00 $3097800 $432500  $3892500) $301154  $27.10386 $287500]  $2587500] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
34 l430-1752 M.ﬁmuw.n,é Sewer Culvert (ACCMP) (72°) (1/2 Section Riser) | EA | $4.240.00 $4.24000|  $5.10000 aw.JS_S_ $348385  $348385| $3.970.00 S.m.a_co_ NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
35 | 430-982-625 |Mitered End Section, Optional, Elliptical 14" x 23" 15 EA $545.00 $6.17500]  $85700|  $12,85500]  $649.07  $074955]  $54000]  $8.10000| NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
36 | 430-984-129 | Mitered End Section, Optional - Round/24” 8 EA $595.00 $4,760.00|  $960.00 $7.680.00]  $758.30 $6,06640]  $795.00 $6,360.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
37 | 430-984-133 | Mitered End Section, Optional - Round/30" 7 EA $960.00 $6,720.00] $147500  $10,32500] $1.63360]  $11 43520] $1,065.00 $7.455.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
38 | 5152301 |Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing (Aluminum) (Addendum #2) 237 | LF $88.00 $20856.00]  $44.65  $10,58205 $20.58|  $4,877.46 $4500  $10,66500] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
39 52018 |Type AB Special (Curb and Gutter) 105 | LF $10.75 $11,287.50| $980]  $10,20000]  $15.17|  $15,928.50| $750]  $7.875.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
40 | 520-1-10 |Type F Curb and Gutter 11206 | LF $7.15 $80,766 40} $855  $96,580.80] $672|  $75.909.12 $600|  $67,776.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
41 522-1 _ |4" Concrete Sidewalk 6276 | sy $20.00 $12552000]  $18.55| §11641980]  $17.33| $108,763.08 $1850] $116.106.00] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
Concrete Ditch Pavement - Non Reinforced - Fabric Formed
42 e [ L . s82 | sy $76.60 «t.um_.uo_ $155.75 uoo.ma_%_ $6391|  $37,19562 $55.00 8».998_ NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
43 53034 |Rip-Rap (Rubble) (Ditch Lining) 176 | TN $115.00 $2024000]  $5700]  $10,00200]  $9533  $16.77808]  $15500]  $27.28000] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
Contractor's Sediment and Erosion Control includes
44 | 908-104-1 _n e P ras fa Bkt ok 1 ts | $6.050.00 $6,05000] $3.300.00 uu_wS.S_ $541643]  $541643] $500000 $5.00000] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
SUBTOTAL ROADWAY $2,128,799.27 $2,332,855.90] $2,447,579.08) $2,242,882 42 NO BIDDER
45 | 700-20-11 |Sign Single Post, <12 S.F. (Addendum #2) 31 EA $265.00 $621500]  $18700|  $579700]  $27082  $839542]  $19000]  $589000] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
46 7063 |Reflective Pavement Marker, All Colors 326 | EA $3.30 $1,075 80| $415|  $1,352.90| $325|  $1,059.50] $420  $1.36920] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
47 | 710-12-290 |Reflective Paint (Island Nose) (Yellow) (Addendum #2) 242 | SF $4 40 $1.064.80| $0.80 $193.60] $1.08 $261.36 $0.81 $196.02] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
48 | 71111160 _Wumn_.na_.ﬁmwaa. Thermoplastic (Bike Lane Markings) | .5 | gp $110.00 s200000| s20200  $383800] s25999  $493981]  $20500|  $389500] NOBIDDER| NOBIDDER
49 | 711-11-170 |Directional Arrows, Thermoplastic 19 EA $66.00 $1.25400]  $5740|  $1,00060]  $7583]  $1.440.77 $5800]  $1.10200] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
50 | 711-11-251 .W.___“_H.ﬂuﬁ wm_u.. A8 Yellow, Tharmoplastic, § 340 | LF $1.10 $374.00 $0.95 $323.00] $1.19 $404 60| $1.00 $34000] NOBIDDER| NO BIDDER
51 | 711-11-222 |Solid Traffic Stripe. 8" Yellow, Thermoplastic 785 | LF $1.75 $1373.75 $1.15 $902.75 $184 $1.444 40} $115 $902.75] NO BIDDER| NO BIDDER
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Bid Tabulation
IFB #11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase llA
Bid "B" Based on a completion time of 150 Calendar Days

6 B 8 5 10
= 1 Utility Systems Construction Westra Construction Corp. Ajax Paving Industries Gator Grading & Paving BID
BID "B" - 150 CALENDAR DAYS (Sumter County) (Manatee County) (Sarasota County) (Manatee County v
B — 4K
ITEM ITEM # DESCRIPTION Qrty. | UNITS PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE _u’a.hlm_ o EXTENDED PRICE ﬁ._ _ EXTENDED PRICE
52 | 711-11-224 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 18" Yellow, Thermoplastic 531 | LF $2.55 $1,354.05 $3.00 $1,593.00} $4.17 $2,214.27 $3.00 $1,593.00] NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
53 | 711-11-121 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 6" White, Thermoplastic 11,251 | LF $1.25 $14,063.75 $0.95 $10,688.45 $1.19 $13,388 69 $0.95 $10,688.45| NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
54 | 711-11-221 |Solid Traffic Stripe, 6" Yellow, Thermoplastic 10,054 | LF $1.10 $11,059.40) $0.95 $9,551.30) $1.19 $11,964 26| $0.95 $9,551.30] NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
54A | 711-11-123 [Solid Traffic Stripe, 12" White, Thermoplastic (Add. #2) 45 | LF $2.30 $103.50] $150 $67.50| $3.25 $146.25 $1.50 $67.50] NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
848 | 711-11.135 [SO8d Traffic Stripe, 24° White, Thermoplestic (StopBar) | o | (¢ $4.40 s200  sa10 $20.50 $5.96 $29.80 $4.15 $2075| NOBIDDER|  NO BIDDER
|(Addendum #2)
SUBTOTAL SIGNING AND STRIPING $42,050.05 $35,418.60| $45,689.13 $35,615.97 NO BIDDER
55 | 715211 m.huu...”u_mnnn»__a (Electrical, 4" PVC DR 18, Color White) | 05 | ¢ $9.00 s2.097.00| $9.70 um.ns_a_ $4.17 $971.61 $4.20 33.8- NOBIDDER|  NO BIDDER
SUBTOTAL LIGHTING $2,097.00 $2,260.10] $971.61 $978.60 NO BIDDER
56 | 570-1-1 |Performance Turf (Hydroseed) 12,551 | SY $0.45 $5,647.95 $0.50 $6,275.50) $0.49 $6,149.99| $0.45 $5.647.95] NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
57 | 570-1-2  |Performance Turf (Bahia Sod) 48,896 | sy $1.60 $78,233 60| $1.70 $83,123 20] $1.62 $79,211.52 $1.46 $71,388.16] NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
SUBTOTAL LANDSCAPING $83,881.55 $89,398.70| $85,361.51 $77,036.11 NO BIDDER
58 3" PVC Casing (Purple, Reclaim Water) 168 | LF $7.35 $1,234.80] $6.95 $1,167.60| $7.58 $1,273.44 $8.50 $1.428.00] NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
59 12" Ductile Iron Pipe (Reclaim Water) 98 | LF $36.40 $3.567.20]  $4165 $4081.70]  $4333 $4,246.34 $42.70 $4,184 60| NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
60 12" Caps/Plugs 2 EA $345.00 $690.00]  $310.00 $620.00]  $96.41 $192.82]  $565.00 $1,130.00] NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
61 Joint Restraints 4 EA | $160.00 $640.00]  $130.00 $520.00]  $276.24 $1,104.96 $92 00 $368.00] NO BIDDER NO BIDDER
SUBTOTAL UTILITY $6,132.00| $6.389.30] $6,817.56] $7.110.60] NO BIDDER
DISCRETIONARY $180,000.00] $180,000.00} $180,000.00] $180,000.00f NO BIDDER
TOTAL BID "B" PRICE: $2,442,959.87 $2,646,322.60 $2,766,418.89| $2,543,623.70 NO BIDDER
Acknowledged Addendum #1 YES YES YES YES NO BIDDER
Acknowledged Addendum #2 YES YES YES YES NO BIDDER
Florida Trench Safety Act YES YES YES YES NO BIDDER
Contractor's Questionnaire YES YES YES YES NO BIDDER
Drug Free Work Place Certification YES YES YES YES NO BIDDER
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes YES YES YES YES NO BIDDER
Affidavit for Local Business (if applicable) NO NO YES YES NO BIDDER
Notes: Item #13A - Quantity = 22,311 -
Unit Price = $11.370 & Extended
Price = $253,676.07 N/A N/A N/A NO BIDDER
Bid Bond YES YES YES YES NO BIDDER
Acknowledged Site Visit YES - 7/27/11 YES - 7/26/11 YES - 7/15/11 YES - 7727/11 NO BIDDER
i{
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Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-1949-DS
El Conquistador Parkway Extension, Phase lIA
Bid "B" Based on a completion time of 150 Calendar Days

preparEDEY: NN Robunson

(Project Management)  Sherri Robinson, Assessment Coordinator

REVIEWED BY: St e

(Engineer) Sunny Fu, P.E, Project Engineer

APPROVED BY: Oooena 0N Do

(Purchasing) Donna Stevens, Contract Specialist

_Bad

Date
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Date
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