Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-1021-DS

Coquina Concession Building Remodel

Delesline Construction, Inc. E.O. Koch Construction, Inc. Canio Construction LLC
Bid "A" - 180 Days Completion Palmetto, FL Seabring, FL Bradenton, FL
941.723.6112 863.385.8649 941.896.3118
Item Description u/mj ary. Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 Mobilization LS 115 35973.00 ] 5 3597300 S 10,000.00 } 5 10,000.00 § 5 7,800.00 | 7,800.00
2 Temporary Erosion Control LS 1]5 826.00 | S B26.00 | S 2,500.00 | 5 2,500.00 | 5 3,950.00 | 5 3,950.00
3 Demolition LS 115 7,289.00 | 5 7,289.00 | § 3,500.00 | 5 3,500.00 | 5 4,975.00 | $ 4,975.00
4  [site Work - Complete LS 1]s 538005 538.00 | 5 - Is - Is 3,150.00 § $ 3,150.00
5 |Landscape and Irrigation 153 115 - 15 B - IS - 15 1,200.00 | 5 1,200.00
6 Building - Complete LS 115 262,629.00 | 5§ 262,629.00 S 261,732.00 ] 5 261,732.00} 5 208,970.00 § $ 208,970.00
7 Discretionary Work S m_..__mm.o.s S 30,000.00 S 30,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE 5 337,255.00 S 307,732.00 $ 260,045.00
8  |Hazardous Material Removal CY 115 5,000.00 [| 5,000.00 § § 500.00 | § 500.00 § $ 275.00 | 275.00
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 4 Yes Yes Yes
Provided Price for R | /Replacement of Haz Mat. Yes 22 tons minimum Yes Yes
Site Visit Yes Yes Yes
Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Certification Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes

Total Bid Price corrected in accordance with
Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB,
Total Price stated as $337,254.00
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Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-1021-DS
Coquina Concession Building Remodel

Pat Cariton Construction, Inc Sandhoff Construction Co. Inc. Remco Builders, Inc.
Bid "A" - 180 Days Completion Duette, FL Bradenton, FL Bradenton, FL
941.776.2723 941.737.8442 941.748.5200
Description U/M| ary. Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 Maobilization LS 1 No Bid No Bid § 5 8,500.00 | 5 8,500.00 | 5 5,000.00 | S 5,000.00
2 |Temporary Erosion Control LS 1 No Bid No Bid | 5 1,500.00 | 5 1,500.00 | 5 2,500.00 | S 2,500.00
3 Demaolition LS 1 No Bid No Bid | 5 3,500.00 || 5 3,500.00 | 5 5,800.00 || S 5,800.00
4 Site Work - Complete LS 1 No Bid No Bid | 5 1,000.00 || 5 1,000.00 § - S -
5 Landscape and Irrigation LS 1 No Bid NoBid | § . s 5 . S -
6 Building - Complete LS 1 No Bid NoBid |5 285291005 285,291.00} 5 247,700.00 | s 247,700.00
7 Discretionary Work S 30,000.00 5 30,000.00 S 30,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE No Bid S 329,791.00 5 291,000.00
Hazardous Material Removal ey 1 No Bid | No Bid | § 350.00 | § 350.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 110.00
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 4 Yes Yes Yes
Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. No Yes Yes
Site Visit Yes Yes Yes
Florida Trench Safety Act No Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire No Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Certification No Yes Yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification No Yes Yes
Bid Bond No Yes No

—.

APPROVED BY PROJECT MANAGER: - : h.’y’

ey

PREPARED BY ARCHITECT: \y ; 2

APPROVED BY PURCHASING: Og m ) w%
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Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-1021-DS

Coquina Concession Building Remodel

DelLesline Construction, Inc. E.O. Koch Construction, Inc. Canio Construction LLC
Bid "B" - 120 Days Completion Palmetto, FL Seabring, FL Bradenton, FL
941.723.6112 B63.385.8649 941.896.3118
Item Description uU/Mmj Qry. Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 Mobilization LS 115 35973004 5 35,973.00 | 5 10,000.00 | § 10,000.00 | 5 9,800.00 || S 9,800.00
2 Temporary Erosion Control LS 1]s 926.00 || 5 926.00]5 2,500.00 | 5 2,500.00 | § 3,950.00 § 3,950.00
3 Demaolition LS 115 7,289.00 || 5 7,28900 | 5 3,500.00 | 5 35000005 5,650.00 | 5,650.00
4 Site Work - Complete LS 1S 538.00S 538.00 || 5 S - 5 3,150.00] s 3,150.00
5 |Landscape and Irrigation LS 115 . S - S - 5 . 5 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
6 |Building - Complete LS 115 277.869.00 | § 277.869.00 ) 5 261,732.004 5 261,732,001 5 215,697.00 | $ 215,697.00
7  |Discretionary Work S 30,000.00 S 30,000.00 3 30,000.00
BID "B" TOTAL BID PRICE S 352,595.00 $ 307,732.00 S 269,747.00
8 |Hazardous Material Removal cY 1]s 5,000.00 | § 5,000.00 | 5 500.00 | § 500.00 | § 275.00 I $ 275.00
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum i 2 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum ¥ 3 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 4 Yes Yes Yes
Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. Yes 22 tons minimum Yes Yes
Site Visit Yes Yes Yes
Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Certification Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes

Jwa Bond

Total Bid Price corrected in accordance with
Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB,
Total Price stated as $352,494.00
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Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-1021-DS

Coquina Concession Building Remodel

Pat Carlton Construction, Inc Sandhoff Construction Co. Inc. Remco Builders, Inc.
Bid "B" - 120 Days Completion Duette, FL Bradenton, FL Bradenton, FL
941.776.2723 941.737.8442 941.748.5200
Item Description u/m| ary. Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 Mobilization LS 1 No Bid No Bid | 5 8,500.00 | 5 8,500.00 | 5 5,000.00 || $ 5,000.00
2  |Temporary Erosion Control LS 1 No Bid No Bid | § 1,500.00 | S 1,500.00 | § 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
3 Demalition LS 1 No Bid No Bid | 5 3,500.00 | 5 3,500.00 | 5 5,800.00 | $ 5,800.00
4  |Site Work - Complete LS 1 No Bid No Bid | 5 1,000.00 | 5 1,000.00 | 5 - $ -
S Landscape and Irrigation LS 1 No Bid NoBid | § - S - s - s -
6 |Building - Complete LS 1 No Bid NoBid | 5 285,291.00 )5 285,291.004 5 247,700.00 § S 247,700.00
7 _D_mn-n_"_u:n:.. Work H 30,000.00 S 30,000.00 S 30,000.00
BID "B" TOTAL BID PRICE No Bid S 329,791.00 S 291,000.00
8  |Hazardous Material Removal ey | 1 No Bid || No Bid | § 350.00 | 5 350.00 | $ 110.00 | § 110.00
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 4 Yes Yes Yes
Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. No Yes Yes
Site Visit Yes Yes Yes
Florida Trench Safety Act No Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire No Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Centification No Yes Yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification No Yes Yes
Bid Bond No Yes No

PREPARED BY ARCHITECT:
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