
 
MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 

INTENT TO AWARD 
 

 

ITQ NO / TITLE 
20-R074542GE / 

Automotive Parts 

DATE 

POSTED 

BCC _________ 

 

MCC 

_________ 

MBC 

________ 

PROCUREMENT 

REPRESENTATIVE 
George Earnest CPPB 

PROJECTED 

AWARD DATE 
September 1, 2020 

DEPARTMENT / 

DIVISION 

Public Works 

Department / 

Fleet Services Division 

 

 

 

AUTHORIZED 

BY 

 

 

 

Jacob Erickson, MBA, CPPO 

Interim Procurement Official  

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

 

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract to TPH Holdings, 

LLC d/b/a The Parts House for the supply of automotive parts. 

 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

 

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26. 

 

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION 

 

The Manatee County Public Works Department, Fleet Services Division is responsible for ensuring that County 

vehicles operate optimally. For that reason, a solicitation was advertised to select a supplier for automotive parts. 

 

The solicitation was advertised on July 20, 2020 on the Manatee County website. It was also provided to the 

Manatee County Chamber of Commerce and the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce for release to their 

members. Responses were received from the following firms:  

 

1. Genuine Automotive Supply, Inc. / Bradenton, FL 

2. IEH Auto Parts LLC d/b/a Auto Plus Auto Parts / Moorestown, NJ 

3. TPH Holdings, LLC d/b/a The Parts House / Jacksonville, FL 

4. Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. / Boca Raton, FL 

  

EVALUATION RESULTS SUMMARY:  

 

TPH Holdings, LLC d/b/a The Parts House has been determined to be the responsive and responsible bidder 

with the lowest total quote price. A quote tabulation of the results is attached to this Notice of Intent to Award. 

 

The Procurement Division and the Public Works Department recommend the award to TPH Holdings, LLC d/b/a 

The Parts House.  

  

ATTACHMENT 

 

Quote Tabulation 

  

NAME OF FUNDING SOURCE 

 

Various / Blanket 

Purchase Order 

COST $84,521.13 FUNDS VERIFIED Yes 



Exhibit 3: Quote Tabulation
ITQ 20-R074542GE Automotive Parts

Group A: Auto Parts & Accessories

Auto Plus / Pep 
Boys

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Genuine 
Auto Supply

Genuine 
Auto Supply

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program
The Parts 

House
The Parts 

House

ITEM DESCRIPTION     STOCK # PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE
1 BELT K100610 - 3097269 1G1030 $37.74 $377.40 $39.23 $392.30 $19.60 $196.00 $34.86 $348.60
2 BELT 1210K-6 1G1210 $0.00 $29.95 $179.70 $24.71 $148.26 $39.85 $239.10
3 BELT, 9420 1G1256 $14.03 $420.90 $13.94 $418.20 $11.77 $353.10 $10.76 $322.80
4 BELT K060923 1G1420 $24.39 $292.68 $25.25 $303.00 $22.26 $267.12 $24.10 $289.20
5 BELT K060878 1G1510 $23.97 $287.64 $24.90 $298.80 $19.65 $235.80 $25.08 $300.96
6 BELT 6K915 1G1515 $25.96 $155.76 $25.83 $154.98 $23.55 $141.30 $24.42 $146.52
7 BELT K061187 1G1520 $29.63 $177.78 $29.87 $179.22 $20.33 $121.98 $33.17 $199.02
8 BELT K080496 1G1700 $28.26 $565.20 $27.40 $548.00 $13.85 $277.00 $26.65 $533.00
9 BELT 3289124 1G1720 $25.42 $152.52 $19.68 $118.08 $15.99 $95.94 $23.65 $141.90

10 BELT, K080813HD 1G1960 $36.19 $1,230.46 $34.48 $1,172.32 $17.51 $595.34 $26.18 $890.12
11 BELT K080471HD 1G5310 $36.66 $219.96 $34.96 $209.76 $23.45 $140.70 $20.67 $124.02
12 BELT 4931563/K080600 1G5320 $29.50 $177.00 $27.67 $166.02 $14.02 $84.12 $30.97 $185.82
13 BELT 4933315 1G6210 $34.57 $207.42 $31.98 $191.88 $17.74 $106.44 $36.26 $217.56
14 BELT JK81413 JK81413 $82.37 $494.22 $64.69 $388.14 $69.84 $419.04 $77.74 $466.44
15 BELT 1420-K6/K061420/K060680 TBD $15.81 $94.86 $16.90 $101.40 $14.40 $86.40 $45.87 $275.22
16 PULLEY 36310 1G6310 $17.52 $35.04 $17.95 $35.90 $15.98 $31.96 $18.79 $37.58
17 PULLEY 38006 1G8006 $14.00 $42.00 $13.90 $41.70 $10.60 $31.80 $14.73 $44.19
18 PULLEY 89017 1G8015 $16.75 $83.75 $16.90 $84.50 $14.24 $71.20 $14.14 $70.70
19 PULLEY 38019 1G8019 $13.04 $52.16 $12.50 $50.00 $11.09 $44.36 $13.31 $53.24
20 HOSE 1" SILICONE H508 - 26254 1H1010 $9.00 $225.00 $9.06 $226.50 $7.27 $181.75 $4.01 $100.25
21 HOSE 1/8" H174 - 27000 1H2180 $0.69 $17.25 $0.79 $19.75 $0.55 $13.75 $0.44 $11.00
22 HOSE 7/64" H458 - 27041 1H2185 $0.21 $5.25 $0.23 $5.75 $0.17 $4.25 $0.44 $11.00
23 HOSE 1/4" H175 - 27022 1H2190 $0.76 $38.00 $0.94 $47.00 $0.59 $29.50 $0.59 $29.50
24 HOSE 5/16" H176 - 27023 1H2195 $0.00 $0.92 $46.00 $0.60 $30.00 $0.59 $29.50
25 HOSE 3/8" H177 - 27024 1H2200 $0.00 $1.03 $77.25 $0.67 $50.25 $0.59 $44.25
26 HOSE 5/32" H459 - 27042 1H2205 $0.30 $7.50 $0.59 $14.75 $0.24 $6.00 $0.44 $11.00
27 HOSE 1/2" HEATER H156 - 65020 1H2235 $0.63 $31.50 $0.79 $39.50 $0.49 $24.50 $0.52 $26.00
28 HOSE 5/8 HEATER H153 - 65023 1H2240 $0.73 $36.50 $0.90 $45.00 $0.46 $23.00 $0.59 $29.50
29 HOSE 3/4" HEATER H152 - 65026 1H2245 $0.86 $43.00 $1.00 $50.00 $0.54 $27.00 $0.84 $42.00
30 CLAMP 505-1204 - 6202 1H2340 $0.46 $9.20 $0.53 $10.60 $0.74 $14.80 $0.28 $5.60
31 CLAMP 505-1206 -  6203 1H2345 $0.46 $9.20 $0.53 $10.60 $0.54 $10.80 $0.28 $5.60
32 CLAMP 505-1212  -  5012 1H2350 $0.69 $13.80 $0.53 $10.60 $0.63 $12.60 $0.32 $6.40
33 CLAMP 505-1216 -  5016 1H2355 $0.69 $13.80 $0.53 $10.60 $0.65 $13.00 $0.35 $7.00
34 CLAMP 505-1224 - - 5024 1H2360 $0.69 $13.80 $0.53 $10.60 $0.65 $13.00 $0.37 $7.40
35 CLAMP 505-1228 -  5028 1H2365 $0.69 $13.80 $0.53 $10.60 $0.73 $14.60 $0.37 $7.40
36 CLAMP 505-1232 -  5032 1H2370 $0.69 $13.80 $0.53 $10.60 $0.70 $14.00 $0.40 $8.00



Exhibit 3: Quote Tabulation
ITQ 20-R074542GE Automotive Parts

Group A: Auto Parts & Accessories

Auto Plus / Pep 
Boys

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Genuine 
Auto Supply

Genuine 
Auto Supply

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program
The Parts 

House
The Parts 

House

ITEM DESCRIPTION     STOCK # PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE
37 CLAMP 505-1236 -  5036 1H2375 $0.69 $13.80 $0.54 $10.80 $0.72 $14.40 $0.40 $8.00
38 CLAMP 705-1020 -  5040 1H2380 $1.23 $24.60 $0.98 $19.60 $0.96 $19.20 $0.56 $11.20
39 CLAMP 705-1023 -  5048 1H2385 $1.46 $29.20 $1.17 $23.40 $1.07 $21.40 $0.61 $12.20
40 CLAMP 705-1026 -  5056 1H2390 $1.61 $16.10 $1.32 $13.20 $1.15 $11.50 $0.69 $6.90
41 CLAMP 705-1029 -  32072 1H2395 $1.55 $15.50 $1.45 $14.50 $1.24 $12.40 $0.83 $8.30
42 CLAMP 705-1032 -  32104 1H2400 $1.85 $18.50 $1.74 $17.40 $1.52 $15.20 $1.16 $11.60
43 FUEL CAP 31748 GATES 1J1045 $3.60 $7.20 $6.83 $13.66 $3.38 $6.76 $6.15 $12.30
44 RADIATOR CAP 31527/703-1697 1J1055 $3.06 $9.18 $5.69 $17.07 $2.40 $7.20 $2.67 $8.01
45 RADIATOR CAP 31528/703-1698 1J1070 $3.06 $36.72 $4.49 $53.88 $2.90 $34.80 $2.61 $31.32
46 RED BAR LIGHT 49112 49112 $7.02 $21.06 $11.00 $33.00 $0.00 $8.98 $26.94
47 STEERING WHEEL COVER 38405P 38405P $0.00 $11.37 $113.70 $0.00 $10.09 $100.90
48 BATTERY HOLD DOWN BOLT 84-9286 1D1105 $4.68 $14.04 $4.84 $14.52 $0.00 $2.40 $7.20
49 RELAY 1252/11-1650 AIR SOURCE 30AMP 1E1110 $8.28 $24.84 $11.96 $35.88 $0.00 $5.41 $16.23
50 RELAY 1250/11-3002 AIR SOURCE 40AMP 1E1115 $13.86 $138.60 $9.23 $92.30 $0.00 $3.94 $39.40
51 FUSE HOLDER WATERPROOF BUSS  HHG 1E1305 $2.02 $60.60 $2.96 $88.80 $0.00 $2.24 $67.20
52 FUSE HOLDER HD BUSS HHD 1E1310 $1.33 $26.60 $2.82 $56.40 $0.00 $1.19 $23.80
53 ADD-A-CIRCIUT FHM200BP FHM200BP $11.72 $234.40 $8.99 $179.80 $0.00 $5.71 $114.20
54 WIRE LOOM 1/4"  100 FT BOX 783 1E1378 $0.23 $23.00 $0.28 $28.00 $0.00 $0.12 $12.00
55 WIRE LOOM 3/8"  100 FT BOX 784 1E1379 $0.28 $28.00 $0.33 $33.00 $0.00 $0.17 $17.00
56 WIRE LOOM 1/2"  100 FT BOX 786 1E1380 $0.30 $30.00 $0.33 $33.00 $0.00 $0.17 $17.00
57 WIRE LOOM 3/4"  100 FT BOX 1E1381 $0.36 $36.00 $0.47 $47.00 $0.00 $0.25 $25.00
58 BACK UP ALARM 60-102 STAR/530 ECCO 1E1445 $29.04 $174.24 $28.30 $169.80 $0.00 $25.12 $150.72
59 BACK UP ALARM ECCO #520 (12 TO 24VDC) 520 $23.08 $230.80 $35.90 $359.00 $0.00 $12.98 $129.80
60 TRAILER CONNECTOR 12-707 BW (RV STYLE) 1E1700 $6.45 $96.75 $9.95 $149.25 $0.00 $6.13 $91.95
61 TRAILER CONNECTOR 12-706 BW (RV STYLE) 1E1705 $6.43 $321.50 $7.95 $397.50 $0.00 $5.84 $292.00
62 TRAILER CONN BRACKET 38016 1E1710 $3.68 $11.04 $7.18 $21.54 $0.00 $3.11 $9.33
63 HORN, UNIVERSAL 12V HI NOTE 72100 1I1220 $15.59 $77.95 $13.95 $69.75 $0.00 $7.34 $36.70
64 HORN, UNIVERSAL 12V LO NOTE 72010 1I1225 $14.22 $71.10 $13.95 $69.75 $0.00 $7.34 $36.70
65 TOGGLE SW 5582-10 COLE 1I1267 $5.81 $17.43 $14.74 $44.22 $0.00 $12.86 $38.58
66 BOOT 81264 COLE HERSEE 1I1268 $8.24 $98.88 $3.95 $47.40 $0.00 $1.74 $20.88
67 RELAY 11-3007 1R3007 $20.65 $41.30 $8.95 $17.90 $0.00 $24.32 $48.64
68 EXH CLAMP L40SA 4" 33224 1X1040 $7.58 $75.80 $9.95 $99.50 $0.00 $9.42 $94.20
69 EXH HANGER 35103 / 8049 1X1025 $5.35 $214.00 $4.32 $172.80 $0.00 $6.65 $266.00
70 MUD FLAP 24"x36" PLAIN BLACK RUBBER 1X1205 $12.70 $317.50 $13.48 $337.00 $0.00 $8.23 $205.75
71 TARP MOTOR 61L DONOVAN 1X1400 $0.00 $175.30 $350.60 $0.00 $257.50 $515.00
72 TARP MOTOR SWITCH 90005-1-BX COLE HERSEE 1X1405 $0.00 $26.94 $53.88 $0.00 $19.67 $39.34
73 TRAILER BREAKAWAY KIT 20099 20099 $34.12 $511.80 $49.95 $749.25 $0.00 $36.71 $550.65

GROUP A: GRAND TOTAL $8,626.18 $9,727.65 $4,073.52 $8,370.33



Exhibit 3: Quote Form
ITQ 20-R074542GE Automotive Parts

Group B: Chemicals

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Genuine 
Auto 

Supply
Genuine Auto 

Supply

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

The 
Parts 
House

The Parts 
House

ITEM DESCRIPTION STOCK NBR PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE
1 BRAKE FLUID DOT 3 QUART 1B1305 $3.65 $87.60 $4.99 $119.76 No Bid $4.31 $103.44
2 BRAKE FLUID DOT 3 GALLON 1B1310 $13.66 $163.92 $14.99 $179.88 $16.91 $202.92
3 A/C FLUSH 2400 FJC 32 OU 1A1225 $7.47 $179.28 $9.95 $238.80 $10.40 $249.60
4 A/C FLUSH FJC #2401 (1 GALLON) FJC2401 $35.25 $423.00 $39.95 $479.40 $30.01 $360.12
5 A/C COND/EVAP CLEANER FJC5915 1A1227 $10.98 $263.52 $11.95 $286.80 $9.14 $219.36
6 A/C EVAP CLEANER 5914 FJC 1A1228 $8.24 $197.76 $11.95 $286.80 $7.79 $186.96
7 A/C OIL, PAG 150 VIS 1A1240 $6.77 $162.48 $5.99 $143.76 $3.89 $93.36
8 A/C PAG OIL PAG46 8 OUNCE 1A1246 $6.57 $157.68 $5.99 $143.76 $3.89 $93.36
9 A/C PAG OIL PAG100 8 OUNCE 1A1250 $6.77 $162.48 $5.99 $143.76 $3.89 $93.36
10 ACID CORE SOLDER 1LB 38101 FOR 1N1015 $17.29 $103.74 $7.99 $47.94 $7.25 $43.50
11 ROSIN CORE SOLDER 1LB 38070 FOR 1N1020 $16.59 $99.54 $6.99 $41.94 $7.12 $42.72
12 WEATHERSTRIP ADH 80 PERMATEX 81731 1N1030 $2.81 $16.86 $5.99 $35.94 $3.11 $18.66
13 CLEAR SILICONE 66B PERMATEX 80050 1N1040 $2.83 $67.92 $4.49 $107.76 $2.66 $63.84
14 ULTR GREY SILICONE 82194 PTX 1N1043 $3.79 $45.48 $4.99 $59.88 $3.69 $44.28
15 BLACK SILICONE 16B PERMATEX 81158 1N1047 $2.46 $59.04 $4.99 $119.76 $2.27 $54.48
16 WD40 12OU  NO SUBSTITUTE 490057 1N1055 $5.31 $127.44 $5.99 $143.76 $5.87 $140.88
17 MOLY LUBE ALL NO SUBSTITUTIONS LA12 $0.00 $9.95 $119.40 $9.45 $113.40
18 FREE ALL NO SUBSTITIUTIONS RE12 $0.00 $5.39 $194.04 $8.50 $306.00
19 PB BLASTER 16PB NO SUBSTITUTE 1N1056 $6.20 $74.40 $4.99 $59.88 $4.74 $56.88
20 SEAFOAM SF16 NO SUBSTITUTE 1N1065 $6.95 $8,340.00 $5.59 $6,708.00 $4.74 $5,688.00
21 BATTERY CLEANER 05023 CRC 1N1075 $2.42 $116.16 $2.99 $143.52 $2.35 $112.80
22 BATTERY PROTECTOR 7.5 OU SPRAY CRC 05046 1N1080 $3.80 $182.40 $3.99 $191.52 $3.81 $182.88
23 CARB CLEANER, M48-14/1736 AXC 1N1085 $2.48 $119.04 $1.89 $90.72 $1.77 $84.96
24 BRAKE CLEAN NON CHLOR 0732 AXC 14OU 1N1105 $2.51 $2,008.00 $1.79 $1,432.00 $1.76 $1,408.00

25
ARMORALL PROTECTOR 10OU
NO SUBSTITUTE 11010 1N1115 $5.07 $121.68 $3.99 $95.76 $6.40 $153.60



Exhibit 3: Quote Form
ITQ 20-R074542GE Automotive Parts

Group B: Chemicals

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Genuine 
Auto 

Supply
Genuine Auto 

Supply

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

The 
Parts 
House

The Parts 
House

ITEM DESCRIPTION STOCK NBR PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE
26 POWER STEERING FLUID 12 OU/M27-13 RAD 1N1120 $1.59 $57.24 $1.99 $71.64 $1.07 $38.52
27 TURTLE WAX PASTE T222R 1N1125 $6.45 $77.40 $5.99 $71.88 $6.55 $78.60
28 BUGS BE GONE  BBG-1  16OU 1N1127 $4.97 $298.20 $4.99 $299.40 $3.28 $196.80
29 NEVER SIEZE 133K PERMATEX 80078 PTX 1N1135 $6.42 $38.52 $8.99 $53.94 $4.91 $29.46
30 CALIPER LUBE, PERMATEX #24110 24110 $12.43 $74.58 $10.99 $65.94 $10.49 $62.94
31 LOCTITE RED THREADLOCKER 27140 PERMATEX 1N1140 $11.23 $67.38 $18.99 $113.94 $15.37 $92.22
32 SILICONE SPRAY 05074 CRC 1N1145 $3.11 $111.96 $2.59 $93.24 $2.46 $88.56
33 ELECTRICAL TAPE  3/4"X60'-59656 MMM 1N1155 $0.59 $29.50 $2.59 $129.50 $0.95 $47.50
34 TEFLON TAPE  1/2"X522"-9-1462 MTM 1N1160 $1.78 $44.50 $2.59 $64.75 $1.82 $45.50
35 WINDOW WASH M5-06 RAD 1N1165 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.79 $1,790.00 $1.04 $1,040.00

36
FIRE EXTINGUISHER 466425 5LB A:B:C W/MTG 
BRACKET/466425 KID 1N1170 $0.00 $49.95 $999.00 $48.03 $960.60

37 SPRAY WHITE GREASE 14OU/L6-16 RAD 1N1175 $3.49 $83.76 $3.99 $95.76 $3.48 $83.52
38 SPRAY PAINT WHITE GLOSS DPLBT40 1N1190 $3.81 $137.16 $2.99 $107.64 $2.99 $107.64
39 SPRAY PAINT BLACK GLOSS DPLBT42 1N1195 $3.81 $182.88 $2.99 $143.52 $2.99 $143.52
40 SUPER GLUE 82191 1N1200 $2.34 $56.16 $1.99 $47.76 $1.42 $34.08
41 REAR VIEW MIRROR ADH 81840 81840 $2.28 $22.80 $4.99 $49.90 $2.52 $25.20
42 REARVIEW MIRROR ADHESIVE 81844 PERMATEX 1N1210 $1.20 $18.00 $2.99 $44.85 $1.54 $23.10
43 LOCKTITE BLUE THREADLOCKER 24240 PERMATX 1N1215 $11.23 $67.38 $19.95 $119.70 $15.37 $92.22
44 PIPE JOINT COMP 80044 PERM 4OU/82194 PTX 1N1220 $3.79 $22.74 $5.99 $35.94 $3.69 $22.14

45
AIR FRESHENER TREES U6P-60101
(6 PER PACKAGE) OR PRICE EACH 1N1240 $0.00 $4.89 $352.08 $1.19 $85.68

46 DISTILLED WATER GAL/WATER CPU 1N2010 $0.00 $2.49 $435.75 $1.50 $262.50

47
LOCTITE GREY 21744 CARTRIDGE
NO SUBSTITUTE/82195 PTX 1N5999 $9.92 $59.52 $13.99 $83.94 $12.87 $77.22

48
3M MARINE SEALANT/FAST CURE #06520  NO 
SUBSTITUTE 06520 $18.13 $181.30 $28.95 $289.50 $23.69 $236.90

49 TRIM ADHESIVE 08090 MMM 1N8090 $17.62 $176.20 $22.99 $229.90 $22.20 $222.00
50 DIELECTRIC GREASE 22058 PTX 22058 $5.62 $56.20 $4.99 $49.90 $6.48 $64.80
51 TAPE DOUBLE SIDED 03614 3M 3614 $5.66 $67.92 $6.99 $83.88 $6.90 $82.80
52 SEALANT, 3M BODY 08500 8500 $20.78 $249.36 $24.99 $299.88 $25.38 $304.56
53  DIESEL DEEP CLEAN (LUCAS) NO SUBTITUTE 10872 $8.76 $5,694.00 $10.49 $6,818.50 $9.35 $6,077.50
54 5078 THROTTLE BODY CLEANER 5078 $3.11 $37.32 $3.99 $47.88 $3.16 $37.92
55 1041/05103 CRC ELECTRICAL CONTACT CLEANER 5103 $5.18 $62.16 $4.99 $59.88 $5.30 $63.60

GROUP B: GRAND TOTAL $22,253.56 $24,763.93 No Bid $20,844.96



Exhibit 3: Quote Tabulation
ITQ 20-R074542GE Automotive Parts

Group C: Heavy Duty Truck Parts

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Auto plus / 
Pep Boys

Genuine 
Auto 

Supply
Genuine Auto 

Supply

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program
The Parts 

House
The Parts 

House

ITEM DESCRIPTION STOCK NBR PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE

1 GASKET STEMCO 330-3036 1W1070 $2.73 $27.30 No Bid $1.49 $14.90

2 GASKET ROCKWELL 2208J426-E2433 1W1072 $1.27 $12.70 $0.60 $6.00

3 GASKET STEMCO 3060 1W1075 $3.63 $36.30 $1.38 $13.80

4 GASKET N8092/FREIGHTLINER 11-14418-000 1W1078 $0.00 $4.20 $50.40

5 AIR BRAKE TUBING, 1/2" (100' ROLL)PRICE PER FOOT 1H0012 $0.81 $81.00 $0.69 $69.00

6 AIR BRAKE TUBING, 1/4" (100' ROLL)PRICE PER FOOT 1H0014 $0.28 $28.00 $0.35 $35.00

7 AIR BRAKE TUBING, 3/8" (100' ROLL)PRICE PER FOOT 1H0038 $0.57 $57.00 $0.59 $59.00

8 HUBODOMETER, 600-9999 STEMCO 1W1200 $0.00 $55.34 $332.04

9 AXLE GASKET J17829 / 55350 J17829 $1.82 $21.84 $1.79 $21.48

10 AXLE ORING F81Z1001BA F81Z1001BA $0.00 $4.33 $43.30

11 U-JOINT 5-280X 5-280X $32.33 $64.66 $35.63 $71.26

12 U-JOINT 5-675X 5-675X $38.97 $77.94 $43.00 $86.00

13 GOVENOR OR275491X BENDIX 1B1010 $12.21 $97.68 $13.69 $109.52

14 PP-1 AIR BRAKE VALVE OR276567X 1B1015 $0.00 $14.99 $59.96

15 DRIER ELEMENT 107794X BENDIX 1B1050 $30.68 $1,073.80 $23.42 $819.70



Exhibit 3: Quote Tabulation
ITQ 20-R074542GE Automotive Parts

Group C: Heavy Duty Truck Parts

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Auto plus / 
Pep Boys

Genuine 
Auto 

Supply
Genuine Auto 

Supply

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program
The Parts 

House
The Parts 

House

ITEM DESCRIPTION STOCK NBR PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE

16 AD-9 PURGE VALVE 800405 BENDIX 1B1052 $35.12 $351.20 $167.81 $1,678.10

17 DRIER R950011 MERITOR 1B1056 $0.00 $60.71 $242.84

18 DRIER KIT W/FILTERS T224-P T224-P $39.88 $997.00 88.46 $107.62 $2,690.50

19 DRUMS 64115B WEBB 1B1125 $0.00 $219.09 $7,887.24

20 HEIGHT CONTROL VALVE 90054007 NEWAY 1B2010 $43.96 $175.84 $58.62 $234.48

21 BRAKE PADS MERITOR# KIT2252H2BA-2   NO SUBSTITUTE 1B6215 $0.00 $211.40 $1,691.20

22
BRAKE ROTOR ONLY MERITOR #23123647002  NO 
SUBSTITUTE TBD $0.00 $307.32 $2,458.56

23
BRAKE ROTOR & HUB ASM MERITOR #17160071000 NO 
SUBSTITUTE TBD $0.00 $1,062.71 $8,501.68

24
BRAKE CALIPER MERITOR #EX225H301XX00 NO 
SUBSTITUTE 1B6220 $0.00 $942.06 $7,536.48

25
BRAKE CALIPER MERITOR #EX225H302XX00 NO 
SUBSTITUTE 1B6225 $0.00 $942.06 $7,536.48

26 DRUMS,  107864 CONMET NO SUB 1B2100 $0.00 $92.48 $924.80

27 DRUMS, 3754 1B2110 $0.00 $256.84 $1,027.36

28 DRUM 66884B WEBB 1B2165 $0.00 $172.59 $690.36

29 BRAKE DRUM 107865 CONMET NO SUB 1B4715 $0.00 $104.59 $1,255.08

30 BRAKE DRUM 107863 CONMET NO SUB 107863 $0.00 $92.18 $368.72

31 BRAKE DRUM 107866 CONMET NO SUB 107866 $0.00 $99.50 $398.00
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32 HARDWARE KIT8846HD MERITOR 1B5515 $0.00 $69.48 $277.92

33 HARDWARE KIT6065 MERITOR 1B5565 $0.00 $147.48 $3,539.52

34 STEMCO CAP 343-4080 1S1005 $0.00 $39.73 $397.30

35 NATIONAL 380001A NO SUBSTITUE 1S1018 $29.95 $119.80 $27.23 $108.92

36 NATIONAL 370003A NO SUBSTITUTE 1S1020 $31.50 $126.00 $28.64 $114.56

37 NATIONAL 370195A NO SUBSTITUTE 1S1035 $40.61 $1,624.40 $36.92 $1,476.80

38 BCA/TIMKEN ONLY 203FF 1S1040 $9.19 $36.76 $3.45 $13.80

39 BCA/TIMKIN ONLY 205FF 1S1042 $14.95 $179.40 $9.60 $115.20

40 BEARING 5106-WCC 1S1046 $30.83 $493.28 $21.52 $344.32

41 STEMCO CAP 340-4009 1S1165 $13.26 $53.04 $7.38 $29.52

42  NATIONAL 370047A/34387 1S1245 $24.53 $147.18 $22.30 $133.80

43 HUB CAP 340-4024 STEMCO 1S4024 $23.67 $94.68 $24.65 $98.60

44 SEAL BRS110 MTRCRAFT 710454 $34.01 $408.12 $33.48 $401.76

45 SEAL 710568 710568 $16.64 $199.68 $14.29 $171.48

46 PARKING BRAKE VALVE BENDIX K031485  K031485 $0.00 $228.90 $915.60



Exhibit 3: Quote Tabulation
ITQ 20-R074542GE Automotive Parts

Group C: Heavy Duty Truck Parts

Auto Plus / 
Pep Boys

Auto plus / 
Pep Boys

Genuine 
Auto 

Supply
Genuine Auto 

Supply

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program

Vehicle 
Maintenance 

Program
The Parts 

House
The Parts 

House

ITEM DESCRIPTION STOCK NBR PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE

47 HEIGHT CONTROL VALVE BENDIX KD2262  KD2262 $0.00 $42.25 $253.50

GROUP C: GRAND TOTAL $6,584.60 No Bid $2,211.50 $55,305.84
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