MANATEE COUNTY PURCHASING - BID TABULATION
IFB #09-2762DC FUEL TANK INSTALLATION @ ADMINISTRATION CENTER

230,400.00

C&S Technical Delesline Quality REA Remedial Southeastern Kincart
STANDARD WORK HOURS Resources Construction |JAH Construction Enterprises Solutions Gen Contractors | Construction
BID A - 90 Days Orlando FL Palmetto FL Tampa FL Naples FL Valrico FL Jax FL Bartow FL
Fuel Tank Furnish/Install $ 191,400.00( $ 212,359.62 $ 298,033.00] $ 195,000.00| $ 251,688.00
Underpinning $ 14,000.00{ $ 13,926.50 $ 15,306.50{ $ 11,000.00| $ 8,000.00
Discretionary $ 25,000.00{ $ 25,000.00 $ 25,000.00 $ 25,000.00| $ 25,000.00
TOTALBID PRICE-BIDA | § 230,400.00( $ 251,286.12 No Bid $ 338,339.50 $ 231,000.00{ $ 284,688.00| No pricing submitted
BID B-115 Dayé
Fuel Tank Furnish/Install $ 191,400.00| $ 197,859.62 $ 283,5633.00] $ 192,000.00| $ 244,188.00
Underpinning $ 14,000.00{ $ 13,926.50 $ 15,306.50 $ 10,000.00 $ 8,000.00
Discretionary $ 25,000.00| $ 25,000.00 $ 25,000.00] $ 25,000.00| $ 25,000.00
TOTAL BID PRICE-BIDB | $ $ 236,786.12 No Bid $ $ 227,000.00 $ No pricing submitted
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ALTERNATE #1 C echnica eLesline Quality EA Remedt heastern ncart
NIGHT & WEEKEND WORK Resources Construction |JAH Construction Enterprises Solutions Gen Contractors | Construction
BID A - 90 Days Orlando FL Palmetto FL Tampa FL Naples FL Valrico FL Jax FL Bartow FL
Fuel Tank Furnish/Install $ 210,540.00| $ 265,449.52 $ 323,033.00| $ 215,500.00
Underpinning $ 14,000.00| $ 17,408.13 $ 15,306.50 $ 14,000.00
Discretionary $ 25,000.00} $ 25,000.00 $ 25,000.00] $ 25,000.00
TOTAL BID PRICE-BID A $ 249,540.00| $ 307,857.65 No Bid $ 363,339.50] $ 254,500.00 No Bid No pricing submitted
BID B- 115 Days
Fuel Tank Furnish/Install $ 210,540.00( $ 24732452 $ 391,699.00] $ 308,533.00 $ 211,500.00
Underpinning $ 14,000.00] $ 17,408.13| $ 20,860.00f $ 15,306.50| $ 13,000.00
Discretionary $ 25,000.00f $ 25,000.00{ $ 25,000.00{ $ 25,000.00| $ 25,000.00
TOTAL BID PRICE -BID B $ 249,540.00f $ 289,73265| $ 437,559.00] $ 348,839.50 $ 249,500.00 No Bid No pricing submitted
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