Suburban System Water Line Replacement Project, Phase 1
Project No. 60747.70
Bid No. 09-3281-0OV
Bid Price "B"

Bid Opening November 12, 2009

Volt Information Sciences,

Youngs Communication

Kuxhausen Construction,

Harris-McBurney,

ITEM DESCRIPTION (BID A) UNITS  QTY Inc. Co, Inc. Dallas 1 Corporation Inc Pipeline Utilities, Inc. Company BJ Enterprises, Inc. Carl Hankins, Inc. Infratech Corporation Olney Earthworks, Inc. Woodruff & Sons, Inc. Strickler Brothers, Inc. Westra Construction Corp. | D.R. Swanson, Co.
NO. : UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTEND
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE %) PRICE (6] PRICE %) PRICE PRICE ED
(%) (O] ($) $) %) $) %) %) $) $) (%) (%) (9) (%) (%) $) (%) (%) () (9) 9) (%) (9) () | PRICE
1 |Mobilization-Demobilization LS 1 10,000.00 10,000.00 | 53,625.00 53,625.00 | 89,900.50 89,900.50 | 100,000.00 100,000.00 |110,830.00 110,830.00 | 44,626.00 44,626.00 45,740.00 45,740.00 |45,095.00 45,095.00 | 15,000.00 15,000.00 | 60,544.65 60,544.65 123,398.42 123,398.42 120,000.00 120,000.00 130,000.00 130,000.00 |No Bid
2 |Furnish and Install Pipe
2A |4 Inch PVC Pipe-Open Cut LF 502 5.13 2,575.26 9.36 4,698.72 15.00 7,530.00 20.00 10,040.00 11.35 5,697.70 13.00 6,526.00 10.30 5,170.60 12.50 6,275.00 8.41 4,221.82 7.95 3,990.90 16.60 8,333.20 14.00 7,028.00 19.00 9,538.00 |No Bid
2B |4 Inch HDPE Pipe-HDD LF 529 9.92 5,247.68 10.24 5,416.96 11.00 5,819.00 15.00 7,935.00 15.95 8,437.55 13.00 6,877.00 18.20 9,627.80 17.50 9,257.50 13.26 7,014.54 25.15 13,304.35 18.99 10,045.71 17.00 8,993.00 27.00 14,283.00 |No Bid
2C |6 Inch PVC Pipe-Open Cut LF 1,903 9.05 17,222.15 11.94 22,721.82 18.00 34,254.00 24.00 45,672.00 12.85 24,453.55 15.00 28,545.00 11.80 22,455.40 16.00 30,448.00 10.91 20,761.73 9.70 18,459.10 18.78 35,738.34 16.00 30,448.00 16.00 30,448.00 |No Bid
2D |6 Inch HDPE Pipe-HDD LF 10,145 16.34 165,769.30 14.04 142,435.80 16.00 162,320.00 18.50 187,682.50 19.50 197,827.50 16.90 171,450.50 22.20 225,219.00 22.00 223,190.00 21.31 216,189.95 32.10 325,654.50 20.76 210,610.20 26.00 263,770.00 30.55 309,929.75 |No Bid
2E |8 Inch PVC Pipe-Open Cut LF 387 10.87 4,206.69 16.58 6,416.46 21.00 8,127.00 26.00 10,062.00 16.00 6,192.00 24.15 9,346.05 15.30 5,921.10 21.00 8,127.00 15.38 5,952.06 13.65 5,282.55 22.96 8,885.52 20.00 7,740.00 25.00 9,675.00 |No Bid
2F |8 Inch HDPE Pipe-HDD LF 2,885 23.35 67,364.75 17.60 50,776.00 22.00 63,470.00 22.00 63,470.00 28.30 81,645.50 20.50 59,142.50 29.70 85,684.50 29.00 83,665.00 28.85 83,232.25 40.40 116,554.00 28.37 81,847.45 33.00 95,205.00 42.45 122,468.25 |No Bid
Furnish and Install Ductile Iron
3 |Fittings TON 3.45 9,120.51 31,465.76 | 5,460.00 18,837.00 | 7,360.00 25,392.00 2,770.00 9,556.50 9,920.00 34,224.00 | 2,421.00 8,352.45  9,500.00 32,775.00 | 9,900.00 34,155.00 | 6,549.38 22,595.36 | 6,803.85 23,473.28 11,945.35 41,211.46 12,540.00 43,263.00 8,200.00 28,290.00 |No Bid
4 |Furnish and Install Valves
4A |4 Inch Gate Valve EA 2 762.67 1,525.34 692.25 1,384.50 540.00 1,080.00 853.00 1,706.00 645.00 1,290.00 700.00 1,400.00 710.00 1,420.00 946.00 1,892.00 629.54 1,259.08 684.35 1,368.70 886.22 1,772.44 680.00 1,360.00 1,059.00 2,118.00 |No Bid
4B |6 Inch Gate Valve EA 23 1,300.43 29,909.89 911.63 20,967.49 660.00 15,180.00 1,028.00 23,644.00 760.00 17,480.00 900.00 20,700.00 880.00 20,240.00 | 1,150.00 26,450.00 844.47 19,422.81 883.20 20,313.60 1,038.41 23,883.43 880.00 20,240.00 1,175.00 27,025.00 |No Bid
4C |8 inch Gate Valve EA 17 1,923.48 32,699.16 | 1,228.50 20,884.50 940.00 15,980.00 1,318.00 22,406.00 1,055.00 17,935.00 | 1,243.00 21,131.00 1,170.00 19,890.00 | 1,550.00 26,350.00 | 1,180.87 20,074.79 | 1,212.75 20,616.75 1,402.35 23,839.95 1,220.00 20,740.00 1,484.00 25,228.00 |No Bid
4D |20 inch Butterfly Valve 7,721.75 7,721.75 [ 10,725.00 10,725.00 | 16,410.00 16,410.00 7,075.00 7,075.00 6,305.00 6,305.00 | 8,100.00 8,100.00  6,070.00 6,070.00 | 7,528.00 7,528.00 | 6,627.87 6,627.87 | 6,628.90 6,628.90 7,518.02 7,518.02 6,950.00 6,950.00 7,280.00 7,280.00 |No Bid
Furnish and Install Tapping Sleeves
5 |and Valves
5A |18"x6" Tapping Sleeve and Valve 2,643.80 13,219.00 | 4,387.00 21,935.00 | 4,480.00 22,400.00 2,613.00 3,295.00 16,475.00 | 6,700.00 33,500.00 1,692.00 8,460.00 | 3,600.00 18,000.00 | 2,390.29 11,951.45 9,637.25 4,153.87 20,769.35 3,760.00 18,800.00 30,965.00 |No Bid
5B |20"x6" Tapping Sleeve and Valve 2,374.41 7,123.23 | 4,485.00 13,455.00 | 6,980.00 20,940.00 2,705.00 3,385.00 10,155.00 | 6,800.00 20,400.00  1,785.00 5,355.00 | 3,710.00 11,130.00 | 9,118.36 27,355.08 | 2,029.60 6,088.80 4,240.89 12,722.67 3,850.00 11,550.00 18,963.00 |No Bid
Furnish and Install Small and
Medium Diameter Distribution
6 |Connections
6A |1 1/2 Inch Connection 174.30 348.60 282.75 565.50 770.00 1,540.00 400.00 800.00 795.00 1,590.00 411.00 822.00 600.00 1,200.00 336.00 672.00 171.04 342.08 296.05 592.10 821.47 1,642.94 420.00 840.00 570.00 1,140.00
6B |2 Inch Connection EA 2 689.82 1,379.64 616.20 1,232.40 | 1,010.00 2,020.00 804.00 1,608.00 840.00 1,680.00 710.00 1,420.00 997.00 1,994.00 942.00 1,884.00 969.80 1,939.60 740.60 1,481.20 900.03 1,800.06 820.00 1,640.00 1,429.00 2,858.00 |No Bid
6 Inch Connection Near 5506 16th St|
6C  |West EA 1 357.44 357.44 | 3,085.88 3,085.88 | 1,120.00 1,120.00 1,426.00 1,426.00 2,155.00 2,155.00 | 1,268.00 1,268.00 850.00 850.00 | 1,500.00 1,500.00 375.98 375.98 920.90 920.90 2,336.64 2,336.64 1,320.00 1,320.00 3,099.00 3,099.00 |No Bid
6 Inch Connection Near 5612 16th St
6D |West EA 1 357.44 357.44 | 3,573.38 3,5673.38 | 1,120.00 1,120.00 1,426.00 1,426.00 2,155.00 2,155.00 | 1,268.00 1,268.00 850.00 850.00 650.00 650.00 375.98 375.98 920.90 920.90 3,025.34 3,025.34 1,320.00 1,320.00 2,465.00 2,465.00 |No Bid
6 Inch Connection Near 5412 16th St|
6E  |West EA 1 357.44 357.44 | 3,573.38 3,573.38 | 1,120.00 1,120.00 1,426.00 1,426.00 2,770.00 2,770.00 | 1,268.00 1,268.00 850.00 850.00 450.00 450.00 375.98 375.98 920.90 920.90 6,088.21 6,088.21 1,320.00 1,320.00 3,615.00 3,615.00 |No Bid
8 Inch Connection 55th. Ave. West &
6F |18th. St. West. EA 1 407.75 407.75 | 3,814.20 3,814.20 | 1,160.00 1,160.00 1,466.00 1,466.00 2,260.00 2,260.00 | 1,368.00 1,368.00 897.00 897.00 950.00 950.00 417.79 417.79 | 1,038.65 1,038.65 3,154.28 3,154.28 1,360.00 1,360.00 3,375.00 3,375.00 |No Bid
Funish and Install DIP Conflict
7 |Piping 55th. Ave. West LS 1 3,591.43 3,591.43 | 29,932.50 29,932.50 | 4,730.00 4,730.00 | 4,800.00 4,800.00 8,480.00 8,480.00 | 3,544.00 3,544.00 3,640.00 3,640.00 |13,550.00 13,550.00 | 3,610.89 3,610.89 | 3,891.00 3,891.00 4,994.60 4,994.60 4,570.00 4,570.00 7,265.00 7,265.00 |No Bid
Furnish and Install Fire Hydrant
8  |Assembly 7,521.01 165,462.22 | 3,475.88 76,469.36 | 3,290.00 72,380.00 3,835.00 84,370.00 3,435.00 75,570.00 | 3,980.00 87,560.00  3,715.00 81,730.00 | 5,088.75 111,952.50 | 4,998.22 109,960.84 | 3,898.30 85,762.60 4,063.36 89,393.92 4,180.00 91,960.00 4,120.00 90,640.00
Furnish and Install Long Side Water
9 |Service
9A |Long Side Single Water Service 382.72 26,407.68 794.63 54,829.47 600.00 41,400.00 27,887.04 670.00 46,230.00 789.00 54,441.00  1,060.00 73,140.00 725.00 50,025.00 | 1,405.22 96,960.18 631.25 43,556.25 951.55 65,656.95 870.00 60,030.00 1,000.00 69,000.00 |No Bid
9B |Long Side Multiple Water Service 1,272.71 78,908.02 | 1,246.05 77,255.10 | 1,030.00 63,860.00 58,441.82 1,085.00 67,270.00 | 1,580.00 97,960.00  1,492.00 92,504.00 | 1,500.00 93,000.00 | 2,163.40 134,130.80 | 1,146.05 71,055.10 1,516.05 93,995.10 1,340.00 83,080.00 1,893.00 117,366.00 |No Bid
Furnish and Install Short Side Water
10 |Service
10A [Short Side Single Water Service 376.47 36,517.59 511.88 49,652.36 470.00 45,590.00 229.00 22,213.00 380.00 36,860.00 570.00 55,290.00 490.00 47,530.00 315.00 30,555.00 559.14 54,236.58 245.25 23,789.25 504.85 48,970.45 490.00 47,530.00 450.00 43,650.00
10B |Short Side Multiple Water Servce EA 51 889.23 45,350.73 750.75 38,288.25 860.00 43,860.00 707.00 36,057.00 765.00 39,015.00 | 1,126.00 57,426.00 889.00 45,339.00 915.00 46,665.00 | 1,081.04 55,133.04 721.80 36,811.80 1,030.46 52,553.46 920.00 46,920.00 920.00 46,920.00 |No Bid
Furnish and Install Meter Box
11 |Assembly 197.10 82,387.80 83.85 35,049.30 130.00 54,340.00 139.00 58,102.00 250.00 104,500.00 270.00 112,860.00 309.00 129,162.00 215.00 89,870.00 207.04 86,542.72 167.50 70,015.00 210.10 87,821.80 231.00 96,558.00 280.00 117,040.00 |No Bid
Furnish and Install Right-of-Entry
12 |Services
12A |Type I ROE Service 1,389.52 16,674.24 843.38 10,120.56 420.00 5,040.00 2,950.00 35,400.00 775.00 9,300.00 610.00 7,320.00 830.00 9,960.00 225.00 2,700.00 919.68 11,036.16 | 1,948.15 23,377.80 812.16 9,745.92 500.00 6,000.00 1,400.00 16,800.00
12B |Type Il ROE Service EA 3 382.20 1,146.60 877.50 2,632.50 490.00 1,470.00 1,059.00 3,177.00 695.00 2,085.00 780.00 2,340.00 950.00 2,850.00 250.00 750.00 586.76 1,760.28 | 1,801.05 5,403.15 1,000.61 3,001.83 600.00 1,800.00 2,614.00 7,842.00 |No Bid
12C |Type Il ROE Service EA 12 1,507.47 18,089.64 959.79 11,517.48 750.00 9,000.00 1,617.00 19,404.00 770.00 9,240.00 | 2,612.00 31,344.00 1,281.00 15,372.00 325.00 3,900.00 | 1,000.19 12,002.28 | 2,446.40 29,356.80 1,715.43 20,585.16 1,270.00 15,240.00 2,485.00 29,820.00 |No Bid
Funrnish and Install Blow-Off
13 |Assembly EA 4 942.77 3,771.08 300.00 1,200.00 840.00 3,360.00 1,686.00 6,744.00 895.00 3,580.00 780.00 3,120.00 891.00 3,564.00 975.00 3,900.00 | 2,173.05 8,692.20 752.45 3,009.80 1,202.48 4,809.92 1,230.00 4,920.00 800.00 3,200.00 |No Bid
Furnish and Install Air Release
14 |Assembly EA 4 1,825.66 7,302.64 | 2,190.83 8,763.32 | 3,260.00 13,040.00 2,570.00 10,280.00 1,565.00 6,260.00 | 1,700.00 6,800.00 1,650.00 6,600.00 | 1,947.00 7,788.00 | 1,885.95 7,543.80 | 1,507.55 6,030.20 1,906.26 7,625.04 1,970.00 7,880.00 2,025.00 8,100.00 |No Bid
15 [Grout Abandoned Pipelines
15A |2 Inch Water Line LF 370 0.31 114.70 3.32 1,228.40 1.70 629.00 4.00 1,480.00 1.60 592.00 1.05 388.50 5.60 2,072.00 1.50 555.00 2.00 740.00 1.00 370.00 6.53 2,416.10 7.00 2,590.00 2.15 795.50 |No Bid
15B |3 Inch Water Line LF 11,607 0.34 3,946.38 3.56 41,320.92 2.00 23,214.00 4.50 52,231.50 1.60 18,571.20 1.05 12,187.35 1.10 12,767.70 2.25 26,115.75 3.00 34,821.00 1.15 13,348.05 2.94 34,124.58 8.00 92,856.00 1.80 20,892.60 |No Bid
15C |6 Inch Water Line LF 3,965 0.11 436.15 4.00 15,860.00 5.90 23,393.50 6.00 23,790.00 3.90 15,463.50 1.60 6,344.00 1.50 5,947.50 3.50 13,877.50 4.00 15,860.00 25.05 99,323.25 3.55 14,075.75 10.00 39,650.00 2.60 10,309.00 |No Bid
16 |Pavement Restoration SY 206.5 4.48 925.12 28.28 5,839.82 110.00 22,715.00 50.00 10,325.00 84.15 17,376.98 50.00 10,325.00 25.40 5,245.10 26.00 5,369.00 27.00 5,575.50 61.45 12,689.43 112.36 23,202.34 33.00 6,814.50 35.50 7,330.75 |No Bid
Pavement Restoration-Milling and
17 |Overlay sy 3,311 1.67 5,529.37 13.69 45,327.59 16.00 52,976.00 13.00 43,043.00 12.90 42,711.90 20.00 66,220.00 14.00 46,354.00 22.00 72,842.00 22.00 72,842.00 14.55 48,175.05 12.87 42,612.57 12.00 39,732.00 9.15 30,295.65 |No Bid
18  |Curb Restoration LF 177 8.25 1,460.25 19.99 3,538.23 24.00 4,248.00 25.00 4,425.00 35.00 6,195.00 20.00 3,540.00 19.80 3,504.60 35.00 6,195.00 11.00 1,947.00 24.20 4,283.40 26.40 4,672.80 30.00 5,310.00 48.50 8,584.50 |No Bid
19 |Driveway Restoration
19A |Concrete Driveway SY 219 9.42 2,062.98 45.09 9,874.71 75.00 16,425.00 40.00 8,760.00 32.60 7,139.40 40.00 8,760.00 56.50 12,373.50 50.00 10,950.00 75.00 16,425.00 30.25 6,624.75 36.34 7,958.46 44.00 9,636.00 45.45 9,953.55 |No Bid
19B |Asphalt Driveway sy 158 2.99 472.42 28.28 4,468.24 70.00 11,060.00 45.00 7,110.00 45.20 7,141.60 30.00 4,740.00 49.50 7,821.00 24.50 3,871.00 45.00 7,110.00 54.95 8,682.10 58.67 9,269.86 44.00 6,952.00 31.25 4,937.50 |No Bid
19C |Shell Driveway SY 33 15.92 525.36 24.86 820.38 61.00 2,013.00 10.00 330.00 19.75 651.75 10.00 330.00 26.20 864.60 18.50 610.50 21.00 693.00 14.70 485.10 24.60 811.80 11.00 363.00 10.75 354.75 |No Bid
19D [Stone Driveway sy 9 13.27 119.43 24.86 223.74 68.00 612.00 40.00 360.00 80.00 720.00 18.00 162.00 69.50 625.50 12.25 110.25 18.00 162.00 13.10 117.90 43.45 391.05 11.00 99.00 11.90 107.10 |No Bid
20 |[Sidewalk Restoration SY 17 26.18 445.06 45.34 770.78 55.00 935.00 40.00 680.00 25.25 429.25 40.00 680.00 67.30 1,144.10 38.75 658.75 72.00 1,224.00 26.05 442.85 71.07 1,208.19 36.00 612.00 43.25 735.25 |No Bid
21 [Discretionary Work 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00
TOTAL PRICE: 1,060,905.16 1,095,107.00 1,173,173.00 1,197,991.36 1,236,940.38 1,241,192.35 1,270,780.00 1,293,478.75 1,364,495.47 1,594,702.15
Commments See Notes Note 1 Note 1 Note 1 [ ] ] ] Note 1
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid
Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid
Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid
Drug Free Work Place Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid
Bid Bond Enclosed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid
Site Visit Confirmed N/A N/a N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Affidavit submitted if applicable No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes No Bid

Note 1 Extended Price and Total Price Corrected per Information To Bidders Paragraph A.28




