08-3857DS TABULATION FOR SMALL SCALE ROOF REPAIRS AND INSTALLATIONS

Anderson & Shah Roofing, Inc. of FL
6456 123rd Ave.

Largo, FL 33773

727-524-8888

Budget Roofing of Florida
1410 US Hwy 92W
Auburndale, FL 33123
863-967-6675

Charles A Roy Roofing, Inc.
510 6th Ave. E.

Bradenton, FL 34208
941-746-0008

7321 Intemnational Place
Sarasota, FL 34240
941-343-9600

Crowther Roofing & Sheet Metal of FL, Inc.

Manson Roofing, inc.
807 24th Ave. W.
Bradenton, FL 34205
941-748-5547

ITEM NO.

DESCRIPTION

EST Qty

UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

NEW ROOFING AND ROOF REPAIR - Includes fumishing of
ali materials, labor, equipment, and incidentals for performance
of the required work.

FIBERGLASS SHINGLE ROOFING

_mm_<mauma. painted metal eaves drip and flashing

Remove existing roofing material and existing 1"2" fumber,
drip edge, and flashing down to wood decking. install new drip
edge of 1'x4", minimum, pressure treated lumber along the
entire perimeter of the roof. Apply one layer of 30 pound 8_4
and install a minimum 25 year, 3 tab, Class A, self-sealing
mildew/fungus resistant strip shingles with all new 26 gauge|

A1

410 12 rise to 6 to 12 rise

Square

$280.00 $1,680.00

NO BID NO BID

$285.00 $1,710.00

$2,700.00

$204.00

$1,224.00

A1.2

Less than 4 to 12 rise over run. Perform work as specified
above, with the exception for two layers of 30 pound felt paper,
linstead of one layer. Under 3 to 12 rise shorter exposited
single face.

Square

$310.00 $1,860.00

NO BID NO BID

$275.00 $1,650.00

$450.00 $2,700.00

$219.00

$1,314.00

A2

BUILT-UP ROOFING

Remove existing roofing material, existing lumber, drip edge,
and flashing down to wood decking. install new drip edge of]
pressure treated lumber to match existing removed along the
entire perimeter of the roof. Install new flashings and 26|
gauge galvanized painted metal gravei stop. Apply four ply hot
mopped built-up roofing with flood coat and gravel. Example:
Dry in with Type 43 glass base sheet or compatible, hot mop
three fiberglass felts, flood coat with hot asphalt and
embedded gravel

A2.1

1to 5 Squares

Square

[ $35000 |

$350.00

NO BID ] NO BID

i

$800.00 | $800.00

$950.00 | $950.00

| $60000 |

$600.00 ]

A22

Over 5 Squares

Square

$290.00 | $1,450.00

-

NOBID | NO BID

$750.00 | $3,750,00

$750.00__| $3,750.00

$535.00 |

$2,675.00 1

A3

SINGLE PLY TORCH APPLIED ROOFING-MODIFIED
BITUMEN

A31

Remove existing roofing material and flashing down to existing
decking. Install new 26 gauge galvanized painted metal
flashing and apply single ply granulated surfaced modified
roofing membrane by either torch or hot asphait over Type 43
J_m_hum base sheet or compatible

Square

$350.00 $350.00

NO BID NO BID

Torch - $500 Torch - $500

Hot - $650 Hot - $650

$950.00 $350.00

$540.00

$540.00

A4

METAL ROOFING

Begin installation at the end of roof, opposits the prevailing|
wind. Place all paneis properly side and end-lapped with
proper fastening and maximum water seal. Provide a drip
edge, with 3 inches of overhang, 1" where gutters are used.
Complete instailation at gabie, ridge and the entire roof

Ad.1

SV-CRIMP: Perform work as specified above.

Square

$400.00 $400.00

NO BID NO BID

$900.00 $900.00

$650.00 $650.00

325.00

325.00

STANDING SEAM: Perform work as specified above.

Square

$450.00

NO BID NO BID

$1,100.00 $1,100.00

$1,100.00 $1,100.00

5425.00

$425.00

A4.3

SNAP-ON SEAM: Perform work as specified above.

Square

550.00 550.00

NO BID NO BID

$850.00 $850.00

$800.00 $800.00

3425.00

$425.00

A44

CORRUGATED METAL: Perform work as specified above

Square

$400.00 $400.00

NO BID NO BID

$750.00 $750.00

$700.00 $700.00

$300.00

$300.00
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08-3857DS TABULATION FOR SMALL SCALE ROOF REPAIRS AND INSTALLATIONS

Murton Roofing Corp.
3750 Canai St.

Ft. Myers, FL
239-322-1080

Quality Roofing of FL, Inc.
6515 N 50th St.

Tampa, FL 33610
813-620-4797

Sutter Roofing Co. of FL
8284 Vico Ct.

Sarasota, FL 34240
941-377-1000

Witliam Samuels Approved Roofing, Inc.
1209 44th Ave. E.

Bradenton, FL 34203

941-756-4259

ITEM NO.

DESCRIPTION

EST Qty,

um

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE — EXTENDED PRICE

NEW ROOFING AND ROOF REPAIR - Includes furnishing of
all materials, labor, equipment, and incidentals for performance
of the required work.

FIBERGLASS SHINGLE ROOFING

Remove existing roofing material and existing 1"x2" lumber,
drip edge, and flashing down to wood decking. Install new drip
edge of 1"x4", minimum, pressure treated lumber along the
ontire perimeter of the roof. Apply one layer of 30 pound felt|
and install a minimum 25 year, 3 tab, Class A, self-sealing

|mildew/fungus resistant strip shingles with all new 26 gauge

alvanized, painted metal eaves drip and flashing

|

A1.1

4 t0 12 rise to 6to 12 rise

Square

$400.00

$2,400.00

$220.00 $1,320.00

$242.00 $1,452.00

N/R

A1.2

Less than 4 to 12 rise over run: Perform work as specified
above, with the exception for two layers of 30 pound felt paper
instead of one layer. Under 3 to 12 rise shorter exposited
single face.

A2

Square

$463.00

$2,778.00

$225.00 $1,350.00

$235.00 $1,410.00

N/R

BUILT-UP ROOFING

Remove existing roofing material, existing lumber, drip edge,
and flashing down to wood decking. Install new drip edge of]
pressure treated lumber to match existing removed along the
entire perimeter of the roof. Install new fiashings and 26!
gauge galvanized painted metal gravel stop. Apply four ply hot
mopped built-up roofing with flood coat and gravel. Example:
Dry in with Type 43 glass base sheet or compatible, hot mop
three fiberglass felts, flood coat with hot asphalt and
embedded gravel

A21

1 to 5 Squares

-
-

Square

]

$935.00 |

$935.00

$700.00 | $700.00

T $75500 | $1,155.00

NR ] NIR

A2.2

Over 5 Squares

Square

$708.00 |

$3,990.00

3500.00 | $2,500.00

| $875.00 | $4,375.00

NR | NIR

A3

SINGLE PLY TORCH APPLIED ROOFING-MODIFIED
BITUMEN

A.3.1
A4

Remove existing roofing materiai and flashing down to existing
decking. Install new 26 gauge galvanized painted metal
flashing and apply single ply granulated surfaced modified
roofing membrane by either torch or hot asphalt over Type 43

iass base sheet or compatible

Square

$860.00

$860.00

$600.00 $600.00

$747.00 $747.00

N/R N/R

METAL ROOFING

Begin installation at the end of roof, opposite the prevailing
wind. Place all panels properly side and end-lapped with
proper fastening and meximum water seal. Provide a drip
edge, with 3 inches of overhang, 1" where gutters are used.
Complete installation at gable, ridge and the entire roof

Ad1

S5V-CRIMP. Perform work as specified above.

Square

$780.00

$780.00

$600.00 $600.00

$864.00 $864.00

NIR NIR

STANDING SEAM: Perform work as specified above.

Square

$1,030.00

$1,030.00

700.00 700.00

$975.00 $975.00

N/R N/R

A4.3

SNAP-ON SEAM: Perform work as specified above.

Square

$1,030.00

$1,030.00

700.00 .wooﬂoo

$850.00 $850.00

N/R N/R

A4.4

CORRUGATED METAL: Perform work as specified above

Square

$780.00

$780.00

$600.00 $600.00

$800.00 $800.00

N/R N/R
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08-3857DS TABULATION FOR SMALL SCALE ROOF REPAIRS AND INSTALLATIONS

Anderson & Shah Roofing, Inc. of FL Budget Roofing of Florida Charles A Roy Roofing, inc. Crowther Roofing & Sheet Metal of FL, Inc. Manson Roofing, Inc.
6456 123rd Ave. 1410 US Hwy 92W 510 6th Ave. E. 7321 Internationai Place 807 24th Ave. W.
Largo, FL 33773 Auburndale, FL 33123 Bradenton, FL 34208 Sarasota, FL 34240 Bradenton, FL 34205
727-524-8888 863-967-6675 941-746-0008 941-343-9600 941-748-5547
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION EST Qty U/M UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Remove existing roof system down to the existing deck andj..
legally dispose of debris offsite conforming to all rules andf..
reguiations. Inspect light-weight deck and wood cant strips.§:
Recommend any necessary repairs to light-wsight deck or|
replacement of any wood cant strip. Install new rubber type :
roof per manufacturer's E_chm LT AT S RN o LT i SEE g o L
A.5.1 ETHYLENE PROPYLENE DIENE MONOMER - EPDM 1 Square |  $300.00 | NOBID | NO BID $650.00 $850.00 $850.00 N/B { N/B
A5.2 SYNTHETIC SHEET RUBBER MEMBRANE 1 Square |  $350.00 1 NOBID | NO BID $650.00 1 $850.00 $850.00 $486.00 | $486.00
REMOVE & INSTALL, MATERIAL INSTALLATION - Inciudes
furnishing of all materials, labor, equipment, and incidentats for
B performance of the required work as delineated below.
B.1.a Remove/install Plywood Sheathing, 4 ply, CDX %" x4'x & 5 SHT $64.00 $320.00 NO BID NO BID $80.00 $400.00 $137.00 $685.00 $63.00 $315.00
B.1.b Remove/Install Plywood Sheathing, 4 ply, CDX 5/8"x 4' x & 5 SHT $72.00 $360.00 NO BID NO BID $88.00 $440.00 $140.00 $700.00 $69.00 $345.00
B.1.c Remove/install Plywood Sheathing, 4 ply, CDX %" x4’ x 8 5 SHT $80.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID $96.00 5480.00 $145.00 725.00 $74.00 $370.00
B.2 Removelinstall Strip Sheathing Lumber, 1" x 4" 100 LF $1.50 150.00 NO BID NO BID 2.50 250.00 1.77 177.00 $0.85 $85.00
B.3. Remove/instali Lumber, 1" x 4" 100 LF 1.50 150.00 NO BiD NO BID 2.50 250.00 1.77 $177.00 0.85 $85.00
B.4 Remove/install Lumber, 1" x 6" 100 LF 1.75 175.00 NO BID NO BID $3.00 $300.00 1.85 185.00 1.15 $115.00
_w,m Remove/Install Lumber, 1" x 8" 100 LF 2.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID 3.50 350,00 2.10 210.00 1.35 135.00
B.6 Removelinstali Lumber, 1" x 10" 100 LF 2.25 225.00 NO BID NO BID b4.00 $400.00 2.39 239.00 1.65 165.00
m Removelinstall Lumber, 1" x 12" 100 LF 2.50 250.00 NO BID NO BID 54.50 $450.00 2.68 268.00 1.95 185.00
B.8 Removelinstall Lumber, 2" x 4" 100 LF 1.75 175.00 NO BID NO BID 34.50 $450.00 1.87 187,00 2.35 235.00
B.9 Remove/install Lumber, 2" x 6" 100 LF 2.00 200.00 NO BID NO BID $6.00 $600.00 2,03 203.00 2.85 285.00
B.10 Removefinstall Lumber, 2" x 8" 100 LF 2.40 240.00 NO BID NO BID $6.50 $650.00 2.11 211.00 3.35 335.00
lm.: l‘ﬂoaoé::wﬁ__ Lumber, 2" x 10" 100 LF 2.60 260.00 NO BID NO BID 7.00 $700.00 2.38 238.00 3.85 385.00
B.12 Remove/install Metal Flashing, 26 gauge 100 LF 3.00 300,00 NO BID NO BID 7.00 700.00 $4.72 72.00 N/B N/B
B.13 Removelinstall 30 pound ASTMD-226 Felt 1 Square $40.00 $40.00 NO BID NO BID $60.00 $60.00 $58.00 $58.00 N/B N/B
B.14 Lightweight Concrete {Amended 12/10/08) 50 SF $5.50 275.00 NO BID NO BID $4.00 $200.00 $8.75 $437.50 $7.35 367.50
XH Remove/install Metal Decking (Amended 12/10/08) 50 SF $8.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID 3.00 150.00 $5.75 $287.50 $6.85 342.50
B.16 Remove/lnstall Gypsum (Amended 12/10/08) 50 SF $5.00 $250.00 NO BID NO BID 54.00 $200.00 $13.00 $650.00 $8.25 $412.50
Remove/install Barrel Tile (Concrete) (Amended 12/10/08) 1 sQ
B.17 $500.00 $500.00 NO BID NO BID $700.00 $700.00 $750.00 $750.00 N/B N/B
Remove/install Barrel THe (Clay) (Amended 12/10/08) 1 SQ
B.18 $650.00 $650.00 NO BID NO BID $800.00 $800.00 $950.00 $950.00 N/B N/B
HOURLY RATES - Per trade or class of workers for any labor T - : b
cost for work not included in above pricing. Hourly rate
includes all costs for labor, material, equipment, and
C incidentals to complete the work.
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08-3857DS TABULATION FOR SMALL SCALE ROOF REPAIRS AND INSTALLATIONS

Murton Roofing Corp. Quality Roofing of FL, Inc. Sutter Roofing Co. of FL William Samuels Approved Roofing, Inc.
3750 Canal St. 6515 N 50th St. 8284 Vico Ct. 1209 44th Ave. E.
Ft. Myers, FL Tampa, FL 33610 Sarasota, FL 34240 Bradenton, FL 34203
238-322-1080 813-620-4797 941-377-1000 941-756-4259
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION EST Qty Um UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
A5 RUBBER TYPE ROOFS RN e G ’ T L I FTRT R S e e T T ' S R
legally dispose of debris offsite conforming to all rules and|
regulations. Inspect light-weight deck and wood cant strips.j: i B
Recommend any necessary repairs to light-weight deck orf:: it i
replacement of any wood cant strip. Instali new rubber type e i .
roof per manufacturer's specifications. s L L SIS : .|l s S T i : i
A.5.1 ETHYLENE PROPYLENE DIENE MONOMER - EPDM 1 | Square | $850.00 |} $850.00 1 $600.00 1 $600.00 1 500 | $845.00 NR N/R
A52  |SYNTHETIC SHEET RUBBER MEMBRANE T | Square | $820.00 | $820.00 1T $60000 | $600.00 | 85500 | $855.00 NR NIR
REMOVE & INSTALL, MATERIAL INSTALLATION - includes
furnishing of all materials, labor, equipment, and incidentals for
B performance of the required work as delineated below.
B.1.a Remove/install Plywood Sheathing, 4 ply, CDX %" x4'x8' 5 SHT $130.00 $650.00 $64.00 $320.00 $80.00 $400.00 N/R N/R
B.1.b Removelinstall Plywood Sheathing, 4 ply, CDX 5/8" x4'x 8 5 SHT $132.00 $660.00 $80.00 $400.00 $90.00 $450.00 N/R N/R
B.1.c Removelinstall Plywood Sheathing, 4 ply, CDX %" x4 x 8 5 SHT $134.00 $670.00 $96.00 $480.00 $110.00 $550.00 N/R N/R
B.2 Remove/lnstall Strip Sheathing Lumber, 1" x 4" 100 LF $5.70 $570.00 $2.00 200.00 1.10 110.00 N/R N/R
_mr.m.. Removeiinstali Lumber, 1" x 4" 100 LF $5.70 $570.00 2.00 $200.00 1.12 112.00 NIR N/R
8.4 Remove/install Lumber, 1" x 6" 100 LF $6.00 $600.00 2.50 $250.00 1.75 175.00 N/R N/R
B.5 Remova/install Lumber, 1" x 8" 100 LF $6.30 $630.00 3.00 300.00 2.05 205.00 N/R NIR
W@ Remove/Install Lumber, 1" x 10" 100 LF $6.70 $670.00 $4.00 400.00 2.60 260.00 N/R N/R
B.7 Remove/install Lumber, 1" x 12" 100 LF $7.00 $700.00 $4.50 5450.00 3.05 305.00 N/R NR_
B.8 \_l.»maoﬁ\_:ma__ Lumber, 2" x 4" 100 LF $5.70 $570.00 34.00 3400.00 2.25 225.00 N/R N/R
B.S Remove/install Lumber, 2" x " 100 LF $6.00 $600.00 $4.50 $450.00 2.55 255.00 N/R N/R
B.10 Remove/install Lumber, 2" x 8" 100 LF $6.10 w.lma,oo $5.00 $500.00 2.65 265.00 NIR N/R
B.11 Remove/install Lumber, 2" x 10" 100 LF $6.70 $670.00 $6.00 $600.00 3.25 325.00 N/R NIR
B.12 Remove/install Metal Flashing, 26 gauge 100 LF $5.20 $520.00 $5.00 $500.00 2.35 235.00 N/R N/R
B.13 Remove/install 30 pound ASTMD-226 Felt 1 Square $5.80 $5.80 $25.00 $25.00 $0.85 $0.85 N/R N/R
B.14 Remove/install Lightweight C (A ded 12/10/08) 50 SF $9.00 $450.00 $8.00 $400.00 $13.00 $650.00 N/R N/R
B.15 Removs/install Metal Decking (Amended 12/10/08) 50 SF $14.80 740.00 $8.00 $400.00 $9.25 $462.50 N/R N/R
B.16 Remove/install Gypsum (Amended 12/10/08) 50 SF $9.00 $450.00 $8.00 $400.00 $15.00 750.00 N/R N/R
Remove/install Barrel THe (Concrete) (Amended 12/10/08) 1 sQ
B.17 $950.00 $950.00 $300.00 $300.00 $4.75 $4.75 N/R N/R
Remove/instail Barrel Tile (Clay) (Amended 12/10/08) 1 sQ
B.18 $950.00 $950.00 $400.00 $400.00 $6.50 $6.50 NR N/R
HOURLY RATES - Per trade or class of workers for any labor i ; -
cost for work not included in above pricing. Hourly rate
includes all costs for labor, material, equipment, and
C incidentals to complete the work.
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08-3857DS TABULATION FOR SMALL SCALE ROOF REPAIRS AND INSTALLATIONS

Page 50of 6

Anderson & Shah Roofing, inc. of FL Budget Roofing of Florida Charies A Roy Roofing, Inc. Crowther Roofing & Sheet Metal of FL, Inc. Manson Roofing, Inc.
6456 123rd Ave. 1410 US Hwy 92W 510 6th Ave. E. 7321 International Place 807 24th Ave. W.
Largoe, FL 33773 Auburndale, FL 33123 Bradenton, FL 34208 Sarasota, FL 34240 Bradenton, FL 34205
727-524-8888 863-967-6675 941-746-0008 941-343-9600 941-748-5547
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION EST Qty U/M UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE _ EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
REGULAR HOURS kS ;
From: AM to PM; Days of the s 7:00 AM-5:00 PM 7:00 AM-5.00 PM S 7:00 AM-5:00 PM 8:00 AM-4:00 PM
c.1 week: & i MTW,TF T NO BID Monday - Friday Sorai Monday - Friday Monday - Friday
C.l.a Journeyman Roofer 10 HR 30.00 300,00 NO BID NO BID $545.00 $58.00 $580.00 $750.00
.b Roofer Helper 10 HR 25.00 250.00 NO BID NO BID $445.00 $50.00 $500.00 $525.00
. Carpenter 10 HR_ 25.00 250.00 NO BID NO BID 595.00 $58.00 $580.00 $525.00
.d Carpenter Helper 10 HR 20.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID $495.00 $50.00 $500.00 $525.00
OVERTIME HOURS S 7:00 AM-5:00 PM 5:00 PM-7:00 AM Monday -
From: AM to PM; Days of the 5:01 PM-6:59 AM Saturday & Sunday Friday and all Saturday & Holidays and all other
C2 week: ALL DAYS After 5 Mon-Fri Sunday & Holidays over time not listed above
C.2.a Joumneyman Roofer $420.00 NO BID $817.50 $700.00 $1,125.00
b Roofer Helper 240.00 NO BID NO BID $742.50 $600.00 $720.00
.c Carpenter 340.00 NO BID NO BID $892.50 $700.00 787.50
.d Carpenter Helper 280.00 NQ BID $742.50 $600.00 787.50
MATERIAL ONLY - County's requirement for any roofing
materials (does not include any work items specified in the
above items) shall be at the vendor's cost plus % (not
to exceed 10%) for overhead and profit. Vendor must submit
D.1 material invoice for payment. 10% NO BID 10% 10% 35%
D.2 DISPOSAL FEES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID COST Yes NO BID
FPL xmhb._.mm.vwan_vms Y or N (check one) Yes NO BID Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledge Addendum 1 Yes NO BID Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledge Addendum 2 Yes NO BID Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes NO BID Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Certification Yes NO BID Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting and Environmental Crimes Certification Yes NO BID Yes Yes Yes
Yes




08-3857DS TABULATION FOR SMALL SCALE ROOF REPAIRS AND INSTALLATIONS

Murton Roofing Corp. Quality Roofing of FL, Inc. Sutter Roofing Co. of FL William Samuels Approved Roofing, Inc.
3750 Canal St. 6515 N 50th St. 8284 Vico Ct. 1209 44th Ave. E.
Ft. Myers, FL Tampa, FL 33610 Sarasota, FL 34240 Bradenton, FL 34203
239-322-1080 813-620-4797 941-377-1000 941-756-4259
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION EST Qty, UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE _ EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
REGULAR HOURS 5 ; ey
From: AMto PM; Days of the : 6:00 AM-6:00 PM 7:00 AM-6.00 PM 7:00 AM-5:00 PM
C.1 week: Monday - Friday s Monday - Friday Monday - Friday fr
C.ia Journsyman Roofer $580.00 $72.00 $720.00 $480.00 N/R
b Roofer Helper $580.00 $660.00 $400.00 N/R
.C Carpenter 580.00 $720.00 $450.00 N/R
d Carpenter Helper $580.00 $660.00 $400.00 N/R
OVERTIME HOURS
From: AM to PM; Days of the 6.00 AM-6:00 PM 7:00 AM-6:00 PM 7:00 AM-5:00 PM 40 + hours, |-
C.2 week: Saturday & Sunday Saturday & Sunday Holidays, Saturday & Sunday | _
C2a Journeyman Roofer $580.00 $1,080.00 $650.00 N/R
.b Roofer Helper $580.00 $990.00 $580.00 N/R
.C Carpenter $580.00 $1,080.00 $560.00 N/R
.d mmm_ﬁm:nmq Helper $580.00 $990.00 $550.00 N/R
MATERIAL ONLY - County's requirement for any roofing
materials (does not include any work items specified in the
above items) shall be at the vendor's cost plus % (not
to exceed 10%) for overhead and profit. Vendor must submit
D.1 material invoice for payment. 10% 10% 17% N/R
D.2 DISPOSAL FEES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID COST N/R
FPL REBATES-Participate Y or N (check one) Yes Yes Yes N/R
Acknowledge Addendum 1 Yes Yes, Yes N/R
Acknowledge Addendum 2 Yes Yes Yes N/R
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes N/R
Drug Free Work Place Certification Yes Yes Yes N/R
Public Contracting and Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes N/R

Rec'd bid from Budget Roofing on 1-29-09 @ 7:19AM

(s
Keyed by: . w(yf

Wcheda

Date: w - ,o .\Oﬁuﬂ

Page 6 of 6

Date:

Checked Eng
3 lio[o9




