
Intent to Award (Rev. 10-25-22) 

MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 
INTENT TO AWARD 

IFB NO. / TITLE 

IFBC No. 24-TA005135JH / 
Moccasin Wallow Road, 
Segment 2 from 115th 
Street East to West of 
Sawgrass Road 

DATE POSTED MC __________
 

DS _________ 

PROCUREMENT 
REPRESENTATIVE 

Jeb Hayter, Procurement 
Agent III 

PROJECTED
AWARD DATE August 13, 2024

DEPARTMENT/DIVISION Public Works Department AUTHORIZED BY 
DATE 

Jacob Erickson, Purchasing Official 
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Gator Grading & 
Paving, LLC for the provision of Moccasin Wallow Road, Segment 2 from 115th Street East to West of Sawgrass Road. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26. 

BACKGROUND/EVALUATION 

The Scope of Work consists of, but not limited to, reconstruction and widening on Moccasin Wallow Road from an 
existing 2-lane open drainage road to a 4-lane divided roadway from 115th Avenue East to West of Sawgrass Road. 

The solicitation was advertised on March 28, 2024, on the Manatee County website and DemandStar. It was also 
provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast 
Builders Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members and in the Bradenton 
Herald and Tempo News newspapers.  Responses were received from the following firms:  

1. Gator Grading & Paving, LLC, Palmetto, FL 2. Prince Contracting, LLC, Tampa, FL

The following firms were deemed non-responsive/non-responsible: None 

EVALUATION SUMMARY:  

Gator Grading & Paving, LLC was the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s).  A bid tabulation of the results is 
attached to this Notice of Intent to Award. 

RECOMMENDATION 
The Procurement Division and the Public Works Department recommend award to Gator Grading & Paving, LLC. 

ATTACHMENTS 
(List in order of attached) 

Bid Tabulation COST $34,498,529.48 



Gator Grading & Paving, LLC Prince Contracting, LLC
NO BID NO BID

Gator Grading & Paving, LLC Prince Contracting, LLC
$34,498,529.48 $34,823,451.30

Moccasin Wallow Road Segment 2 From 115th Street East to West of Sawgrass Road
Bid Total - Bid B 540 Calendar Days

Moccasin Wallow Road Segment 2 From 115th Street East to West of Sawgrass Road
Bid Total - Bid A 450 Calendar Days

BID TABULATION SUMMARY
IFBC NO. 24-TA005135JH
MOCCASIN WALLOW ROAD SEGMENT 2 FROM 115TH STREET EAST TO WEST OF 
SAWGRASS ROAD



Pay Item No. Item
 Estimated 
Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

NO BID NO BID

101-1 MOBILIZATION 1 LS $0.00 $1,800,000.00 $1,800,000.00 $0.00 $2,200,000.00 $2,200,000.00

102-1 MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC 1 LS $0.00 $560,000.00 $560,000.00 $0.00 $1,259,982.80 $1,259,982.80
102-2-200 SPECIAL DETOUR-TEMPORARY PAVEMENT 3,040 SY $0.00 $38.00 $115,520.00 $0.00 $45.00 $136,800.00

104-10-3 SEDIMENT BARRIER 24,520 LF $0.00 $3.07 $75,276.40 $0.00 $4.00 $98,080.00

104-11 FLOATING TURBIDITY BARRIER 509 LF $0.00 $66.51 $33,853.59 $0.00 $16.00 $8,144.00

104-18 INLET PROTECTION SYSTEM 34 EA $0.00 $385.59 $13,110.06 $0.00 $235.00 $7,990.00

110-1-1 CLEARING & GRUBBING 43 AC $0.00 $18,000.00 $774,000.00 $0.00 $13,500.00 $580,500.00

120-1
REGULAR EXCAVATION

22,638 CY $0.00 $10.87 $246,075.06 $0.00 $6.00 $135,828.00

120-4
SUBSOIL EXCAVATION

278 CY $0.00 $99.77 $27,736.06 $0.00 $20.00 $5,560.00

120-6
EMBANKMENT

150,080 CY $0.00 $26.00 $3,902,080.00 $0.00 $15.00 $2,251,200.00

160-4a TYPE B STABILIZATION
93,182 SY $0.00 $7.53 $701,660.46 $0.00 $5.50 $512,501.00

160-4b TYPE B STABILIZATION FOR SHARED USE PATH 12,978 SY $0.00 $11.00 $142,758.00 $0.00 $13.00 $168,714.00

285-701 OPTIONAL BASE, BASE GROUP 01 FOR SHARED USE PATH
8,912 SY $0.00 $42.00 $374,304.00 $0.00 $47.75 $425,548.00

285-709 OPTIONAL BASE, BASE GROUP 09
80,219 SY $0.00 $24.96 $2,002,266.24 $0.00 $25.00 $2,005,475.00

327-70-6 MILLING EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT, 1 1/2" AVG DEPTH 734 SY $0.00 $39.53 $29,015.02 $0.00 $19.10 $14,019.40

334-1-12 SUPERPAVE ASPHALTIC CONC, TRAFFIC B FOR SHARED USE PATH
736 TN $0.00 $190.00 $139,840.00 $0.00 $196.00 $144,256.00

334-1-13
SUPERPAVE ASPHALTIC CONC, TRAFFIC C 

13,236 TN $0.00 $177.65 $2,351,375.40 $0.00 $163.00 $2,157,468.00
337-7-83 ASPHALT CONCRETE FRICTION COURSE,TRAFFIC C, FC-12.5, PG 76-22 6,484 TN $0.00 $213.55 $1,384,658.20 $0.00 $192.00 $1,244,928.00

425-1-351 INLETS, CURB, TYPE P-5, <10' 1 EA $0.00 $9,096.81 $9,096.81 $0.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00

425-1-361 INLETS, CURB, TYPE P-6, <10' 26 EA $0.00 $9,845.32 $255,978.32 $0.00 $10,000.00 $260,000.00

425-1-362 INLETS, CURB, TYPE P-6, >10' 1 EA $0.00 $19,951.62 $19,951.62 $0.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00

425-1-461 INLETS, CURB, TYPE J-6, <10' 2 EA $0.00 $12,455.08 $24,910.16 $0.00 $14,000.00 $28,000.00

425-1-583 INLETS, DT BOT, TYPE H, J BOTTOM <10' (2 GRATE) MODIFIED 1 EA $0.00 $17,798.65 $17,798.65 $0.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

425-1-583a INLETS, DT BOT, TYPE H, J BOTTOM <10'  (4 GRATE) MODIFIED 2 EA $0.00 $21,818.35 $43,636.70 $0.00 $18,000.00 $36,000.00

425-1-584 INLETS, DT BOT, TYPE H, J BOTTOM >10' (2 GRATE) MODIFIED 1 EA $0.00 $30,847.43 $30,847.43 $0.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

425-1-584a INLETS, DT BOT, TYPE H, J BOTTOM >10'  (4 GRATE) MODIFIED 1 EA $0.00 $29,463.14 $29,463.14 $0.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

425-2-61 MANHOLES, P-8, <10' 4 EA $0.00 $9,031.95 $36,127.80 $0.00 $6,000.00 $24,000.00

425-2-91 MANHOLES, J-8, <10' 1 EA $0.00 $13,157.40 $13,157.40 $0.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

425-2-92 MANHOLES, J-8, >10' 4 EA $0.00 $18,358.21 $73,432.84 $0.00 $20,000.00 $80,000.00

425-10 YARD DRAIN 10 EA $0.00 $2,082.84 $20,828.40 $0.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00

425-11 MODIFY EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE - PARTIAL 5
EA

$0.00 $5,122.82 $25,614.10 $0.00 $7,500.00 $37,500.00

430-175-118 PIPE CULVERT,OPTIONAL MATERIAL,ROUND, 18"S/CD 1,936 LF $0.00 $113.39 $219,523.04 $0.00 $160.00 $309,760.00

430-175-124 PIPE CULVERT,OPTIONAL MATERIAL,ROUND, 24"S/CD 2,179 LF $0.00 $136.63 $297,716.77 $0.00 $175.00 $381,325.00

430-175-130 PIPE CULVERT, OPT MATERIAL, ROUND, 30"S/CD 999 LF $0.00 $197.97 $197,772.03 $0.00 $230.00 $229,770.00

430-175-136 PIPE CULVERT, OPT MATERIAL, ROUND, 36"S/CD 330 LF $0.00 $257.41 $84,945.30 $0.00 $300.00 $99,000.00

430-175-142 PIPE CULVERT, OPT MATERIAL, ROUND, 42"S/CD 568 LF $0.00 $320.26 $181,907.68 $0.00 $340.00 $193,120.00

430-175-148 PIPE CULVERT, OPT MATERIAL, ROUND, 48"S/CD 47 LF $0.00 $403.20 $18,950.40 $0.00 $480.00 $22,560.00

430-175-160 PIPE CULVERT, OPT MATERIAL, ROUND, 60"S/CD 160 LF $0.00 $502.18 $80,348.80 $0.00 $650.00 $104,000.00

430-175-172 PIPE CULVERT, OPT MATERIAL, ROUND, 72"S/CD 460 LF $0.00 $760.39 $349,779.40 $0.00 $1,000.00 $460,000.00

430-175-230 PIPE CULVERT, OPT MATERIAL, OTHER SHAPE - ELIP/ARCH, 30"S/CD 54 LF $0.00 $313.02 $16,903.08 $0.00 $300.00 $16,200.00

430-175-254 PIPE CULVERT, OPT MATERIAL, OTHER SHAPE - ELIP/ARCH, 54"S/CD 108 LF $0.00 $484.28 $52,302.24 $0.00 $600.00 $64,800.00

430-524-100 STRAIGHT CONCRETE ENDWALLS, 24", SINGLE, 0 DEGREES, ROUND 3 EA $0.00 $4,409.09 $13,227.27 $0.00 $8,500.00 $25,500.00

430-530-100 STRAIGHT CONCRETE ENDWALLS, 30", SINGLE, 0 DEGREES, ROUND 1 EA $0.00 $4,740.83 $4,740.83 $0.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00

430-536-100 STRAIGHT CONCRETE ENDWALLS, 36", SINGLE, 0 DEGREES, ROUND 1 EA $0.00 $6,284.45 $6,284.45 $0.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00

430-542-100 STRAIGHT CONCRETE ENDWALLS, 42", SINGLE, 0 DEGREES, ROUND 1 EA $0.00 $8,422.67 $8,422.67 $0.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00

430-548-100 STRAIGHT CONCRETE ENDWALLS, 48", SINGLE, 0 DEGREES, ROUND 1 EA $0.00 $22,511.67 $22,511.67 $0.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00

430-560-100 STRAIGHT CONCRETE ENDWALLS, 60", SINGLE, 0 DEGREES, ROUND 1 EA $0.00 $44,431.00 $44,431.00 $0.00 $27,500.00 $27,500.00

430-964-6 PVC PIPE, 8 INCH 834 LF $0.00 $24.61 $20,524.74 $0.00 $75.00 $62,550.00
520-1-10 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F 16,927 LF $0.00 $28.01 $474,125.27 $0.00 $30.00 $507,810.00
520-1-7 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE E 346 LF $0.00 $50.77 $17,566.42 $0.00 $40.00 $13,840.00
520-5-11 TRAFFIC SEPARATOR CONCRETE-TYPE I, 4' WIDE 304 LF $0.00 $93.34 $28,375.36 $0.00 $83.00 $25,232.00
522-1 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 4" THICK 6,056 SY $0.00 $78.00 $472,368.00 $0.00 $61.00 $369,416.00
522-2 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK 149 SY $0.00 $282.49 $42,091.01 $0.00 $110.00 $16,390.00
527-2 DETECTABLE WARNINGS 377 SF $0.00 $48.78 $18,390.06 $0.00 $32.00 $12,064.00

570-1-2 PERFORMANCE TURF, SOD 62,747 SY $0.00 $5.46 $342,598.62 $0.00 $6.00 $376,482.00

SPECIAL-1 RECORD DRAWINGS PER MANATEE COUNTY STANDARDS (DRAINAGE) 1 LS $0.00 $9,146.34 $9,146.34 $0.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

SPECIAL-2 EXISTING DITCH REGRADING (30' WIDE) 1,791 LF $0.00 $9.22 $16,513.02 $0.00 $11.00 $19,701.00
SPECIAL-3 4" CONCRETE, TERRACOTTA & IMPRINTED WITH BRICK 1,280 SY $0.00 $190.73 $244,134.40 $0.00 $105.00 $134,400.00
SPECIAL-4 TRAFFIC SEPARATOR CONCRETE-TYPE I, 3' WIDE 235 LF $0.00 $86.43 $20,311.05 $0.00 $75.00 $17,625.00
SPECIAL-5 TRAFFIC CONTROL STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKINGS (INCLUDES TEMPORARY PAINT MARKINGS) 1 LS $0.00 $281,490.24 $281,490.24 $0.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00
SPECIAL-6 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNAGE 1 LS $0.00 $128,048.78 $128,048.78 $0.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

SPECIAL-7 6" UNDERDRAIN 1,883 LF $0.00 $40.08 $75,470.64 $0.00 $55.00 $103,565.00

SPECIAL-8 UNDERDRAIN CLEANOUT 37 EA $0.00 $980.28 $36,270.36 $0.00 $800.00 $29,600.00
MC-201.3 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE "AB" MODIFIED 4,036 LF $0.00 $25.78 $104,048.08 $0.00 $35.00 $141,260.00

$0.00 $19,205,610.88 $0.00 $18,401,464.20

BID A 450 CALENDAR DAYS BID B 540 CALENDAR DAYS

GENERAL, EARTHWORK, ROADWAY & DRAINAGE COMPONENT

GENERAL, EARTHWORK, ROADWAY & DRAINAGE COMPONENT SUB-TOTAL

BID TABULATION

IFBC NO. 24-TA005135JH MOCCASIN WALLOW ROAD SEGMENT 2 FROM 115TH  STREET EAST TO WEST OF SAWGRASS ROAD
Bidders must provide prices for each available line item on each tab for their bid to be considered responsive

*To be considered responsive, it is the sole responsibility of the bidder to correctly calculate and manually enter all sub-total, contingency, and total bid price fields*

BID A 450 CALENDAR DAYS BID B 540 CALENDAR DAYS
Gator Grading & Paving, LLC Prince Contracting, LLC



630-2-11 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, OPEN TRENCH 11,137 LF $0.00 $19.76 $220,067.12 $0.00 $17.50 $194,897.50

630-2-12 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, DIRECTIONAL BORE 1,828 LF $0.00 $33.26 $60,799.28 $0.00 $29.55 $54,017.40

632-7-1 SIGNAL CABLE - NEW OR RECONSTRUCTED INTERSECTION, F&I 1 PI $0.00 $30,398.95 $30,398.95 $0.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00

633-1-121 FIBER OPTIC CABLE, F&I, UNDERGROUND,2-12 FIBERS 377 LF $0.00 $5.33 $2,009.41 $0.00 $4.70 $1,771.90

633-1-122 FIBER OPTIC CABLE, F&I, UNDERGROUND,13-48 FIBERS 9,764 LF $0.00 $5.77 $56,338.28 $0.00 $5.00 $48,820.00

633-2-31 FIBER OPTIC CONNECTION, INSTALL, SPLICE 52 EA $0.00 $65.66 $3,414.32 $0.00 $58.10 $3,021.20

633-3-11 FIBER OPTIC CONNECTION HARDWARE, F&I, SPLICE ENCLOSURE 1 EA $0.00 $1,787.33 $1,787.33 $0.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00

633-3-12 FIBER OPTIC CONNECTION HARDWARE, F&I, SPLICE TRAY 2 EA $0.00 $72.95 $145.90 $0.00 $65.00 $130.00

633-3-13 FIBER OPTIC CONNECTION HARDWARE, F&I, PRETERMINATED CONNECTOR ASSEMBLY 2 EA $0.00 $94.84 $189.68 $0.00 $83.30 $166.60

633-3-15 FIBER OPTIC CONNECTION HARDWARE, F&I, PRETERMINATED PATCH PANEL 1 EA $0.00 $2,808.66 $2,808.66 $0.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

633-8-1 MULTI-CONDUCTOR COMMUNICATION CABLE, FURNISH & INSTALL 4,906 LF $0.00 $9.68 $47,490.08 $0.00 $8.60 $42,191.60

635-2-12 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 24" X 36" COVER SIZE 35 EA $0.00 $2,881.34 $100,846.90 $0.00 $2,550.00 $89,250.00

635-2-13 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 30" X 60" RECTANGULAR OR 36" ROUND COVER SIZE 1 EA $0.00 $6,967.53 $6,967.53 $0.00 $6,150.00 $6,150.00

635-2-14 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 17" X 30" COVER SIZE 6 EA $0.00 $2,050.28 $12,301.68 $0.00 $1,850.00 $11,100.00

639-1-122 ELECTRICAL POWER SEVICE, F&I, UNDERGROUND, METER PURCHASED BY CONTRACTOR 1 AS $0.00 $7,097.94 $7,097.94 $0.00 $6,250.00 $6,250.00

639-2-1 ELECTRICAL SERVICE WIRE, FURNISH & INSTALL 8 LF $0.00 $6.84 $54.72 $0.00 $6.10 $48.80

639-3-11 ELECTRICAL SERVICE DISCONNECT, F&I, POLE MOUNT 1 EA $0.00 $2,304.05 $2,304.05 $0.00 $2,025.00 $2,025.00

639-4-6 EMERGENCY GENERATOR - PORTABLE, INSTALL HOUSING ONLY 1 EA $0.00 $7,031.24 $7,031.24 $0.00 $6,175.00 $6,175.00

641-2-12 PRESTRESSED CONCRETE POLE, F&I, TYPE P-II SERVICE POLE 1 EA $0.00 $1,846.83 $1,846.83 $0.00 $1,625.00 $1,625.00

641-2-13 PRESTRESSED CONCRETE POLE, F&I, TYPE P-III 4 EA $0.00 $12,035.12 $48,140.48 $0.00 $10,600.00 $42,400.00

646-1-11 ALUMINUM SIGNALS POLE, F&I, PEDESTAL 8 EA $0.00 $2,585.90 $20,687.20 $0.00 $2,300.00 $18,400.00

649-21-6 STEEL MAST ARM ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, SINGLE ARM 50' 1 EA $0.00 $72,030.72 $72,030.72 $0.00 $63,260.00 $63,260.00

649-21-15 STEEL MAST ARM ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, SINGLE ARM 70' 1 EA $0.00 $87,800.19 $87,800.19 $0.00 $77,110.00 $77,110.00

649-21-21 STEEL MAST ARM ASSEMBLY, F&I, SINGLE ARM 78' 4 EA $0.00 $118,919.54 $475,678.16 $0.00 $104,500.00 $418,000.00

649-21-27 MAST ARM ASSEMBLY, FURNISH & INSTALL, DOUBLE ARM 78'-78' 1 EA $0.00 $162,809.98 $162,809.98 $0.00 $143,000.00 $143,000.00

650-1-34 VEHICULAR TRAFFIC SIGNAL, FURNISH & INSTALL POLYCARBONATE, 3 SECTION, 1 WAY 22 AS $0.00 $1,429.84 $31,456.48 $0.00 $1,260.00 $27,720.00

650-1-39 VEHICULAR TRAFFIC SIGNAL, FURNISH & INSTALL POLYCARBONATE, 5 SECTION CLUSTER, 1 WAY 4 AS $0.00 $9,553.66 $38,214.64 $0.00 $1,925.00 $7,700.00

653-1-11 PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL, F&I, LED COUNTDOWN, 1 WAY 8 AS $0.00 $832.73 $6,661.84 $0.00 $735.00 $5,880.00

660-3-11 VEHICLE DETECTION SYSTEM - WAVETRONIX SMARTSENSOR HD, F&I CABINET EQUIPMENT 6 EA $0.00 $2,099.66 $12,597.96 $0.00 $1,850.00 $11,100.00

660-3-12 VEHICLE DETECTION SYSTEM - WAVETRONIX SMARTSENSOR HD, F&I, ABOVE GROUND EQUIPMENT 12 EA $0.00 $9,553.66 $114,643.92 $0.00 $8,400.00 $100,800.00

665-1-11 PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR, F&I, STANDARD 8 EA $0.00 $368.43 $2,947.44 $0.00 $325.00 $2,600.00

670-5-110 TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY, F&I, NEMA 1 AS $0.00 $52,297.18 $52,297.18 $0.00 $45,950.00 $45,950.00

676-3-10 SMALL EQUIPMENT ENCLOSURE, FURNISH AND INSTALL, LESS THAN 10"W X 13"H X 11" D 4 EA $0.00 $1,892.66 $7,570.64 $0.00 $1,670.00 $6,680.00

682-1-113 ITS CCTV CAMERA, F&I, DOME PTZ ENCLOSURE - PRESSURIZED, IP, HIGH DEFINITION 1 EA $0.00 $6,013.26 $6,013.26 $0.00 $5,300.00 $5,300.00

684-1-1 MANAGED FIELD ETHERNET SWITCH, F&I 1 EA $0.00 $9,432.65 $9,432.65 $0.00 $8,300.00 $8,300.00

685-1-12 UNINTERRUPTIBLE POWER SUPPLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, ONLINE/DOUBLE CONVERSION 1 EA $0.00 $12,493.49 $12,493.49 $0.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00

685-2-1 REMOTE POWER MANAGEMENT UNIT-RPMU, FURNISH AND INSTALL 1 EA $0.00 $1,193.27 $1,193.27 $0.00 $1,050.00 $1,050.00

700-3-201 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF 10 EA $0.00 $1,168.04 $11,680.40 $0.00 $1,030.00 $10,300.00

700-5-22 INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL, OVERHEAD MOUNT, 12-18 SF 4 EA $0.00 $7,447.13 $29,788.52 $0.00 $6,550.00 $26,200.00

715-5-32
LUMINAIRE & BRACKET ARM-GALV STEEL, FURNISH & INSTALL NEW LUMINAIRE, AND ARM ON 
NEW/EXISTING POLE 4 EA $0.00 $1,647.13 $6,588.52 $0.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00

$0.00 $1,774,626.84 $0.00 $1,537,490.00

630-2-11 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, OPEN TRENCH 16,036 LF $0.00 12.49 $200,289.64 $0.00 $11.00 $176,396.00

630-2-12 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, DIRECTIONAL BORE 616 LF $0.00 28.34 $17,457.44 $0.00 $25.00 $15,400.00

635-2-11 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 13" x 24" COVER SIZE 132 EA $0.00 1407.52 $185,792.64 $0.00 $1,250.00 $165,000.00

639-1-122  ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, UNDERGROUND, METER PURCHASED BY CONTRACTOR 1 AS $0.00 7924.07 $7,924.07 $0.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

641-2-12  PRESTRESSED CONCRETE POLE, F&I, TYPE P-II SERVICE POLE 1 EA $0.00 1846.83 $1,846.83 $0.00 $1,650.00 $1,650.00

715-1-12 LIGHTING CONDUCTORS, F&I, INSULATED, NO. 8 - 6 59,268 LF $0.00 2.27 $134,538.36 $0.00 $2.10 $124,462.80

715-1-13 LIGHTING CONDUCTORS, F&I, INSULATED, NO. 4 - 2 688 LF $0.00 5.12 $3,522.56 $0.00 $4.50 $3,096.00

715-61-352
 LIGHT POLE COMPLETE, F&I, STANDARD POLE STANDARD FOUNDATION, 40' MOUNTING HEIGHT, 15' ARM 
LENGTH 110 EA $0.00 9020.59 $992,264.90 $0.00 $8,000.00 $880,000.00

715-7-11  LOAD CENTER, F&I, SECONDARY VOLTAGE 1 EA $0.00 19747.11 $19,747.11 $0.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00

715-500-1  POLE CABLE DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM, CONVENTIONAL 124 EA $0.00 707.39 $87,716.36 $0.00 $650.00 $80,600.00

715-511-313  LIGHT POLE COMPLETE - SPECIAL DESIGN, F&I, SINGLE ARM SHOULDER MOUNT, CONCRETE, 13' 14 EA $0.00 5615.78 $78,620.92 $0.00 $5,000.00 $70,000.00
$0.00 $1,729,720.83 $0.00 $1,541,104.80

101-1 MOBILIZATION 1 LS $0.00 $485,000.00 $485,000.00 $0.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00

1050-16003 UTILITY PIPE, REMOVE & DISPOSE, 5-7.9"
120

LF
$0.00 $28.87 $3,464.40 $0.00 $70.00 $8,400.00

1050-16004 UTILITY PIPE, REMOVE & DISPOSE 8-19.9"
788

LF
$0.00 $27.81 $21,914.28 $0.00 $80.00 $63,040.00

1050-16005 UTILITY PIPE,REMOVE & DISPOSE, 20-49.9" - 30" 8,280 LF $0.00 $9.98 $82,634.40 $0.00 $90.00 $745,200.00

1050-31202 UTILITY PIPE- POLY VINYL CHLORIDE, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 2" 6 LF $0.00 $287.98 $1,727.88 $0.00 $120.00 $720.00

1050-31208 UTILITY PIPE- POLY VINYL CHLORIDE, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 8" 45 LF $0.00 $198.33 $8,924.85 $0.00 $350.00 $15,750.00
1050-51206 UTILITY PIPE-DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 6" 148 LF $0.00 $145.81 $21,579.88 $0.00 $140.00 $20,720.00

1050-51208 UTILITY PIPE- DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 8" 147 LF $0.00 $161.81 $23,786.07 $0.00 $180.00 $26,460.00

1050-51212 UTILITY PIPE-DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 12"
147

LF
$0.00 $189.66 $27,880.02 $0.00 $220.00 $32,340.00

1050-51230 UTILITY PIPE- DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 30" 8,297 LF $0.00 $427.00 $3,542,819.00 $0.00 $550.00 $4,563,350.00

1055-51108 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL 45 DEG ELBOW, 8" 6 EA $0.00 $1,219.46 $7,316.76 $0.00 $800.00 $4,800.00

1055-51112 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL 45 DEG ELBOW, 12" 2 EA $0.00 $3,620.76 $7,241.52 $0.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00

1055-51130 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL 45 DEG ELBOW, 30" 28 EA $0.00 $10,577.79 $296,178.12 $0.00 $11,000.00 $308,000.00

1055-51230a UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 30" X 6" 1 EA $0.00 $10,247.22 $10,247.22 $0.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

1055-51230b UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 30" X 8" 4 EA $0.00 $10,669.66 $42,678.64 $0.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00

1055-51230c UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 30" X 12" 1 EA $0.00 $22,833.43 $22,833.43 $0.00 $7,700.00 $7,700.00

1055-51230d UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 30" X 30" 1 EA $0.00 $16,678.68 $16,678.68 $0.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

1055-51230e
UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, CROSS, 30"X30"X12"X12"

1 EA $0.00 $28,713.38 $28,713.38 $0.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00

1055-51308 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL REDUCER, 8"x2" 1 EA $0.00 $1,847.98 $1,847.98 $0.00 $700.00 $700.00

1055-51312 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL REDUCER, 12"X8"
1

EA
$0.00 $3,299.27 $3,299.27 $0.00 $900.00 $900.00

1080-22112 UTILITY FIXTURE-BACKFLOW ASSEMBLY, RELOCATE
1

EA
$0.00 $1,906.07 $1,906.07 $0.00 $26,500.00 $26,500.00

1080-24106 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 6" 1 EA $0.00 $20,723.38 $20,723.38 $0.00 $1,900.00 $1,900.00

1080-24108 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 8" 5 EA $0.00 $3,879.27 $19,396.35 $0.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00

1080-24112 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 12" 1 EA $0.00 $6,887.53 $6,887.53 $0.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

1080-24130 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 30" 19 EA $0.00 $48,392.12 $919,450.28 $0.00 $45,000.00 $855,000.00

1080-25102 UTILITY FIXTURE- BLOWOFF ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 2" 2 EA $0.00 $10,944.76 $21,889.52 $0.00 $12,500.00 $25,000.00

1080-29102 UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 2" 1 EA $0.00 $1,430.33 $1,430.33 $0.00 $750.00 $750.00

1080-29106 UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 6" 1 EA $0.00 $1,504.76 $1,504.76 $0.00 $1,150.00 $1,150.00

1080-29108
UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 8"

5 EA $0.00 $1,545.10 $7,725.50 $0.00 $185.00 $925.00

1080-29112
UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 12"

1 EA $0.00 $1,764.06 $1,764.06 $0.00 $325.00 $325.00

1080-29130
UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 30"

357 EA $0.00 $3,300.00 $1,178,100.00 $0.00 $700.00 $249,900.00

1644-113-08
FIRE HYDRANT, F&I, STANDARD, 2 HOSE, 1 PUMPER, 6"

9 EA $0.00 $16,687.01 $150,183.09 $0.00 $21,500.00 $193,500.00

1644-800 FIRE HYDRANT, RELOCATE
2

EA
$0.00 $18,591.61 $37,183.22 $0.00 $17,000.00 $34,000.00

SPECIAL-9 RECORD DRAWINGS PER MANATEE COUNTY STANDARDS (UTILITY) 1 LS $0.00 $7,865.85 $7,865.85 $0.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
$0.00 $7,032,775.72 $0.00 $7,771,230.00

SIGNALIZATION COMPONENT

SIGNALIZATION COMPONENT SUB-TOTAL

LIGHTING COMPONENT

LIGHTING COMPONENT SUB-TOTAL

POTABLE WATER COMPONENT

POTABLE WATER COMPONENT SUB-TOTAL



101-1 MOBILIZATION 1 LS $0.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $0.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00

1050-16002 UTILITY PIPE, REMOVE & DISPOSE, 2-4.9"
832

LF
$0.00 $17.48 $14,543.36 $0.00 $22.00 $18,304.00

1050-16003 ITILITY PIPE, REMOVE & DISPOSE, 5-7.9"
103

LF
$0.00 $54.01 $5,563.03 $0.00 $60.00 $6,180.00

1050-16004 ITILITY PIPE, REMOVE & DISPOSE, 8-19.9" 2,641 LF $0.00 $10.99 $29,024.59 $0.00 $75.00 $198,075.00

1051-16005 ITILITY PIPE, REMOVE & DISPOSE, 20-49.9"
1,195

LF
$0.00 $13.74 $16,419.30 $0.00 $80.00 $95,600.00

1050-31204 UTILITY PIPE- POLY VINYL CHLORIDE, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 4" 142 LF $0.00 $55.17 $7,834.14 $0.00 $110.00 $15,620.00

1050-31210 UTILITY PIPE- POLY VINYL CHLORIDE, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 10" 2,384 LF $0.00 $59.73 $142,396.32 $0.00 $150.00 $357,600.00

1050-51206 UTILITY PIPE- DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 6" 346 LF $0.00 $77.99 $26,984.54 $0.00 $150.00 $51,900.00

1050-51210 UTILITY PIPE- DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 10" 295 LF $0.00 $145.79 $43,008.05 $0.00 $200.00 $59,000.00

1050-51220
UTILITY PIPE- DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 20"

1,285 LF $0.00 $217.42 $279,384.70 $0.00 $350.00 $449,750.00

1050 61112 UTILITY PIPE- STEEL, FURNISH & INSTALL, CASING, 12" 127 LF $0.00 $146.02 $18,544.54 $0.00 $250.00 $31,750.00
1055-51110a UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL 11.25 DEG ELBOW, 10" 1 EA $0.00 $2,010.19 $2,010.19 $0.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00
1055-51110b UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL 45 DEG ELBOW, 10" 15 EA $0.00 $1,966.47 $29,497.05 $0.00 $1,850.00 $27,750.00

1055-51120 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL 45 DEG ELBOW, 20" 6 EA $0.00 $6,639.00 $39,834.00 $0.00 $5,500.00 $33,000.00

1055-51210a UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 10" X 6" 1 EA $0.00 $2,537.57 $2,537.57 $0.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00

1055-51210b UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 10" X 10" 1 EA $0.00 $2,692.36 $2,692.36 $0.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

1055-51220a
UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 20" X 20"

2 EA $0.00 $6,254.89 $12,509.78 $0.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00

1055-51220b UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 20" X 6" 1 EA $0.00 $4,374.70 $4,374.70 $0.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00

1055-51220c UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, TEE, 20" X 4" 1 EA $0.00 $5,890.19 $5,890.19 $0.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00

1055-51220d
UTILITY FITTINGS, DI F&I, CROSS, 20" X 10" X 10" X 10"

1 EA $0.00 $6,518.28 $6,518.28 $0.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00

 1055-51510 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, CAP/PLUG, 10" 1 EA $0.00 $1,721.40 $1,721.40 $0.00 $650.00 $650.00

1080-22112 UTILITY FIXTURE-BACKFLOW ASSEMBLY, RELOCATE 2 EA
$0.00 $20,046.49 $40,092.98 $0.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00

1080-24104 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 4" 2 EA $0.00 $2,654.22 $5,308.44 $0.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00

1080-24106 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 6" 2 EA $0.00 $2,896.83 $5,793.66 $0.00 $1,850.00 $3,700.00

1080-24110 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 10" 7 EA $0.00 $5,128.66 $35,900.62 $0.00 $5,000.00 $35,000.00

1080-24120
UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 20"

9 EA $0.00 $19,977.04 $179,793.36 $0.00 $23,500.00 $211,500.00

1080-29104
UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 4"

4 EA $0.00 $1,453.83 $5,815.32 $0.00 $175.00 $700.00

1080-29106
UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 6"

14 EA $0.00 $1,049.74 $14,696.36 $0.00 $225.00 $3,150.00

1080-29110
UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 10"

36 EA $0.00 $1,195.67 $43,044.12 $0.00 $450.00 $16,200.00

1080-29120
UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 20"

63 EA $0.00 $2,548.57 $160,559.91 $0.00 $1,350.00 $85,050.00

1644-113-08 FIRE HYDRANT, F&I, STANDARD, 2 HOSE, 1 PUMPER, 6" 11 EA $0.00 $10,686.24 $117,548.64 $0.00 $17,500.00 $192,500.00

SPECIAL-10 RECORD DRAWINGS PER MANATEE COUNTY STANDARDS (UTILITY) 1 LS $0.00 $3,658.53 $3,658.53 $0.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
$0.00 $1,378,500.03 $0.00 $2,179,529.00

101-1 MOBILIZATION 1 LS $0.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $0.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

SPECIAL-11 RECORD DRAWINGS PER MANATEE COUNTY STANDARDS (UTILITY) 1 LS $0.00 $1,585.36 $1,585.36 $0.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
1050 16004 UTILITY PIPE, REMOVE & DISPOSE, 8-19.9" 165 LF $0.00 $56.73 $9,360.45 $0.00 $89.00 $14,685.00

1050-31202 UTILITY PIPE- POLY VINYL CHLORIDE, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 2"' 181 LF $0.00 $75.66 $13,694.46 $0.00 $100.00 $18,100.00

1050-31210 UTILITY PIPE- POLY VINYL CHLORIDE, FURNISH & INSTALL, WATER/SEWER, 10" 186 LF $0.00 $159.64 $29,693.04 $0.00 $180.00 $33,480.00

1050-61104 UTILITY PIPE- STEEL, FURNISH & INSTALL, CASING, 4" 99 LF $0.00 $88.92 $8,803.08 $0.00 $250.00 $24,750.00

1050-61120 UTILITY PIPE- STEEL, FURNISH & INSTALL, CASING, 20" 127 LF $0.00 $245.96 $31,236.92 $0.00 $350.00 $44,450.00

1055-51110 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL 45 DEG ELBOW, 10" 2 EA $0.00 $3,010.58 $6,021.16 $0.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00

1055-51310a UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL REDUCER, 10"x2" 1 EA $0.00 $2,210.83 $2,210.83 $0.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

1055-51310b UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL REDUCER, 10"x4" 1 EA $0.00 $7,683.85 $7,683.85 $0.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

 1055-51510 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL, CAP/PLUG, 10" 1 EA $0.00 $2,210.83 $2,210.83 $0.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

1055-51612 UTILITY FITTINGS, DUCTILE IRON/CAST IRON, FURNISH & INSTALL Y, 12" 2 EA $0.00 $11,683.90 $23,367.80 $0.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00

1080-24102 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 2" 2 EA $0.00 $2,389.50 $4,779.00 $0.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00

1080-24110 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, FURNISH AND INSTALL, 10" 2 EA $0.00 $5,916.45 $11,832.90 $0.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00

1080-24500 UTILITY FIXTURE, VALVE ASSEMBLY, ADJUST/MODIFY 12 EA $0.00 $3,196.45 $38,357.40 $0.00 $2,000.00 $24,000.00

1080-26500 UTILITY FIXTURE, VAC/AIR ASSEMBLY, ADJUST/MODIFY 3 EA $0.00 $7,014.79 $21,044.37 $0.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00

1080-29102
UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 2"

8 EA $0.00 $975.31 $7,802.48 $0.00 $500.00 $4,000.00

1080-29110 UTILITY FIXTURE, MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT, FURNISH & INSTALL, 10" 2 EA $0.00 $1,190.65 $2,381.30 $0.00 $700.00 $1,400.00
$0.00 $241,065.23 $0.00 $226,865.00

$0.00 $31,362,299.53 $0.00 $31,657,683.00

CONTRACT CONTINGENCY (USED ONLY WITH COUNTY APPROVAL) 10% $0.00 $3,136,229.95 $0.00 $3,165,768.30

$0.00 $34,498,529.48 $0.00 $34,823,451.30

RECLAIM COMPONENT

RECLAIM COMPONENT SUB-TOTAL

SANITARY COMPONENT

SANITARY COMPONENT SUB-TOTAL

Sub-Total Price (Total General, Earthwork, Roadway & Drainage, Signialization, Lighting, Potable Water, Reclaim, Sanitary)

TOTAL BID PRICE (SUB-TOTAL PRICE PLUS THE CONSTRUCTION CONTINGENCY)  
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