

**MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT
AGENDA MEMORANDUM**

SUBJECT	Authorization to Award IFB #11-0579OV, Construction of the Bradenton Downtown Bus Transfer Plaza / Bus Station Bradenton, FL	TYPE AGENDA ITEM	Consent
DATE REQUESTED	April 26, 2011	DATE SUBMITTED/REVISED	April 13, 2011
BRIEFINGS? Who?	N/A	CONSEQUENCES IF DEFERRED	N/A
DEPARTMENT/DIVISION	Financial Management/Purchasing	AUTHORIZED BY TITLE	Jim Seuffert, Director
CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE/EXTENSION	Olga Valcich, Purchasing x 3055 R.C. "Rob" Cuthbert, C.P.M, CPPO Purchasing x 3014	PRESENTER/TITLE TELEPHONE/EXTENSION	Howard Leyo, Project Manager, x 3052 / Tom Yarger, Construction Services Project Manager, x 3003
ADMINISTRATIVE APPROVAL			
ACTION DESIRED INDICATE WHETHER 1) REPORT; 2) DISCUSSION; 3) FORM OF MOTION; OR 4) OTHER ACTION REQUIRED			
Authorization to Award IFB #11-0579OV, Construction of the Bradenton Downtown Bus Transfer Plaza / Bus Station, Bradenton, FL to Zirkelbach Construction, Palmetto, FL in the amount of \$1,751,856.00 (Option "B" – 270 calendar day completion time) and to authorize the County Administrator, or his designee to execute contract documents, payment / performance bonds and certificate of insurance.			
ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy			
Manatee County Code of Laws, Chapter 2-26 Manatee County Purchasing Ordinance, Section 2-26-40 and the Standards and Procedures approved by the County Administrator.			
BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION			
<ul style="list-style-type: none"> This project consists of the construction of a Bradenton Downtown Bus Transfer Plaza / Bus Station located at 601 13th Street West, Bradenton, FL. Background/Discussion Continued on page 2. Funding Source: This project is funded by the Federal Transit Administration and the Florida Department of Transportation. Grant Nos. FTA FL90-X593 and FDOT AOK48. 			
Check appropriate box			
<input type="checkbox"/>	REVIEWED Written Comments: <input type="checkbox"/> Attached <input type="checkbox"/> Available from Attorney (Attorney's initials: (____))		
<input type="checkbox"/>	NOT REVIEWED (No apparent legal issues.)		
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	NOT REVIEWED (Utilizes exact form or procedure previously approved by CAO.)		
<input type="checkbox"/>	OTHER		
ATTACHMENTS: (List in order as attached)		INSTRUCTIONS TO BOARD RECORDS:	
Department Memo (dated April 1, 2011) Engineer of Record Recommendation (3/31/2011) Bid Tabulation Executed Agreement (2 originals) Payment / Performance Bonds (2 originals) Certificate of Insurance (2 originals)		One Original to Board Records. 2 nd Original to Zirkelbach Construction ,1415 10 th St. W., Palmetto, FL 34221 Copy of Signature Page to: Rodney Beggs, Senior Fiscal Analyst, Public Works; Howard Leyo, Project Manager, Property Management Dept., Olga Valcich, Purchasing Division	
COST:	\$1,751,856.00	SOURCE (ACCT # & NAME):	4369003114-562000 / 4369008926-562000 / 4369008932-562000 Grants: FTA FL90-X593 and FDOT AOK48.
COMMENTS:	N/A	AMT./FREQ. OF RECURRING COSTS: (ATTACH FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT)	N/A

3

- The scope of this project includes the construction of the Bradenton Downtown Bus Transfer Plaza/Bus Station located between 6th Avenue West and 8th Avenue West (West of the Bank of America and East of First Bank), with the physical address of 601 13th Street West, Bradenton, FL. The Bus Transfer Plaza / Bus Station will include a small permanent structure, bus shelters, connecting canopy, landscape and hardscape for the project. The permanent structure will also hold office and support for two (2) work stations, three (3) restrooms, and a vending area.

Unique to this project will be the installation of four (4) Art Walls at the Bradenton Downtown Bus Transfer Plaza / Bus Station. In an attempt to encourage public ridership, and the beautification of the Downtown Bradenton area, Manatee County Transit Authority (MCAT) requested SchenkelShultz Architecture, the Architect of Record to team up with the Bradenton Downtown Development Authority (BDDA) who provided for the selection process of the artist for the public art work. The Art Walls between the bus bays will incorporate fence in median with panels for changing art displays and / or advertising.

2/11/2011 – 3/23/2011 appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability was broadcast to 1,988 suppliers via Onvia DemandStar, www.mymanatee.org and the Manatee Chamber of Commerce. Thirteen (13) local suppliers were directly solicited for this project. A total of fourteen (14) bids were received. Six (6) bids were from Manatee County, three (3) bids were from Sarasota County, one (1) bid was from Hillsborough County, one (1) bid was from Highlands County one (1) bid from Polk County and two (2) bids were from Lee County. The fourteen (14) bids received are listed in ascending order based on Bid "B", 270 calendar day completion time.

Contractor	Bid "A" (300 Calendar Days)	Bid "B" (270 Calendar Days)
1. Zirkelbach Construction, Palmetto, FL	\$1,751,856.00	\$1,751,856.00
2. E. O. Koch, Seabring, FL	\$1,781,490.00	\$1,781,490.00
3. DeLesline Construction, Palmetto, FL	\$1,799,089.00	\$1,799,089.00
4. NDC Construction, Bradenton, FL	\$1,847,700.00	\$1,837,700.00
5. Pat Cook Construction, Bradenton, FL	\$1,895,146.00	\$1,895,146.00
6. Vogel Bros. Building Co., Lakeland, FL	\$1,910,000.00	\$1,910,000.00
7. Stellar Development, Bradenton, FL	\$1,911,286.00	\$1,911,286.00
8. Holland Construction, Sarasota, FL	\$1,919,800.00	\$1,919,800.00
9. J. L. Wallace, Inc., Fort Myers, FL (Contractor did not provide pricing for Bid Items Nos. 3, 4, 6)	\$ 291,500.00	\$1,959,000.00
10. Magnum Builders, Sarasota, FL	\$2,027,584.00	\$2,027,584.00
11. Construction Technology Group, Inc. Plant City, FL	\$2,121,000.00	\$\$2,157,000.00
12. Lodge Construction, Inc., Fort Myers, FL	\$2,333,211.52	\$2,379,155.85
13. Westra Construction, Palmetto, FL	\$2,432,000.00	No Bid
14. D. L. Porter Constructors, Sarasota, FL (Extended total corrected - Contractor did not provide pricing for Bid Item #6)	\$ 735,689.00	\$ 735,689.00

- 04/01/2011 – Property Management staff has recommended award to the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder, Zirkelbach Construction, Palmetto, FL in the amount of \$1,751,856.00 with a construction completion time of two hundred seventy days (270) calendar days.
- Funding Source: This project is funded by the Federal Transit Administration and the Florida Department of Transportation. Grant Nos. FTA FL90-X593 and FDOT AOK48.

MEMORANDUM

OKGA



Property Management Department
Construction Services Division
1112 Manatee Avenue West, Ste. 868
Bradenton, FL 34205

MANATEE COUNTY
FLORIDA

Phone: 941-749-3005
Fax: 941-749-3018
www.mymanatee.org

To: Melissa Assha, Contracts and Buyer Manager
Purchasing Division

From: Charlie Bishop, Director *CWB*
Property Management Department

Date: April 1, 2011

Subject: Downtown Bradenton Transit Station
Recommendation to Award

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by both Manatee County Property Management and Public Works Transit staff. The bid tabulation form is attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract for the Downtown Bradenton Transit Station be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, Zirkelbach Construction, for the Bid "B" (270 days) in the amount of \$1,751,856.00 in accordance with the terms and conditions of the bid package IFB #11-0579-OV.

The funding source for the contract is 436-9008925 and 436-9003114.
Grants that will be funding this project are FTA FL90-X593 and FDOT AOK48.

Please contact Howard Leyo, if you have any questions regarding the attached documents.

Thank you for your continued assistance.

cc: Tom Yarger, Construction Services Division Manager *ty*
Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works
Ralf Heseler, Transit Division Manager
R. C. "Rob" Cuthbert, C.P.M., Purchasing Manager
Howard Leyo, Project Manager *HL*
Debra Leavenworth, Construction Services Inspector

MANATEE COUNTY
2011 APR 11 AM 8:29
PURCHASING

Project File: 49646 1.1

SCHENKELSHULTZ

ARCHITECTURE

March 31, 2011

Mr. Tom Yarger, PMP
Division Manager, Construction Services
Property Management Department
1112 Manatee Ave., Suite 803
Bradenton, FL 34205

Re: IFB #11-0579-OV / Downtown Bradenton Transit Station, Manatee County, FL.,
Location: 601 13th Street West, Bradenton, FL

Dear Tom:

Schenkel Shultz received and reviewed the bids for the above captioned project. There were total of 14 bids received ranging from a high \$2,432,000 (Westra Construction) down to a low bidder of \$1,751,856 (Zirkelbach Construction). Upon our review of the bids we have confirmed that the low bidder, Zirkelbach Construction from Palmetto FL, had fully complied with the bid requirements supplying all necessary documentation. Zirkelbach Construction is the low bidder for both bid "A" (300 days) and bid "B" (270 days).

Zirkelbach Construction is a reputable firm fully capable of executing the work under the scope of this project. Upon the review of all bids received for this project and based on the information provided to our team, it is our recommendation that this project be awarded to Zirkelbach Construction from Palmetto FL for the amount of \$1,751,856.00. SchenkelShultz Architecture recommends that bid "B" be utilized for the complete duration of the construction not to exceed 270 days.

Please do not hesitate to contact me with any questions.

Sincerely,



Dražen Ahmedić, AIA
Associate
941.952.5875
SSA project #0920818

MANATEE COUNTY
2011 APR 11 AM 8:29
PURCHASING

Downtown Bradenton Transit Station

Item		Description		U/M		QTY.		Construction Technology Group, Inc. Plant City, FL 813.752.2959		D.L. Porter Constructors, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.929.9400		Pat Cook Construction, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.749.1959	
		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1 \$ 255,000.00	\$ 255,000.00	\$	91,170.00	\$ 91,170.00	\$	30,000.00	\$	30,000.00	\$	30,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1 \$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$	8,611.00	\$ 8,611.00	\$	7,500.00	\$	7,500.00	\$	7,500.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1 \$ 640,000.00	\$ 640,000.00	\$	218,325.00	\$ 218,325.00	\$	229,000.00	\$	229,000.00	\$	229,000.00
4	Art Wall - Screen	LS	1 \$ 180,000.00	\$ 180,000.00	\$	139,000.00	\$ 139,000.00	\$	171,500.00	\$	171,500.00	\$	171,500.00
5	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1 \$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$	8,567.00	\$ 8,567.00	\$	10,000.00	\$	10,000.00	\$	10,000.00
6	Building - Complete	LS	1 \$ 750,000.00	\$ 750,000.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	1,154,146.00	\$	1,154,146.00	\$	1,154,146.00
7	Art Allowance	LS	1 \$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$	160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$	160,000.00	\$	160,000.00	\$	160,000.00
8	Art Allowance Implementation and Associated Cost	LS	1 \$ 19,000.00	\$ 19,000.00	\$	10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$	33,000.00	\$	33,000.00	\$	33,000.00
9	Discretionary Work	LS	1 \$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$	100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$	100,000.00	\$	100,000.00	\$	100,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE				\$ 2,121,000.00	\$ 735,689.00	\$ 1,895,146.00							
10	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6 \$ 100.00	\$ 600.00	\$	125.00	\$ 125.00	\$	750.00	\$	2,000.00	\$	2,000.00
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1		Yes										Yes
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2		Yes										No
	Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage		Yes										Yes
	Provided Price for Removal/Replacement of Haz Mat.		Yes										Yes (incorrect u/m qty utilized)
	Site Visit		Yes										Yes
	Florida Trench Safety Act		Yes										Yes
	Contractor's Questionnaire		Yes										Yes
	License Requirement: General Contractor		Yes										Yes
	Drug Free Work Place Certification		Yes										Yes
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification		Yes										Yes
	Bid Bond		Yes										Yes
Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB. Total Price on bid stated as \$1,884,814.00													

Bid "A" - 300 Days Completion		Lodge Construction, Inc. Fort Myers, FL 239.332.4371		Magnum Builders of Sarasota, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.351.5560		NDC Construction Bradenton, FL 941.747.1062			
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 93,760.00	\$ 93,760.00	\$ 80,000.00	\$ 80,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 2,655.17	\$ 2,655.17	\$ 1,910.00	\$ 1,910.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 552,700.00	\$ 552,700.00	\$ 241,047.00	\$ 241,047.00	\$ 525,000.00	\$ 525,000.00
4	Art Wall - Screen	LS	1	\$ 117,931.03	\$ 117,931.03	\$ 268,763.00	\$ 268,763.00	\$ 175,000.00	\$ 175,000.00
5	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 22,613.79	\$ 22,613.79	\$ 12,822.00	\$ 12,822.00	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 13,200.00
6	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,304,990.84	\$ 1,304,990.84	\$ 1,138,265.00	\$ 1,138,265.00	\$ 781,500.00	\$ 781,500.00
7	ART Allowance	LS	1	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00
8	ART Allowance Implementation and Associated Cost	LS	1	\$ 62,320.69	\$ 62,320.69	\$ 11,017.00	\$ 11,017.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00
9	Discretionary Work	LS	1	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE				\$	2,333,211.52	\$	2,027,584.00	\$	1,847,700.00
10	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 120.00	\$ 720.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,200.00
Acknowledged Addendum # 1		Yes							
Acknowledged Addendum # 2		Yes							
Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage		Yes							
Provided Price for Removal / Replacement of Haz Mat.		Yes							
Site Visit		Yes							
Florida Trench Safety Act		Yes							
Contractor's Questionnaire		Yes							
License Requirement: General Contractor		Yes							
Drug Free Work Place Certification		Yes							
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification		Yes							
Bid Bond		No							
Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB									

Bid "A" - 300 Days Completion				Stellar Development, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.907.8788		J.L. Wallace, Inc. Fort Myers, FL 239.437.1111		Vogel Bros. Building Co. Lakeland, FL 863.646.5078		
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 26,048.00	\$ 26,048.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 90,000.00	\$ 90,000.00	
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 5,210.00	\$ 5,210.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,288,528.00	\$ 1,288,528.00	-	-	\$ 909,000.00	\$ 909,000.00	
4	Art Wall - Screen	LS	1	\$ 150,000.00	\$ 150,000.00	-	-	\$ 130,000.00	\$ 130,000.00	
5	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 16,500.00	\$ 16,500.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	
6	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 140,000.00	\$ 140,000.00	-	-	\$ 500,000.00	\$ 500,000.00	
7	Art Allowance	LS	1	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	
8	Art Allowance Implementation and Associated Cost	LS	1	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	
9	Discretionary Work			\$	\$ 100,000.00	\$	\$ 100,000.00	\$	\$ 100,000.00	
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE				\$	\$ 1,911,286.00	\$	\$ 291,500.00	\$	\$ 1,910,000.00	
10	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 300.00	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage Provided Price for Removal / Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond			Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		pricing not provided for #3,#4 and #6 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes				
						Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB. Total Price on bid stated as \$1,959,000.00				

Downtown Bradenton Transit Station

Item		Description		U/M	QTY.	Westra Construction Palmetto, FL 941.723.1611		Zirkelbach Construction Palmetto, FL 941.729.0000	
						Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1		LS	Mobilization / Demobilization		1	\$ 120,000.00	\$ 120,000.00	\$ -	\$ 780.00
2		LS	Temporary Erosion Control		1	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ -	\$ 2,310.00
3		LS	Sitework - Complete		1	\$ 491,000.00	\$ 491,000.00	\$ -	\$ 242,584.00
4		LS	Art Wall - Screen		1	\$ 222,000.00	\$ 222,000.00	\$ -	\$ 129,911.00
5		LS	Landscape and Irrigation		1	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ -	\$ 12,989.00
6		LS	Building - Complete		1	\$ 1,300,000.00	\$ 1,300,000.00	\$ -	\$ 1,093,807.00
7		LS	Art Allowance		1	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00
8		LS	Art Allowance Implementation and Associated Cost		1	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 19,000.00	\$ -	\$ 9,475.00
9		LS	Discretionary Work		1	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 100,000.00
							\$ 2,432,000.00		\$ 1,751,856.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE									
10			Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 570.00
		Acknowledged Addendum # 1				Yes		Yes	
		Acknowledged Addendum # 2				Yes		Yes	
		Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage				Yes		Yes	
		Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat.				Yes		Yes	
		Site Visit				Yes		Yes	
		Florida Trench Safety Act				Yes		Yes	
		Contractor's Questionnaire				Yes		Yes	
		License Requirement: General Contractor				Yes		Yes	
		Drug Free Work Place Certification				Yes		Yes	
		Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification				Yes		Yes	
		Bid Bond				Yes		Yes	

PREPARED BY ARCHITECT

Armedic

April 22 4/24/11

REVIEWED BY PROJECT MANAGER:

APPROVED BY PURCHASING:

[Signature]

Item		Description		U/M		QTY.		Construction Technology Group, Inc. Plant City, FL 813.752.2959		D.L. Porter Constructors, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.929.9400		Pat Cook Construction, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.749.1959	
Item		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	\$ 255,000.00	\$ 255,000.00	\$ 91,170.00	\$ 91,170.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 8,611.00	\$ 8,611.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 229,000.00	\$ 229,000.00	\$ 229,000.00	\$ 229,000.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00
3	Sitework - Complete	\$ 658,000.00	\$ 658,000.00	\$ 218,375.00	\$ 218,375.00	\$ 229,000.00	\$ 229,000.00	\$ 171,500.00	\$ 171,500.00	\$ 171,500.00	\$ 171,500.00	\$ 171,500.00	\$ 171,500.00
4	Art Wall - Screen	\$ 180,000.00	\$ 180,000.00	\$ 139,000.00	\$ 139,000.00	\$ 171,500.00	\$ 171,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00
5	Landscape and Irrigation	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 8,567.00	\$ 8,567.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 1,154,146.00	\$ 1,154,146.00	\$ 1,154,146.00	\$ 1,154,146.00	\$ 1,154,146.00	\$ 1,154,146.00
6	Building - Complete	\$ 768,000.00	\$ 768,000.00	-	-	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00
7	Art Allowance	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 33,000.00	\$ 33,000.00	\$ 33,000.00	\$ 33,000.00	\$ 33,000.00	\$ 33,000.00	\$ 33,000.00	\$ 33,000.00
8	Art Allowance Implementation and Associated Cost	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00	\$ 10,016.00
9	Discretionary Work	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00
		BID "B" TOTAL BID PRICE		\$ 2,157,000.00		\$ 735,689.00		\$ 1,895,146.00		\$ 1,895,146.00		\$ 1,895,146.00	

Item	U/M	QTY.	Description	Unit Price	Extended Price	Yes/No/Yes (incorrct u/rm qty utilized)
10	CY	6	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	\$ 125.00	\$ 750.00	Yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond						
			Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB. Total Price on bid stated as \$1,859,814.00			

Downtown Bradenton Transit Station

Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	DeLesline Construction, Inc. Palmetto, FL 941.723.6112		E.O. Koch Construction, Inc. Seabring, FL 863.385.8649		Holland Construction Corporation Sarasota, FL 941.953.4500	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 102,394.00	\$ 102,394.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 9,015.00	\$ 9,015.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 1,300.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 212,359.00	\$ 212,359.00	\$ 91,658.00	\$ 91,658.00	\$ 388,445.00	\$ 388,445.00
4	Art Wall - Screen	LS	1	\$ 352,669.00	\$ 352,669.00	\$ 205,009.00	\$ 205,009.00	\$ 1,064,655.00	\$ 1,064,655.00
5	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 13,963.00	\$ 13,963.00	\$ 12,776.00	\$ 12,776.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 16,000.00
6	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 825,039.00	\$ 825,039.00	\$ 1,191,499.00	\$ 1,191,499.00	\$ 162,400.00	\$ 162,400.00
7	Art Allowance	LS	1	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00
8	Art Allowance Implementation and Associated Cost	LS	1	\$ 23,650.00	\$ 23,650.00	\$ 8,048.00	\$ 8,048.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00
9	Discretionary Work			\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 100,000.00
BID "B" TOTAL BID PRICE				\$	1,799,089.00	\$	1,781,490.00	\$	1,919,800.00

Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Yes/No
10	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 36,000.00	Yes
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1					Yes
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2					Yes
	Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage					Yes
	Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat.					Yes
	Site Visit					Yes
	Florida Trench Safety Act					Yes
	Contractor's Questionnaire					Yes
	License Requirement: General Contractor					Yes
	Drug Free Work Place Certification					Yes
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification					Yes
	Bid Bond					Yes
Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB						Yes
				\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	Yes
				\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	Yes
				\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	Yes
				\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	Yes

Downtown Bradenton Transit Station

Item		Description		U/M	QTY.	Lodge Construction, Inc. Fort Myers, FL 239.332.4371		Magnum Builders of Sarasota, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.351.5560		NDC Construction Bradenton, FL 941.747.1062	
		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1 \$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 93,760.00	\$ 93,760.00	\$ 80,000.00	\$ 80,000.00			
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1 \$ 2,686.05	\$ 2,686.05	\$ 1,910.00	\$ 1,910.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00			
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1 \$ 581,080.23	\$ 581,080.23	\$ 241,047.00	\$ 241,047.00	\$ 525,000.00	\$ 525,000.00			
4	Art Wall - Screen	LS	1 \$ 119,302.33	\$ 119,302.33	\$ 268,763.00	\$ 268,763.00	\$ 175,000.00	\$ 175,000.00			
5	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1 \$ 22,876.74	\$ 22,876.74	\$ 12,822.00	\$ 12,822.00	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 13,200.00			
6	Building - Complete	LS	1 \$ 1,320,165.15	\$ 1,320,165.15	\$ 1,138,265.00	\$ 1,138,265.00	\$ 771,500.00	\$ 771,500.00			
7	ART Allowance	LS	1 \$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00			
8	ART Allowance Implementation and Associated Cost	LS	1 \$ 63,045.35	\$ 63,045.35	\$ 11,017.00	\$ 11,017.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00			
9	Discretionary Work			\$ 100,000.00	\$	\$ 100,000.00	\$	\$ 100,000.00			
BID "B" TOTAL BID PRICE				\$ 2,379,155.85	\$ 2,027,584.00	\$ 1,837,700.00					
10	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6 \$ 120.00	\$ 720.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,200.00			
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat.			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Site Visit			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes			Yes				Yes
	License Requirement: General Contractor			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Drug Free Work Place Certification			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification			Yes			Yes				Yes
	Bid Bond			Yes			No				Yes

Downtown Bradenton Transit Station

Item		Description		U/M QTY.		Stellar Development, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.907.8788		J.L. Wallace, Inc. Fort Myers, FL 239.437.1111		Vogel Bros. Building Co. Lakeland, FL 863.646.5078	
						Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1		LS	1	\$	26,048.00	\$	26,048.00	\$	10,000.00	\$	10,000.00
2		LS	1	\$	5,210.00	\$	5,210.00	\$	2,500.00	\$	2,500.00
3		LS	1	\$	1,288,528.00	\$	1,288,528.00	\$	852,757.00	\$	852,757.00
4		LS	1	\$	150,000.00	\$	150,000.00	\$	120,000.00	\$	120,000.00
5		LS	1	\$	16,500.00	\$	16,500.00	\$	9,000.00	\$	9,000.00
6		LS	1	\$	140,000.00	\$	140,000.00	\$	694,743.00	\$	694,743.00
7		LS	1	\$	160,000.00	\$	160,000.00	\$	160,000.00	\$	160,000.00
8		LS	1	\$	25,000.00	\$	25,000.00	\$	10,000.00	\$	10,000.00
9						\$	100,000.00	\$	100,000.00	\$	100,000.00
BID "B" TOTAL BID PRICE						\$	1,911,286.00	\$	1,959,000.00	\$	1,910,000.00
10						\$	1,000.00	\$	6,000.00	\$	50.00
		Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material		CY	6		pricing not provided				300.00
		Acknowledged Addendum # 1				Yes					Yes
		Acknowledged Addendum # 2				Yes					Yes
		Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage				Yes					Yes
		Provided Price for Removal/Replacement of Haz Mat.				Yes					Yes
		Site Visit				Yes					Yes
		Florida Trench Safety Act				Yes					Yes
		Contractor's Questionnaire				Yes					Yes
		License Requirement: General Contractor				Yes					Yes
		Drug Free Work Place Certification				Yes					Yes
		Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification				Yes					Yes
		Bid Bond				Yes					Yes
		Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB.									Extended bid price totaled at \$1,959,000.00
		Extended bid price totaled at \$1,959,000.00									

Downtown Bradenton Transit Station

Item		Description		U/M	QTY.	Westra Construction Palmetto, FL 941.723.1611		Zirkelbach Construction Palmetto, FL 941.729.0000	
		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	780.00	\$	780.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	2,310.00	\$	2,310.00
3	Sitework - Complete	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	242,584.00	\$	242,584.00
4	Art Wall - Screen	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	129,911.00	\$	129,911.00
5	Landscape and Irrigation	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	12,989.00	\$	12,989.00
6	Building - Complete	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	1,093,807.00	\$	1,093,807.00
7	Art Allowance	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	160,000.00	\$	160,000.00
8	Art Allowance Implementation and Associated Cost	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	9,475.00	\$	9,475.00
9	Discretionary Work	No Bid	No Bid	LS	1	\$	100,000.00	\$	100,000.00
BID "B" TOTAL BID PRICE							\$ 1,751,856.00		
10	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	No Bid	No Bid	CY	6	\$	95.00	\$	570.00
		Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Bid Form / Subcontractor Percentage Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond							

PREPARED BY ARCHITECT

Armedic
 April 23 4/24/11
 Olga Felicit - 4/24/2011

REVIEWED BY PROJECT MANAGER:

APPROVED BY PURCHASING: