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MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 
INTENT TO AWARD 

 

IFB NO. / TITLE 

IFBC No. 24-TA005162JH / 
SR 684 (Cortez Road) Water 
Main and Force Main 
Intracoastal Crossing 
 

DATE POSTED MC __________ 
 

DS _________ 
 

PROCUREMENT 
REPRESENTATIVE 

Jeb Hayter, Procurement 
Agent III 

PROJECTED 
AWARD DATE June 11, 2024 

DEPARTMENT/DIVISION Public Works Department AUTHORIZED BY 
DATE 

Jacob Erickson, Purchasing Official 
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with D.B.E. Management, 
LLC d/b/a DBE Utility Services for the provision of SR 684 (Cortez Road) Water Main and Force Main Intracoastal 
Crossing. 
 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 
 
Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26. 
 

BACKGROUND/EVALUATION 
 
The Scope of Work consists of, but not limited to, the relocation of the County's intracoastal crossings of the water 
main and force main along the Cortez bridge.  
 
The solicitation was advertised on February 14, 2024, on the Manatee County website and DemandStar. It was also 
provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast 
Builders Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members and in the Bradenton 
Herald and Tempo News newspapers.  Responses were received from the following firms:  
 

1. Accurate Drilling Systems, Inc., Labelle, FL 4. Metro Equipment Services, Inc., Miami, FL 
2. Andrew Site Work, LLC, Fort Myers, FL 5. Quality Enterprises USA, Inc., Naples, FL 
3. D.B.E. Management, LLC d/b/a DBE Utility Services, 
Loxahatchee, FL 

6. Westra Construction Corp., Palmetto, FL 

The following firms were deemed non-responsive/non-responsible: None 
 
EVALUATION SUMMARY:  
 
D.B.E. Management, LLC d/b/a DBE Utility Services was the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s).  A bid tabulation 
of the results is attached to this Notice of Intent to Award. 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
The Procurement Division and the Public Works Department recommend award to D.B.E. Management, LLC d/b/a 
DBE Utility Services. 

ATTACHMENTS  
(List in order of attached) 

 

 

 

Bid Tabulation 
 
 
 
 
 

COST 
 
 
 
 
 
 

$8,826,022.70 

 

 

 

 



ACCURATE DRILLING 
SYSTEMS, INC. ANDREW SITE WORK, LLC D.B.E. MANAGEMENT, LLC

METRO EQUIPMENT 
SERVICES, INC.

QUALITY ENTERPRISES 
USA, INC.

WESTRA CONSTRUCTION 
CORP

$9,780,523.50 $11,004,549.60 $8,826,022.70 NO BID $9,206,002.30 NO BID

$9,780,523.50 $11,005,649.60 $8,804,022.70 $9,972,649.50 $9,206,002.30 $18,735,481.60
SR 684 (Cortez Road) Water Main and Force Main Intracoastal Crossing

Bid Total - Bid B 580 Calendar Days

SR 684 (Cortez Road) Water Main and Force Main Intracoastal Crossing
Bid Total - Bid A 520 Calendar Days

BID TABULATION SUMMARY
IFBC NO. 24-TA005162JH

SR 684 (CORTEZ ROAD) WATER MAIN AND FORCE MAIN INTRACOASTAL CROSSING



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1 Mobilization 1 LS $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $814,968.00 $814,968.00 $815,968.00 $815,968.00 $696,950.00 $696,950.00 $676,950.00 $676,950.00 $0.00 $990,000.00 $990,000.00 $833,040.00 $833,040.00 $833,040.00 $833,040.00 $0.00 $1,590,000.00 $1,590,000.00
2 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $545,263.00 $545,263.00 $545,263.00 $545,263.00 $148,665.00 $148,665.00 $148,665.00 $148,665.00 $0.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $226,259.00 $226,259.00 $226,259.00 $226,259.00 $0.00 $270,000.00 $270,000.00
3 Maintenance of Drill 1 LS $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $657,730.00 $657,730.00 $657,730.00 $657,730.00 $59,740.00 $59,740.00 $59,740.00 $59,740.00 $0.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $175,865.00 $175,865.00 $175,865.00 $175,865.00 $0.00 $390,000.00 $390,000.00
4 Erosion and Sediment Control 1 LS $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $77,346.00 $77,346.00 $77,346.00 $77,346.00 $77,230.00 $77,230.00 $77,230.00 $77,230.00 $0.00 $11,200.00 $11,200.00 $34,637.00 $34,637.00 $34,637.00 $34,637.00 $0.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00
5 Clearing and Grubbing 1 LS $21,175.00 $21,175.00 $21,175.00 $21,175.00 $452,218.00 $452,218.00 $452,218.00 $452,218.00 $62,433.00 $62,433.00 $62,433.00 $62,433.00 $0.00 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $74,771.00 $74,771.00 $74,771.00 $74,771.00 $0.00 $79,000.00 $79,000.00
6 Preconstruction Video 1 LS $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $12,651.00 $12,651.00 $12,651.00 $12,651.00 $1,458.00 $1,458.00 $1,458.00 $1,458.00 $0.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,909.00 $5,909.00 $5,909.00 $5,909.00 $0.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
7 Project Signs 1 LS $6,350.00 $6,350.00 $6,350.00 $6,350.00 $9,555.00 $9,555.00 $9,555.00 $9,555.00 $6,405.00 $6,405.00 $6,405.00 $6,405.00 $0.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $7,879.00 $7,879.00 $7,879.00 $7,879.00 $0.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00
8 Record Drawings 1 LS $52,650.00 $52,650.00 $52,650.00 $52,650.00 $94,891.00 $94,891.00 $94,891.00 $94,891.00 $8,417.00 $8,417.00 $8,417.00 $8,417.00 $0.00 $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $9,028.00 $9,028.00 $9,028.00 $9,028.00 $0.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00

$883,575.00 $883,575.00 $2,664,622.00 $2,665,622.00 $1,061,298.00 $1,041,298.00 $0.00 $1,353,200.00 $1,367,388.00 $1,367,388.00 $0.00 $2,446,800.00

9 24" HDPE DR 9 Water Main (HDD) 3120 LF $587.00 $1,831,440.00 $587.00 $1,831,440.00 $508.60 $1,586,832.00 $508.60 $1,586,832.00 $440.30 $1,373,736.00 $440.30 $1,373,736.00 $0.00 $898.00 $2,801,760.00 $555.00 $1,731,600.00 $555.00 $1,731,600.00 $0.00 $1,600.00 $4,992,000.00
10 36" Steel Casing (Open-Cut) 105 LF $497.00 $52,185.00 $497.00 $52,185.00 $558.00 $58,590.00 $558.00 $58,590.00 $500.00 $52,500.00 $500.00 $52,500.00 $0.00 $935.00 $98,175.00 $735.00 $77,175.00 $735.00 $77,175.00 $0.00 $2,100.00 $220,500.00
11 36" Steel Casing (Jack and Bore) 430 LF $3,200.00 $1,376,000.00 $3,200.00 $1,376,000.00 $2,621.00 $1,127,030.00 $2,621.00 $1,127,030.00 $3,293.00 $1,415,990.00 $3,293.00 $1,415,990.00 $0.00 $1,089.00 $468,270.00 $2,037.00 $875,910.00 $2,037.00 $875,910.00 $0.00 $4,000.00 $1,720,000.00
12 20" DIP Class 250 Water Main (Open Cut) 1380 LF $325.00 $448,500.00 $325.00 $448,500.00 $365.00 $503,700.00 $365.00 $503,700.00 $341.00 $470,580.00 $341.00 $470,580.00 $0.00 $377.00 $520,260.00 $453.00 $625,140.00 $453.00 $625,140.00 $0.00 $555.00 $765,900.00
13 10" HDPE DR 11 Water Main (HDD) 240 LF $250.00 $60,000.00 $250.00 $60,000.00 $251.00 $60,240.00 $251.00 $60,240.00 $124.00 $29,760.00 $124.00 $29,760.00 $0.00 $297.00 $71,280.00 $234.00 $56,160.00 $234.00 $56,160.00 $0.00 $250.00 $60,000.00
14 8" DIP Class 350 Water Main (Open Cut) 50 LF $115.00 $5,750.00 $115.00 $5,750.00 $831.00 $41,550.00 $831.00 $41,550.00 $117.50 $5,875.00 $117.50 $5,875.00 $0.00 $258.00 $12,900.00 $490.00 $24,500.00 $490.00 $24,500.00 $0.00 $320.00 $16,000.00
15 6" DIP Class 350 Water Main (Open Cut) 50 LF $140.00 $7,000.00 $140.00 $7,000.00 $397.00 $19,850.00 $397.00 $19,850.00 $115.50 $5,775.00 $115.50 $5,775.00 $0.00 $218.00 $10,900.00 $376.00 $18,800.00 $376.00 $18,800.00 $0.00 $130.00 $6,500.00
16 20" DI Fitting - 90 Deg. Bend, MJ (Water) 3 EA $4,375.00 $13,125.00 $4,375.00 $13,125.00 $5,607.00 $16,821.00 $5,607.00 $16,821.00 $6,640.00 $19,920.00 $6,640.00 $19,920.00 $0.00 $6,460.00 $19,380.00 $4,540.00 $13,620.00 $4,540.00 $13,620.00 $0.00 $4,660.00 $13,980.00
17 20" DI Fitting - 45 Deg. Bend, MJ (Water) 9 EA $3,675.00 $33,075.00 $3,675.00 $33,075.00 $5,290.00 $47,610.00 $5,290.00 $47,610.00 $5,980.00 $53,820.00 $5,980.00 $53,820.00 $0.00 $6,233.00 $56,097.00 $3,874.00 $34,866.00 $3,874.00 $34,866.00 $0.00 $4,045.00 $36,405.00
18 20" DI Fitting - 22.5 Deg. Bend, MJ (Water) 7 EA $3,750.00 $26,250.00 $3,750.00 $26,250.00 $5,045.00 $35,315.00 $5,045.00 $35,315.00 $6,036.00 $42,252.00 $6,036.00 $42,252.00 $0.00 $3,124.00 $21,868.00 $3,930.00 $27,510.00 $3,930.00 $27,510.00 $0.00 $4,100.00 $28,700.00
19 20" DI Fitting - 11.25 Deg. Bend, MJ (Water) 2 EA $3,650.00 $7,300.00 $3,650.00 $7,300.00 $6,163.00 $12,326.00 $6,163.00 $12,326.00 $5,960.00 $11,920.00 $5,960.00 $11,920.00 $0.00 $2,750.00 $5,500.00 $3,853.00 $7,706.00 $3,853.00 $7,706.00 $0.00 $4,025.00 $8,050.00
20 8" DI Fitting - 90 Deg. Bend MJ (Water) 1 EA $1,075.00 $1,075.00 $1,075.00 $1,075.00 $2,263.00 $2,263.00 $2,263.00 $2,263.00 $2,235.00 $2,235.00 $2,235.00 $2,235.00 $0.00 $1,880.00 $1,880.00 $1,299.00 $1,299.00 $1,299.00 $1,299.00 $0.00 $865.00 $865.00
21 8" DI Fitting - 45 Deg. Bend MJ (Water) 8 EA $1,400.00 $11,200.00 $1,400.00 $11,200.00 $2,483.00 $19,864.00 $2,483.00 $19,864.00 $2,194.00 $17,552.00 $2,194.00 $17,552.00 $0.00 $1,865.00 $14,920.00 $1,257.00 $10,056.00 $1,257.00 $10,056.00 $0.00 $825.00 $6,600.00
22 8" DI Fitting - 22.5 Deg. Bend MJ (Water) 2 EA $1,050.00 $2,100.00 $1,050.00 $2,100.00 $2,120.00 $4,240.00 $2,120.00 $4,240.00 $1,339.00 $2,678.00 $1,339.00 $2,678.00 $0.00 $741.00 $1,482.00 $1,253.00 $2,506.00 $1,253.00 $2,506.00 $0.00 $820.00 $1,640.00
23 8" DI Fitting - 11.25 Deg. Bend MJ (Water) 2 EA $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,238.00 $6,476.00 $3,238.00 $6,476.00 $2,172.00 $4,344.00 $2,172.00 $4,344.00 $0.00 $634.00 $1,268.00 $1,236.00 $2,472.00 $1,236.00 $2,472.00 $0.00 $805.00 $1,610.00
24 6" DI Fitting - 90 Deg. Bend, MJ (Water) 2 EA $835.00 $1,670.00 $835.00 $1,670.00 $2,140.00 $4,280.00 $2,140.00 $4,280.00 $2,103.00 $4,206.00 $2,103.00 $4,206.00 $0.00 $735.00 $1,470.00 $1,166.00 $2,332.00 $1,166.00 $2,332.00 $0.00 $740.00 $1,480.00
25 8" X 20" DI Fitting - Reducer, MJ (Water) 1 EA $2,575.00 $2,575.00 $2,575.00 $2,575.00 $4,597.00 $4,597.00 $4,597.00 $4,597.00 $7,074.00 $7,074.00 $7,074.00 $7,074.00 $0.00 $5,336.00 $5,336.00 $4,982.00 $4,982.00 $4,982.00 $4,982.00 $0.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00
26 20" X 24" DI Fitting - Reducer, MJ (Water) 2 EA $4,025.00 $8,050.00 $4,025.00 $8,050.00 $6,763.00 $13,526.00 $6,763.00 $13,526.00 $6,605.00 $13,210.00 $6,605.00 $13,210.00 $0.00 $5,977.00 $11,954.00 $4,504.00 $9,008.00 $4,504.00 $9,008.00 $0.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00
27 8" X 10" DI Fitting - Reducer, MJ (Water) 2 EA $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $2,794.00 $5,588.00 $2,794.00 $5,588.00 $2,250.00 $4,500.00 $2,250.00 $4,500.00 $0.00 $1,530.00 $3,060.00 $1,314.00 $2,628.00 $1,314.00 $2,628.00 $0.00 $877.00 $1,754.00
28 20" DI Fitting - Tee, MJ (Water) 3 EA $5,830.00 $17,490.00 $5,830.00 $17,490.00 $7,029.00 $21,087.00 $7,029.00 $21,087.00 $9,228.00 $27,684.00 $9,228.00 $27,684.00 $0.00 $7,755.00 $23,265.00 $5,439.00 $16,317.00 $5,439.00 $16,317.00 $0.00 $5,375.00 $16,125.00
29 6" X 20" DI Fitting - Tee, MJ (Water) 2 EA $4,380.00 $8,760.00 $4,380.00 $8,760.00 $5,984.00 $11,968.00 $5,984.00 $11,968.00 $7,257.00 $14,514.00 $7,257.00 $14,514.00 $0.00 $6,369.00 $12,738.00 $4,304.00 $8,608.00 $4,304.00 $8,608.00 $0.00 $5,050.00 $10,100.00
30 8" X 20" DI Fitting - Tee, MJ (Water) 1 EA $4,960.00 $4,960.00 $4,960.00 $4,960.00 $6,342.00 $6,342.00 $6,342.00 $6,342.00 $7,323.00 $7,323.00 $7,323.00 $7,323.00 $0.00 $6,825.00 $6,825.00 $4,373.00 $4,373.00 $4,373.00 $4,373.00 $0.00 $5,120.00 $5,120.00
31 8" Foster Adapter (Water) 2 EA $985.00 $1,970.00 $985.00 $1,970.00 $1,390.00 $2,780.00 $1,390.00 $2,780.00 $1,916.00 $3,832.00 $1,916.00 $3,832.00 $0.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $977.00 $1,954.00 $977.00 $1,954.00 $0.00 $925.00 $1,850.00
32 24" HDPE MJ Adapter (Water) 2 EA $6,725.00 $13,450.00 $6,725.00 $13,450.00 $11,103.00 $22,206.00 $11,103.00 $22,206.00 $10,602.00 $21,204.00 $10,602.00 $21,204.00 $0.00 $6,602.00 $13,204.00 $9,408.00 $18,816.00 $9,408.00 $18,816.00 $0.00 $13,575.00 $27,150.00
33 10" HDPE MJ Adapter (Water) 2 EA $1,775.00 $3,550.00 $1,775.00 $3,550.00 $4,687.00 $9,374.00 $4,687.00 $9,374.00 $4,550.00 $9,100.00 $4,550.00 $9,100.00 $0.00 $1,444.00 $2,888.00 $3,642.00 $7,284.00 $3,642.00 $7,284.00 $0.00 $3,810.00 $7,620.00
34 Water Monitoring Valve Vault 1 EA $174,450.00 $174,450.00 $174,450.00 $174,450.00 $166,564.00 $166,564.00 $166,564.00 $166,564.00 $172,087.00 $172,087.00 $172,087.00 $172,087.00 $0.00 $54,684.00 $54,684.00 $128,863.00 $128,863.00 $128,863.00 $128,863.00 $0.00 $145,000.00 $145,000.00
35 20" Micrometer Ultra Mag UM-020 1 EA $21,320.00 $21,320.00 $21,320.00 $21,320.00 $18,950.00 $18,950.00 $18,950.00 $18,950.00 $36,080.00 $36,080.00 $36,080.00 $36,080.00 $0.00 $18,585.00 $18,585.00 $22,941.00 $22,941.00 $22,941.00 $22,941.00 $0.00 $21,700.00 $21,700.00
36 20" Mechanical Electric Actuated Gate Valve 1 EA $28,985.00 $28,985.00 $28,985.00 $28,985.00 $53,938.00 $53,938.00 $53,938.00 $53,938.00 $59,348.00 $59,348.00 $59,348.00 $59,348.00 $0.00 $47,367.00 $47,367.00 $46,480.00 $46,480.00 $46,480.00 $46,480.00 $0.00 $38,650.00 $38,650.00
37 Pressure Monitor 1 EA $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $4,793.00 $4,793.00 $4,793.00 $4,793.00 $2,157.00 $2,157.00 $2,157.00 $2,157.00 $0.00 $5,664.00 $5,664.00 $5,113.00 $5,113.00 $5,113.00 $5,113.00 $0.00 $3,545.00 $3,545.00
39 20" DI Gate Valve, MJ 4 EA $28,985.00 $115,940.00 $28,985.00 $115,940.00 $24,209.00 $96,836.00 $24,209.00 $96,836.00 $30,209.00 $120,836.00 $30,209.00 $120,836.00 $0.00 $16,107.00 $64,428.00 $26,769.00 $107,076.00 $26,769.00 $107,076.00 $0.00 $4,750.00 $19,000.00
40 8" DI Gate Valve, MJ 2 EA $5,100.00 $10,200.00 $5,100.00 $10,200.00 $5,615.00 $11,230.00 $5,615.00 $11,230.00 $6,730.00 $13,460.00 $6,730.00 $13,460.00 $0.00 $5,956.00 $11,912.00 $4,560.00 $9,120.00 $4,560.00 $9,120.00 $0.00 $8,870.00 $17,740.00
41 Above Ground Air Release Valve Assembly 2 EA $11,450.00 $22,900.00 $11,450.00 $22,900.00 $6,359.00 $12,718.00 $6,359.00 $12,718.00 $9,470.00 $18,940.00 $9,470.00 $18,940.00 $0.00 $9,173.00 $18,346.00 $6,102.00 $12,204.00 $6,102.00 $12,204.00 $0.00 $9,335.00 $18,670.00
42 Cut and Connect to 8" Water Main 2 EA $13,570.00 $27,140.00 $13,570.00 $27,140.00 $6,451.00 $12,902.00 $6,451.00 $12,902.00 $8,655.00 $17,310.00 $8,655.00 $17,310.00 $0.00 $14,604.00 $29,208.00 $9,680.00 $19,360.00 $9,680.00 $19,360.00 $0.00 $22,155.00 $44,310.00
43 Cut and Connect to 20" Water Main 2 EA $24,875.00 $49,750.00 $24,875.00 $49,750.00 $5,221.00 $10,442.00 $5,221.00 $10,442.00 $19,470.00 $38,940.00 $19,470.00 $38,940.00 $0.00 $19,889.00 $39,778.00 $15,655.00 $31,310.00 $15,655.00 $31,310.00 $0.00 $9,000.00 $18,000.00
44 6" Fire Hydrant Assembly 1 EA $9,770.00 $9,770.00 $9,770.00 $9,770.00 $19,324.00 $19,324.00 $19,324.00 $19,324.00 $11,780.00 $11,780.00 $11,780.00 $11,780.00 $0.00 $19,525.00 $19,525.00 $14,496.00 $14,496.00 $14,496.00 $14,496.00 $0.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00

$4,410,630.00 $4,410,630.00 $4,052,152.00 $4,052,152.00 $4,112,522.00 $4,112,522.00 $0.00 $4,498,577.00 $3,982,585.00 $3,982,585.00 $0.00 $8,297,764.00

45 20" HDPE DR 9 Force Main (HDD) 3250 LF $470.00 $1,527,500.00 $470.00 $1,527,500.00 $381.00 $1,238,250.00 $381.00 $1,238,250.00 $391.00 $1,270,750.00 $391.00 $1,270,750.00 $0.00 $678.00 $2,203,500.00 $462.00 $1,501,500.00 $462.00 $1,501,500.00 $0.00 $1,300.00 $4,225,000.00
46 18" PVC C900 DR 18 Force Main (Open Cut) 850 LF $195.00 $165,750.00 $195.00 $165,750.00 $378.00 $321,300.00 $378.00 $321,300.00 $270.00 $229,500.00 $270.00 $229,500.00 $0.00 $175.00 $148,750.00 $353.00 $300,050.00 $353.00 $300,050.00 $0.00 $585.00 $497,250.00
47 6" PVC C900 DR 18 Force Main (Open Cut) 130 LF $65.00 $8,450.00 $65.00 $8,450.00 $185.00 $24,050.00 $185.00 $24,050.00 $100.50 $13,065.00 $100.50 $13,065.00 $0.00 $135.00 $17,550.00 $384.00 $49,920.00 $384.00 $49,920.00 $0.00 $240.00 $31,200.00
48 8" HDPE DR 11 Force Main (HDD) 250 LF $145.00 $36,250.00 $145.00 $36,250.00 $154.00 $38,500.00 $154.00 $38,500.00 $110.00 $27,500.00 $110.00 $27,500.00 $0.00 $235.00 $58,750.00 $221.00 $55,250.00 $221.00 $55,250.00 $0.00 $215.00 $53,750.00
49 18" DI Fitting - 90 Deg. Bend, MJ (Wastewater) 2 EA $5,200.00 $10,400.00 $5,200.00 $10,400.00 $5,485.00 $10,970.00 $5,485.00 $10,970.00 $7,145.00 $14,290.00 $7,145.00 $14,290.00 $0.00 $8,252.00 $16,504.00 $5,052.00 $10,104.00 $5,052.00 $10,104.00 $0.00 $5,145.00 $10,290.00
50 18" DI Fitting - 45 Deg. Bend, MJ (Wastewater) 12 EA $4,750.00 $57,000.00 $4,750.00 $57,000.00 $5,752.00 $69,024.00 $5,752.00 $69,024.00 $6,795.00 $81,540.00 $6,795.00 $81,540.00 $0.00 $8,066.00 $96,792.00 $4,698.00 $56,376.00 $4,698.00 $56,376.00 $0.00 $4,815.00 $57,780.00
51 18" DI Fitting - 22.5 Deg. Bend, MJ (Wastewater) 3 EA $4,625.00 $13,875.00 $4,625.00 $13,875.00 $5,445.00 $16,335.00 $5,445.00 $16,335.00 $6,784.00 $20,352.00 $6,784.00 $20,352.00 $0.00 $5,775.00 $17,325.00 $4,687.00 $14,061.00 $4,687.00 $14,061.00 $0.00 $4,800.00 $14,400.00
52 18" DI Fitting - 11.25 Deg. Bend, MJ (Wastewater) 2 EA $4,900.00 $9,800.00 $4,900.00 $9,800.00 $5,783.00 $11,566.00 $5,783.00 $11,566.00 $7,146.00 $14,292.00 $7,146.00 $14,292.00 $0.00 $5,058.00 $10,116.00 $5,052.00 $10,104.00 $5,052.00 $10,104.00 $0.00 $5,145.00 $10,290.00
53 6" DI Fitting - 90 Deg. Bend, MJ (Wastewater) 1 EA $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,887.00 $1,887.00 $1,887.00 $1,887.00 $2,387.00 $2,387.00 $2,387.00 $2,387.00 $0.00 $977.00 $977.00 $1,453.00 $1,453.00 $1,453.00 $1,453.00 $0.00 $1,190.00 $1,190.00
54 6" DI Fitting - 45 Deg. Bend, MJ (Wastewater) 6 EA $1,150.00 $6,900.00 $1,150.00 $6,900.00 $2,004.00 $12,024.00 $2,004.00 $12,024.00 $2,235.00 $13,410.00 $2,235.00 $13,410.00 $0.00 $921.00 $5,526.00 $1,300.00 $7,800.00 $1,300.00 $7,800.00 $0.00 $1,045.00 $6,270.00
55 6" DI Fitting - 11.25 Deg. Bend, MJ (Wastewater) 2 EA $1,150.00 $2,300.00 $1,150.00 $2,300.00 $1,840.00 $3,680.00 $1,840.00 $3,680.00 $2,336.00 $4,672.00 $2,336.00 $4,672.00 $0.00 $822.00 $1,644.00 $1,402.00 $2,804.00 $1,402.00 $2,804.00 $0.00 $1,140.00 $2,280.00
56 18" X 20" DI Fitting - Reducer, MJ (Wastewater) 3 EA $5,775.00 $17,325.00 $5,775.00 $17,325.00 $6,306.00 $18,918.00 $6,306.00 $18,918.00 $7,390.00 $22,170.00 $7,390.00 $22,170.00 $0.00 $4,906.00 $14,718.00 $5,299.00 $15,897.00 $5,299.00 $15,897.00 $0.00 $5,245.00 $15,735.00
57 6" X 8" DI Fitting - Reducer, MJ (Wastewater) 2 EA $1,300.00 $2,600.00 $1,300.00 $2,600.00 $2,486.00 $4,972.00 $2,486.00 $4,972.00 $2,474.00 $4,948.00 $2,474.00 $4,948.00 $0.00 $1,028.00 $2,056.00 $1,542.00 $3,084.00 $1,542.00 $3,084.00 $0.00 $1,270.00 $2,540.00
58 6" X 18" DI Fitting - Tee, MJ (Wastewater) 1 EA $5,625.00 $5,625.00 $5,625.00 $5,625.00 $6,395.00 $6,395.00 $6,395.00 $6,395.00 $8,334.00 $8,334.00 $8,334.00 $8,334.00 $0.00 $4,490.00 $4,490.00 $5,397.00 $5,397.00 $5,397.00 $5,397.00 $0.00 $4,965.00 $4,965.00
59 18" DI Fitting - Tee, MJ (Wastewater) 2 EA $9,200.00 $18,400.00 $9,200.00 $18,400.00 $8,050.00 $16,100.00 $8,050.00 $16,100.00 $10,960.00 $21,920.00 $10,960.00 $21,920.00 $0.00 $7,476.00 $14,952.00 $7,190.00 $14,380.00 $7,190.00 $14,380.00 $0.00 $7,020.00 $14,040.00
60 20" HDPE MJ Adadpter (Wastewater) 3 EA $4,400.00 $13,200.00 $4,400.00 $13,200.00 $7,474.00 $22,422.00 $7,474.00 $22,422.00 $8,722.00 $26,166.00 $8,722.00 $26,166.00 $0.00 $4,594.00 $13,782.00 $9,339.00 $28,017.00 $9,339.00 $28,017.00 $0.00 $11,000.00 $33,000.00
61 8" HDPE MJ Adapter (Wastewater) 2 EA $1,125.00 $2,250.00 $1,125.00 $2,250.00 $4,415.00 $8,830.00 $4,415.00 $8,830.00 $4,222.00 $8,444.00 $4,222.00 $8,444.00 $0.00 $1,077.00 $2,154.00 $3,310.00 $6,620.00 $3,310.00 $6,620.00 $0.00 $3,130.00 $6,260.00
62 18" DI Plug Valve, MJ 3 EA $21,685.00 $65,055.00 $21,685.00 $65,055.00 $16,423.00 $49,269.00 $16,423.00 $49,269.00 $22,175.00 $66,525.00 $22,175.00 $66,525.00 $0.00 $11,500.00 $34,500.00 $22,432.00 $67,296.00 $22,432.00 $67,296.00 $0.00 $16,200.00 $48,600.00
63 6" DI Plug Valve, MJ 1 EA $6,725.00 $6,725.00 $6,725.00 $6,725.00 $5,988.00 $5,988.00 $5,988.00 $5,988.00 $8,463.00 $8,463.00 $8,463.00 $8,463.00 $0.00 $6,971.00 $6,971.00 $6,315.00 $6,315.00 $6,315.00 $6,315.00 $0.00 $5,945.00 $5,945.00
64 Cut and Connect to 6" Force Main 1 EA $3,515.00 $3,515.00 $3,515.00 $3,515.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $19,612.00 $19,612.00 $19,612.00 $19,612.00 $0.00 $7,743.00 $7,743.00 $17,940.00 $17,940.00 $17,940.00 $17,940.00 $0.00 $97,900.00 $97,900.00
65 Cut and Connect to 18" Force Main 2 EA $40,500.00 $81,000.00 $40,500.00 $81,000.00 $74,000.00 $148,000.00 $74,000.00 $148,000.00 $33,585.00 $67,170.00 $33,585.00 $67,170.00 $0.00 $8,650.00 $17,300.00 $19,594.00 $39,188.00 $19,594.00 $39,188.00 $0.00 $152,000.00 $304,000.00
66 Force Main Monitoring and Bypassing Valve Vault 1 EA $114,000.00 $114,000.00 $114,000.00 $114,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $143,920.00 $143,920.00 $143,920.00 $143,920.00 $0.00 $28,731.00 $28,731.00 $93,652.00 $93,652.00 $93,652.00 $93,652.00 $0.00 $124,400.00 $124,400.00
67 18" DI FLG Adapter (Wastewater) 1 EA $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $7,651.00 $7,651.00 $7,651.00 $7,651.00 $6,072.00 $6,072.00 $6,072.00 $6,072.00 $0.00 $6,747.00 $6,747.00 $6,319.00 $6,319.00 $6,319.00 $6,319.00 $0.00 $10,100.00 $10,100.00
68 18" Micrometer Ultra Mag UM-018 1 EA $17,250.00 $17,250.00 $17,250.00 $17,250.00 $32,582.00 $32,582.00 $32,582.00 $32,582.00 $36,438.00 $36,438.00 $36,438.00 $36,438.00 $0.00 $22,476.00 $22,476.00 $21,334.00 $21,334.00 $21,334.00 $21,334.00 $0.00 $22,200.00 $22,200.00
69 2" Stainless Steel Pressure Gauge with Saddle Tap 2 EA $1,900.00 $3,800.00 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 $4,893.00 $9,786.00 $4,893.00 $9,786.00 $1,612.00 $3,224.00 $1,612.00 $3,224.00 $0.00 $922.00 $1,844.00 $4,993.00 $9,986.00 $4,993.00 $9,986.00 $0.00 $4,550.00 $9,100.00
71 Force Main Bypass Valve Vault 1 EA $114,000.00 $114,000.00 $114,000.00 $114,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $131,150.00 $131,150.00 $131,150.00 $131,150.00 $0.00 $62,714.00 $62,714.00 $86,522.00 $86,522.00 $86,522.00 $86,522.00 $0.00 $93,500.00 $93,500.00
72 18" DI Fitting - Tee, FLG (Wastewater) 2 EA $18,100.00 $36,200.00 $18,100.00 $36,200.00 $6,692.00 $13,384.00 $6,692.00 $13,384.00 $6,543.00 $13,086.00 $6,543.00 $13,086.00 $0.00 $9,658.00 $19,316.00 $5,934.00 $11,868.00 $5,934.00 $11,868.00 $0.00 $5,985.00 $11,970.00
73 18" DI Fitting - 90 Deg. Bend, FLG (Wastewater) 1 EA $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $9,735.00 $9,735.00 $9,735.00 $9,735.00 $9,594.00 $9,594.00 $9,594.00 $9,594.00 $0.00 $8,871.00 $8,871.00 $9,882.00 $9,882.00 $9,882.00 $9,882.00 $0.00 $9,300.00 $9,300.00
74 18" DI Plug Valve, FLG 4 EA $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $14,548.00 $58,192.00 $14,548.00 $58,192.00 $14,758.00 $59,032.00 $14,758.00 $59,032.00 $0.00 $8,245.00 $32,980.00 $20,792.00 $83,168.00 $20,792.00 $83,168.00 $0.00 $14,100.00 $56,400.00

$2,410,570.00 $2,410,570.00 $2,340,810.00 $2,340,810.00 $2,348,026.00 $2,348,026.00 $0.00 $2,879,779.00 $2,536,287.00 $2,536,287.00 $0.00 $5,779,655.00

75 3.5" OD Duraline Smoothwall HDPE SDR 9 Conduit (HDD) 3430 LF $180.00 $617,400.00 $180.00 $617,400.00 $150.00 $514,500.00 $150.00 $514,500.00 $23.90 $81,977.00 $23.90 $81,977.00 $0.00 $13.00 $44,590.00 $38.00 $130,340.00 $38.00 $130,340.00 $0.00 $8.90 $30,527.00
76 Fiber Optic Splice Box (30"x60"x48") w/ Hand Line 2 EA $29,000.00 $58,000.00 $29,000.00 $58,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $13,710.00 $27,420.00 $13,710.00 $27,420.00 $0.00 $11,578.00 $23,156.00 $13,726.00 $27,452.00 $13,726.00 $27,452.00 $0.00 $10,175.00 $20,350.00

$675,400.00 $675,400.00 $538,500.00 $538,500.00 $109,397.00 $109,397.00 $0.00 $67,746.00 $157,792.00 $157,792.00 $0.00 $50,877.00

77 Grout Fill and Abandon Existing 6" Water Main and 8" Force Main 4 CY $2,810.00 $11,240.00 $2,810.00 $11,240.00 $4,271.00 $17,084.00 $4,271.00 $17,084.00 $1,475.00 $5,900.00 $1,475.00 $5,900.00 $0.00 $2,400.00 $9,600.00 $1,931.00 $7,724.00 $1,931.00 $7,724.00 $0.00 $2,075.00 $8,300.00
78 Abandon Existing 20" Water Main and 18" Force Main 1 LS $10,250.00 $10,250.00 $10,250.00 $10,250.00 $56,500.00 $56,500.00 $56,500.00 $56,500.00 $22,560.00 $22,560.00 $22,560.00 $22,560.00 $0.00 $13,383.00 $13,383.00 $28,295.00 $28,295.00 $28,295.00 $28,295.00 $0.00 $55,500.00 $55,500.00
79 Full Road Restoration 690 SY $385.00 $265,650.00 $385.00 $265,650.00 $85.00 $58,650.00 $85.00 $58,650.00 $177.60 $122,544.00 $177.60 $122,544.00 $0.00 $130.00 $89,700.00 $90.00 $62,100.00 $90.00 $62,100.00 $0.00 $175.00 $120,750.00
80 Sidewalk & Concrete Driveway Restoration 450 SY $115.00 $51,750.00 $115.00 $51,750.00 $110.00 $49,500.00 $110.00 $49,500.00 $137.90 $62,055.00 $137.90 $62,055.00 $0.00 $134.00 $60,300.00 $86.00 $38,700.00 $86.00 $38,700.00 $0.00 $106.00 $47,700.00
81 Remove & Replace Curb 100 LF $210.00 $21,000.00 $210.00 $21,000.00 $127.00 $12,700.00 $127.00 $12,700.00 $57.60 $5,760.00 $57.60 $5,760.00 $0.00 $87.00 $8,700.00 $57.00 $5,700.00 $57.00 $5,700.00 $0.00 $77.00 $7,700.00
82 Mill and Resurfacing 320 SY $116.00 $37,120.00 $116.00 $37,120.00 $101.00 $32,320.00 $101.00 $32,320.00 $157.50 $50,400.00 $157.50 $50,400.00 $0.00 $49.00 $15,680.00 $84.00 $26,880.00 $84.00 $26,880.00 $0.00 $243.00 $77,760.00
83 Sodding 6500 SY $6.00 $39,000.00 $6.00 $39,000.00 $11.00 $71,500.00 $11.00 $71,500.00 $7.95 $51,675.00 $7.95 $51,675.00 $0.00 $6.00 $39,000.00 $10.00 $65,000.00 $10.00 $65,000.00 $0.00 $4.30 $27,950.00
84 Water Service Replacement 7 EA $3,600.00 $25,200.00 $3,600.00 $25,200.00 $7,632.00 $53,424.00 $7,632.00 $53,424.00 $6,745.00 $47,215.00 $6,745.00 $47,215.00 $0.00 $2,945.00 $20,615.00 $6,871.00 $48,097.00 $6,871.00 $48,097.00 $0.00 $3,500.00 $24,500.00
85 Tree and Shrub Replacement 1 LS $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $56,374.00 $56,374.00 $56,374.00 $56,374.00 $24,305.00 $24,305.00 $24,305.00 $24,305.00 $0.00 $9,765.00 $9,765.00 $42,545.00 $42,545.00 $42,545.00 $42,545.00 $0.00 $87,000.00 $87,000.00

$511,210.00 $511,210.00 $408,052.00 $408,052.00 $392,414.00 $392,414.00 $0.00 $266,743.00 $325,041.00 $325,041.00 $0.00 $457,160.00
$8,891,385.00 $8,891,385.00 $10,004,136.00 $10,005,136.00 $8,023,657.00 $8,003,657.00 $0.00 $9,066,045.00 $8,369,093.00 $8,369,093.00 $0.00 $17,032,256.00

86 Contract Contingency (Used only with County Approval) 10% $889,138.50 $889,138.50 $1,000,413.60 $1,000,513.60 $802,365.70 $800,365.70 $0.00 $906,604.50 $836,909.30 $836,909.30 $0.00 $1,703,225.60
$9,780,523.50 $9,780,523.50 $11,004,549.60 $11,005,649.60 $8,826,022.70 $8,804,022.70 NO BID $0.00 $9,972,649.50 $9,206,002.30 $9,206,002.30 NO BID $0.00 $18,735,481.60

Westra Construction CorpAccurate Drilling Systems, Inc. Andrew Site Work, LLC D.B.E. Management, LLC Metro Equipment Services, Inc. Quality Enterprises USA, Inc.
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