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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Woodruff & Sons,
Inc., for the provision of Lift Station 9A Rehabilitation and Force Main Replacement.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26.

BACKGROUND/EVALUATION

The Scope of Work consists of lift station rehabilitation and force main replacement based on the plans and
specifications.

The solicitation was advertised on October 13, 2022, on the Manatee County website and DemandStar. It was also
provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast
Builders Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members and in the Bradenton
Herald and Tempo News newspapers. Responses were received from the following firms:

1. Metro Equipment Services, Inc., Miami, FL
2. Woodruff & Sons, Inc., Bradenton, FL

EVALUATION SUMMARY:
Woodruff & Sons, Inc., was the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s). A bid tabulation of the results is attached to
this Notice of Intent to Award.

RECOMMENDATION
The Procurement Division and the Public Works recommend award to Woodruff & Sons, Inc.

ATTACHMENTS Bid Tabulation COST $4,965,978.85
(List in order of attached)

Intent to Award (Rev. 10-25-22)



BID TABULATION SUMMARY

IFBC NO. 22-TA004367JH
LIFT STATION 9A REHABILITATION AND FORCE MAIN REPLACEMENT

|Lift Station 9A Rehabilitation and Force Main Replacement | Metro Equip Services, Inc. | Woodruff & Sons, Inc.
Bid Total - Bid A 300 Calendar Days| $6,984,197.00 I NO BID
|Lift Station 9A Rehabilitation and Force Main Replacement | Metro Equip Services, Inc. | Woodruff & Sons, Inc.
Bid Total - Bid B 360 Calendar Days| $5,961,496.20 $4,965,978.85




BID TABULATION
IFBC NO. 22-TA004367JH

PROJECT NAME: LIFT STATION 9A REHABILITATION AND FORCE MAIN REPLACEME!

IFBC NO. 22-TA004367JH PROJECT NUMBER: 6074081

METRO EQUIPMENT SERVICES, INC.

'WOODRUFF & SONS, INC.

l';’;YM DESCRIPTION oty | umt | UNITPRICEBID A300 | EXTENDED PRICE BID | UNIT PRICE BID B 360 | EXTENDED PRICE BID | UNIT PRICE BID A 300 | EXTENDED PRICE BID | UNIT PRICE BID B 360 | EXTENDED PRICE BID
NO. CALENDAR DAYS A CALENDAR DAYS B CALENDAR DAYS A CALENDAR DAYS B
1. |MOBILIZATION 1 LS $290,000.00 $290,000.00 $290,000.00 $290.000.00 NO BID 50.00 $272,908.22 $272.908.22
2. |[DEMOLITION 1 LS $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 NO BID 50.00 §87.392.42 $87,392.42
3. SITEWORK
3.1, |SELECTIVE DEMOLITION 1 Ls $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $186,606.32 $186.606.32
32. [SHORING 1 Ls $64.000.00 $64,000.00 $64.000.00 $64,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $156,075.20 $156.075.20
33. |TRAFFIC CONTROL BARRIER 1 Ls $3.500.00 $3.,500.00 $3.500.00 $3,500.00 NO BID $0.00 $136.900.42 $136.900.42
3.4. |EROSION CONTROL 1 Ls $5.000.00 $5.000.00 $5.000.00 $5.000.00 NO BID $0.00 $27.820.72 $27.820.72
3.5. |ASPHALT REPLACEMENT 2500 | sy $73.00 $182.500.00 $73.00 $182.500.00 NO BID $0.00 $144.72 $361.800.00
36. |DRIVEWAY ASPHALT REPLACEMENT 1200 | sy §55.00 $66.000.00 §55.00 $66.000.00 NO BID $0.00 $210.27 $252.324.00
37. |SOD REPLACEMENT 8175 | sy $7.00 §57,225.00 $7.00 §57,225.00 NO BID $0.00 §7.97 $65,154.75
38. |REPAIR SIDEWALKS 236 SF $29.00 $6,844.00 $29.00 $6,844.00 NO BID $0.00 52096 $4.946.56
39.  |REPAIR CONCRETE 15 Sy $665.00 $9.975.00 $665.00 $9.975.00 NO BID $0.00 $771.53 $11,572.95
3.10. |MILL & RESURFACING 2000 | sy §39.00 $81.900.00 $39.00 $81,900.00 NO BID $0.00 $25.75 $54,075.00
3.11. |MANHOLE LINING - SPRAY LINER 6 EA $15.000.00 $90,000.00 $15.000.00 $90,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $19.469.66 $116.817.96
3.12. [MISC. SITEWORK 1 Ls $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 NO BID $0.00 §56.441.40 $56,441.40
3.13. |TEMPORARY BYPASS ALLOWANCE 1 Ls $62.000.00 $62,000.00 $62.000.00 $62,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $204,336.99 $204.336.99
4. FURNISH AND INSTALL YARD PIPE
4.1. |6"SLAB ON GRADE 10 cy $450.00 $4,500.00 $450.00 $4,500.00 NO BID 50.00 $1.484.45 $14,844.50
4.2 6" DI #350 WATER MAIN AND FITTINGS - RESTRAINED 116 LF $145.00 $16,820.00 $145.00 $16,820.00 NO BID $0.00 $426.74 $49,501.84
4.3 12" PVC SDR 35 GRAVITY SEWER MAIN AND FITTINGS 25 LF $485.00 $12,125.00 $485.00 $12,125.00 NO BID $0.00 $465.60 $11,640.00
44, [10"PVC SDR 35 GRAVITY SEWER MAIN AND FITTINGS 36 LF $460.00 $16,560.00 $460.00 $16,560.00 NO BID $0.00 $310.41 $11,174.76
4.5 8" PVC SDR 35 GRAVITY SEWER MAIN AND FITTINGS 33 LF $340.00 $11,220.00 $340.00 $11,220.00 NO BID $0.00 $310.17 $10,235.61
4.6. 2"PVC SCH. 80 WATER SERVICE PIPE AND FITTINGS - SOCKET JOINT 20 LF $120.00 $2,400.00 $120.00 $2,400.00 NO BID $0.00 $157.47 $3,149.40
47, |BURIED STRUCTURES, MANHOLES, 48" DIA. 2 EA §39.000.00 $78,000.00 $39.000.00 $78,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $27.958.26 $55.916.52
48.  [BURIED STRUCTURES, MANHOLES, 48" DIA. - SITEWORK ALLOWANCE 1 Ls $5.000.00 §5.000.00 $5.000.00 §5.000.00 NO BID $0.00 $3.792.25 $3.792.25
4.9. ‘WATER METER AND BACKFLOW PREVENTION ASSEMBLY, 2 1/2" 1 EA $5.400.00 $5,400.00 $5.400.00 $5,400.00 NO BID $0.00 $10,105.03 $10,105.03
4.10. | 18" RCP CLASS Il CULVERT 538 LF $90.00 $48.420.00 $90.00 $48.420.00 NO BID 50.00 $342.93 $184.496.34
4.11. 24" RCP CLASS IIl CULVERT 58 LF $140.00 $8,120.00 $140.00 $8,120.00 NO BID 50.00 $415.13 $24,077.54
4.12. | CONNECTION TO EXISTING MANHOLE 2 EA $4.600.00 $9.200.00 $4.600.00 $9.200.00 NO BID $0.00 $16,631.57 $33.263.14
5. FURNISH AND INSTALL FORCE MAIN
5.1 12" PVC €900 DR 18 FORCEMAIN AND FITTINGS - RESTRAINED 1,572 LF $740.00 $1,163,280.00 $592.00 $930,624.00 NO BID $0.00 $238.07 $374,246.04
52. 12" PVC €900 DR 18 FORCEMAIN AND FITTINGS - PUSH-ON JOINT 4586 | LF $690.00 §3,164.340.00 $538.00 §2.467.268.00 NO BID $0.00 $114.08 $523.170.88
53. [24"PVC CASING 60 LF $270.00 $16,200.00 $270.00 $16,200.00 NO BID $0.00 $284.03 $17.041.80
54. |AIRRELIEF VALVE 6 EA $6.000.00 $36,000.00 $6.000.00 $36,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $9.30097 $55.805.82
55. |12 PLUG VALVE 5 EA $6.500.00 $32,500.00 $6.500.00 $32,500.00 NO BID $0.00 $8.043.67 $40218.35
5.6. | CONNECTION TO EXISTING MANHOLE 1 EA $4.600.00 $4,600.00 $4.600.00 $4,600.00 NO BID $0.00 $78,353.74 $78,353.74
6. FURNISH AND INSTALL LIFT STATION
6.1. |6"SLAB ON GRADE 583 cy $300.00 §1.749.00 $300.00 $1.749.00 NO BID $0.00 $1.859.18 $10,839.02
62. |ALUMINUM HATCH COVER 1 Ls $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $4,833.61 $4,833.61
6.3. |FINISHES, OTHER 1 Ls $5.000.00 §5.000.00 $5.000.00 $5.000.00 NO BID $0.00 $6.782.57 $6.782.57
64.  |ELECTRICAL 1 Ls $120,000.00 $120.000.00 $120,000.00 $120.000.00 NO BID $0.00 $48.440.56 $48,440.56
65. |EARTHWORK 1092 | oy $1.00 $1,092.00 $1.00 $1,092.00 NO BID 50.00 $50.82 $55.495.44
66. |12 DIA. WETWELL 1 EA §396,000.00 $396.000.00 §396,000.00 $396.000.00 NO BID $0.00 $467918.39 $467.918.39
67 [PROCESS PIPE AND FITTINGS 125 LF $140.00 $17,500.00 $140.00 $17,500.00 NO BID $0.00 $782.72 $97,840.00
68. [1&C 1 LS $53,000.00 $53,000.00 $53,000.00 $53,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $80,601.87 $80,601.87
6.9. |SUBMERSIBLE PUMP, 35 HP 2 EA $60.000.00 $120.000.00 $60.000.00 $120.000.00 NO BID $0.00 $85.286.77 $170,573.54
6.10. |12" CHECK VALVE 2 EA $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $6,857.09 $13.714.18
6.11. |12" GATE VALVE 7 EA $4.500.00 $31,500.00 $4.500.00 $31,500.00 NO BID $0.00 $4.534.59 $31,742.13
6.12. |ADJUSTABLE 316 SST PIPE SUPPORTS 4 EA $1.200.00 $4,800.00 $1.200.00 $4,800.00 NO BID 50.00 $2,118.08 $8.472.32
7. |CLEANUP AND DEMOBILIZATION 1 LS $8.000.00 $8,000.00 $8.000.00 $8,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $21.066.13 $21,066.13
SUB-TOTAL BASE BID $6,349,270.00 $5,419,542.00 $0.00 $4,514,526.23
8 Contract Contingency (Used only with County Approval) 1 10% $634,927.00 $541,954.20 $0.00 $451,452.62
TOTAL CONTRACT AWARD (Including 10% Contract Contingency) $6,984,197.00 $5,961,496.20 $0.00 $4,965,978.85
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