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Agenda 
February 24, 2015 - Regular Meeting 

Category 
B. CONSENT AGENDA 

Sub-Catogory 
Financial Management 

Approval Path 
FM (Purchasing-Melissa) 

Subject 
IFB #14-3257CD: Fort Hamer Bridge Project wtth Road Improvements on Fort Hamer Road and Upper Manatee 
River Road (U.M .R.R.) 

Briefings 
None 

help 

Contact end/or Presenter Information 

Contact: Chris Daley, FinanCial Management Department, Purchasing Division, Ext. 3048. 

Presenter: Kent Bontrager-Engineer II, Ext. 7331 and Jeff streltmatter- Public Works Department, Project 
Management Division, Ext 7335. 

Action Requested 

Award IF8 #14-3257CD: Fort Hamer Brldge Project with Road Improvements on Fort Hamer Road and Upper 
Mlinatee RIver Road (U.M.R..R.) to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidder, Johnson Bros. Corporation, a 
Southland Company, Uthla, Fl for a total of $32,690,155.48 with 630 calendar days for completion. 

Authorize the County Administrator, or deSignee, to execute the Agreement and accept and date the Performance 
and Payment Bonds. 

Adopt Budget Amendment Resolution B-15-041. 

~nabllng/Regulatfng Authority 

Manatee County Code of Laws 

Background Discus.lon 

The work consists of constructing a br1dge over the Manatee River connecting Upper Manatee River Road to Fort 
Hamer Road. In addltlon, this Bid also Jndudes roadway functional Improvements to both Upper Manatee River Road 
and Fort Hamer Road. These three projects will be constructed simultaneously under one contract. 

The major components of the Work: Include: 
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1. Fort Hamer Bridge: ThIs Work consists of furnishing all labor, materials, equipment and Incidentals required for 
the construction of a new roadway connecting the existing Upper Manatee River Road, south of the Manatee River, 
to the existing Fort Hamer Road, north of the Manatee River, via a new bridge spanning the river. The length of the 
roadway, Including the bridge, is approximately 1.4 miles. The proposed bridge over the Manatee River will carry 
two lanes of tramc and will be comprised of 18 spans ranging In length from 100 feet to 144 feet resulting in a total 
bridge length of 2,318 feet. 

2. Upper Manatee River Road Functional Improvements: This Work consists of furnishing all labor, materials, 
equipment and Incidentals required for the widening of existing shoulders, relocating existing roadside ditches, 
addition of Sidewalks, addition of tum lanes at each InterseCtion, and the construction of utility adjustments on the 
eXisting Upper Manatee River Road from the SR64 Intersection south to the beginning of the new Fort Hamer Road 
Bridge described above. 

3. Fort Hamer Road Functional Improvements: This Work consists of furnishing all labor, materials, equipment and 
Incidentals requIred for the widening of the existing road from 22 ft to 24 ft with 4 bike lanes and 4 ft shoulders, 
relocating exlstfng roadside ditches, addition of Sidewalks, and the construction of ut11Jty adjustments on the 
existing Fort Hamer Road from Britt Road south to the end of tile new Fort Hamer Road Brfdge described above. 

Formal, competitive sealed bid procedures were followed resulting In a total of seven (7) bidders submitting a 
sealed bld for consideration. 

Hillsborough County 
Johnson Bros. Corporation 
Orion Marine Construction, Inc. 
Prince Contracting, LLC 

Duval County 
Superior Construction Company 

Mlami- Dade County 
GLF Construction Corporation 

Orange County 
Hubbard Construction Company 

Lee County 
Zep Construction, Inc. 

Bid A (630 days) 
$32,690,155.48 
$36,252,103.22 
$39,061,762.56 

No Bid 

$36,696,018.87 

$37,901,683.42 

$44,251,923.97 

Bid 8 (720 days) 
No Bid 

$36,259,802.95 
$38,059,589.17 

$36,119,939.97 

$36,176,240.38 

$37,811,712.44 

$43,172,283.84 

On February 4, 2015, 21 memorandum was received from Public Works Department recommending award to 
Johnson Bros. Corporation, of Uthla, FL, for a total bid amount of $32,690,155.48 with a 630 calendar day 
completion time. 

County Attorney Review 
Not Reviewed (No apparent legal Issues) 

Explanation of Other 

Reviewing Attorney 
N/A 

Instructions to Board Records 

Orfglnal to Board Records 

Copies to: 

Johnson Bros. Corporation, 5476 Uthla Pinecrest Road, Uthla, FL 33765 (twlnn@iohnson-bros.com). 

Johnnie Yetter ljohnnle.yetter@mymanatee,oro), Public WorXs Department; Towanda BrInson 
mallto:towanda.brinson@manateeclcrk.com), Accounts payable Anance Department; CaSSidy Rickrode 
(C8ssidy.rlckrode@mymanatee.org), Financial Management Department; Chris Daley (chrls.daley@mymanatee.org), 
Purchasing Division. 
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Cost and Funds Source Account Number and Name 
The funding sources for this Agreement are Transportation Bonds, Road Impact Fees, and Gas Taxes - Various 
Accounts In projects 6035560, 6054764, 6082660, 5134270, and 5134280-UppermanateeRlvRd/FtHamerRdBrg 

Chris Daley - 0 
Role : Item Author 

Amount and Frequency of Recurring Costs 
N/A 

Attachments: (list) 

rl 
14-3257CD Departmental 

Recommendation.pdf 

itt. 
14-3257CD 

Tabulation. pdf 

Version: 1.2.1.3 - 1.2.7.5 

ii1 
14-3257CO Johnson Bros 
Corporation Contract. pdf 

iil 
BA B-15-
041.pdf 

log out 

© 2002-2015, Idea Integration Corp. 
All Rights Reserved 
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BID TABULATION- BID SUMMARY 
IFB #14-3257CD-

FORT HAMER BRIDGE PROJECT WITH ROAD IMPROVEMENTS ON FORT HAMER ROAD AND UPPOER MANATEE RIVER ROAD (U.M.R.R.) 

Brothers Construction Construction 
Construction Company pany Contracting, LLC pany Southeast, LLC 

o Highland Manor Dr., 
Box 588 W. Tyson Ave SW 8th St., Suite 2201 Lee Road 110 Jean Blvd. Buisness Park Blvd. 

FL FL 33611 FL 33130 FL 32789 FL 33610 , FL 33967 i I FL 32256 

DESCRIPTION QTY TOTAL BID PRICE TOTAL BID PRICE TOTAL BID PRICE TOTAL BID PRICE TOTAL BID PRICE TOTAL BID PRICE TOTAL BID PRICE 

"A" Based on Completion 
LS 1 $32,690,155.48 $36,252,103.22 $36,696,01 B.B7 $37,901,683.42 $39,061,762.56 $44,251,923.97 No Bid 

of 630 Calendar Days 

"B" Based on Completion 
LS 1 No Bid $36,259,802.95 $36,176,240.38 $37,811,712.44 $38,059,589.17 $43,172,283.84 $36,119,939.97 

of 720 Calendar Days 

Addendum 111 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Addendum 112 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Addendum 113 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Addendum 114 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Act Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Yes Yes Yes No No 

as to Local Business No Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 
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