
MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 
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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

Manatee County intends to award blanket purchase orders to Argos Ready Mix, LLC and Concrete On Call, Inc. per the terms, 
conditions and specifications of RFQ 14-3248GE. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy. 

Manatee County Code of Laws 

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION 

• On November 7, 2014 RFQ 14-3248GE for Ready-mix Concrete and Cement Block was issued. No 
addendums were issued. On November 21, 2014 four responses were received: Anderson Asphalt & 
Concrete, LLC, Argos Ready Mix, LLC, Concrete On Call, Inc., and Davis Concrete, Inc. 

• Per the Basis of Award, the County reserves the right to make multiple awards. 

• After an evaluation of the quote submittals, Argos Ready Mix, LLC and Concrete On Call, Inc. are the 
responsive and responsible quoters with the lowest total quote prices. 

• RFQ Quote Price Tabulations are attached. 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST: 
$ 24,000.00 

Blanket PO with a 
AMT/FREQ OF possible five year term 

RECURRING COSTS 



-- ------- ----

QUOTE PRICE TABULATION 
"RFQ # 14-3248GE - READY-MIX CONCRETE AND CEMENT BLOCK 

Anderson Asphalt & Concrete. LLC. Sarasota FL 

ITEM CATALOG # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE 
GROUP A: Ready Mix Concrete (FOOT Spec. 345) 

1A 2104420021 2500 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
No Bid Yard 

2A 2104420021 2500 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 
$ 97.00 

Yard 

2104420023 3000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
No Bid 3A Yard 

4A 2104420022 3000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 
$ 99.00 Yard 

SA 2104420025 
3500 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

No Bid Yard 

SA 2104420024 3500 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 
$101 .00 Yard 

7A 2104420002 4000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
No Bid Yard 

8A 2104420001 4000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 
$ 105.00 Yard 

9A 2104420004 
5000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

No Bid 
Yard 

10A 2104420003 
5000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic $111.00 
Yard 

11A 2104420050 3000 PSI Pearock Pump No Bid Mix Cubic Yard 

12A 2104420052 
3500 PSI Pea rock Pump $101.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

13A 2104420054 
4000 PSI Pearock Pump 

$ 105.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

14A 2104420056 
5000 PSI Pearock Pump 

$111.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

ADDITIVES: 

15A 
Fiber (dosage rate of 1.5 

$ 7.00 Ibs per yard) 
Short load charge for 

1SA deliveries of less than 5 $ 75.00 
cubic yards 

17A 
Fee for Saturday service 

$ 175.00 

18A Environmental Fee 
$ 2.00 

GROUP A total for award purposes $62,009.00 

NOTE: Anderson Asphalt's submittal for Group A is non-responsive as it is 
incomplete. 



Anderson Asphalt & Concrete, LLC. Sarasota FL 

ITEM CATALOG # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE 
GROUP 8: CONCRETE 8LOCK & MOTAR MIX 

18 Block delivery fuel surcharge per trip No Bid 
28 2101520001 8 X 8 X 16 Regular - Delivered No Bid 
38 8 X 8 X 16 Regular - Pick Up No Bid 
48 2101520002 8 X 8 X 8 1/2 Corner - Delivered No Bid 
58 8 X 8 X 8 1/2 Corner - Pick Up No Bid 
68 2101520003 8 X 4 X 16 Split - Delivered No Bid 
78 8 X 4 X 16 Split - Pick Up No Bid 
88 2101520004 12 X 8 X 16 Regular - Delivered No Bid 
98 12 X 8 X 16 Regular - Pick Up No Bid 
108 2101520005 12 X 8 X 8 1/2 (3/4 Blk) - Delivered No Bid 
118 12 X 8 X 8 1/2 (3/4 Blk) - Pick Up No Bid 
128 2101520006 8 X 8 X 16 Lintel - Delivered No Bid 
138 8 X 8 X 16 Lintel- Pick Up No Bid 
148 Flowable fill, non-excavatable (pump)lYard No Bid 

158 5,000 PSI CPM Per Yard 
No Bid 

168 5,000 Grout Per Yard 
No Bid 

178 5,000 PSI Lightweight concrete per Yard No Bid 

188 Fee for Saturday service 
No Bid 

"Group 8" Total For Award Purposes $0.00 

NOTE: Anderson Asphalt's submittal for Group B is non-responsive as it is incomplete. 



Argos Ready Mix, LLC. Sarasota FL 

ITEM CATALOG # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE 
GROUP A: Ready Mix Concrete (FDOT Spec. 345) 

1A 2104420021 
2500 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

$ 95.00 
Yard 

2A 2104420021 
2500 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

N/A 
Yard 

2104420023 
3000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

$ 98.00 3A Yard 

4A 2104420022 
3000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 103.00 
Yard 

SA 2104420025 
3500 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

$ 100.00 
Yard 

6A 2104420024 
3500 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 105.00 
Yard 

7A 2104420002 
4000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

$ 102.00 
Yard 

8A 2104420001 
4000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 107.00 
Yard 

9A 2104420004 
5000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

$104.00 
Yard 

10A 2104420003 
5000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 109.00 
Yard 

11A 2104420050 
3000 PSI Pearock Pump 

$103.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

12A 2104420052 
3500 PSI Pearock Pump 

$ 105.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

13A 2104420054 
4000 PSI Pearock Pump 

$107.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

14A 2104420056 
5000 PSI Pearock Pump 

$ 109.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

ADDITIVES: 

1SA 
Fiber (dosage rate of 1.5 

$ 5.50 
Ibs per yard) 
Short load charge for 

16A deliveries of less than 5 $ 50.00 
cubic yards 

17A 
Fee for Saturday service 

$ 500.00 

18A 
Environmental Fee 

$ 1.50 

GROUP A total for award purposes $103,507.00 



Argos Ready Mix, LLC. Sarasota FL 

ITEM CATALOG # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE 
GROUP B: CONCRETE BLOCK & MOTAR MIX 

1B Block delivery fuel surcharge per trip $ 32.50 
2B 2101520001 8 X 8 X 16 Regular - Delivered $ 1.05 
3B 8 X 8 X 16 Regular - Pick Up $ 1.05 
4B 2101520002 8 X 8 X 8 1/2 Corner - Delivered $ 1.06 
5B 8 X 8 X 81/2 Corner - Pick Up $ 1.06 
6B 2101520003 8 X 4 X 16 Split - Delivered $ 1.35 
7B 8 X 4 X 16 Split - Pick Up $ 1.35 
8B 2101520004 12 X 8 X 16 Regular - Delivered $ 1.40 
9B 12 X 8 X 16 Regular - Pick Up $ 1.40 
10B 2101520005 12 X 8 X 8 1/2 (3/4 Blk) - Delivered $ 1.40 
11B 12 X 8 X 8112 (3/4 Blk) - Pick Up $ 1.40 
12B 2101520006 8 X 8 X 16 Lintel - Delivered $ 1.45 
13B 8 X 8 X 16 Lintel- Pick Up $ 1.45 
14B Flowable fill , non-excavatable (pump)/Yard $ 90.00 

15B 5,000 PSI CPM Per Yard 
$ 109.00 

16B 5,000 Grout Per Yard 
$115.00 

17B 5,000 PSI Lightweight concrete per Yard $ 165.00 

18B Fee for Saturday service 
$ 500.00 

"Group B" Total For Award Purposes $8,192.00 



Concrete On Call, LLC. Palmetto FL 

ITEM CATALOG # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE 
GROUP A: Ready Mix Concrete (FDOT Spec. 345) 

1A 2104420021 2500 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
$ 96.00 Yard 

2A 2104420021 2500 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 
$ 96.00 Yard 

2104420023 3000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
$ 96.00 3A Yard 

4A 2104420022 
3000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 96.00 Yard 

5A 2104420025 
3500 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

$ 98.00 Yard 

6A 2104420024 
3500 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 98.00 Yard 

7A 2104420002 
4000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

$ 100.00 
Yard 

SA 2104420001 
4000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 100.00 Yard 

9A 2104420004 
5000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

$ 102.00 
Yard 

10A 2104420003 
5000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 102.00 
Yard 

11A 2104420050 
3000 PSI Pearock Pump $ 96.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

12A 2104420052 
3500 PSI Pearock Pump $ 98.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

13A 2104420054 
4000 PSI Pearock Pump $ 100.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

14A 2104420056 
5000 PSI Pearock Pump $ 102.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

ADDITIVES: 

15A 
Fiber (dosage rate of 1.5 $ 5.00 
Ibs per yard) 
Short load charge for 

16A deliveries of less than 5 $ 0.00 
cubic yards 

17A Fee for Saturday service 
$ 0.00 

1SA Environmental Fee 
$ 5.00 

GROUP A total for award purposes $108,110.00 



Concrete On Call, LLC. Palmetto FL 

ITEM CATALOG # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE 
GROUP B: CONCRETE BLOCK & MOTAR MIX 

1B Block delivery fuel surcharqe per trip No Bid 
2B 2101520001 8 X 8 X 16 Regular - Delivered No Bid 
3B 8 X 8 X 16 Reqular - Pick Up No Bid 
4B 2101520002 8 X 8 X 8 1/2 Corner - Delivered No Bid 
5B 8 X 8 X 8 1/2 Corner - Pick Up No Bid 
6B 2101520003 8 X 4 X 16 Split - Delivered No Bid 
7B 8 X 4 X 16 Split - Pick Up No Bid 
8B 2101520004 12 X 8 X 16 Reqular - Delivered No Bid 
9B 12 X 8 X 16 Regular- Pick Up No Bid 
10B 2101520005 12 X 8 X 8 1/2 (3/4 Blk) - Delivered No Bid 
11B 12 X 8 X 8 1/2 (3/4 Blk) - Pick Up No Bid 
12B 2101520006 8 X 8 X 16 Lintel - Delivered No Bid 
13B 8 X 8 X 16 Lintel- Pick Up No Bid 
14B Flowable fill , non-excavatable (pump)lYard $ 96.00 

15B 5,000 PSI CPM Per Yard 
No Bid 

16B 5,000 Grout Per Yard 
$ 138.00 

17B 5,000 PSI Lightweight concrete per Yard No Bid 

18B Fee for Saturday service 
$ 0.00 

"Group B" Total For Award Purposes $ 2,340.00 

NOTE: Concrete On Call's submittal for Group B is non-responsive as it is 
incomplete. 



Davis Concrete, Inc. Bradenton FL 

ITEM CATALOG # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE 
GROUP A: Ready Mix Concrete (FDOT Spec. 345) 

1A 2104420021 2500 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
No Bid 

Yard 

2A 2104420021 
2500 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 94.50 Yard 

2104420023 3000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
No Bid 3A Yard 

4A 2104420022 3000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 
$ 94.50 Yard 

5A 2104420025 3500 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
No Bid Yard 

6A 2104420024 3500 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 
$ 96.75 Yard 

7A 2104420002 4000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 
No Bid Yard 

SA 2104420001 
4000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic 

$ 99.00 
Yard 

9A 2104420004 
5000 PSI 3/4 Rock Cubic 

No Bid 
Yard 

10A 2104420003 5000 PSI 3/8 Rock Cubic $ 103.50 
Yard 

11A 2104420050 
3000 PSI Pea rock Pump 

$ 94.50 
Mix Cubic Yard 

12A 2104420052 3500 PSI Pearock Pump $ 96.75 
Mix Cubic Yard 

13A 2104420054 4000 PSI Pea rock Pump $ 99.00 
Mix Cubic Yard 

14A 2104420056 
5000 PSI Pearock Pump 

$ 103.50 Mix Cubic Yard 
ADDITIVES: 

15A 
Fiber (dosage rate of 1.5 
Ibs per yard) 

$ 5.00 

Short load charge for 
16A deliveries of less than 5 $ 99.00 

cubic yards 

17A 
Fee for Saturday service 

Not Available 

1SA 
Environmental Fee 

$ 0.00 

GROUP A total for award purposes $63,554.00 

NOTE: Davis Concrete's submittal for Group A is non-responsive as it is 
incomplete. 



Davis Concrete. Inc. Bradenton FL 

ITEM CATALOG # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE 
GROUP 8: CONCRETE 8LOCK & MOTAR MIX 

18 Block delivery fuel surcharge J>er trip No Bid 
28 2101520001 8 X 8 X 16 Regular - Delivered No Bid 
38 8 X 8 X 16 Reqular - Pick UQ No Bid 
48 2101520002 8 X 8 X 8 1/2 Corner - Delivered No Bid 
58 8 X 8 X 8 1/2 Corner - Pick Up No Bid 
68 2101520003 8 X 4 X 16 Split - Delivered No Bid 
78 8 X 4 X 16 Split - Pick Up No Bid 
88 2101520004 12 X 8 X 16 Regular - Delivered No Bid 
98 12 X 8 X 16 Regular- Pick Up No Bid 
108 2101520005 12 X 8 X 81/2 (3/4 Blk) - Delivered No Bid 
118 12 X 8 X 8 1/2 (3/4 Blk) - Pick Up No Bid 
128 2101520006 8 X 8 X 16 Lintel - Delivered No Bid 
138 8 X 8 X 16 Lintel- Pick Up No Bid 
148 Flowable fill , non-excavatable lpumpllYard $1,030.00 

158 
5,000 PSI CPM Per Yard No Bid 

168 5,000 Grout Per Yard No Bid 

178 5,000 PSI Lightweight concrete per Yard No Bid 

188 
Fee for Saturday service No Bid 

"Group 8" Total For Award Purposes 
$ 1,030.00 

NOTE: Davis Concrete's submittal for Group B is non-responsive as it is 
incomplete. 


