MANATEE COUNTY

January 22, 2009

TO: All Interested Bidders

RE: IFB 08-29060V
Bid Tabulation for Satellite Lift Station
Rehabilitation — Priority 2:
Linger Lodge / Champion Homes / Marineland

We thank you for your participation in the Manatee County Government Bidding
process. We look forward to your future participation.

Should you have any questions regarding the attached, please contact the under-
signed.

Regards,

< lga Valcich
Construction Buyer
941-749-3055
Email: olga.valcich@mymanatee.org.

Financial Management Department — Purchasing Division
1112 Manatee Avenue West, Suite 803, Bradenton, FL 34205
Phone: 941-749-3014 - Fax: 941-749-3034

I ARRY BUSTLE * DR, GWENDOLYN Y. BROWN * JOHN R. CHAPPIE * RON GETMAN * DONNA G. HAYES * CAROL WHITMORE * JOE MCCLASH
sirict District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7



08-29060V TABULATION
SATELLITE LIFT STATION REHABILITATION PRIORITY 2
LINGER LODGE

DeJonge Excavating J&H Waterstop, inc. Kimmins Contracting Kuxhausen Construction, } Seavy & Associates, Inc. w.§0_< Contractors, inc. Strickler Brothers, Inc. US Water Services Waestra Construction Corp
P.0. Box 743 P.0. Box 741103 1501 Second Avenue P.O. Box 21087 2608 S 86th St. Suite B 6028 33rd St. E. 4176 Canat St. 4939 Cross Bayou Bivd P.O. Box 1142
Venice, FL 34284 Orange City, FL 32774 Tampa, FL 33605 Sarasota, FL 342764087 Tampa, FL 33619 Bradenton, FL 34203 Fort Myers, FL 33816 | New Port Richey, FL 34652 Palmetto, FL. 34220
941-485-7799 813-248-3878 941-379-6603 813-363-0862 941-756-4700 239-267-2050 727-848-8292 941-723-1611
EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM! DESCRIPTION QTY UM JUNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE]  PRICE PRICE PRICE JUNITPRICE] PRICE PRICE PRICE _ JUNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE} PRICE JUNIT PRICE
Bid "A" - Based on
Completion Time of
300 Days
1 |Plug influent Line 1 LS| $200.00 $200.00 $500.00 $500.00 $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 §| NO BID NO BID $700.00 $700.00 $500.00 $500.00 $400.00 $400.00 NQ BID NQO BID $360.00 $360.00
By-Pass Pumping (ADD #3 -
2 |11/17/08) 1 LS | $9.098.00 $9,098.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 F $5400.00 | $5400.00 § NOBID NOBID $14,500.00 | $14,500.00 }§ $9.000.00 | $9.000.00 §$12,000.00 | $12,000.00 NO BID NO BID $7,140.00 | $7,140.00
3 _|Liner (Repair) - Wet Well (ADD#2) | 75 | SF| $48.00 $3,600.00 $54.00 $4,050.00 $49.00 $3675.00 § NOBID NO BID $25.00 $1,875.00 | $26.00 $1,950.00 $40.00 $3.000.00 NO BID NO BiD $75.00 $5.625.00
Drain Down & Clean Wet Well
4 |(ADD #3 - 11/17/08) 1 LS | $1.757.00 $1.757.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 § $3,200.00 | $3200.00 § NOBID NO BID $2,000.00 | $2,000.00 £$1,350.00 | $1.350.00 ¥ $1,000.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID $1,050.00 | $1050.00
3" PVC (C-900) Drain w/ "P" Trep
including (Boring/Grout) 1 LS| $816.00 $816.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 § $1,500.00 | $1.500.00 § NOBID NO BID $5,500.00 | $5500.00 §$1,200.00 | $1,200.00 § $350.00 $350.00 NO BID NO BID $1.450.00 | $1450.00
Remove Base Ells, Anchors, Piping,
Valves, Bracing Supports, Magnetic
6 |Flow Meters, Etc. 1 LS | $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 || $6800.00 | $6.800.00 § NOBID NOBID $3,800.00 | $3800.00 §#$7500.00 | $7,500.00 §i $2,000.00 $2,000.00 NO BID NOBID [ $900.00 900.00
7__|6" PVC (SCH 80) Stilling Well 1 EA | $1.224.00 $1,224.00 $1,518.00 $1.518.00 § $1.400.00 | $1400.00 § NOBID NO BID $725.00 $72500 §$1.500.00 | $1500.00 § $700.00 $700.00 NO BID NO BID $1,700.00 | $1,700.00
4" Pump Base Ells & Base Plates
(Grinding/Leveling Base of Grout as
8 _|Required) 2 EA | $2.23500 $4,470.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 | $2,500.00 | $5.000.00 # NOBID NO BID $1,700.00 | $3400.00 §$3,500.00 | $7.000.00 § $1,820.00 $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $2,030.00 [ $4,060.00
6" HDPE (SDR-11) & Discharge
gb _{Piping System (ADD #2) 1 EA | $4802.00 $4.802.00 3,000.00 000.00 6,500.00 | $6,500.00 NO BID NOBID §$11,900.00 | $11,900.00 § $1.600,00 1,600.00 }i $5.500.00 5,500.00 NO BID NOBID 1§ $9970.00 | $9.970.00
10b_|6" Swing Check Valve (ADD #2) 2 EA| $1762.00 3,524.00 1,750.00 500.00 § $2.200.00 | $4,400.00 NO BID NO BID $1800.00 | $3600.00 §$2000.00 | $4,000.00 § $970.00 1,940.00 NOBID NO BID $2,140.00 | $4,280.00
11b 16" Gate Valve (ADD #2) 3 EA] $726.00 2,178.00 1,200.00 600.00 $950.00 $2,850.00 NO BID NOBID $1,200.00 | $3600.00 §$1500.00 { $4500.00 § $570.00 1.710.00 NO BID NO BID $1,140.00 | $3,420.00
Pump Guide Rail System (Per
12_|Pump) (ADD #2) 2 EA | $1.322.00 $2.644.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 f $2.200.00 | $4.400.00 § NOBID NO BID $1,600.00 | $3.200.00 §$1.600.00 | $3.200.00 { $1560.00 [ $3120.00 NO BID NO BID $2,030.00 | $4,060.00
Pipe Bracing System: Stainless
13 {Steel (ADD #2) 3 EA| $784.00 $2,352.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 § $1,15000 | $3.45000 § NOBID NO BID $2,000.00 | $6.000.00 §$1600.00 | $4,800.00 § $1,00000 | $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID $1,160.00 [ $3.480.00
14 |Di Fittings (ADD #4 - 11/18/08) 490 | LB $7.50 $3,675.00 $7.05 $3,454.50 $12.50 $6,125.00 § NOBID NO BID $3.00 $147000 | $10.00 $4,900.00 _$8.00 $3,920.00 NO BID NO BID $7.00 $3.430.00
6" PVC W.W. Vent W/Stainless
15 _ISteel Screen 1 LS 874.00 $874.00 $300.00 $300.00 $650.00 $650.00 NO BID NO BID $1,500.00 | $1500.00 f$1,00000 1,000.00 | $450.00 $450.00 NO BID NO BiD $1.775.00 | $1.77500
16b 18" Magnetic Flow Meter (ADD #2) 1 EA | $5563.00 $5,563.00 _$6,400.00 $6.400.00 | $9,500.00 | $9,500.00 | NOBID O BID $7,200.00 | $7.200.00 {§$7,000.00 7,000.00 § $7,370.00 $7,370.00 NO BID NO 8ID $5.665.00 | $5665.00
17__|Underground Conduit (ADD #2) 50 | FT i $11.23 __$561.50 $12.00 $600.00 $24 00 $1.200.00 | NOBID 0 BID $17.25 $862.50 $20.00 1,000.00 $16.00 $800.00 NQ BID NO BID $19.00 $950.00
18 _|6" Quick Connect 1 EA | $332.43 $332.43 $500.00 $500.00 $450.00 $450.00 NO BID Q BID $150.00 $150.00 § $2,000.00 2,000.00 § $360.00 $360.00 NO BID NO BID $340.00 $340.00
Stainless Steel Adjustable Pipe
19_ |Support 4 EA | $307.58 $1,230.32 $300.00 1,200.00 $300.00 $1,200.00 § NOBID NOBID $250.00 $1,000.00 }$1.000.00 [ $4,000.00 NOBID NO BID $710.00 2.840.00
20b }6" Piug Valve (ADD #3 - 11/17/08) 1] EA $0.00 _$0.00 $1,250.00 ILobo $0.00 NOBID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $2,000.00 X NO BID $1,470.00
21 _|Pressure Tap & Gauge 1 EA | $633.18 $633.18 $600.00 $600.00 $350.00 $350.00 NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100.00 §$1,500.00 [ $1500.00 § $170.00 $170.00 _NOBID NOBID $880.00 $880.00
22 |Doubte Check Backfiow Preventer 1 EA | $1.359.25 $1,359.25 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $120.00 $120.00 NO BID NO 81D $700.00 $700.00 [1$1.50000 | $1.50000 | $400.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID $640.00 640.00
Upgrade Service Connection,
23 |Water 1 EA| $863.17 $863.17 $400.00 $400.00 $3,000.00 | $3,000.00 § NOBID NO BID $1.850.00 | $1.850.00 §$2000.00 | $2000.00 § $1.000.00 $1,000.00 NQ BID NO BID $2,000.00 | $2000.00
Mobilization Not to Exceed (10% of
24 Total Bid) 1 LS | $7.028.75 $7,028.75 $7,700.00 $7.700.00 || $10,300.00 | $10,300.00 } NO BID NOBID | $5700.00 | $5700.00 {$7,500.00 | $7.500.00 } $9,000.00 | $9,000.00 NO BID NOBID } $10,300.00 | $10,300.00
25 |Miscellaneous Work & Clean Up 1 LS | $5798.75 5.798.75 750.00 750.00 3.500.00 3,500.00 § NOBID NO BID 25.00 25.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 3,700.00 $3,700.00 NO BID NO BID 5 850.00 5,850.00
26 [Contingency 1 LS 30,000.00 30.000.00 30.000.00 | NO BID NO BID 30,000.00 30,000.00 30.000.00 NO BID NO BID 30,000.00
26a |Contingency: Stone, Shell & Mulch CcY 25.00 N/A 25.00 NO BID NO BID 25.00 40.00 NO BID NO BID $55.00
Upgrade Service Connection,
26b [Water LF | $2500 N/A 27.00 NOQ BID NO BID 35.00 $40.00 NO BID NO BID $48.00
Upgrade Service Connection,
26c {Water NO BID NO BID 400.00 BID NO BID 1,500.00
TOTAL BID "A" PRICE $86,684.35 $89,522.50 $117,270.00§ NO BID NOBID $111,957.50 $113,500.00 $96.330.00 NO BID NO BID 4 $112,185.00




08-29060V TABULATION
SATELLITE LIFT STATION REHABILITATION PRIORITY 2

LINGER LODGE
DeJonge Excavating J&H Waterstop, Inc. Kimmins Contracting Kuxhausen Construction, § Seavy & Associates, inc. m.§m_< Contractors, Inc. Strickier Brothers, Inc. US Water Services Wastra Construction Corp
P.0. Box 743 P.0O. Box 741103 1501 Second Avenue P.0. Box 21087 2608 S 86th St. Suite B 6028 33rd St. E. 4176 Canal St. 4939 Cross Bayou Bivd £.0. Box 1149
Venice, FL. 34284 Orange City, FL 32774 Tampa, FL 33605 Sarasota, FL 34276-4087 Tampa, FL 33618 Bradenton, FL 34203 Fort Myers, FL 33916 | New Port Richey, FL 34652 Palmetto, FL 34220
941-485-7799 813-248-3878 941-379-6603 813-363-0882 941.756-4700 239-267-2050 727-848-8292 941-723-1611
i EXTENDED } EXTENDED { EXTENDED | EXTENDED mx._.mzom_u EXTENDED
ommom_v._._Oz UNIT _um_Om FUNIT _um_Om ! UNIT PRICE § ; UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE
ooau_mn_o: Time of
240 Days
1 [Plug influent Line 1 LS | $200.00 $200.00 __$500.00 500.00 $2,300.00 | $2.300.00 J$6.200.00 | $6.200.00 $700.00 $700.00 $500.00 $500.00 $400.00 $400.00 $2006.00 | $2006.00 § $360.00 $360.00
By-Pass Pumping (ADD #3 -
2 |11/17/08) 1 LS | $9,098.00 $9,098.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 § $5400.00 | $5400.00 [$7,500.00 | $7,500.00 | $14,500.00 | $14,500.00 § $9,000.00 | $9.000.00 §$12.000.00 | $12,000.00 § $15.239.00 $15,230.00 § $7.140.00 | $7,140.00
3 iLiner (Repair) - Wet Well (ADD#2) | 75 | SF | $48.00 $3,600.00 $54.00 $4,050.00 $49.00 $3675.00 $2.00 $150.00 $25.00 $1.875.00 § $26.00 $1.950.00 $40.00 $3,000.00 $33.00 $2.475.00 $75.00 $5.625.00
Drain Down & Clean Wet Well
4 {ADD#3 - 11/17/08) 1 LS | $1.757.00 $1,757.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 | $3.200.00 | $320000 § $575.00 $575.00 $2.000.00 | $2.00000 §$1,350.00 | $1,350.00 j $1,000.00 $1,000.00 | $3.500.00 | $3,500.00 } $1.050.00 | $1,050.00
3" PVC (C-800) Drain w/ "P" Trap
5 lincluding (Boring/Grout) 1 LS| $816.00 $816.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 4 $1.500.00 | $1.500.00 § $750.00 $750.00 §l $5500.00 | $5500.00 §$1200.00 { $1,200.00 $350.00 $350.00 $3,336.00 | $3,336.00 §| $1.450.00 | $1.450.00
Remove Base Ells, Anchors, Piping,
Valves, Bracing Supports, Magnetic
6 _ |Flow Meters, Etc. 1 LS | $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,500.00 $2.500.00 § $6,800.00 | $6,800.00 [$2,300.00 | $2,300.00 | $3,800.00 | $3,.800.00 §$7,500.00 ; $7,500.00 § $2,000.00 $2,000.00 | $440500 | $4.40500 § $900.00 $900.00
7 __|8" PVC (SCH 80) Stiling Well 1 EA | $1.22400 $1.224.00 $1,518.00 $1.518.00 | $1,400.00 | $1.400.00 §$1,130.00 | $1,130.00 $72500 $725.00 §$1,500.00 { $1,500.00 $700.00 $700.00 $3.491.00 | $3,491.00 | $1,700.00 | $1.700.00
4" Pump Base Ells & Base Plates
(Gringing/Leveling Base of Grout as
8 |Required) 2 EA | $2,235.00 $4,470.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 § $2500.00 | $5.000.00 [$1.800.00 | $3,600.00 § $1.700.00 | $3,400.00 §$3,500.00 | $7,000.00 § $1,820.00 $3,640.00 §| $4077.50 | $8155.00 § $2,030.00 | $4060,00
6" HDPE (SDR-11) & Discharge
9b |Piping System (ADD #2) 1 EA | $4,802.00 4,802.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 || $6,500.00 | $6,500.00 j $4.940.00 4,940.00 § $11,900.00 { $11,900.00 § $1,600.00 1.600.00 § $5,500.00 550000 § $5144.00 | $5144.00 §| $9,870.00 | $9.970.00
10b 16" Swing Check Vaive (ADD #2) 2 EA | $1.762.00 3,624.00 1,750.00 3,500.00 || $2,200.00 400.00_J $1,300.00 2.600.00 J $1,800.00 | $3600.00 §$2.000.00 000.00 $970.00 1,940.00 § $1.678.00 | $3356.00 § $2,140.00 | $4,280.00
11b [6” Gate Valve (ADD #2) 3 EA | $726.00 2,178.00 1,200.00 $3,600.00 $950.00 2,850.00 || $850.00 255000 f| $1.20000 | $3,600.00 }$1,500.00 4.500.00 § $570.00 1,710.00 [ $1.070.70 | $3212.10 § $1,140.00 | $3420.00
Pump Guide Rail System (Per
12_{Pump) (ADD #2) 2 EA| $1.322.00 $2,644.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 § $2200.00 | $4.400.00 $$1,350.00 | $2700.00 § $1,800.00 | $3.200.00 §$1,600.00 | $3.20000 ¥ $1.560.00 $3,120.00 | $284550 | $5691.00 § $2030.00 | $4,060.00
Pipe Bracing System: Stainless
13 {Steel (ADD #2) 3 EA| $784.00 $2,352.00 $750.00 $2.250.00 || $1,150.00 | $3.450.00 [$1,200.00 | $3600.00 § $2,000.00 | $6.000.00 §$1.600.00 | $4,800.00 § $1,000.00 $3,000.00 § $1.840.00 | $5520.00 § $1160.00 | $3,480.00
14 _|DI Fittings (ADD #4 - 11/18/08) 490 | LB $7.50 $3,675.00 $7.05 $3,454.50 $12.50 $6,125.00 $0.01 $4.90 $3.00 $1,470.00 § $10.00 $4,900.00 $8.00 $3.920.00 $4.30 $2,107.00 $7.00 $3,430.00
6" PVC W.W. Vent W/Stainless
15 |Steel Screen 1 LSt $874.00 $874.00 $300.00 $300.00 $650.00 $650.00 |} $675.00 $675.00 $1,500.00 | $1.500.00 §$1,000.00 1,000.00 § $450.00 $450.00 $857.00 $857.00 § $1.775.00 | $1.775.00
16b _|6" Magnetic Flow Meter (ADD #2) 1 EA | $5,563.00 $5563.00 | $6400.00 | $6400.00 § $9.500.00 | $9,500.00 ($7,070.00 | $7.070.00 § $7.200.00 | $7,200.00 §$7.000.00 7.000.00 | $7.370.00 | $7.370.00 § $9.941.00 { $9941.00 0§ $5665.00 | $5665.00
17_{Underground Conduit (ADD #2} 50 | FT| $11.23 $561.50 $12.00 $600.00 $24.00 $1,200.00 $6.00 $300.00 $17.25 $862.50 $20.00 1,000.00 $16.00 $800.00 $13.70 $685.00 $19.00 $950.00
18 |6" Quick Connect 1 EA | $33243 $332.43 $500.00 $500.00 $450.00 $450.00 $400.00 $400.00 $150.00 $150.00 [ $2,000.00 2,000.00 $360.00 $360.00 $1,547.00 | $1547.00 § $340.00 $340.00
Stainless Steel Adjustable Pipe
19 |Support 4 EA| $307.58 $1,230.32 $300.00 .00 $300.00 $1,200.00 740.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 §$1,000.00 000.00 200.00 .00 $381.50 $1,526.00 § $710.00 2.840.00
20b 16" Plug Valve (ADD #3 - 11/17/08) 1] EA $0.00 _$0.00 $1,250.00 $0.00 X $0.00 2,000.00 1,810.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.470.00
21 |Pressure Tap & Gauge 1 EA| $633.18 $633.18 | _$600.00 $600.00 wmmo 00 $350.00 $200.00 $200.00 «Bo 00 $100.00 [$1,500.00 | $1,500.00 $170.00 $170.00 $272.00 $272.00 $880.00 880.00
22 |Double Check Backflow Preventer 1 EA| $1.359.25 $1,359.25 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $120.00 $120.00 _§ $550.00 | $550.00 $700.00 $700.00 §$1.500.00 | $1,500.00 § $400.00 $400.00 $2713.00 | $2713.00 § $640.00 $640.00
Upgrade Service Connection,
23 |Water 1 EA| $863.17 _$863.17 $400.00 $400.00 $3,000.00 | $3.000.00 600.00 $600.00 $1,850.00 | $1.850.00 §$2,000.00 | $2,000.00 § §$1.000.00 $1,000.00 § $2,583.00 | $2583.00 §| $2.000.00 | $2,000.00
Mobilization Not to Exceed (10% of
24 _|Total Bid) 1 LS | $7.028.75 $7.028.75 $7.700.00 $7,700.00 | $10,300.00 | $10,300.00 § $6,000.00 6,000.00 § $5700.00 | $5700.00 §$7.500.00 | $7.500.00 § $9,000.00 $9,000.00 { $4.000.00 | $4,000.00 §$10,300.00 ; $10,300.00
25 | Miscellaneous Work & Clean Up 1 LS | $5798.75 5.798.75 750.00 750.00 3.500.00 3,500.00 § $2.600.00 2,600.00 625.00 25.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 3,700.00 3,700.00 1,200.00 1,200.00 5 850.00 5,850.00
26 |Contingency 1 LS 30.000.00 30,000.00 30.000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00
26a [Contingency: Stone, Shell & Muich cY 25.00 N/A 25.00 0.00 500.00 25.00 .00 55.00 55.00
Upgrade Service Connection,
26b |Water LF | $2500 N/A 27.00 25.00 32.00 35.00 40.00 80.00 48.00
Upgrade Service Connection,
Water $250. 1,000.00 480.00 1,500.00
T "B” PR e $96,684.35 $89,522.50 $117.270.00 $87,734.90 $111,957.50 $113,500.00 § $96,330.00 1 $123,051.10 $112,185.00
Ackni e Addendums 1 thru 4 Yes es Yes s Yes g Yes Yes
Subcontractor Percentage Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes m Yes Yes
The Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes g Yes
Drug Free Work Place Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bonds included No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Site Visit Confirmed ALH Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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08-29060V TABULATION
SATELLITE LIFT STATION REHABILITATION PRIORITY 2
CHAMPION HOMES

DeJonge Excavating J&H Waterstop, Inc. Kimmins Contracting Kuxhausen Construction,] Seavy & Asscciates, inc. W§0_< Contractors, inc. Strickler Brothers, Inc. US Water Services Westra Construction Corp

P.0. Box 743 P.0. Box 741103 1501 Second Avenue P.O. Box 21087 2608 S 86th St. Suite B 8028 33rd St. E. 4176 Canai St. 4938 Cross Bayou Bivd P.0. Box 1148
Venice, FL 34284 Orange City, FL 32774 Tampa, FL 33605 Sarasota, FL 34276-4087| Tampa, FL 33819 Bradenton, FL 34203 Fort Myers, FL 33916  |New Port Richey, FL 34852]  Palmetto, FL 34220
941-485-7799 813.248-3878 941-379-6603 813-363-0862 941.756-4700 239-267-2050 727-848-8292 941-723-1611
EST. UNIT UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY jum] PRICE |EXTENDED ...i_omﬂ PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE pRICE _JuniTpricE] PRICE_JuniTPricE]l PRICE JUNITPRICE] PRICE JUNITPRICE] PRICE JUNIT PRICE] _PRICE
Bid "A" - Based on
Completion Time of
300 Days
1_|Plug Influent Line 1 LS | $250.00 $250.00 $500.00 $500.00 $2.300.00 $2,300.00 NOBID | NOBID $700.00 $700.00 | $500.00 $500.00 | $400.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID $360.00 $360.00
By-Pass Pumping (ADD #3 -
2 _111/17/08) 1 LS |$9,696.00 $9,696.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 NOBID | NOBID ]$14500.00 | $14,500.00 } $13,900.00 | $13,900.00 §$12,000.00 | $12,000.00 f NOBID NOBID | $7.250.00 | $7,260.00
3 |Liner (Repair) - Wet Weli (ADD#2) | 75 | SF | $48.00 $3,600.00 $54.00 $4,050.00 $48.00 $3,800,00 NO BID NO BiD $25.00 $1,.875.00 | $26.00 $1.950.00 | $40.00 $3,000.00 | NOBID NO BID $75.00 $5,625.00
Drain Down & Ciean Wet Well
4_|(ADD#3 - 11/17/08) 1 LS |$1,757.00 $1,757.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 NO BID NOBID | $2,000.00 | $2.000.00 3 $1,350.00 | $1.350.00 | $1,000.00 | $1,00000 | NOBID NOBID | $1,050.00 | $1,050.00
3" PVC (C-200) Drain w/ "P" Trap
5 linchuding (Boring/Grout) 1 LS | $816.00 $816.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1.500.00 $1,500.00 NOBID | NOBID § $5500.00 | $5500.00 | $1,200.00 | $1,200.00 § $350.00 $350.00 NO BID NOBID | $1.450.00 | $1,450.00

Remove Base Ells, Anchors,
Piping, Valves, Bracing Supports,
Magnetic Flow Meters, Etc. 1 LS |$2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2.500.00 $2,500.00 $6,800.00 $6,800.00 NO BID NO BID $3,800.00 | $3.800.00 § $7,500.00 | $7.500.00 | $2500.00 } $2500.00 NO BID NO BID $300.00 $500.00
6" PVC (SCH 80) Stilling Well 1 EA |$1.224.00 $1,224.00 $1,518.00 $1,518.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 NO BID NO BID $725.00 $725.00 ] $1,500.00 ; $1.500.00 ] $700.00 $700.00 NO BID NO BID $1.700.00 | $1.700.00
4" Pump Base Elis & Base Plates
(Grinding/Leveling Base of Grout as

~ O

8 IRequired 2 EA | $2.241.00 $4.482.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 NO BID NO BID $1,700.00 | $3.400.00 | $3,500.00 | $7.000.00 | $1,820.00 | $3.640.00 NO BID NO BID $2,030.00 | $4,080.00
8" HDPE (SDR-11) & Discharge
9c_|Piping System (ADD #2) 1 EA |$5488.00 $5.489.00 2,250.00 2,250.00 8,000.00 __$8,000.00 NO BID OBID | $12,200.00 | $12,200.00 § $1,600.00 1,600.00 | $7,200.00 7,200.00 NO BID NOBID §$11,425.00 | $11,42500
10c 8" Swing Check Valve (ADD #2) 2 EA [$2289.00 $4,578.00 2,000.00 000.00 3,400.00 $6,800.00 NO BID O BID $1,850.00 | $3700.00 2,000.00 $4,000.00 § $1460.00 2,920.00 NO BID NOoBID | $270000 | $5400.00
11b [8" Gate Valve (ADD #2) 3 EA |{$1.073.00 $3,219.00 1.400.00 200.00 1,450.00 $4,350.00 NO BID NO BID $1,250.00 | $3,750.00 1,500.00 54,500.00 | $860.00 2,580.00 NO BiD NO BID $1,400.00 | $4.200.00
Pump Guide Rail System (Per
12 _|Pump) (ADD #2) 2 EA |$1.322.00 $2,644.00 $1,400.00 $2.800.00 $2,400.00 $4,800.00 NO BID NO BID $1.600.00 | $3.200.00 } $160000 | $3.200.00 | $1.560.00 | $3,120.00 NO BID NO BID $2,030.00 | $4,080.00
Pipe Bracing System: Stainiess
13 {Steet 3 EA | $784.00 $2,352.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 NO BID NO BiD $2,000.00 | $6,000.00 | $1.600.00 | $4.800.00 } $1,000.00 | $3000.00 NO BID. NO BID $1,160.00 | $3480.00
14 _|Oi Fittings (ADD #4 - 11/18/08) 1200 ; LB | $8.40 $7,680.00 $3.54 $4,248.00 $7.00 $8,400.00 NO BID NO BID $3.50 $4.200.00 $5.00 $6,000.00 $7.50 _$9,000.00 NO BID NO BID $7.00 $8,400.00
8" PVC W.W. Vent W/Stainless
15 }Steel Screen 1 LS | $874.00 $874.00 $300.00 $300.00 $700.00 $700.00 NO BID NO BID $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 ] $1.000.00 100000 § $500.00 $500.00 NO BID NO BID $1,775.00 | $1.775.00
16c |8" Magnetic Fiow Meter (ADD #2) 1 EA ,435.00 $6,435.00 $6,700.00 $6,700.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 NO BID O BID $7,700.00 | $7.700.00 } $7.000.00 7,000.00 | $7.900.00 | $7,900.00 NO BID NO 81D $7.040.00 | $7,040.00
17_{Underground Conduit (ADD #2) 50 | FT | $10.00 $500.60 $12.00 _$600.00 $24.00 $1,200.00 NO BID O BID $17.25 862.50 $20.00 1,000.00 $16.00 $800.00 NO BID NO BID $18.00 $950.00
18 |8” Quick Connect 1 EA | $333.00 $333.00 $500.00 $500.00 $450.00 $450.00 NO BID NO BID $150.00 $150.00 | $2.000.00 2,000.00 | $440.00 $440.00 NO BID NO BID $340.00 $340.00
Stainless Steel Adjustable Pipe
19 |Support 4 EA | $308.00 $1,232.00 $300.00 1.200.00 $325.00 $1,300.00 NO BID NO BID $250.00 $1,000.00 § $1000.00 | $4.00000 § $200.00 $800.00 NO BID NO BID $710.00 $2,840.00
20c 8" Plug Valve (ADD #3 - 11/17/08} 0 EA | $0.00 _$0.00 $1,500.00 | $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $2,370.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $1.865.00 $0.00
21 |Pressure Tap & Gayl 1 EA | $63400 $634.00 00.00 00.00 $350.00 $350.00 NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100.00 { $1.500.00 | $1500.00 § $170.00 $170.00 NO BID NO BID $880.00 $880.00
22 _|Double Check Backfiow Preventer 1 EA |$1.360.00 $1,360.00 $2,600.00 $2.600.00 $120.00 $120.00 NO BID NO BiD $700.00 $700.00 |} $1.500.00 | $1500.00 | $400.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID $640.00 $640.00
23 _|Relocate Water Service 1 EA | $864.00 $864.00 $400.00 $400.00 $3.400.00 $3.,400.00 NO BID NO BID $1.850.00 | $1.850.00 ] $2,000.00 | $2.000.00 ] $1,000.00 | $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID $2,000.00 | $2,000.00
Mobilization Not to Exceed (10% of
24 iTotal Bid 1 LS 9825610 |  $8256.10 1$780000] $7.80000 | $9.00000 | $8.00000 | | NoBID | NOBID I $570000 | $5700.00 § $7,500.00 | $7,500.00 § $9,000.00 | $9,000.00 NO BID NOBID |$10,300.00 | $10,300.00
25 [Miscellanecus Work & Clean U 1 L 5.798.75 5 798.75 300.00 300.00 3,500.00 $3,500.00 NO BID NO BID 25.00 25.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 NO BID NO BID 850.00 5.850.00
28 |[Contingency 1 L 000.00 30, 000.00 NO BID NO BID .00 30,000.00 30,000.00 NO BID 30,000.00
28a {Contingency: Stone, Sheli & Muich cY 25.00 N/A 25.00 NO BID NOBID | $500.00 25.00 0.00 NO BID 55.00
Contingency: Vinyl Coated 6' Galv.
26b |Chain Link Fence EA $25.00 N/A 27.00 NO BID NQBID $32.00 35.00 0.00 NO BID 48.00

Contingency: Swing Gate, ' For
Viny! Coated Gaiv. Chain Link

i

N/A 1,500.00 NO BID NOBID ] $500.00 1,000.00
$124,570.00 NO BID NO BID 19! .

B xR

106,153.85 $119.500.00 NO BID $121.975.00




08-29060V TABULATION
SATELLITE LIFT STATION REHABILITATION PRIORITY 2
CHAMPION HOMES

DeJonge Excavating J&H Waterstop, Inc. Kimmins Contracting Kuxhausen Construction, | Seavy & Associates, inc. WEE« Contractors, Inc. .m..So.._o_. Brothers, Inc. US Water Seivices Westra Construction Corp
P.O. Box 743 P.O. Box 741103 1501 Second Avenue P.O. Box 21087 2608 S 86th St. Suite B 8028 33rd St. E. 4176 Canal St. 4939 Cross Bayou Blvd N_ P.O. Box 1149
Venice, FL 34284 Orange City, FL 32774 Tampa, FL 33805 Sarasota, FL 34276-4087| Tampa, FL 33619 Bradenton, FL 34203 Fort Myers, FL 33916  |New Port Richey, FL 3465 Palmetto, FL 34220
041-485-7799 813-248-3878 oﬂ.w.\o.m._mow 813-3€ u.ohn 941-756-4700 239-267-2050 vuq.mem.FwN 941-723-1611
EST. UNIT UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
{TEM! DESCRIPTION QTY fuM] PRICE [|EXTENDED PRICE] PRICE PRICE UNIT _um_OIm PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
Bid "B" - Based on
Completion Time of
240 Days
1 |Plug Influent Line 1 LS | $250.00 $250.00 $500.00 $500.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $6,200.00 | $6.200.00 $700.00 $700.00 $500.00 $500.00 $400.00 $400.00 $2,096.00 $2,096.00 $360.00 $360.00
By-Pass Pumping (ADD #3 -
2 {11/17/08) 1 LS |$9,696.00 $9,696.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $8,100.00 | $8,100.00 }$14.500.00 | $14.500.00 1$13,900.00 | $13,900.00 J$12,000.00 | $12,000.00 | $15,239.00 $15.239.00 § $7.250.00 $7,250.00
3 _|Liner (Repair) - Wet Weli (ADD #2) 75 SF | $48.00 $3.600.00 $54.00 $4,050.00 $48.00 $3.600.00 $2.00 $150.00 $25.00 $1,875.00 $26.00 $1.950.00 $40.00 $3.000.00 $33.00 $2.475.00 $75.00 $5,625.00
Drain Down & Clean Wet Waeil
4 (ADD#3 - 11/17/08} 1 LS 1$1,757.00 $1,757.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 _$575.00 $575.00 $2.000.00 $2,000.00 § $1,350.00 $1,350.00 ] $1,000.00 $1,000.00 | $3,500.00 $3,500.00 ] $1,050.00 $1,050.00
3" PVC (C-800) Drain w/ “P* Trap
5 _|including (Boring/Grout) 1 LS | $816.00 _$816.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $750.00 $750.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 § $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $350.00 $350.00 $3,336.00 $3,336.00 § $1.450.00 $1,450.00
Remove Base Ells, Anchors,
Piping, Valves, Bracing Supports,
6 __|Magnetic Flow Meters, Etc. 1 LS |$2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $6.800.00 $6,800.00 $2,300.00 | $2300.00 ] $3,800.00 $3,800.00 | $7.500.00 $7.500.00 § $2 500.00 $2,500.00 | $4,505.00 $4,505.00 $900.00 $800.00
7__i8" PVC (SCH 80) Stiling Well 1 EA |$1.224.00 $1.224.00 $1,518.00 $1,518.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,130.00 | $1.130.00 $725.00 $725.00 $1.500.00 $1,500.00 $700.00 $700.00 $3,491.00 $3,491.00 | $1.700.00 $1,700.00
4" Pump Base Elis & Base Plates
(Gringing/Leveling Base of Grout as
8 |Required) 2 EA |$2,241.00 $4,482.00 $1.500.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $1,800.00 | $3:600.00 1 $1.700.00 $3,400.00 ] $3,500.00 $7.000.00 } $1.820.00 $3,840.00 1 $4,256.00 $8.512.00 3 $2,030.00 $4,060.00
8" HDPE (SDR-11) & Discharge
9c_|Piping System (ADD #2) 1 EA | $5,469.00 $5.469.00 2,250.00 2,250.00 8,000.00 $8,000.00 | $6,200.00 | $6,200.00 ]$12200.00 | $12,200.00 1.600.00 1.600.00 | $7,200.00 7.200.00 8,310.00 $6,310.00 ] $11,425.00 | $11.425.00
10c _|8" Swing Check Valve (ADD #2) 2 EA 1$2,289.00 $4.578.00 2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,400.00 $6.800.00 1,800.00 | $3,600.00 | $1,850.00 $3,700.00 2,000.00 54.000.00 | $1.460.00 2,920.00 1,845.50 $3,691.00 ! $2,700.00 $5,400.00
11b {8" Gate Valve (ADD #2) 3 EA | $1,073.00 $3,219.00 1,400.00 54,200.00 $1,450.00 $4,350.00 $1,120.00 | $3.360.00 | $1.250.00 $3,750.00 1.500.00 54,500.00 $860.00 ,580.00 1,270.00 $3,810.00 | $1.400.00 $4,200.00
Pump Guide Rail System (Per
12 _|Pump) (ADD #2) 2 EA [$1.322.00 $2.644.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $2,400.00 $4,800.00 $1,350.00 | $2.700.00 § $1,600.00 $3,200.00 ¥ $1,800.00 $3.200.00 1 $1,560.00 $3,120.00 | $2,845.50 $5,691.00 § $2030.00 $4.060.00
Pipe Bracing System: Stainless
13 |Steel 3 EA | $784.00 $2,352.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $1,200.00 | $3600.00 § $2.000.00 | $8,000.00 ¥ $1,600.00 $4.800.00 | $1.000.00 $3,000.00 { $1,840.00 $5,520.00 1 $1160.00 $3,480.00
14 |Di Fittings (ADD #4 - 11/18/08) 1200 | LB $6.40 $7,680.00 $3.54 $4.248.00 $7.00 $8,400.00 | _$0.01 $12.00 $3.50 $4,200.00 $5.00 _$6,000.00 $7.50 $9.000.00 $5.50 $6,800.00 $7.00 400.00
8" PVC W.W. Vent W/Stainiess
15 Steel Screen 1 LS | $874.00 $874.00 $300.00 $300.00 $700.00 $700.00 $675.00 $675.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 | $1,000.00 1,000.00 $500.00 500.00 | $857.00 $857.00 $1,775.00 $1,775.00
16¢_|8" Magnetic Flow Meter (ADD #2) 1 EA | $6435.00 $6.435.00 $6.700.00 $6,700.00 $10,000.00 $10.000.00 $7,600.00 { $7.600.00 F $7,700.00 $7.700.00 } $7,000.00 7.000.00 3 $7,900.00 $7,900.00 } $9.941.00 $8,941.00 | $7,040.00 $7,040.00
17 _|Underground Conduit (ADD #2) 50 FT | $10.00 $500.00 $12.00 $600.00 $24.00 $1.200.00 $6.00 $300.00 _$17.25 $862.50 $20.00 1,000.00 $18.00 $800.00 $13.70 $685.00 $19.00 $950.00
18 16" Quick Connect 1 EA | $333.00 $333.00 500.00 $500.00 $450.00 $450.00 $500.00 $500.00 $150.00 $150.00 $2,000.00 2,000.00 $440.00 $440.00 $1.547.00 $1,547.00 $340.00 $340.00
Stainless Steel Adjustable Pipe
19 |Support 4 EA | $308.00 $1,232.00 $300.00 1.200.00 $325.00 $1,300.00 $185.00 $740.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 § $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $200.00 _$800.00 $381.50 $1,526.00 $710.00 $2,840.00
20c 18" Plug Valve (ADD #3 - 11/17/08) 0 EA | $0.00 $0.00 1,500.00 0.00 $0.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,000.00 . $0.00 $2,370.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,665.00 $0.00
21_|Pressure Tap & Gau 1 EA | $634.00 _$634.00 $600.00 $600.00 $350.00 $350.00 $200.00 $200.00 $100.00 $100.00 $1,500.00 § $1,500.00 $170.00 $170.00 $272.00 $272.00 $880.00 $880.00
22 |Double Check Backflow Preventer 1 EA |$1,360.00 $1,360.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $120.00 $120.00 $550.00 _$550.00 $700.00 $700.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $400.00 $400.00 $2,713.00 $2,713.00 $640.00 $640.00
23 IRelocate Water Service 1 EA | $864.00 $884.00 $400.00 $400.00 3,400.00 3,400.00 500.00 | _$500.00 $1.850.00 $1,850.00 ] $2,000.00 $2,000.00 § $1,000.00 $1,000.00 |} $2583.00 $2.583.00 | $2,000.00 $2,000.00
Mobilization Not to Exceed (10% of
24 [Total Bid) 1 L 8256101  $8.256.10 ) $7,800.00 | 7,800.00 000.00 000.00 5,700.00 $5,700.00 7,500.00 $7.500.00 ] $9.000.00 9,000.00 | $4000.00 000.00 10,300.00 | $10,300.00
25 |Miscellanecus Work & Clean Up 1 L 5.798.75 5.798.75 300.00 300.00 3 .00 X 2.500.00 2,500.00 25.00 25.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 3.500.00 $00.00 1,200.00 1,200.00 5,850.00 5,850.00
26 |Contingency 1 LS 30.000.00 30.000.00 30.000.00 30,000.00 30.000.00 30.000.00 0,000.00 30.000.00 000.00
268a |Contingency: Stone, Sheli & Mulch cY 25.00 N/A 25.00 0.00 500.00 25.00 .00 55.00 55.00
Contingency: Vinyl Coated &' Galy.
26b |Chain Link Fence EA | $2500 N/A 27.00 25.00 2.00 35.00 0.00 80.00 48.00
Contingency: Swing Gate, 6' For
Vinyl Coated Gaiv. Chain Link
Fence 1,500.00
F TOTAL BID "B" PRICE 108,153.85 1,016.00 11 .00 $61,842.00 $119,500.00 $105,920.00 $130,100.00: $121,875.00
Acknowledge ndums 1 thru es Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes : Yes
Subcontractor Percentage Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
The Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting and
Environmental Crimes Centification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bonds Inciuded Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Site Visit Confirmed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

KEYED m,sm ﬁw{ /wm/

7
\ \ ;
£ p
cHeckepsy_{ L. T A
. e




08-29060V TABULATION
SATELLITE LIFT STATION REHABILITATION PRIORITY 2

MARINELAND
DeJonge E: ating Ct J&H p, inc. Kimmins C ing Kuxh [ i Seavy & A ] inc. Stately C , Inc, i , Inc. US Water Services Westra Construction Corp
P.O. Box 743 P.O. Box 741103 1501 Second Avenue P.O. Box 21087 2608 S 86th St. Suite B 8028 33rd St. E. 4176 Canal St. 4938 Cross Bayou Blvd P.O. Box 1149
Venice, FL 34284 Orange City, FL 32774 Tampa, FL 33605 Sarasota, FL 34276-4087 Tampa, FL 33619 Bradenton, FL 34203 Fort Myers, FL 33918 New Port Richey, FL 34652 Paimetto, FL 34220
£41-485-7799 813-248-3878 941-379-6803 §13-363-0862 941-756-4700 239-267-2050 727-848-8292 941-723-1611
EST. EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED ﬁacmo EXTENDED llgzomo EXTENDED =me,_. ENDED
[TEM! DESCRIPTION QTY C;I; UNIT PRICE vw_lolm PRICE PRICE _ux.oim PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
Bid "A" - Based on
Completion Time of
300 Days
1 ]Plug Influent Line 1 LS | _$200.00 $200.00 500.00 $500.00 $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 NO BID NO BID $700.00 $700.00 $500.00 _$600.00 $400.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID $360.00 $360.00
By-Pass Pumping (ADD #3 -
2 111/17/08) 1 LS ! $10,166.00 $10,166.00 $4.200.00 $4,200.00 400.00 | $5400.00 NO BID NO BID $14,500.00 | $14,500.00 J $11,630.00 $11.630.00 | $12,000.00 $12,000.00 NO BID NO BiD $7,140.00 $7,140.00
3 |Liner (Repair) - Wet Well (ADD #2) 75 SF $48.00 $3.600.00 _$54.00 $4,050.00 $49.00 $3675.00 NO BID NO BID $25.00 $1.875.00 $26.00 $1.950.00 $40.00 $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID $75.00 $5.625.00
Drain Down & Clean Wet Well
4 |[(ADD#3 - 11/17/08) 1 LS | $1,757.00 $1,757.00 $3.000.00 $3,000.00 $4,000.00 | $4,000.00 NO BID NO BID $2,000.00 $2,000.00 § $1,350.00 $1,350.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BiD $1.050.00 $1,060.00
3" PVC (C-900) Drain w/ "P" Trap
5 _|including (Boring/Grout! 1 LS 816.00 $816.00 $1,500.00 $1.500.00 $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 NQ BID NOBID ] $5500.00 $5,500.00 ] $1,200.00 $1.,200.00 $350.00 $350.00 NO BID NO BID $1.450.00 $1,450.00
Remove Base Ells, Anchors, Piping,
Valves, Bracing Supports, Magnetic
©__|Flow Meters, Etc. 1 LS | $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $6.000.00 | $6,000.00 NO BID NO BID $3.800.00 $3,800.00 § $7.500.00 $7,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID $900.00 $900.00
7 _|6" PVC (SCH 80) Stilling Well 1 EA | $1.22400 $1,224.00 $1.518.00 $1.518.00 $1,400.00 | $1.400.00 NO BID NOBID $725.00 $725.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $700.00 $700.0 NO BID NO BiD $1,520.00 $1,520.00
4" Pump Base Ells & Base Plates
(Grinding/Leveling Base of Grout as
8__Required 2 EA 2,235.00 $4,470.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 | $5,000.00 NQ BID NO BID $1.700.00 $3.400.00 ] $3,500.00 $7.000.00 $1,820.00 $3.640.00 NO BID NO BID $1.85000 $3,700.00
4" HDPE (SDR-11) & Discharge
9a |Piping System (ADD #2) 1 . $3.613.00 3,613.00 $4.000.00 $4,000.00 $5.400.00 | $5.400.00 NO BID NO BID $9.500.00 $9,500.00 1,600.00 1,600.00 $4.050.00 $4,050.00 NO BID NO BID $9.100.00 $9.100.00
4" Swing Check Valve (ADD #2) 2 . $1.449.00 2,808.00 500.00 3,000.00 $2,000.00 | $4.000.00 NO BID NO BID $1,800.00 $3.600.00 2,000.00 §4.000.00 $820.00 1,640.00 NO BID NO BID $1.620.00 $3.240.00
11a 14" Gate Valve (ADD #2) 3 EA | $530.00 1.590.00 000.00 3,000.00 $1.140.00 | $3.420.00 NO BID NO BID $1,200.00 $3,600.00 1,500.00 b4,500,00 $440.00 1,320.00 NO BID NO BID $1.260.00 $3.780.00
Pump Guide Rail System (Per
12 |Pump) (ADD #2) 2 EA | $1,322.00 $2.644.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $240000 | $4,800.00 NO BID NO BID $1.600.00 $3,200.00 ) $1.600.00 $3,200.00 $2,420.00 $4,840.00 NO BID NO BID $2,780.00 $5.560.00
Pipe Bracing System: Stainless
13 |Steel (ADD #2) 4 EA | $78400 $3,136.00 $750.00 $3.000.00 $1.230.00 | $4.820.00 NO BID NO BID $2,000.00 $8,000.00 1,600.00 $6.400.00 1,000.00 $4,000.00 NO BID NO BiD $1,160.00 $4.640 00
14 _|DI Fittings (ADD #4 - 11/18/08) 367 | LB $8.50 $3,119.50 $6.15 $2,257.05 $10.00 $3,670.00 NO BID NO BID $3.00 $1,101.00 $10.00 $3.670.00 $8.00 $2,936.00 NO BID NO BID $7.00 $2,569.00
8" PVC W.W. Vent W/Stainless
15 |Steel Screen 1 LS |  $874.00 _$87400 $300.00 $300.00 $700.00 $700.00 NO BID O BID $1,500.00 $1,500.00 | $1,000.00 1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 NO BID NO BID $1,775.00 $1.775.00
16a |4" Magnetic Flow Meter 1 EA | $4608.00 $4,608.00 | $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8.900.00 | $8.800.00 NO BID QO BID $7.200.00 $7.200.00 ] $7,000.00 7,000.00 | $6,940.00 $6.840.00 NO BID NO BID $5.040.00 $5,040.00
17_|Underground Conduit (ADD #2) 50 FT $10.00 $500.00 $12.00 $600.00 $26.00 $1.300.00 NO BID O BID $17.25 862.50 $20.00 1,000.00 $18.00 $800.00 NO BID NO BID $19.00 $950.00
18 _m.. Quick Connect 1 EA | $333.00 $333.00 $500.00 $500.00 $450.00 $450.00 NO BID O BID $150.00 $150.00 $2,000.00 2,000.00 $270.00 $270.00 NO BID NO BID $340.00 $340.00
Stainless Steel Adjustable Pipe
19 {Support 4 EA $308.00 $1.232.00 $300.00 $300.00 $1.200.00 NO BID NO BID $250.00 $1.000.00 § $1,000.00 000.00 200,00 00.00 710.00 2,840.00
20a |4" Plug Valve (ADD #3 - 11/17/08) s] EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NOBID. NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $2,000.00 1.650.00 1,165.00
21 1 EA | $634.00 $634.00 . X $350.00 $350.00 NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $170.00 $170.00 $880.00 $880.00
22 _{Double Check Backflow Preventer 1 EA | $2.223.00 $2,223.00 $2.,600.00 $2.600.00 $135.00 $135.00, NO BID NOBID $700.00 $700.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $400.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID $650.00 $650.00
tion Not to Exceed (10% of
24 |Total Bid) 1 LS | $86400 864 .00 7.000.00 $7.000.00 9,000.00 ; $9.000.00 NO BID NOBID { $5700.00 $5.700.00 J $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $9.000.00 $9,000.00 NO BID NO BID $10,300.00 | $10,300.00
25 3.000.00 3.700.00 5,580.00
26 q
263 |Contingency: Stone, Shell & Muich | _$2500 | | $40.00 |
Contingency: Viny! Coated 8' Galv. a E
26b |Chain Link Fence b %
Contingency: Swing Gate, 8 Ft. for
Vinyl Coated Galv. Chain Link
Fence $250. $1,000.00 $400.00
OTAL BID "A” PRICE i X $111,020.00




08-29060V TABULATION
SATELLITE LIFT STATION REHABILITATION PRIORITY 2

DeJonge Excavating Contractors J&H Waterstop, inc. Kimmins Contracting | Kuxhausen Construction, | Seavy & Associatas, Inc. Statety Ci Inc. Brothers, Inc. clw Water Services Woestra Construction Corp
P.O.Box 743 P.O. Box 741103 1501 Second Avenue P.0. Box 21087 2608 S 86th St. Suite B 6028 33rd St. E. 4176 Canal St 4939 Cross Bayou Bivd P.O. Box 1148
Venice, FL 34284 Orange City, FL 32774 Tarnpa, FL 33605 Sarasota, FL 34276-4087 Tampa, FL 33819 Bradenton, FL 34203 Fort Myers, FL 33818 New Port Richey, FL 34652 Palmetto, FL 34220
841-485-7798 wﬁm;?guw cﬁ.w.\é Ew.uow'mc.mln 941-756-4700 238-267-2050 727-848-8282 941-723-1811
EST. EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
|TEM DESCRIPTION QTY | U/M JUNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
e 3 LR SRR SRR SRR RNRAR: S
Bid “"B" - Based on
Completion Time of
240 Days
1 [Plug influent Line 1 Ls $200.00 $200.00 $500.00 $500.00 $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 £00.00 ) $5.600.00 $700.00 $700.00 $500.00 $500.00 $400.00 $400.00 $2.096.00 $2,096.00 $360.00 $360.00
By-Pass Pumping (ADD #3 -
2 _111/47/08) 1 LS | $10,168.00 $10,166.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 5,400.00 | $5400.00 §$8,100.00 | $8,100.00 | $14,500.00 | $14,500.00 ] $11.630.00 $11,630.00_ } $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $15239.00 | $15239.00 § $7,140.00 $7.140.00
3 |Liner (Repair) - Wet Well (ADD #2) 75 SE $48.00 $3,600.00 $54.00 $4.050.00 $49.00 $3.675.00 $2.00 $150.00 $25.00 $1.875.00 $26.00 _$1,950.00 $40.00 $3,000.00 $33.00 $2.475.00 $75.00 $5.625.00
Drain Down & Clean Wat Wail
4 |[(ADD#3- 11/17/08) 1 LS | $1,757.00 $1,757.00 $3,000,00 | _ $3,000.00 $4,000.00 | $4000.00 | $575.00 $575.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 § $1.350.00 $1.350.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3.500.00 $3.500.00 | $1,050.00 $1,050.00
3" PVC (C-900) Drain w/ "P" Trap
5 |including (Boring/Grout 1 LS $816.00 $816.00 $1,500.00 $1.500.00 $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 | $750.00 $750.00 $5,500.00 $5500.00 ] $1.200.00 $1,200.00 $350.00 $350.00 $3,336.00 $3,336.00 § $1.450.00 $1,450.00
Remove Base Eils, Anchors, Piping,
Valves, Bracing Supports, Magnetic
8__|Flow Meters, Etc. 1 LS | $2,100.00 $2.100.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $6.000.00 | $6,000.00 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 ] $3,800.00 $3,800.00_ ] $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,405.00 $4,405.00 $900.00 $900.00
7 16" PVC {SCH 80) Stilling Wett 1 EA | $1.224.00 $1,224.00 $1,518.00 $1.518.00 $1.400.00 | $1.400.00 §$1.130.00 | $1,130.00 $725.00 $725.00 $1.500.00 $1.500.00 $700.00 $700.00 | $3491.00 $3.491.00 ]$15200.00 | $1,520.00
4" Pump Base Elis & Base Plates
(Grinding/Leveling Base of Grout as
8 {Required) 2 EA | $2,235.00 $4,470.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 | $5.000.00 | $1.800.00 | $3.600.00 | $1,700.00 $3.400.00 | $3,500.00 $7.000.00 | $1.820.00 $3.640.00 $4.077.50 $8,155.00 ] $1.850.00 | $3.700.00
4" HDPE (SDR-11) & Discharge
9a {Piping System (ADD #2) 1 A | $3613.00 3,613.00 $4.000.00 $4,000.00 5.400.00 | $5.400.00 | $4,000.00 }4,000.00 | $9.500.00 $9,500.00 1,600.00 1.600.00 $4,050.00 $4.050.00 $6,144.00 $5,144.00 | $9,100.00 $9.100.00
10a [4" Swing Check Valve (ADD #2) 2 A | $1.44900 2,898.00 1,500.00 3,000.00 $2000.00 { $4.000.00 J$1025.00 2,050.00 | $1.80000 $3.600.00 2,000.00 $4,000.00 $820.00 1,640.00 $1.512.00 $3,024.00 | $1620.00 $3,240.00
11a_|4" Gate Valve (ADD #2) 3 A | $530.00 1,580.00 1,000.00 3,000.00 $1,140.00 | $3.420.00 } $72500 2,175.00 § $1,200.00 $3,600.00 1,500.00 54,500.00 $440.00 1,320.00 $1.071.70 $3.215.10 ] $126000 $3.780.00
Pump Guide Rail System (Per
12_|Purnp) (ADD #2) 2 EA | $1,322.00 $2,644.00 $1.400.00 $2,800.00 $2.400.00 | $4.800.00 §$2.100.00 | $4.200.00 § $1.600.00 $3,200.00_§ $1600.00 $3.200.00 $2,420.060 $4,840.00 $2.876.50 $5,953.00 | $2.780.00 $5,560.00
Pipe Bracing System: Stainless
13 |Steel (ADD #2) 4 EA | $784.00 $3,136.00 $750.00 $3.000.00 $1.230.00 | $492000 J$1200.00 | $4,800.00 | $2,000.00 $8,000.00 | $1.600.00 $6.400.00 1,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,707.30 $6,828.20 | $1.160.00 $4.640.00
14_]| DI Fittings (ADD #4 - 11/18/08; 387 LB $8.50 $3,119.50 $6.15 $2.257.05 $10.00 $3.670.00 $0.01 $3.67 $3.00 $1,101.00 $10.00 $3.670.00 $8.00 $2,936.00 $5.10 $1.871.70 $7.00 $2,569.00
8" PVC W.W. Vent W/Stainless
15 |Steet Screen 1 LS $874.00 $874.00 $300.00 $300.00 $700.00 $700.00 $675.00 $675.00 $1,500.00 $1.500.00 § $1,000.00 1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $857.00 $857.00 $1.775.00 $1.775.00
16a 14" Magnetic Flow Meter 1 EA | $4.69800 $4,698.00 $86,000.00 $6,000.00 $8.900.00 | $8900.00 J$6.700.00 | $6,700.00 § $7.200.00 $7.200.00 | $7.000.00 7.000.00 | $6.940.00 $6,940.00 $9.941.00 $9,941.00 | $5040.00 $5,040.00
17 _{Underground Conduit (ADD #2) 50 FT $10.00 $500.00 $12.00 $600.00 $26.00 $1,300.00 $6.00 $300.00 $17.25 $862.50 $20.00 1,000.00 $16.00 $800.00 $43.70 $685.00 $19.00 $950.00
18 16" Quick Connect 1 EA $333.00 $333.00 $500.00 500.00 $450.00 $450.00 $300.00 $300. $150.00 $150.00 $2,000.00 2,000.00 $270.00 $270.00 $1.547.00 $1,547.00 $340.00 $340.00
i Stainless Steel Adjustable Pipe
19 Support 4 EA | $308.00 $1,232.00 $300.00 $1,200.00 ] $185.00 740.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 200.00 800.00 381.50 $1,526.00 710.00 2.840.00
20a i4" Piug Valve (ADD #3 - 11/17/08) 0 EA $0.00 $0.00 500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,750.00 $0.00 $0.00 . X $0.00 $0.00
21 |Pressure Tap & Gauge 1 1 EA] $63400 $634.00 $600.00 $600.00 $350.00 $350.00 | $200.00 $200.00 $100.00 $100.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 $170.00 $170.00 $272.00 $272.00 $880.00 $880.00
22 Double Check Backflow Preventer 1 EA | $2.22300 $2,223.00 $2,600.00 $2.600.00 $135.00 $135.00 $550.00 $550.00 $700.00 $700.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $400.00 $400.00 $2.713.00 $2.713.00 $650.00 50.00
Mobilization Not to Exceed (10% of
24 |Total Bid) 1 LS | $7.742.00 $7.742.00 $7,000.00 $7.000.00 9.000.00 | $8,000.00 §$6,000.00 | $6,000.00 ] $5.700.00 $5.700.00 ] $7.500.00 $7.500.00 ] $9.000.00 $9.000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 § $10,300.00 | $10,300.00
25 |Misceltaneous Work & Clean Ui 1 LS | $5788.75 5.798.75 750.00 $750.00 3.500.00 | $3.500.00 {$2.500.00 2,500, 5.00 25.00 3.000.00 3,000.00 3,700.00 3,700.00 1.200.00 1,200.00 5 580.00 5,580.00
26 _|Continge: 1 LS 30.000.00 30.000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00 30.000. 30, 30.000.00 0. 000.00
26a |Contingency: Stone, Shell & Muich CY 25,00 25.00 0.00 500.00 25.00 0.00 5.00 55.00
Contingency: Viny! Coated §' Galv.
26b |Chain Link Fence LF 25,00 27.00 25.00 32.00 35.00 40.00 80.00 8.00
Contingency: Swing Gate, 6 Ft. for
Vinyl Coated Galv. Chain Link
Fence EA 250.00 00.00 $450.00
TOTAL BID "B" PRICE ouu.uolubmh. . $110.475.00k ,989.00
Acknowledge Addendums 1 thru 4 Yes Yes : Yes
Subcontractor Percentage Yes. Yes Yes
The Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Cerification Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting and
Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bonds Included Yes Yes Yes
e Visit Confirmed - bog SRRt Yes Yes Yes
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