MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT
INTENT TO AWARD

Whitfield Country Club
IFB NO. /TITLE | Cights Water Main DATE POSTED MC——r | DS
Replacement
# 6109570
PROCUREMENT Leslie Peer PROJECTED June 6. 2023
REPRESENTATIVE Procurement Agent lll AWARD DATE ’
Jacob Erickson, MBA’ Digitally signed by Jacob Erickson,
DEPARTMENT/DIVISION Public Works AUTHOR'ZEDDA?: CPPO, NIGP-CPP  Date: 095,042 0803145 0410

Jacob Erickson, Purchasing Official

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with C-Squared Certified
General Contractor, Inc. for the provision of Whitfield Country Club Heights Water Main Replacement.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26.

BACKGROUND/EVALUATION

The Scope of Work consists of the replacement of mains, including replacement of mains due to excessive service
breaks, fire hydrant assembly as well as 8", 6" and 4" gate valve services.

The solicitation was advertised on February 23, 2023 on the Manatee County website and DemandStar. It was also
provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast
Builders Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members and in the Bradenton
Herald and Tempo News newspapers. Responses were received from the following firms:

1. C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc.
Sarasota, Florida

2. Woodruff & Sons, Bradenton, Florida

3. ET Mackenzie of Florida, Bradenton, Florida

EVALUATION SUMMARY:

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc. was the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s). A bid tabulation of the
results is attached to this Notice of Intent to Award.

RECOMMENDATION
The Procurement Division and the Public Works Department recommend award to C-Squared Certified General
Contractor, Inc..

ATTACHMENTS Bid Tabulation COST 51,763,351.37
(List in order of attached)

Intent to Award (Rev. 10-25-22)



BID PRICING FORM

PROJECT NAME: Whitfield Country Club Heights Water Main Replacement

IFBC No. 23-TA004588LP

COUNTY PROJECT No. 6109570

C-Squared Certified General

Woodruff & Sons, Inc.

E.T. MacKenzie of Floride,

Contractors, Inc. Inc.
EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED |(EXTENDED| EXTENDED |EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
DESCRIPTION BID A 240 BID B 180 BID A 240 BID B 180 BID A 240 BID B 180
CALENDAR CALENDAR CALENDAR |CALENDAR| CALENDAR |CALENDAR
DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS
Total Construction Cost $1,763,351.37 $1,763,351.37 | $1,979,272.21 NO BID $2,006,249.30 NO BID




Manatee County BCC

BID PRICING FORM

PROJECT NAME: Whitfield Country Club Heights Water Main Replacement

IFBC No. 23-TA004588LP
COUNTY PROJECT No. 6109570

'WATER LINES 8-INCH & UNDER

C-Squared Certified General Contractors, Inc.

‘Woodruff & Sons, Inc.

E.T. MacKenzie of Floride, Inc.

UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE [ EXTENDED |UNIT PRICE| EXTENDE | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED |UNIT PRICE| EXTENDE
BID A 240 PRICE BID B 180 PRICE BID A 240 PRICE BID B 180 D PRICE BID A 240 PRICE BID B 180 D PRICE
ITEM QTY [ CALENDAR BID A CALENDAR BID B CALENDAR BID A CALENDAR| BID B CALENDAR BID A CALENDAR| BID B
NO. DESCRIPTION um DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS

1 Pavement Repair & Road Restoration
1.01 Curb Repl LF| 9 99.5 $8,955.00 99.5 $8,955.00 106.39 $9,575.10|NO BID NO BID 78 $7,020.00| NO BID NO BID
1.02 Road Pavement Base SY | 130 240.00 $31,200.00 240.00 $31,200.00 66.56 $8,652.80|NO BID NO BID 186.00 $24,180.00] NO BID NO BID
1.03 Road Pavement Asphalt SY | 299 68.00 $20,332.00 68.00 $20,332.00 65.41 $19,557.59|NO BID NO BID 119.00 $35,581.00f NO BID NO BID
1.04 Mill & Overlay SY | 2103 46.10 $96,948.30 46.10 $96,948.30 44.07 $92,679.21 [NO BID NO BID 65.00 $136,695.00f NO BID NO BID
2 Sidewalk Repl conc. (4" min. thick.) SY | 30 144.00 $4,320.00 144.00 $4,320.00 192.07 $5,762.10|NO BID NO BID 164.00 $4,920.00| NO BID NO BID
B Driveway Restoration NO BID NO BID
3.01 Concrete (6" min. thick.) SY | 698 108.50 $75,733.00 108.50 $75,733.00 236.49 $165,070.02|NO BID NO BID 197.00 $137,506.00] NO BID NO BID
3.02 Asphalt (6" min. thick.) SY| 15 500.00 $7,500.00 500.00 $7,500.00 655.65 $9,834.75|NO BID NO BID 735.00 $11,025.00f NO BID NO BID
4 Sodding SY | 3587 4.75 $17,038.25 4.75 $17,038.25 8.14 $29,198.18[NO BID NO BID 8.00 $28,696.00/ NO BID NO BID
S Grout Fill Abandoned Pipe CY| 5 1381.00 $6,905.00 1381.00 $6,905.00 3588.78 $17,943.90/NO BID NO BID 20750.00 $103,750.00f NO BID NO BID
6 2" Blow-off Assembly EA| 3 3475.00 $10,425.00 3475.00 $10,425.00 8505.18 $25,515.54|NO BID NO BID 11285.00 $33,855.00/ NO BID NO BID
7 Backflow Prevention Assemblies (BPA)
7.01 DC BPA, 3/4" EA[ 16 2600.00 $41,600.00 2600.00 $41,600.00 1786.58 $28,585.28|NO BID NO BID 5835.00 $93,360.00f NO BID NO BID
7.02 RPZ BPA, 3/4" EA| 21 2300.00 $48,300.00 2300.00 $48,300.00 1784.30 $37.470.30[NO BID NO BID 5580.00 $117,180.00f NO BID NO BID
8 Permitting Fees- Building Dept- BPA Installation EA| 4 300.00 $1,200.00 300.00 $1,200.00 265.81 $1,063.24|NO BID NO BID 48.00 $192.00 NO BID NO BID
9 Remove Ex. Items
9.01 2" Valve EA| 3 975.00 $2,925.00 975.00 $2.925.00 1036.39 $3,109.17|NO BID NO BID 329.00 $987.00| NO BID NO BID
9.02 3" Valve EA| 4 1000.00 $4,000.00 1000.00 $4,000.00 1023.62 $4,094.48|NO BID NO BID 329.00 $1,316.00| NOBID NO BID
9.03 6" Valve EA| 1 1500.00 $1,500.00 1500.00 $1,500.00 1427.71 $1,427.71|NO BID NO BID 329.00 $329.00 NO BID NO BID
9.04 Fire Hydrant Assembly EA| 2 1200.00 $2,400.00 1200.00 $2,400.00 2507.97 $5,015.94|NO BID NO BID 658.00 $1,316.00| NOBID NO BID
10 Pipe
10.01 PVC (C-900), 3" LF| 10 292.50 $2,925.00 292.50 $2,925.00 298.55 $2,985.50|NO BID NO BID 116.00 $1,160.00| NO BID NO BID
10.02 PVC (C-900), 4" LF | 651 91.00 $59,241.00 91.00 $59,241.00 162.98 $106,099.98NO BID NO BID 92.00 $59,892.00f NO BID NO BID
10.03 PVC (C-900), 6" LF | 1715 91.75 $157,351.25 91.75 $157,351.25 171.08 $293.402.20 [NO BID NO BID 106.00 $181,790.00f NO BID NO BID
10.04 PVC (C-900), 8" LF| 45 291.00 $13,095.00 291.00 $13,095.00 209.64 $9,433.80|NO BID NO BID 342.00 $15,390.00f NO BID NO BID
10.04.1  |PVC (C-900). 6" SDR-26" LF | 360 330.00 $118,800.00 330.00 $118,800.00 188.20 $67,752.00|NO BID NO BID 182.00 $65,520.00f NO BID NO BID
10.05 DIP (Class 350), 4" LF | 162 151.75 $24,583.50 151.75 $24,583.50 209.28 $33,903.36/NO BID NO BID 162.00 $26,244.00/ NO BID NO BID
10.06 DIP (Class 350), 6" LF | 258 135.00 $34,830.00 135.00 $34,830.00 191.00 $49,278.00|NO BID NO BID 137.00 $35,346.00/ NO BID NO BID
10.07 PE (DR-9), 2" LF | 489 53.50 $26,161.50 53.50 $26,161.50 144.56 $70,689.84|NO BID NO BID 75.00 $36,675.00/ NO BID NO BID
10.08 HDPE (DR-11), 4" LF| 83 450.00 $37,350.00 450.00 $37,350.00 166.03 $13,780.49|NO BID NO BID 90.00 $7,470.00| NO BID NO BID
11 Water Services
11.01 1" PE Single Service (Short) EA| 21 1950.00 $40,950.00 1950.00 $40,950.00 2236.44 $46,965.24|NO BID NO BID 1700.00 $35,700.00f NO BID NO BID
11.02 1" PE Single Service (Long), w/ 2" Casing EA| 11 4325.00 $47,575.00f  4325.00 $47,575.00]  4540.90 $49,949.90|NO BID NO BID 5675.00 $62,425.00/ NO BID NO BID
11.03 1" PE Double Service (Short) EA| 8 2275.00 $18,200.00 2275.00 $18,200.00 2659.92 $21,279.36|NO BID NO BID 2795.00 $22,360.00f NO BID NO BID
11.04 1" PE Double Service (Long), w/ 2" Casing EA| 5 5050.00 $25,250.00 5050.00 $25,250.00]  4581.70 $22,908.50[NO BID NO BID 6870.00 $34,350.00/ NO BID NO BID
11.05 Additional 1" Service Pipe over 10' Short and 30'Ld LF | 185 105.00 $19,425.00 105.00 $19,425.00 134.17 $24,821.45|NO BID NO BID 26.00 $4,810.00{ NO BID NO BID
12 New Meter Box EA| 1 450.00 $450.00 450.00 $450.00 809.50 $809.50{NO BID NO BID 1160.00 $1,160.00| NO BID NO BID
13 DI Fittings Fittings
13.01 2" 22.5 Degree Bend EA| 1 550.00 $550.00 550.00 $550.00 806.04 $806.04[NO BID NO BID 868.00 $868.00| NO BID NO BID
13.02 3" 45 Degree Bend EA| 2 575.00 $1,150.00 575.00 $1,150.00 483.78 $967.56|NO BID NO BID 844.00 $1,688.00) NO BID NO BID
13.03 4" Plug x 2" Compression Fitting EA| 4 575.00 $2,300.00 575.00 $2,300.00 62831 $2,513.24|NO BID NO BID 511.00 $2,044.00| NOBID NO BID
13.04 4" Plug x 3" Compression Fitting EA| 1 650.00 $650.00 650.00 $650.00 899.35 $899.35[NO BID NO BID 1255.00 $1,255.00] NOBID NO BID

IFBC 23-TA004588LP




Manatee County BCC

UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE [ EXTENDED |UNIT PRICE| EXTENDE | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED |UNIT PRICE| EXTENDE
BID A 240 PRICE BID B 180 PRICE BID A 240 PRICE BID B 180 D PRICE BID A 240 PRICE BID B 180 D PRICE
ITEM QTY [ CALENDAR BID A CALENDAR BID B CALENDAR BID A CALENDAR| BIDB | CALENDAR BID A CALENDAR| BID B
NO. DESCRIPTION um DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS DAYS

13.05 6" Tee EA| 2 850.00 $1,700.00 850.00 $1,700.00]  2100.90 $4,201.80|NO BID NO BID 1030.00 $2,060.00| NO BID NO BID
13.06 4" 11.25 Degree Bend EA| 2 650.00 $1,300.00 650.00 $1,300.00 587.36 $1,174.72|NO BID NO BID 632.00 $1,264.00| NO BID NO BID
13.07 4" 45 Degree Bend EA| 3 450.00 $1,350.00 450.00 $1,350.00 568.90 $1,706.70|NO BID NO BID 641.00 $1,923.00] NOBID NO BID
13.08 6" 45 Degree Bend EA| 16 500.00 $8,000.00 500.00 $8,000.00 753.33 $12,053.28NO BID NO BID 758.00 $12,128.00) NO BID NO BID
13.08.1 6" Bend PVC EA| 48 160.00 $7,680.00 160.00 $7,680.00 268.29 $12,877.92[NO BID NO BID 1130.00 $54,240.00)  NO BID NO BID
13.09 6" x 3" Reducer EA| 1 475.00 $475.00 475.00 $475.00]  5509.57 $5,509.57|NO BID NO BID 1315.00 $1,315.00] NOBID NO BID
13.10 6" x 4" Reducer EA| 2 500.00 $1,000.00 500.00 $1,000.00 667.00 $1,334.00|NO BID NO BID 685.00 $1,370.00| NOBID NO BID
13.11 8" Tee (Cut-In) EA| 3 6150.00 $18,450.00f  6150.00 $18,450.00]  10825.64 $32.,476.92[NO BID NO BID 11595.00 $34,785.00) NO BID NO BID
13.12 8" Cross (Cut-In) EA| 1 6500.00 $6,500.00]  6500.00 $6,500.00]  15078.54 $15,078.54|NO BID NO BID 10820.00 $10,820.00) NO BID NO BID
13.13 8" x 4" Reducer EA| 2 575.00 $1,150.00 575.00 $1,150.00 767.82 $1,535.64|NO BID NO BID 770.00 $1,540.00| NO BID NO BID
13.14 8" x 6" Reducer EA| 3 625.00 $1,875.00 625.00 $1,875.00 769.36 $2,308.08|NO BID NO BID 811.00 $2,433.00| NO BID NO BID
14 Pipe Joint Restraints
14.01 4" EA| 12 250.00 $3,000.00 250.00 $3,000.00 498.22 $5,978.64|NO BID NO BID 317.00 $3,804.00| NOBID NO BID
14.02 6" EA| 52 300.00 $15,600.00 300.00 $15,600.00 638.29 $33,191.08|NO BID NO BID 374.00 $19,448.00) NO BID NO BID
15 HDPE MJ Pipe Adapter
15.01 2" EA| 3 275.00 $825.00 275.00 $825.00 817.43 $2,452.29|NO BID NO BID 150.00 $450.00] NO BID NO BID
15.02 4" EA| 1 1075.00 $1,075.00 1075.00 $1,075.00]  2390.55 $2,390.55|NO BID NO BID 358.00 $358.00] NOBID NO BID
16 Valves
16.01 Gate Valve, 4" EA| 3 3675.00 $11,025.00f  3675.00 $11,025.00]  2673.10 $8,019.30|NO BID NO BID 2495.00 $7,485.00| NO BID NO BID
16.02 Gate Valve, 6" EA| 8 4175.00 $33,400.00f  4175.00 $33,400.00]  3047.15 $24,377.20[NO BID NO BID 2865.00 $22,920.00) NO BID NO BID
16.03 Gate Valve (Cut-In), 8" EA| 8 8300.00 $66,400.00f  8300.00 $66,400.00] 1270230 $101,618.40/NO BID NO BID 4710.00 $37,680.00f NO BID NO BID
17 Fire Hydrant Assembly EA| 5 9700.00 $48,500.00f  9700.00 $48,500.00]  10489.30 $52,446.50[NO BID NO BID 12005.00 $60,025.00)  NO BID NO BID
18 Remove & Reinstall Mailbox EA| 31 450.00 $13,950.00 450.00 $13,950.00 819.98 $25,419.38|NO BID NO BID 279.00 $8,649.00| NO BID NO BID
19 New Mailbox EA| 10 700.00 $7,000.00 700.00 $7,000.00 983.37 $9,833.70|NO BID NO BID 409.00 $4,090.00| NOBID NO BID
20 Thermoplastic Striping, Double Yellow 6" LF| 45 60.00 $2,700.00 60.00 $2,700.00 36.40 $1,638.00|NO BID NO BID 57.00 $2,565.00| NO BID NO BID
21 Inlet Protection EA| 14 500.00 $7,000.00 500.00 $7,000.00 614.39 $8,601.46|NO BID NO BID 111.00 $1,554.00| NOBID NO BID
22 Silt Fence LF | 842 7.45 $6,272.90 7.45 $6,272.90 10.48 $8,824.16|NO BID NO BID 3.50 $2,947.00| NO BID NO BID
23 Erosion Control LS| 1 15200.00 $15,200.00  15200.00 $15,200.00]  4460.62 $4,460.62|NO BID NO BID 34855.00 $34,855.00) NO BID NO BID
24 Traffic Control LS| 1 75000.00 $75,000.00f  75000.00 $75,000.00]  7636.10 $7,636.10|NO BID NO BID 54975.00 $54,975.00) NO BID NO BID
25 Mobilization LS| 1 220000 $220,000.00 220000 $220,000.00] 106383.49 $106,383.49|NO BID NO BID 95600 $95,600.00)  NO BID NO BID
26 Record Drawings LS| 1 14500 $14,500.00 14500 $14,500.00]  22009.71 $22,009.71 [NO BID NO BID 8525 $8,525.00| NO BID NO BID

SubTotal Construction Cost $1,603,046.70 $1,603,046.70 $1,799,338.37 NO BID $1,823,863.00 NO BID

CONSTRUCTION CONTINGENCY COUNTY

AUTHORIZED USE ONLY (10% OF SUBTOTAL
27 PRICE) EA | 10% $160,304.67 $160,304.67 $179,933.84 NO BID 182386.3 NO BID

Total Construction Cost $1,763,351.37 $1,763,351.37 $1,979,272.21 NO BID $2,006,249.30 NO BID

IFBC 23-TA004588LP




	Bid Tabulation.pdf
	Summary
	Const Cost


		2023-04-20T08:03:45-0400
	Jacob Erickson, MBA, CPPO, NIGP-CPP




