700,000 gallons)
|Transport, unleaded
Markup/gallon
ransportation/gallon

100,000 gallons)

Tank Wagon, unleaded

Markup/gallon
ransportation/gallon

900,000 gallons)

Transport, diesel

Markup/gallon
ransportation/gallon

150,000 gallons)

Tank Wagon, diesel
Markup/gallon
[Transportation/gallon

Gasoline and Diesel Fuel ,
— . E———— Ia —— — , =  — ———
DA
BV OIL % GREAT LAKES JH WILLIAMS _ LYKINS MANSFIELD OIL || PALMDALE OIL|| PETROLEUM RKA
PETROLEUM COMPANIES COMPANY COMPANY TRADERS PETROLEUM
ARCADIA, FL CLEVELAND, OH BRADENTON, FL NAPLES, FL GAINESVILLE, GA FT. PIERCE, FL FT. WAYNE, IN ROMULUS, M1
S 0.0380 || S 0.0300 || S 0.0150 i S 0.0250 | (50.0001)f S 0.0263 | S 0.0064 0.1394
$ 0.0010 |

{5 __ 00106

0.1000
0.0130

.m... —

0025005

_0.0400]5

$
| B
s
0.0400 || 5
S 0.0950 | NO BID ? S
S 0.0250 NO BID 7 S

0000035

0.2180 | $
S

0.2180 7
0.0000 |

wvr

0.0263
0.1740

NO BID
NO BID

el

0.3408

0.1603

0.3578
0.0000




