

# MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT INTENT TO AWARD

|   |  |
|---|--|
| <b>SUBJECT</b> Maintenance of Traffic                       | <b>DATE POSTED</b> MC <u>10/22/14</u><br>CC <u>38</u>                            |
| <b>PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE</b> Donna M. Stevens ext. 3045 | <b>DATE CONTRACT SHALL BE AWARDED</b> Seven days from date posted                |
| <b>DEPARTMENT</b> Utilities Department                      | <b>CONSEQUENCES IF DEFERRED</b> Inefficiency in acquiring MOT                    |
| <b>SOLICITATION</b> RFQ #14-2791-DS                         | <b>AUTHORIZED BY DATE</b> Donna M. Stevens <u>DMStevens</u><br><u>10/22</u> 2014 |

### NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Notice of Intent to Award, Request for Quote # 14-2791-DS, Maintenance of Traffic to the lowest, responsive and responsible quoter, Bob' Barricades located at 921 Shotgun Road, Sunrise, FL 33326 for a total base quote of \$10,245.01.

### ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.

Manatee County Code of Law

### BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

It is the intent of Manatee County (County) to purchase on an "as required" basis, a turnkey service for Maintenance of Traffic (MOT) on road closures, whether scheduled or emergency at various locations within the County. It is the specific purpose of this quote to establish an annual Blanket Purchase Order. The Successful Quoter shall provide all labor, equipment, materials, and services inclusive of a traffic control plan, for the Maintenance of Traffic as specified by the Manatee County Utilities Department in accordance with all pertinent regulations and specifications. Manatee County reserves the right to add to or delete items.

Successful Quoter must comply with the most current version of the Work Traffic Control Handbook (W.A.T.C.H), the Florida Department of Transportation Procedure 625-010-010-h, paragraph 4.3 and the Manual of Uniform Traffic Control Devices (M.U.T.C.D.). The MUTCD is published by the Federal Highway Administration (FHWA) under 23 Code of Federal Regulations (CFR), Part 655, Subpart F.

Appropriate quote procedures were followed. Notice of Quote availability advertised on mymanatee.org and the Manatee Chamber of Commerce. Notice of Quote for viewing electronically transmitted to 5 Contractors.

Four (4) quotes were received.

|   |             |
|---|-------------|
| Bob's Barricade                           | \$10,245.01 |
| Traffic Control Products of Florida, Inc. | \$23,565.90 |
| Acme Barricades, LC                       | \$16,458.00 |
| Road Safe Traffic Systems, Inc.           | \$20,323.30 |

|   |   |
|---|---|
| <b>ATTACHMENTS</b><br>(List in order of attached)   | <b>FUNDING SOURCE</b><br>(Acct Number & Name)   |
| Quote Tabulation                                    | Various accounts<br><input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Funds Verified<br><input type="checkbox"/> Insufficient Funds |
| <b>COST</b> Approx. annual expenditure<br>\$ 36,000 | <b>AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING COSTS</b> (Attach Fiscal Impact Statement)<br>Blanket Purchase Order with a two year term.   |

**QUOTE TABULATION**  
**RFQ #14-2791-DS**  
**MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC**

|     |                |  |          |                    | Bob's Barricades<br>921 Shotgun Road<br>Sunrise, FL 33326 |                  | Traffic Control Products of<br>Florida, Inc.<br>5514 Cormack Road<br>Tampa FL 33610 |                  | Acme Barricades, LC<br>9800 Normandy Blvd<br>Jacksonville, FL 32221 |                  | Road Safe Traffic Systems,<br>Inc.<br>1365 NE 119th Street Miami,<br>FL 33160 |                  |
|-----|----------------|--|----------|--------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|
| No. | FDOT<br>NUMBER | ITEM DESCRIPTION   | QUANTITY | UNIT OF<br>MEASURE | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT PRICE  | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST |
| 1.  | 102-74-1       | Work Zone Signs  | 1        | Daily              | \$10.00   | \$10.00          | \$2.25  | \$2.25           | \$2.00  | \$2.00           | \$1.00  | \$1.00           |
| 2.  |                | Type III/w- Light  | 1        | Daily              | \$10.00   | \$10.00          | \$2.25  | \$2.25           | \$2.00  | \$2.00           | \$0.50  | \$0.50           |
| 3.  | 102-74-2       | Barricade (Temporary) Types I,<br>II, VP, Cones (LCD not Included) | 1        | Daily              | \$10.00   | \$10.00          | \$0.50  | \$0.50           | \$1.00  | \$1.00           | \$0.35  | \$0.35           |
| 4.  |                | Stop/Slow Paddle   | 1        | Daily              | \$10.00   | \$10.00          | \$2.25  | \$2.25           | \$2.00  | \$2.00           | \$0.50  | \$0.50           |
| 5.  |                | Attenuator/Crash Truck   | 1        | Daily              | \$450.00  | \$450.00         | \$850.00  | \$850.00         | \$700.00  | \$700.00         | \$950.00  | \$950.00         |
| 6.  |                | Solar Arrow Board  | 1        | Daily              | \$25.00   | \$25.00          | \$30.00   | \$30.00          | \$25.00   | \$25.00          | \$25.00   | \$25.00          |
| 7.  |                | Solar Variable Message Board                                       | 1        | Daily              | \$35.00   | \$35.00          | \$50.00   | \$50.00          | \$30.00   | \$30.00          | \$45.00   | \$45.00          |
| 8.  | 102-76         | Barricade (Temporary Type III)                                     |          | Daily              | \$10.00   | \$10.00          | \$2.25  | \$0.00           | \$2.00  | \$2.00           | \$1.00  | \$0.00           |
| 9.  | 102-77         | Panels Arrow Advance Warning                                       | 1        | Daily              | \$40.00   | \$40.00          | \$30.00   | \$30.00          | \$25.00   | \$25.00          | \$25.00   | \$25.00          |
| 10. | 102-79         | High Intensity Flashing Lights<br>(Temp - Type B)                  | 1        | Daily              | \$5.00  | \$5.00           | \$0.10  | \$0.10           | \$1.00  | \$1.00           | \$0.45  | \$0.45           |

**QUOTE TABULATION**  
**RFQ #14-2791-DS**  
**MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC**

|     |                |   |          |                    | Bob's Barricades<br>921 Shotgun Road<br>Sunrise, FL 33326 |                  | Traffic Control Products of<br>Florida, Inc.<br>5514 Cormack Road<br>Tampa FL 33610 |                  | Acme Barricades, LC<br>9800 Normandy Blvd<br>Jacksonville, FL 32221 |                  | Road Safe Traffic Systems,<br>Inc.<br>1365 NE 119th Street Miami,<br>FL 33160 |                  |
|-----|----------------|---|----------|--------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|
| No. | FDOT<br>NUMBER | ITEM DESCRIPTION                                  | QUANTITY | UNIT OF<br>MEASURE | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT PRICE  | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST |
| 11. | 102-89-7       | Lights Barrier Wall Mount Temp Type C             | 1        | EA                 | \$5.00  | \$5.00           | \$0.05  | \$0.05           | \$1.00  | \$1.00           | \$0.25  | \$0.25           |
| 12. |                | Temporary Crash Cushion, Redirective Option       | 1        | EA                 | \$800.00  | \$800.00         | \$350.00  | \$350.00         | \$1,500.00  | \$1,500.00       | \$2,500.00  | \$2,500.00       |
| 13. |                | Water Barrier Wall (15 Day Minimum)               | 1        | LS                 | \$75.00   | \$75.00          | \$780.00  | \$780.00         | no bid  | no bid           | \$60.00   | \$60.00          |
| 14. |                | Concrete Barrier Wall (15 day minimum)            | 1        | LS                 | \$75.00   | \$75.00          | \$4800<br>(100 LF max)  | \$4,800.00       | no bid  | no bid           | N/A   | N/A              |
| 15. |                | Steady Burn Light for Fencing and or Barrier Wall | 1        | Daily              | \$5.00  | \$5.00           | 0.5<br>(100 LF max)   | \$0.50           | \$1.00  | \$1.00           | \$0.25  | \$0.25           |
| 16. |                | Installation of Barrier Wall                      | 1        | EA                 | \$100.00  | \$100.00         | \$3,500.00  | \$3,500.00       | no bid  | no bid           | N/A   | N/A              |
| 17. |                | Basic Set- up MOT                                 | 1        | EA                 | \$250.00  | \$250.00         | \$440.00  | \$440.00         | \$100.00  | \$100.00         | \$200.00  | \$200.00         |
| 18. |                | Basic Breakdown MOT                               | 1        | EA                 | \$250.00  | \$250.00         | \$180.00  | \$180.00         | \$50.00   | \$50.00          | \$100.00  | \$100.00         |
| 19. |                | Basic Road Closure/Detour Routes Set-up           | 1        | EA                 | \$450.00  | \$450.00         | \$450.00  | \$450.00         | \$200.00  | \$200.00         | \$450.00  | \$450.00         |
| 20. |                | Basic Road Closure/Detour Route Breakdown         | 1        | EA                 | \$250.00  | \$250.00         | \$225.00  | \$225.00         | \$100.00  | \$100.00         | \$100.00  | \$100.00         |

**QUOTE TABULATION**  
**RFQ #14-2791-DS**  
**MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC**

|     |                |   |          |                    | Bob's Barricades<br>921 Shotgun Road<br>Sunrise, FL 33326 |                  | Traffic Control Products of<br>Florida, Inc.<br>5514 Cormack Road<br>Tampa FL 33610 |                  | Acme Barricades, LC<br>9800 Normandy Blvd<br>Jacksonville, FL 32221 |                  | Road Safe Traffic Systems,<br>Inc.<br>1365 NE 119th Street Miami,<br>FL 33160 |                  |
|-----|----------------|---|----------|--------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|
| No. | FDOT<br>NUMBER | ITEM DESCRIPTION  | QUANTITY | UNIT OF<br>MEASURE | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT PRICE  | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST |
| 21. |                | Delivery/Pick-up MOT  | 1        | EA                 | \$150.00  | \$150.00         | \$220.00  | \$220.00         | \$100.00  | \$100.00         | \$100.00  | \$100.00         |
| 22. |                | Mobilization Post Mount Sign  | 1        | EA                 | \$45.00   | \$45.00          | \$220.00  | \$220.00         | \$75.00   | \$75.00          | \$65.00   | \$65.00          |
| 23. | 102-99         | Changeable Variable Message Sign Based on 1-15 Day Rental                                     | 1        | Daily              | \$300.00  | \$300.00         | \$50.00   | \$50.00          | \$30.00   | \$30.00          | \$45.00   | \$45.00          |
| 24. |                | Changeable Variable Message Sign Based on 30 Day Rental                                       | 30       | Daily              | \$18.00   | \$540.00         | \$17.00   | \$510.00         | \$30.00   | \$900.00         | \$40.00   | \$1,200.00       |
| 25. |                | Changeable Variable Message Sign Based on 45 Day Rental                                       | 45       | Daily              | \$17.00   | \$765.00         | \$17.00   | \$765.00         | \$30.00   | \$1,350.00       | \$35.00   | \$1,575.00       |
| 26. |                | Changeable Variable Message Sign Based on 60 Day Rental                                       | 60       | Daily              | \$15.00   | \$900.00         | \$15.00   | \$900.00         | \$30.00   | \$1,800.00       | \$30.00   | \$1,800.00       |
| 27. |                | Changeable Variable Message Sign Based on 75 Day Rental                                       | 75       | Daily              | \$15.00   | \$1,125.00       | \$15.00   | \$1,125.00       | \$30.00   | \$2,250.00       | \$28.00   | \$2,100.00       |
| 28. |                | Truck Mounted Attenuator with Operator Portal-Portal 4 hr min.                                | 1        | HOUR               | \$65.00   | \$65.00          | \$95.00   | \$95.00          | \$100.00  | \$100.00         | \$450.00  | \$450.00         |
| 29. | Flag Op.       | Total 3 technicians includes delivery/set up/ 8 hours on site/mobilization and demobilization | 3        | LS                 |   | \$1,080.00       |   | \$1,290.00       | \$1,000.00  | \$3,000.00       | \$900.00  | \$2,700.00       |
| 30. |                | Light Tower   | 1        | EA                 | \$100.00  | \$100.00         | \$48.00   | \$48.00          | \$125.00  | \$125.00         | \$150.00  | \$150.00         |

**QUOTE TABULATION**

**RFQ #14-2791-DS**

**MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC**

|     |                |  |          | Bob's Barricades<br>921 Shotgun Road<br>Sunrise, FL 33326 |               |                  | Traffic Control Products of<br>Florida, Inc.<br>5514 Cormack Road<br>Tampa FL 33610 |                  |               | Acme Barricades, LC<br>9800 Normandy Blvd<br>Jacksonville, FL 32221 |               |                  | Road Safe Traffic Systems,<br>Inc.<br>1365 NE 119th Street Miami,<br>FL 33160 |
|-----|----------------|--|----------|---|---------------|------------------|---|------------------|---------------|---|---------------|------------------|---|
| No. | FDOT<br>NUMBER | ITEM DESCRIPTION   | QUANTITY | UNIT OF<br>MEASURE  | UNIT<br>PRICE | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT PRICE  | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE | EXTENDED<br>COST  | UNIT<br>PRICE | EXTENDED<br>COST |   |
| 31. | Lane Closure   | Single lane closure per 1613 inclusive of initial delivery along with set up/demobilization (pickup along with devices per (not on Interstate) | 1        | LS  | \$450.00      | \$450.00         | \$850.00  | \$850.00         | \$425.00      | \$425.00  | \$350.00      | \$350.00         |   |
| 32. |                | Daily Rate for line # 31 devices (min. 3 hrs)  | 1        | DAILY   | \$75.00       | \$75.00          | \$100.00  | \$100.00         | \$100.00      | \$100.00  | \$50.00       | \$50.00          |   |
| 33. |                | FDOT Information Sign 4" x 6" Standard MUTCD only Temporary Stands   | 1        | F & I   | \$20.00       | \$20.00          | \$100.00  | \$100.00         | \$400.00      | \$400.00  | \$400.00      | \$400.00         |   |
| 34. |                | FDOT Information Sign 4" x 6" Standard MUTCD only Post Mount Stands  | 1        | F & I   | \$20.00       | \$20.00          | \$690.00  | \$690.00         | \$600.00      | \$600.00  | \$500.00      | \$500.00         |   |
| 35. |                | FDOT Information Sign 5" x 10" Standard MUTCD only Temporary Stands  | 1        | F & I   | \$20.00       | \$20.00          | \$1,250.00  | \$1,250.00       | \$500.00      | \$500.00  | \$700.00      | \$700.00         |   |
| 36. |                | FDOT Information Sign 5" x 10" Standard MUTCD only Post Mount Stands   | 1        | F & I   | \$20.00       | \$20.00          | \$1,250.00  | \$1,250.00       | \$950.00      | \$950.00  | \$1,200.00    | \$1,200.00       |   |
| 37. |                | MOT Plans (ATSSA-Certified)  | 1        | Page  | \$150.00      | \$150.00         | \$250.00  | \$250.00         | \$200.00      | \$200.00  | \$250.00      | \$250.00         |   |
| 38. |                | MOT Plans (Engineer-Certified)   | 1        | Page  | \$500.00      | \$500.00         | \$750.00  | \$750.00         | \$500.00      | \$500.00  | \$1,000.00    | \$1,000.00       |   |
| 39. |                | Delivery/pickup each way   | 0-50     | Miles   | \$150.00      | \$150.00         | \$180.00  | \$180.00         | \$1.00        | \$50.00   | \$100.00      | \$100.00         |   |
| 40. |                | Delivery/pickup each way   | 51-99    | Miles   | \$200.00      | \$200.00         | \$225.00  | \$225.00         | \$1.00        | \$51.00   | \$200.00      | \$200.00         |   |

**QUOTE TABULATION**  
**RFQ #14-2791-DS**  
**MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC**

|  |                |   |          |                    | Bob's Barricades<br>921 Shotgun Road<br>Sunrise, FL 33326 |                  | Traffic Control Products of<br>Florida, Inc.<br>5514 Cormack Road<br>Tampa FL 33610 |                  | Acme Barricades, LC<br>9800 Normandy Blvd<br>Jacksonville, FL 32221 |                  | Road Safe Traffic Systems,<br>Inc.<br>1365 NE 119th Street Miami,<br>FL 33160 |                  |
|--|----------------|---|----------|--------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|---|------------------|
| No.  | FDOT<br>NUMBER | ITEM DESCRIPTION                                | QUANTITY | UNIT OF<br>MEASURE | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT PRICE  | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST | UNIT<br>PRICE   | EXTENDED<br>COST |
| 41.  |                | Delivery/pickup each way                        | 100      | Miles              | \$0.01  | \$0.01           |   | \$375.00         | \$1.00  | \$100.00         |   | \$250.00         |
| 42.  |                | Certified Flagger - 6 HR Minimum<br>per Flagger | 1        | EA                 | \$350.00  | \$350.00         | \$260.00  | \$260.00         | \$35.00   | \$35.00          | \$250.00  | \$250.00         |
| 43.  |                | MOT Assistant- On Site 6 Hr min                 | 1        | EA                 | \$270.00  | \$270.00         | \$295.00  | \$295.00         | \$25.00   | \$25.00          | \$280.00  | \$280.00         |
| 44.  |                | Work Zone Traffic Control<br>Supervisor         | 1        | HOUR               | \$85.00   | \$85.00          | \$75.00   | \$75.00          | \$50.00   | \$50.00          | \$150.00  | \$150.00         |
| <b>TOTAL CONTRACT AWARD for MAINTENANCE OF<br/>TRAFFIC</b>       |                |   |          |                    |   | \$10,245.01      |   | \$23,565.90      |   | \$16,458.00      |   | \$20,323.30      |
| <b>Acknowledged Addendum # 1</b>                                 |                |   |          |                    |   | Yes              |   | Yes              |   | Yes              |   | Yes              |
| <b>Affidavit as to Local Business</b>                            |                |   |          |                    |   |                  |   | Yes              |   |                  | Yes<br>(Tampa<br>location)  |                  |
| <b>Public Contracting and Environmental Crimes Certification</b> |                |   |          |                    |   | Yes              |   | Yes              |   | Yes              |   | Yes              |