Financial Management Dept
Purchasing Division Phone: 941.749.3014

oo " MANATEE COUNTY s mymnates org

FLORIDA
To: All Bidders
From: Olga Valcich, Construction Buyer
Date: May 20, 2009

Subject: Revised Tabulation — IFB 09-0897-OV — Replacement Pumps for Lift Stations

Bidders:

Attached please find the revised tabulation dated May 20, 2009 for IFB 09-0897-OV which was opened on April
7, 2009.

The tabulation is being reissued as we had inadvertently omitted Technical Sales Corporation, Tampa, FL.
Please accept our apologies for the error. Should you have any questions, please contact me at 941-708-7527.

We thank you for your continued interest in the Manatee County bidding process.

Cc: Sal Bordonaro, Project Manager
Jim Marble, Utilities Superintendent

LARRY BUSTLE * DR. GWENDOLYN Y. BROWN * JOHN R. CHAPPIE * RON GETMAN * DONNA G. HAYES * CAROL WHITMORE * JOE MCCLASH
District 1 District 2 District 3 Dustrict 4 District 5 District 6 District 7



REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V BID TABULATION

BARNEY'S PUMPS,
INC. HYDROMATIC

BARNEY'S PUMPS,

COAST PUMP &

CUSTOM PUMPS &

GODWIN PUMPS OF

**GRIFFIN PUMP &

ABS USA PUMPS INC. HOMA PUMPS SUPPLY CO. CONTROLS, INC. AMERICA, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC***
SANFORD, FL LAKELAND, FL LAKELAND, FL VENICE, FL TAMPA, FL BRIDGEPORT, NJ HOUSTON, TX
(800) 323-1731 (863) 665-8500 (863) 665-8500 (941) 484-3738 (813) 886-6255 (856) 467-3636 (713) 671-7000
EST EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT [EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY_ | UM | UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
1 pumping 600 GPM @ 32' T D H for #12 2 ea $3,995 00 $7,990 00| $2,194 00 $4,38800| $2,134 00 $4,268 00| $2,389 56 $4.779 12| $1,841.00 $3,68200{ NO BID NO BID|_$4,261.00 $6.522.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
2 pumping 320 GPM @ 43' T.D.H for #14 2 ea $2,866 00 $5.732 00] $1,736 00 $3,472.00} $1,766.00] $3,532 00| $2,389.56 $4.779 12 $1,84100 $3,682.00{ NO BID NO BID| $4,261.00 $8,522.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
3 pumping 275 GPM @ 35' T.D.H. for #6 2 ea $2,394 00 $4,788 00| $1,662.00 $3,364 00| $1,679 00 $3,358.00| $2,240.00 $4,480.00 $1,752.00 $3,504 00| _NO BID NO BID| $3,985 00 $7,970.00
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
4 pumping 800 GPM @ 35' T.D.H. for #7 2 ea $3.990 00 $7,980.00| $3,648.00 $7.296 00| $3,993.00 $7,986.00| $4,79158 $9,583.16| $3,577.00 $7,154 00] _NO BID! NO 81D| $5.270.00 $10,540.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
5 pumping 250 GPM @ 48' T.D H. for 14-D 2 ea $2,866.00 $5.732.00f $1,736.00 $3.472.00| $1,766 00 $3,532 00| $§2,389 56 $4,779.12| $1,839.00 $3,678.00] NO BID! NO BID| $4,261.00 $8,522.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
) pumping 600 GPM @ 60' T.D.H. for 15-D 2 ea $4,682.00 $9,364.00] $2,465.00 $4,930.00] $2,947.00 $5.894 00] $4,791.57 $9,583.14] _$2,5680.00 $5,160 00] NO BID NO BID| $5.270.00 $10,540.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
7 pumping 200 GPM @ 25°T.D. H. for 16-D 2 ea $3,067 00 $6,134 00] $1,553.00; $3,106 00] $1,203 00 $2,406.00| $2,109.21 $4,218 42f $1,578.00 $3,156.00| NO BID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
8 pumping 275 GPM @ 25' T.D.H. for 1M-A 2 ea $2,167.00 $4,334.00| $1,682.00 $3.364.00 $1,203 00 $2,406 00| $1,898 20 $3.996 40{ $1,578 00 $3,156.00] NO BID. NO BID| $2,357.00 $4,714.00
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
9 pumping 550 GPM @ 41’ T.D.H. for 21-A 2 ea $3,990 00 $7,980.00| $3,648.00 $7,266.00] $3,993 00 $7.986.00| $4,791.57 $9,583 14| $2,343.00 $4,686 00| NOBID NO BID| $8,528.00 $17,056.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
10 |pumping 125 GPM @ 27' T.D. H. for 28-A 2 ea $2,553 00 $5,106 00| $1,553.00 $3,106.00|  $1,203.00 $2,406 00| $2,109 21 $4,218.42| $1,604.00 $3,208.00] NO BID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
11 |pumping 500 GPM @ 45' T.D. H. for 2-D 2 ea $3,995 00 $7,990 00| $2,465.00 $4.930.00] $2,13400 $4,268.00] $2,624.11 $5,248.22| $2,390.00 $4,780.00] NO BID NOBID| $5,270.00 $10,540.00
4" Submersible Sewage pumps capable of
12 |pumping 275 GPM @ 25' T.D. H. for 2-M 2 ea $2,167.001 $4,334.00 $1,682.00, $3.364.00] $1,203 00 $2,406 00{ $1,998 20| $3,996.40] $1,578 00 $3,156.00] NO BID NOBID| $3,985.00 $7,970.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
13 |pumping 180 GPM @ 20' T.D. H. for 3-M 2 ea $2,553.00 $5106.00] $1,553 00 $3,106 00| $1,203.00 $2,406 00 $2,109.21 $4,218.42] $1,418.00 $2.836.00] NO BID NOBID| $2,216.00 $4,432.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
14 |pumping 200 GPM @ 26' T.D H_ for 42-A 2 ea $3,067 00 $6,134 00j $1,563 00 $3,106.00{ $1,203.00 $2,406.00] $1,998 20 $3,996.40{ $1,578 00 $3,156.00) NO BID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4.714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
15 _ |pumping 120 GPM @ 20' T.D.H for 4-D 2 ea $2,553 00 $5,106 00| $1,504 00 $3,00800| $1,203 00 $2,406 00| $2,109 21 $4,218 42| $1,418 00 $2,836.00] NO BID NO BID| $2,216 00 $4.432.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
16 __|pumping 184 GPM @ 46' T.D.H. for 5-D 2 ea $2,866 00 $5.732 00| $1,736.00 $3,472.00| $1,679 00 $3,358.00{ $2,240 00| $4,480.00] $1,726 00 $3,452.00] NO BID NO BID| $3.056.00 $6.112 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabie of
17 __|pumping 280 GPM @ 31'TD H. for 7-A 2 ea $2,917.00) $5,834 00| $1,682 00 $3,364 00| $1,203 00 $2,406 00| $2,122 10, $4,244 20 $1,578 00 $3,156 00| NO BID NO BID| $3,985.00 $7,970 00
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
18 umping 465 GPM @ 42' T.D H. for 7-D 2 ea $3,789 00, $7,578 00| $2,194 00| $4,388.00| $3,348 00 $6,696 00| $4,791 57 $9,583 14| $1,815 00 $3,630 00| NO BID NO BID| $4,261 00 $8,522 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps cabpable of
pumping 150 GPM @ 25' T.D.H. for Airport
19 {Industrial Park 2 ea $2,553 00 $5,106 00| $1,553 00 $3,106 00| $1,203 00 $2,406 00} $1,998 20 $3.996.40| $1,444 00 $2,888 00| NO BID NO BID| _$2,216.00/ $4,432 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 80 GPM @ 15' T.D.H for Bayou
20 ___i{Condominiums 2 ea $2,553 00 $5,106 00| $1,504 00 $3.00800] $1,203 00 $2,406 00| $2,109 21 $4,218.42 $1,318 00 $2,636 00| NO BID NO BID| $1,848.00 $3,696.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 250 GPM @ 64, T.D H. for Bayshore
21__|onthe Lake 2 ea $3.995 00, $7,950 00| _$2,465.00] $4,930 00| $2,512 00 $5.024 00| $2,624 114 $5.248 22| 52,363 00 $4,726 00| NO BID NO BID| $5,270.00 $10,540.00
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V BID TABULATION

**ITT WATER &
HUDSON PUMP & WASTEWATER, **MADER ELECTRIC TAMPA ARMATURE | **TECHNICAL SALES **SOUTHEASTERN
EQUIPMENT FLORIDA LLC MOTORS POWER & PUMPS **PX PUMPS USA, LLC WORKS, INC. CORP. PUMP
LAKELAND, FL APOPKA, FL N FT. MYERS, FL JACKSONVILLE, FL SANFORD, FL RIVERVIEW, FL. TAMPA, FL FORT LAUDERDALE, FL
(863) 665-7867 {407) 880-2900 (239) 731-5455 (904) 356-5881 (407) 936-2570 (813) 621-5661 (813) 876-9256 {954) 583-3303
EST. UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UM PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
1 pumping 600 GPM @ 32' T.D.H. for #12 2 ea | $3,18500 $6,370 00| $5,480 00 $10,960.00) $2,945 65 $5,891 30| $3,566.00 $7.132.00| $3,667 95 $7,335.90| $2,577 00 $5.154 00]  $3,120 00 $6,240 00| $2,571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
2 pumping 320 GPM @ 43' T.D H. for #14 2 ea_| $3,185.00 $6,370.00] $4,845 00 $9.690 00| $2,70978 $5,419 56| $3,280.00 $6,560 00| $3,667 85 $7,335 90| $2,466 00 $4,932.00]_$2,751 00 $5,502.00] $2,571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
3 pumping 275 GPM @ 35’ T.D.H. for #6 2 ea | $1,97500 $3,850 00| _$3,807 00 $7.614 00| $1,134.78 $2,269 56| $1,526 00 $3,052.00] $2,07529 $4,150.58] $2,133.00 $4,266.00]  $2,443.00 $4,886.00] $2,166 91 $4,333.82
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
4 pumping 800 GPM @ 35' T.D.H. for #7 2 ea | $341400 $6,828.00| $8,356 00 $16,712 00| $3,118.48 $6,236.96| $3,775.00 $7,550.00} _$4,807.69 $9.615 38| $4,300 00 $8,600.00]  $4,007 00 $8,014.00{_$2,845 44 $5690.88
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
5 pumping 260 GPM @ 48' T.D H. for 14-D 2 ea | $2,96200 $5,964,00] $4,845.00: $9,690.00| $2,047.83 $4,00566| $2,755.00 $5,510.00| $3.224 31 $6,448.62] $2,466 00 $4,932.00f 2,751 00 $5.502.00 $2,571.84 $5,143 68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
6 pumping 600 GPM @ 60° T.D.H. for 15-D. 2 ea | $3,211.00 $6,422.00| $8,425.00 $16,850 00} $3071.74 $6,143 48| $3718.00 $7.436 00| $6,140.48 $12,280.86| $4,133 00 $8,266.00]  $3,893 00 $7,786.00] $2,57184 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
7 pumping 200 GPM @ 25'T.D. H. for 16-D 2 ea | $1,696 00 $3,392.00] $3,248.00 $6,496 00| $1,080.43 $2.160.86| $1,453 00 32,906 00| $2,075.29 $4,150 58| $1,91100 $3.822.00] $1,953 00 $3,906.00] $2,166.91 $4,333 82
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
8 pumping 275 GPM @ 25' T.O.H. for iM-A 2 ea | $1,69600 $3,392 00| $3,807 00 $7,614 00| $1,080.43 $2,160 86| $1,453 00 $2,906 00| $2.07529 $4,150 58| $2,133.00 $4,266.00]  $2,083 00 $4,166.00 $1,696.32 $3,30264
6" Submersibie Sewage Pumps capable of
9 pumping 550 GPM @ 41' T.D.H. for 21-A 2 ea | $3211.00 $6,422.00| $5,232 00 $10,464 00| $2,992.39 $6,984.78| $3,622 00 $7.24400| 9530888 $10.617.76| $4,300.00 $8,600.00|  $4,007 00 $6,014.00] $2,845.44 $5,690.88
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
10 |pumping 125 GPM @ 27' T.D. H. for 28-A 2 ea | $124900 $2,498.00] $3,113.00 $6,226.00| 396848 $1,936 96| $1,303 00 $2,606 00| $2,07529 $4,150.58| $1,911.00 $3.82200] $1,953.0 $3,906 00| $2,166.91 $4,333.82
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
11 _ {pumping 500 GPM @ 45' T.D. H. for 2-D 2 ea | 3321100 $6,422 00| $5,480.00 $10.960 00} $2,867.39 $5.734 78| $3.471.00 $6,942 00| $3,667 05 $7.33580] $2.577.00 $5.154 00|  $3,120.00 $6,240.00| $2.571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage pumps capable of
12 |pumping 275 GPM @ 25' T.D. H. for 2-M 2 ea | $1,88500 $3,772 00| $3,807.00) $7,614 00| $1,08043 $2,160.86} $1,453 00 $2,906 00| $2,075.29 $4,150.58| $2,133.00 34,266 00]  $2,083.00 $4,166.00| $1,696.32 $3,382.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
13 [pumping 180 GPM @ 20°' T.D. H. for 3-M 2 ea | $1,88600 $3,772 00| $3,673 00| $7.345 00| $1,080 43 $2,160.86] $1.453 00 $2,906.00| $2,07529 $4,150 58| $1,911.00 $3,82200] $2,011 00 $4,022 00| $1,641.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
14 |pumping 200 GPM @ 26' T.D.H. for 42-A 2 ea | $1,69600 $3,392 00| $3,248 00| $6,496 00| $1.080 43 $2,160.85| $1,453.00 $2,906.00| $2.07529 $4,150.58] $1,911.00 $3.82200] $2,01100 $4,022 00| $1,696.32 $3,392.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
15 |pumping 120 GPM @ 20' T.D.H. for 4-D 2 ea | $1.249.00 $2,498.00] $3,113 00 $6,226.00] $1,080 43 $2,160 86| $1,453 00 $2,906.00| $2,075.29 $4,150 58| $3,633 00 $7,266 00| $1.848 00| $3,696.00] $1,641.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
16 pumping 184 GPM @ 46' T.D H. for 5-D 2 ea $1.682 00! $3.364 00| $4,930 GO $9,860 00] $1.08043 $2,160.86) $1,453 00 $2,906 00] $3,224 31 $6,44862] $2.466 00 $4,93200] $2,134 00| $4,268 00f $257184 $5143 68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
17 |pumping 280 GPM @ 31'TD H for 7-A 2 ea | $1,88600 $3,772 00| $3.807 00 $7.614 00{ $1,080 43 $2,16086| $1,453 00 $2,906 00| $2.07529 $4,150 58] $2,133 00 $4,266 00| $2,083 00 $4,166.00| $2,166 91 $4,333 82
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
18  {pumping 465 GPM @ 42’ TD H. for 7-D 2 ea | $2,85400 $5,708 00| $5.232 00 $10,464 00| $2.945 65 $5,891.30| $3,566 00 $7.13200| $5,11583 $10,231 66 $4,300 00 $8,60000]  $4,007 00 $8,014.00| $2,845 44 $5,690 88
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps cabpable of
pumping 150 GPM @ 25' T.D.H for Airport
19 |Industrial Park 2 ea | $1,33900 $2,678 00| $3,113 00 $6,226 00| $1,080 43, $2,160 86| $1,453 00 $2,906 00| $2,07529 $4 150 58] $1.91100 $3.822.00] $2,287 00| $4.574 00| $164160 $3,283 20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 80 GPM @ 15' T D H. for Bayou
20 |Condominiums 2 ea | $1,262.00 $2,524 00 NiA N/A| $1,080 43 $2,160 86| $1,453.00 $2,906 00| $2.07529 $4,150 58| $3,633.00 $7.266 00| _ $1.848 00 $3,696 00| $1,641 60 $3,283 20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 250 GPM @ 64, T.DH for Bayshore
21 |onthe Lake 2 ea | $3,084 00 $6,168 00| $5,480 00 $10,960 00| $2,709 78 35,419 56] $1,453 00 $2,906 00| _$3.667 95 $7,335 90| $2,577 00 $5,154 00  $3,105 00; $6,21000) $1,641 60 $3,283 20
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V

BID TABULATION

BARNEY'S PUMPS,
INC. HYDROMATIC BARNEY'S PUMPS, COAST PUMP & CUSTOM PUMPS & |GODWIN PUMPS OF| **GRIFFIN PUMP &
ABS USA PUMPS INC. HOMA PUMPS SUPPLY CO. CONTROLS, INC. AMERICA, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC.***
SANFORD, FL LAKELAND, FL LAKELAND, FL VENICE, FL TAMPA, FL BRIDGEPORT, NJ HOQUSTON, TX
(800) 323-1731 (863) 665-8500 (863) 665-8500 (941) 484-3738 (813) 886-6255 (856) 467-3636 (713) 671-7000
EST EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED [| UNIT [[EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY. || U/M [|UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 1200 GPM @ 115' T.D.H. for
- Bayshore Yacht Basin (Add.#1 /03/30/09)
22 3 ea $19,933 00 $59,799 00| $10,240 00| $30,720 00] $8.350 00 $25,050 00] $7,005 47 $21,016 41| $5,601.00 $16,803.00] NO BID NO BID| $12,023.00 $36,069.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 150 GPM @ 61' T.D.H. for Doraye
23 _|Villas 2 ea $3,722 00 $7,444 00| $1,736 00 $3.472.00} _$2,400.00 $4,800.00| $2,389 56 $4,779 12| _$2,192 00, $4,384 00| NO BID NOBIO| $527000 $10,540.00
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 800 GPM @110' T.D.H. for El
- Conquistador 1(Add.#1 / 03/30/09)
24 3 ea $19,391 00 $58,173 00 $4,853 00 $14,559.00| $6,527 00 $19,561 00| $6,749.37 $20,248 11| $5,217.60 $16,651.00| NO BID NO BID] $12,023 00 $36.069.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 220 GPM @ 102' T.D.H. for
Foster's Grove - Vortex impeller Pumps
“*25 |(Add. #1/03/30/09) 2 ea $8,188 00 $16,376.00] _$3,928.00 $7,856 00| $3,628 00 $7,256.00| $2.624 10 $5,248 20| $3,920.00 $7.840.00] NOBID NO BID| $7,090 00 $14,180.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 81' T.D.H. for Glenn
26 Lakes 1 2 ea $4,724 00| $9,448 00|  $2,720 00! $5,440 00| $2,947 00 $5,894 00f $2,624 10 $5,248 20 $3,863 00 $7,726.00] NO BID| NOBID] $6,009.00 $12,018.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 105 GPM @ 31' T.D.H. for Glenn
27 _jlLakes2 2 ea $2,640.00 $5,280 00| $1,553.00 $3,106.00| $1,203 00! $2,406 00 $2,109.21 $4,218 42| $1,604 00, $3.20800| NOBID NO BID| $2.357.00 $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 32' T.D.H. for Harbor
28 __|Woods 2 ea $3,067 00 $6,134.00| $1,553 00 $3,106 00| _$1,203.00 $2,406 00| $1.998 20! $3,996 40{ $1,604 00 $3.208.00| NO BID NOBID| $235700 $4,71400
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 140 GPM @ 28' T.D H. for Henson
29 Industrial Park 2 ea $3.067 00| $6,134 00| $1,553 00 $3,106.00] $1,203 00 $2,406 00| $2.109 21 $4,218.42| $1.578.00 $3,156.00] NO BID: NO BID| $2.357.00 $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
3g |Pumping 200GPM@3S'T.DH.forKayRoad| , | o $2,917 00 $5,834 00| $1,682 00 $3,364 00] 1,203 00 $2,406 00| $2,122 10 $4,244 20| $1,604.00 $3.208.00] NOBID NOBID| $398500 797000
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 1427 GPM @59’ T.D.H. for
31 _ |Lakewood Ranch Riverwalk 3 ea $15,980 00 $47,940 00| _ $4,856 00| $13,968.00{ $5,398 00 $16,194 00| $6.612 42 $19,837 26| $4,639 00 $13,917.00] NOBID NO BID| $11.130 00 $33,390 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 200 GPM @ 23' T.D.H. for Manasota
32 Industrial Park 2 ea $2,553.00 $5,106 00| $1,553 00 $3,106.00) $1,203 60 $2,406 00} $1.998 21 $3,996.42) $1.444 00 $2,888 00| NOBID, NOBID] $2.216 00 $4,432 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 38" T.D.H for Mill Creek
33 |2 2 ea $2,167 00 $4,334 00 $1.682 00 $3,364 00} $1,203 00 $2,406 00| $1,998 20. $3,996.40| $1,604 00 $3.20800] NO BID; NOBID| $2,357 00 $4,714 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 46" T.D.H. for Mill Creek
34 |3 2 ea $2,394 00 $4,788 00] $1,682 00 $3,364.00| _$1,679 00 $3,358 00| $2,122 10 $4,244 20| $1,604 00 $3,20800| NOBID NO BID| $3.056 00 $6.112 00,
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 930 GPM @ 101" T.DH for
35 |Missionary Village 2 ea $14,133 00| $28.266.00] $4,382 00 $8,764 00] $4,992 00 $9,984 00] $6.932 51 $13,86502| $4.972 00 $9.944.00| NO BID NO BID| $12,023.00 $24,046 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
36 pumping 315 GPM @ 53' T D H for N7-A 2 ea $3,995 00; $7,990 00| $2,194 00 $4,388 00] $2,134 00 $4,268 00| $2,624 10| $5,248 20{ $2,319 00 $4,638 00) NO BID, NO BID| $5.270 00| $10,540 00
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V BID TABULATION

**ITT WATER &
HUDSON PUMP & WASTEWATER, **MADER ELECTRIC TAMPA ARMATURE | **TECHNICAL SALES **SOUTHEASTERN
EQUIPMENT FLORIDA LLC MOTORS POWER & PUMPS **PX PUMPS USA, LLC WORKS, INC. CORP. PUMP
LAKELAND, FL APOPKA, FL N FT. MYERS, FL. JACKSONVILLE, FL SANFORD, FL RIVERVIEW, FL TAMPA, FL FORT LAUDERDALE, FL
(863) 665-7867 (407) 880-2900 (239) 731-5455 (904) 356-5881 (407) 936-2570 (813) 621-5661 (813) 876-9256 (954) 583-3303
EST. UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY. fUM | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pUMpING 1200 GPM @ 15 1.0 H Tor
22 Bayshore Yacht Basin (Add #1 /03/30/09) 3 ea |$10,488 00 $31,464 00| $22,292.00 $66,876 00| $11.913 04 $35,739.12 $14,421 00 $43,263.00} $14,521 44 $43,564.32] $15,833 00 $47,499 00| $12,721 00 $38,163.00{ $5,860 51 $17,581 53
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 150 GPM @ 61' T.O H. for Doraye
23 _|villas 2 ea | $3,08400 $6,168 00| $5,480 00 $10,960 00| $1,08043 $2,160.86| $1,453 00| $2,906 00| $3,667.95 $7,335 90} $2,577.00 $5.154.00]  $3,120.00 $6,24000] $2,57184 $5,143.68|
6" St sible ge Pumps cap of
pumping 800 GPM @110’ T.D.H. for Et
24 Conquistador 1{Add #1103/30/03) 3 ea | $6,946 00 $20,838 00| $17,837 00 $53,511 00| $12,806 52 $38,419 56 $15,503.00 $46,509 00| $11,937.54 $35,812.62| $15,833 00 $47,499.00| $10,009.001 $30,027.00| $5,855.04 $17,565.12
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 220 GPM @ 102' T.D.H. for
Foster's Grove - Vortex Impeller Pumps
**25 (Add. #1/03/30/09) 2 ea | $4,88100 $9,762 00{ $9.730 00 $19,460.00| $5,896 74 $11,793 48} $7,138 00! $14,276 00| $6,140 48 $12,280 96| $4,450 00 $8,900 00|  $4,000 00 $8,000.00] $3,688.13 $7,376 26
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 81’ T.D H. for Glenn
26 Lakes 1 2 ea $4,550.00 $9,100.00| $9,195.00 $18,390.00] $2,867 00 $5,734.00] $3,471.00 $6,94200] $6,14048 $12,280.96| $4,133 00 $8,266 00|  $4,707 00 $9.414.00| $3,688.13 $7,376.26
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 105 GPM @ 31" T.D.H. for Glenn
27 |lakes?2 2 ea | $1,33900 $2,67800| $3,248.00 $6,496 00|  $968 48 $1,936 96| $1,303 00 $2,606 00{  $2,075 29 $4,150 68| $1,911.00 $3.822 00|  $2,237.00| $4,474.00| $1,641.60 $3,283.20.
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 32' T D H. for Harbor
28 |Woods 2 ea | $1339.00 $2,678 00| $3.248 00 $6,496 00| $1,080 43 $2,16086] $1.453 00| $2,906.00| $2,075.29 $4,150.58| $1,911 00 $3,82200| $2,237 00 $4,47400] $164160 $3,283 20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 140 GPM @ 28' T D H. for Henson
29 Industrial Park 2 ea $1,248 00 $2,496 00{ $3,248.00 $6,496.00] $1,080.43 $2,160 86| $1,453.00 $2,906 00| $2,075 29 $4,150 58] $1,911.00 $3,82200|  $2,011.00 $402200| $1.641.60 $3,283 20.
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
30 |PumPping 200 GPM@ 35 TDH for Kay Road 2 ea | $1,78400 $3,568.00} $3,807 00| $7,614 00| $1,080 43 $2,160.86| _§$1,453 00 $2,906.00] $2,075.29 $4.150 58| $2,133 00 $4,266 00| $2,443.00] $4.886 00| $2,166.91 $4,333.82
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 1427 GPM @59' TD H. for
31 |Lakewood Ranch Riverwalk 3 ea | $6.89500 $20,685 00 $13,765 00 $41,295 00{ $12,184.78 $36,554.34| $14,750.00 $44,250 00| $8,676 11 $26,028.33} $6,425.00 $19,275 00| $10,009.00, $30,027.00| $3,688 13 $11.064.39
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 200 GPM @ 23' T.D H. for Manasota
32 |Industrial Park 2 ea | $1.97500 $3,950.00| $3,113 00| $6,226 00| $1,080 43 $2,160 86| $1,453.00 $2,906 00{ $2,075 29 $4,150 68| $1,911.00| $3,822 00| $2,346 00; $4,602.00| $1,641 60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 38' T.O.H. for Mill Creek
33 |2 2 ea | $1,77200 $3,544 00| $3,113.00 $6,226 00| $868 48, $1,936 96| $1,303 00 $2,606 00} $2,075 29 $4,150 58] $2,133 00| $4,266 00| $2,443.00 $4.886.00| $1,696 32 $3,392.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 46' T D H. for Mill Creek
34 __[3 2 ea | $177200 $3,544 00! NIA N/A| $1,080 43 $2,160 86| $1.453 00 $2,906 00| $2.075.29 $4,150 58} $2,133 00 $4,266 00  $2,443 00 $4,886 00| $2,166 91 $4,333 82
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 830 GPM @ 101" TDH for
35__ |Missionary Village 2 ea | $6.94600 $13,892 00} $16,774 00 $33,548 00| $12,806 52 $25,613 04 $15,503 00 $31,006 00| $11,766 77 $23,533 54| $8,525 00 $17,050 00|  $9,960 00| $19.92000) $5,198 40 $10,396.80
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
36 |pumping 315 GPM @ 53' TD H_for N7-A 2 ea_| $2,98200 $5,964 00] 5,480 00 $10,960 00| $1,130 43 $2,260 86] $1.521 00 $3.04200] $3,667 95 $7,335 90| $2577 00 $5,15400{  $3,120.00 $6,240 00| $2,571 84 $5,143 68
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V

BID TABULATION

BARNEY'S PUMPS,
INC. HYDROMATIC BARNEY'S PUMPS, COAST PUMP & CUSTOM PUMPS & |GODWIN PUMPS OF | **GRIFFIN PUMP &
ABS USA PUMPS INC. HOMA PUMPS SUPPLY CO. CONTROLS, INC. AMERICA, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC.***
SANFORD, FL LAKELAND, FL LAKELAND, FL VENICE, FL TAMPA, FL BRIDGEPORT, NJ HOUSTON, TX
(800) 323-1731 {863) 665-8500 (863) 665-8500 (941) 484-3738 (813) 886-6255 {856) 467-3636 (713) 671-7000
EST EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT [EXTENDED| UNIT [ EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY. || U/M [{UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 28’ T D.H. for Palm Arre
37 |4 2 ea $2.553 00, $5,106.00| _$1,553.00 $3,106.00| $1,203.00 $2,408 00| $2,109 21 $4218 42| $1,57800 $3,15600] NOBID NO BID| $2,216.00 $4,432,00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 210 GPM @ 115' TD.H. for River
Wilderness 3 - Vortex impeller Pumps
**38 |(Add. #1103/30/08 2 ea $8,94 00' $17,898 00| $3,950 00 $7,900 00| $3,628 00 $7,256 00| $5,400 85 $10,801.72] $3,884.001 $7,768.00] NO BID NO BID| $7,090.00 $14,180.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 63' T.D.H. for River
39 |Wilderness 5 2 ea 34,119 00 $8,238.00 $2,465 00 $4,93000] $2,512 00 $5,024.00 $2,624 10 $5,248.20]  $2,390.00! $4,78000| NO BID NOBID| $5,270.00 $10,540.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabie of
pumping 120 GPM @ 37' T.D.H for Riverview
40__|Landings 2 ea $2,167.00 $4,334.00| $1,682.00 $3,364.00] $1,203 00 $2,406.00| $2,122 10, $4,244.20| $1,578 00 $3.156.00) NO BID NO BID| $2,357 00: $4,714 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
41__|pumping 100 GPM @ 35' T.D.H. for S-4 2 ea $3,067 00 $6,13400| $1,682.00 $3,364 00| $1,203 00 $2,406 00| $2,108 21 $4,218.42] $1,578 00 $3,156 00| NO BID NO BID| $2.357.00, $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 240 GPM @ 22’ T.D.H. for San
42 _|Remo 2 ea $2,553 00 $5.106 00| $1,553 00 $3,106 00| $1,203.00 $2,406 00] $2,109 21 $4,218.42| 1,578 00! $3,156.00| NO BID NOBID| $2,357.00 $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 14' T.D.H. for Saunders
43 __|Rd. industrial Park 2 ea $2,553 00 $5,106 00| $1,504.00 $3,008 00| $1,203.00 $2,406 00| $2,109 21 $4,218 42| $1,318 00 $2,636.00] _NO BID NOBID| $1,848.00 $3,696 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 180 GPM @ 27" T.D.H. for Spanish
44 {Park 2 ea $3,067 00: $6,134.00] $1,553.00: $3,106 00| $1,203.00 $2,406 00| $1,998 20 $3.996 40! $1,578 00 $3,156 00| NOBID NO 8ID| $2,357 00 $4,714 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 425 GPM @ 25' T.D.H for State
45 |Road 70 2 ea $2,917 00| $5.834.00f $1,682 00 $3,364 00} $1,203 00 $2,406.00| $2,240 00| $4.480.00] $1,604.00 $3,20800{ NO BID NO BID| $3,985 00 $7,970 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
46 |pumping 400 GPM @ 40’ T.D H. for Tara 6 2 ea $3,995 00, $7.990 00] $2,194 00 $4,388 00| §1.766 00 $3,532 00| $2,389 56 $4779 12| $1.84100 $3.68200[ NOBID NO BID| $4,261 00 $8,522.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 23' T.D.H. for
47 _|Timberlake 2 ea $2,167 00, $4,334 00{ _$1,682.00! $3,364 00} $1.203 00 $2,406 00| $1,998 20 $3,996 40| $1,578 00 $3,156 60| _NO BID NO BID| $2,357 00 $4,714 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 155 GPM @ 26' T.D.H. for Travier's
48 _{Oasis 2 ea $2,553 00 $5,106.00[ $1553 00 $3,106 00| §1,203 00 $2,406 00{ $2,109 21 $4,218 42| $1.604 00 $3,20800] NOBID NO BID| $2,357 00: $4,714 00
TOTAL PRICE: $485,522.00 $241,365 00 $228,249.00 $296,491.40 $225,523.00 NO BID} $451,020.00
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V BID TABULATION

**ITT WATER &
HUDSON PUMP & WASTEWATER, **MADER ELECTRIC TAMPA ARMATURE | **TECHNICAL SALES **SOUTHEASTERN
EQUIPMENT FLORIDA LLC MOTORS POWER & PUMPS **PX PUMPS USA, LLC WORKS, INC. CORP. PUMP
LAKELAND, FL. APOPKA, FL. N FT. MYERS, FL. JACKSONVILLE, FL SANFORD, FL RIVERVIEW, FL TAMPA, FL FORT LAUDERDALE, FL
(863) 665-7867 (407) 880-2900 {239) 731-5455 {904) 356-5881 (407) 936-2570 (813) 621-5661 (813) 876-9256 (954) 583-3303
EST UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY. UM | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 28' T.D H. for Palm Aire
37 |4 2 ea | $1,24900 $2,498.00] _$3,113.00 $6,226.00|  $1,080.43 $2,160 86} $1,453.00 $2,906 00| $2,075.29 $4,150 58] $1,91100 $3,82200| $1,953 00 $3,.906.00| $1,64160 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabie of
pumping 210 GPM @ 115' TD.H. for River
Wilderness 3 - Vortex Impeller Pumps
**38 |{Add. #1/03/30/09 2 ea | $4,88100 $9.762 00 $9,258 00 $18,516 00| $5.282 61 $10,565 22| $6,395.00 $12,790 00| $5,123 25 $10,246 50| $4,678.00 $9,356 00| $4,419.00 $8,838.00| $3,688 13| $7,376.26)
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 63’ T.D H. for River
39 |wilderness 5 2 ea | $3,211.00 $6,422.00| §5,480 G0 $10,960.00| $1,130.43 $2,260.86| $1,521.00 $3,042.00| $4,807 69 $9.61538| $2,577.00 $5,154 00| __$3,645 00 $7,200.00] $2,571 84 $5,143 68|
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 120 GPM @ 37' T.D.H. for Riverview
40 _ILandings 2 ea | $168200 $3,364 00 $3,807 00 $7,61400  $96848 $1,936.96] $1,303 00 $2,606 00| $2,075 29 $4,150.58| $2.133 00 $4,266 00 $1,902 00 $3,804 00| 81,696 32 $3,392 64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
41 |pumping 100 GPM @ 35' T.D.H. for S-4 2 ea | $1,696.00 $3,392.00 N/A NiA|  $96848 $1,936 96| $1,303 00 $2,606.00| $2,075 29 $4,150.58] $2,133.00 $4,266.00]  $1,802.00 $3.804.00 $1,69632 $3,39264
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 240 GPM @ 22' T.D.H. for San
42 [Remo 2 ea | $1,88600 $3,77200] $3,11300 $6,226 00{ $1,080.43 $2,160.86| $1,453 00 $2,906.00| $2,075 29 $4,150.58] $2,467.00 $4,93400] $2,011.00 $4,02200 $1,64160 $3.283 20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 14’ T.D.H. for Saunders
43 Rd. Industrial Park 2 ea $1,249 00| $2,498.00 NIA N/A| $1,080.43 $2,160.86] $1,453.00 $2,906.00| $2,075 29 $4,150.58| $3,633.00 $7,266.00]  $1,848 00 $3,696 00 $1,641,60 $3,283 20,
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 180 GPM @ 27' T.D.H. for Spanish
44  |Park 2 ea | $1,696.00 $3.392 00| $3,248 00 $6.496.00| $1.08043 $2,160.86] $1,453 00 $2,906 00| $2,075 29 $4,150.58| $1,91100 $3.82200] $2,01100 $4,022.00 $1,641.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 425 GPM @ 25' T.D H. for State
45 [Road 70 2 ea | $1,97500 93,950 00] $3,638 00 $7,27600{ $1,134.78 $2,269.56| $1,526 00 $3,052.00] $2,07529 $4,15058| $2,133 00 $4,266.00]  $3,113 00 $6,226.00| $2,166.91 $4,333 82
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabile of
46 _ |pumping 400 GPM @ 40' T.D.H_for Tara 6 2 ea | $3.18600 $6,37200] $4,84500 $9.69000| $2,047 83 $4,005.66| $2,888 00 $5,776.00| $3,667.95 $7,335 90| $2,577.00 $515400[  $3,907 00 $7,814 00| $2,571.84 $5,14368
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 23' TD H. for
47 |Timberlake 2 ea | $1,886 00 $3,772. 00| $3,638 00 $7,276 00| $1,080.43 $2,160.86] $1,453 00 $2,906.00] $2,075.29 $4,15058| $2,133 00 $4.266.00| $3,166.00 $6.332.00 $1,696 32 $3.39264
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabte of
pumping 1556 GPM @ 26' T.D.H. for Travler's
48 _|Qasis 2 ea | $1,33900 $2,678 00] $3,638 00 $7,276 00| $1,08043 $2,160 86| $1,453 00 $2,906 00| $2,075.29 $4,150 58] §1,911 00 $3.82200]  $2,346 00 $4,692 00 $1,641 60 $3,283 20,
TOTAL PRICE: $287,881.00 $568,192.00 -~ 1$285,616.36 $352,374.00 $392,422 57 $362,307.00 $355,793.00 1$247,296.08
KEYED BY: A) - )/Qﬂ ,u,u/w DATE: L 0
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