
Intent to Award (Rev. 10-25-22) 

MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 
INTENT TO AWARD 

IFB NO. / TITLE 

24-TA005521JK/ Southwest
Service Area D Force Main 
Replacements   

DATE POSTED 
MC __________ DS _________ 

PROCUREMENT 
REPRESENTATIVE 

Julie Kovacs, Procurement 
Agent III 

PROJECTED 
AWARD DATE 

JANUARY 28, 2025 

DEPARTMENT/DIVISION Utilities Department 
AUTHORIZED 

BY 
DATE Jacob Erickson, Purchasing Official 

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Harris-McBurney 
Company for the provision of Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacements. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26. 

BACKGROUND/EVALUATION 

Replace approximately 3,655 (Linear Feet) LF of 8 inch force main at Lift Station 7D (RTU 230), 
approximately 625 (LF) of 6 inch force main at Lift Station 22D (RTU 224), approximately 279 LF 
(250 LF by jack and bore and 29 LF open cut) of 4 inch force main at Lift Station 21D (RTU 229), 
approximately 875 LF of 4 inch force main at Lift Station 4D (RTU 231). Includes lining of receiving 
manhole and the first two downstream manholes for each force main. 

The solicitation was advertised on August 23, 2024 on the Manatee County website and DemandStar. It was also 
provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast 
Builders Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members and in the Bradenton 
Herald and Tempo News newspapers.  Responses were received from the following firms:  

1. C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc.,
Bradenton, FL

3. Landmark Services of Southwest FL, Inc., Bradenton,
FL

2. Harris-McBurney Company, Tampa, FL 4. Woodruff & Sons, Inc., Bradenton, FL

The following firms were deemed non-responsive/non-responsible: None 

EVALUATION SUMMARY: 
Harris-McBurney Company was the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s).  A bid tabulation of the results is 
attached to this Notice of Intent to Award. 

RECOMMENDATION: 
The Procurement Division and the Utilities Department recommend award to Harris-McBurney Company. 

ATTACHMENTS 
(List in order of attached) 

Bid Summary & 
Tabulation 

COST $2,713,641.88 



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement 

PROJECT NUMBER: 609781

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 

BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

C-SQUARED

$3,076,938.09

No Bid $2,713,641.88

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

$2,713,641.88

HARRIS 

MCBURNEY

$3,206,874.88 No Bid

LANDMARK WOORDUFF

$3,206,874.88 $3,521,009.35



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement - Lift Station 7D

PROJECT NUMBER: 6089781

ITEM 

NO.

DESCRIPTION U/M QTY.  UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 
1 Curb Replacement LF 686 80.65$             55,325.90$            55.03$           37,750.58$            55.03$           37,750.58$            122.12$         83,774.32$            122.12$         83,774.32$            65.39$           44,857.54$            

2 Asphalt Pavement Restoration    

2.01 Road Pavment Base SY 555 56.50$             31,357.50$            78.83$           43,750.65$            78.83$           43,750.65$            342.90$         190,309.50$          342.90$         190,309.50$          126.62$         70,274.10$            

2.02 Asphalt, S-I, 2" thick SY 917 57.00$             52,269.00$            57.60$           52,819.20$            57.60$           52,819.20$            57.04$           52,305.68$            57.04$           52,305.68$            51.29$           47,032.93$            

2.03 Asphalt, S-III, 3/4" thick SY 3396 19.50$             66,222.00$            18.22$           61,875.12$            18.22$           61,875.12$            18.56$           63,029.76$            18.56$           63,029.76$            17.84$           60,584.64$            

2.04 Asphalt Pavement Restortation (Mill) SY 3396 12.15$             41,261.40$            13.17$           44,725.32$            13.17$           44,725.32$            11.60$           39,393.60$            11.60$           39,393.60$            11.15$           37,865.40$            

3 Thermoplastic Striping

3.01 Stop Bar, White, 24" LF 36 10.00$             360.00$                 11.52$           414.72$                 11.52$           414.72$                 16.28$           586.08$                 16.28$           586.08$                 27.87$           1,003.32$              

3.02 Edge of Pavment Line, White, 6" LF 1387 4.50$               6,241.50$              3.24$             4,493.88$              3.24$             4,493.88$              2.36$             3,273.32$              2.36$             3,273.32$              2.23$             3,093.01$              

3.03 Yellow Solid, 6" LF 1945 5.25$               10,211.25$            3.24$             6,301.80$              3.24$             6,301.80$              2.36$             4,590.20$              2.36$             4,590.20$              2.23$             4,337.35$              

3.04 Yellow 10-30 Skip, 6" LF 52 4.00$               208.00$                 3.24$             168.48$                 3.24$             168.48$                 1.86$             96.72$                  1.86$             96.72$                  3.34$             173.68$                 

4 Sidewalk Replacement (4" min. thick), concrete SY 15 300.00$           4,500.00$              84.87$           1,273.05$              84.87$           1,273.05$              280.36$         4,205.40$              280.36$         4,205.40$              107.03$         1,605.45$              

5 Driveway Restortation

5.01 Concrete SY 849 83.00$             70,467.00$            114.09$         96,862.41$            114.09$         96,862.41$            148.50$         126,076.50$          148.50$         126,076.50$          120.95$         102,686.55$          

5.02 Asphalt SY 62 85.00$             5,270.00$              73.44$           4,553.28$              73.44$           4,553.28$              515.49$         31,960.38$            515.49$         31,960.38$            583.77$         36,193.74$            

5.03 Paver Bricks (6" min thick) SY 65 61.00$             3,965.00$              177.05$         11,508.25$            177.05$         11,508.25$            201.06$         13,068.90$            201.06$         13,068.90$            188.41$         12,246.65$            

5.04 Shell SY 158 78.00$             12,324.00$            30.58$           4,831.64$              30.58$           4,831.64$              35.18$           5,558.44$              35.18$           5,558.44$              108.32$         17,114.56$            

6  Sodding SY 1413 5.50$               7,771.50$              21.60$           30,520.80$            21.60$           30,520.80$            3.91$             5,524.83$              3.91$             5,524.83$              8.81$             12,448.53$            

7 Misc. Vegetation & Tree Removal

7.01 General Removal and/or Trimming Vegetation LS 1 95,000.00$      95,000.00$            30,275.85$    30,275.85$            30,275.85$    30,275.85$            15,012.31$    15,012.31$            15,012.31$    15,012.31$            22,324.58$    22,324.58$            

7.02 Tree Removal, 4"-6" EA 1 4,800.00$        4,800.00$              1,440.00$      1,440.00$              1,440.00$      1,440.00$              1,113.66$      1,113.66$              1,113.66$      1,113.66$              1,001.53$      1,001.53$              

7.03 Tree Removal, 6.1"-12" EA 1 5,500.00$        5,500.00$              2,880.00$      2,880.00$              2,880.00$      2,880.00$              1,769.15$      1,769.15$              1,769.15$      1,769.15$              1,001.53$      1,001.53$              

7.04 Tree Removal, 12.1" & Greater EA 1 6,500.00$        6,500.00$              4,320.00$      4,320.00$              4,320.00$      4,320.00$              2,879.71$      2,879.71$              2,879.71$      2,879.71$              2,661.40$      2,661.40$              

8 Mailbox,  removal/reinstall and new

8.01 Remove and Reinstall EA 29 600.00$           17,400.00$            504.60$         14,633.40$            504.60$         14,633.40$            174.23$         5,052.67$              174.23$         5,052.67$              975.55$         28,290.95$            

8.02 New EA 7 525.00$           3,675.00$              705.22$         4,936.54$              705.22$         4,936.54$              505.93$         3,541.51$              505.93$         3,541.51$              769.66$         5,387.62$              

9 Grout Fill Abandonded Pipe (cement slurry) CY 47 725.00$           34,075.00$            1,440.00$      67,680.00$            1,440.00$      67,680.00$            1,119.34$      52,608.98$            1,119.34$      52,608.98$            1,284.71$      60,381.37$            

10 Remove Existing Items

10.01 Valve EA 2 2,700.00$        5,400.00$              1,009.20$      2,018.40$              1,009.20$      2,018.40$              667.96$         1,335.92$              667.96$         1,335.92$              5,623.09$      11,246.18$            

10.02 Ex. Forcemain LF 10 1,500.00$        15,000.00$            100.92$         1,009.20$              100.92$         1,009.20$              112.46$         1,124.60$              112.46$         1,124.60$              224.93$         2,249.30$              

10.03 Air Release Valve EA 1 6,300.00$        6,300.00$              2,018.39$      2,018.39$              2,018.39$      2,018.39$              1,791.00$      1,791.00$              1,791.00$      1,791.00$              1,938.18$      1,938.18$              

10.04 Air Release Valve Manhole (STA: 46+77) EA 1 6,500.00$        6,500.00$              504.60$         504.60$                 504.60$         504.60$                 9,787.91$      9,787.91$              9,787.91$      9,787.91$              969.10$         969.10$                 

11 Pipe  (Wastewater)    

11.01 Intentionally Left Blank

11.02 PVC (C-900), 4" LF 10 620.00$           6,200.00$              146.06$         1,460.60$              146.06$         1,460.60$              2,042.34$      20,423.40$            2,042.34$      20,423.40$            119.08$         1,190.80$              

11.03 Intentionally Left Blank

11.04 PVC (C-900), 8" LF 4308 108.00$           465,264.00$          160.97$         693,458.76$          160.97$         693,458.76$          147.87$         637,023.96$          147.87$         637,023.96$          133.69$         575,936.52$          

11.05 Intentionally Left Blank

12 HDPE MJ Adapters (Wastewater)    

12.01                                        Intentionally Left Blank

13 DI  Fittings (Wastewater)    

13.01                                         Intentionally Left Blank

13.02                                         Intentionally Left Blank

13.03      Tee, 8" x 4" EA 1 1,800.00$        1,800.00$              1,537.71$      1,537.71$              1,537.71$      1,537.71$              2,427.11$      2,427.11$              2,427.11$      2,427.11$              1,669.69$      1,669.69$              

13.04      Bends ,<90, 8" EA 32 1,200.00$        38,400.00$            1,537.47$      49,199.04$            1,537.47$      49,199.04$            972.07$         31,106.24$            972.07$         31,106.24$            1,435.72$      45,943.04$            

13.05                                         Intentionally Left Blank

14 Pipe Joint Restrains    

14.01      4" EA 1 1,100.00$        1,100.00$              360.69$         360.69$                 360.69$         360.69$                 443.95$         443.95$                 443.95$         443.95$                 560.88$         560.88$                 

14.02

14.03      8" EA 33 1,300.00$        42,900.00$            704.33$         23,242.89$            704.33$         23,242.89$            864.63$         28,532.79$            864.63$         28,532.79$            644.30$         21,261.90$            

15 Valves (Wastewater)    

15.01      Plug, 4" EA 1 5,850.00$        5,850.00$              3,951.96$      3,951.96$              3,951.96$      3,951.96$              2,786.63$      2,786.63$              2,786.63$      2,786.63$              3,106.96$      3,106.96$              

15.02                                            Intentionally Left Blank

15.03      Plug, 8" EA 2 7,150.00$        14,300.00$            5,788.21$      11,576.42$            5,788.21$      11,576.42$            4,772.49$      9,544.98$              4,772.49$      9,544.98$              4,266.35$      8,532.70$              

15.04                                            Intentionally Left Blank

15.05      Tapping Valves, 8" EA 1 8,800.00$        8,800.00$              9,776.28$      9,776.28$              9,776.28$      9,776.28$              8,042.46$      8,042.46$              8,042.46$      8,042.46$              4,198.82$      4,198.82$              

16 Tapping Sleeves (Wastewater) (316 SS)    

16.01                                           Intentionally Left Blank

16.02      20"x 8" EA 1 3,875.00$        3,875.00$              12,432.32$    12,432.32$            12,432.32$    12,432.32$            13,289.10$    13,289.10$            13,289.10$    13,289.10$            37,533.75$    37,533.75$            

17 Air Release Valves  (Wastewater)    

17.01      Above ground EA 1 9,400.00$        9,400.00$              7,978.38$      7,978.38$              7,978.38$      7,978.38$              8,730.64$      8,730.64$              8,730.64$      8,730.64$              9,088.89$      9,088.89$              

 BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 

FORCE MAIN 7-D SERVING LIFT STATION RTU 230  NO BID  NO BID 

BID TABULATION 

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc. Harris McBurney Landmark Woodruff & Sons

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement - Lift Station 7D

PROJECT NUMBER: 6089781

ITEM 

NO.

DESCRIPTION U/M QTY.  UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 
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($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 
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PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 

FORCE MAIN 7-D SERVING LIFT STATION RTU 230  NO BID  NO BID 

BID TABULATION 

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc. Harris McBurney Landmark Woodruff & Sons

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 

17.02      Fiberglass enclosure EA 1 4,100.00$        4,100.00$              1,744.82$      1,744.82$              1,744.82$      1,744.82$              2,065.66$      2,065.66$              2,065.66$      2,065.66$              3,204.34$      3,204.34$              

18 Pipeline Connections a Structures    

18.01 Lift Station EA 1 10,000.00$      10,000.00$            20,756.63$    20,756.63$            20,756.63$    20,756.63$            11,802.73$    11,802.73$            11,802.73$    11,802.73$            16,148.66$    16,148.66$            

18.02                                           Intentionally Left Blank

19 Temporary Bypass Pumping LS 1 17,000.00$      17,000.00$            15,695.35$    15,695.35$            15,695.35$    15,695.35$            9,456.67$      9,456.67$              9,456.67$      9,456.67$              66,696.87$    66,696.87$            

20 Concrete Manhole Bottom / Channel /Bench VF 11 650.00$           7,150.00$              432.00$         4,752.00$              432.00$         4,752.00$              746.71$         8,213.81$              746.71$         8,213.81$              2,378.69$      26,165.59$            

21 Repair Existing Liner SF 45 215.00$           9,675.00$              72.00$           3,240.00$              72.00$           3,240.00$              93.00$           4,185.00$              93.00$           4,185.00$              278.73$         12,542.85$            

22 Erosion Control LS 1 13,500.00$      13,500.00$            2,880.00$      2,880.00$              2,880.00$      2,880.00$              7,936.00$      7,936.00$              7,936.00$      7,936.00$              1,000.00$      1,000.00$              

22.01 Inlet Protection EA 27 425.00$           11,475.00$            216.00$         5,832.00$              216.00$         5,832.00$              452.92$         12,228.84$            452.92$         12,228.84$            338.32$         9,134.64$              

22.02 Silt Fencing LF 765 15.25$             11,666.25$            5.76$             4,406.40$              5.76$             4,406.40$              47.06$           36,000.90$            47.06$           36,000.90$            12.47$           9,539.55$              

23 Traffic Control LS 1 130,000.00$    130,000.00$          5,050.97$      5,050.97$              5,050.97$      5,050.97$              196,477.16$  196,477.16$          196,477.16$  196,477.16$          132,909.89$  132,909.89$          

24 Excavate and Inspect Existing Main Connections LS 1 21,400.00$      21,400.00$            3,027.59$      3,027.59$              3,027.59$      3,027.59$              12,510.77$    12,510.77$            12,510.77$    12,510.77$            17,443.67$    17,443.67$            

25 Sewer lateral locate EA 24 2,700.00$        64,800.00$            1,009.20$      24,220.80$            1,009.20$      24,220.80$            1,004.69$      24,112.56$            1,004.69$      24,112.56$            969.10$         23,258.40$            

26                                         Intentionally Left Blank

27 Remove / reinstall street signage EA 5 1,375.00$        6,875.00$              638.35$         3,191.75$              638.35$         3,191.75$              248.00$         1,240.00$              248.00$         1,240.00$              746.54$         3,732.70$              

28                                         Intentionally Left Blank

29 Protect power poles EA 14 3,000.00$        42,000.00$            2,880.00$      40,320.00$            2,880.00$      40,320.00$            4,228.40$      59,197.60$            4,228.40$      59,197.60$            13,148.98$    184,085.72$          

SubTotal Construction Cost 1,515,434.30$       1,483,658.92$       1,483,658.92$       1,867,550.01$       1,867,550.01$       1,803,856.02$       

30 Mobilization (10% of Sub Total) 10%   151,543.43$            148,365.89$            148,365.89$            91,571.20$            91,571.20$              180,385.60$          

31 Record Drawings 2%   30,308.69$              29,673.18$              29,673.18$              30,922.71$            30,922.71$              36,077.12$            

32 Contingency (10% of SubTotal) 10%   151,543.43$            148,365.89$            148,365.89$            186,755.00$          186,755.00$            180,385.60$          

  Total Construction Cost 1,848,829.85$       No Bid 1,810,063.88$       1,810,063.88$       2,176,798.92$       2,176,798.92$       2,200,704.34$       No Bid



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement - Lift Station 22D

PROJECT NUMBER: 6089781

FORCE MAIN 22-D SERVING LIFT STATION RTU 224

ITEM 

NO.

DESCRIPTION U/M QTY.  UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

1 Curb Replacement LF 120 116.00$          13,920.00$                 66.04$            7,924.80$                   66.04$            7,924.80$                   124.25$          14,910.00$                 124.25$          14,910.00$                 65.39$                 7,846.80$       

2 Asphalt Pavement Restoration    

2.01 Road Pavment Base SY 28 171.00$          4,788.00$                   78.57$            2,199.96$                   78.57$            2,199.96$                   524.54$          14,687.12$                 524.54$          14,687.12$                 128.18$               3,589.04$       

2.02 Asphalt, S-I, 2" thick SY 56 130.00$          7,280.00$                   256.32$          14,353.92$                 256.32$          14,353.92$                 107.12$          5,998.72$                   107.12$          5,998.72$                   265.35$               14,859.60$     

2.03 Asphalt, S-III, 3/4" thick SY 279 56.50$            15,763.50$                 65.66$            18,319.14$                 65.66$            18,319.14$                 58.59$            16,346.61$                 58.59$            16,346.61$                 51.84$                 14,463.36$     

2.04 Asphalt Pavement Restortation (Mill) SY 279 55.00$            15,345.00$                 36.83$            10,275.57$                 36.83$            10,275.57$                 56.70$            15,819.30$                 56.70$            15,819.30$                 50.17$                 13,997.43$     

3 Thermoplastic Striping

3.01 Intentionally Left Blank

3.02 Intentionally Left Blank

3.03 Intentionally Left Blank

3.04 Intentionally Left Blank

4 Intentionally Left Blank

5 Driveway Restortation

5.01 Concrete SY 65 163.00$          10,595.00$                 156.06$          10,143.90$                 156.06$          10,143.90$                 156.22$          10,154.30$                 156.22$          10,154.30$                 490.54$               31,885.10$     

5.02 Intentionally Left Blank

5.03 Intentionally Left Blank

5.04 Shell SY 17 275.00$          4,675.00$                   68.53$            1,165.01$                   68.53$            1,165.01$                   73.35$            1,246.95$                   73.35$            1,246.95$                   749.30$               12,738.10$     

6  Sodding SY 248 25.50$            6,324.00$                   28.80$            7,142.40$                   28.80$            7,142.40$                   3.98$              987.04$                      3.98$              987.04$                      8.81$                   2,184.88$       

7 Misc. Vegetation & Tree Removal

7.01 General Removal and/or Trimming Vegetation LS 1 11,000.00$     11,000.00$                 10,091.95$     10,091.95$                 10,091.95$     10,091.95$                 2,124.00$       2,124.00$                   2,124.00$       2,124.00$                   7,441.53$            7,441.53$       

7.02 Intentionally Left Blank

7.03 Intentionally Left Blank

7.04 Intentionally Left Blank

8 Mailbox,  removal/reinstall and new

8.01 Intentionally Left Blank

8.02 Intentionally Left Blank

9 Grout Fill Abandonded Pipe (cement slurry) CY 5 2,000.00$       10,000.00$                 2,880.00$       14,400.00$                 2,880.00$       14,400.00$                 3,084.88$       15,424.40$                 3,084.88$       15,424.40$                 2,369.27$            11,846.35$     

10 Remove Existing Items

10.01 Valve EA 2 2,200.00$       4,400.00$                   1,009.20$       2,018.40$                   1,009.20$       2,018.40$                   678.73$          1,357.46$                   678.73$          1,357.46$                   5,623.09$            11,246.18$     

10.02                                          Intentionally Left Blank

10.03                                          Intentionally Left Blank

10.04                                          Intentionally Left Blank

11 Pipe  (Wastewater)    

11.01                                          Intentionally Left Blank

11.02                                          Intentionally Left Blank

11.03 PVC (C-900), 6" LF 537 124.00$          66,588.00$                 89.57$            48,099.09$                 89.57$            48,099.09$                 142.16$          76,339.92$                 142.16$          76,339.92$                 330.07$               177,247.59$   

11.04                                          Intentionally Left Blank

11.05                                          Intentionally Left Blank

12 HDPE MJ Adapters (Wastewater)    

12.01                                          Intentionally Left Blank

13 DI  Fittings (Wastewater)    

13.01                                          Intentionally Left Blank

13.02                                          Intentionally Left Blank

13.03                                          Intentionally Left Blank

13.04                                          Intentionally Left Blank

13.05                                          Intentionally Left Blank

14 Pipe Joint Restrains    

14.01                                          Intentionally Left Blank

14.02      6" EA 6 1,700.00$       10,200.00$                 504.80$          3,028.80$                   504.80$          3,028.80$                   790.34$          4,742.04$                   790.34$          4,742.04$                   580.12$               3,480.72$       

14.03                                          Intentionally Left Blank

15 Valves (Wastewater)    

15.01                                          Intentionally Left Blank

15.02      Plug, 6" EA 1 4,825.00$       4,825.00$                   5,442.84$       5,442.84$                   5,442.84$       5,442.84$                   3,655.70$       3,655.70$                   3,655.70$       3,655.70$                   3,501.28$            3,501.28$       

15.03                                          Intentionally Left Blank

15.04      Tapping Valves, 6" EA 1 7,600.00$       7,600.00$                   1,959.71$       1,959.71$                   1,959.71$       1,959.71$                   7,598.02$       7,598.02$                   7,598.02$       7,598.02$                   3,499.97$            3,499.97$       

15.05                                          Intentionally Left Blank

16 Tapping Sleeves (Wastewater) (316 SS)    

16.01        10"x 6" EA 1 5,700.00$       5,700.00$                   9,256.27$       9,256.27$                   9,256.27$       9,256.27$                   14,157.84$     14,157.84$                 14,157.84$     14,157.84$                 34,831.52$          34,831.52$     

16.02                                          Intentionally Left Blank

17 Air Release Valves  (Wastewater)    

17.01                                          Intentionally Left Blank

17.02                                          Intentionally Left Blank

18 Pipeline Connections a Structures    

18.01 Lift Station EA 1 4,500.00$       4,500.00$                   10,529.63$     10,529.63$                 10,529.63$     10,529.63$                 11,856.75$     11,856.75$                 11,856.75$     11,856.75$                 16,148.66$          16,148.66$     

18.02                                          Intentionally Left Blank

Landmark Woodruff & Sons

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 

BID TABULATION 

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc. Harris McBurney

NO BID

 BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

NO BID



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement - Lift Station 22D

PROJECT NUMBER: 6089781

FORCE MAIN 22-D SERVING LIFT STATION RTU 224

ITEM 

NO.

DESCRIPTION U/M QTY.  UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

Landmark Woodruff & Sons

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 

BID TABULATION 

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc. Harris McBurney

NO BID

 BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

NO BID

19 Temporary Bypass Pumping LS 1 18,000.00$     18,000.00$                 15,695.35$     15,695.35$                 15,695.35$     15,695.35$                 10,356.51$     10,356.51$                 10,356.51$     10,356.51$                 66,696.87$          66,696.87$     

20                                          Intentionally Left Blank

21                                          Intentionally Left Blank

22 Erosion Control LS 1 13,500.00$     13,500.00$                 2,880.00$       2,880.00$                   2,880.00$       2,880.00$                   3,244.50$       3,244.50$                   3,244.50$       3,244.50$                   1,000.00$            1,000.00$       

22.01 Inlet Protection EA 1 525.00$          525.00$                      432.00$          432.00$                      432.00$          432.00$                      2,448.92$       2,448.92$                   2,448.92$       2,448.92$                   338.32$               338.32$          

22.02 Silt Fencing LF 95 17.50$            1,662.50$                   10.08$            957.60$                      10.08$            957.60$                      79.43$            7,545.85$                   79.43$            7,545.85$                   12.47$                 1,184.65$       

23 Traffic Control LS 1 38,000.00$     38,000.00$                 5,050.96$       5,050.96$                   5,050.96$       5,050.96$                   8,280.26$       8,280.26$                   8,280.26$       8,280.26$                   14,828.94$          14,828.94$     

24                                          Intentionally Left Blank

25 Sewer lateral locate EA 2 2,750.00$       5,500.00$                   1,009.20$       2,018.40$                   1,009.20$       2,018.40$                   1,020.89$       2,041.78$                   1,020.89$       2,041.78$                   969.10$               1,938.20$       

26                                          Intentionally Left Blank

27 Remove / reinstall street signage EA 3 1,075.00$       3,225.00$                   638.35$          1,915.05$                   638.35$          1,915.05$                   252.00$          756.00$                      252.00$          756.00$                      746.54$               2,239.62$       

28 Relocate decorative items in ROW EA 1 11,250.00$     11,250.00$                 10,091.95$     10,091.95$                 10,091.95$     10,091.95$                 415.39$          415.39$                      415.39$          415.39$                      4,479.23$            4,479.23$       

29 Protect Power Poles EA 1 -$                            2,880.00$       2,880.00$                   2,880.00$       2,880.00$                   4,296.60$       4,296.60$                   4,296.60$       4,296.60$                   13,148.98$          13,148.98$     

     

SubTotal Construction Cost 295,166.00$               218,272.70$               218,272.70$               256,791.98$               256,791.98$               476,662.92$   

30 Mobilization 10%   29,516.60$                   21,827.27$                 21,827.27$                   17,657.23$                 17,657.23$                   47,666.29$     

31 Record Drawings 2%   5,903.32$                     4,365.45$                   4,365.45$                     3,986.35$                   3,986.35$                     9,533.26$       

32 Contingency (10% of SubTotal) 10%   29,516.60$                   21,827.27$                 21,827.27$                   25,720.74$                 25,720.74$                   47,666.29$     

  Total Construction Cost 360,102.52$               No Bid 266,292.69$               266,292.69$               304,156.30$               304,156.30$               581,528.76$   No Bid



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement - Lift Station 21D

PROJECT NUMBER: 6089781

ITEM 

NO.

DESCRIPTION U/M QTY.  UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 
1 Curb Replacement LF 20 175.00$         3,500.00$               309.60$         6,192.00$      309.60$         6,192.00$      153.83$         3,076.60$      153.83$         3,076.60$      65.39$            1,307.80$      

2 Asphalt Pavement Restoration    

2.01 Road Pavment Base SY 3 725.00$         2,175.00$               552.82$         1,658.46$      552.82$         1,658.46$      2,482.80$      7,448.40$      2,482.80$      7,448.40$      442.22$         1,326.66$      

2.02 Asphalt, S-I, 2" thick SY 7 550.00$         3,850.00$               355.68$         2,489.76$      355.68$         2,489.76$      121.52$         850.64$         121.52$         850.64$         1,806.14$      12,642.98$    

2.03 Asphalt, S-III, 3/4" thick SY 212 72.15$            15,295.80$             74.88$            15,874.56$    74.88$            15,874.56$    74.97$            15,893.64$    74.97$            15,893.64$    66.34$            14,064.08$    

2.04 Asphalt Pavement Restortation (Mill) SY 212 72.15$            15,295.80$             37.88$            8,030.56$      37.88$            8,030.56$      74.97$            15,893.64$    74.97$            15,893.64$    66.34$            14,064.08$    

3 Thermoplastic Striping

3.01

3.02 Edge of Pavment Line, White, 6" LF 172 4.50$              774.00$                  17.57$            3,022.04$      17.57$            3,022.04$      2.39$              411.08$         2.39$              411.08$         5.57$              958.04$         

3.03 Yellow Solid, 6" LF 172 5.25$              903.00$                  17.57$            3,022.04$      17.57$            3,022.04$      2.39$              411.08$         2.39$              411.08$         5.57$              958.04$         

3.04 Intentionally Left Blank

4 Intentionally Left Blank

5 Driveway Restortation

5.01 Intentionally Left Blank

5.02 Intentionally Left Blank

5.03 Intentionally Left Blank

5.04 Intentionally Left Blank

6  Sodding SY 65 44.00$            2,860.00$               43.20$            2,808.00$      43.20$            2,808.00$      3.98$              258.70$         3.98$              258.70$         8.81$              572.65$         

7 Misc. Vegetation & Tree Removal

7.01 General Removal and/or Trimming Vegetation LS 1 25,200.00$    25,200.00$             10,091.95$    10,091.95$    10,091.95$    10,091.95$    3,785.57$      3,785.57$      3,785.57$      3,785.57$      7,441.53$      7,441.53$      

7.02 Intentionally Left Blank

7.03 Intentionally Left Blank

7.04 Intentionally Left Blank

8 Mailbox,  removal/reinstall and new

8.01 Intentionally Left Blank

8.02 Intentionally Left Blank

9 Intentionally Left Blank

10 Remove Existing Items

10.01 Valve EA 1 3,200.00$      3,200.00$               1,009.20$      1,009.20$      1,009.20$      1,009.20$      681.31$         681.31$         681.31$         681.31$         5,623.09$      5,623.09$      

10.02 Ex. Forcemain LF 20 370.00$         7,400.00$               1,009.20$      20,184.00$    1,009.20$      20,184.00$    158.71$         3,174.20$      158.71$         3,174.20$      224.93$         4,498.60$      

11 Pipe  (Wastewater)    

11.01 Intentionally Left Blank

11.02  PVC (C-900), 4" LF 55 275.00$         15,125.00$             116.01$         6,380.55$      116.01$         6,380.55$      871.09$         47,909.95$    871.09$         47,909.95$    554.75$         30,511.25$    

11.03 Intentionally Left Blank

11.04 Intentionally Left Blank

11.05 Intentionally Left Blank

12 HDPE MJ Adapters (Wastewater)    

12.01      4" EA 2 500.00$         1,000.00$               992.09$         1,984.18$      992.09$         1,984.18$      918.34$         1,836.68$      918.34$         1,836.68$      3,116.73$      6,233.46$      

13 DI  Fittings (Wastewater)    

13.01      Bends, <90, 4" EA 6 900.00$         5,400.00$               946.76$         5,680.56$      946.76$         5,680.56$      551.55$         3,309.30$      551.55$         3,309.30$      1,128.53$      6,771.18$      

13.02      Bends,   90, 4" EA 2 1,300.00$      2,600.00$               970.56$         1,941.12$      970.56$         1,941.12$      576.58$         1,153.16$      576.58$         1,153.16$      1,151.46$      2,302.92$      

13.03 Intentionally Left Blank

13.04 Intentionally Left Blank

13.05      Sleeves, 4" EA 2 1,375.00$      2,750.00$               367.46$         734.92$         367.46$         734.92$         710.56$         1,421.12$      710.56$         1,421.12$      1,106.20$      2,212.40$      

14 Pipe Joint Restrains                                    

14.01      4" EA 3 800.00$         2,400.00$               252.32$         756.96$         252.32$         756.96$         449.01$         1,347.03$      449.01$         1,347.03$      560.88$         1,682.64$      

14.02 Intentionally Left Blank

14.03 Intentionally Left Blank

15 Valves (Wastewater)    

15.01      Plug, 4" EA 1 5,900.00$      5,900.00$               3,951.96$      3,951.96$      3,951.96$      3,951.96$      2,831.58$      2,831.58$      2,831.58$      2,831.58$      3,106.96$      3,106.96$      

15.02 Intentionally Left Blank

15.03 Intentionally Left Blank

15.04 Intentionally Left Blank

15.05 Intentionally Left Blank

16 Tapping Sleeves (Wastewater) (316 SS)    

16.01 Intentionally Left Blank

 BID A 390 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 BID B 330 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

FORCE MAIN 21-D SERVING LIFT STATION RTU 229

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc.

 NO BID 

BID TABULATION 

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 
 BID B 330 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 NO BID 

Harris McBurney Landmark Woodruff & Sons

 BID A 390 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 BID B 330 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 BID A 390 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 BID B 330 CALENDAR 

DAYS 



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement - Lift Station 21D

PROJECT NUMBER: 6089781

ITEM 

NO.

DESCRIPTION U/M QTY.  UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED 

PRICE

($) 

 BID A 390 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 BID B 330 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

FORCE MAIN 21-D SERVING LIFT STATION RTU 229

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc.

 NO BID 

BID TABULATION 

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS 
 BID B 330 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 NO BID 

Harris McBurney Landmark Woodruff & Sons

 BID A 390 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 BID B 330 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 BID A 390 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

 BID B 330 CALENDAR 

DAYS 

16.02 Intentionally Left Blank

17 Air Release Valves  (Wastewater)    

17.01      Above ground EA 1 9,400.00$      9,400.00$               7,961.63$      7,961.63$      7,961.63$      7,961.63$      8,854.58$      8,854.58$      8,854.58$      8,854.58$      8,945.74$      8,945.74$      

17.02      Fiberglass enclosure EA 1 4,100.00$      4,100.00$               1,744.82$      1,744.82$      1,744.82$      1,744.82$      2,098.98$      2,098.98$      2,098.98$      2,098.98$      3,204.34$      3,204.34$      

18 Pipeline Connections a Structures    

18.01 Lift Station EA 1 4,500.00$      4,500.00$               10,419.48$    10,419.48$    10,419.48$    10,419.48$    12,781.06$    12,781.06$    12,781.06$    12,781.06$    16,148.66$    16,148.66$    

18.02 Gravity Manhole (>6') EA 1 6,700.00$      6,700.00$               11,733.48$    11,733.48$    11,733.48$    11,733.48$    5,887.80$      5,887.80$      5,887.80$      5,887.80$      16,148.66$    16,148.66$    

19 Temporary Bypass Pumping LS 1 15,750.00$    15,750.00$             15,595.35$    15,595.35$    15,595.35$    15,595.35$    19,574.65$    19,574.65$    19,574.65$    19,574.65$    19,870.88$    19,870.88$    

20 Concrete Manhole Bottom / Channel /Bench VF 12 600.00$         7,200.00$               2,285.89$      27,430.68$    2,285.89$      27,430.68$    758.75$         9,105.00$      758.75$         9,105.00$      2,180.46$      26,165.52$    

21 Repair Existing Liner SF 25 265.00$         6,625.00$               288.00$         7,200.00$      288.00$         7,200.00$      758.75$         18,968.75$    758.75$         18,968.75$    

22 Erosion Control LS 1 13,500.00$    13,500.00$             2,880.00$      2,880.00$      2,880.00$      2,880.00$      3,244.50$      3,244.50$      3,244.50$      3,244.50$      1,000.00$      1,000.00$      

22.01 Inlet Protection EA 2 500.00$         1,000.00$               288.00$         576.00$         288.00$         576.00$         961.33$         1,922.66$      961.33$         1,922.66$      338.32$         676.64$         

22.02 Silt Fencing LF 10 46.50$            465.00$                  28.80$            288.00$         28.80$            288.00$         555.90$         5,559.00$      555.90$         5,559.00$      46.69$            466.90$         

23 Traffic Control LS 1 33,000.00$    33,000.00$             5,050.97$      5,050.97$      5,050.97$      5,050.97$      38,209.50$    38,209.50$    38,209.50$    38,209.50$    14,828.94$    14,828.94$    

24 Intentionally Left Blank

25 Intentionally Left Blank

26 Remove / reinstall railing section of guardrail EA 1 11,500.00$    11,500.00$             2,880.00$      2,880.00$      2,880.00$      2,880.00$      830.79$         830.79$         830.79$         830.79$         6,541.38$      6,541.38$      

27 Remove / reinstall street signage EA 1 1,800.00$      1,800.00$               5,467.73$      5,467.73$      5,467.73$      5,467.73$      252.22$         252.00$         252.22$         252.00$         746.54$         746.54$         

28 Relocate decorative items in ROW EA 2 10,000.00$    20,000.00$             5,045.98$      10,091.96$    5,045.98$      10,091.96$    415.39$         830.78$         415.39$         830.78$         2,239.61$      4,479.22$      

29 Intentionally Left Blank    

  SubTotal Construction Cost 251,168.60$           205,132.92$  205,132.92$  239,813.73$  239,813.73$  235,501.78$  

25 Mobilization 10% 25,116.86$             20,513.29$    20,513.29$    12,650.46$    12,650.46$    23,550.18$    

26 Record Drawings 2% 5,023.37$               4,102.66$      4,102.66$      2,407.86$      2,407.86$      4,710.04$      

27 Contingency (10% of SubTotal) 10% 25,116.86$             20,513.29$    20,513.29$    22,380.58$    22,380.58$    23,550.18$    

  Total Construction Cost 306,425.69$           No Bid 250,262.16$  250,262.16$  277,252.63$  277,252.63$  287,312.18$  No Bid



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement - Lift Station 4D

PROJECT NUMBER: 6089781

ITEM 

NO.

DESCRIPTION U/M QTY.  UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

1 Intentionally Left Blank

2 Asphalt Pavement Restoration    

2.01 Road Pavment Base SY 116 160.00$          18,560.00$                 84.75$            9,831.00$                   84.75$            9,831.00$                   339.32$          39,361.12$                 339.32$          39,361.12$                 127.19$          14,754.04$                 

2.02 Asphalt, S-I, 2" thick SY 162 100.00$          16,200.00$                 109.44$          17,729.28$                 109.44$          17,729.28$                 68.87$            11,156.94$                 68.87$            11,156.94$                 89.19$            14,448.78$                 

2.03 Asphalt, S-III, 3/4" thick SY 304 53.00$            16,112.00$                 60.48$            18,385.92$                 60.48$            18,385.92$                 50.46$            15,339.84$                 50.46$            15,339.84$                 48.50$            14,744.00$                 

2.04 Asphalt Pavement Restortation (Mill) SY 304 51.00$            15,504.00$                 40.78$            12,397.12$                 40.78$            12,397.12$                 48.14$            14,634.56$                 48.14$            14,634.56$                 46.27$            14,066.08$                 

3 Thermoplastic Striping

3.01 Intentionally Left Blank

3.02 Edge of Pavment Line, White, 6" LF 239 4.50$              1,075.50$                   8.51$              2,033.89$                   8.51$              2,033.89$                   2.36$              564.04$                      2.36$              564.04$                      5.02$              1,199.78$                   

3.03 Yellow Solid, 6" LF 472 5.25$              2,478.00$                   8.51$              4,016.72$                   8.51$              4,016.72$                   2.36$              1,113.92$                   2.36$              1,113.92$                   3.34$              1,576.48$                   

3.04 Intentionally Left Blank

4 Intentionally Left Blank

5 Driveway Restortation

5.01 Concrete SY 166 135.00$          22,410.00$                 127.14$          21,105.24$                 127.14$          21,105.24$                 150.19$          24,931.54$                 150.19$          24,931.54$                 247.03$          41,006.98$                 

5.02 Intentionally Left Blank

5.03 Intentionally Left Blank

5.04 Intentionally Left Blank

6  Sodding SY 279 21.00$            5,859.00$                   36.00$            10,044.00$                 36.00$            10,044.00$                 3.91$              1,090.89$                   3.91$              1,090.89$                   8.81$              2,457.99$                   

7 Misc. Vegetation & Tree Removal

7.01 General Removal and/or Trimming Vegetation LS 1 -$                            10,091.95$     10,091.95$                 10,091.95$     10,091.95$                 2,907.88$       2,907.88$                   2,907.88$       2,907.88$                   18,603.81$     18,603.81$                 

7.02 Intentionally Left Blank

7.03 Intentionally Left Blank

7.04 Intentionally Left Blank

8 Mailbox,  removal/reinstall and new

8.01 Intentionally Left Blank

8.02 Intentionally Left Blank

9 Grout Fill Abandonded Pipe (flowable fill) CY 3 3,300.00$       9,900.00$                   2,880.00$       8,640.00$                   2,880.00$       8,640.00$                   5,983.55$       17,950.65$                 5,983.55$       17,950.65$                 3,829.49$       11,488.47$                 

10 Remove Existing Items

10.01 Valve EA 1 3,200.00$       3,200.00$                   1,009.20$       1,009.20$                   1,009.20$       1,009.20$                   669.51$          669.51$                      669.51$          669.51$                      5,623.09$       5,623.09$                   

10.02 Ex. Forcemain LF 30 250.00$          7,500.00$                   33.64$            1,009.20$                   33.64$            1,009.20$                   148.55$          4,456.50$                   148.55$          4,456.50$                   224.93$          6,747.90$                   

10.03 Air Release Valve EA 1 1,850.00$       1,850.00$                   2,018.39$       2,018.39$                   2,018.39$       2,018.39$                   1,791.00$       1,791.00$                   1,791.00$       1,791.00$                   1,938.18$       1,938.18$                   

10.04 Intentionally Left Blank

11 Pipe  (Wastewater)    

11.01 HDPE (DR 11), 4" LF 693 270.00$          187,110.00$               153.36$          106,278.48$               153.36$          106,278.48$               124.72$          86,430.96$                 124.72$          86,430.96$                 127.55$          88,392.15$                 

11.02 PVC (C-900), 4" LF 45 180.00$          8,100.00$                   -$                            276.04$          12,421.80$                 276.04$          12,421.80$                 457.60$          20,592.00$                 457.60$          20,592.00$                 114.22$          5,139.90$                   

11.03 Intentionally Left Blank

11.04 Intentionally Left Blank

11.05 Intentionally Left Blank

12 HDPE MJ Adapters (Wastewater)    

12.01      4" EA 3 500.00$          1,500.00$                   2,256.00$       6,768.00$                   2,256.00$       6,768.00$                   903.15$          2,709.45$                   903.15$          2,709.45$                   3,116.72$       9,350.16$                   

13 DI  Fittings (Wastewater)    

13.01      Bends, <90, 4" EA 8 950.00$          7,600.00$                   946.76$          7,574.08$                   946.76$          7,574.08$                   542.66$          4,341.28$                   542.66$          4,341.28$                   1,129.29$       9,034.32$                   

13.02      Bends,   90, 4" EA 2 1,950.00$       3,900.00$                   970.56$          1,941.12$                   970.56$          1,941.12$                   567.43$          1,134.86$                   567.43$          1,134.86$                   1,151.46$       2,302.92$                   

13.03 Intentionally Left Blank

13.04 Intentionally Left Blank

13.05  Sleeves, 4" EA 2 750.00$          1,500.00$                   442.16$          884.32$                      442.16$          884.32$                      2,439.40$       4,878.80$                   2,439.40$       4,878.80$                   1,106.20$       2,212.40$                   

14 Pipe Joint Restrains    

14.01      4" EA 2 2,500.00$       5,000.00$                   360.83$          721.66$                      360.83$          721.66$                      442.40$          884.80$                      442.40$          884.80$                      560.88$          1,121.76$                   

14.02 Intentionally Left Blank

14.03 Intentionally Left Blank

15 Valves (Wastewater)    

15.01      Plug, 4" EA 2 5,900.00$       11,800.00$                 6,894.73$       13,789.46$                 6,894.73$       13,789.46$                 2,785.08$       5,570.16$                   2,785.08$       5,570.16$                   3,106.96$       6,213.92$                   

15.02 Intentionally Left Blank

15.03 Intentionally Left Blank

15.04 Intentionally Left Blank

15.05 Intentionally Left Blank

16 Tapping Sleeves (Wastewater) (316 SS)    

16.01 Intentionally Left Blank

16.02 Intentionally Left Blank

17 Air Release Valves  (Wastewater)    

17.01      Above ground EA 1 9,500.00$       9,500.00$                   7,961.63$       7,961.63$                   7,961.63$       7,961.63$                   8,714.03$       8,714.03$                   8,714.03$       8,714.03$                   9,088.89$       9,088.89$                   

17.02      Fiberglass enclosure EA 1 4,100.00$       4,100.00$                   1,744.82$       1,744.82$                   1,744.82$       1,744.82$                   2,065.66$       2,065.66$                   2,065.66$       2,065.66$                   3,204.34$       3,204.34$                   

18 Pipeline Connections a Structures    

18.01 Lift Station EA 1 10,000.00$     10,000.00$                 10,747.00$     10,747.00$                 10,747.00$     10,747.00$                 10,990.55$     10,990.55$                 10,990.55$     10,990.55$                 16,148.66$     16,148.66$                 

18.02 Intentionally Left Blank

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

FORCE MAIN 4-D SERVING LIFT STATION RTU 231

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc.

 NO BID  NO BID 

BID TABULATION 

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

Harris McBurney Landmark Woodruff & Sons

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 



PROJECT NAME: Southwest Service Area D Force Main Replacement - Lift Station 4D

PROJECT NUMBER: 6089781

ITEM 

NO.

DESCRIPTION U/M QTY.  UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 UNIT PRICE

($) 

 EXTENDED PRICE

($) 

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

FORCE MAIN 4-D SERVING LIFT STATION RTU 231

C-Squared Certified General Contractor, Inc.

 NO BID  NO BID 

BID TABULATION 

IFBC NO. 24-TA005521JK

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

Harris McBurney Landmark Woodruff & Sons

 BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS  BID A 390 CALENDAR DAYS  BID B 330 CALENDAR DAYS 

19 Temporary Bypass Pumping LS 1 15,750.00$     15,750.00$                 15,695.35$     15,695.35$                 15,695.35$     15,695.35$                 24,943.75$     24,943.75$                 24,943.75$     24,943.75$                 19,870.88$     19,870.88$                 

20 Intentionally Left Blank

21 Intentionally Left Blank

22 Erosion Control LS 1 13,500.00$     13,500.00$                 2,160.00$       2,160.00$                   2,160.00$       2,160.00$                   3,193.00$       3,193.00$                   3,193.00$       3,193.00$                   1,000.00$       1,000.00$                   

22.01 Intentionally Left Blank

22.02 Silt Fencing LF 131 13.00$            1,703.00$                   14.40$            1,886.40$                   14.40$            1,886.40$                   111.88$          14,656.28$                 111.88$          14,656.28$                 46.69$            6,116.39$                   

23 Traffic Control LS 1 35,000.00$     35,000.00$                 5,050.96$       5,050.96$                   5,050.96$       5,050.96$                   52,930.80$     52,930.80$                 52,930.80$     52,930.80$                 27,624.56$     27,624.56$                 

24 Intentionally Left Blank

25 Intentionally Left Blank

26 Remove / reinstall railing section of guardrail EA 2 10,000.00$     20,000.00$                 1,009.20$       2,018.40$                   1,009.20$       2,018.40$                   817.60$          1,635.20$                   817.60$          1,635.20$                   6,541.38$       13,082.76$                 

27 Remove / reinstall street signage EA 2 1,800.00$       3,600.00$                   638.35$          1,276.70$                   638.35$          1,276.70$                   248.00$          496.00$                      248.00$          496.00$                      746.54$          1,493.08$                   

28 Intentionally Left Blank

29 Intentionally Left Blank

     

SubTotal Construction Cost 460,311.50$               317,232.09$               317,232.09$               382,135.97$               382,135.97$               370,052.67$               

30 Mobilization (% of SubTotal) 10%   46,031.15$                   31,723.21$                   31,723.21$                   23,337.02$                 23,337.02$                   37,005.27$                 

31 Record Drawings 2%   9,206.23$                     6,344.64$                     6,344.64$                     4,980.44$                   4,980.44$                     7,401.05$                   

32 Contingency (10% of SubTotal) 10%   46,031.15$                   31,723.21$                   31,723.21$                   38,213.60$                 38,213.60$                   37,005.27$                 

  Total Construction Cost   561,580.03$               No Bid 387,023.15$               387,023.15$               448,667.03$               448,667.03$               451,464.26$               No Bid
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