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MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 
INTENT TO AWARD 

IFB NO. / TITLE 

24-TA004989DJ Lake
Manatee Water Treatment
Plant Sedimentation Basin
C Sludge Collection
Upgrade

DATE POSTED MC __________
 

DS _________ 

PROCUREMENT 
REPRESENTATIVE 

Dave Janney, Procurement 
Agent III 

PROJECTED
AWARD DATE April 9, 2024

DEPARTMENT/DIVISION Utilities Department AUTHORIZED BY 
DATE 

Jacob Erickson, Purchasing Official 
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Florida Design 
Contractors, LLC. for the provision of Lake Manatee Water Treatment Plant Sedimentation Basin C Sludge Collection 
Upgrade. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26. 

BACKGROUND/EVALUATION 

Replacing the existing travelling bridge system located in basin C with new Ovivo traveling bridges along with 
ancillary equipment, valving and controls as shown in the bid plans and specifications. 

The solicitation was advertised on November 8, 2023, on the Manatee County website and DemandStar. It was also 
provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast 
Builders Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members and in the Bradenton 
Herald and Tempo News newspapers.  Responses were received from the following firms:  

4. TLC Diversified, Inc., Palmetto, FL1. Florida Design Contractors, LLC., Lake Park, FL
2. Poole & Kent Company of Florida, Miami, FL
3. Razorback LLC., Tarpon Springs, FL

The following firms were deemed non-responsive/non-responsible: None 

EVALUATION SUMMARY:  

Florida Design Contractors, LLC. was the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s).  A bid tabulation of the results is 
attached to this Notice of Intent to Award. 

RECOMMENDATION 
The Procurement Division and the Utilities Department recommend award to Florida Design Contractors, LLC. 

ATTACHMENTS 
(List in order of attached) 

Bid Tabulation COST $5,751,592.00 



1 Mobilization 1 LS $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $394,000.00 $394,000.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Preconstruction Video 1 LS $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 No Bid No Bid
3 Record Drawings 1 LS $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid

$286,000.00 $286,000.00 $607,000.00 $607,000.00 $429,000.00 $631,000.00 $397,900.00

4 Demolition 1 LS $364,700.00 $364,700.00 $364,700.00 $364,700.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $155,000.00 $155,000.00 $193,000.00 $193,000.00 $131,300.00 $131,300.00 No Bid No Bid
5 Ovivo Traveling Bridge Equipment Package 1 LS $3,900,000.00 $3,900,000.00 $3,900,000.00 $3,900,000.00 $3,800,000.00 $3,800,000.00 $3,800,000.00 $3,800,000.00 $4,830,000.00 $4,830,000.00 $5,000,000.00 $5,000,000.00 $4,146,100.00 $4,146,100.00 No Bid No Bid
6 Epoxy Crack Injection 50 LF $202.00 $10,100.00 $202.00 $10,100.00 $780.00 $39,000.00 $780.00 $39,000.00 $200.00 $10,000.00 $240.00 $12,000.00 $250.00 $12,500.00 No Bid No Bid
7 Polyurethane Foam Grout Crack Injection 1600 LF $101.00 $161,600.00 $101.00 $161,600.00 $230.00 $368,000.00 $230.00 $368,000.00 $220.00 $352,000.00 $265.00 $424,000.00 $122.00 $195,200.00 No Bid No Bid
8 Joint Sealant Replacement 2600 LF $34.00 $88,400.00 $34.00 $88,400.00 $30.00 $78,000.00 $30.00 $78,000.00 $38.00 $98,800.00 $47.00 $122,200.00 $38.00 $98,800.00 No Bid No Bid
9 Spall/Delamination Repair 118 SF $415.00 $48,970.00 $415.00 $48,970.00 $800.00 $94,400.00 $800.00 $94,400.00 $1,200.00 $141,600.00 $1,500.00 $177,000.00 $560.00 $66,080.00 No Bid No Bid

10 Deck/Coating Repair 160 SF $50.00 $8,000.00 $50.00 $8,000.00 $110.00 $17,600.00 $110.00 $17,600.00 $90.00 $14,400.00 $100.00 $16,000.00 $432.00 $69,120.00 No Bid No Bid
11 Lime Building Expansion Dowel and Spall Repair 1 LS $8,050.00 $8,050.00 $8,050.00 $8,050.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $107,300.00 $107,300.00 No Bid No Bid
12 6" Dezurik Swing Check Valve 6 EA $10,130.00 $60,780.00 $10,130.00 $60,780.00 $4,600.00 $27,600.00 $4,600.00 $27,600.00 $18,300.00 $109,800.00 $20,000.00 $120,000.00 $9,900.00 $59,400.00 No Bid No Bid
13 6" Pratt Full Round Port Plug Valve 28 EA $3,280.00 $91,840.00 $3,280.00 $91,840.00 $2,700.00 $75,600.00 $2,700.00 $75,600.00 $17,400.00 $487,200.00 $19,500.00 $546,000.00 $6,750.00 $189,000.00 No Bid No Bid
14 4" Pratt Full Round Port Plug Valve 6 EA $4,580.00 $27,480.00 $4,580.00 $27,480.00 $2,100.00 $12,600.00 $2,100.00 $12,600.00 $16,300.00 $97,800.00 $18,600.00 $111,600.00 $6,500.00 $39,000.00 No Bid No Bid
15 4" Valmatic Butterfly Valve 6 EA $2,250.00 $13,500.00 $2,250.00 $13,500.00 $1,800.00 $10,800.00 $1,800.00 $10,800.00 $15,500.00 $93,000.00 $17,800.00 $106,800.00 $6,400.00 $38,400.00 No Bid No Bid
16 Electrical, Instrumentation, Integration, and

C t l
1 LS $127,000.00 $127,000.00 $127,000.00 $127,000.00 $249,512.00 $249,512.00 $249,512.00 $249,512.00 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $78,000.00 $78,000.00 $113,000.00 $113,000.00 No Bid No Bid

17 Permit Allowance 1 LS $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00
18 Basin Cleaning 1 LS $22,300.00 $22,300.00 $22,300.00 $22,300.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $67,400.00 $67,400.00 No Bid No Bid

$4,942,720.00 $4,942,720.00 $5,493,112.00 $5,493,112.00 $6,567,600.00 $7,056,600.00 $5,342,600.00 No Bid
$5,228,720.00 $5,228,720.00 $6,100,112.00 $6,100,112.00 $6,996,600.00 $7,687,600.00 $5,740,500.00 No Bid

19 Contingency (Used only with County Approval) 10% LS $522,872.00 $522,872.00 $610,011.20 $610,011.20 $699,660.00 $768,760.00 $574,050.00 No Bid
$5,751,592.00 $5,751,592.00 $6,710,123.20 $6,710,123.20 $7,696,260.00 $8,456,360.00 $6,314,550.00 No Bid

MISCELLANEOUS

TAB SHEET
24-TA004989DJ LMWTP SEDIMENTATION BASIN C SLUDGE COLLECTION UPGRADE

Bidders must provide prices for each available line item on each tab for their bid to be considered 
responsive.

*To be considered responsive, it is the sole responsibility of the bidder to correctly calculate and 
manually enter all sub-total, contingency, and total bid price fields.

ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Florida Design Contractors

UNIT
UNIT PRICE

BID B
309 Calendar 

AMOUNT
BID B

309 Calendar 

UNIT PRICE
BID A

399 Calendar 

AMOUNT
BID A

399 Calendar 

SUBTOTAL
LIME SLUDGE IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL

GRAND TOTAL

SUBTOTAL ALL SECTIONS, MISCELLANEOUS AND LIME SLUDGE IMPROVEMENTS

Poole & Kent

UNIT PRICE
BID A

399 Calendar 

AMOUNT
BID A

399 Calendar 

UNIT PRICE
BID B

309 Calendar 

AMOUNT
BID B

309 Calendar 

Razorback

UNIT PRICE
BID A

399 Calendar 

AMOUNT
BID A

399 Calendar 

UNIT PRICE
BID B

309 Calendar 

AMOUNT
BID B

309 Calendar 

TLC

UNIT PRICE
BID A

399 Calendar 

AMOUNT
BID A

399 Calendar 

UNIT PRICE
BID B

309 Calendar 

AMOUNT
BID B

309 Calendar 
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