

**TABULATION 09-0250 DC**  
**NORTH REGIONAL WATER RECLAMATION FACILITY INFLUENT STRUCTURE**

				Beach Construction Company, Inc. P.O. Box 141860 Gainesville, FL 32614 352-335-5556	Brandes Design-Build, Inc. 2151 NE Coachman Rd. Clearwater, FL 33765 727-445-7544	Cardinal Contractors, Inc. 2201 Cantu Ct. Suite #202 Sarasota, FL 34232 941-377-8555	Close Construction, Inc. 301 NW 4th Ave. Okeechobee, FL 34972 863-467-0831	Encore Construction Co. P.O. Box 771599 Winter Garden, FL 34777-1599 407-877-5903
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST. QTY.	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
	<b>BID "A" - Based on Completion Time of <u>420</u> calendar days</b>							
1.	Mobilization	LS	1	\$265,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$380,000.00	\$500,000.00
2	Construction Influent Structure	LS	1	\$4,685,000.00	\$4,650,000.00	\$4,607,000.00	\$4,532,859.00	\$4,650,000.00
3	Miscellaneous Work & Cleanup	LS	1	\$0.00	\$50,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$10,000.00
4	Discretionary Work			\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00
	<b>TOTAL BID PRICE</b>			<b>\$5,370,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,420,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,397,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,347,859.00</b>	<b>\$5,580,000.00</b>
	<b>BID "B" - Based on Completion Time of <u>300</u> calendar days</b>							
1.	Mobilization	LS	1	\$265,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$380,000.00	\$500,000.00
2	Construction Influent Structure	LS	1	\$4,815,000.00	\$4,650,000.00	\$4,792,000.00	\$4,532,859.00	\$4,830,000.00
3	Miscellaneous Work & Cleanup	LS	1	\$0.00	\$50,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$10,000.00
4	Discretionary Work			\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00
	<b>TOTAL BID PRICE</b>			<b>\$5,500,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,420,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,582,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,347,859.00</b>	<b>\$5,760,000.00</b>
	Acknowledge Addendum 1			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Acknowledge Addendum 2			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Acknowledge Addendum 3			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Subcontractor Percentage			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	The Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Drug Free Work Place Certification			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes

**TABULATION 09-0250 DC  
NORTH REGIONAL WATER RECLAMATION FACILITY INFLUENT STRUCTURE**

				General Contracting Services, Inc. P.O. Box 630 Placida, FL 33946 941-697-2047	John Reynolds & Sons, Inc. 5634 W 5th St. Jacksonville, FL 32254 904-695-9290	Adams Robinson Enterprises, Inc. 2735 Needmore Rd. Dayton, OH 45414 937-274-5318	RTD Construction, Inc. P.O. Box 996 Zephyrhills, FL 33539-0996 813-783-9119
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST. QTY.	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
	<b>BID "A" - Based on Completion Time of <u>420</u> calendar days</b>						
1.	Mobilization	LS	1	\$225,000.00	\$500,000.00	\$250,000.00	\$265,000.00
2	Construction Influent Structure	LS	1	\$4,756,000.00	\$4,025,000.00	\$4,868,000.00	\$4,377,700.00
3	Miscellaneous Work & Cleanup	LS	1	\$287,900.00	\$120,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$25,000.00
4	Discretionary Work			\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00
	<b>TOTAL BID PRICE</b>			<b>\$5,688,900.00</b>	<b>\$5,065,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,548,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,087,700.00</b>
	<b>BID "B" - Based on Completion Time of <u>300</u> calendar days</b>						
1.	Mobilization	LS	1	\$225,000.00	\$550,000.00	\$250,000.00	\$280,000.00
2	Construction Influent Structure	LS	1	\$4,756,000.00	\$4,125,000.00	\$5,228,000.00	\$4,637,700.00
3	Miscellaneous Work & Cleanup	LS	1	\$287,900.00	\$120,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$25,000.00
4	Discretionary Work			\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00
	<b>TOTAL BID PRICE</b>			<b>\$5,688,900.00</b>	<b>\$5,215,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,908,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,362,700.00</b>
	Acknowledge Addendum 1			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Acknowledge Addendum 2			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Acknowledge Addendum 3			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Subcontractor Percentage			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	The Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Drug Free Work Place Certification			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes

**TABULATION 09-0250 DC  
NORTH REGIONAL WATER RECLAMATION FACILITY INFLUENT STRUCTURE**

				TLC Diversified, Inc. P.O. Box 2039 Blanding Blvd. Middleburg, FL 32050 904-406-6100	Vogel Bros. Building Co. P.O. Box 5200 Lakeland, FL 33807-5200 863-646-5078	Westra Construction Corp. P.O. Box 1149 Palmetto, FL 34220 941-723-1611	Wharton-Smith, Inc. P.O. Box 471028 Lake Monroe, FL 32747 407-321-8410
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST. QTY.	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
<b>BID "A" - Based on Completion Time of <u>420</u> calendar days</b>							
1.	Mobilization	LS	1	\$145,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$220,000.00	\$360,000.00
2	Construction Influent Structure	LS	1	\$4,748,000.00	\$4,554,000.00	\$4,580,000.00	\$4,592,000.00
3	Miscellaneous Work & Cleanup	LS	1	\$24,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$37,000.00	\$20,000.00
4	Discretionary Work			\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00
<b>TOTAL BID PRICE</b>				<b>\$5,337,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,474,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,257,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,392,000.00</b>
<b>BID "B" - Based on Completion Time of <u>300</u> calendar days</b>							
1.	Mobilization	LS	1	\$145,000.00	\$450,000.00	No Bid	\$360,000.00
2	Construction Influent Structure	LS	1	\$5,114,840.00	\$4,484,000.00	No Bid	\$4,522,000.00
3	Miscellaneous Work & Cleanup	LS	1	\$24,000.00	\$50,000.00	No Bid	\$20,000.00
4	Discretionary Work			\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	No Bid	\$420,000.00
<b>TOTAL BID PRICE</b>				<b>\$5,703,840.00</b>	<b>\$5,404,000.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$5,322,000.00</b>
	Acknowledge Addendum 1			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Acknowledge Addendum 2			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Acknowledge Addendum 3			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Subcontractor Percentage			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	The Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Drug Free Work Place Certification			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes

Keyed by: Carol Richards Date: 2-27-09  
 Checked by: Jessica Smith Date: 2-27-09