MANATEE COUNTY PURCHASING
IFB #09-0246DC PARRISH OLD SCHOOL HOUSE WINDOWS
BID OPENING JANUARY 6, 2009 - TALLY OF SUBMITTALS

TOTAL BID PRICE

Universal Window

Wind-Tech Products

Tri-Tech Consttr

REMCO Builders

Quality Screening

DE Murphy Constr

Bradenton FL Braselton GA Bradenton FL Bradenton FL Sarasota FL Sarasota FL

BID "A" - 90 DAYS

OPTION 1 - 501 Frames S 177,763.92 | $ 387,850.00 | S 367,005.00 | $ 298,000.00 | $ 191,418.00 | $ 232,612.00
OPTION 2 - 501 Frames S 160,533.67 | no bid S 348,654.00 | S 278,000.00 | $ 160,940.00 | S 221,912.00
BID "B" - 60 DAYS

OPTION 1 - 501 Frames S 177,763.92 | no bid S 389,654.00 | S 298,000.00 | 191,418.00 | $ 232,612.00
OPTION 2 - 501 Frames S 160,533.67 | no bid S 371,154.00 | $ 278,000.00 | $ 160,940.00 | $ 221,912.00
Mfr - Window YKK VHS 50 TU Arch Alum 3100 YKK #05-317.03 YKK Alum EFCO 5-526 | YKK/YHS 50 + YHC

Ykk Alum EFCO D-300

Mfr - Door

YK Y35H

Arch Alum 3100

YKK #05-317.03

YKK/YHS 50 + YHC

e

JLB Builders

TOTAL BID PRICE MarSac Devel E.O.Koc.h Constr Hayo Constr Cairns (;orp Absolu.te Alum
Bradenton FL Sebring FL St Petersburg FL Bradenton FL Tampa FL Venice FL
PGT Series 701 Kawneer Kawneer IR501/500
BID "A" - 90 DAYS Series 350 Kawneer 350MS
OPTION 1 - 501 Frames S 280,000.00 | $ 283,604.00 | S 249,500.00 nd bid S 145,000.00 | $ 204,604.00
OPTION 2 - 501 Frames S 269,000.00 | § 274,189.00 | 241,000.00 | S 220,000.00 | S 149,000.00 | 185,614.00
: Hurricane Protect -
BID "B" - 60 DAYS Miramar FL
OPTION 1 - 501 Frames S 316,000.00 | S 283,604.00 | S 249,500.00 | $ 217,178.00 | S 145,000.00 | § 217,687.00
OPTION 2 - 501 Frames ) 309,000.00 | $ 274,189.00 | S 241,000.00 | § 212,393.00| S 149,000.00 | no bid
Mfr - Window Kawneer IR501/500 Kawheer Kawneer IR-1600 Graham Arch Kawneer IR500 Graham Arch
Mfr - Door Kawneer 350 Series [Kawneer Kawneer IR-350 YKK AP American Kawneer IR350 Kawneer 350MS
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