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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Here Rentals, Inc. and
Synergy Equipment for the provision of heavy equipment rental

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITV
Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26.

BACKG ROUN D/EVALUATION

In the course of daily operations. Manatee County departments require the ability to rent a wide variety of heavy
equipment. These needs require the availability of several sources and therefore a multiple award of this solicitation is
in order.

The solicitation was advertised on March 31, 2019 on the Manatee County website and DemandStar. It was also
provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce and the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce for release of
its members. Responses were received from the following firms:

1. Here Rentals, Inc., Sarasota, FL

2. Synergy Equipment, Sarasota, FL

EVALUATION SUMMARY:
Here Rentals, Inc. and Synergy Equipment were the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s). A bid tabulation of the
results is attached to this Notice of Intent to Award.

RECOMMENDATION
The Procurement Division and the Property Management Department recommend award to Here Rentals, Inc. and
Synergy Equipment.

Blanket Purchase
Order

NAME AND NUMBER OF #5010003698-
FUNDING SOURCE 596000

ATTACHMENTS Bid Tabulation
(List in order of attached)

Estimated Annual

COST Spend $150,000 FUNDS VERIFIED N/A

Intent to Award (Rev 3-9-18)



NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD - BID TABULATION

HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL
IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION
GROUP A - CRANES

A1 20 Ton, Hydraulic, Truck Mounted, Rubber Tire

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS
A2 20 Ton, Metal Track Crawler (NO BID)
A3 25 Ton, Truck Mounted (NO BID)
A4 25 Ton, Metal Track Crawler (NO BID)
A5 35 Ton, Truck Mounted (NO BID)
A6 35 Ton, Metal Track Crawler (NO BID)
A7 50 Ton, Truck Mounted (NO BID)
A8 50 Ton, Metal Track Crawler (NO BID)
A9 50 Ton, Friction, Metal Tracked (NO BID)
A10 50 Ton, Friction, Truck Mount (NO BID)
A11 90 Ton, Friction, Truck Mounted (NO BID)
A12 120 Ton, Truck Mounted (NO BID)

HOUR DAY WEEK
DELIVERY &

MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$687. 00 $1, 882. 00
$125.00/HOUR

$4, 542. 00 $4, 542. 00/MNTH $4, 542. 00/MNTH EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

GROUP B - LOW BOYS
50 Ton capacity with 12' width, Mack Tractor

B1 and Roger Trailer (NO BID)
30 Ton capacity with 10' width, Mack Tractor

B2 and Roger Trailer (NO BID)

HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6)MONTHS
DELIVERY &

PICKUP CHARGES

GROUP C - FRONT END WHEEL LOADER
C1 1.5 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 91 OF or Equal

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS
*add* HERC RENTALS

Forks

Bucket

Root Rake

Grao Ie R k

SYNERGY RENTALS
*add* SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

Hydraulic Quick Couplers
Forks

Bucket

$125. 00/HOUR
$605.00 $1,254.00 $3, 151.00 $3, 151/MNTH $3, 151/MNTH EACH WAY

$101.00
$80.00

$118.00
$207.00

$278.00
$197.00
$278. 00
$479.00

$524. 00 $524/MNTH
$404.00 $404/MNTH
$524. 00 S524/MNTH
$905. 00 $905/MNTH

S404/MNTH

$355. 00

NoCha e

$25. 00
No Charge

$1, 000. 00

N/C
$65.00

N/C

$2, 095. 00 $6,285.00 $12,570.00 $100 EACH WAY

N/C
$145. 00

N/C

N/C
$435. 00

N/C

N/C

$870.00
N/C



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

C2 2.0 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 918F or Equal
Without Operator

HERC RENTALS (no accessories)
C3 2. 5 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 928F or Equal

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS (no accessories)

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
a

Forks
Bucket
Root Rake

Grapple Rake
C4 3. 0 Cubic Yard Bucket, Cat 938F or Equal

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS no accessories)

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
"add"

Forks

Bucket

Root Rake
Grapple Rake

C5 4.0 Cubic yard Bucket, Cat 950 F or Equal
Without Operator

HERC RENTALS (no accessories)

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
"add"

Forks

Bucket

Root Rake

Grapple Rake
Grappler Hooks

HOUR DAY

$588. 00

$702. 00

$575. 00

$100. 00
No Charge

$150.00
$250. 00

WEEK

$1, 646. 00

$1, 764. 00

$1, 555. 00

$200. 00
N/C

$300. 00
$600. 00

MONTH (3)MONTHS

$4,222.00 $4,222/MNTH

DELIVERY &
(6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$125.00/HOUR
$4, 222/MNTH EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$4, 726. 00 $4, 726/MNTH $4, 726/MNTH EACH WAY

$3,650.00 $10,950.00 $21,900.00 $150 EACH WAY

$400. 00
N/C

$600. 00
$1,200.00

$1, 200. 00
N/C

$1, 800. 00
$3,600.00

$2,400.00 $
N/C

$3, 600. 00
$7,200.00

$125.00/HOUR
$726. 00

$575. 00

$100. 00
No Charge

$150.00
$250. 00

$843.00

$950.00

$125. 00
No Charge

$150.00
$250. 00

$1, 100. 00

$2, 038. 00

$1, 555. 00

$200.00
N/C

$300.00
$600. 00

$2, 128. 00

$2, 165. 00

$250. 00
N/C

$300. 00
$600.00

$2, 995. 00

$4, 878. 00

$3, 650. 00

$400. 00
N/C

$600. 00
$1,200. 00

$6,272.00

$5, 175. 00

$500. 00
N/C

$600. 00
$1,200. 00
$7, 750. 00

$4,878/MNTH

$10, 950

$1,200.00
N/C

$1,800.00
$3, 600. 00

$6, 272/MNTH

$15,525.00

$1,500.00
N/C

$1,800.00
$3,600.00

$23,250.00

$4, 878/MNTH

$21, 900. 00

$2, 400. 00

N/C

$3,600.00
$7, 200. 00

$6, 272/MNTH

$31,050.00

$3,000.00
N/C

$3,600.00
$7, 200. 00

$46,500.00

EACH WAY

$150 EACH W/

$125.00/HOUR
EACH WAY

$175 EACH W^



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

GROUP D. FRONT END CRAWLER
LOADER

D1 No bids for Group D

GROUP E . DUMP TRUCKS
E1 5 Yard Capacity

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
E2 Tandem -15 Yard Capacity

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS
E3 Tri-axle -18 Yard Capacity (NO BIDS)
E4 Semi-tractor trailer dump (NO BIDS)
E5 Flatbed - 2 Ton Capacity

Without Operator

HERO RENTALS
E6 30 Ton Dump Truck

Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

E7 Articulated Dump Truck, 40-Ton Capacity
(NO BIDS)

HOUR DAY

$364. 00

$252. 00

$718. 00

$252. 00

$2, 500. 00

WEEK

$1, 000. 00

$778. 00

$2, 346. 00

$868.00

DELIVERY &
MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$125. 00/HOUR
$2,352.00 $2,352/MNTH $2,352/MNTH EACH WAY

$1,720.00 $5, 160.00 $10, 320. 00 $125 EACH WAY

$125. 00/HOUR
$5,488.00 $5,488/MNTH $5,488/MNTH EACH WAY

$125. 00/HOUR
$1,792.00 $1,792/MNTH $1,792/MNTH EACH WAY

$4, 500.00 $10, 300. 00 $30,900.00 $61,800.00 $250 EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

GROUP F - DRAGLINE - BUCKET &
CLAMSHELL

F1 No bids for Group F

GROUP G - EXCAVATORS
Excavator with Hydroscopic Boom, 30' Reach,

G1 Gradall, Badger or Equal
Without Operator

HERC RENTALS
Mini Excavator with Trailer, Takeuchi Model

G2 #TB25 or Equal
Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
Mini Excavator, 11,000 Ibs with Rubber Tracks,

G3 Kubota V2203-M Model or Equal
Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
G4 Watkiin Excavator (NO BIDS)

HOUR DAY

$883. 00

$269. 00

$420. 00

$311.00

WEEK

$2, 128. 00

$745. 00

$1, 138. 00

DELIVERY &
MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$826.00

$125.00/HOUR
$5, 600. 00 $5, 600/MNTH $5, 600/MNTH EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$1,462.00 $1,462/MNTH $1,462/MNTH EACH WAY

$2,700.00 $8, 100.00 $16,200.00 $125 EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$324.00 $914.00 $2,128.00 $2, 128/MNTH $2, 128/MNTH EACH WAY

$1,850. 00 $5, 550. 00 $11,100.00 $125 EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

GROUP H - BULLDOZERS
H1 CAT D3CLGP or Equal

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (JD 450)
H2 CAT D4HLGP or Equal

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (JD 650)
H4 CAT D6HLGP or Equal

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (JD 700)
CAT D7 LGP - With Landfill Package (NO

H5 BIDS)
H6 CAT D7H or Equal (NO BIDS)
H7 CAT D8n or Equal (NO BIDS)

HOUR DAY WEEK
DELIVERY &

MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$631. 00

$420. 00

$756.00

$500.00

$1, 159. 00

$572. 00

$1, 568. 00

$1,400. 00

$1, 837. 00

$1,600.00

$2,822.00

$2, 100. 00

$125.00/HOUR
$3,991.00 $3,991/MNTH $3,991/MNTH EACH WAY

$3, 150. 00 $9, 450. 00 $18. 900. 00 $150 EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$4, 620. 00 $4, 620/MNTH $4, 620/MNTH EACH WAY

$4, 300. 00 $12, 900. 00 $25, 800. 00 $150 EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$7,351.00 $7,351/MNTH $7,351/MNTH EACH WAY

$5,250.00 $15,750.00 $31,500.00 $150EACYWAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

GROUP I. BACKHOE, RUBBER TIRE
11 3/4 Yard Bucket

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

"add"

Extended Boom

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (JD 310)
"add"
Rear Bucket

4 Wheel Drive

Extended Boom

12 1 Yard Bucket (NO BID)
13 1 1/4 Yard Bucket (NO BID)

HOUR DAY

$325. 00

WEEK MONTH (3)MONTHS (6) MONTHS
DELIVERY &

PICKUP CHARGES

$869. 00
$125.00/HOUR

$2, 143. 00 $2, 143/MNTH $2, 143/MNTH EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$353. 00

$275.00

No Charge
No Charge

$25.00

$952. 00

$650. 00

N/C
N/C

$45.00

$2, 240. 00

$1,550. 00

N/C
N/C

$75. 00

$2, 240/MNTH

$4,650.00

N/C
N/C

$225. 00

$2, 240/MNTH

$9,300.00

N/C
N/C

$450. 00



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION
GROUP J - BACKHOE, CRAWLER/METAL
TRACK
GATE 70 B or Equal. Min 14,500#, Max

J1 17,500#, Min. Digging Depth 15'
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
Min 25,600# - Max 30,000#, Min. Digging

J2 Depth 18' 4" w/rubber tracks
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (RT 140)
CAT 312L or Equal. Min 26, 000#, Max.

J3 30,000#, Min. Digging Depth 19'
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (145)
CAT 320L or Equal. Min 42, 000#, Max.

J4 50,000#, Min. Digging Depth 21'
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (200)

CAT 320L Long Reach or Equal., Min.
J5 45, 000#, Max. 50, 000#, Min. Digging Depth 38'

Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (200LR)
CAT 325L or Equal. Min. 50, 000#, Max.

J6 60,000#, Min. Digging Depth 24'
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (250)

HOUR DAY WEEK MONTH (3)MONTHS
DELIVERY &

(6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$400.00

$595. 00

$585. 00

$695. 00

$1,350. 00

$890. 00

$1, 138. 00

$1,600.00

$1, 562. 00

$1, 985. 00

$3,240.00

$2, 355. 00

$2, 700. 00

$4,370.00

$4, 170. 00

$4, 850. 00

$8,200. 00

$5,700.00

$8, 100.00

$13, 110.00

$12,510.00

$14,500.00

$24,600.00

$17, 100.00

$16,200.00 $125 EACH WAY

$26,220.00 $175 EACH WAY

$25,020.00 $175 EACH WAY

$29, 100.00 $200 EACH WAY

$49, 200. 00 $250 EACH WAY

$34, 200. 00 $225 EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION
CAT EL330L or Equal. Min. 65, 000#, Max.

J7 70,000#, Min. Digigng Depth 26'
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (300)
CAT 350L or Equal. Min. 95,000#, Max.

J8 110,000, Min. Diging Depth 30' (NO BID)
CAT 375L or Equal. Min. 170, 000#. Max.

J9 190,000#, Min. Digging Depth 35' (NO BID)

GROUP K - TRENCHERS
K1 Rubber tired, Vermier 450 or Equal.

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
K2 Crawler/Metal Track or Equal.

Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

GROUP L - TANKER TRUCKS
L1 5,000 Gallon Capaci*/ for Clear Water

Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

L2 Potable Water - Size Available:
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

HOUR DAY

$925.00

$112. 00

$204. 00

$513. 00

$375. 00

DELIVERY &
WEEK MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$2, 525. 00 $6, 900. 00 $20, 700. 00 $41, 400.00 $250EACYWAY

$125.00/HOUR
$429.00 $1,075.00 $2,430.00 $2,430/MNTH $2,430/MNTH EACH WAY

$508.00

$548. 00

$1,475.00

$999. 00

$1,324. 00

$1,480. 00

$3, 972. 00

$4, 440. 00

$7,944.00 $105 EACH WAY

$8,880.00 $105 EACH WAY

$3,850.00

$2,299. 00

$11,550.00

$6, 897. 00

$23, 100.00 $125 EACH WAY

$13, 794. 00 $125 EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK
DELIVERY &

MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

GROUP M- ROLLERS
Static, Double Drum Riding, 30" Drum, Asphalt

M1 and SOD

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (36" D/D)
Tandem, Riding, Vibratory, Asphalt 30" Drum

M2 (NO BID)
Vibrating, 80" min. Drum with 10 Ton Unit,

M3 Sakai Model SV91 D without operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (BOMAG 211 D)
Vibrating Sheepfoot Roller with 84" Drum, CAT

M4 Model CP563 or Equal
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
Pneumatic, Tired Sakai Model TS150H or

M5 Equal

Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (9 Wheel Roller)

GROUP N - CHERRY PICKER
27 1/2 Ton, Rough Terrain Crane, Lorain LRT-

N1 275 (NO BID)
18/20 Ton Rough Terrain Crane, Lorain LRT-

N2 18V (NO BID)

$125.00/HOUR
$167. 00 $444. 00 $832. 00 $832/MNTH $832/MNTH EACH WAY

$160.00 $440.00 $960.00 $2,880.00 $5,760.00 $95 EACH WAY

$400. 00 $1,093. 00 $2, 525. 00 $7, 575. 00 $15, 150. 00 $125 EACH WAY

$400 + $180 SF $1,093+$392 SF $2480+$1000 SF $7740+$3000 SF $14880+6000 S F $125 EACH WAY

$400. 00 $800. 00 $2, 480. 00 $7, 740.00 $14, 880. 00 $125 EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

GROUP 0. SCRAPPER
01 Scrapper, Caterpillar 615 (NO BID)
02 Scrapper, Caterpillar 623 NO BID)

GROUP P - COMPACTOR
Soil, Vibratory, Riding, Single Drum, 7 Ton or

P1 Greater

Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
Double Drum Asphalt, Caterpillar CB-224-B

P2 (NO BID)
Landfill Package, with Air Conditioned Cab,

P3 CAT 826 (NO BID)

GROUP Q - MOTAR MIXERS

Q1 6 Cubic Feet, without operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

Q2 8 Cubic Feet, without operator

HERC RENTALS

GROUP R - AERIAL WORK PLATFORMS
60' One Man Bucket, Simon Model M-P-60 or

R1 Equal, without operator

HERC RENTALS
60' Two Man Bucket, Simon Model M-P-60 or

R2 Equal, without operator

HERC RENTALS
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

HOUR DAY

$272. 00

$56.00

$96. 00

$412. 00

$412.00

$365. 00

WEEK

$740. 00

$240.00

$340. 00

$952. 00

$952. 00
$850. 00

MONTH

$1,680. 00

$595. 00

(3)MONTHS

$5, 040. 00

$1,785.00

DELIVERY &
(6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$10, 080. 00 $125 EACH WAY

$3,570.00 $75 EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$718.00 $718.00/MNTH $718.00/MNTH EACH WAY

$125. 00/HOUR
$2,464.00 $2,464.00/MNTH $2,464.00/MNTH EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$2,464.00 $2,464.00/MNTH $2,464.00/MNTH EACH WAY
$1,725. 00 $5, 175. 00 $10, 350. 00 $125 EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK
DELIVERY &

MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

GROUP S - WELLPOINT PUMPS AND
ACCESSORIES

S1 4" Pump, wellpoint
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

82 6" Pump, wellpoint

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
S3 8" Pump, wellpoint

HERC RENTALS
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

S4 10" Pump, wellpoint

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

35 12 ft. wellpoint (2' diameter) with risers and lops
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

S6 14 ft. wellpoint (2' diameter) with risers and lops
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

S7 16 ft. wellpoint (2' diameter) with risers and lops
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

S8 8" Header Pipe (20 ft. length)
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

S9 10" Header Pipe, 20 ft. (NO BID)
810 8" Discharge Pips (20 ft. length)

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

S11 10" Discharge Pipe (20 ft. length)
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

S12 8" Sleeves (NO BID)
S13 10" Sleeves (NO BID)
S14 8" Dresser Couplings (NO BID)
S15 10" Dresser Coup'ir (NO BID)
S16 Hat Plugs (NO BID)

$72. 00

$227.00

$161.00

$252. 00
$183. 00

$302. 00
$205. 00

$1.00

$1.00

$1.00

$8.00

$12.00

$16.00

$216. 00

$643.00

$483.00

$715.00

$550. 00

$852. 00
$616. 00

$3. 00

$3. 00

$3. 00

$26. 00

$36.00

$50. 00

$650.00 $1,950.00 $3,900.00 $135 EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$1,877.00 $1,877.00/MNTH $1,877.00/MNTH EACH WAY
$1,450. 00 $4, 350. 00 $8, 700. 00 $135 EACH WAY

$125. 00/HOUR
$2, 146. 00 $2, 146. 00/MNTH $2, 146. 00/MNTH EACH WAY
$1,650.00 $4,950.00 $9,900.00 $135 EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$2, 365. 00 $2, 365. 00/MNTH $2, 365. 00/MNTH EACH WAY
$1, 850. 00 $5, 550. 00 $11, 100.00 $135 EACH WAY

$11.00

$11.00

$11.00

$80.00

$110.00

$150. 00

$33.00

$33.00

$33.00

$240.00

$330. 00

$450. 00

$66.00

$66. 00

$66.00

$480.00

$660.00

$900. 00



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION
S17 Swing Joints

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

HOUR DAY WEEK

$1.00 $3. 00

MONTH (3) MONTHS

$11.00 $33.00

DELIVERY &
(6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$66.00



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

GROUP T. MISCELLANEOUS

T1 Motor Grader - JD 670, CAT 120G or Equal
Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

T1 a Motor Grader - JD 570 or Equal
Without Operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

T2 Mowing Tractor, 5' Bushog or Equal
(NO BID)

T3 Mowing Tractor, 10' Bushog or Equal
(NO BID

T4 Sidewinder Mower Tractor (NO BID)
Mower Tractor with side attachment Mowing

T5 Arm (NO BID)
Soil Stabilizer(Tamper) Bomag MPH-100,

T6 without operator
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

T7 Wheel Tractor, w/Broom or w/Blade

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (LAYMOR SM300, 3-
wheek sweeper)

T8 Rock Breaker Tractor/Truck Mounted

(NO BID)

HOUR DAY

$725. 00

$2,240. 00

$278. 00

$235. 00

WEEK MONTH (3)MONTHS (6)MONTHS
DELIVERY &

PICKUP CHARGES

$125. 00/HOUR
$1, 135. 00 $3, 190. 00 $8, 956. 00 $8, 956/MNTH $8,956/MNTH EACH WAY

$725. 00 $2, 400. 00 $6, 700. 00 $20, 100. 00 $40, 200. 00 $125 EACH WAY

$2, 400. 00

$672. 00

$600. 00

$6, 700. 00 $20, 100.00 $40, 200. 00 $125 EACH WAY

$4, 800. 00 $15, 500. 00 $46, 500. 00 $93, 000. 00 $200 EACH WAY

$125. 00/HOUR
$1,723.00 $1,723/MNTH $1,723/MNTH EACH WAY

$1, 100. 00 $3,300.00 $6,600.00 $95 EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION
T9 Truck mounted Aerial Lift & Aerial Bucket

(NO BID)
Power Post Hole Digger, Mounted, 6" to 36"

T10 Diameter (NO BID)
T11 Flatbed Tractor Trailer, Long Bed (NO BID)
T12 Short Bed (NO BID)
T13 Bobcat, 700 Series or equal

Without Operator

HERC RENTALS

HOUR DAY WEEK
DELIVERY &

MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$125. 00/HOUR
$407.00 $1,076.00 $2,231.00 $2,231/MNTH $2,321/MNTH EACH WAY

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT (T740 or 750)
T14 Bobcat, 800 Series or equal (NO BID)
T154" Jet Pump (NO BID)
T16 Boom Truck, 12 Ton (NO BID)

3/4 Ton Pick-Up Truck (4X4), Ford F250 (NO
T17 BID)
T18 125 KW Portable Generator, 230/480 Volts

HERC RENTALS
750 KW Generator (Truck Mounted), 480

T19 Volts

$385. 00

$417. 00

$1,027. 00

$1,051. 00

$2, 333. 00 $6, 999. 00 $13, 998. 00 $125 EACH WAY

$125.00/HOUR
$2,856.00 $2,856/MNTH $2,856/MNTH EACH WAY

HERC RENTALS
1000 KW Generator (Truck Mounted), 480

T20 Volts

$1,613.00 $4, 855. 00 $14, 280. 00 $14, 280/MNTH $14, 280/MNTH $125. 00/HOUR EAC

HERC RENTALS $2,419.00 $6,236. 00 $18, 480. 00 $18, 480/MNTH $18, 480/MNTH
$125. 00/HOUR
EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION
1500 KW Generator (Truck Mounted), 4160

T21 Volts

HERC RENTALS

T22 5,000 Gallon Water Wagon (NO BID)

T23 Ingersolt-Rand 185 Portable Air Compressor

HERC RENTALS

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT
Screening Plant, 1" to 4" Screens, Motor, 47+

T24 HP, Belt, 5' wide (NO BID)
Conveyor Belt, 40" H, 20" W. Height of

T25 discharge + min. of 30" wide belt.

HERC RENTALS
T26 Scissor Lift 19-20 ft; must fit door opening

of 74" (safety bars collapse down)

HERC RENTALS
SYNERGY EQUIPMENT

HOUR DAY

$4, 133. 00

$118. 00

$92. 00

$112.00

$112.00
$80. 00

WEEK

$11, 424. 00

$246. 00

$280. 00

$330. 00

$213. 00
$185. 00

DELIVERY &
MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

25. 0 R
$29, 400. 00 $29, 400/MNTH $29, 400/MNTH EACH WAY

$125. 00/HOUR
$588. 00 $588/MNTH $588/MNTH EACH WAY

$520. 00 $1,560.00 $3, 120.00 $75 EACH WAY

$878.00 $878/MNTH $878/MNTH
25. 00 H UR

EACH WAY

25.
$414.00 $414/MNTH $414/MNTH EACH WAY
$315.00 $945.00 $1,890.00 $75 EACH WAY



IFB 19-R070399GL

NO. EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION HOUR DAY WEEK

SYNERGY EQUIPMENT rental schedule (HERC RENTALS did not supply a schedule)
MINIMUM HOURLY PERIOD OF RENTAL IS 8 8 HOURS

ADDITIONAL CHARGES FOR USAGE ON SATURDAY, SUNDAY OR HOLIDAYS (NO BID )

HOURS SHALL CONSTITUTE ONE-HALF (1/2) DAY OF RENTAL NO CHARGE

HOURS SHALL CONSTITUTE A FULL DAY OF RENTAL EIGHT (8) HOURS

DAYS SHALL CONSTITUTE ONE WEEK OF RENTAL SEVEN (7) DAYS

DAYS SHALL CONSTITUTE ONE MONTH OF RENTAL 28 DAYS

DELIVERY &
MONTH (3) MONTHS (6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

GROUP U - PORTABLE GENERATORS SYNERGY

EQUIPMENT (HERC RENTALS DID NOT BID)
HOUR

Ul

U2
U3
U4

35 KW (Qty 3)
60 KW (Qty 1)
100 KW (Qty 2)

125 KW (Qty 1) BOBCAT T590

DAY

$160.00
$225. 00
$395.00
$278. 00

WEEK

$400. 00
$520. 00
$795. 00
$795.00

MONTH

$865.00
$1,250. 00
$1,795.00
$1,600.00

(3)MONTHS

$2,595.00
$3,750.00
$5,385.00
$4, 800. 00

DELIVERY &
(6) MONTHS PICKUP CHARGES

$5, 190.00 $95 EACH WAY
$7,500.00 $95 EACH WAY

$10,770.00 $95 EACH WAY
$9, 600. 00 $95 EACH WAY


