TABULATION 09-0670 OV
IMPROVEMENTS TO THE TARA #20 MASTER LIFT STATION

CenState Contractors
P.Q. Drawer 552
Winter Haven, FL 33882-0552

Inc.
P.O. Box 630

General Contracting Services

Placida, FL 33946

Islands Mechanical
Contractor, Inc.

P.O. Box 2039 Blanding Bivd.
Middieburg, FL 32050

Kuxhausen Construction, Inc.
P.O. Box 21087
Sarasota, FL 34276-4087

Intercounty Engineering Inc.
1925 NW 18 St.
Pompano Beach, FL 33069

TOTAL BID PRICE

BID "B" - Based on
Completion Time of 365

$1,420,300.00

$1,832,800.00

863-324-3882 941-697-2047 904-406-6100 - 1941-379-6603 954-972-9800
EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION U/MIQTY.| UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE WUNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
BID "A" - Based on
Completion Time of 320
calendar days
1. |Mobilization LS| 1 $60,800.00 $60.800.00]  $126,000.00] $126,000.00] $124,245.00]  $124,245.00] $120,000.00 $120,000.00f $150,000.00{ $150,000.00
Electrical Instrumentation
2 |Work LS| 1 $1,257,500.00| $1,257,500.00] $1,567,900.00| $1,567,900.00} $1,905,090.00| $1,905,090.00; $1 ,160,000.00 $1,160,000.00{ $1,223,687.00| $1,223,687.00
Miscellaneous Work &
3 |Cleanup LS| 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $38,900.00 $38,900.00 $41,415.00 $41,415.00 $5,000.00 20,000.00 $20,000.00
4 |Discretionary Work $100,000.00} $100,000.00 : $100,000.00

$1,493,687.00

Page

10f3

calendar days

1. {Mobilization LS| 1 $60,800.00 $60,800.00] $126,000.00] $126,000.00f $109,625.00{  $109,625.00 $120,000.00] $120,000.00f $150,000.00{ $150,000.00
Electrical Instrumentation

2 |Work LS| 1 $1,257,500.00] $1,257,500.00] $1,567,900.00| $1,567,900.00) $1,680,911.00; $1,680,911.00 $1,160,000.00| $1,160,000.00} $1,123,687.00] $1,123,687.00
Miscellaneous Work &
Cleanup LS| 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $38,900.00 $38,800.00 $36 $36,542.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
Discretionary Work $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00¢: $100,000.00f $100,000.00
TOTAL BID PRICE $1,420,300.00 $1,832,800.00 $1,927,078.0 $1,385,000.0 $1,393,687.00
Acknowledge Site Visit Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledge Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledge Addendum 2 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Subcontractor Percentage Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Act Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place
Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting &
Environmental Crimes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bonds Included Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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IMPROVEMENTS TO THE TARA #20 MASTER LIFT STATION

RTD Construction

P.O. Box 996

Zephyrhills, FL 33539-0996
813-783-9119

Service, Inc.

941-378-0080

Southeastern Communication

2017 Cattlemen Rd.
Sarasota, FL 34232

P.O. Drawer 552

863-324-3882

Spectrum Underground

Winter Haven, FL 33882-0552

6028 33rd St. E.

941-756-4700

Stately Contractors

Bradenton, FL 34203

2719 17th St E.

041-722-0821

TLC Diversified, inc.

Palmetto, FL 34221
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EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M{QTY.| UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE +UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
BID "A" - Based on
Completion Time of 320
calendar days
1. |Mobilization LS| 1 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $91,915.00 $91,815.00 $94,222.00 $94,222.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $54,000.00 $54,000.00
Electrical instrumentation
2 |Work LS| 1 $1,329,000.00] $1,329,000.00] $1,617,696.00| $1,617,696.00 $1,188,566.00; $1,188,566.00] $1,400,000.00] $1 ,400,000.00] $1,227,500.00{ $1,227,500.00
Miscellaneous Work &
3 |Cleanup LS| 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00f $128,680.00{ $128,680.00 $5,075.00 0,000.00 $20,000.00 $13,400.00 $13,400.00
4 |Discretionary Work $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00]
: OTAL BID PRICE $1,509,000.00 $1,387,863.00 $1,600,000.00 $1,394,900.00
BID "B" - Based on
Completion Time of 365
calendar days
1. {Mobilization LS| 1 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $91,915.00 $91,915.00 $94,222.00 $94,222.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $54,000.00 $54,000.00
Electrical Instrumentation
2 |Work Ls! 1 $1,329,000.00| $1,329,000.00} $1,617,696.00 $1,617,696.00] $1,188,566.00! $1,188,566.00) $1,400,000.00 $1,400,000.00{ $1,227,500.00 $1,227,500.00
Miscellaneous Work &
3 |Cleanup LS| 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00] $128,680.00{  $128,680.00 $5,075.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $13,400.00 $13,400.00
4 |Discretionary Work $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00|
- |TOTAL BID PRICE $1,938,291.00 $1,387,863.00 $1,600,000.00 $1,394,800.00
Acknowledge Site Visit Yes Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledge Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledge Addendum 2 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Subcontractor Percentage Yes Yes Yes Yes
Act Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place
Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting &
Environmental Crimes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bonds Included Yes Yes Yes Yes
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727-848-8292

New Port Richey, FL 34652

941-723-1611

Palmetto, FL. 34220

407-321-8410

Sanford, FL 32771

US Water Services
Corporation Westra Construction Corp. Wharton-Smith, inc. Woodruff & Sons, Inc.
4939 Cross Bayou Blvd. P.0. Box 1148 750 Monroe Rd. P.0O. Box 10127

941-156-1871

Bradenton, FL 34282

TOTAL BID PRICE

BID "B" - Based on

$1,395,200.00

$1,217,340.

$1,369,000.0

EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION U/MJQTY.| UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE * UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
BID "A" - Based on
Completion Time of 320
calendar days
1. |Mobilization LSi 1 $85,000.00 $95,000.00, $41,265.00 $41,265.001 $125,000.00] $125,000.00 $28,513.24 $28,513.24
Electrical Instrumentation
2 |Work LS| 1 $1,187,000.00, $1,187,000.00} $1,066,900.00| $1,066,900.00] $1,114,000.00| $1,114,000.00] $1,385,068.49| $1,385,068.49
Miscellaneous Work &
3 |Cleanup LS| 1 $13,200.00 $13,200.00 $9,175.00 $9,175.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $8,194.26 $8,194.26
4_|Discretionary Work §100,000.00

F121,175.55

OTAL BID PRICE

cknowledge Site Visit

"$1,389,000.00

Completion Time of 365
calendar days
1. {Mobilization LS| 1 No Bid No Bid $41,265.00 $41,265.00]  $125,000.00{  $125,000.00 $28,513.24 $28,513.24
Electrical Instrumentation
2 |Work LS| 1 No Bid No Bid] $1,066,900.00] $1,066,900.00] $1,114,000.00{ $1,114,000.00] $1,385,068.49] $1,385,068.49
Miscellaneous Work &
3 |Cleanup LS| 1 No Bid No Bid $9,175.00 $9,175.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $8,194.26 $8,194.26
4 |Discretionary Work i i $100,000.00f $100,000.00

,521,775.99

Acknowledge Addendum 1
Acknowledge Addendum 2 §
ubcontractor Percentage
ct

Contractor's Questionnaire
rug Free Work Place
ertification

ublic Contracting &
nvironmental Crimes
Bonds Included

Keyed by:

Checked by:

Page 3 of 3



