MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

SOURCE SELECTION
' S October 31, 2011
Date Posted on
, Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides, and o , Mymanatee org /
SUBJECT  Other Related Aquatic Chemicals  DATE ,POSTED By: /?
PURCHASING L DATE CON TRACT ; i
REPRESENTATIVE  Chris Daley, 749-3048 SHALL BE AWARDED November},’ 2011
CONSEQUENCES IF
DEPARTMENT ® Various DEFERRED % n
SOURCE AUTHORIZED BY Melissa Assha ‘\
RECOMMENDATION. IFB #11-2981CD . DATE October 31, 2011
ACTION DESIRED '

Authorization to award IFB #11-2981CD; Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides, and Other Related Aquatic Chemlcals for
purchase on an as required basis, to the lowest responsive, responsible multiple bidders meeting specifications
for an estimated annual total of $575,000.00:

Dieter’s Sod Service, Inc., Bradenton, FL ; Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co. Inc., Ruskin, FL ; Pennington Seed, Madison, GA ;
Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc., Ft. Pierce, FL ; John Deere Landscapes, Cleveland, OH ; Harrell's LLC, Lakeland, FL ;

Helena Chemical, Dade City, FL. ; Southern Agricultural Insecticides, Rubonia, FL ; Crop Production Services, Mulberry, FL ;
Agrium Advanced Technologies, Loveland CO; Red River Specialties, Inc., Branford, FL ; AlliGare LLC, Opelika, AL ;

CWC Chemical, Inc., Cloverdale, VA

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordmances, resolutions; policy.)

Manatee County Purchasing Ordinance Chapter 2-26; Article IV, Source Selection; Section 2-26-40, Policies

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

* This annual contract provides for the procurement of sod, seed, fertilizers, herbicides, and other related aquatic chemicals by
various departments, on an as required basis, for aquatic control of the stormwater system and landscaping maintenance
performed by County staff.

* The procurement of these items is funded from various funding sources such as Transportation Trust Fund, General Fund, Utility
Fund, Enterprise Fund, etc.., with various operating accounts for each Department.

e This contract is for a twelve (12) month period with two (2) twelve (12) month renewal periods not to exceed a total contract duration
of thirty six (36) months. Price adjustments after the first contract period, may, upon the County’s approval be adjusted in accordance
with the Bureau of Labor Statistics Producers Price Index.

e Background/ discussion information continued on page 2.

Recommend award of IFB #11-22981CD, Sod, Fertilizer, Herbicides, and Other Related Aquatic Chemicals, onanas
required basis, to multiple bidders: Dieter’s Sod Service, Inc., Bradenton, FL; Sunbelt Sod & Grading, Inc., Ruskin, FL;
Pennington Seed, Madison, GA; Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Ft. Pierce, FL; John Deere landscapes, Cleveland, OH;
Harrell’s LLC, Lakeland FL; Helena Chemical, Dade City, FL; Southern Agricultural Insecticides, Rubonia, FL; Crop
Production Services, Mulberry, FL; Agrium Advanced Technologies, Loveland CO; Red River Speciaities, Inc.,
Branford, FL; AlliGare LL.C, Opelika, FL.; CWC Chemical, Inc., Cloverdale, VA.

SUMMARY

ATTACHMENTS: (List in order as attached) | INSTRUCTIONS TO BOARD RECORDS:

1)Bid Tabulation of all Bids

2)Award Tabulation Sheet N/A

Various Sources & Operating

COST = $575,000.00 (estimated) SOURCE (ACCT# & NAME) Accounts

AMT./F REQ. OF RECURRING COSTS

(ATTACH FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT) N/A

COMMENTS

\\
RS
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e 9/22/20111t0 10/18/2011, appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of the Bid's availability was
posted on the Manatee County website, as well as broadcast via Onvia DemandStar to two hundred
twelve (212) prospective bidders. (14) Bids were received.

» Basis of award for IFB #08-2789CD, as stated in Article E.01 of the bid documents, is a line item by line
item basis to the lowest responsive, responsible multiple bidders meeting specifications.

* ltis the intent to place orders with the lowest priced bidder, who can provide the products at the time
needed. Should the lowest priced bidder be unable to supply the products due to availability, a
contingency plan has been established to contact the next lowest bidder.

» Four of the chemical items are Agency priced items, whereby the chemical manufacturer sets the
selling price for all of their authorized distributors creating tie bids.

» All Agency priced items will be awarded to the multiple local vendors that bid them in accordance with
the Basis of Award Article E.01 of the bid documents. Local business is defined as a business duly
licensed and authorized to engage in the sale of goods and/or services to be procured, and which
certifies within its bid that for at least six (6) months prior to the announcement of the solicitation of bids
it has maintained a physical place of business in Manatee, Desoto, Hardee, Hillsborough, Pinellas or
Sarasota County with at least one full time employee at that location.

FAWORD DOCUMENTSMFB\11-2981CD Sod, Seed, Herbicides\11-2981CD Source Selection.doc 2



TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

CHEMICALS
—

[Dieter's Sod Service, Inc.
12315 Zipperer Raod

Iﬂrllorl‘loﬂ, FL 34212

COMTANG R
SCE

¥

ITEM] PRODUCT NAME

l EST. QTY.

ultmrzl UNIT PRICE I

EXTERDED |
PRICE

Sunbeit Sod & Grading Co. Inc.

819 9th Street NE
Ruskin, FL 33570

= g

ENDED

>
aemre] o pruce |

] R Fertilizer Co., Inc.
100 Glades Cutoff Road
Ft. Pierce, FL 34981

ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE
- — —

EXTENDED |
PRICE

AR ST

l =

1 IBAI-II. SOD

A 114 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 5F)

8. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b COUNTY PICK UP

¢ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)

1 Pallet = 400 Square Feet

5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 5F)
@. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

C  |10-24 PALLETS {4,000 SF - 9,959 5F)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
|b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

€ SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 5F OR MORE)
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

|b SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Paliet Sod) :

$37,125.00

$70,000.00

2 IST AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 5F - 1,999 5F)

@, DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b COUNTY PICK UP
€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

. d SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

$220.00

$1,280.00

$102.50

B [5-9 PALLETS (2,000 5F - 3,999 5F)

@. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)

$800.00

$1,920.00
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

er's Sod Service, Inc.
315 Zipperer Raod

418 BERMUDA SOD

Pennington Seaed
1280 Atlanta HWY

Ft. Pierce, FL 34981

Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc.
4100 Glades Cutoff Road

CHEMICALS radenton, FL 34212 Madison, GA 30650
I l TY. l l l l
PRODUCT NAME SQE EST.QTY.  Jaitemna UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE PRICE ATERNATE | UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
—me — —— ——— —— —

1-4 PALLETS (400 S - 1,999 5F)
@. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b COUNTY Picx UP

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

1 Roll = 300 Sq Ft

Pallet = 400 Sq FY

5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
d ROLLED 500- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 5F)
@ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)
b ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)
@ DELIVERED K& INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
|b ROLLED SO0- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

$11,780,00

$310.00

STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)

@ STAPLES [COUNTY SUPPLIED) 1EA

b STAPLES (VENDOR SUPPLIED] 10,000 SF

NON GOLF COURSE SEED (50 POUND BAGS) 3

3. PENSACOLA BAMIA SEED 5018 400 Bag /BAG| $44 800,00 /BAG | $47.000.00

b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 50 18 340 Bag $25.00 | BAG| $8.500.00 $2480 |mac | $8.432.00

c. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEPT.) 50 18 340 Bag $25.00 | mAG| $8,500.00 $26.80 | mac $9,112.00

d. BEAMUDA SEED (HULLED) 5018 500 Bag /BAG| $105,000.00 BAG | $93,750.00
|muLcH (so PounD BAGS)

3. CYPRESS MULCH (Grade “A")

b. PREMIUM SHREDDED CYPRESS

©  MALALUAKA MULCH- FLORAMULCH *

CELLULOSE MULCH(FOR HYDRO SEEDING],
d  60% PAPER, 40% WOOD FIBER (50 LB BALES) [s0i8
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD Dieter's Sod Service, Inc. Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co, Inc. Pennington Seed Diamond R Fertilizer Co,, Inc.
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC (2315 Zipperer Raod B19 9th Street NE 1280 Atlanta HWY 4100 Glades Cutoff Road
CHEMICALS radenton, FL 34212 Ruskin, FL 33570 Madison, GA 30650 Ft. Pierce, FL 34981
ITEM] PRODUCT NAME SUE EST. QTY. Javessare] UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE aTERNaTE | UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
— — —
2-16 FERTILUZER, w' Slow Relsase Nitrogen
u (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 30 000|LB NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.336| /LB $10.080.00
ISLOW RELEASE NITROGEN (NO
SUBSTITUTIONS) |BaGs 20,000{LB NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.791| /LB $15,820.00
=1 - - ——
ETERAN 720 1.5 gal 2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE 75 gal 24 EA NOBID — NO BID [ 32000 JEAT S4B0.00
Inuunnuv PRO 2.5 gal 200 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL] (NO SUBS]  [2.5 gal 15 EA NO BID NOBID NO BID
b. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 30 gal 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 RODED, AQUA CLEAR 25 gal 10 EA — NO BID NO BID NO BID
b. RODEOD, AUA CLEAR [RETURNABLE
[CONTAINER) 30 gal 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
[ |sONARQ(NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 401b 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
b Jsowas as) o susmrumons) 1gal 56L NO BID NO BID NO BID
II 'sluzm KINETIC 1gal 150 GL NO BID NO BID NO BID
5] JSENCOR 75 TURF [NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5 b 4 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 MEC AMINE-D 25gal 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 a. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) oz 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
qb TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 15 o2 2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 MONUMENT 75WG (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5x5 gram 12 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 [GARLON 4 (GENERICS ALLOWED) 25l 12 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID fEA
14 IA  GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 25 gal 250 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID Eloment 3 $14575 [EA $36,437.50
B GARLON 34 (GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID Element 3 | $1,749.00 /EA $34,980.00
s PLATEAU (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 25 gal 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID - 1 NO Bid
= MILESTONE VM (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 25 gal 40 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO Bid
ALIETTE WDG {GENERICS ALLOWED) lsAs b | 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $103.40 J/EA $517.00
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD Dieter's Sod Service, Inc. Sunbeh Sod & Grading Ce. Inc. Pennington Seed |piamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc.
$OD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC 2315 Zipperer Raod 819 9th Street NE 1280 Atlanta HWY 14100 Glades Cutoff Road
CHEMICALS radenton, FL 34212 Ruskin, FL 33570 Madison, GA 30650 F1. Pierce, FL 34981
CONTAINER EXTERDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME I SIE I EST QTY A."ERNM‘EI UNIT PRICE l PRICE ATERNATE L UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERMATE | UNIT PRICE I PRICE ALTERNATE l UNIT PRICE PRICE
R - e —
1 ORTHENE 1016 10 EA NO BID NO E $59.00 [EA $580.00|
2 a. AMDRO 1L8 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 16 10 L8 NO BID NO BID NO Bid
b. AMDRO 2508 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 250 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO Bid
g [TOPCHOICE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50 Ib 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO Bid
[TALSTAR F 1 gal 40 GL NO BID NO BID $2890 IGL $1,156.00]
ALOFT LC 5C (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 64 o2 20 EA NO BID NO BID $496.00 _J'EA $9,920.00
1 quant 120 quan NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.20 QT $984.00
LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1gal 500 GL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO Bid
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT
h (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 quart 2.000 quarnt NO BID NO BID NO BID $890 /QT $17,800.00

PAGE 4 OF 16



TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD [John Deere Landscapes Harrell's LLC Chemical
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC |1385 East 36th Street 720 Kraft Road .0. Box 1758
CHEMICALS ICleveland, OH 44114 iLakeland, FL 34240 ade City, FL 33526
e CONTAINER i 39030 20 EXTENDED |
|WEM. PRODUCT % SUE I EST. QTY. | autemware UNIT PRICE ] PRICE ALTERMATE UNIT PRICE ALTERNATE l UNIT PRICE I PRICE

1 ]umsoo

A 14 PALLETS (400 5F - 1,999 SF)
. DEUVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b COUNTY PiCK UP

. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
’H PALLETS (2,000 5F - 3,999 5F)

b DELIVERED & INSTALLED [Pallet Sod)

€ SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

C  |10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 5F)
A. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)

C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Paliet Sod)

D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 55 OR MORE}

2. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

b SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

2 |ST. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 5F)

@. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b COUNTY PiCK UP

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)

d SLOPE DELIVERY B INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

B [5-9 PALLETS {2,000 5F - 3,999 5F)

&. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

|b DELVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)
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TABULATIO

N

Chemical

P.O. Box 1758

[Dade City, FL 33526

IFB 11-2981CD Deere Landscapes [Harrell's LLC
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC [1385 East 36th Street 720 Kraft Road
CHEMICALS [Cleveland, OH 44114 . FL 34240
e ———
cummml [ EXTENDED
ITEM] PRODUCT NAME l EST. QTY. | atemsare UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERMATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
B e - e e ——r —

S -BERMUBA-SOH-

ALTERNATE

LINIT PRICE
e

|

EXTENDED |
PRICE

—

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 5F - 1,999 5F)
@. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b COUNTY PiCK UP

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

59 PALLETS (2,000 5F - 3,999 5F)

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

—
C  [10-24 PALLETS (4,000 5F - 9,999 5F)
& DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

b ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 55 OR MORE)
@ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
|b ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

8 STAPLES (COUNTY SUPPLIED)

4 |STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)

10,000 SF

b STAPLES (VENDOR SUPPLIED)

GOLF COURSE SEED (50 POUND BAGS)

2. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 5018

b. AYE GRASS {OCT THRU MARCH) 50 18

. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THAU SEPT.) 5018 340 $15,130.00
d. BERMUDA SEED (MULLED) 5018 500 Bag $115,000.00
‘um.cu (50 POUND BAGS)

2. CYPRESS MULCH (Grade "A") 500 Bag

b. PREMIUM SHREDDED CYPRESS 400 Bag

& MALALUAKA MULCH- FLORAMULCH * 500 Bag

CELLULOSE MULCH{FOR HYDRO SEEDING),
d mnmn_mwmnﬂau{sawms: 5018 300 Bag
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD [John Deere Landscapes
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC |1385 East 36th Street 0.
CHEMICALS ICleveland, OH 44114 iDade City, FL 33526
— | [ 12,4320 o
SUE EST. QTY. | arennate UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
BAGS 30,000{LB 30.456' B $13,680.00 NO BID
BAGS 20,000|LB $0.964| LB $18.280.00 NO BID
2.5 gal 2 EA NO Bid $67.50 /EA $135.00
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE 25 gal 74 EA e 50 EA $660.00 |
h 2.5 gal 200 EA NO Bid $33.50 J/EA $6,700.00 JRangerPro| $27.50 /EA $5,500.00
n 3. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) |25 gal 15 EA 1 NO Bid $3475 [EA $521.25
b. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 30 gal 10 EA NO Bid - $414.00 /EA $4,140.00
a. RODED, AQUA CLEAR 25 gal 0 EA $5426 [EA $2037 [EA $283.70
b. RODED, AQUA CLEAR (RETURNABLE
CONTAINER) 30 gal 50 EA fEA $352.50 /EA $17.625.00
E SONAR Q [NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 401b 30 EA $998.00 /EA | $29.940.00
[r lsormt [A.S) (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1gal 5 GL -] $1,698.00 /GL $8,490.00
L lsuum, KINETIC 1gal 150 GL fEA $10,050.00 §Siinet 200| $32.88 /GL $4,932.00
JSENCOR 75 TURF (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5 ib 4 EA [EA $1.500.00 2] $339.50 (EA $1,358.00
10 MEC AMINE-D 25 gal 20 EA i NO Bid
11 a. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 3oz 10 EA EA $3,850.00 $330.00 /EA $3,300.00
b TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 15 o2 2EA EA $2,310.00 $890.00 /EA $1,980.00
12 MONUMENT 75WG (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) |5x5 gram 12 EA fEA $2,880.00 $240.00 /EA $2.880.00
13 GARLON 4 (GENERICS ALLOWED) 25 gal 12 EA fEA $3,060.00 $121.25 [EA $1.455.00
4 |A GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 gal 250 EA fEA $49,500.00 | Element3a| $105.00 /EA $26,250.00
B GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 20 EA NO Bid $25,200.00
hs PLATEAU (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 25 gal 100 EA NO Bid $14,720.00
MILESTONE VM (NO SUBSTITUTION 25 gal 40 EA_ NO Bid $29,972.80
ALIETTE WDG (GENERICS ALLOWED) '5,5 b ] 5 EA 5 Ib bag l $190.91 /EA [ $954.55|Chipco Signature|  $140.00  /EA $700.00 Slbbag | $114.50 /EA $572.50)
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD lJohn Deere Landscapes sLLC Helena Chermical
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC 1385 East 36th Street 20 Kraft Road P.O. Bax 1758
CHEMICALS leveland, OH 44114 Lakeland, FL 34240 hD.de City, FL 33526
[ | [ I Pomce
PRODUCT NAME SWE EST QTY. | acvernate UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERMATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTESNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
. — e - —— e e

JORTHENE 101b 10 EA Sibbag | $47.06 /EA $941 20.| Acephate ¥7 $67.50 /EA $675.00 JAcephates7| $91.00 /EA $910.00
l! . AMORO 1L8 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1l 10 LB -1 NOBid : 1EA $110.00 R 2
| b. AMDRO 258 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 251b 20 EA NO Bid o BRBRRS fEA $4.480.00 $198.00 /EA $3,960.00
I_J TOPCHOICE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50 ib 100 EA $162.50 $16.,250.00| fEA $16,250.00 $162.50 JEA $16,250.00

TALSTAR F 1gal 40 GL $36.87 /GL $1,474.80| IEA $1,480.00 $39.00 /GL $1,560.00

ALOFT LC 5C (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 64 0z 20 EA $496.00 [EA $9,920.00 /EA $11,800.00 $465.60 /EA $9,312.00

ANTS & ADDITIVES —= =

)

DEFOAMER 1 quart 120 quart | Antfoam $4.81 PT $1,154.40 Duwhesamer $13.00 QT $1,560.00 JFoambuster] $9.98 /QT $1,197.60
L o DL2 - 2.5 gal

LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1gal 500 GL $37.09 /GL $18,545.00] sufmctam $13500 /GL $67,500.00 $3000 /Gal | $15,000.00

PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT
ol SUBSTITUTIONS) 1quen 2,000 quart NO Bid NO Bid $9.18 Q| $18,360.00

1 &.I.
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD Southem Agricultural Insecticides Crop Production Services iAgrium Advanced Technologies
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC |7400 Bayshore Road 2100 Moores Lane 2915 Rocky Mountain Ave, #400
CHEMICALS ubonia, FL 34221 ulberry, FL 33860 Loveland, CO 80538
Im-nml l EXTENDED l EXTENDED
ITEM] PRODUCT NAME SZE EST. QTY. AL TERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE AL TERMATE UNIT PRICE I PRICE AL TERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
- - —— X R 3 ) ’ 3

1 |BAHIA SOD

A |14 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 5F)
&. DELVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b COUNTY PiCXK UP

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED [Pallet Sod)
5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 5F)

. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Patiet Sod)

C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod

C  |10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 5F)
&. DELIVERFD AND SPOT PLACED

b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

€ SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Paliet Sod)

D |25 PALLETS OR MORE {10,000 SF OR MORE)
. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)

hb SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

'87. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM
A [1-4 PALLETS (400 ¥ - 1,999 5F)

*l. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b COUNTY PICXK UP
€ DELVERED & INSTALLED {Paliet Sod)

d SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

A, DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

B ls-n PALLETS (2,000 5F - 3,999 5F)
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

CHEMICALS

F=
SUE EST QTY.

ITEM} PRODUCT NAME

PRICE

rop Production Services um Advanced Technologies
2100 Moores Lane 15 Rocky Mountain Ave, #400
Mulberry, FL 33860 oveland, CO BO538

UNIT PRICE PRICE

ALTERNATE I UNIT PRICE

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 5F)
@ DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
hl COUNTY PiCx UP

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 5F)

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

€ ]10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 57)
@ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
b ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 5F OR MORE)
@ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
b ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

8 STAPLES (COUNTY SUPPLIED)

4 |STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)

b STAPLES (VENDOR SUPPLIED)

NON GOLF COURSE SEED (50 POUND BAGS)

NO BID NO BID

3. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 50 18
b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 5018
<. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEPT.) 50 I8
d_BERMUDA SEED (HULLED) 50 18
MULCH (50 POUND BAGS)
2. CYPRESS MULCH (Grade "A”)
b PREMIUM SHREDDED CYPRESS
£ MALALUAKA MULCH- FLORAMULCH *

CELLULOSE MULCH(FOR HYDRO SEEDING],
d 60% PAPER, 40% WOOD FIBER (S0 L8 BALES) |som
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

Southern Agricultural Insecticides
400 Bayshore Road

Production Services
100 Moares Lane

JAgrium Advanced Technologies
2915 Rocky Mountain Ave, #400

CHEMICALS [Rubonia, FL 34221 M . FL 33860 Loveland, CO B0538
oop."rmnl l EXTENOED | I l EXTENDED
SZE EST. QTY ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE AL TERNATE UMIT PRICE PRICE AL TERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
B ———— rrer—— — e . e
[lzw:s 30 wulm NO BID NO BID
|u.ss 20 unuIL,B NO BID NO BID
= g
15 gal 2 EA NOBid $32.00 /GL $160.00
i) 75 gal 74 EA $26.75 EA Wiad oy Pl [ $557.00
3 'nouunuv PRO 1.5 gal 200 EA $2875 JEA $5,750.00 M ooy s $9.95 /GL $4,975.00
n [a- WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 2.6 gal 15 EA NO Bid TGL $52125
L' b. WEEDAR 64 {AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 30 gal 10 EA NO Bid IGL $4,170.00
3. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR 2.5 gal 10 EA 334,75 [EA IGL $330.00
b. RODEQ, AQUA CLEAR [RETURNABLE
[CONTAINER) 30 gal 50 EA $405.00 /EA $19,110.00
I SONAR Q (NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 4016 30 EA NO Bid $29,940.00
b sonar ias) mvo susstmumons) 1gal 5 6L NO Bid $8.490.00
L Isuutm. KINETIC 1gal 150 GL NO Bid $4,680.00
Is SENCOR 75 TURF (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5 b 4 EA NO Bid §1,375.00
10 MEC AMINE-O 25 gal 20 EA NO Bid $1,000.00
1 a. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 3oz 10 EA $340.00
. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 15 a2 2 EA $340.00
12 MONUMENT 75WG (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) Sx5 gram 12 EA $240.00
13 GARLON 4 (GENERICS ALLOWED) 25gal 12 EA NO Bid $1,560.00
14 A GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 gal 250 EA NO Bid $23,187.50
B GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 20 EA NO Bid $22,260.00
\E] PLATEAU (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 25l 100 EA NO Bid $30,000.00
MILESTONE VM [NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 gal 40 EA NO Bid $29,000.00
1 ALIETTE WDG (GENERICS ALLOWED) |5.5 b I 5 EA [ $105.00 /EA $525.00 I NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD Southern Agricultural Insecticides Crop Production Services jAgrium Advanced Technologies
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC [7400 Bayshore Road 2100 Moores Lane 12915 Rocky Mountain Ave, #400
CHEMICALS Rubonia, FL 34221 Mulberry, FL 33860 oveland, CO 80538
IEMICAL T - TXTERDED i EXTERDEY
ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE l PRICE ALTERNATE I UNIT PRICE PRICE AL TERMATE I UNIT PRICE PRICE
e et —
NO Bid NO Bid Acephate
a. AMDRO 1LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1lb 10 LB NO Bid NO Bid X o %
b AMDRO 2518 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 25 1b 20 EA $173.75 J/EA §3,475.00 NO Bid $200.00 /EA $4,000.00
g TOPCHDICE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50 Ib 100 EA $162.50 /EA $16,250.00 NO Bid $162.50 /EA | $16,250.00
TALSTAR £ 1 gal 40 GL JUpstar Gold| $3200 /GL $1,280.00 NO Bid $30.00 /EA $1,200.00
ALOFT LC SC (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 64 01 20 EA $496.00 /EA $9.920.00 NO Bid ] $495.00 /EA $9,900.00
1 quari 120 quart $450 QT $540.00 Un Foamer| $8.20 /QT $984.00 NO Bid
LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1gal 500 GL NO Bid NO Bid
| |nomrt ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT
(NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 quart 2,000 quart NO Bid NO Bid
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD River Specialties, Inc. nivar USA Inc. JAlliGare LLC JCWC Chemical, Inc.
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC 1013 NW Suwannee Ave 5051 L.B McLeod Rd, Suite D 13 N. Bth Street [214 Simmons Drive
CHEMICALS ranford, FL 32008 {Orlanddo, FL 32811 [Opelika, AL 36801 ICloverdale, VA 24077
e — Icw»nal l I EXTERDED. TRTENOED
SUE EST QTY ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE AL TERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE AL TERNA' UNIT PRICE

ITEM] PRODUCT NAME

5N

PRICE

A |14 PALLETS (400 5F - 1,999 5F)

B. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b COUNTY PiCK UP

€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

15-9 PALLETS (2,000 F - 3,999 SF)

. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED [Paliet Sod)

€ SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod

C  [10-24 PALLETS (4,000 5F - 5,999 SF)
2. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED [Pallet Sod)

€ SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Paliet Sod)

D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 5F OR MORE)
. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

[b SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) -

ST. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 5F)

. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b COUNTY PICX UP
€ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pailet Sod)

d SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

B |59 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 5F)

4. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD River Specialties, Inc.
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC [1013 NW Suwannee Ave
CHEMICALS ranford, FL 32008

ITEM] PRODUCT NAME

|
SZE EST. QTY

uwwnl UNIT PRICE I
o —————

PRICE

Univar USA Inc.
5051 L.B McLeod Rd, Suite D
Oranddo, FL 32811

JAlliGare LLC
13 N. Bth Street
[Opelika, AL 36801

l I
ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
——

+-BERMUDA-GED

ICWC Chemical, inc.
214 Simmons Drive
Cloverdale VA 24077

ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE I PRICE

EXTENDED |
ltfﬂ UNIT PRICE I PRICE

1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)
A. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b COUNTY PICK UP
II.'. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 5F)

€ DEUVERED & INSTALLED (Paliet Sod)
d ROLLED S0D- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

10-28 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 5,999 5F)
@ DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)
|b ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)
@ DELVERED & INSTALLED (Paflet Sod)
b ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED

@ STAPLES (COUNTY SUPPLIED)
b STAPLES [VENDOR SUPPLIED)

STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)

a. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 5018
b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 50 18
. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEPT.) 5018
d, BERMUDA SEED (HULLED) 50 18

MULCH (50 POUND BAGS)
3. CYPRESS MULCH (Grade "A")

b. PREMIUM SHREDDED CYPRESS

£ MALALUAKA MULCH- FLORAMULCH *

CELLULOSE MULCH{FOR HYDRO SEEDING),

d _60% PAPER, 40% WOOD FIBER (SO LB BALES) |sois
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD Red River Specialties, Inc. nivar USA Inc. JAlliGare LLC CWC Chemical, Inc
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC [1013 NW Suwannee Ave 5051 L.B MclLeod Rd, Sulte D 13 N. 8th Strest 1214 Simmons Drive
CHEMICALS ranford, FL 32008 randdo, FL 32811 ika, AL 36801 ICloverdale, VA 24077
s Icmmﬂ l I l EXTENDED | ] EXTENDED |
ITEM] PRODUCT NAME SZE EST.QTY. ALTERMNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE AL TERMATE UNIT PRICE PRICE AL TERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE B termate]  UNIT PRICE PRICE
————— == e s
2-16 FERTILIZER, w' Siow Release Nitrogen
u (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 30.000{L8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SLOW RELEASE NITROGEN (NO I
SUBSTITUTIONS) {BAGS 20,000|L8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALGICIDES e s
720 15 gal 2 EA $82.00 /EA $164.00] NO Bid NO Bid $77.00 /EA $154,
1SOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE 25 gal 24 EA 2810 JEX| 0 NO Bid ;
'IlOI..INOUP PRO 25l 200 EA Generic $28.10 [EA $5.62000] e $30.50 [EA| $6,100.00] Gooresses | $2425 /EA $4,850.00| $37.00 [EA
2. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL] (NO SUBS) 25 gal 15 EA NO Bid NO Bid NOBid - NOBid -}
b. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (ND SUBS) 30 gal 10 EA NO Bid - NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid
a. RODEOD, AQUA CLEAR 25 gal 10 EA $36.25 JEA 2. NO Bid $30.75 $37.00  /EA| .
b. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR [RETURNABLE nol
JCONTAINER} 30 gal 50 EA $409.50 /EA| $20475.00 NO Bid $355.50 /EA $480.00 /EA| $24.000.
JSONAR O (NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 40 b 30 EA NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid
I |sowasias) o sussmrumons) 10l 5 GL NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid
L SILKEN, RINETIC . 1gal 150 GL Elte Marv $38.00 [EA $5,700.00 NO Bid NO Bid $55.00
10 SENCOR 75 TURF (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5ib 4 EA =1 NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid
10 MEC AMINE-O 25l 20 EA NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid
11 4. TRAN XiT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 3oz 10 EA NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid
b TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 15 oz 2EA NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid
12 IMONUMENT 75WG (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5x5 gram 12 EA NO Bid NO Bid = ] NO Bid
13 (GARLON 4 [GENERICS ALLOWED) 25 gal 12 EA Elemant 4 $125.00 /EA $1,500.00 NO Bid $109.75 /EA| $1,317.00] Elemems | $13400 /EA $1,608.00}
14 A GARLON 3A [GENERICS ALLOWED) 25gal 250 EA Elarmant 14 $10250 /EA| $25625.00 NO Bid $8680 J/EA| S21 .?oo.oo] Emmert3 | $116.00 /EA| $29.000.00]
|8 GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 20 EA Element JA | §1,230.00 /EA| $24,600.00 NO Bid $1,02660 /EA| s20 532.00] Emment) | $1,390.00 /EA| $27,800.00]
15 PLATEAU (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 25 gal 100 EA : $302.50 J/EA| $30,250.00 NO Bid $360.00 /EA| $36,000.00]
MILESTONE VM (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 25 gl 40 EA $749.325 /EA| $20.973.00f NO Bid $749.32 /EA| 529972
1 ALIETTE WDG (GENERICS ALLOWED) IsAs b 5 EA Fosetyl-Al $93.50 /I $467.50 I NO BID I NO BID ' NO BID
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TABULATION

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

CHEMICALS

ed River Specialties, Inc. nivar USA Inc. iGare LLC ICWC Chemical, inc.
1013 NW Suwannee Ave 5051 L.B McLeod Rd, Suite D 13 N. Bth Street 214 Simmons Drive
ranford, FL 32008 rianddo, FL 32811 [Cloverdale, VA 24077

ika, AL 36801
Imm“gl I I EXTENDED ERTENCED | EXTENDED |
PRODUCT NAME SUE EST.QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE  Jateswate]  UNIT PRICE PRICE
- —— e . -
JORTHENE 1016 10 EA Fire Art Killar $8.00 /b NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid
. AMDRO 1L8 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1lb 10 LB $12.00 NO Bid i NO Bid NO Bid
b. AMDRO 2508 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 251b 20 EA $193.75 $3,875.00) NO Bid NO Bid
2 TOPCHOICE (ND SUBSTITUTIONS) 50 Ib 100 EA $16250 /MBG| $16,250.00 NO Bid NO Bid
TALSTAR F 1gsl 40 GL $33.00 /GL| $1,320.00] NO Bid NO Bid
JALOFT LC 5C (NO SUBSTITUTION: s4or 20 EA NO Bid i o NO Bid NO Bid
ANTS & ADDITIVES
1 DEFOAMER 1 quan 120 quant $4.95 $435 /QT $8.00
LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1 gal 500 GL NO Bid $695 IGL owe 80 $11.00
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT 2
1 quart 2,000 quart 7 NO Bid - N0 8 NO i
Keyed by: Date: /[ ﬁ /// ? / /
Chris Daley, CPPB- Buyer { 10/19/2011
- y P, " /
Checked b%éy ( Date: /ﬁ // / / 4
Maq‘oﬁ;/(_oﬂs, Administéative Asst, ' 7 7 10/19/2011
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SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

Dieter's Sod Service, Inc.

2315 Zipperer Raod

Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co. Inc.
819 9th Street NE

Pennington Seed
1280 Atlanta HWY

Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc.

4100 Glades Cutoff Road

CHEMICALS Bradenton, FL 34212 Ruskin, FL 33570 Madison, GA 30650 Ft. Pierce, FL 34981
CONTAINER EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. |[ALTERNATE[ UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE| UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
SODS
1 |BAHIA SOD
A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF) 11 Pallet = 400 Square Feet

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b COUNTY PICK UP
Cc DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

6,000 SF

$960.00

$1,500.00

800 SF

$112.00

4,000 SF

$780.00

$1,200.00

B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 5,600 SF $868.00 $1,120.00
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 7,600 SF $1,330.00 $1,900.00
C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 1,800 SF $333.00 $468.00
C  |10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 4,000 SF $600.00 $720.00
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 8,000 SF $1,400.00 $1,440.00
C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 12,500 SF $2,312.50 $2,250.00
D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 225,000 SF $37,125.00 $0.18 /sF | $40,500.00
b SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) :: 400,000 SF $70,000.00 $0.175 /srF | $70,000.00
2 |ST. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM
A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF) - 400 Square Feet
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 7,600 SF $2,432.00 $0.30 /SF $2,280.00
b COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF $220.00 No Bid /SF
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 3,200 SF $1,280.00 $0.35 /SF $1,120.00
d SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 250 SF $102.50 $0.37 ISF $92.50
B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
Cc DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

2,500 SF

$800.00

$750.000

4,800 SF

$1,920.00

$1,680.00[




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD Dieter's Sod Service, Inc. Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co. Inc. Pennington Seed Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc.
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC (2315 Zipperer Raod 819 9th Street NE 1280 Atlanta HWY 4100 Glades Cutoff Road
CHEMICALS Bradenton, FL 34212 Ruskin, FL 33570 Madison, GA 30650 Ft. Pierce, FL 34981
CONTAINER EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. |[ALTERNATE[ UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE| UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE

3 [419 BERMUDA SOD

4|1 Pallet = 400 Sq Ft/

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF) 1 Roll = 300 Sq Ft
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 500 SF $160.00 |} $150.00
b COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF $220.00 |t :
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 1,600 SF : $656.00 |I: $560.00
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 200 SF I} $86.00 $70.00

B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 8,000 SF . $3,280.00 |- . $2,800.00
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF : . $1,720.00 : . $1,400.00
C 10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 SF) o i +laalade alelnleTade Tl dele e Tl de e T e Tl Je e T
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 12,000 SF . $4,680.00 |I: . $3,720.00
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF . $1,640.00 : . $1,240.00

D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE) ~ simimemisiiioiioisllelle bl s e
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) , ; . $14,060.00 |- . $11,780.00
d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED ‘ b ) : . $390.00 |- : $310.00

4 |STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR) B | e el
C STAPLES (COUNTY SUPPLIED) :
d STAPLES (VENDOR SUPPLIED) : . $700.00 |; . $400.00

il ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR SOD L i  $113,948.00 [f:in $30,602.52f:
SEEDS & MULCH

1 NON GOLF COURSE SEED (50 POUND BAGS)
a. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 50 1B 400 Bag $112.00 $44,800.00 $117.50 $47,000.00
b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 50 1B 340 Bag $25.00 | /BAG| $8,500.00 $24.80 |/BAG $8,432.00
c. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEPT.) 50 1B 340 Bag $25.00 | /BAG| $8,500.00 $26.80 | /BAG $9,112.00
d. BERMUDA SEED (HULLED) 5018 500 Bag $210.00 | /1BAG | $105,000.00 $187.50 | /BAG $93,750.00
2 MULCH (50 POUND BAGS) i
a. CYPRESS MULCH (Grade "A") 500 Bag
b. PREMIUM SHREDDED CYPRESS 400 Bag
¢ MALALUAKA MULCH- FLORAMULCH © L O T e o e B L N L R
CELLULOSE MULCH(FOR HYDRO SEEDING), 70 Paper /
d 60% PAPER, 40% WOOD FIBER (50 LB BALES) |50 I8 300 Bag $3,540.00 30 Wood $16.50 |/BAG $4,950.00

<|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR SEED & MULCH $56,840.00f;::: $102,182.00




SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

IFB 11-2981CD

TABULATED AWARD SHEET

Dieter's Sod Service, Inc.
2315 Zipperer Raod

Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co. Inc.
819 9th Street NE

Pennington Seed
1280 Atlanta HWY

Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc.
4100 Glades Cutoff Road

CHEMICALS Bradenton, FL 34212 Ruskin, FL 33570 Madison, GA 30650 Ft. Pierce, FL 34981
CONTAINER EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED

ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. |[ALTERNATE[ UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE| UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
FERTILIZERS

6-2-16 FERTILIZER, w/ Slow Release Nitrogen
1 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 30,000(LB $0.336( /LB $10,080.00

15-0-15 FERTILIZER W7 .67% RONSTAR AND

SLOW RELEASE NITROGEN (NO
2 SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 20,000(LB $0.791 $15,820.00

<|[ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR FERTILIZERS $10,080.00

HERBICIDES/ ALGICIDES

1 VETERAN 720 2.5gal 2 EA
2 ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE 2.5gal 24 EA | $20.00 /EA| $480.00
3 ROUNDUP PRO 2.5 gal 200 EA Glystar Pro
4 a. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 2.5gal 15 EA
b. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 30 gal 10 EA
5 a. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR 2.5gal 10 EA
b. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR (RETURNABLE
CONTAINER) 30 gal 50 EA
6 SONAR Q (NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 40 1b 30 EA
7 SONAR (A.S) (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 gal 5 GL
8 SILKEN, KINETIC 1gal 150 GL
9 SENCOR 75 TURF (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 51lb 4 EA
10 MEC AMINE-D 2.5gal 20 EA Weedar 64
11 a. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50z 10 EA e
b. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 150z 2 EA
12 MONUMENT 75WG (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5x5 gram 12 EA
13 GARLON 4 (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5gal 12 EA
14 a GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5gal 250 EA
b GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 20 EA
15 PLATEAU (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 gal 100 EA
16 MILESTONE VM (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5gal 40 EA

NON AGENCY

“|[ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR HERBICIDES-

$480.00

$728.00
-

]ESTIMATED AWARD TOTALS FOR HERBICIDES- AGENCY




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD Dieter's Sod Service, Inc. Sunbelt Sod & Grading Co. Inc. Pennington Seed Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc.
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC (2315 Zipperer Raod 819 9th Street NE 1280 Atlanta HWY 4100 Glades Cutoff Road
CHEMICALS Bradenton, FL 34212 Ruskin, FL 33570 Madison, GA 30650 Ft. Pierce, FL 34981
CONTAINER EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. |[ALTERNATE[ UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE| UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
FUNGICIDES
1 ALIETTE WDG (GENERICS ALLOWED) 551b 5 EA $517.00
: ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD FUNGICIDES $0.00

INSECTICIDES
1 ORTHENE 10 Ib 10 EA [ttt R e R 2 | $59.00 /EA | $590.00
2 a. AMDRO 1LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1lb 10 LB $11.20 /Lb $112.0

b. AMDRO 25LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 251b 20 EA ] $175.00 /EA $3,500.00
3 TOPCHOICE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50 Ib 100 EA | e T T T T e L T
4 TALSTAR F 1 gal 40 GL Upstar Gold $1,156.00

ALOFT LC SC (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) . wen e T T T T e T e

ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR INSECTICIDES-
INON AGENCY

$1,746.00

|ESTIMATED AWARD TOTALS FOR INSECTICIDES- AGENCY
VANTS & ADDITIVES

ADJU

1 DEFOAMER 1 quart 120 quart
2 LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1gal 500 GL
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT
3 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 quart 2,000 quart $17,800.00

|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR ADJUVANTS &

ADDITIVES $17,800.00

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS BY PRIMARY AWARD $113,948.00 $30,602.52 $57,320.00 $132,536.00

|ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS BY AGENCY ITEMS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Yellow Highlighted Items = Primary Award
Green Highlighted Items = Agency ltems

For all Non highlighted items showing under vendors
name, this demonstrates a secondary vendor award.



TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

John Deere Landscapes
1385 East 36th Street

Harrell's LLC
720 Kraft Road

Helena Chemical
P.O. Box 1758

CHEMICALS Cleveland, OH 44114 Lakeland, FL 34240 Dade City, FL 33526
CONTAINER EXTEfDED EXTENDED EXTEfDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
SODS
1 |BAHIA SOD
A 1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b COUNTY PICK UP
Cc DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

6,000 SF

800 SF

4,000 SF

B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 5,600 SF
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 7,600 SF
C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 1,800 SF
C  |10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 4,000 SF
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 8,000 SF
C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 12,500 SF
D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 225,000 SF
b SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 400,000 SF
2 [ST. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM
A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 7,600 SF
b COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 3,200 SF
d SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)
B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

2,500 SF

4,800 SF




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

John Deere Landscapes
1385 East 36th Street

Harrell's LLC
720 Kraft Road

Helena Chemical
P.O. Box 1758

CHEMICALS Cleveland, OH 44114 Lakeland, FL 34240 Dade City, FL 33526
CONTAINER EXTEfDED EXTENDED EXTEfDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE

T4+ BERMEBDASOD
A 1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 500 SF

b COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 1,600 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED
B |S-OPALLETS(2,000SF-3,999SF) mmimmmmnnnonon

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 8,000 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF
C  |10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 SF) 15

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 12,000 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF
D 25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED
4 |STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)

C STAPLES (COUNTY SUPPLIED)

d STAPLES (VENDOR SUPPLIED)

1

10,000

ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR SOD

SEED

S & MULCH

1

NON GOLF COURSE SEED (50 POUND BAGS)

a. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 5018 400 Bag
b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 501B 340 Bag
c. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEPT.) 5018 340 Bag
d. BERMUDA SEED (HULLED) 501B 500 Bag
2 MULCH (50 POUND BAGS) 2
a. CYPRESS MULCH (Grade "A") 500 Bag || 3cf/bag | $5.50 [/BAG | $2,750.00
b. PREMIUM SHREDDED CYPRESS 400 Bag ||
¢ MALALUAKA MULCH- FLORAMULCH ® 500 Bag
CELLULOSE MULCH(FOR HYDRO SEEDING),
d  60% PAPER, 40% WOOD FIBER (50 LB BALES) |50 1B 300 Bag

<|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR SEED & MULCH

$2,750.00f::::




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

John Deere Landscapes
1385 East 36th Street

Harrell's LLC
720 Kraft Road

Helena Chemical
P.O. Box 1758

CHEMICALS Cleveland, OH 44114 Lakeland, FL 34240 Dade City, FL 33526
CONTAINER EXTEfDED EXTENDED EXTEfDED

ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
FERTILIZERS

6-2-16 FERTILIZER, w/ Slow Release Nitrogen :
1 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 30,000(LB $0.417| /LB $12,510.00}

15-0-15 FERTILIZER W7 .67% RONSTAR AND

SLOW RELEASE NITROGEN (NO :
2 SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 20,000|LB $0.750 $15,000.00}-

<|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR FERTILIZERS

$15,000.00}:

HERBICIDES/ ALGICIDES

1 VETERAN 720 2.5 gal 2 EA $135.00
2 ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE 2.5 gal 24 EA
3 ROUNDUP PRO 2.5gal 200 EA it
4 a. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 2.5 gal 15 EA $521.25
b. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 30 gal 10 EA $414.00 $4,140.00
5 a. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR 2.5 gal 10 EA $29.37 $293.70
b. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR (RETURNABLE
CONTAINER) 30 gal 50 EA $352.50 J/EA $17,625.00
6 SONAR Q (NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 401b 30 EA 7 $998.00 /EA $29,940.00
7 SONAR (A.S) (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1gal 5 GL AGENCY-] $1,698.00 /GL $8,490.00
8 SILKEN, KINETIC 1 gal 150 GL $32.88 /GL $4,932.00
SENCOR 75 TURF (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 51b 4 EA $339.50 $1,358.00
10 MEC AMINE-D 2.5 gal 20 EA i
11 a. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50z 10 EA $330.00 $3,300.00
b. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 15 oz 2 EA 4 $990.00 /EA $1,980.00
12 MONUMENT 75WG (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5x5 gram 12 EA NGY:] $240.00 /EA $2,880.00
13 GARLON 4 (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 gal 12 EA Element4 | $121.25 $1,455.00
14 a GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 gal 250 EA
b GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 20 EA
15 PLATEAU (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 gal 100 EA
16 MILESTONE VM (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 gal 40 EA $749.32 $29,972.80

NON AGENCY

“|[ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR HERBICIDES-

$28,831.70

]ESTIMATED AWARD TOTALS FOR HERBICIDES- AGENCY

$41,310.00




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

John Deere Landscapes
1385 East 36th Street

Harrell's LLC
720 Kraft Road

Helena Chemical
P.O. Box 1758

CHEMICALS Cleveland, OH 44114 Lakeland, FL 34240 Dade City, FL 33526
CONTAINER EXTEfDED EXTENDED EXTEfDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
FUNGICIDES
1 ALIETTE WDG (GENERICS ALLOWED) 551b 5 EA
: ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD FUNGICIDES

INSECTICIDES
1 ORTHENE 101b 10 EA Acephate 97 $67.50 /EA $675.00
2 a. AMDRO 1LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1lb 10 LB o =l $11.00 J/EA $110.00

b. AMDRO 25LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 251b 20 EA e
3 TOPCHOICE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50 Ib 100 EA $162.50 J/EA $16,250.00
4 TALSTAR F 1gal 40 GL :

ALOFT LC SC (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 64 oz 20 EA ] $465.60 J/EA $9,312.00

‘INON AGENCY

=|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR INSECTICIDES-

$110.00

$9,312.00

|ESTIMATED AWARD TOTALS FOR INSECTICIDES- AGENCY

$16,250.00

ADJUVANTS & ADDITIVES

1 DEFOAMER 1 quart 120 quart
2 LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1gal 500 GL
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT
3 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 quart 2,000 quart /Qt $18,360.00

|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR ADJUVANTS &

$0.00

| ADDITIVES

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS BY PRIMARY AWARD

$2,750.00

$15,110.00

$38,

143.70

|ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS BY AGENCY ITEMS

$0.00

$0.00

$57,560.00

Yellow Highlighted Items
Green Highlighted Items

= Primary Award
= Agency ltems

For all Non highlighted items showing under vendors
name, this demonstrates a secondary vendor award.



IFB 11-2981CD

TABULATED AWARD SHEET

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

Southern Agricultural Insecticides
7400 Bayshore Road

Crop Production Services
2100 Moores Lane

Agrium Advanced Technologies
2915 Rocky Mountain Ave, #400

CHEMICALS Rubonia, FL 34221 Mulberry, FL 33860 Loveland, CO 80538
CONTAINER EXTEfDED EXTEfDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PfICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PfICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
SODS
1 |BAHIA SOD
A 1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b COUNTY PICK UP
Cc DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

6,000 SF

800 SF

4,000 SF

B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 5,600 SF
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 7,600 SF
C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 1,800 SF
C  |10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 4,000 SF
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 8,000 SF
C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 12,500 SF
D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 225,000 SF
b SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod) 400,000 SF
2 [ST. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM
A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 7,600 SF
b COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 3,200 SF
d SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)
B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

2,500 SF

4,800 SF




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

Southern Agricultural Insecticides

7400 Bayshore Road

Crop Production Services
2100 Moores Lane

Agrium Advanced Technologies
2915 Rocky Mountain Ave, #400

CHEMICALS Rubonia, FL 34221 Mulberry, FL 33860 Loveland, CO 80538
CONTAINER EXTEfDED EXTEDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PfICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PfICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE

F—T4+-BERMEBASOD
A 1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 500 SF

b COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 1,600 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED
B |S-OPALLETS(2,000SF-3,999SF) oo

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 8,000 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF
C  [10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 SF)

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 12,000 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF
D 25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)  salsiiaiaiaeltala bl

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED s
4 |STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)

C STAPLES (COUNTY SUPPLIED)

d STAPLES (VENDOR SUPPLIED)
B ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR SOD

SEEDS & MULCH

1

NON GOLF COURSE SEED (50 POUND BAGS)

a. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 50 1B 400 Bag
b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 501B 340 Bag
c. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEPT.) 50 1B 340 Bag
d. BERMUDA SEED (HULLED) 50 1B 500 Bag
2 MULCH (50 POUND BAGS)
a. CYPRESS MULCH (Grade "A") 500 Bag
b. PREMIUM SHREDDED CYPRESS 400 Bag
¢ MALALUAKA MULCH- FLORAMULCH © 500 Bag
CELLULOSE MULCH(FOR HYDRO SEEDING),
d 60% PAPER, 40% WOOD FIBER (50 LB BALES) [501B 300 Bag

]ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR SEED & MULCH




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD Southern Agricultural Insecticides Crop Production Services Agrium Advanced Technologies
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC |[[7400 Bayshore Road 2100 Moores Lane 2915 Rocky Mountain Ave, #400
CHEMICALS Rubonia, FL 34221 Mulberry, FL 33860 Loveland, CO 80538
CONTAINER EXTEfDED EXTEDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PfICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PfICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
FERTILIZERS
6-2-16 FERTILIZER, w/ Slow Release Nitrogen
1 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 30,000(LB
15-0-15 FERTILIZER W/ .67% RONSTAR AND
SLOW RELEASE NITROGEN (NO
2 SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 20,000(LB

J|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR FERTILIZERS

HERBICIDES/ ALGICIDES

1 VETERAN 720 2.5 gal 2 EA
2 ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE 2.5 gal 24 EA
3 ROUNDUP PRO 2.5 gal 200 EA
4 a. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 2.5 gal 15 EA $521.25

b. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 30 gal 10 EA $4,170.00
5 a. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR 2.5 gal 10 EA

b. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR (RETURNABLE

CONTAINER) 30 gal 50 EA
6 SONAR Q (NO SUBSITUTITIONS) 40 Ib 30 EA GE $24.95 /Lb $29,940.00
7 SONAR (A.S) (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1gal 5 GL A | $1,698.00 /GL $8,490.00
] SILKEN, KINETIC 1gal 150 GL Silnet 200 $31.20 /GL $4,680.00

SENCOR 75 TURF (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 51b 4 EA 1 $343.75 [EA $1,375.00
10 MEC AMINE-D 2.5 gal 20 EA . $1,000.00
11 a. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50z 10 EA I : $340.00 /EA $3,400.00

b. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 15 oz 2 EA T ] $340.00 /EA $2,040.00 -
12 MONUMENT 75WG (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5x5 gram 12 EA ||-AGE $240.00 /EA $2,880.00 ik . $2,880.00
13 GARLON 4 (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 gal 12 EA it
14 a GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 gal 250 EA A Element 3a $37.10 $23,187.50

b GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 20 EA Element 3A $37.10 $22,260.00
15 PLATEAU (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 gal 100 EA $120.00 $30,000.00
16 MILESTONE VM (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 gal 40 EA $29,000.00
ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR HERBICIDES-

INON AGENCY $0.00 $64,201.25 $0.00
|ESTIMATED AWARD TOTALS FOR HERBICIDES- AGENCY - $2,880.00 : ] $38,430.00 ; - $2,880.00




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

Southern Agricultural Insecticides
7400 Bayshore Road

Crop Production Services
2100 Moores Lane

Agrium Advanced Technologies
2915 Rocky Mountain Ave, #400

CHEMICALS Rubonia, FL 34221 Mulberry, FL 33860 Loveland, CO 80538
CONTAINER EXTEfDED EXTEfDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PfICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PfICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
FUNGICIDES
1 ALIETTE WDG (GENERICS ALLOWED) 551b 5 EA
: ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD FUNGICIDES

INSECTICIDES
1 ORTHENE 101b 10 EA
2 a. AMDRO 1LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1lb 10 LB

b. AMDRO 25LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 251b 20 EA $173.75 [EA $3,475.00
3 TOPCHOICE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50 Ib 100 EA $162.50 /EA $16,250.00 $16,250.00
4 TALSTAR F 1gal 40 GL $30.00 /EA $1,200.00

ALOFT LC SC (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 64 oz 20 EA 1 $495.00 /EA $9,900.00

=|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR INSECTICIDES-

‘INON AGENCY

$3,475.00}:

$0.00

|ESTIMATED AWARD TOTALS FOR INSECTICIDES- AGENCY

$16,250.00["

$16,250.00

ADJUVANTS & ADDITIVES

1 DEFOAMER 1 quart 120 quart $540.00

2 LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1gal 500 GL ‘|Spreader 90 $4,730.00
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT :

3 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 quart 2,000 quart

|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR ADJUVANTS &

| ADDITIVES

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS BY PRIMARY AWARD

$3,475.00

$64,201.25

$0.00

|ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS BY AGENCY ITEMS

$19,130.00

$38,430.00

$19,130.00

Yellow Highlighted Items
Green Highlighted Items

= Primary Award
= Agency ltems

For all Non highlighted items showing under vendors
name, this demonstrates a secondary vendor award.



TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

CHEMICALS

Red River Specialties, Inc.
1013 NW Suwannee Ave
Branford, FL 32008

Univar USA Inc.

5051 L.B McLeod Rd, Suite D

Orlanddo, FL 32811

AlliGare LLC

13 N. 8th Street
Opelika, AL 36801

CWC Chemical, Inc.
214 Simmons Drive
Cloverdale, VA 24077

ITEM PRODUCT NAME

CONTAINER
SIZE

EST. QTY.

ALTERNATE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ALTERNATE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ALTERNATE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ALTERNATE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

SODS

1 |BAHIA SOD

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b COUNTY PICK UP

Cc DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

6,000 SF

800 SF

4,000 SF

B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

5,600 SF

7,600 SF

1,800 SF

C  |10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 SF)
a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
b DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

C SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

4,000 SF

8,000 SF

12,500 SF

D |25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)
a. DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

b SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

225,000 SF

400,000 SF

2 [ST. AUGUSTINE- FLORATAM

A |1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED

b COUNTY PICK UP
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

d SLOPE DELIVERY & INSTALLATION (Pallet Sod)

7,600 SF

800 SF

3,200 SF

B |5-9 PALLETS (2,000 SF - 3,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED
C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

2,500 SF

4,800 SF




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

Red River Specialties, Inc.
1013 NW Suwannee Ave

Univar USA Inc.
5051 L.B McLeod Rd, Suite D

AlliGare LLC
13 N. 8th Street

CWC Chemical, Inc.
214 Simmons Drive

CHEMICALS Branford, FL 32008 Orlanddo, FL 32811 Opelika, AL 36801 Cloverdale, VA 24077
CONTAINER EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE

T4+ BERMEBDASOD
A 1-4 PALLETS (400 SF - 1,999 SF)

a. DELIVERED AND SPOT PLACED 500 SF

b COUNTY PICK UP 800 SF

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 1,600 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED
B |S-OPALLETS(2,000SF-3,999SF) mmimmmmnnnonon

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 8,000 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF
C  [10-24 PALLETS (4,000 SF - 9,999 SF) 15

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod) 12,000 SF

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED 4,000 SF
D 25 PALLETS OR MORE (10,000 SF OR MORE)

C DELIVERED & INSTALLED (Pallet Sod)

d ROLLED SOD- DELIVERED & INSTALLED
4 |STAKE/STAPLES (INSTALLED BY VENDOR)

C STAPLES (COUNTY SUPPLIED)

d STAPLES (VENDOR SUPPLIED)

1

10,000

ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR SOD

SEEDS & MULCH

1

NON GOLF COURSE SEED (50 POUND BAGS)

a. PENSACOLA BAHIA SEED 50 1B 400 Bag
b. RYE GRASS (OCT THRU MARCH) 501B 340 Bag
c. BROWN TOP MILLET (APRIL THRU SEPT.) 50 1B 340 Bag
d. BERMUDA SEED (HULLED) 50 1B 500 Bag
2 MULCH (50 POUND BAGS)
a. CYPRESS MULCH (Grade "A") 500 Bag
b. PREMIUM SHREDDED CYPRESS 400 Bag
¢ MALALUAKA MULCH- FLORAMULCH © 500 Bag
CELLULOSE MULCH(FOR HYDRO SEEDING),
d 60% PAPER, 40% WOOD FIBER (50 LB BALES) [501B 300 Bag

<|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR SEED & MULCH




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB 11-2981CD Red River Specialties, Inc. Univar USA Inc. AlliGare LLC CWC Chemical, Inc.
SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC [[1013 NW Suwannee Ave 5051 L.B McLeod Rd, Suite D 13 N. 8th Street 214 Simmons Drive
CHEMICALS Branford, FL 32008 Orlanddo, FL 32811 Opelika, AL 36801 Cloverdale, VA 24077
CONTAINER EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED

ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
FERTILIZERS

6-2-16 FERTILIZER, w/ Slow Release Nitrogen
1 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 30,000(LB

15-0-15 FERTILIZER W/ .67% RONSTAR AND

SLOW RELEASE NITROGEN (NO
2 SUBSTITUTIONS) BAGS 20,000(LB

“|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR FERTILIZERS

HERBICIDES/ ALGICIDES
1 VETERAN 720 2.5 gal 2EA |F : EA $154.00
2 ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE 2.5 gal 24 EA | Glophosate 4+ $582.00}}:
3 ROUNDUP PRO 2.5 gal 200 EA || Glophosate 4+ $4,850.00]:
4 a. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 2.5 gal 15 EA | R o 8

b. WEEDAR 64 (AQUATIC LABEL) (NO SUBS) 30 gal 10 EA | i
5 a. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR 2.5 gal 10 EA : Glophosate 5.4  $30.75 $307.50]:

b. RODEO, AQUA CLEAR (RETURNABLE : g

CONTAINER) 30 gal 50 EA . Glophosate 5.4  $355.50 $17,775.00
; e o P S e B e e et SR e e SR
7 SONAR (A.S) (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 gal 5 GL
8 SILKEN, KINETIC 1 gal 150 GL

SENCOR 75 TURF (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 51b 4 EA
10 MEC AMINE-D 2.5 gal 20 EA
11 a. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50z 10 EA

b. TRAN XIT GTA (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 15 oz 2 EA
12 MONUMENT 75WG (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 5x5 gram 12 EA B sl Bt S
13 GARLON 4 (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 gal 12 EA | Triclopyr 4 $109.75 /EA| $1,317.00f:
14 a GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 2.5 gal 250 EA ||} Triclopyr 3 $86.80 /EA| $21,700.00f:

b GARLON 3A (GENERICS ALLOWED) 30 GAL 20EA | Triclopyr3 | $1,026.60 /EA | $20,532.00|:
15 PLATEAU (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 gal 100 EA || $302.50 /EA| $30,250.00
16 MILESTONE VM (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 2.5 gal 40 EA

Z|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR HERBICIDES- : - .
NON AGENCY 3 . 1 $48,399.00}: $0.00

]ESTIMATED AWARD TOTALS FOR HERBICIDES- AGENCY




TABULATED AWARD SHEET

IFB

11-2981CD

SOD, FERTILIZER, HERBICIDES, and OTHER RELATED AQUATIC

Red River Specialties, Inc.
1013 NW Suwannee Ave

Univar USA Inc.

5051 L.B McLeod Rd, Suite D

AlliGare LLC

13 N. 8th Street

CWC Chemical, Inc.
214 Simmons Drive

CHEMICALS Branford, FL 32008 Orlanddo, FL 32811 Opelika, AL 36801 Cloverdale, VA 24077
CONTAINER EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM PRODUCT NAME SIZE EST. QTY. ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICE PRICE
FUNGICIDES
1 ALIETTE WDG (GENERICS ALLOWED) 5.51b 5 EA Fosetyl-Al IEA $467.50
ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD FUNGICIDES $467.50

INSECTICIDES
1 ORTHENE 10 1b 10 EA
2 a. AMDRO 1LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1lb 10 LB

b. AMDRO 25LB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 251b 20 EA
3 TOPCHOICE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 50 Ib 100 EA
4 TALSTAR F 1gal 40 GL

ALOFT LC SC (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 64 oz 20 EA

‘INON AGENCY

=|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR INSECTICIDES-

|ESTIMATED AWARD TOTALS FOR INSECTICIDES- AGENCY

ADJUVANTS & ADDITIVES

Alligare
1 DEFOAMER 1 quart 120 quart Antifoam $522.00
2 LOVELAND X-77 SPREADER 1 gal 500 GL Alligard 90 $3,475.00
PROMATE ACCURACY, WINDBRAKE, AIRTIGHT
3 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 1 quart 2,000 quart

|ESTIMATED PRIMARY AWARD TOTALS FOR ADJUVANTS &

$3,997.00}::

| ADDITIVES

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS BY PRIMARY AWARD $467.50 $0.00 $52,396.00 $0.00
|{ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS BY AGENCY ITEMS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Yellow Highlighted Items = Primary Award ESTIMATED YEARLY PRIMARY AWARD TOTAL: $510,949.97
Green Highlighted Items = Agency ltems
ESTIMATED YEARLY AGENCY ITEM AWARD TOTAL.: $57,560.00
For all Non highlighted items showing under vendors
name, this demonstrates a secondary vendor award.
ESTIMATED YEARLY GRAND AWARD TOTAL: $568,509.97
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