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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD I 

Notice of Intent to Award , Invitation for Bid #14-0684-0V, Southeast Waler Reclamation Facility (SEWRF) Dedicated Reject Line 
to the lowest, responsive responsible bidder, E. T. MacKenzie of Florida, Inc., 6212 33rd Street East, Bradenton, FL for a total 
Base Bid of -9:833 255.50 fBid "A"\ for a comnlelion time of 120 calendar davs. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

FederallStats law(s), administrative ruUng(8). Manatee County Comp Pia nILand Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy. 

Manatee County Code of Laws 

BACKGROUND/OISCUSSION 

The Work in this project consists of the installation of approximately 1,910 linear feet of 24-inch ductile iron pipe by open 
cut construction , fillings , manual and motor operated valves, and other appurtenances. Location of the Work is 3331 
Lena Road, Bradenton, FL. 

Successful Contractor shall furnish and install all materials, equipment and labor required to perform this project in 
accordance with the specifications and plans provided with the solicitation. 

Appropriate Bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability was advertised on mymanatee.org, OemandStar 
and the Manatee Chamber of Commerce. 

Ten (10) bids were received: 

Citrus Count~ BID " A" ,120 Calendar Da~s) BID "B" (180 Calendar Da)ls} 
Pas piech Contracting, Inc. 
(Inverness, FL) $ 933,636.00 $ 898,436.00 

Hillsborough Countlf 
American Construction Services, Inc. 
(Tampa, FL) 1,649,296.00 1,649,296.00 

BackQround discussion continued on page 2. 

Funds Verified, 
Utility Rates, 404-
6083680 (Budget 

Department X Amendment 9-14-• 
ATTACHMENTS Recommendation FUNDING SOURCE 053/3 pending 

(List In order of attached) • Bid T abulalion (Acet Number & Name) BCC approval 
5/612014) 

AMTIFREQ OF RECURRING 
COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact 

COST $833,255.50 Statement) 
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Hillsborough County (Continued) BID "A" (120 Calendar Davs) BID "B" (180 Calendar Daysl 

Brandes Design-Build, Inc. 
(Clearwater, FL) 925,430.00 $ 903,430.00 

Harris-McBurney, Company 
(Tampa, FL) No Bid 999,814.20 

Manatee County 

E. T. MacKenzie, Bradenton, FL 833,255.50 833,255.50 

TLC Diversified (Palmetto, FL) No Bid 1,043,108.00 

Westra Construction (Palmetto, FL) No Bid 1,002,122.00 

Woodruff & Sons (Bradenton, FL) No Bid 1,326,016.71 

Seminole County 

L7 Construction, Inc. 839,993.00 839,993.00 

Ann Arborl Michigan 
Douglas N. Higgins, Inc. 992,992.00 971,146.00 

On April 28, 2014, a memorandum from Project Management Division was received recommending award to E. T. 
MacKenzie, Inc., Bradenton, FL the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder for a total base bid of $833,255.50 with a 
completion time of 120 Calendar Days (Bid "A"l. 

A Budget Amendment (BU14000284,/ B-145-053/3) has been processed and will be presented to the BCC on May 
6,2014. 
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MEMORANDUM 
To: 

From: 

Date: 

Subject: 

Melissa M. Wendel, CPPO, Purchasing Official 
Jeff Streitmatter III, P. E., Project Management (f:l ~ 
Division Manager ~ r 
Aprit23,2014 

SEWRF - Dedicated Reject Line 

E. T. MacKenzie 
Recommendation for Award - IFB#14 M 0684 M OV 

Manatee 
County 

r LOR IOA 

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation fonm 
is attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract Bid "A" I with a construction 
time of 120 Calendar Days be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, E.T. 
MacKenzie in the amount of $833,255.50 and in accordance with the terms and conditions of 
the bid package. Upon completion of project award, please provide a copy of the purchase 
order assigned to the contractor. The funding source for this contract is Utility Rates. 

The amount currently encumbered is less than the proposed contract amount, and a budget 
amendment will be prepared to fully fund the project prior to the contract award. 

Please contact Kent Bontrager, Project Engineer II if you have any questions regarding the 
attached documents. 

Thank you for your continued assistance. 

JS/kdb p'9 . 

cc: Mike Gore, Director, Utilities 
Ron Schul hofer, Director, Public Works 
Sia Mollanazar, P .E., Deputy Director, Engineering Services 
Kent Bontrager, Project Engineer II 

Project File: 6083680 9.2 
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IFSN14-Ot84-OVlBASE BID -A­
SEWRF o.diclt.cf R-fKl Lint 
ManlllH County, 9radtnlon, FL· ProJed No.: 60&3880 

BIO"A" 
120 CALENDAR DAYS 

,. 

• TNt TOI .. C .... "'" ""'.'" farc-n*< 2 _. "'" ...... h .... TellLI Ot/ ... 
.... d ... IIWF_1. 

.~, 125000 S.48S.DOOOO 527700 

$30.00000 $110.00000 128.00000 

S2O,OOOOO S20,OOOOO S17.OOOOO 

SIIXI,IJooOO Sloo,ooooo 110.1.00000 

Plg.l aft 
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SEWRF ~Ieat.d Reject LInt 
Manat" County, Bradenton, FL . ProJtel No.: 6DB3BSO 

BID "A" 
120 CALENDAR DAYS 
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1f9 tI"-MI4-oVIBASE 8lD -8-

SEWRF Dedk:l~ ~JI'tl LIM 
M.lnl" County. erld ... _. FL - Proi'C' No.: MflUa 

BID "B" 
180 CALENDAR DAYS 
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PREPARED BY: 
(ProJM:t M,n'gem""t) 

REVIEWED BY: 
(Proj.ct Engineer) 

BID TABULA nON 

FOR 

IFB #l4-0684-0V 

Southeast Water Reclamation Facility (SEWRF) Dedicated Reject Line 

BID "A"IBID "B" 
BASED ON A COMPLETION nME OF 1201180 CALENDAR DAYS 

David A. O'Connor, PEl BCE~ Cardno 

Kelly Wehner, PE, c&"no V 

PROJECT MANAGEMENT: ~~~C(Engln .. rll 
APPROVED BY: 
(1'urchaslng) 

PI,. 5 of S 

~y 
o.te 


