



1112 Manatee Avenue West
Bradenton, FL 34205
purchasing@mymanatee.org

Solicitation Addendum

Addendum No.: 1
Solicitation No.: IFB 21-R077463JH
Solicitation Title: EMS Medical Supplies
Addendum Date: September 16, 2021
Procurement Contact: Jeb Hayter

IFB 21-R077463JH is amended as set forth herein. Responses to questions posed by prospective bidders are provided below. This Addendum is hereby incorporated in and made a part of IFB 21-R077463JH.

The deadline to submit all inquiries concerning interpretation, clarification or additional information pertaining to this IFB was September 9, 2021.

REPLACE:

ATTACHMENT G, BID PRICING FORM

Replace Attachment G, Bid Pricing Form with the Revised Attachment G – Bid Pricing Form issued with this Addendum No. 1 and available for download as a separate attachment.

QUESTIONS AND RESPONSES:

Q1. Could you please confirm that bids can be submitted by email or fax?

R1. Refer to Section A.03, Submission of Bids.

Q2. Do we have to bid on all items (aggregate) in order to be considered for this bid?

R2. Bidder must bid all the items in a group; however, is not obligated to bid on all groups.

Q3. Can this bid be submitted electronically or via bidsync?

R3 Refer to R1.

**Q4. 3M has discontinued this product, what would they like for a replacement?
(Group D: Respirator with exhalation valve, 10/bx - #3M9211, N95)**

R4. Bid a Respirator with Exhalation valve that is NIOSH N95 certified.

Q5. For line 4 in group I, what strength would be needed for the Acetaminophen Suppository?

R5. 120mg

Q6. The item “Lancets (200/box)”, is this for “Safety Lancets”?

R6. Yes

Q7. What is the quantity of glucose test strips per box?

R7. 50 each

Q8. Could Manatee County provide the previous bid price?

R8. Please see attached previous Bid Tabulation IFB 17-1032GE tab sheet for medical supplies.

Q9. Group A items #54 and #55 for Filterlines and Capnolines. Are you willing to accept non-Medtronic (Oridion) capnography products?

R9. Yes

Q10. Group I item #56 for “OVERNIGHT "COLD" SHIPPING CHARGES-AS REQUIRED”. Could you please confirm what is expected to be bid for this line? Are you requesting cost to overnight ship refrigerated pharmaceuticals?

R10. This cost should be included in the pricing of any items that have to be shipped cold.

Q11. Can you tell us what type of coveralls are you currently using? Do they have hoods and boots attached?

R11. Blue Precept, with hoods, no boots

Q12. For clarification- you will allow deviations or exceptions to the terms to be submitted for review at the time of bid submittal?

R12. No deviations or exceptions shall be accepted.

Q13. price changes are going to be allowed at any time during the term of one year and for the renewal periods, if noted on a sperate sheet the items that could have price changes during the time of the bid. And those items can be changed at any time with a 14-day notice. Is this correct?

R13. Yes, with proper documentation sent directly from the manufacturer.

Q14. Group A: Item # 30: Curaplex Select Nebulizer, small-volume, handheld, T-piece, Mouthpiece, flextube, 7 ft, this is a Curaplex brand that is exclusive only to Boundtree Medical. Please allow substitutions on this item or remove item from the bid.

R14. Refer to Revised Attachment G – Bid Pricing Form.

Q15. Group A: Item #31: VixOne Nebulizer with Pedi Dragon Mast, latex free, Westmed#0312, Westmed doesn’t sell the Vixone with Pedi Dragon. Westmed item 0312 includes the following - nebulizer, 7 Foot kink resistant tubing, Super Spike™ pediatric mask. Is this what you are wanting?

R15. The correct item is Westmed item # 0311.

Q16. Group B: Item # 5: Vacutainer Needle, what size needle are you looking for?

R16. 21gtw X 1" (0.80 X 25mm)

Q17. Group B: Item # 6: .5-gram foil package, K-Y lubrication jelly, should this item be 5 grams, or do you want .5 grams?

R17. 5 grams

Q18. Group B: Item #12: MAD100, Mucosal Atomization Device, MAD100 is now owned by Teleflex. Can you supply the Teleflex or Boundtree part number as there are three different options?

R18. BT 2170-20100

Q19. Group B: Item #38: 25 ga x 5/8" needles, can you please supply the manufacturer or Boundtree's part number?

R19. BT 620403

Q20. Group B: Item #39: 20 ga x 1 1/2" needles, can you please supply the manufacturer or Boundtree's part number?

R20. BT 11317

Q21. Group B: Item #42: Bone Marrow Needle, Jamshida, there are multiple sizes available. What size are you looking for?

R21. 15ga X 1 7/8"

Q22. Group B: Item #44: Clave vial adapters, Abott #1200-01, Clave is not an Abbott product. Please supply the manufacturer name / part number or Boundtree's part number.

R22. G4128

Q23. Group B: Item #59: IV Start Kit, this is a Curaplex brand that is exclusive only to Boundtree Medical. Please allow substitutions on this item or remove item from the bid.

R23. Refer to the Revised Attachment G – Bid Pricing Form.

Q24. Group C: Item # 4: Curaplex Extrication Collar, Adult, this is a Curaplex brand that is exclusive only to Boundtree Medical. Please allow substitutions on this item or remove item from the bid.

R24. Refer to the Revised Attachment G – Bid Pricing Form.

Q25. Group C: Item #5: Curaplex Extrication Collar, Mini, this is a Curaplex brand that is exclusive only to Boundtree Medical. Please allow substitutions on this item or remove item from the bid.

R25. Refer to the Revised Attachment G – Bid Pricing Form.

Q26. Group E: Item #1: 8 Quart Sage Sharps Container 10"x7.25x10.5, Sage Products # 8870, 8870 is an 18-gallon white/blue pharmaceutical waste container. Do you still want the Sage # 8870?

R26. Remove the item# 8870 and bid 8 Quart in the dimensions in the description.

Q27. Group L: Item # 1 – 14: These items must be purchased directly from Teleflex. No distributor can bid on these items. Please remove these items from the bid.

R27. These items are required by the County and will not be removed from the Invitation to Bid. Bidders are not required to bid on all groups.

Q28. We would like to see that all no-substitution products be grouped together in one group.

R28. Bidders shall provide bids in accordance with the Revised Attachment G – Bid Pricing Form. No further modifications shall be made.

NOTE:

Deleted items will be ~~struck through~~, added or modified items will be underlined. All other terms and conditions remain as stated in the IFB.

INSTRUCTIONS:

Receipt of this Addendum must be acknowledged as instructed in the solicitation document. Failure to acknowledge receipt of this Addendum may result in the response being deemed non-responsive.

END OF ADDENDUM

AUTHORIZED FOR RELEASE

TABULATION FOR IFB 17-1032GE Medical Supplies

Bid award will be on a per Group basis. Note the discount percentage off catalog prices found after Group J.

Item	Description	Unit	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Group A																	
						Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices	Midwest Medical Supply, Extension	Diamond Medical Supplies, Unit Prices	Diamond Medical Supplies, Extension	Ever Ready First Aid, Unit Prices	Ever Ready First Aid, Extension	Henry Schein EMS, Unit Prices	Henry Schein EMS, Extension	Quadmed, Unit Prices	Quadmed, Extension	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Unit Prices	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Extension
GROUP A: OXYGEN AND AIRWAY CONTROL, BASIC AIRWAY MANAGEMENT																							
1	Adult Spur II	each	Ambu 520-211-000	No Substitution	1600	\$ 8.18	\$ 13,088.00	\$ 11.45	\$ 18,320.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 25,600.00	\$ 10.46	\$ 16,736.00	\$ 12.88	\$ 20,608.00	\$ 10.36	\$ 16,576.00	\$ 9.11	\$ 14,576.00	\$ 9.80	\$ 15,680.00	\$ 9.29	\$ 14,864.00
2	Pedi Spur II	each	Ambu 530-213-000	No Substitution	80	\$ 8.18	\$ 654.40	\$ 15.17	\$ 1,213.60	\$ 21.00	\$ 1,680.00	\$ 13.20	\$ 1,056.00	\$ 12.88	\$ 1,030.40	\$ 13.72	\$ 1,097.60	\$ 12.08	\$ 966.40	\$ 16.21	\$ 1,296.80	\$ 12.99	\$ 1,039.20
3	Infant Spur II	each	Ambu 540-212-000	No Substitution	60	\$ 8.18	\$ 490.80	\$ 15.35	\$ 921.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 1,530.00	\$ 13.20	\$ 792.00	\$ 12.88	\$ 772.80	\$ 13.72	\$ 823.20	\$ 12.09	\$ 725.40	\$ 15.82	\$ 949.20	\$ 12.99	\$ 779.40
4	55mm, infant, Hudson cath-guide airways, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	30	\$ 0.83	\$ 24.90	\$ 1.89	\$ 56.70	\$ 1.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 24.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.90	\$ 27.00	\$ 0.87	\$ 26.10	\$ 0.96	\$ 28.80	\$ 0.85	\$ 25.50
5	60mm, small child, Hudson cath-guide airways, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	20	\$ 0.83	\$ 16.60	\$ 1.89	\$ 37.80	\$ 1.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 16.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.90	\$ 18.00	\$ 0.87	\$ 17.40	\$ 0.96	\$ 19.20	\$ 0.85	\$ 17.00
6	70mm, child, Hudson cath-guide airways, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	20	\$ 0.83	\$ 16.60	\$ 1.89	\$ 37.80	\$ 1.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 16.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.90	\$ 18.00	\$ 0.87	\$ 17.40	\$ 0.96	\$ 19.20	\$ 0.85	\$ 17.00
7	80mm, small adult, Hudson cath-guide airways, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	100	\$ 0.83	\$ 83.00	\$ 1.12	\$ 112.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 80.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.90	\$ 90.00	\$ 0.87	\$ 87.00	\$ 0.96	\$ 96.00	\$ 0.85	\$ 85.00
8	100mm, medium adult, Hudson cath-guide airways, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	700	\$ 0.83	\$ 581.00	\$ 1.18	\$ 826.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 560.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.90	\$ 630.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 693.00	\$ 0.96	\$ 772.00	\$ 0.85	\$ 595.00
9	110mm, adult, Hudson cath-guide airways, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	350	\$ 0.83	\$ 290.50	\$ 1.89	\$ 661.50	\$ 1.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 280.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.90	\$ 315.00	\$ 0.87	\$ 304.50	\$ 0.96	\$ 336.00	\$ 0.90	\$ 315.00
10	120mm, large adult, Hudson cath-guide airways, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	100	\$ 0.83	\$ 83.00	\$ 1.12	\$ 112.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 80.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.90	\$ 90.00	\$ 0.87	\$ 87.00	\$ 0.96	\$ 96.00	\$ 0.90	\$ 90.00
11	size 12 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	40	\$ 1.22	\$ 48.80	\$ 3.47	\$ 138.80	\$ 2.90	\$ 116.00	\$ 2.11	\$ 84.40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2.18	\$ 87.20	\$ 2.62	\$ 104.80	\$ 2.40	\$ 96.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 39.60
12	size 14 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	30	\$ 1.22	\$ 36.60	\$ 3.47	\$ 104.10	\$ 2.90	\$ 87.00	\$ 2.11	\$ 63.30	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2.18	\$ 65.40	\$ 2.62	\$ 78.60	\$ 2.40	\$ 72.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 29.70
13	size 16 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	40	\$ 1.22	\$ 48.80	\$ 3.47	\$ 138.80	\$ 2.90	\$ 116.00	\$ 2.11	\$ 84.40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2.18	\$ 87.20	\$ 2.62	\$ 104.80	\$ 2.40	\$ 96.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 39.60
14	size 18 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	40	\$ 1.22	\$ 48.80	\$ 3.47	\$ 138.80	\$ 2.90	\$ 116.00	\$ 2.11	\$ 84.40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2.18	\$ 87.20	\$ 2.62	\$ 104.80	\$ 2.40	\$ 96.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 39.60
15	size 20 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	30	\$ 1.22	\$ 36.60	\$ 3.20	\$ 96.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 87.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 49.50	\$ 2.40	\$ 72.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 65.40	\$ 2.42	\$ 72.60	\$ 1.59	\$ 47.70	\$ 0.99	\$ 29.70
16	size 22 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	30	\$ 1.22	\$ 36.60	\$ 3.20	\$ 96.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 87.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 49.50	\$ 2.40	\$ 72.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 65.40	\$ 2.42	\$ 72.60	\$ 1.59	\$ 47.70	\$ 0.99	\$ 29.70
17	size 24 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	75	\$ 1.22	\$ 91.50	\$ 3.20	\$ 240.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 217.50	\$ 1.65	\$ 123.75	\$ 2.40	\$ 180.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 163.50	\$ 2.42	\$ 181.50	\$ 1.59	\$ 119.25	\$ 0.99	\$ 74.25
18	size 26 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	175	\$ 1.22	\$ 213.50	\$ 3.20	\$ 560.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 507.50	\$ 1.65	\$ 288.75	\$ 2.40	\$ 420.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 381.50	\$ 2.42	\$ 423.50	\$ 1.59	\$ 278.25	\$ 0.99	\$ 173.25
19	size 28 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	150	\$ 1.22	\$ 183.00	\$ 3.30	\$ 495.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 435.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 247.50	\$ 2.40	\$ 360.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 327.00	\$ 2.42	\$ 363.00	\$ 1.59	\$ 238.50	\$ 0.99	\$ 148.50
20	size 30 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	100	\$ 1.22	\$ 122.00	\$ 3.30	\$ 330.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 290.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 165.00	\$ 2.40	\$ 360.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 327.00	\$ 2.42	\$ 363.00	\$ 1.59	\$ 238.50	\$ 0.99	\$ 148.50
21	size 32 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	100	\$ 1.22	\$ 122.00	\$ 3.30	\$ 330.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 290.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 165.00	\$ 2.40	\$ 240.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 218.00	\$ 2.42	\$ 242.00	\$ 1.59	\$ 159.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 99.00
22	size 34 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	50	\$ 1.22	\$ 61.00	\$ 3.20	\$ 160.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 145.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 82.50	\$ 2.40	\$ 120.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 109.00	\$ 2.42	\$ 121.00	\$ 1.59	\$ 79.50	\$ 0.99	\$ 49.50
23	size 36 fr, Nasopharyngeal airway, robertazzi style, latex free	each	Rusch	or Equivalent	40	\$ 1.22	\$ 48.80	\$ 3.30	\$ 198.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 174.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 99.00	\$ 2.40	\$ 144.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 130.80	\$ 2.42	\$ 145.20	\$ 1.59	\$ 95.40	\$ 0.99	\$ 59.40
24	Infant, medium concentration oxygen mask, latex free, w/7ft tubing	each		or Equivalent	70	\$ 0.91	\$ 63.70	\$ 4.72	\$ 330.40	\$ 1.55	\$ 108.50	\$ 0.70	\$ 49.00	\$ 1.40	\$ 98.00	\$ 0.90	\$ 63.00	\$ 2.72	\$ 190.40	\$ 0.87	\$ 60.90	\$ 0.73	\$ 51.10
25	Pediatric non-breather, high concentration oxygen mask, latex free, w/7ft tubing	each		or Equivalent	350	\$ 0.67	\$ 234.50	\$ 1.33	\$ 465.50	\$ 1.15	\$ 402.50	\$ 0.67	\$ 234.50	\$ 2.40	\$ 840.00	\$ 0.90	\$ 315.00	\$ 1.04	\$ 364.00	\$ 0.68	\$ 238.00	\$ 0.64	\$ 224.00
26	Adult, non-breather, high concentration oxygen mask, latex free, elongated w/7ft tubing	each		or Equivalent	3000	\$ 0.67	\$ 2,010.00	\$ 0.82	\$ 2,460.00	\$ 1.12	\$ 3,360.00	\$ 0.63	\$ 1,890.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 0.75	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 1.06	\$ 3,180.00	\$ 0.59	\$ 1,770.00	\$ 0.61	\$ 1,830.00
27	Infant Nasal cannula, latex free, w/7ft tubing	each		or Equivalent	50	\$ 0.43	\$ 21.50	\$ 3.06	\$ 153.00	\$ 0.93	\$ 46.50	\$ 0.70	\$ 35.00	\$ 3.25	\$ 162.50	\$ 0.90	\$ 45.00	\$ 1.98	\$ 99.00	\$ 0.71	\$ 35.50	\$ 0.39	\$ 19.50
28	Pediatric Nasal Cannula, latex free with 7ft tubing	each		or Equivalent	250	\$ 0.26	\$ 65.00	\$ 2.60	\$ 650.00	\$ 0.89	\$ 222.50	\$ 0.35	\$ 87.50	\$ 2.50	\$ 625.00	\$ 0.36	\$ 90.00	\$ 0.18	\$ 45.00	\$ 0.29	\$ 72.50	\$ 0.23	\$ 57.50
29	Adult, nasal cannula, over the ear style, flair tipped, latex free, w/7ft tubing	each		or Equivalent	9000	\$ 0.26	\$ 2,340.00	\$ 0.47	\$ 4,230.00	\$ 0.40	\$ 3,600.00	\$ 0.24	\$ 2,160.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 0.25	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 0.25	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 0.24	\$ 2,160.00	\$ 0.21	\$ 1,890.00
30	Curplex Select Nebulizer, small-volume, hand held, 1-piece, Mouthpiece, flexible, 7 ft	each		or Equivalent	900	\$ 0.73	\$ 657.00	\$ 1.90	\$ 1,710.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 0.75	\$ 675.00	\$ 1.50	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 0.75	\$ 675.00	\$ 0.60	\$ 540.00	\$ 0.75	\$ 675.00	\$ 0.61	\$ 549.00
31	ViaOne Nebulizer with Pedi Dragon Mast, latex free, Westmed#0312	each		or Equivalent	75	\$ 1.23	\$ 92.25	\$ 1.19	\$ 89.25	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1.25	\$ 93.75	\$ 1.75	\$ 131.25	\$ 1.36	\$ 102.00	\$ 1.12	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.31	\$ 98.25	\$ 0.79	\$ 59.25
32	84" Oxygen supply tube, latex free	each		or Equivalent	30	\$ 0.29	\$ 8.70	\$ 0.40	\$ 12.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.24	\$ 7.20	\$ 0.75	\$ 22.50	\$ 0.30	\$ 9.00	\$ 0.27	\$ 8.10	\$ 0.32	\$ 9.60	\$ 0.23	\$ 6.90
33	Ventilation circuit Smith Medical	each	Pneupak #122003	No Substitution	150	\$ 10.32	\$ 1,548.00	\$ 13.63	\$ 2,044.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11.35	\$ 1,702.50	\$ 20.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 12.36	\$ 1,854.00	\$ 11.03	\$ 1,654.50	\$ 11.76	\$ 1,764.00	\$ 11.95	\$ 1,792.50
34	3.0mm size; Rusch flexi set, uncuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	30	\$ 3.36	\$ 100.80	\$ 4.90	\$ 147.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 3.35	\$ 100.50	\$ 7.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 3.60	\$ 108.00	\$ 3.70	\$ 111.00	\$ 3.94	\$ 118.20	\$ 2.95	\$ 88.50
35	3.5mm size; Rusch flexi set, uncuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	30	\$ 3.36	\$ 100.80	\$ 4.90	\$ 147.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 3.35	\$ 100.50	\$ 7.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 3.60	\$ 108.00	\$ 3.70	\$ 111.00	\$ 3.94	\$ 118.20	\$ 2.95	\$ 88.50
36	4.0mm size; Rusch flexi set, uncuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	40	\$ 3.36	\$ 134.40	\$ 8.78	\$ 351.20	\$ 4.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 3.35	\$ 134.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 3.60	\$ 144.00	\$ 3.70	\$ 148.00	\$ 3.94	\$ 157.60	\$ 2.95	\$ 118.00
37	5.0mm size; Rusch flexi set, uncuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	50	\$ 3.36	\$ 168.00	\$ 8.78	\$ 439.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 3.35	\$ 167.50	\$ 7.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 3.60	\$ 180.00	\$ 3.70	\$ 185.00	\$ 3.94	\$ 197.00	\$ 2.95	\$ 147.50
38	6.0mm size; Rusch flexi set, cuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	50	\$ 3.49	\$ 174.50	\$ 5.41	\$ 270.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 225.00	\$ 3.47	\$ 173.50	\$ 7.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 3.25	\$ 162.50	\$ 4.08	\$ 204.00	\$ 3.94	\$ 197.00	\$ 3.22	\$ 161.00
39	6.5mm size; Rusch flexi set, cuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	75	\$ 3.49	\$ 261.75	\$ 5.41	\$ 405.75	\$ 4.50	\$ 337.50	\$ 3.47	\$ 260.25	\$ 7.00	\$ 525.00	\$ 3.25	\$ 243.75	\$ 4.08	\$ 306.00	\$ 3.94	\$ 295.50	\$ 3.22	\$ 241.50
40	7.0mm size; Rusch flexi set, cuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	250	\$ 3.49	\$ 872.50	\$ 5.41	\$ 1,352.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 3.47	\$ 867.50	\$ 7.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 3.25	\$ 812.50	\$ 4.08	\$ 1,020.00	\$ 3.78	\$ 945.00	\$ 3.22	\$ 805.00
41	8.0mm size; Rusch flexi set, cuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	300	\$ 3.49	\$ 1,047.00	\$ 8.31	\$ 2,493.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 3.47	\$ 1,041.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 3.25	\$ 975.00	\$ 4.37	\$ 1,311.00	\$ 3.67	\$ 1,101.00	\$ 3.22	\$ 966.00
42	9.0mm size; Rusch flexi set, cuffed endotracheal tubes with stylet installed, Murphy tip with internal connector and radiopaque line; latex free	each	Rusch	No Substitution	50	\$ 3.64	\$ 182.00	\$ 8.31	\$ 415.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 225.00	\$ 3.47	\$ 173.50	\$ 7.00	\$ 350.00</								

TABULATION FOR IFB 17-1032GE Medical Supplies

GROUP B: MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES							Group B													Group B			
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices	Midwest Medical Supply, Extension	Diamond Medical Supplies, Unit Prices	Diamond Medical Supplies, Extension	Ever Ready First Aid, Unit Prices	Ever Ready First Aid, Extension	Henry Schein EMS, Unit Prices	Henry Schein EMS, Extension	Quadmed, Unit Prices	Quadmed, Extension	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Unit Prices	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Extension
1	Bayer Contour Blood Glucose Strips	box	Manufacturer #7099c	No Substitution	400	\$ 15.19	\$ 6,076.00	\$ 35.43	\$ 14,172.00	\$ 14.75	\$ 5,900.00	\$ 14.44	\$ 5,776.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 7,200.00	\$ 14.34	\$ 5,736.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
2	Contour Blood Glucose Meter	each	Manufacturer #0019371	No Substitution	500	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 30.36	\$ 15,180.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 8,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 17.00	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 8.90	\$ 4,450.00	\$ 16.55	\$ 8,275.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
3	10ml vacutainer, red top	each		or Equivalent	700	\$ 0.26	\$ 182.00	\$ 0.28	\$ 196.00	\$ 0.09	\$ 63.00	\$ 0.19	\$ 133.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.29	\$ 203.00	\$ 0.24	\$ 168.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
4	5 gram foil package, K-Y lubrication jelly	144/bx		or Equivalent	500	\$ 8.71	\$ 4,355.00	\$ 5.98	\$ 2,990.00	\$ 0.08	\$ 40.00	\$ 5.66	\$ 2,830.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 7.18	\$ 3,590.00	\$ 57.97	\$ 28,985.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
5	medium size, Alcohol prep pads	200/bx		or Equivalent	250	\$ 1.31	\$ 327.50	\$ 1.08	\$ 270.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 312.50	\$ 1.24	\$ 310.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 1.45	\$ 362.50	\$ 1.01	\$ 252.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
6	Iodophor PVP prep pads	200/bx		or Equivalent	40	\$ 6.58	\$ 263.20	\$ 33.50	\$ 1,340.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 140.00	\$ 6.60	\$ 264.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 16.90	\$ 676.00	\$ 6.45	\$ 258.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
7	Accu-Check Safe-T-Pro Lancet	200/bx	NCD 50924-951-20	No Substitution	60	\$ 47.73	\$ 2,863.80	\$ 112.35	\$ 6,741.00	\$ 48.52	\$ 2,911.20	\$ 47.72	\$ 2,863.20	\$ 63.86	\$ 3,831.60	\$ 54.00	\$ 3,240.00	\$ 50.74	\$ 3,044.40	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
8	3" x 9", 1V, arm board, padded disposable	each		or Equivalent	250	\$ 0.86	\$ 215.00	\$ 0.76	\$ 190.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.51	\$ 127.50	\$ 5.00	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 0.60	\$ 150.00	\$ 0.81	\$ 202.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
9	3" x 17 1/2" IV, arm board, padded disposable	each		or Equivalent	220	\$ 0.90	\$ 198.00	\$ 1.36	\$ 299.20	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.69	\$ 151.80	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.36	\$ 79.20	\$ 1.12	\$ 246.40	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
10	MAD100, Mascoal Atomization Device	each	Wolfe Tory Medical #10	No Substitution	80	\$ 6.65	\$ 532.00	\$ 6.20	\$ 500.00	\$ 13.80	\$ 690.00	\$ 6.15	\$ 307.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6.72	\$ 537.60	\$ 4.60	\$ 368.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
11	Posey disposable restraint	each	Posey #2528	No Substitution	250	\$ 4.52	\$ 1,130.00	\$ 5.60	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 5.75	\$ 1,437.50	\$ 4.58	\$ 1,145.00	\$ 6.45	\$ 1,612.50	\$ 6.18	\$ 1,545.00	\$ 4.06	\$ 1,015.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
12	Convenience bags, White 650cc	12/pk	Model 1000 / 7000	No Substitution	250	\$ 13.29	\$ 3,322.50	\$ 1.32	\$ 330.00	\$ 265.00	\$ 66,250.00	\$ 1.10	\$ 275.00	\$ 1.99	\$ 497.50	\$ 16.50	\$ 4,125.00	\$ 12.73	\$ 3,182.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
13	Bite sticks, disposable plastic	each		or Equivalent	25	\$ 0.35	\$ 8.75	\$ 0.47	\$ 11.75	\$ 3.50	\$ 87.50	\$ 0.29	\$ 7.25	\$ 0.60	\$ 15.00	\$ 0.40	\$ 10.00	\$ 0.36	\$ 9.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
14	Disposable penlight	each		or Equivalent	150	\$ 0.60	\$ 90.00	\$ 0.71	\$ 106.50	\$ 0.93	\$ 139.50	\$ 0.54	\$ 81.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 148.50	\$ 0.70	\$ 105.00	\$ 0.70	\$ 105.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
15	Ammonia Inhalants, capsule	10/bx		or Equivalent	80	\$ 1.52	\$ 121.60	\$ 2.26	\$ 180.80	\$ 1.93	\$ 154.40	\$ 1.86	\$ 148.80	\$ 2.66	\$ 212.80	\$ 2.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 1.73	\$ 138.40	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
16	Bandage Scissors, regular size, 5 1/2"	each		or Equivalent	25	\$ 0.85	\$ 21.25	\$ 1.68	\$ 42.00	\$ 2.07	\$ 51.75	\$ 1.53	\$ 38.25	\$ 1.50	\$ 37.50	\$ 1.20	\$ 30.00	\$ 0.74	\$ 18.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
17	Basic Paramed Shears 7 1/2" Long	each		or Equivalent	5	\$ 0.81	\$ 4.05	\$ 1.07	\$ 5.35	\$ 2.07	\$ 10.35	\$ 0.75	\$ 3.75	\$ 1.50	\$ 7.50	\$ 1.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 0.83	\$ 4.15	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
18	16 oz bd, 70% Isopropyl rubbing alcohol	each		or Equivalent	120	\$ 1.69	\$ 202.80	\$ 1.16	\$ 139.20	\$ 1.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 1.19	\$ 142.80	\$ 1.88	\$ 225.60	\$ 2.00	\$ 240.00	\$ 0.94	\$ 112.80	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
19	16 oz bd, Hydrogen Peroxide, topical solution	each		or Equivalent	160	\$ 0.89	\$ 142.40	\$ 0.46	\$ 73.60	\$ 0.54	\$ 86.40	\$ 0.56	\$ 89.60	\$ 1.02	\$ 163.20	\$ 0.95	\$ 152.00	\$ 0.40	\$ 64.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
20	5 1/2" x 8" cold pack, disposable	each		or Equivalent	1200	\$ 0.19	\$ 228.00	\$ 1.07	\$ 1,284.00	\$ 0.44	\$ 528.00	\$ 0.39	\$ 468.00	\$ 0.65	\$ 780.00	\$ 0.50	\$ 600.00	\$ 0.18	\$ 216.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
21	OB kit, disposable, soft packaging	each		or Equivalent	30	\$ 5.09	\$ 152.70	\$ 5.78	\$ 173.40	\$ 5.75	\$ 172.50	\$ 4.78	\$ 143.40	\$ 8.00	\$ 240.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 5.81	\$ 174.30	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
22	24ga x 3/4" ClearSafe Safety IV Catheter	box	Medsource	No Substitution	40	\$ 65.50	\$ 2,620.00	\$ 9.15	\$ 366.00	\$ 1.55	\$ 62.00	\$ 63.83	\$ 2,680.86	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 80.00	\$ 3,360.00	\$ 65.08	\$ 2,605.20	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
23	22ga x 1" ClearSafe Safety IV Catheter	box	Medsource	No Substitution	280	\$ 65.50	\$ 18,340.00	\$ 32.18	\$ 9,010.40	\$ 1.55	\$ 434.00	\$ 63.83	\$ 17,872.40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 80.00	\$ 22,400.00	\$ 65.08	\$ 18,222.40	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
24	20ga x 1 1/4" ClearSafe Safety IV Catheter	box	Medsource	No Substitution	200	\$ 65.50	\$ 13,100.00	\$ 36.47	\$ 7,294.00	\$ 1.55	\$ 310.00	\$ 63.83	\$ 12,766.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 80.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 65.08	\$ 13,016.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
25	18ga x 1 1/4" ClearSafe Safety IV Catheter	box	Medsource	No Substitution	200	\$ 65.50	\$ 13,100.00	\$ 32.18	\$ 6,436.00	\$ 1.55	\$ 310.00	\$ 63.83	\$ 12,766.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 80.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 68.08	\$ 13,616.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
26	16ga x 1 1/4" ClearSafe Safety IV Catheter	box	Medsource	No Substitution	70	\$ 65.50	\$ 4,585.00	\$ 30.08	\$ 2,105.60	\$ 1.55	\$ 108.50	\$ 63.83	\$ 4,468.10	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 80.00	\$ 5,600.00	\$ 65.08	\$ 4,555.60	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
27	14 ga x 1 1/4" ClearSafe Safety IV Catheter	box		or Equivalent	50	\$ 65.50	\$ 3,275.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 1.55	\$ 77.50	\$ 63.83	\$ 3,191.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 80.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 65.08	\$ 3,254.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
28	Sodium Chloride 0.9% 10ml prefilled syringe, flush IV	each		or Equivalent	22000	\$ 0.31	\$ 6,820.00	\$ 0.49	\$ 10,780.00	\$ 0.60	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 0.29	\$ 6,380.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.33	\$ 7,260.00	\$ 0.33	\$ 7,260.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
29	60cc syringe, luer lok	40/bx	B-D 309653	or Equivalent	3	\$ 17.52	\$ 52.56	\$ 10.50	\$ 31.50	\$ 18.95	\$ 56.85	\$ 13.60	\$ 40.80	\$ 23.20	\$ 69.60	\$ 11.36	\$ 45.48	\$ 17.65	\$ 52.95	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
30	30cc syringe, luer lok	40/bx	B-D 309650	or Equivalent	2	\$ 12.80	\$ 25.60	\$ 6.26	\$ 12.52	\$ 18.95	\$ 37.90	\$ 7.20	\$ 14.40	\$ 12.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 11.90	\$ 23.80	\$ 11.82	\$ 23.64	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
31	10cc syringe, luer lok	100/bx	B-D 309604	or Equivalent	15	\$ 9.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 11.36	\$ 170.40	\$ 18.95	\$ 284.25	\$ 5.75	\$ 86.25	\$ 9.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 7.54	\$ 113.10	\$ 9.87	\$ 148.05	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
32	3cc syringe, luer lok	100/bx	B-D 309585	or Equivalent	10	\$ 5.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 9.34	\$ 93.40	\$ 22.95	\$ 229.50	\$ 4.13	\$ 41.30	\$ 8.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 5.72	\$ 57.20	\$ 6.08	\$ 60.80	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
33	1cc syringe, slip tip	100/bx	B-D 309602	or Equivalent	3	\$ 6.71	\$ 20.13	\$ 7.58	\$ 22.74	\$ 18.95	\$ 56.85	\$ 9.23	\$ 27.69	\$ 9.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 7.54	\$ 22.62	\$ 10.48	\$ 31.44	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
34	Bulb syringe, 2 oz cap, Reference: Gam40-04	each	Busse	or Equivalent	50	\$ 0.49	\$ 24.50	\$ 1.16	\$ 58.00	\$ 0.88	\$ 44.00	\$ 0.33	\$ 16.50	\$ 0.66	\$ 33.00	\$ 0.45	\$ 22.50	\$ 0.68	\$ 34.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
35	25 ga x 5/8" needles	1000/bx	B-D	or Equivalent	10	\$ 3.50	\$ 35.00	\$ 3.41	\$ 34.10	\$ 5.35	\$ 53.50	\$ 2.77	\$ 27.70	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 3.18	\$ 31.80	\$ 7.97	\$ 79.70	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
36	20 ga x 1 1/2" needles	1000/bx	B-D	or Equivalent	10	\$ 4.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 3.41	\$ 34.10	\$ 5.35	\$ 53.50	\$ 2.77	\$ 27.70	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 3.18	\$ 31.80	\$ 4.75	\$ 47.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
37	18 ga x 1 1/2" needles	1000/bx	B-D	or Equivalent	15	\$ 4.40	\$ 66.00	\$ 3.19	\$ 47.85	\$ 5.35	\$ 80.25	\$ 2.27	\$ 34.05	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3.18	\$ 47.70	\$ 4.75	\$ 71.25	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
38	14ga x 3.25" IV catheter	each	B&D ANG100ATTY #3	or Equivalent	80	\$ 6.09	\$ 487.20	\$ 18.02	\$ 1,441.60	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7.97	\$ 638.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5.54	\$ 443.20	\$ 13.96	\$ 1,116.80	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
39	Filter straw, 5 micron, 1.7" long (ref B Braun Co. #415021)	each		or Equivalent	900	\$ 0.42	\$ 378.00	\$ 0.54	\$ 486.00	\$ 0.49	\$ 441.00	\$ 0.37	\$ 333.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.54	\$ 486.00	\$ 0.46	\$ 414.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
40	Clave vital adaptors,	each	Abbott #1200-01	or Equivalent	600	\$ 0.80	\$ 480.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1.75	\$ 1,050.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4.54	\$ 2,724.00	\$ 2.38	\$ 1,428.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
41	Manual Adult BP Cuff, Proshyzyg 775, Size 11	each	Proshyzyg 775, size 11	or Equivalent	60	\$ 5.81	\$ 348.60	\$ 12.76	\$ 765.60	\$ 14.50	\$ 870.00	\$ 4.83	\$ 289.80	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6.00	\$ 360.00	\$ 9.87	\$ 592.20	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
42	Manual Pediatric BP Cuff Medsource	each	MS-BP 300 Child	or Equivalent	50	\$ 6.62	\$ 331.00	\$ 7.51	\$ 375.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 217.50	\$ 4.83	\$ 300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 5.82	\$ 291.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
43	Manual Thigh BP Cuff Medstorm	each	36014-Thigh	or Equivalent	40	\$ 6.41	\$ 256.40	\$ 19.49	\$ 779.60	\$ 21.00	\$ 840.00	\$ 5.33	\$ 213.20	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 8.43	\$ 337.20	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
44	Proscope 660 Adult Stethoscope Neon Orange	each		or Equivalent	100	\$ 2.54	\$ 254.00	\$ 5.83	\$ 583.00	\$ 2.98	\$ 298.00	\$ 2.92	\$ 292.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 2.17	\$ 217.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
45	Carpajet Holder	each	Hospira 2049-02	or Equivalent	100	\$ 0.02	\$ 2.00	\$ 0.04	\$ 4.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.02	\$ 2.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.04	\$ 4.00	\$ 0.03	\$ 3.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
47	Forceps, Magill intubating Adult 9.75	each		or Equivalent	75	\$ 3.42	\$ 256.50	\$ 8.48	\$ 636.00	\$ 6.95	\$ 521.25	\$ 4.06	\$ 304.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 3.22	\$ 241.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!
48																							

TABULATION FOR IFB 17-1032GE Medical Supplies

GROUP C: IMMOBILIZATION SUPPLIES						Group C																		
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices	Midwest Medical Supply, Extension	Diamond Medical Supplies, Unit Prices	Diamond Medical Supplies, Extension	Ever Ready First Aid, Unit Prices	Ever Ready First Aid, Extension	Henry Schein EMS, Unit Prices	Henry Schein EMS, Extension	Quadmed, Unit Prices	Quadmed, Extension	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Unit Prices	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Extension	
1	Multi-Grip Head Immobilizer, Adult	each	Itec	No Substitution	4000	\$ 3.25	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 8.26	\$ 33,040.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4.29	\$ 17,160.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 4.36	\$ 17,440.00	\$ 3.87	\$ 15,480.00	\$ 4.48	\$ 17,920.00	\$ 5.25	\$ 21,000.00	
2	Strap, 2 piece, white, looped end with plastic buckle 5ft	3/pkg		No Substitution	4000	\$ 4.83	\$ 19,320.00	\$ 12.98	\$ 51,920.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4.56	\$ 18,240.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 4.90	\$ 19,600.00	\$ 5.97	\$ 23,880.00	\$ 4.74	\$ 18,960.00	\$ 4.47	\$ 17,880.00	
3	Mega Mover Portable Transport Unit	each	Item #51926	No Substitution	100	\$ 16.43	\$ 1,643.00	\$ 21.25	\$ 2,125.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 15.53	\$ 1,553.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 20.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 17.19	\$ 1,719.00	\$ 16.44	\$ 1,644.00	\$ 19.95	\$ 1,995.00	
TOTAL, GROUP C						\$ 33,963.00	\$ 87,085.00	\$ 36,953.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 36,953.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 36,953.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 39,040.00	\$ 41,079.00	\$ 38,524.00	\$ 40,875.00	\$ 38,524.00	\$ 40,875.00	\$ 40,875.00	\$ 40,875.00	
GROUP D: PPE / PERSONAL PROTECTION EQUIPMENT						Group D																		
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices	Midwest Medical Supply, Extension	Diamond Medical Supplies, Unit Prices	Diamond Medical Supplies, Extension	Ever Ready First Aid, Unit Prices	Ever Ready First Aid, Extension	Henry Schein EMS, Unit Prices	Henry Schein EMS, Extension	Quadmed, Unit Prices	Quadmed, Extension	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Unit Prices	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Extension	
1	Halvard purple nitril gloves, 9.5" latex free, powder free, textured finger tips, fingertip 5.9mil, palm 4.7mil, cuff 3.5mil	box	All Sizes	No Substitution	5200	\$ 6.49	\$ 33,748.00	\$ 8.32	\$ 43,264.00	\$ 60.50	\$ 314,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 9.95	\$ 51,740.00	\$ 8.72	\$ 45,344.00	\$ 6.84	\$ 35,568.00	\$ 7.69	\$ 39,988.00	
2	Medstrom Infection Control Kit	each		No Substitution	100	\$ 2.43	\$ 243.00	\$ 9.43	\$ 943.00	\$ 3.75	\$ 375.00	\$ 3.53	\$ 353.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3.50	\$ 350.00	\$ 4.26	\$ 426.00	\$ 3.59	\$ 359.00	\$ 1.59	\$ 159.00	
3	Safety Glasses Skyper X2 with Clear Lens	each		No Substitution	250	\$ 3.33	\$ 832.50	\$ 8.85	\$ 2,212.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2.89	\$ 722.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2.90	\$ 725.00	\$ 6.16	\$ 1,540.00	\$ 1.95	\$ 487.50	\$ 2.49	\$ 622.50	
4	Safety Glasses Skyper X2 with Gray Lens	each		No Substitution	200	\$ 3.55	\$ 710.00	\$ 9.83	\$ 1,966.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3.12	\$ 624.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3.18	\$ 636.00	\$ 6.16	\$ 1,232.00	\$ 2.10	\$ 420.00	\$ 2.89	\$ 578.00	
5	Sleeve Cover, White, 18"	200/ca		No Substitution	2	\$ 18.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 614.25	\$ 1,228.50	\$ 32.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 73.50	\$ 147.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 130.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 78.47	\$ 156.94	\$ 43.50	\$ 87.00	\$ 18.95	\$ 37.90	
6	Respirator with exhalation valve	10/bx	#3M9211, (N95)	No Substitution	20	\$ 17.40	\$ 348.00	\$ 33.79	\$ 675.80	\$ 19.13	\$ 382.60	\$ 16.77	\$ 335.40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 14.90	\$ 298.00	\$ 16.29	\$ 325.80	\$ 20.98	\$ 419.60	\$ 21.29	\$ 425.80	
7	Safetec Red Z Fluid Solidifying Powder Soz Bottle	each	#41101	No Substitution	25	\$ 4.69	\$ 117.25	\$ 4.90	\$ 122.50	\$ 4.67	\$ 116.75	\$ 4.05	\$ 101.25	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4.20	\$ 105.00	\$ 3.70	\$ 92.50	\$ 4.99	\$ 124.75	\$ 4.99	\$ 124.75	
8	Medicoise Disposable Coveralls x-Large	each		No Substitution	100	\$ 2.49	\$ 249.00	\$ 3.52	\$ 352.00	\$ 2.40	\$ 240.00	\$ 1.27	\$ 127.00	\$ 1.71	\$ 171.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1.22	\$ 122.00	\$ 6.95	\$ 695.00	\$ 1.29	\$ 129.00	
TOTAL, GROUP D						\$ 36,283.75	\$ 50,764.30	\$ 315,778.35	\$ 2,410.15	\$ 315,778.35	\$ 2,410.15	\$ 315,778.35	\$ 2,410.15	\$ 171.00	\$ 54,414.00	\$ 49,239.24	\$ 38,160.85	\$ 42,064.95	\$ 42,064.95	\$ 42,064.95	\$ 42,064.95	\$ 42,064.95	\$ 42,064.95	\$ 42,064.95
GROUP E: PLASTIC PRODUCTS/LINENS/STRAPS AND FASTNERS						Group E																		
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices	Midwest Medical Supply, Extension	Diamond Medical Supplies, Unit Prices	Diamond Medical Supplies, Extension	Ever Ready First Aid, Unit Prices	Ever Ready First Aid, Extension	Henry Schein EMS, Unit Prices	Henry Schein EMS, Extension	Quadmed, Unit Prices	Quadmed, Extension	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Unit Prices	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Extension	
1	8 Quart Sage Sharps Container 10"x7.25x10.5	each	Sage Product #8870	No Substitution	250	\$ 3.35	\$ 837.50	\$ 3.78	\$ 945.00	\$ 11.50	\$ 2,875.00	\$ 3.15	\$ 787.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3.54	\$ 885.00	\$ 2.93	\$ 732.50	\$ 31.65	\$ 7,912.50	\$ 3.39	\$ 847.50	
2	SharpSafety Covidien	each	Covidien 8303SA	No Substitution	100	\$ 3.36	\$ 336.00	\$ 4.89	\$ 489.00	\$ 3.25	\$ 325.00	\$ 3.23	\$ 323.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3.49	\$ 349.00	\$ 3.01	\$ 301.00	\$ 3.49	\$ 349.00	\$ 3.39	\$ 339.00	
3	Plastic disposable bed pans, adult size	each		No Substitution	10	\$ 0.91	\$ 9.10	\$ 5.66	\$ 56.60	\$ 0.99	\$ 9.90	\$ 0.72	\$ 7.20	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1.05	\$ 10.50	\$ 0.94	\$ 9.40	\$ 1.04	\$ 10.40	\$ 1.25	\$ 12.50	
4	Plastic disposable urinals, adult size	each		No Substitution	40	\$ 0.43	\$ 17.20	\$ 0.60	\$ 24.00	\$ 0.59	\$ 23.60	\$ 0.34	\$ 13.60	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.50	\$ 20.00	\$ 0.47	\$ 18.80	\$ 0.56	\$ 22.40	\$ 0.85	\$ 34.00	
5	62" X 80" general purpose blkt, 70%wool/30% man made fibers	each		No Substitution	50	\$ 10.34	\$ 517.00	\$ 98.30	\$ 4,915.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11.33	\$ 566.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.90	\$ 445.00	\$ 7.49	\$ 374.50	\$ 13.78	\$ 689.00	\$ 8.95	\$ 447.50	
6	Pillow, Disposable Medium Weight 18"x24"	each		No Substitution	500	\$ 2.23	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 3.80	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 0.45	\$ 225.00	\$ 2.17	\$ 1,085.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2.20	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 1.01	\$ 505.00	\$ 3.52	\$ 1,760.00	\$ 1.79	\$ 895.00	
8	40" X 90" Disposable drape sheet, plastic backed, Taii Blue	50/ca	Banta Brand #980928	No Substitution	500	\$ 24.65	\$ 12,325.00	\$ 23.11	\$ 11,555.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 27.96	\$ 13,980.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 20.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 21.50	\$ 10,750.00	\$ 29.90	\$ 14,950.00	\$ 19.95	\$ 9,975.00	
9	Disposable pillow case, full size, plastic backed	100/ca		No Substitution	5	\$ 15.99	\$ 79.95	\$ 13.98	\$ 69.90	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 19.36	\$ 96.80	\$ 25.60	\$ 128.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 26.82	\$ 134.10	\$ 23.20	\$ 116.00	\$ 21.50	\$ 107.50	
10	Red Biohazard Bag, 4 Gal, 1.5mil	500/ca		No Substitution	5	\$ 50.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 36.17	\$ 180.85	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 50.20	\$ 251.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 57.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 53.43	\$ 267.15	\$ 56.85	\$ 284.25	\$ 44.90	\$ 224.50	
11	Razor, Disposable	each		No Substitution	1000	\$ 0.07	\$ 70.00	\$ 0.60	\$ 60.00	\$ 0.08	\$ 8.00	\$ 0.09	\$ 9.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.38	\$ 38.00	\$ 0.32	\$ 32.00	\$ 0.12	\$ 12.00	\$ 0.10	\$ 10.00	
12	Cricothyrotomy Field Kit	each	351632	No Substitution	25	\$ 17.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 54.19	\$ 1,354.75	\$ 56.25	\$ 1,406.25	\$ 15.75	\$ 393.75	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 24.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 43.28	\$ 1,082.00	\$ 40.65	\$ 1,016.25	\$ 24.95	\$ 623.75	
13	Emergency Blanket Dynarex	each	EOTHERMBL	No Substitution	10	\$ 1.81	\$ 18.10	\$ 2.80	\$ 28.00	\$ 0.61	\$ 6.10	\$ 0.43	\$ 4.30	\$ 1.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 6.72	\$ 67.20	\$ 0.54	\$ 5.40	\$ 0.54	\$ 5.40	\$ 0.69	\$ 6.90	
14	Tempa-DOT, Oral/Auxiliary Single use-sterile	100/box	3-M	No Substitution	10	\$ 17.98	\$ 179.80	\$ 21.32	\$ 213.20	\$ 13.50	\$ 135.00	\$ 11.05	\$ 110.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10.75	\$ 107.50	\$ 9.98	\$ 99.80	\$ 13.90	\$ 139.00	\$ 13.89	\$ 138.90	
15	EMAT Tourniquet	each		No Substitution	20	\$ 22.16	\$ 443.20	\$ 44.20	\$ 884.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 22.71	\$ 454.20	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 26.00	\$ 520.00	\$ 23.17	\$ 463.40	\$ 24.40	\$ 488.00	\$ 22.19	\$ 443.80	
TOTAL, GROUP E						\$ 16,640.87	\$ 23,223.51	\$ 14,085.85	\$ 18,174.83	\$ 2,086.80	\$ 14,543.20	\$ 15,062.84	\$ 27,872.65	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75	\$ 14,197.75
GROUP F: STRYKER STRETCHER PARTS/REPAIR/REPLACEMENT						Group F																		
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices	Midwest Medical Supply, Extension	Diamond Medical Supplies, Unit Prices	Diamond Medical Supplies, Extension	Ever Ready First Aid, Unit Prices	Ever Ready First Aid, Extension	Henry Schein EMS, Unit Prices	Henry Schein EMS, Extension	Quadmed, Unit Prices	Quadmed, Extension	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Unit Prices	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Extension	
1	Bolster mattress	each	#6090-041-010	No Substitution	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
2	Full restraint set	set	#6082-260-010	No Substitution	20	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
3	Chest restraint	each	#6060-260-046	No Substitution	25	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
4	Shoulder harness	each	#6060-260-045	No Substitution	25	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
5	Single restraint belt	each	#6060-160-044	No Substitution	50	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
6	Pocketed BP pouch	each	#6500-130-000	No Substitution	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
7	HE storage flat	each	#6500-128-000	No Substitution	4	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
8	Base storage net	each	#6500-160-000	No Substitution	10	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
9	Battery	each	#6500-700-046	No Substitution	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
10	Battery charger	each	#6500-201-000	No Substitution	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
11	12 VDC Cable Automotive	each	#6500-201-147	No Substitution	20	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
12	SMRT Power Kit-12 VDC, Domestic	each	#6500-700-040	No Substitution	5	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
13	Bottle Holder Cover	each	#6500-001-260	No Substitution	10	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
14	Bottle Holder Strap	each	#6500-001-261	No Substitution	20	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
15	Bottle Holder Pad	set	#6500-001-262	No Substitution	50	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	No Bid	#VALUE!	
TOTAL, GROUP F						\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
GROUP G: SPLINTS						Group G																		
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices												

TABULATION FOR IFB 17-1032GE Medical Supplies

GROUP H: BANDAGES/FACE AND RESPIRATORY PROTECTION/MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES																								
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Group H		Midwest Medical		Diamond Medical		Ever Ready First Aid		Henry Schein EMS		Quadmed		Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Unit Prices	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Extension	
										Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices	Midwest Medical Supply, Extension	Diamond Medical Supplies, Unit Prices	Diamond Medical Supplies, Extension	Ever Ready First Aid, Unit Prices	Ever Ready First Aid, Extension	Henry Schein EMS, Unit Prices	Henry Schein EMS, Extension	Quadmed, Unit Prices	Quadmed, Extension			
1	Asherman Chest Seal	each	Rusch #115554	No Substitution	60	\$ 9.26	\$ 555.60	\$ 11.47	\$ 688.20	\$ 9.67	\$ 580.20	\$ 8.11	\$ 486.60	\$ 0.41	\$ 24.60	\$ 8.90	\$ 534.00	\$ 8.88	\$ 532.80	\$ 9.74	\$ 584.40	\$ 9.90	\$ 594.00	
2	2" wide x 4 yds long, elastic bandage	each		or Equivalent	100	\$ 0.27	\$ 27.00	\$ 3.60	\$ 27.00	\$ 0.50	\$ 50.00	\$ 0.27	\$ 27.00	\$ 0.16	\$ 16.00	\$ 0.25	\$ 25.00	\$ 0.16	\$ 16.00	\$ 0.22	\$ 22.00	\$ 0.29	\$ 29.00	
3	4" wide x 4 yds long, elastic bandage	each		or Equivalent	200	\$ 0.41	\$ 82.00	\$ 16.39	\$ 3,278.00	\$ 0.65	\$ 130.00	\$ 0.51	\$ 102.00	\$ 0.77	\$ 154.00	\$ 0.40	\$ 80.00	\$ 0.29	\$ 58.00	\$ 0.39	\$ 78.00	\$ 0.39	\$ 78.00	
4	6" wide x 4 yds long, elastic bandage	each		or Equivalent	110	\$ 0.66	\$ 72.60	\$ 53.18	\$ 5,849.80	\$ 0.72	\$ 79.20	\$ 0.73	\$ 80.30	\$ 1.23	\$ 135.30	\$ 0.65	\$ 73.50	\$ 0.41	\$ 45.10	\$ 0.67	\$ 73.70	\$ 0.59	\$ 64.90	
5	3" wide x 4 yds long, roller gauze, self adhering, non sterile	12rl/pk		or Equivalent	200	\$ 1.41	\$ 282.00	\$ 4.27	\$ 854.00	\$ 0.51	\$ 102.00	\$ 1.18	\$ 236.00	\$ 2.52	\$ 504.00	\$ 1.20	\$ 240.00	\$ 0.57	\$ 114.00	\$ 1.13	\$ 226.00	\$ 1.19	\$ 238.00	
6	6" wide x 4 yds long, roller gauze, self adhering, non sterile	6rl/pkg		or Equivalent	100	\$ 1.65	\$ 165.00	\$ 1.24	\$ 124.00	\$ 0.98	\$ 98.00	\$ 1.32	\$ 132.00	\$ 1.92	\$ 192.00	\$ 1.15	\$ 115.00	\$ 0.60	\$ 60.00	\$ 1.15	\$ 115.00	\$ 1.19	\$ 119.00	
7	17 1/2" x 8" individually wrapped, ABD pads, sterile	20/rty		or Equivalent	500	\$ 3.49	\$ 1,745.00	\$ 3.52	\$ 1,760.00	\$ 2.35	\$ 1,175.00	\$ 2.60	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 5.44	\$ 2,720.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 825.00	\$ 3.65	\$ 1,825.00	\$ 3.95	\$ 1,975.00	\$ 2.69	\$ 1,345.00	
8	12" x 30" individually wrapped, Multitrauma dressing, sterile	each		or Equivalent	120	\$ 0.90	\$ 108.00	\$ 1.07	\$ 128.40	\$ 1.20	\$ 144.00	\$ 0.75	\$ 90.00	\$ 1.62	\$ 194.40	\$ 0.70	\$ 84.00	\$ 0.83	\$ 99.60	\$ 0.68	\$ 81.60	\$ 0.63	\$ 75.60	
9	4" x 4", 12 ply individually wrapped, bandage, sterile	100/bx		or Equivalent	10	\$ 5.63	\$ 56.30	\$ 6.81	\$ 68.10	\$ 2.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 4.44	\$ 44.40	\$ 2.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 4.35	\$ 43.50	\$ 5.64	\$ 56.40	\$ 1.46	\$ 14.60	\$ 4.19	\$ 41.90	
10	2" x 2", 12 ply individually wrapped, bandage, sterile	100/bx		or Equivalent	6	\$ 2.35	\$ 14.10	\$ 2.83	\$ 16.98	\$ 3.06	\$ 18.36	\$ 2.03	\$ 12.18	\$ 2.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 2.05	\$ 12.30	\$ 0.91	\$ 5.46	\$ 1.35	\$ 8.10	\$ 2.09	\$ 12.54	
11	40"x40"x36" (approx size) triangular bandage, individually wrapped, with 2 safety pins	each		or Equivalent	350	\$ 0.17	\$ 59.50	\$ 0.22	\$ 77.00	\$ 0.35	\$ 122.50	\$ 0.19	\$ 66.50	\$ 0.50	\$ 175.00	\$ 0.36	\$ 126.00	\$ 0.27	\$ 94.50	\$ 0.22	\$ 77.00	\$ 0.23	\$ 80.50	
12	60" x 90", individually wrapped, burn sheet, blue, sterile	each		or Equivalent	50	\$ 2.34	\$ 117.00	\$ 241.93	\$ 12,096.50	\$ 2.95	\$ 147.50	\$ 1.64	\$ 82.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 2.18	\$ 109.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 82.50	\$ 1.48	\$ 74.00	\$ 1.39	\$ 69.50	
13	4" x 4", 12 ply, bandage, non sterile	200/pk		or Equivalent	350	\$ 2.99	\$ 1,046.50	\$ 5.06	\$ 1,771.00	\$ 4.11	\$ 1,438.50	\$ 2.27	\$ 794.50	\$ 2.93	\$ 1,025.50	\$ 3.40	\$ 1,190.00	\$ 2.20	\$ 770.00	\$ 3.27	\$ 1,144.50	\$ 2.19	\$ 766.50	
14	1" x 10 yds, tape, surgical cloth	12/bx		or Equivalent	35	\$ 7.60	\$ 266.00	\$ 9.40	\$ 329.00	\$ 7.85	\$ 274.75	\$ 7.92	\$ 277.20	\$ 10.56	\$ 369.60	\$ 8.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 7.26	\$ 254.10	\$ 7.50	\$ 262.50	\$ 6.89	\$ 241.15	
15	2" x 10 yds, tape, surgical cloth	6/bx		or Equivalent	60	\$ 7.60	\$ 456.00	\$ 9.40	\$ 564.00	\$ 7.85	\$ 471.00	\$ 7.92	\$ 475.20	\$ 10.56	\$ 633.60	\$ 8.00	\$ 480.00	\$ 7.26	\$ 435.60	\$ 7.50	\$ 450.00	\$ 6.89	\$ 413.40	
16	3" x 9" individually wrapped, vaseline gauze	50/bx		or Equivalent	4	\$ 12.09	\$ 48.36	\$ 36.00	\$ 144.00	\$ 21.56	\$ 86.24	\$ 29.82	\$ 119.28	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 23.00	\$ 92.00	\$ 27.51	\$ 110.04	\$ 5.30	\$ 21.20	\$ 20.29	\$ 81.16	
17	Technol "fluid shield" with splash guard visor	25/bx	#47080-80	No Substitution	80	\$ 23.09	\$ 1,847.20	\$ 26.78	\$ 2,142.40	\$ 17.69	\$ 1,415.20	\$ 27.21	\$ 2,176.80	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 27.00	\$ 2,160.00	\$ 2.54	\$ 203.20	\$ 22.90	\$ 1,832.00	\$ 19.95	\$ 1,596.00	
18	Band-aids 1"x3"	100/bx		or Equivalent	50	\$ 1.19	\$ 59.50	\$ 4.70	\$ 235.00	\$ 1.45	\$ 72.50	\$ 1.14	\$ 57.00	\$ 2.75	\$ 137.50	\$ 1.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 1.77	\$ 88.50	\$ 1.16	\$ 58.00	\$ 1.09	\$ 54.50	
19	Metal Eye Shield	each		or Equivalent	25	\$ 0.70	\$ 17.50	\$ 11.69	\$ 292.25	\$ 0.70	\$ 17.50	\$ 0.72	\$ 18.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 0.67	\$ 16.75	\$ 0.84	\$ 21.00	\$ 0.95	\$ 23.75	
20	Oval Eye pads	10/bx	80841	or Equivalent	50	\$ 0.89	\$ 44.50	\$ 1.84	\$ 92.00	\$ 4.40	\$ 220.00	\$ 3.62	\$ 184.00	\$ 5.63	\$ 281.50	\$ 2.91	\$ 145.50	\$ 1.15	\$ 57.50	\$ 4.12	\$ 206.00	\$ 0.90	\$ 45.00	
21	3M Coban 1" x 5yd	each		or Equivalent	100	\$ 0.45	\$ 45.00	\$ 4.58	\$ 458.00	\$ 0.65	\$ 65.00	\$ 0.31	\$ 31.00	\$ 0.85	\$ 85.00	\$ 0.36	\$ 36.00	\$ 0.86	\$ 86.00	\$ 0.33	\$ 33.00	\$ 0.55	\$ 55.00	
22	3M Coban 2" x 5yd	each		or Equivalent	100	\$ 0.74	\$ 74.00	\$ 1.68	\$ 168.00	\$ 0.76	\$ 76.00	\$ 0.33	\$ 33.00	\$ 1.37	\$ 137.00	\$ 0.54	\$ 54.00	\$ 0.30	\$ 30.00	\$ 0.57	\$ 57.00	\$ 0.89	\$ 89.00	
23	3M Coban 4" x 5yd	each		or Equivalent	100	\$ 1.31	\$ 131.00	\$ 2.63	\$ 263.00	\$ 2.09	\$ 209.00	\$ 1.05	\$ 105.00	\$ 2.25	\$ 225.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 125.00	\$ 0.45	\$ 45.00	\$ 1.17	\$ 117.00	\$ 1.19	\$ 119.00	
TOTAL, GROUP H							\$ 7,319.66		\$ 31,759.63		\$ 7,017.45		\$ 6,952.96		\$ 7,242.40		\$ 6,902.80		\$ 5,086.05		\$ 7,531.60		\$ 6,232.40	
GROUP I: MEDICATION LIST																								
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution or Brand Supplied	Estimated Annual Quantities	Bound Tree Medical, Unit Prices	Bound Tree Medical, Extension	NAD Global Health, Unit Price	NAD Global Health, Extension	Group I		Midwest Medical		Diamond Medical		Ever Ready First Aid		Henry Schein EMS		Quadmed		Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Unit Prices	Nashville Medical dba EMS Products, Extension	
										Sun Surgical Supply, Unit Prices	Sun Surgical Supply, Extension	Midwest Medical Supply, Unit Prices	Midwest Medical Supply, Extension	Diamond Medical Supplies, Unit Prices	Diamond Medical Supplies, Extension	Ever Ready First Aid, Unit Prices	Ever Ready First Aid, Extension	Henry Schein EMS, Unit Prices	Henry Schein EMS, Extension	Quadmed, Unit Prices	Quadmed, Extension			
1	3-Way Stopcock With Swivel Male Luer Lock	each		or Equivalent	100	\$ 0.85	\$ 85.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.65	\$ 65.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 1.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 2.77	\$ 277.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
2	Acetaminophen 500 mg Tabs	each	1988-61	or Equivalent	1000	\$ 0.04	\$ 40.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 4.37	\$ 4,370.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 1.54	\$ 1,540.00	\$ 4.04	\$ 4,040.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
3	Acetaminophen Cherry Elircr	each	1985-00	or Equivalent	100	\$ 1.26	\$ 126.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 1.56	\$ 156.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 1.72	\$ 172.00	\$ 4.04	\$ 404.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
4	Acetaminophen Suppository	each	1985-00	or Equivalent	500	\$ 1.26	\$ 630.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 5.76	\$ 2,880.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 3.18	\$ 1,590.00	\$ 0.47	\$ 235.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
5	Adenosine 6mg/2ml vial	each		or Equivalent	250	\$ 3.15	\$ 787.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 172.43	\$ 43,107.50	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11.46	\$ 2,865.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
6	Albuterol (for inhalation) unit dose vial, 3mL - 2.5mg	each		or Equivalent	200	\$ 0.13	\$ 26.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 7.47	\$ 1,494.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.18	\$ 36.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
7	Amidate, 2mg/ml, 20ml LIFE shield	each		or Equivalent	150	\$ 8.17	\$ 1,225.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 79.43	\$ 11,914.50	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21.60	\$ 3,240.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
8	Amiodarone, 150mg/3ml, Vial	each		or Equivalent	300	\$ 1.76	\$ 528.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 55.51	\$ 16,653.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5.76	\$ 1,728.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
9	Ativan (Lorazepam), 2mg, 1ml Vial	each		or Equivalent	60	\$ 2.03	\$ 121.80	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6.40	\$ 384.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
10	Atropine Sulfate, 0.1mg/mL, 10mL = 1mg Luer Jet	each		or Equivalent	600	\$ 11.49	\$ 6,894.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 144.00	\$ 86,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 35.17	\$ 21,102.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
11	Atrovent, 0.2%, 2.5mL, S.D.V.	each		or Equivalent	200	\$ 0.13	\$ 26.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.39	\$ 78.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
12	B Braun Dispensing Pin with one way valve	each	412023	No Substitution	500	\$ 3.34	\$ 1,670.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2.92	\$ 1,460.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3.88	\$ 1,940.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
13	B Braun Infusomat Space Pump IV Set	each	490036	No Substitution	1000	\$ 4.83	\$ 4,830.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 4.73	\$ 4,730.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4.50	\$ 4,500.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
14	Benzydyl 50 mg/mL, 1mL = 50 mg Vial	each		or Equivalent	150	\$ 1.04	\$ 156.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4.40	\$ 660.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
15	Bumetanide Injection, USP 2.5mg/10ml Vial	each		or Equivalent	300	\$ 3.10	\$ 930.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 39.00	\$ 11,700.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 9.39	\$ 2,817.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
16	D50W 500 mg/mL, 50 mL = 25gm Luer Jet	each		or Equivalent	650	\$ 12.32	\$ 8,008.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 30.73	\$ 19,974.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
17	Dextrose 5% 100ml Bag	each		or Equivalent	250	\$ 2.78	\$ 695.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 12.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.80	\$ 2,200.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
18	Dextrose 5% 250ml Bag	each		or Equivalent	250	\$ 2.20	\$ 550.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 7.14	\$ 1,785.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12.32	\$ 3,080.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
19	Dilazem (refrigerated) 25 mg	each	6013-10	or Equivalent	200	\$ 2.25	\$ 450.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 46.05	\$ 9,210.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
20	Dopamine 400mg, 2% Dextrose, Injection, 250 ml	each		or Equivalent	200	\$ 14.09	\$ 2,818.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 329.38	\$ 65,876.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 32.93	\$ 6,586.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
21	Dopamine 400mg/250cc	each	118-2B0842EA	or Equivalent	50	\$ 14.09	\$ 704.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ 267.18	\$ 13,359.00	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 43.89	\$ 2,194.50	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$ -	\$ -	
22	Epinephrine 1:10,000 0.1mg/mL, 10mL = 1 mg L																							