

BID TABULATION
 IFB BO. 19-R070549CD
 WATER WASTEWATER PUMPING AND HAULING SERVICES

EnviroWaste Service Group 18001 Old Cutler Road, #55 Miami, FL 33157	DeJonge Excavating inc. P.O. Box 1399 Nokomis, FL 34274	Blue Septic Tank Services Inc. 6119 17th Street East Bradenton, FL 34203
--	---	---

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST.ANNUAL QUANTITY	U/M	BID PRICE	TOTAL BID	BID PRICE	TOTAL BID	BID PRICE	TOTAL BID
				PER HOUR	PRICE	PER HOUR	PRICE	PER HOUR	PRICE
GROUP A: 3,000 to 5,000 gallon pump tanker with driver									
1	Monday thru Friday- 8am to 5pm; Billable: Manatee County on-site to manatee County off-site or alternate designated station/ location or gravity sewer system	1000	HOUR	\$174.00	\$174,000.00	No Bid		\$195.00	\$195,000.00
2	Monday thru Friday- 5pm to 8am, Holidays, any Weekends; Billable: Manatee County on-site to manatee County off-site or alternate designated station/ location or gravity sewer system	200	HOUR	\$250.00	\$50,000.00	No Bid		\$255.00	\$51,000.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP A					\$224,000.00		No Bid		\$246,000.00

BID TABULATION
 IFB BO. 19-R070549CD
 WATER WASTEWATER PUMPING AND HAULING SERVICES

EnviroWaste Service Group 18001 Old Cutler Road, #55 Miami, FL 33157	DeJonge Excavating inc. P.O. Box 1399 Nokomis, FL 34274	Blue Septic Tank Services Inc. 6119 17th Street East Bradenton, FL 34203
--	---	---

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST.ANNUAL QUANTITY	U/M	BID PRICE PER HOUR	TOTAL BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER HOUR	TOTAL BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER HOUR	TOTAL BID PRICE
GROUP B: 9-12 yard Vac-con truck with driver									
1	Monday thru Friday- 8am to 5pm; Billable: Manatee County on-site to manatee County off-site or alternate designated station/ location or gravity sewer system	100	HOUR	\$195.00	\$19,500.00	\$200.00	\$20,000.00	No Bid	
2	Monday thru Friday- 5pm to 8am, Holidays, any Weekends; Billable: Manatee County on-site to manatee County off-site or alternate designated station/ location or gravity sewer system	20	HOUR	\$249.00	\$4,980.00	\$250.00	\$5,000.00	No Bid	
TOTAL FOR GROUP B					\$24,480.00		\$25,000.00		No Bid

BID TABULATION
 IFB BO. 19-R070549CD
 WATER WASTEWATER PUMPING AND HAULING SERVICES

EnviroWaste Service Group 18001 Old Cutler Road, #55 Miami, FL 33157	DeJonge Excavating inc. P.O. Box 1399 Nokomis, FL 34274	Blue Septic Tank Services Inc. 6119 17th Street East Bradenton, FL 34203
--	---	---

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST.ANNUAL QUANTITY	U/M	BID PRICE PER HOUR	TOTAL BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER HOUR	TOTAL BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER HOUR	TOTAL BID PRICE
GROUP C: 6,000 TO 9,000 GALLON SEMI PUMP TANKER WITH DRIVER									
1	Monday thru Friday- 8am to 5pm; Billable: Manatee County on-site to manatee County off-site or alternate designated station/ location or gravity sewer system	200	HOUR	No Bid		\$225.00	\$45,000.00	\$200.00	\$40,000.00
2	Monday thru Friday- 5pm to 8am, Holidays, any Weekends; Billable: Manatee County on-site to manatee County off-site or alternate designated station/ location or gravity sewer system	40	HOUR	No Bid		\$275.00	\$11,000.00	\$260.00	\$10,400.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP C					No Bid		\$56,000.00		\$50,400.00
TOTAL OFFER FOR BID AWARD PURPOSE							\$248,480.00		\$81,000.00