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MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 
INTENT TO AWARD 

 

IFB NO. / TITLE 22-R079213SB Centrifuge 
Rental Services DATE POSTED MC _________ 

DS _________ 
CC _________ 
BIDSYNC______ 

PROCUREMENT 
REPRESENTATIVE 

Stacia Branco, Senior 
Procurement Agent 

PROJECTED 
AWARD DATE August 9, 2022 

DEPARTMENT/DIVISION Utilities Department AUTHORIZED BY 
DATE 

Jacob Erickson, Purchasing Official 
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Pace Dewatering 
System Ltd. Inc. for the provision of Centrifuge Rental Services. 
 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 
 
Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26. 
 

BACKGROUND/EVALUATION 
 
The solicitation was advertised to secure a qualified contractor to provide centrifuge rental services. The Utilities 
Department has long relied upon mechanically cleaned sludge drying beds to process its alum sludge residuals, with the 
growth of Manatee County, the sludge drying beds have proven inadequate to sustain the County needs. The County 
has established centrifuge mechanical dewatering as the preferred technology for this application. The County is 
constructing permanent solids dewatering facilities, but those permanent facilities are not anticipated to become 
operational until sometime during the 2024 calendar year. 
 
The solicitation was advertised on June 6, 2022 on the Manatee County website and Periscope S2G. It was also provided 
to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast Builders 
Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members.  Responses were received from the 
following firms:  
 

1. Pace Dewatering Systems Ltd. Inc., Mansfield, TX       
2. Synagro South, LLC, Baltimore , MD       

EVALUATION SUMMARY:  
Pace Dewatering Systems Ltd. Inc. was the lowest responsible, responsive bidder.  A bid tabulation of the results is 
attached to this Notice of Intent to Award. 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
The Procurement Division and the  Utilities Department recommend award to Pace Dewatering Systems Ltd. Inc. 

 
ATTACHMENTS  

(List in order of attached) 
 
Bid Tabulation 

NAME AND NUMBER OF 
 FUNDING SOURCE 4010009400-534000 

COST 

Estimated Annual 
Expenditure 
$2,050,000.00 FUNDS VERIFIED 

TBD 
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Line 
Item Description Estimated 

Quantity
Unit of 

Measure Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Group 
A-1

Mobilization and setup of Mobile Dewatering Centrifuge Rental 
Equipment to the Water Treatment Plant. 1 LUMP 

SUM $84,033.00 $84,033.00 $38,577.50 $38,577.50

Group 
A-2

Demobilization and removal of Mobile Dewatering Centrifuge 
Rental Equipment from the Water Treatment Plant. 1 LUMP 

SUM $72,731.25 $72,731.25 $38,577.50 $38,577.50

Group 
A-3

Monthly rental of complete Mobile Dewatering Centrifuge 
System with Operator (including portable electric and 
components for full operation, 12hrs/day Monday through 
Sunday). 
Estimated monthly rental 12 to 36 months.

12 MONTH $153,951.12 $1,847,413.44 $168,555.00 $2,022,660.00

Group 
A-4

Hourly rate for operation of complete Mobile Dewatering 
Centrifuge System with Operator in excess of 12 hours Monday 
through Sunday (including portable electric and components for 
full operation)
(as directed by the County)

100 PER 
HOUR $275.80 $27,580.00 $445.00 $44,500.00

Line 
Item Description Estimated 

Quantity
Unit of 

Measure Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Group 
B-1

Mobilization and setup of Mobile Dewatering Centrifuge Rental 
Equipment to the Water Treatment Plant. 1 LUMP 

SUM $75,155.56 $75,155.56 No Bid No Bid

Group 
B-2

Demobilization and removal of Mobile Dewatering Centrifuge 
Rental Equipment from the Water Treatment Plant. 1 LUMP 

SUM $70,759.38 $70,759.38 No Bid No Bid

Group 
B-3

Monthly rental of complete Mobile Dewatering Centrifuge 
System without Operator (including portable electric and 
components for full operation) 
Estimated monthly rental 12 to 36 months.

12 MONTH $115,325.24 $1,383,902.88 No Bid No Bid

Synagro South, LLC

BID TABULATION
IFB NO. 22-R079213SB 

CENTRIFUGE RENTAL SERVICES

Total amount for award purposes only Group A 

Pace Dewatering Systems, LTD Synagro South, LLC

GROUP A - CENTRIFUGE DEWATERING PLANT WITH OPERATOR Pace Dewatering Systems, LTD

Total amount for award purposes only Group B

GROUP B - CENTRIFUGE DEWATERING PLANT WITHOUT OPERATOR

N/A

$2,031,757.69 $2,144,315.00

$1,529,817.82
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