TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS
ADDITIONAL GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL
FIXED MARKUP COST | FIXEDT
VENDOR PER GAL.

1. GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOADS: REGULAR UNLEADED

RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
28340 Wick Road
Romulus, Ml 48174

0.02 0.03

QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
1618 S 50th St.
Tampa, FL 33619

0.03 0.04

PALMDALE Oll. COMPANY INC
911 North 2nd St.
Fort Pierce, FL 34950

v

0.0367 0.0257

[FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
_ §5115 Joanne Kearney Bivd.
Tampa, FL 33619

0.25 0.0665

{BV OIL COMPANY INC.
P.O. Box 1018
Arcadia, FL 34265

Y,

0.025 0.007

2. GASOLINE - TANK WAGON LOADS: REGULAR UNLEADED

RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
28340 Wick Road

/ Romulus, Ml 48174

$0.2999 $10.00

~ {1618 S 50th St.

IQUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
Tampa, FL 33619

$0.03 $0.135

PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC
911 North 2nd St.
Fort Pierce, FL 34950

$0.0634 $0.0964

FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
5115 Joanne Kearney Bivd.
Tampa, FL 33619

v

NO BID NO BID

.0. Box 1018

BV OIL COMPANY INC.
. P
rcadia, FL 34265

NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS
ADDITIONAL GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL
VENDOR PER GAL. PER GAL.
3. GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOADS: PREMIUM
RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
28340 Wick Road
¥ IRomulus, Mi 48174 $0.02 $0.03
lQUlCK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
1618 S 50th St.
Tampa, FL 33619 $0.03 $0.04
PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC |
911 North 2nd St.
- HFort Pierce, FL 34950 0.0367 0.0257
FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd.
Tampa, FL 33619 0.25 0.0665
BV OIL. COMPANY INC.
P.O. Box 1018
Arcadia, FL 34265 0.025 0.007
4. GASOLINE - TANK WAGON LOADS: PREMIUM
RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
28340 Wick Road
Romulus, Ml 48174 $0.2999 $10.00
QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
1618 S 50th St.
Tampa, FL 33619 $0.03 $0.135
PALMDALE OlL. COMPANY INC
911 North 2nd St.
7 {Fort Pierce, FL 34950 $0.0634 $0.0964
FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
+ §5115 Joanne Kearney Bivd.
Tampa, FL 33619 NO BID NO BID
BV OIL COMPANY INC.
+ §P.O. Box 1018
Arcadia, FL 34265 NO BID NO BID
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VENDOR

TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS

PER GAL.

PER GAL.

5. GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOADS: UNLEADED W/10% ETHANOL

RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
_ 128340 Wick Road
Romulus, Mi 48174

$0.02

$0.03

QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
1618 S 50th St.
Tampa, FL 33619

$0.03

$0.04

PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC
911 North 2nd St.
Fort Pierce, FL 34950

0.0167

0.0257

FFLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
+ 5115 Joanne Kearney Bivd.
[Tampa, FL 33619

0.25

0.0665

rBV OIL. COMPANY INC.
P.O. Box 1018
IArcadia, FL 34265

s

0.025

0.007

6. GASOLINE - TANK WAGON LOADS: UNLEADED W/10% ETHANOL

RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
28340 Wick Road
Romulus, Ml 48174

$0.2999

$10.00

QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
1618 S 50th St.
Tampa, FL 33619

v

$0.03

$0.135

PALMDALE OIL. COMPANY INC
911 North 2nd St.
Fort Pierce, FL. 34950

;
pa

$0.0434

$0.0964

FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd.
[Tampa, FL 33619

v

NO BID

NO BID

P.O. Box 1018

I:V OIL COMPANY INC.
/
rcadia, FL 34265

$0.1125

$0.01
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TABULATION

8 DIESEL FUEL s

VENDOR

IFB 09-0400BS
ADDITIONAL GASOLINE & DIE
FIXED MARKUP COST

PER GAL.

PER GAL.

7. GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOADS: PREMIUM W/10% ETHANOL

RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
28340 Wick Road
Romulus, M| 48174

$0.02

$0.03

QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
1618 S 50th St.
Tampa, FL 33619

$0.03

$0.04

PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC
911 North 2nd St.
Fort Pierce, FL 34950

0.0167

0.0257

#5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd.

HFLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
/ ITampa, FL 33619

0.25

0.0665

BV OIL COMPANY INC.
, P.O. Box 1018
Arcadia, FL. 34265

0.025

0.007

8. GASOLINE - TANK WAGON LOADS: PREMIUM W/10% ETHANOL

RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
28340 Wick Road
Romulus, Mi 48174

~

$0.2999

$10.00

QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
1618 S 50th St.
Tampa, FL 33619

$0.03

$0.135

PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC
911 North 2nd St.
Fort Pierce, FL 34950

$0.0434

$0.0964

FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
5115 Joanne Kearney Blvd.
Tampa, FL 33619

NO BID

NO BID

P.O. Box 1018

IzV OIL COMPANY INC.
rcadia, FL 34265

$0.1125

$0.01
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TABULATION

IFB 09-0400BS

ADDITIONAL GASOLlNE & DIESEL FUEL

T | FIXED TRANSPORT C
VENDOR PER GAL. PER GAL.

9. DIESEL - TRANSPORT LOADS: #2 DIESEL W/ULTRA LOW SULFUR
RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
.- [128340 Wick Road

Romulus, Mi 48174 $0.02 $0.03
QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES
1618 S 50th St.

" §Tampa, FL 33619 $0.03 $0.04

PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC
911 North 2nd St.

Fort Pierce, FL 34950 0.0367 0.0296
FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
, 5115 Joanne Kearney Bivd.

y

Tampa, FL 33619 0.25 0.0665
BV OIl. COMPANY INC.

P.0O. Box 1018

IArcadia, FL 34265 0.025 0.007

10. DIESEL - TANK WAGON LOADS: #2 DIESEL W/ULTRA LOW SULFUR

RKA PETROLEUM COMPANIES INC.
28340 Wick Road

Romulus, M 48174 $0.2999 $10.00
QUICK FUEL FLEET SERVICES

y 1618 S 50th St.
Tampa, FL 33619 $0.03 $0.135

PALMDALE OIL COMPANY INC
. 1911 North 2nd St.

Fort Pierce, FL 34950 $0.0634 $0.0964
FLORIDA FUEL TRANSPORTERS LLC
5115 Joanne Keamey Bivd.

/" ¥Tampa, FL 33619 NO BID NO BID
BV OIL COMPANY INC.
P.O. Box 1018
rcadia, FL 34265 $0.1125 $0.01
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