MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

INTENT TO AWARD
MC v 5E 93,15
SUBJECT Satellite Lift Station R&R 2014 Group 3 DATE POSTED DS E; SE iF ELl=

CC_N/A

PURCHASING DATE CONTRACT

REPRESENTATIVE Deborah Carey-Reed, 941/749-3074 SHALL BE AWARDED Seven days after date Posted.
Nick Wagner, LS Superintendent CONSEQUENCES IF Delay in project resulting in
DEPARTMENT Sherri Robinson, PW Project Manager DEFERRED interfereiﬁce \{uith public access.
SOLICITATION  IFB #15-0089DC ALt 3 inCly o Wendel, CPPO
DATE rilf 2

days for completion.

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid #15-0089DC, Satellite Lift Station R&R 2014 Group 3, to the lowest, responsive and
responsible bidder, U.S. Water Services Corporation, New Port Richey, Florida, for a total bid of $305,907.42 and 210 calendar

J

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY
Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.

Manatee County Code of Laws

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

e The solicitation requested a qualified contractor for the rehabilitation of four (4) sewage lift stations identified as: River
Landings Bluff, Greenfield Plantation 2, Colony Cove 8, and Veranda Springs.

» Formal competitive sealed bid procedures were followed resulting in a total of five (5) bidders submitting a sealed bid
for consideration per the attached cost tabulation. Water Solutions of SWFL bid submittal was evaluated as non-
responsive because bid prices were not submitted on correct Bid Form as required in Bid Addendum #4 revision.

¢ Memorandum from the Public Works Department recommends award of the project to U.S. Water Services

Corporation.

* Project will be funded through Utility Rates.

ATTACHMENTS Utility Rates 4020019707
(List inorderof *® Public WOFkS Recommendation FUNDING SOURCE 4 Funds Verified
attached) = Tabulation (Acct Number & Name) ] Insufficient Funds
AMT/FREQ OF
RECURRING COSTS
Gt 3805.907.42 (Attach Fiscal Impact /A
Statement)




MEMORANDUM

To: Melissa M. Wendel, CPPO, Purchasing Official
From: Jeff Streitmatter lll, P.E., Project Management Division Manager

Date:  April 3, 2015 /Q
Subject:  Satellite Lift Station R&R - 2014 Group 3 Rehabs

U.S. Water Services Corporation

Recommendation for Award - IFB #15-0089-DC

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation form is
attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract Bid “B", with a construction time of
210 calendar days be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, U.S. Water Services
Corporation in the amount of $305,907.42 and in accordance with the terms and conditions of the
bid package. Upon completion of project award, please provide a copy of the purchase order
assigned to the contractor. The funding source for this contract is Utility Rates.

Please contact Sherri Robinson, Project Manager if you have any questions regarding the attached
documents,

Thank you for your continued assistance.
JS/sr

cc: Mike Gore, Director, Utilities
Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works
Sia Mollanazar, P.E., Deputy Director, Engineering Services
Sherri Robinson, Project Manager.ﬁﬁ-
Nick Wagner, Lift Stations Superintendent
Prony Bonnaire Fils, Engineering Specialist |I, w/attachments
Project File: 402-0018707 - 9.2

Public Works Department
Project Management Division
1022 26tk Avenue East, Bradenton, FL 34208-3926
Phone number: [941) 708-7450

LARRY BUSTLE * CHARLES B. SMITH * JOHN R. CHAPPIE * ROBIN DISABATINO * VANESSA BAUGH ®* CAROL WHITMORE * BETSY BENAC
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7



MEMORANDUM

To: Sherri Robinson
From: J. Shea Shoun, P.E., Sr. Project Engineer
Date: March 30, 2015
Subject: Engineering Recommendation of Award
IFB # 15-0088-DC
SLS R&R 2014 Group 3

Praject No.: 402.0019707 5001301

We recommend award of this project to U.S. Water Services Corporation for $305,907.42, as
the Jowest responsive bid for Bid A & B. References were favorable. A Certified Underground
Utility & Excavafion Contractor license (Gary Deremer CUC1223914) and Certified General
Contracter license (Ceceil Delcher CGC003307) are current and active per
myfloridalicense.com. The BBB website does list US Water Services Corporation as an “A+"
rated company. Although nct BBB accredited.

Thank You

Ce:  (without attachments uniess otherwise noted)
File

Public Works Departmentl
Utility Engineering Division
1022 26% Avenue East
Phone number: (941) 708-7450

LARRY BUSTLE * MICHAEL GALLEN = JOHN R. CHAPPIE * ROBIN DiSABATIND * VANESSA BAUGH " CAROL WHITMORE * BETSY BENAC
Hiw (7383 1 " frwt hadh b Distric1 7



Memo
Page 2
3/30/2015

Bidder Evaluation Notes: SLS R&R 2014 Group 3

by }. Shea Shoun March 25, 2015

US Water Services Corporation will be performing the rehabilitation under Cecil Delcher, a Certified
General Contractor CGC003307 & Gary Deremer, a Certified Underground Utility & Excavation
Contractor CUC1223914. The license(s) will expire on 8/31/2016. Both CGC & CUC licenses are current
and active according to www.myfloridalicense.com, copy of web page attached.

REFERENCE CHECKS:
See attached.

SURETY CHECK:
Gary Francis (B00) 382-2150 is indicated on Question 15 of the questionnaire as the Surety’s resident
agent. The Surety is Fidelity & Deposit Company of Maryland and is listed on the www. floir.com website

and has an active license at the Florida Office of Insurance Regulation, copy of web page attached.

BBE
Web check of the BBB site: BBB of West Florida on 3/20/15 with an "A+" rating.

Att: 1. FDBPR.com screen print
2. FLOIR.com screen print
3. BBB screen print

Filw: Bidder Evalustion & Mamo - 3L8 AR 2014 Grp L.docx



BID TABULATION

IFB #15-0088-DC
2014 Group 3 Rehabs
{River Landings Bluff, Greenficld Plantation 2, Colony Cove 8 and Veranda Springs)
R SR [ 3 & L e ; oy SEESSh [
U.S. Water Services Granger Malntenance & Const. RTD Construction Eclipas Construction CEC Motor & Utllity Services Water Solutions of SWFL
A 4826 Croes Bayou Boulovard 811 & Sam Allen Rosd 38038 North Avenue 2930 Parkway Strect 1751 12th Street 1500 Russel Avanue
BID "A" BASED ON New Port Richoy, FL 34882 Plant Clty, FL 33583 Zaphyrhills, FL 33542 Lakeland, FL 33811 Paimatto, F1, 34221 Samsota, FL 34232
150 CALENDAR DAYS {Psaco County) (Hillsborough County) {Pasco Couriy) {Paolk County) {Manates County) {Surancta County)
BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT
1 [River Landings Bluf! $75,272.70 $74,882.50 $103,547.40 $108,874.18 No Bid Non-Respansive
2 |Greenfisld Plantation 2 -‘— $59,079.42 $51,604.30 $84,253.40 $79,305.06 No Bid Non-Responalve
3 |Colony Cove 8 v $B3,53791 $89,415.00 $110,073.48 $119,817.50 No Bld Non-Responsive
4 |Verands Springs - $88,017.38 $92,385.70 $117,938.39 $139,400.05 No Bld Non-Responsive
Ofier for Bid "A" with
» Based on @ $305,907.42 $308,291.50 $418,610.87 * $447,408.76 No Bid Non-Responsive
of 180 Days
REASENE TR e RS ST T e [ S :
U.S Water Granger Maintenance & Const. Eclipse Construction CEC Motor & Utllity Services Watsr Solutions of SWFL
e 4925 Cross Bayou Boulevard 811 € Sam Allen Road 38038 North Avenue 2030 Parioway Strest 1781 12th Strest 1500 Russel Avenus
BiD “B" BASED ON New Port Richey, FLL 34852 Plant City, FL 33563 Zaphyrhills, FL 33842 Lakeland, FL. 33811 Paimetto, FL 34221 Sarasots, FL 34232
210 CALENDAR DAYS {Pasco County) {Paseo County) {Polk County) (Manates County) {Sarasota County)
BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT
1 |River Landings Bluff $76,272.70 $74,882.60 $103,547.40 $108,210.30 $81,028.00 Non-Responsive
2 |Greenfisld Plantation 2 Jo 3$59,079.42 $51,604.30 $84,253.40 $78,189.10 $44,585.20 Non-Responslve
3 [cotony Cove 8 4 $83,597.91 $89,419.00 $110,072.48 $126,981.45 $94,102.80 Non-Responsive
4 |Versnda Springs ¥ $88,017.39 $92,385.70 ¥ s117,936.20 $134,933.70 $105,303.00 Non-Responsive
Total Cffer for Bid “B" with
Goutingsncy - Based on a Compl $308,807.42 $308,291.50 $415,810.67 $448,204.86 $325,017.00 Non-Reaponsive
Time of 210 Days
[énhmhdmd Addendum #1, #2, #3, #4 Yes Yes Yes Yos Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnalre Yes Yes Yos Yes Yes Yes
Liconae Requirement CUC1223914 & CGC03307 CGC1516355 CUCOS7278 & CGCOB0738 CGCO45221 CGC1520078 Nane Listed
Public Contracting & Ewv, Crimes Yes Yes Yos Yes Yos Yes
|Flerida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
|Bad Bond Yes No Yes Yes Yes No
#5 - Ralao exlsting Wetwall Top wihw
Iotes Biab for Gresnfield Plantation 2, A A NA No Bid for Bid "A" e e
Colony Cove & and Veranda
Springs (Bid "A" and Bid "B7)
Page 1 43206

* Per IFB Article A.29, Mathematical Errors, all bids shall.be reviewed mathematically and corrected.
** Non-responsive:to Addendum #4 Bid Form items revision.



IFB #16-0089-DC
2014 GROUP 3 REHABS
River Landings Bluff - RTU 346
(5508 @1st Street East - Bradenton}

-1 RS . |
= LS. Walsr Services Granger Maimenenca & Conet. 'RTD Construction Eclipsa Construction
BID "B 4925 Cross Bayou Bouleverd A11 E Sem Alsn Road 33098 North Avenus 2830 Parioway Street
Nesw Part Richay, FL 24852 Plant Gy, FL 33589 Zephyrhils, FL 33542 Lakeiand, FL 33911
210 CALENDAR DAYS e = & the (Pol Couny
itam Unit Sxtended Unit Extended Unit Extanded Unil Exionded
Mo | Ling ltem um fay | Prica Prica Price Price Prica Prizs Prica Price
1_[Wetwall Clea SF | 417 $4.12 §1,718.04 $4.00 $1,668.00 $17.00 $7,088,00 $10.00 $4,170.00
2 E DR-11 HDPE Fiping LF_| 48 $45.32 §2,084.72 $60.00 $2,760.00[| _ $305.00 $14,030.00|  $20500 38,430.00 $78.00 $3,586.00 Non-Respansive
3_|BPJU.14 Base Ells EA | 2 | $1.03518 $2,07030 | $900.00 $1,800,00[  s727.00 $1,454.00 | $1,140.00 $2280.00 | $700.00 $1,400.00 Non-Responsive
4_|Bage EN Mounting Piate EA | 2 | $1,190.68 $2,381.36 | $900.00 $1,80000|  $B75.00 $1,750.00 | $1,380.00 $2,780.00 | $700.00 $1,400.00 Non-Responeive
5 _|S.5. 6 . iamater EA | 3 | $1,14845 $3,44535  $800.00 $1,800.00|  $758.00 $2274.00]  $770.00 $2310.00]  $500.00 $1,500.00 Non-Responsive
_6_Raise Existing Welwell Top Siab VF_| 1 | $2,086.05 §2,006.05 | $2,500.00 $2,500.00 || $4.151.00 $4,151.00 [ $3.785.00 53,765.00 | $3.000.00 $3,000.00 Non-Responsive
7 |toft Xy Blank —_—
& _|4" PC Vient, Schedule B0 EA | 1 $360.50 | $360.50 | $400.00 ] $400.00(]  s783.00 $763.00]  $380.00 | $380.00 | $100.00 $100.00 Non-Responsive
9 _|Le# intentionadly Blenk = =
10 I? S.5. Pump Guide Rall Systam IF | =8 $142.14 $5,542.46 $85.00 $2,535.00 $58.00 $2,262.00 $76.00 $2,864.00 $60.00 $2,340.00 Non-Rasponsive
11_|Resilient (Link) Seals wiCanisr Pipe & Liner Reper EA | 5 | $1,180.00 §5950.00 |  $400.00 $2000.00(  $614.00 $3,070.00 $50.00 $250.00 | $250.00 $1,250.00 Non-Responsive
SF_| s88 $16.00 $6,984.00 $24.00 $9,312.00 $18.00 $5,984.00 $23.00 924.00 $20.00 $7.760.00 “Non-Responsive
VF | 1 $2 035.00] $2,035.00]  52,000.00 | $2,000.00 | $2,704.00 $2,704.00 765.00 $3,785.00 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $947.00] $a97.00]  $750.00 75000 | $2,010.00 $2,010.00 | $1,385.00 $1,38500 1  $500.00 $500.00 Non-Responsive
LF | 4 $53.00) $212.00 .00 $100.00 | $343.00 $1,372.00 $85.00 $340.00)  $i25.00 $500.00 Non-Responsive
Ea | 1 $110.00 §110.00) _ $500.00 3500.00 | $852.00 §852.00]  $430.00 $430.00{  $100.00 $100.00 Non-Responalve
s | 1 $6,000.0D) $5,000.00f _$3,500.00 $3,500.00 | $11,393.00 $11,383.00 | $5,650,00 $5,650.00] $6,500.00 $8,500.00 Non-Respansive
s | 1 $978.00 §978.00f  $400.00 3400.00 | $1,160.00 $1.180.00 | $1.880.00 $1.820.00{ 5200.00 $200.00 Non-Respansive
EA | 1 $995.00 95.00]  $2,000.00 $2,000.00 ] $000.00 $900.00 | $2,585.00 52,585.000  $1125.00 §1,125.00 Non-Respansive
EA | 1 $2,836.00 $2.636.00] _$4,000.00 $4,000.00 | _$2.800.00 $2,800.00 | $5,510.00 §5,510.00 | $3,500.00 $3,500.00 Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $8,059.00 $8,060.00] $11,000.00 $11,000.00 | $8,124.00 $6,124.00 | _$0,185.00 $9,195.00 | $20,000.00 $20,000.00 Non-Respansive
F |15 $159.73 §2,385.95 $40.00 SB00.00 $16.00 §240.00]  $420.00 $6,300.00 $20.00 $300.00 Non-Respansive
F |5 $527.20) $2,636.00| _ $100.00 $500.00 §10.00 $50.00 | $1,045.00 $5,225.00 $15.00 $75.00 Non-Responaive
EA | 1 $2.636. $2,636.000 §3,000.00 $3.00000 | $2425.00 $2,425.00 | $3,365.00 $3,365.00 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 Non-Rasponsive
VF | 2 $718. $1,438. §75.00 $150.00 |  $24400 $488.00 00 $760.00 $50.00 $100.00 Non-R h
$62,711.73 $55,075.00 $78,345.00 $83,643.00 $62,238.80 Non-Responsive
s [ 1 $1,848.00 $6,500.00 $5,000.00 $8,790.00 $7,000.00 Non-Responsive
s | 1 $2,750.00 $4,500.00 $10,639.00 $4,340.00 $3.321.20 Nor- i
s | 1 $1,120.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $2,100.00 $1,100.00 Nor-Responsive
JTotal Construction Cost {Byd lems 1 - 39) $68429.73 $68,075.00 $94.134.00 $98,373.00 $73,660.00 Non-Responsive
Caniract Contingsncy (Usad only with County Approval) % | 10| §6,842.97 $6,807.50 $9,413.40 $8,837.30 $7,366.00 Non-Reaponaive
Bid "B" - River Landings Bluff $76,272.70 $74,882.50 $103,547.40 $108,210.30 $81,026.00 Non-Responsive

sage 1
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IFB $18-0000-DC
2014 GROUP 3 REHABS
Greenfietd Piantation 2 - RTU 376
{10748 Old Grova Gircle - Bradenton)

— US Waier Granger Mainisnnce & Const RTD Congiruction Ecipes Congiruction CEC Mator & Ul Water Sowtions of SWFL
BID "B 4825 Crosa Bayou Boulevard 11 E Sam Alon Roed 30036 Narth Avenus 2630 Pariovay Sirest 1751 12ih Streat Enst 1500 Russ Avanue
CALE| New Fort Richey, FL 34652 Piant City, FL 33583 Zaphyrhits, FL 33642 Laketend, FL 33811 Paimelio, FL 34221 Sarasola, FL 34232
210 NDARIOAYS {Paco G {Pasca % {Polk County) {Manaies County) Serwsotn Cou
eem Unit Extonded Un Extanded Unit Unt Extanded Unit Exdended Unit Exiended
No. §f Lins ltem uM | oty | Price Price Price Piice Prca Prica Prics Prica Price Prica Price Piice
1 W Cisari SF | 607 | .12 $2,500.64 $4.00 §2,428.00 $12.00 $7,284.00 $7.00 $4,249.00 $2.00 $1.214.00 Non-Hesponsive
24" DR-11 HOPE Pipi LF | 75 $45.32 $3,399.00 $50.00 $4,500.00 $136.00 $10200.00 ]  $123.00 $9,225.00 $80.00 $6,000.00 Non-Responsive
3_|BPIU.14 Basa Ells EA | 2 | §1,035.15 $2070.30|  $800.00 $1.800.00 §727.00 $1454.00 | $1,160.00 $2320.00| s$700.00 ADO.00 Non-Responsi
4_[Puse E1 Maunling Plate EA | 2 | $1,190.68 $2.381.36 | §900.00 $1,800.00 $876.00 $1,75200 | $1410.00 $2,82000 | §700.00 A00.00 Non-Responsive
5 _15.5. Fipe Bracing, Bt di BA | 4 | §1,14645 $4503.80|  $800.00 52,400.00 §756.00 5303200 $500.00 $2,350.00 |  $500.00 $2,000.00 Non-Responsive
] il:;:n Evisting Top Siab VF | 07 | s2085.00 §1,424.50 | $2,500.00 $1780.007 $7,350.00 $5,145.00 | $5,480.00 $3,838.00 | $3,000.00 $2,100.00 Non-Responsive
7 ionaiy Blartk
8 14" PV Vert, Schaduls 80 EA | 1 $380.50] sa60.50 | $400.00 ] $400.00 $763.00 §762.00] $1,345.00 | $1,34500]  $100.00 | $100.00 Non-Responsive
] Infsriionally Btartk = o= P
10_§2" 5.6, Pump Guide Ral iF | sa $142.14] $8,366.26 §65.00 | $3.835.00 §51.00} 53,009.00 $66.0¢ | $4,071.00 $60.00 | 5$3,540.00 Non-Rasponsive
11 Intandionakly Blamk
12 §Welwell Liner, Spray-On 5F | = $380.00 $60.00) $1.200.00 $48.00) $880.00 538.00 $760.00 $55.00 $1,100.00 Nan-Responsive
12 P ng Drein, Abandon EA | 1 5150.00 $100.00 $100.00 $87.00 587.00]  $345.00 5345.00 | $1,000.00 $1,000.00 Nar-Responsive
14 J* Flanged Gala Vaive EA ] 3 $1,484.00 §300.00] .00 $§543.00] $162800]  $790.00 $2,370.00 | 550000 $1,600.00 Nan-Responsive
15 J4" Fianged Swing Chwck valve EA | 2 $2,738.00 | $1,500.00] $3,000.00 $876.00 $1952.00f $1.115.00 $2,230.00 | $§600.00 $1,000.00 Non-Responsive
76 |~ D1 Flanged Pips IF | & $535.00 $100.00] $500.00 $163.00 §965.00]  s260.00 $1,400.00 $80.00 $400.00 Non-Responaive
A7_JDuctis iron Fitings L8 | 3m $6,000.00 $9.00] $2,700.00 $7.00 '$2,100.00 §15.00 $4,500.00 $20.00 $5,000.00 Non-Responsive
18 | D.L. Flanged Ada EA 52.00 $250.00] $260.00 $477.00/ S477.00]  5242.00 $242.00 $75.10 $75.00 NorrResponsive
4" Male Aluminum Guick C EA 40.00 $250.00] $250.00 5343.00/ $34300)  $175.00 §175.00F 310000 §100.00 Non-Respansive
EA | 2 420,00 $300.00] $600.00 $574.00/ $1,148.00 §  $475.00 $050.00 |  $500.00 $1,000.00 Non-Responsive
511 $3,860.00 $500.00] $500.00 $582.00/ $58200 f 5284500 $2645.00 | $1.000. $1.000.00 Non-Responaive
23 Intendionaly Slank
24_[Cancrate Steb, Valve iy N I $650.00 $700.00 $T00.00 [ $1,557.00] $1.557.00 $14B500 $1,495.00 | $1,500.00 $1,500.00 Non-Responsive
25 [4" Gate Vaive, M) EA | 1 $847.00 | $750.00 $750.00 | $957.00 $957.00)  $1415.00 $1,41500|  $500.00 $500.00 Non-Respansive
26 _J4" PVC Pips (GADO) (Crusa/Tes to Plug Vaive) IF | @ $318.00 $25.00 150.00 | $260.00 $1,576.00 $43.00 §256.00)  $125.00 §750.00 Nor-Responsive
27 |5 Influant Line Flug_ EA | 1 $110.00 | $460.00 400.00 || $852.00 $852.00 | $435.00 $435.00)  $100.00 $100.00 Nor-Responsive
28 _[By-Pass Pumping, <500 GPM is | 1 | $500000 §5,000.00 | $3,500.00 $2,500.00 | $19,371.00 $11.371.00 | _§5.710.00 $5710.00 | $2,000.00 $2,000.00 Non-Responsive
- X Hy Blarks
30 [Leit Intaniionally Blank
31 [Laft infantionaily Blank
32 [ioft infantiomally Blani
33 [iof intentionslly Blank
34 s fly Blsnic
35 JLeft Intentionally Blank
it Brark
piotal C Cost F $47.990.56 $35,913.00 $59,217.00 §55,158,00 $35,779.00 Non-Responsive
s | 1 $1,848.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,670.00 $3,000.00 Non-Responsive
anaous Work, Ctean Up & Restorabon s | 1 $2.750.00 $4,000.00 §12.227.00 $4,925.00 $753.00 Non-Responsive
39_[Record Drawing s | 1 $1,120.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $2,130.00 $1,000.00 Non-Re
~JTotal Construction Cost (Bid tems 1- 39} $53,708.56 $46,9713.00 $76,594.00 $71,081.00 $40,632.00 Non-Responsive
et Con Used only with County Approval] % [0 ] §5.370.86 $4,601.30 $7.658.40 $7,108.10 $4,053.20 Non-Responaive
Bid "B" - Greenfiald Planation 2 H¥$59,079.42 $64,604.30 564,253.40 $78,188.10 $44,585.20 Non-Responsive

age 21
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IFB #15-0089-DC
2014 GROUP 3 REHABS
Calany Cova B - RTU 524
(7100 Lakeshore Drive - Ellenton)

1o R ] [ S Ty — 4 : i 8 — 8
fe .5 Waler Services Granger hsintensnca & Conal. RTO Construction Eclipsa Canetruclion CEC Motor & Utiily Water Solutions of SWFL
BID "B 4825 Croas Bayou Baulevard 811 E Sam Allen Rosd 28038 North Averue 2600 Parkway Sirsst 1761 12th Sireel Esst 1500 Russat Avaniss
210 CALENDAR DAYS New Port Richay, FL 34882 Plant City, FL. 33863 Zephyrhills, L 33542 Lakeland, FI 33811 Pasmaello, FL 34221 Saresols, FL. 34232
{Paco County) {Polk County) {Manaies County} | ‘Barascin
(] Unit Extendsd Unit Exlended Unif Extanded Unk Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Mo June um | oy Price Prics Price Price Price Prics Prico Frica Prica Prica Prica Prica
1 wol Ci 8F | 432 $4.12 $1,770.84 $4.00 $1.728.00 $16.00 $6,912.00 $9.00 $3,888.00 $2.00 $864.00 Non-Responsive
2_J4" DR-11 HOPE Fiping LF_| so $45.32 $2,266.00 $60.00 $3,000.00 $216.00] $10,800.00 $180.00 $8,000.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 Non-Responsive
3 _|BPIU.14 Base Ells EA | 2 035,18 $2,070.30 | $900.00 1,800.00 $727.00) §1454.000 $1,130.00 | $2.280.00 .00 $1,400.00 Non-Responsive
4 EA | 2 ,180.68 $2,381.35 | $500.00) ,800.00 $876.00 ;75200 ) $1,375.00 $2,750.00 $700.00 $1,400.00 Non-Responsive
3 EA | 3 $1,148.45 33.445.35 $500.00 ,800.00 $758.00 52,274.00 $765.00 $2,285.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 Non-Responsive
8 VF | 67 | $2.085.00] oF $1424.50) su $2,500.00 §1,750.00 |  $5.274.00 $3691.50 | $5.325.00 $3727.50 $3,000.00 $2.100.00 Non-Resp
7] EA | 1 si7e1.30] 81781300 52 500.00] $2,500.00 |  $2,107.00 ,107.00 | $5,505.00 $5,505.00 | $3,500.00 §3,500.00 Non-Responsive
& 4" PVC Vent, Schedule 80 EA [ 1 $350.50) $380.50 | - $400.00] $400.00 $763.00 $783.00 $360.00 $380.00 $200.00 $200.00 Non-Responaive
8 [Aluminum Haich Cover, 36"x48", Single Door (Walwel) EA | 1 $927.00] $827.00 | $1,200.00] $1,200.00 §789.00] $793.00 | 51,185.00 $1,185.00 | $1,000.00 $1,000.00 Non-Responsive
10 |2 S.5. Fump Guide Rai Systam LF | 40 $142.14] $5,685.80 $65.00] $2,600.00 $56.00] $2,240.00 $73.00 $2,920.00 $80.00 $3,200.00 Non-Responsi
11 Intantionaily Biank
T_z_%m Liner, Spray-On SF | 403 $18.00] $7,254.00 $24.00] $8.672.00 $18.00] $7,254.00 $23.00 $0,269.00 $20.00 $8,060.00 Non-Responsive
13 IExisling Drain, Abendon EA | 1 $150.00] $150.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $335.00 $335.00 $500.00 ___5500.00 Non-Respansive
14 |4 Flanged Gate Valve EA | 3 $498.00] $1,494.00 $B00.00 $2,400.00 $543.00 $1,626.00 $770.00 $2,310.00 $800.00 $2,400.00 Non-Reapansive
15 }4" Flanged Swing Chack vaive EA | 2 $1,368.00] $2736.00 |  $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $976.00 $1.052.00 | $1.085.00 $2,170.00 $800.00 $1,600.00 Non-Respanaiva
18 |4 D.1. Flanged Pipe LIF | 6 $107.00) $535.00 $100.0D $500.00 $133.00 $865.00 $270.00 $1,350,00 $100.00 $500.00 Non-Respanaive
17 |Ductie ron Fillings L8 [210 $20.00 $4,200.00 $9.00 $1,880.00 $10.00] $2,100.00 $18.00 §3,780.00 $20.00 $4,200.00 Non-Respansive
18 K" D.1. Flanged A EA | 1 $152.00] $152.00 $250.00 $250.00 $477.00§ $477.00 $235.00 $235.00 $200.00 $200.00 Non-Responsive
19 [4" Mals Aluminum Cuick Coupler Adapter EA | 1 $140.00] $140.00 $250.00 $250.00 $343.00 $343.00 $170.00 $170.00 $100.00 $100.00 Non-Responsive
20 }5.8. Adjustabla Valve Supports, Flangs Altact EA | 2 $210.00} $420.00 $300.00 $600.00 $574.00 $1,148,00 $460.00 $620.00 | 51,000.00 $2,000.00 Non-Responsive
21 [\Laft infentionally Blank
2 Intantioraily Biank
23 lete Remaval of Vialve Vault te | 1 $3,680.00] $3,680.00 $800.00 $500.00 |  $2.440.00) $2,440.00 | $2,580.00 $2,580.00 | $2,000.00 $2.000.00 Non-Responsive
24 [Concrete Slab, Valve Assembly is | 1 $850.00] $650.00 $700.00 $700.00 ] $1,532.00 $1,532.00F $1,455.00 $1455.00 |  $1,500.00 $1,500.00 Non-Responaive
25 4" Gale Valvo, MJ ea | 1 $847.00 $947.00 $750.00 $750.00 $954.00 $854.00 | $1.380.00 $1,380.00 $500.00 $500.00 Non-Responsive
28 J4" PVC Plpe (CBO0) {Crosa/Tes o Plug Valva) LIF | 8 $53.00 $318.00 $50.00 $300.00 $263.00 $1.578.00 $45.00 $270.00 $60.00 $480.00 Non-Responaive
27 EA | 1 $110.00 $110.00 $400.00 $400.00 $852.00 $852.00 $425.00 $425.00 $100.00 $100.00 Non-Responsiva
28 8 [ 1 '$5,000.00 $5,000.00 | $3,500.00 $3,500.00 | $11.368.00 $11,368.00 | $5,590.00 $5,500.00 | $4.000.0D $4,000.00 Non-Responsive
8 | 1 $578.00 $076.00 $400.00 $400.00 | $123500 $1,233.00 | §1.370.00 $1,870.00 $500.00 $500.00 Nan-Responaive
EA { 1 $805.00 $695.00 |  $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $800.00 $800.00 | $2.560.00 $2,550.00 | $1,125.00 $1,125.00 Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $2,636.00 $2,636.00 | $4,000.00 $4,000.00 | $2,525.00 $2,525.00 | $5460.00 $5,460.00 | $3,500.00 $3,500.00 Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $5,069.00 $8,059.00 ] §11,000.00 $11,000.00 | $5.124.00 $6,124.00 | $9,105.00 $9,105.00 | $20,000.00 $20,000.00 MNon-Responsive
LF | 15 $155.73 §2395.95 $40.00 $800.00 $16.00 $240.00 $415.00 $6,225.00 $20.00 $300.00 Non-Responaive
LF | 35 $75.31 $2,635.85 $100.00 $3,500.00 $27.00 $845.00 $148.00 $5,180.00 $32.00 $1,120.00 Non-Responaive
EA | 1 $2,636.00 $2,636.00 | §3,000.00 $3,000.00 | $2,425.00 $2425.00 | $3,330.00 $3.330.00 | $2.910.00 $2,510.00 Non-Responsive
Subtotal Conslruction Cost $70,225.85 $68,200.00 $83,876.80 $089,888.50 $76,759.00 Mor-Respansive
a7 Fﬁ:hﬂiﬂﬁnn Ls ] 1 $1,646.00 $6,500.00 $5,000.00 $8,670.00 $8,000.00 Non-Responsive
38 [Miscelianaous Work, Claan Up & s {1 $2,750.00 $4,500.00 $11,040.00 $4.800.00 $1,780.00 Non-Responaive
39 fRecord Drawings LS $1.120.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $2,080.00 §1,000.00 Non-Responsive
~ [ Total Construction Cost (Bid ltems 1 - 39) $75.843.55 $81,290.00 $100,066.80 $115,419.50 $85,548.00 Non-Responsiva
[+ Used only with C o % |10 | §7.584.36 $8,126.00 $10,008.68 $11,641.95 $8,564.80 Non-Responsive
Bid "B" - Colony Cove 8 * $83,537.91 $89,419.00 $110,073.48 $126,961.45 $94,102.80 Non-Responsive

Pag 3¢ 41312015
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IFB #15-0088-DC
2014 GROUP 3 REHABS
River Landings Bluff - RTU 345
{5609 618t Street East - Bradanton)

1 e et e ST = i NS 8
R .S Ve Services ‘Granger Mainianante & COnSL RTD Canginucion ‘EcHpss Conatnicion 'CEC hiotor & Ubity Waler Saiitions of SWFL
BID "A 4825 Croes Bayou Boulsvard 11 E Sam Afien Rosd 35038 North Avenue 2830 Pariway Birsel 1751 120h Strest East 1500 Ruses| Avenus
New Fort Richey, FL 34882 Plant City, FL 33683 Zaphyrhils, FL 33642 Laksland, FL 33011 Paimetio, FL 34221 Sarasots, FL 34232
150 CALENDAR DAYS s % e L ==t
= Unt Unit Unk Exdended Unk. m‘m = -umt_E ML" Uit MEL"
No. | Line umlay| Pice Prics _ Price Prico Prica Price Price Priow Prica Price Price Price
= [Watwsil Cleanin BF | 417 $4.12 $1,718.04 $4.00 $1,666.00 $17.00 .00 $9.50 $3,861.50 o Bid — NorResponaive
E" BR-11 HDPE Piping iF | 4 $45.32 §2,004.72 $60.00 $2,760.00 $305.00 $14,030.00 | 5200.00 $9,200.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
3_|BP.14 Baso Els EA | 2 03515 $2,070.30 | $900.00 1,800.00 $727.00 1,454.00 | §1,148.00 $2,266.00 No Bid Non-Reaponsive
EA | 2 100.68 $2381.36|  $800.00 $1,800.00 $875.00 1,750.00 | $1,400.00 $2,800.00 No Bid NonRasponsive
EA | 3 ,148.45 44635 $600.00 51,800.00|  $758.00 $227400]  $775.00 $2,326.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
VF | 1 | 3208605 086.05 | $2,500.00 $2,500.00 | _$4.151.00 $4,151.00] $3.500.00 $3,900.00 No Bid Non-Respanaive
EA | 1 $350.50 | $360.50]  $400.00 | $400.00}  $763.00 | $763.00§  §382.00 | $362.00 No Bid Non-Responsive ||
LF | 3¢ $142.14 $5,543.46 $65.00 $2,535.00 $58.00 $2,262.00 $78.00 —$3,042.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 5 | $1,150.00 $5950.00 |  $400.00 52,00000 | $614.00 $3,070.00 $49.00 .00 No Bid Non-Responsive
SF | 388 $18.00 56,984.00 §24.00 $0,312.00 §ta.00 $6,064.00 §24.00 §9,312.00 No Bid Non-Responsiva
VF | 1 | s2088.00] 035.00] $2,000.00 000.00 | $2704.00 | §2704.00 | $3.800.00 | $3,900.00 No Bid Nor-Responaive
1
EA | 1 $847.00] $947.00§  $750.00 §760.00 | $2,010.00 $2,010.00 | _$1,400.00 $1,400.00 No Bkl Non-Responsive
LF | a $53.00] §212.0 $25.00 5100.00 | §343.00 $1,372.00 $62.00 00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $110.00] 31100 $500.00 $500.00 |  $852.00 $852.00|  5430.00 $430.00 No Bid Non-Responaive
S | 1 5 000.00, $5,000.00f $3,500.00 $3,500.00 | $11.383.00 $11,393.00 | $5,785.00 $5,785.00 Na Bid Nan-Reaponeive
ol 18 | 1 : $400.00| $1.180.00 $1,160.00§ _$1.780.00 $1,780.00 No Bid Non-Responsh
EA | 1 $2.000.00 |  $800.00 $000.00 | $2.540.00 $2,640.00 No Bid Nor-Reap
=) EA | 1 $4,000.00 | $2,800.00 $2,800.00 | _$5.700.00 $6,700.00 No Bid Non-Responaive
EA | 1 $11,000.00 124.00 $6.124.00 | _$8,500.00 .00 No Bid Non-Responsive
33_|Remove & Replace Schedule 80 PVC Condul [F | 18 $800.00 $16.00 00 343000 $6,450.00 No Bd Ncn-Responsive
34 |Replace Elncisical Sanvcs F | 5 0 $500.00 | $10.00 | 0.00 ] $1,050.00 $6,250.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
"35 |Remove & Replacs Electrical Mounling Structure EA | 1 $3,000.00 | $2.425.00 | $2,425.00 |  $3.240.00 $3,340.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
36_JBrick & blortar Valva Supporis, 3 Tolsl, 8" High VF | 2 Y $150.00 | §244.00 00§ sarsnc $750.00 _Ne Bd Non-Responaive
"JSubtotal Gonstruction Cost___ $62,711.73 $65,075.00 $78,345.00 $84,696.50 No Bid Non-Responsive
37 [Mobllization |1 §1,648.00 .00 $5,000.00 $8,080.00 No Bid Non-Respongive
38 IMiscebaneous Work, Clean Up & Restoration L8 | 1 $2,750.00 $4,500.00 $10,639.00 $4,170.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
38 rd Drawings (] $1,120.00 ~$2,000.00 $150.00 $2,020.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
“§Tetal Cansiruction Com) (81 iems 1 - 39) $68.420.73 $68,075.00 $94,134.00 $98,976.60 No Bid Non-Responsive
ingency (Used anly with County Approval) % [10 | $6,842.97 .50 $9,413.40 $9,807.65 No Bid Non-Responsive
b-d "A" - River Landings Bluff $75,272.70 $74,882.50 $103,647.40 $108,874.15 No Bid Non-Responsive
‘age 51 4132015



IFB #18-0089-DC

2014 GROUP 3 REHABS
Greenfleld Plantation 2 - RTU 378
{10749 Old Grove Circle - Bradenton)
osen, | 3 ] L}
e U.S Water Sorvices Granger Malntanance & Canst RTD Construcion Eclipse Construcion CEC WMotor & Urisity Vialar Sobiions of BWFL
BID "A' 4625 Cross Bayou Bovleverd 611 E Sam Allen Road 28038 North Avenue 2890 Parkoway Streat 1761 12th Birnet East 1800 Russel Avenve
150 CALENDAR DAYS New Part Richey, FL 34882 Plant City, FL 33563 Zaphyrhiia, FL 33542 Lakeland, FL 93811 Paimaito, FL 34221 Sermsota, FL 84252
Paaco County) Merisies Barascta
Ibam Exdendad Unit Extended Unit Extended
Tty e R Wi aty | Price Prica Prica Price Price Price
;EMM Cleanlng SF_| o7 ,426.00 $4,249.00 Na Bid n-Reaponsive
2_§4" DR-#1 HDPE Piping IF | 75 $4,500.00 $8,300.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
; EA | 2 $1,800.00 ; $2,380.00 No Bid Non-Responaive
EA | 2 $1,190.68] $2,381.38 |  $800.00 $1,800.00 52.0( X $3,830.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 4 $1,148.46 $4,593.80 | 3600.00 $2,400.00 032 . $2,400.00 Na Bid Non-Responsive
VF_| 0.7 sa.usa.unl 3~ $1.424.50 | §250000 $1,750.00 | $7,350.00] $5,145.00 735.00 $4,014.50 Na Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $260.50] $360.50 |  $400.00 $400.00 §763.00] $763.00 | $1,380.00 | $1,390.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
F [0 | stazid] 38,386.26|  $6500] $3.835.00 $51.00] $3,008.00 |  $73.00] $4.307.00 NoBid Non-Responsive
SF | 2 $18.00] $360.00 $60.00]  _ $1.200.00 $49.00( $980.00 $41.00 $820.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $160.00] $150.00 mo,g $100.00 sa7.00| $87.00 8360 $350.00 No Nan-Responsive
EA | 3 $404 00| $1,484.00 $800. $2.400.00 $543.00| $1,625.00 5810 .00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 2 §1.368.00 $273800] $1.500.00] $3,000.00 $878.00| $1,952.00 $1.150 $2,300.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
LF | 5 $107.00] $535.00 §100.00] $500.00 $153.00] $965.00 8284 $1.420.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
L8 | a0 $20.00] $6,000.00 $6.00] §2,700.00 $7.00 $2,100.00 $15 $4,500.00 No 8id Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $152.00) }162.00 $260. nnl $250.00 §477.00) $477.00 5242 $242.00 No Bl Non-Responalve
EA | 1 mﬁl 140.00 $260.00 $250.00 $343.00 $343.00 8172 $172.00 No Bid Non-Reaponsive
EA | 2 $210.00 420.00 $300.00{ $800.00 $574.00 $1,148.00 3480 $860.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
s | 1 33,860.00] $3,860.00 $500.00) $500.00 $552.00) $582.00 82,680 $2,880.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
23 1 :__
24 8 [ 1 §660.00 $650.00 s70000] " $700.00 |  $1.557.00 $1,557.00 $1470 $1,470.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
26 13" Gats Valve, MJ EA | 1 $847.00 §947.00 |  §750.00 575000 |  $857.00 $957.00 ] $1,450.00 $1,450.00 No Bid Non-Responsive ‘
25_|4" PVC Pipe (C000) (Cross/Tea 1o Plug Vaive) LF | & $63.00 $318.00 $25.00 §15000] $283.00 $1,678.00 $41.00 $240.00 No Bid nsive
27 J8° Influeni Line Phup EA | 4 $110.00 $110.00]  $400.00 $400.00 |  $852.00 385200  $445.00 $445.00 No Bid Nar-Responsive
28 |By-Pass Pumging, <510 GPM 15 [ + | 5500000 $5000.00 ] $3,500.00 $3,600.00 | $11,371.00 $11,371.00 ] $5,886.00 $5,085.00 No Bid Non-Rasponsive
28 |teft nfantionaly Siari
30 [Left Infentionely Giznk
3B
¥ si79505 $35,913.00 $59,217.00 $56.320.50 No B Non-Responsiva
a7 s |1 $1,848.00 $5,000.00 .00 $8,825.00 Ne Bid Non-Responsive |
38 ous Work, Ciesn Up & Restoralion L8 | 1 $2,750.00 $4,000.00 $12,227.00 $4,860.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
a0 Drawings: s |1 $1,120.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $2,090.00 No Bid Noi onsive
| Total Construction Cost (Bid ltems 1 - 39) $53,708.56 $46,813.00 $78,524.00 $72,095.50 No Bid Non-Responsive
niract Cont [Used only with County Approval) % ] 10 | 70.86 $4,601.30 $7,669.40 $7,209.55 No Bid Non-Responsive
Bid "A" - Greenfield Planation 2 $59,078.42 $61,604.30 $84,253.40 $79,305.05 No Bid Non-Responsive
uge 2 41372018



IFB #15-0088-DC

2014 GROUP 3 REHARS
Colony Cove 8 - RTU 624
{7100 Lakeshore Drive - ERenton)
= = : LR TTE EATTE ] LS T LI
= U.8 Waier Sarvicas Granges Malntenance & Const. RTD Construction Eclipaa Corsiruction CEC Mator & Uitillly Waler Soluions of SWFL
BID “A 4725 Cross Bayou Boulevard 811 E Sam Alian Road 38033 North Avanus 2030 Parkway Street 1751 121h Sicset East 1800 Russal Avenus
180 CALENDAR DAYS Now Port Richey, FL 34862 Plent Cily, F1. 33563 Zephyrhills, FL 33542 Lakeland, FL $2811 Paimatio, FL 34221 Serasola, FL 34232
L e L " ._g-m___ ]
[ Unit Unit Extended Unit Exdended Unit Extended Unit Unit
No. | Line um | oy Price Prica Price Prica Pricy Prica Prics Prica Prica Prca Prics
AR et e S S P et o e et A e a0 P e e S e
_1an Cleaning SF { 432 $4.12 $1.779.84 $4.00) $1,728.00 $16.00/ $6,912.00 $8.00 $3,888.00 No on-Responsh
2 |4’ DR-11 HDPE Piging LF | 60 $45.32) $2.266.00 $60.00| $3,000.00 $216.00 $10,800.00 $33.00 $1,650.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
3 |BPIU.14 Base Els EA | 2 $1.035.15] $2.070.30 $000.00 $1,800.00 $727.00 1,454.00 | $1,135.00 ,270.00 No Bid Non-Responaive
4 _{Basa Eli Mouniing Plale EA | 2 $1,190.68 $2,361.36 $900.00 $1,800.00 $876.00| 75200 $1,355.00 $2,710.00 No Bid Non-Responsive |
5 _|8.5. Pipe Bracing, 8 f. diametar EA | 3 $1,148.45 $3.445.35 $800.00/ j1,800.00 $758.00] $2,274.00 $765.00 $2,295.00 No Bid
8 Existing Wetwal Tap Slab VE | 07 | $2.035.00 §= $1.42450| $2.500.00 1,750.00 | §5,274.00] $5.450.00 $3,815.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
_7_|Repiuce Exisiing Wetwsll Top Slab EA | 1 $1,761.30 $1.761.30 |  $2,500.00 $2.500.00] §2,107.00 $2107.00] $5700.00 $5,700.00 No Big Non-Responsive
8_J4' PVC Vent, Scheduls 80 EA | 1 $380.50 $380.50 $400.00 $400.00 $763.00 $763.00 $360.00 $380.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
8 [Aluminum Hatch Cover, 36"%48", Single Ooor [Wetwal) EA | 1 $027.00) $627.00 |  $1.200.00] $1.200.00 $799.00 $788.00 | $1,220.00 $1,220.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
LF | 40 $142.14 $5,685.60 $85.00] $2,600.00 $56.00| $2,240.00 §75.00  $3,000.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
SF ] 403 518.00] $7,254.00 $24.nu| $8,672.00 $18.00] §7,254.00 $24.00 $8.672.00 No Bid Non-Raspansive
13 EA | 1 $150.00 $150.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $335.00 $335.00 No Bid Non-Responsiva
14_ 4" Fianged Gale Vaive EA | 2 us&oﬁlﬁ $1.484.00 $800.00 $2.400.00 $543.00 $1,820.00 $775.00 §2,325.00 No Bid Non-Responsiva
16 14" Flanged Swing Check vaive EA | 2 $1,360.00 $2738.00] $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $876.00 $1.852.00]  §1,100.00 $2,200.00 No Bid Non-Responasive
16 |4" D.L Flanged Plpe LF $107.00| $536.00 $100.00! $500.00 $1 $865.00 $270.00 $1,350.00 No Bid Non-Respaonsive
17 _|Ductile Iron Fitfings 18 [z10 $20.00| $4,200.00 sa.nol $1,650.00 $10. §2,100.00 $18.00) $3,780.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $152.00] $477.00 $230.00 $230.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA [ 1 $140.00] $343.00 $165.00 $165.00 No Bid Non-Rasponaive
EA | 2 $210.00] $1,148.00 $460.00] $620.00 No Bid Non-Responaive
s | 1 $3,620.00} 5244000 | $2.545.00( $2,545.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
s | 1 $550.00] $1,532.00 $1,400 $1,400.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
25 4" Gate Valva, NI EA [ 1 $947.00 $954.00 | $1,385.00 $1,385.00 No Bld Non-Responaive
28 4" PVC Pipe (CBOO) (Crosa/Tes to Plug Vaive) IF [ 8 $53.00 $1,578.00 $40.00 5240.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
27_|8° Influant Line Plug EA [ 1 $110.00 00 $425.00 $425.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
28 _[By-Paas P <500 GPM s | 1 $5,000.00 $11,388.00 1 $5.720.00 $5.720.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
Ex. Backfiow, Mater & Hose Bibb Assambly s | 1 $978.00 $878.00 $400.00 $40000) $1.233.00 $1.233.00f $1,780.00 $1,760.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $995.00 $605.00 | $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $800.00 so00.00 ) $2.61500 $2 815.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
Swhtch (di EBA | 1 $2,638.00 $2,636.00 | $4,000.00 $4,000.00 | $2525.00] $2,525.00 |  $5,635.00 $5,635.00 No Bid Non-Responaive
EA | 1 $8,059.00 $5,059.00 | $11.000.00 $11.000.00 |  $8,124.00 $8,124.00 | $9,380.00 $5,380.00 No Nan-Responalve |
80 PVC Conduit LF | 18 $158.73 $2,395.95 $40.00 $500.00 $240.00 $420.00 $6,300.00 No Bid Nan-Responsive
LF | 38 $75.31 $100.00 $3,500.00 $845.00 $150.00 _$5,250.00 | No Bid NonResponsive |
Mounting Siructure EA | 1 $2,636.00 $2,836.00 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2425.00 | $3,300.00 $3,300.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
} §70,225.55 $68,280.00 $83,876.80 $83,840.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
s ] 1 $1.848.00 $8.500.00 $5.000.00 | $6,435.00 No Bil Non-Responaive
scalianeous Work, Clean Up & Resioration 1s | 1 $2,750.00 $4.500.00 $11,040.00 $4,650.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
LS $1,120.00 ____$2.000.00 $150.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
Total Construction Cosi (Bid ltems 1 - 38) $75,943.55 $81,280.00 $100,066.80 $108,925.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
(Uned only with County Appreval) % |10 [ $7,504.38 $8.129.00 $10,008.68 __$10,882.50 No Bid Non-Responive
1Bid "A" - Colony Cove B * $83,537.91 $89,419.00 $110,073.48 Esna,u 7.50 No Bid Non-Responaive
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IFB #15-0088-DC

2014 GROUP 3 REHABS
Veranda Springs - RTU 541
(3708 Asbury Drive - Ellenton)
TR T 3 4 ] L3 [
P U.8 Waler Servicas Granger Meuntanance & Const. RTD Construction Eciipsa Construction GECM!UHS Water Scfutions of SWFL
BID "A 4835 Croas Bayoy Boulevard 611 E Sam Aflen Road 38038 North Averce 2930 Parkway Street 1751 1201 Stroet East 1600 Rusasl Avenus
150 CALENDAR DAYS MP;Q.M.H.W Plant City, FL 33863 Zaphyrhilg, Fl. 23642 Lakeland, FL 33811 Palmatto, FL 34221 Sarasota, FL 34232
o oy S— (- W [Serascts
Ham Unit Exisnded Esdanded nit Uinit Extanded Unit ded Unit Exdended
No. | Line item uM | aly Price Price Price Price Price Prica Price Price Price Prica Price Price
Cleani SF | 518 $4.12 $2,12592 $4.00 §2,06400]  §14.00 $7224.00 $8.00 $4,128.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
F] E DR-11 HOPE Ig'_iglg LF | &8 $45.32 $2.881.12 .00 $3,960.00 $185.00 $10,880.00 134.00 $8,844.00 No Bid Non-Rasponsive
3 .14 Bese Els EA | 2 1,035.15 $2,070.30 _$600.00 $1,800.00 $727.00 $1454.00 | $1,130.00 $2,260.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
4 I-. Mounting Plate EA | 2 ,190.68 $2,381.38 $500.00 $1,800.00 $878.00 $1.752.00| $1,350.00 $2,700.00 No Bid Non-Responsh
§ §8.S Pipe Bracng @ 1. di EA | 3 J4845] $3.44535 $600.00 $1,800.00 $758.00 $2.274.00 | $1.030.00 $3,080.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
8 [Ralse g Wetwsll Top Siab vF | 07 #&ml } $1.424.50§ $2.600.00{ $1,750.00 | $5.837.00 $4,085.80 | $5485.00 * $3,825.50 No Bid Non-Responsive
_wm Wetwell Top Slab EA | 1 $1.761.00 $1,761.00]  §2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2.107.00 $2,107.00 | $5,675.00 $5,6875.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
3 J4" PVC Venl, Schadule 80 EA | 1 $360.50 $360.50 $400.00 $400.00 $763.00 $763.00 $355.00 $355.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
] minum Haich Cover, 35"x48", Singls Door [Welwel EA | 1 $927.00 $627.00) §1,200.00 §1,200,00 $799.00 §799.00 | §1,215.00 $1,215.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
10_§2" 5.8, Pump Guide Rall Sysiem LF | 48 $142.14 $6,864.85 $85.00] $3,185.00 $54.00 $2,646.00 §72.00 $3,628.00 No 8id Non-Responsive
11_§Lef Intertiamally Blonk
_12_|Wetwell Linsr, Spray-Gn SF_] 487 $18.00] $8,766.00 $24.00] $11,688.00 $18.00 $8,786.00 $23.00 | $11,201.00 No Bid Non-Respansive
13 Abandon EA | 1 $150.00{ $150.00 umg' $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $335.00 Nao Bid Non-Responsive
14 Gats Valve EA | 3 $498.00| $1,484.00 $800.001 $2,400.00 $543.00 $1.628.00 3770 $2.310.00 Na Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 2 $1,380.00 $2,738.00 |  $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $876.00 $1.952.00|  $1.100.00f $2,200.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
LF | & $107.00 $535.00 $100.00 $80000%  $193.00 $965.00 $270.00) $1,350.00 No Bid on-Responsive
L8 | 210 $20.00 $4,200.00 $6.00 $1,850.00 $7.00 $1,470.00 $18.00 $3,780.00 No Bld Non-Reaponsiva
EA | 1 152.00 $152.00 $250.00 s25000]  $277. $277.00 $230.00 $230.00 No Bid Non-Reaponsive
Quick Caupler Adapter EA | 1 140.00] §140.00 §250.00 $250.00 §143.00 $143.00 $165.00 $165.00 No Bid Non-Respansive
20 I5.8. Adjustable Vaive Supparts, Flange Attachment EA | 3 $210.00) $830.00 §300.00 $800.00 $374.00 $1,122.00 m.cgi & $1,365.00 No Bld Non-Responsive
21 Valve Vaull, Abandon s |1 n.m.nnl §$3,880.00 $500. $500.00 | §2,540.00 $2540.00] $2,530.00 $2 530.00 No Bid Non-Re ¥
= Interdionafly Blank
23_[LeR infertionetly Blank
24 |Concrete Siab, Valve Assembly s [ 1 §700.00] $700.00 | $1,532.00 $1,532.00 |  §1,.395.00] $1,395.00 No Bid Non-Res
25 [4° Gate Valve, MJ _ EA | 1 $750.00 $750.00 $954.00 $854.00 | $1,380.00 $1,380.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
28 _|4" PVC Pips {€800) {Crosa/Tea io Plug Velve) IF | 6 $50.00 $300.00 $263.00 $1,578.00 $39.00 $234.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
27 8" Influent Line Plug EA | 1 X $400.00 $400.00 §852.00 $852.00 $425.00 $425.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
28 |By-Pass Pumping, <500 GPM s | 1 $5,000. $5,000.00 | $3,500.00 §3,500.00 | $11,368.00 $11,368.00 | $8,600.00 $8,660.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
F] LS 1 [5] $878.00 $300.00 $300.00| $1,034.00 $1,034.00 $800.00 $800.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
30 EA | 1 $985.00 $095.00 | $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $800.00 $900.00] $2,600.00 $2,800.00 No Bid Non-Reaponsiva
EA [ 1 $2,638.00 $2,636.00 000.00 $4,000.00 |  §3,200.00 $3,20000 ] $5,610.00 $5.610.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
EA | 1 $6,059.00 $8,055.00 | $12,000.00 §12,000.00 | $12,578.00 §12,578.00 | $14,750.00 $14,750.00 No Bid Non-Respanaive
LF | 18 $159.73 §2,305.65 $40.00 $600.00 $16.00 $24000 ]  $420.00 $8,300.00 No Bid Non-Respansive
LF_| 15 175.73' $2,635.85 $100.00 $1,500.00 $27.00 $405.00 $345.00 $5,176.00 No Bid Non-Responaive
EA 1 $2.636.00 $2636.00 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 | $2.425.00 $2426.00 ) $3,286.00 $3,285.00 No 8id Non-Responsive
$74,397.81 $70,987.00 $80,024.90 $111.730.50 No Bid Non-Responsive |
s | 1 $1,848.00 $6,500.00 $6,000.00 $8,380.00 No Bid Nor- i
38 Riiscaliansous Work, Clean Up & Restoration s | 1 §2,750.00 $4,500.00 $12,040.00 $4,625.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
38 JRecord Drawing s [ 1 $1,120.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $1,980.00 No Bid Non-Responsive
Total Construction Cost (8id ftams 1 - 39 $80,015.81 $83,887.00 $107,214.90 $126,735.50 No Bid Non-Responsive
—_JContmat Used only with Courly Approval) % ] 10 | §8,001.58 $8,398.70 $10.721.48 $12,673.55 No Bid Non-Responsive
|Bld "A" - Veranda Springs lL&Sﬂ.Oﬁ' 39 $62,385.70 $117,936.38 *5138.409.05 No Bid Non-Responsive
‘age &« 41312015




