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SOLICITATION IFB #15-1599BLS AUT"'OR'ZE[? ?E ] k

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid (IFB) 15-1599BLS, Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole
Rehabilitation Services (as required) to multiple lowest responsive, responsible bidders by group.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances,
resolutions, policy.

Manatee County Code of Laws

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

» ltis the intent of the County to establish an agreement to procure, on an “as required” basis Sanitary Sewer Systems,
Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole Rehabilitation Services. The proposed work may include, but not limited to,
6"-72" Cured in Place (CIPP), TV inspection and computerized analysis, smoke testing, trenchless reconstruction,
manhole, and lateral rehabilitation which may include cleaning and inspection, sewage bypass pumping, reestablishing
service connections, maintenance of traffic, surface restoration and any associated work required to complete a project
in accordance with this IFB specification. The underground infrastructure includes underground sewer and stormwater
lines, manholes / wet wells throughout the County.

» The County solicited bids for Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole Rehabilitation Services
(as required). Notice of IFB 15-1599BLS was solicited on MyManatee.org, Manatee County Chamber, and to 42
planholders on Demand Star.

» Formal competitive sealed bid procedures were followed resulting in seven (7) bids (see attachment).

» Group 4 — The County is not awarding Group 4 due to a unit of measure error on the bid form which prevented viable
bids. The County will issue a new IFB solicitation for Group 4 only.

» BLD Services, LLC, Insituform Technologies, LLC, and Lanzo Trenchless Technologies exceeded the maximum 5%
markup on mobilization and demobilization and therefore have been deemed non-responsive in Groups 1, 2, and 3.

» February 16, 2016, received letters from William Elmore, Utilities Supervisor and Paul D. Smith, Public Works Division
Manager - Field Maintenance recommending awards for Groups 1, 2, and 3.

ATTACHMENTS FUNDING SOURCE ]

(List in order of attached) » tabulation (Acct Number & Name) Funds Verified

[] Insufficient Funds

Various Account
Annual Estimate AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING COSTS Numbers (Sanitary,
COST $1,700,000.00 (Attach Fiscal Impact Statement) Storm & Manhole Rehab)
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Agenda
February 23, 2016 - Regular Meeting

Category
B. CONSENT AGENDA

Sub-Category
Financial Management

Approval Path
FM (Purchasing-Dennis)

Subject
IFB 15-1599BLS, Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line & Manhole Rehabhilitation Services

Briefings
Naone

Contact and/or Presenter Information

Bonnie Sietman, Sr. Buyer, FMD, Purchasing Division, x3046

Rob Shankle, Division Manager, Utilities, Underground Maintenance, x5275
Paul "Danny" Smith, Division Manager, Public Works, Maintenance, x7494

Action Requested

Authorization to award Invitation for Bid (IFB) 15-1599BLS, Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line
and Manhole Rehabilitation Services to multiple responsive, responsible bidders by group as indicated.

GROUP 1 - Sanitary Sewer & Stormwater
1) ITV Incorporated, St. Petersburg, FL

2) GML Coatings LLC, Lakewood Ranch, FL
3) Hinterland Group Inc., Riviera Beach, FL
4) VacVision Environmental LLC, Tampa, FL

GROUP 2 - Sanitary Sewer Systems
1} Hinterland Group Inc.

GROUP 3 - Line & Manhole Rehabilitation

1) GML Coatings LLC, Lakewood Ranch, FL

2) Hinterland Group Inc., Riviera Beach, FL
3) VacVision Environmental LLC, Tampa, FL

Enabling /Regulating Authority
Manatee County Code of Laws

Background Discussion

It is the intent of the County to establish an annual agreement to procure, on an "as required" basis, Sanitary
Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole Rehabilitation Services, The underground infrastructure
includes underground sewer and stormwater lines, manholes / wet wells throughout the County. The proposed
work may include, but not be limited to, 6"-72" Cured In Place Pipe (CIPP), TV inspection and computerized
analysls, smoke testing, trenchless recenstruction, manhole, and lateral rehabilitation which may include cleaning
and inspection, sewage bypass pumping, reestablishing service connections, maintenance of traffic, surface
restoration and any associated work required to complete a project in accordance with the Invitation for Bid.

The County solicited bids for Sanitary Sewer Systems, Stormwater Systems, Line and Manhole Rehabilitation
Services. Notice of IFB 15-1599BLS was solicited on MyManatee.org, Manatee County Chamber, and Demand Star.
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Formal competitive sealed bid procedures were followed resulting in seven (7) blds as identified on the attached bid
tabulation.

County Attorney Review
Not Reviewed {No apparent legal issues)

Explanation of Other

Reviewing Attorney
N/A

Instructions to Board Records
Please send a stamped approved copy of this item to:
pgumg.siﬂman@mymanatge.org

Cost and Funds Source Account Number and Name

Sanitary, Storm, Manhole Rehab {various account numbers); Estimated annual budgets: Utilities - stormwater
laterials, manholes, main line lining - $1,200,000; Public Works - sanitary sewer - $500,000;

Amount and Frequency of Recurring Costs

N/A

Attachments: (list)

Ltr recommendation, Ltr recommendation, IFB 15-15998L§§anitary Sewer
Public Works.pdf Utilities.pdf Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab
Serv.pdf

Close Edit Delete

Bennie Sietman - (} log out
Role : Item Author

Version: 1.2.1.3 - 1.2.7.5 © 2002-2016, Idea Integration Corp.
All Rights Reserved

2of2 2/17/2016 3:41 PM



RID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS Lanzo Trenchless
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation i BLD Services, LLC Hinterland Group, Inc. | Insituform Technologies,{ J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South || VacVision Environmental
Services) Kenmer, E.A L1.C Chesterfield, MO St.Petersburg, FL Deerfield, FL LLC Tampa, FL
Est.
Anoual f Uit of Estended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Description ] Q4 Memr B uleir B DB R TS SRS e S
GROUP | - SECTION A =5
ITARY TORMWATER
Sewer Line Cleaning and Inspection, ===

1 Ingl-lt Cleaning 6" 10 127 _|diameter | 10000 $0.00 | N RID 13'! T 50508  sp0000fs  Liols nidaudn $1.00 |5 10,000.00 $5.00 'S 30,000.00 $180 1% Jupenag
14" to 18" |diameter | 8000 so00| NOBID B S ] S0.60 | S 4,800.00 1 S 240 |5 19200.00 $200|5  16.000.00 $5.00 | §  40,000.00 $200|5  16,000.00

20" to 24" ldiameter | 8000 $0.00{ NOBID v EE / $1.00|5  800000(S 3205 25600.00 $3.0015  24,000.00 $4.00 |5  32,000.00 520015  16,000.60

27" to 42" |diameter | 3000 50.00| NOBID S | $2.00 | § 6,000.00 || § 5205  15,600.00 $400 |5  12,000.00 $9.00 |5 27,000.00 52.00 | S 6,000.00

43" 054" latameter | 3000 Jiinenr foot $0.00| NOBID Wil s s3ons  opmnoo|ls 910|s 2730000) s13.00]s  39,000.00 $12.00 | S 36,000.00 52008 600000

>84%  |ammeter | 2000 Junear ot $0.00] NoBID § Is s400|s  800000](S 1430]S 2860000| si500}S  30,000.00 $24.00 | §  48,000.00 33005  6,000.00

, ]

2_|Medium Cleaning 6" to 12" |diameter | 10000 hinesrmoc B $0.00 | NOBID — : s200|s 2000000} 210)S  21.000.60 $1.00 (5  10,000.00 54.00 [ 40,000.00 $2.00 |5 20,000.00
14" to 187 14 5000 _[tinear foot t s0.00] NoBID | | j 5200 |5 10000008 2605  13.000.00 52.00 |5 10,000.00 $6.00 [ 5 30,000.00 $3.00 | §  15,000.00

20" to 24" Jdi 5000 _[linear foot $0.00 | NOBID = | $250|% 12500001 390fS  19.50.00 $3.00|S  15000.80 $8.00 1S  40,000.00 54.00 |5 20,000.00

277 10 42" |dlameter | 3000 Jiinear foot 3000 | NOBID 3 | $3.00 18 900000flS  7.80 |5 2340000 $4.00 |5 12,000.00 §10.00 | 3 38,000.00 $7.00 [$  21,000.00

43" to 54" |diameter | 3000 Iﬁ.rm so00 | NOBID § == s400|5 12000000 1070 |§ 3510000 $13.00]8  39,000.00 $1400 8 4200000 $13.00 | S 39,000.00

> 54" |.u..,..m | 2000 |unear foot 50.00 | NOBID s |3 I $500|8 1000000l 1690{% 3380000 sisoe|s  30,000.00 $32.00 | §  64,000.00 52000 ]S 40,000.00

3 [Heavy Cleaning 6" 10 12" _|dismeter | 1 E I _ s400|s 20000.00; 8 230|5 11,500.00 5200 |8  10,000.00 S8.00 15  40,600.00 (8520018  10,000.00
14" to 18" |diameter | oy $40008 2000000}/ 25008  14.500.00 53.0008  15000.00 $12.00 | $  60,000.00 55005  25.000.00

20" to 24" |diameter ST |3 ol $400|8 20,000.00 | § 4208 21.000.04 $4.00 | § 20,000.00 $16.00 | $ 80,000.00 §7.00] 8§ 35,000.00

27" to 42" |diameter Y ss00)S 15000005 840)%  25200.00f $10.00 | S 30,000.00 $24.00 |8 72,000.00 $1200 S 36,000.00

43" to 54 |diameter =3 == 5600 S 12000005 13.00)s 26000.00| $1800]S  36,000.00 $44.00 | §  88,000.00 $25.00 [ 50.000.00

>54"  Jdiameter i — ' $7.00]s  7o000ufs 21405 2140000 52500 s 25,000.00 $80.00 | §  80,000.00 54000 |$  40,000.00

4 |Root Removal 6" to 12" _|diameter | 3008 Ig.g_rfm - 5000] NOBID | : = S4.00}S  12,000.00 f 5 520 |8  15600.00 $1.00 | § 3,000.00 $5.00 | 15,000.00 $2.00 | S 6,000.00
147 0 18" Jdiamoter | 3000 finearfoor k. $0.00 | NOBID | s 5600 |§ 38000.0ufl5  7s80(s  23.400.00 5200 |5 6,000.00 $10.00 |5 30,000.00 52005  6,000.00

20" ta 24" 3000 Junearfoor 5000 NOBID | - 58.00 |§  24,00000(s 970]s  29.100.00 53008 900000 $15.00 [ S 45,000.00 $3.00]8  9,000.00

27" to 42" ldiameter { 3000 lllnnrl’ooi 30.60 NO EID i 1K $10.00 | § 30,000.00 || § 19501 5 58.500.08 §4.00 § S 12,000.00 $20.00 | 8 60,000.00 $5.00 )% 15,000.00

43" fo 54" 2000 _Jiinear foot $0.00 | NOBID B 510.00 [$  20.00000[(S 2590|S 51800000 $12.00[S  24,000.00 $25.00 |5 50,000.00 $7.00 |§  14,000.00

> 54" i 2600 _fiinear foot § sueo] NoBm F = s1400 {8 2800000 376005  7520000f $1500[5  30,000.00 §50.00 |5 100,000.00 $7.00 |5 _ 14,000.00

5_|Tuberculation 6" to 12" |dtameter | 3000 fiinear foot s0.00 | NOBID Wy 3 $10.00 {5 30,00000fl$ 11705 35100.00) $18.00]% 5400000  $20.00 |$  60,000.00 $20.00 [§  60,000.00
14" to 18" I 1% $12.00 | § 360000048 1560} 85 46.800.01 52000 $ 60,000.00 $30.00 | § 90,000.00 52700 § 51,000.00

au.....m 5 [ $16.00 |8 3200000018 2330($ 46600000 s2500)s  50,000.00 540.00 [ 80,000.00 $3500|s  70,000.00

27" to 42" Jdiameter = X $20.00 | §  20,000.00||$ 31.10|$  3L100.00]  $28.00§  28.000.00 560.00 | $  60,000.00 560.00 | $  60,000.00

43" to 54" fdiameter = $2000 [ 2000000/ 3890 [§  38.900.04F $30.00[S  30.000.00 $90.00 | S 90,000.00 $70.00 |5 70,000.00

>54"  |diameter I $2000|$ 40000005 70.00]§ 14000000 s3500]$  70.000.00|  $120.00 | $  240,000.00 580.00 |5 160,000.00

6_|Mechanical Cutting 6" to 12" _[diameter | 3000 Junear foot $0.00 | NOBID 1N Il §10.00|5  30,000.00[|S 520|S 1560000 $6.00 | $  18,000.00 52000 [ 8 60,000.00 $20.00 |$  60,000.00
14" 10 18" |a seo0] NOBID | sisu|§ 512005  3600000ls  780|s  23,400.00 $8.00 [$  24,000.00 $30.00 [ §  90,000.00 $20.00 [$  60,000.00

20" to 24" |diameter $0.00 NO BID o 1y - $16.00 | § 16,000.00 | § 18.20 | § 18,200.00 $10.00 | § 10,000.00 $40.00 | § 40,000.00 520.00 | § 20,000.00

27" to 42" |diameter 50.00 NO BID £l . 32000 | 5 20,000.00 /{5 2850|8§ 28.500.00 §15.00 | § 15,000.00 $60.00 | § 60.000.00 520.00 18 20,000.00

43" to 54" di 50.00 NOBID § i = $2000 |8 200000048 41501 § 41.500.00 $18.00 | § 18,000.00 $90.00 | § 90,000.00 $20.00 | 8 20,600.00

>54"  diameter | 2000 [tinear foot ol NomMp | s 2 szo0]s 400000003 752005 158408001 s20.00]5 4000000 $12000{S 240,000.00 5200015 40,000.00

IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx




BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS Lanss Trenchion
(Samitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation ' BLD Services, LLC | GML Coatlugs, LLC | Hinterland Group, Inc. || Insituform Technologies, |  J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South | VacVision Environmental
Services) Kenner. LA kewood Rune Riviera Beach, FL LLC Chesterfield, MO St.Petershurg, FL Deerfield, FL LLC Tampa, FL
Est.
Amual]  Unit of Extended L e Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Description Size Messure § Pricing || Pricing | Prichs Pricin |_Pricing | Pricing Pricing || Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing
'ass Pum, .
7 ]8" - 54" diameters | $0.00 | NOBID $400[S  400000)[s 160[S 160000 $0.75 |5 750.00 54.00 (S 4,000.00 SLOO[S  1,000.00
8~ seo0| NOBID § s4.00 |5 12,00000{s 160[S S100|S  3,000.00 5400 |5  12,000.00 | 51.00[S  3,000.00
10" sooa| wNOBID | 00)S  1200000}S  320fS _ 9.600.00 SL.00[S 300000 $4.00 | S 12,000.00 51.00|S  3,000.00
12" ar foot sooo| NoBID § = s400|5 1200000l S570|s  17.100.00 s2.50 |8 7,500.00 $4.00 S 12,000.00 sLoo|s  3,000.00
15" sewer fow| 4000 finescfoot | $0.00] NOBID § = $500 |5 20,00000[S 9.10]S5 3640000 53.00 |8 12,000.00 s10.00 ]S  40,00000]  s200|s 800008
13" sewer fiow] 4000 _Jilnear foot $0.00| NOBID 1% $500|S  2000000[S 1430]$5 5720000 54.00 [$  16,000.00 S10.00 |8 40,000.00 $2.00 |5 800000
20 sewer flow] 4000 [inear foot 5000 NOBDD | =T 5500 |5  20,00000[(S 20.10}S  80.400.00 $7.00 | S 28,000.00 S10.00 [ §  40,000.00 52008  8,000.00
24" sewer flow] 4000 |u..mm se.00| NOBID | g s1z00[$  48000.00[l5 3240]S 129,600.00 $8.00 [ 32,000.00 $10.00 | S 40.000.00 53005  12,000.00
flow] 4000 [unesrfoot § 5000 NOBID | i 1200 | 4800000|s  3890[S 15560000 $15.00 S  60,000.00 $20.00 | S 80,000.00 $3.00 |5 12,000.00
ow] 1000 |unear foot sogo| NOBID | LI s2000($ 2000000]|S 519005 51.900.60| $1500 (5  15,000.00 54000 | S 40,000.00 $10.00 |S  10,000.00]
j. so00| NOBID sout ]S 520005  2000000[|S 6480 ]S 64800.06| $20.00 (S  20,000.00 $60.00 |5 60,000.00 $3000 |S  30,000.00
1000 _funesr foot so.00| NOBID f = $20.00|S  20,00000{lS 7780 |5  77.800.00| $2000 S  20,000.00 $80.00 | S  80,000.00 $40.00|S  40,000.00
1000 Juneac foot | 50.00| NOBID = = 0.00 |5 20,00000|S 90.50 |§ 9080000 s$2500|S  2500000( $12000}S 120,000.00 $50.00 |S  50,000.00
>54" $0.00| NOBID ) 1 _s2000[s 2000000\ 120705 12970000 s28.00]s 28000.00( s240.00 (S 240,000.00 $60.00|S _ 60,000.00
[Pump Set-Up 4 5 [pereach so0] NoBiD § 4 $750.00 | $ 375000 (5 1,037.00 [§ 518500 $100.00 [ 500.00 | $800.00 [$  4.,000.00) 51000005  5000.00
6" ump 5 each so.00| NoBID | = s750.00 [ §  3,750.00 |5 1.037.00 [S 518500 s20000|S  1,000.00 $1,20000|S  600000( $1,20000]5  6,000.00
8 um 5 |pereacn sooo| NOBID § 51 $  5000.00)i$ 1,037.00]$ 5185001 $300.00|%5 150000 $1,600.00]|5  8000.00 || $2.000.00|§ _10.000.00
T um 5 each so.00] NOBID | 120000 [§  6.000.00}is 1,037.00|S 518500 s4s000{s 225000 s240000|S  12,000.00 00 |§  15000.00
12" 5 cach s0.00] mNOBID f 150000 [§  7.500.00 (S 1,037.00 [s  5185.00( s60000|S  3,00000) $320000(% 1600000 $4,000.00|S  20,000.00
¢ |Pum ration (per hour / per pump) _|4" |pump 6 |nour 50.00 | NOBI ) \ $500.00 | 300000 |3 65000 (5 390000 s3s00]s 210.00 §80.00 | S 480001 $25000 (S  1500.00
le ump 6 __|nour $0.00| NOBID = $500.00 |§ 300000 §5 65000 |[$  3.900.00( $45.00]$ 270.00 $80.00 | 480001 $350.00]S  2,100.00
Isn_ ump 6__|nour $0.00 |  NOBID s g $50000 [S 30000005 65000[s  3900.00] s$sso0fs 330.00 $80.00 | § 480.00 ][ 50000 | S 3,000.00
T up 6 |bonr $0.00] NOBID | = 550000 |8 3000005 65000]S  3.900.00| s65.00]% 390.00 $80.00 | 480.00| 500005  3,000.00
12% [pump 6 Itour so.00] m~oBID | = sse0.00 [ 300000 {5 65000 ]S  3.90000| $75.00 % 450.00 $80.00 | 48000 $500.00 |$ ___3,000.00
10 |TV Inspection - Sewer Lateral _ o
Lateral Inspection 0' to 30' 10 each s0.00| NOBID § — 5350.00 [$  3500.00((S 27200|S 272000 s45000 S 4500.00( 542008 |S  420000[ §75000(S  7,500.00
Additional Lateral Inspection > 30" 10 [inear foot 50.00] NOBID | = $10.00 | § 10000/  170]S 17.00 s150s 15.00 52000 | § 200.00 52500 [ § 250.00
Lateral Cleaning 5000 [iinear foot seo0| NoOBID_ § = $1.00|S  500000((s 410]S 2050000 $3.00 S 15,000.00 $7.00|S 3500000 S 2500000
11 |TV Pipe Ini ion (<10,000 linear ft) 3 1 |
6" to 12" diameter 1000 $0.00 NO BID ‘-T_' = §1.00 | § 1,000;0_0 $ 10018 1,000.00 S1O0 | S 1,000.00 $2.00 1§ 2,000.00 $3.00 $ 3,000.00
14" to 18" diameter 8000 $0.00 NOBID § — §1.25} 5% lﬂ,ﬂﬂﬂﬂ 3 13018 10,400.00 _32.00!% 16,000.00 $3.0018 24,000.00 $3.00¢5§ 24,000.00
20" to 24" dismeter 5000 s000| NoBID [ i 5200 [5  1000000)iS  240]S  12.000.00 $225|5  11,250.00 $5.00 [ 25,000.00 53.00[§  15,000.00
37" to 54" diameter 2000 $600] NOBID | L = 3.0015  600000|(5 290|s 580000 52508 5,000.00 $7.00 | 14,000.00 $3.00 |8 6,000.00
43" to 54" diameter 2000 se00| NOBID | sx7sls $4.00{S  800000)s 390|5  7.800.00 53.00|$  6,000.00 59.00 |  18,000.00 $3.00{$S  6000.00
>54" diameter 2000 so00| NommD § = $5005  10,000.00S 420[5 840000 5350 [$  7,000.00 $13.00 | $  26,000.00 $3.00|S  6,000.00
Additional Set-Up 1 so.00] NoBID | = $500.00 | $ 500.00|(s 65000 S 65000 s2s00]s 25.00 s 200000] s7s060]s 750.00
12 |Smoke Testin, e
Smoke Testin ] | 5000 funesr foot s000| NOBID | sasEls s025]s  1,25000{$  0.60]S  3,000.00 5100 {5 500000 $5.00 | S 25.000.00 sioofs 000.00
TOTAL - GROUP 1, SECTION A NO BID s ﬂs 1,072,650.0/ Is‘ 2,297,412.00 $ 1,234,940.00 | §_3,422.800.00 H § 1.621,100.00
(items 1-12)

IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xilsx



IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx

BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS Lanzo I renchicss
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation BLD Services, LLC | GAML Costings LLC | Hinterland Group, Inc. || Insituform Technologies, ||  J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South VacVision Environmental
Services) Kenner, LA cowood Ranch, | Risiern Beach, FL LLC Chesterfield, MO St.Petersburg, FL Deerfield, FL LLC Tampa, FL
Est. il §
Anmal | Usit of Extended Extendesd Extended Extended Extended Extended
Description Size Measure | Prici Pricin | Pricing | Pricin Pricin Pricing Pricing ici P Pricin, Fricing Pricing
GROUP 1, SECTION B
Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater Systems
Line Rehabilitation - Method 1
-In-Place-Pi
1 Sanitary Sewer Mains == —
[5.0mm normal thickness (.197) | Jaiameter | 5000 funear soot $0.00| NOBID il 336.00 |5 18000000l 3070 |S 15350000 $35.00 S 175.000.00 $64.00 | 5 320,000.00 545.00 | §
2 Sanitary Sewer Mains F .
[7.5mm normal thickmess (.295) [ laiameter | 10000 Junear foot se.0] NoBD | sanisls $26.00 | S 260,000.00[(S 3240 ]S 324.00000) s25.00 S  250,080.00 $32.00 S  320,000.00 $32.00 | S 320,000.00
3 Sanitary Sewer Mains ‘ :
[7.5mm normal thickness (.295) {10 Jatameter | 8000 lunear foot se.00|] NoBID | | = $32.00|S 25600000)(S 3750 (s 300.00000] s2500(s  200,000.00 $36.00 |5 288.000.00 $35.00 [ S 280,000.00
4 Sanitary Sewer Mains ‘
{9.0mm normal thickness (354 J2n Joiameter | 8000 funear foot $0.00| NOBID $3800[§ 304000.00(8 43.90]% 35120000 $37.00|S 296,000.00 $44.00 [ 8 352,000.00 530.00 [$  312,000.00
5 Sanitary Sewer Mains
|9.0mm normal thickness (.354) Jas~ Jatsmeter { 5000 [nnear foot so.00 | NOBID $4800(5 24000000((5 6340]S 317,000.00| $4500]S 225000.00 566.00 [ §  330.000.00 $60.00 | S 300,000.00
6 Sanitary Sewer Mains
[10.5mm normal thickness (413) Jas~ Jammeter | 5000 funesroot f  S0.00 | NO B ofs s56.00 |S  280,000.00||s 8340 |S 417.00000] sssee|s 275000.00 $80.00 | S 400,000.00 $80.00 | 400,000.00
7 Sanitary Sewer Mains L= .
12.0mm normal thickness (472) Br" Tatametsr | 5000 finesctoor | 50.00] NOBID | Swke0]3 Seseoeie] 75005 37500000 11250]5 56250000 $7500]s 37500000 $96.00]5 48000000 ] seso0]s 00
8 Sanitary Sewer Mains
13.5mm normal thickness (.531) |34- aismeter | 1500 |inear foot 5000 NOBID | Ssiosen|s 585.00 |8  127.500.00 5 13080 |S 19620000 s9s00fS 142,500.00! si24.00 S 18600000 $130.00 |5  195.000.00
15.0mm normal thickness (.591) . diameter | 1500 imear oot 5000 woBID | ey 586.00 | S 12900000 §5  137.00|S 20550000 s$105.00[$ 15750000 s134.00]$ 201,000.00 s135.00 (S  202,500.00
9 Samitary Sewer Mains !_ S +
13.5mm normal thickness (.531) 277 giameter | 2000 Junear foot 5000] NOBID | 3 s W { si0000]s 200000.00((s 14090 ]S 281800.00] s12500{s 250,00000] si2s5.00]s 25000000 s13500]S 270,000.00
15.0mm normal thickuess (.591) a7 diameter | 2000 Juncar toot 50.00[ NOBID 510000 |5 200000005 147405 294800.00] si13000]s 260000.00] s13500]S 270,000.00| s141.00[S 282,000.00
10 Sanitary Sewer Mains
[15.0mm normal thickness (591) [30" [dismeter | 2000 [unear foot J | 14500 |3 290,000.00|S 16150 |S 32300000} s145.00]$ 290,000.00| $160.00|$ 320,00000 || $14500]S  290,000.00
11 Sanitary Sewer Mains
16.5mm normal thickness (.650) 36" Jasameter | 1000 |llnnrlwt s0.00 | NoBID 1 5185008  185000.00 s 20650 [$ 20650000 $165.00|S 16500000 s200.00]S 200,00000| s165.00 [$  165,000.00
18.0mm normal thiclness (.709) 36" Jtameter | 1000 funenr soot s6.00{ NOBID § = 518500 [ 18500000 (s 21980 {5 219800.00| si170.00]$ 170.000.00] s220.00]S 220,000.00| s175.00 S  175,000.00
12 Sanitary Sewer Mains _ ke
|16.5mm normal thickness (.650) 427 dismeter | 1000 foot 50.00| NOBID 2 522500 |5 22500000 (S 23500 S 235000.00| si170.00|s 170.000.00) s260.00 |5 260.000.00 | s230.00|S  230,000.00
18.0mm normal thickness (.709) 42 dismeter | 1000 [tinear foot s0.00] NoBID § 1 5225.00 | § 00[[s 25040 |5 250.400.00| sis0.00|S5 180,000.00 5280.00[5 00  5250.00 |5 250,000.00
13 Sanitary Sewer Mains { —— =
16.5mm normal thickness (.650) 48" aiameter | 1000 |unear foot 5000 NOBID | sasim|s 524500 |$ 24500000 /S 27180 [ 27180000 $190.00[%5 15000000 $350.00|$ 35000000 s255.00 ]S 255000.00
18.0mm normal thickness (.709) 48" dtameter | 1000 |nnear soot seos! NoBip | sied00|3s  Iee00000 S 24500000)'S 291.00{S 329100000 $20000|5 20000000] $370.0{S 370,000.00 S 285800.60




BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS : e Tramchlies
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, ”ne & Manhole Rehabilitation i BLD Services, LLC ':' ] s, : [nsituform Technologies, || J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South VacVision Environmental
Services) Kenner, LA . 4 Han Riviera Beach, FL LLC ' MO St.Petersburg, FL Deerfleld, FI. LLC Tampa, FL
= —-—— - = — ——
Amnual§  Unit of ‘ Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Description Size Qty | Measre § Pricing § _ Priki Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing {| Pricing || Pricing || Pricing || Pricing || _Pricing
14 Sanitary Sewer Mains
{16.5mm normal thickness (.650) 54" diameter | 1000 |inear foot § 5 39500000 || 32520]8 325200.00) $355.00)5 355000.00 $500.00 | §  500,000.00 $325.00 | 8 325,000.00
18.0mm normal thickness (.709) 54" dismeter | 1000 Il.l.nur foot § 39500000 (S 34350 |5 343.500.00( 5370.00}§ 3T .00 $600.00 | §  600,000.00 $350.00 | § _ 350,000.00
[>84" ‘mm | 1000 Ihnr foot s $660.00 | § 0il €300 00
TOTAL - GROUP 1, SECTION B s .00 % 7,157, i LS
(items 1-15)
R CTION C
Sanitary Sewer ter Systems
Line Rdlahgtmni Bl"’lﬁ Pumnini
1 [Tanker truck tank 4,000 gallon espacity] 5 [perioad : o FE 6,000.0 $50000 [s 250008 ;-EMIS_EM 51,000.00 |§  5000.00
2 |Standard service reconnection 5 each 5 1,250.00 $400.00 | § 2,000.00 $260.00 | S 1,300.00
3 uting 5 |pereach b 1,250.00 5800.60 | § 4,000.00 $300.00 | § 1,500.00
4 Lateral reinstatement cutting of defective =
lateral openi 5 each s 1,925.00 )| $400.00 | S 2,000.00 | $500.00 | § 2,500.00
5 |Trenchless lateral cleaning and
reconstruction system up to 30 linear feet 50 |unear foot 3 0.00( $600.00 |$ 30,000.00| 510500 |S 5.250.00
6 |Trenchiess lateral cleaning and
|reconstruction system over 30 linear feet 50  |inear foot H 4.000.00 $70.00 | § 3,500.00 $105.00 | S 5,250.00
7 [Full wrap at main and 24" up connection _ 200 _Jper cach 5 380.000.00 [ 54,900.00 |'s_ 980.000.00 || 52.000.00 s 40000000
8 Additional; clean out installation up to 4'
deep, grassed area 10 |peresch 0.0 § __ 17,000.00 || $3,000.00 |5  30,000.00 | $1,700.00 | §  17,000.00
9 Additional; clean out installation greater
than 4' deep grassed area i er each $0.00 $142000) § 2,840.00 |{ $3,000.00 | § 6,000.00 || $4,000.00 | S 8,000.00 $4,00000 | S 8,000.00
10 Additional; clean out installation up to 4'
deep, paved area 10 each $0.00 $143500) %  14,350.00/52,500.00 | §  25000.00 || $5,000.00 | S  50,000.00 || 52.500.00 | §  25,000.00
1 Additional; clean out installation greater
than 4' deep, paved area 3 each $0.00 1181000} ¢ 00 1$3,700.00 | § 1110000 | $6.000.00 | §  18,000.00 || $7.000.00 | $  21,000.00
TOTAL - GROUP 1, SECTION C ) L o 5 454,025.00 Ls_1,147,500.00. [Ls__491,800.00
(items 1-11) i
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BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS

i

(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation | BLD Services, LLC
Services) Kenner, LA
Est,
Annual}  Unitof Extended
Description size | ou | mesowe § Pricing | _Pric
ROU. CTION D
Sanitary Sewer Joint Air Testing,
Joint i ateral Grow
1 [Lateral Grouting, 6” dia, sanitary sewer _[Qty <50 20 feach $0.00] NOBID

1 |Lateral Grouting, 6” dia, sanitary sewer |Qty > 50 20 |each $0.00 NO BID
3 |Lateral Grouting, 8-12" dia, sanitary lew::Flry <50 20 Jeach $0.00| NOBID
4 Grouting, 8-12” dia, sanitary sewer|Qty > 50 20 [fesch $0.00 NO BID
5 |Joint Testing, 6-15” dia, sanitary sewer <50 20 feach $0.00 | NOBID
6 |Joint Testing, 6-15” dia, sanitary sewer _ |Qty > 50 20 [esch $0.00 | NOBID
7 |Joint Grouting, 6” sanitary sewer Qty <50 20 [esch $0.00 { NOBID
8 |Joint Groufing, 6™ dia, sanitary sewer Qty > 50 20 |each $0.00 | NOBID
9 |Joint Grouting, 8” dia, sanitary sewer Qty <50 20 feach 50.00) NOBID
10 |Joint Grouting, 8” dia, sanitary sewer Qty > 50 20 feach $0.00 NO BID.
11 |Joint Grouting, 10" dia, sanitary sewer Qty <50 20 Jesch $0.00 NO BID
12 |Joint Grouting, 10” dia, sanitary sewer  |Oty>50 20 |each $0.00 | NOBID
13 |Joint Grouting, 12” dia, sanitary sewer |0ty <50 20 lesch 50.00 ] NOBID
14 |Joint Grouting, 12” dia, sanitary sewer > 50 20 feach 50.00| NOBID
15 [Joint Grouting, 15” dia, sanitary sewer <50 20 |each $0.00 | NOBID
16 [Joint Grouting, 15” dia, sanitary sewer _ |Qty> 50 20 jeach 5000 NOBID
17 GrnutlnE over 2.5 ﬂonh per ﬂon 20 [per gailon $0.00 NO BID
TOTAL - GROUP 1, SECTION D IL_NO Biis

(items 1-17)

——

Lanzo Trenchless
Hinterland Group, Inc. || Insituform Technologies,|| J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South VacVision Environmental
Riviera Beach, FL LLC Chesterfield, MO St.Petersburg, FL Deerfield, FIL. __| LLC T FL
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended

L Pricing _J Pricig ||  Pricing 1 Pricing || [Pricing [ Pricing i  Pricing _J Priciog § Pricley
35000 [S  7.00000 15 434.00[S  8,680.00( s350.00[S  7.000.00] s$650.00 [S 1300000 |  $350.00 |5 7,000.00
53000015 600000/S 40900 S 8180.00] 5350.00]S 700000 $65000]S 13,0000 5350005 7,000.00]
$35000|S  7.000.00['s 454005 9.080.00] s25000|s 500000 sss000ls 11,000.00] s3so0n|s  7.000.00
$30000 /S 6000.00)(S 42200[S 844000 s25000 |5  5.000.00] S 11,00000] $350.00[s  7.000.00]
53500 | $ 70000 3680 [ § 73600 || _ 51500 S 30000]  s1000fs 220000 s5000[S 100000
s 70000 31605 632.00 | $1500 5 30000} s11000[S  220000( $5000]S  1,000.00
$35.00 | § T00001lS 3680 |S 736.00 $100.00 | § 2,000.00 5300.00 | § 6,000.00 $12000 | § ZAQLM_
008 50000(($ 2630]S 526.00 ) $10000 ]S .00 $300.00 ) § 6,000.00 $12000 | § 2,400.00
$25.00 | § 5000058 4000158 800.00 560.00 | § 1,200.00 $300.00 | § 6,000.00 $12000 | § 2,400.00
$25.00{ § 5000015 2950 (% 590.00 560.00 | § 1,200.00 5300.00 | § 000.00 $120.00 | § 2,400.00
§$2500] 5% 50000118 42108 842.00 $60.00 | § 1,200.00 $400.00 | § 8,000.00 $120.00 | § 2.400.00
$30.00s 600.00 (/S 3160 (s 632.00(  $60.00 |5 120000 540000 |S 800000 $12000]S  2.400.00
$30.00 | 600.0011S 453019 906.00 $80.00 | § 1,600.00 $500.00 | §  10,000.00 $120.00 | § 2.400.00
$30.00 | § 60000)(s  42.10(s 84200 sso00]s 160000 s$50000fS  10000.00] size00]s 240000
$35.00 | § 70000]ls s260(s 1052001 ssooos 160000 5600005 _ 12.000.00] sis000]S  3,000.00]
s 700.00(S 5790|s  1,158.00) s80.00S  1.600.00] 560000 |5 1200000] si5000|s  3,000.00
$15.00 ) § ML.W 5 13 § 264_.!0 glﬂl.ﬂl’ $ M $80.00 1 S 1@& $50.00 ! &

s 336001 | 7Y s _sane s tomome0]

S ___56,200.00
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BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS ' _ - Lanzo Trenchless
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation - BLD Services, LLC Hinterland Group, In¢, || Insituform Technologies, || J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South VacVision Environmental}f
Services) Kezzez. LA Riviera FL swlc_ra-_ﬂg FL Deerfield, FL___ !l LLC Tampa, FL
Est
Annval | Unit of Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Description S_ize Messure § Pricing || Pricin Pricing | Pricing || Pricing _} _Pricing | Pricing T
GROUP 1, SECTIONE
scellaneo) 5
Mechanical cutting for grease or mineral
1 deposits (heavier process than root cutting,
rmtashuvy as tuberculation cutting (all J _
sizes 30_ |linear foot $0.00 NO BID $3000) S 900.00)(S 110.00{S 3,300.00 $1500 | § 450.00 $50.00 | § 1,500.00 $20.00 600.00
2 Main line air testing and grounting of joints NO BID
(8" -24™) 1000 _fes pipe joint $0.00. : $ 45000.00(S 59.00|% 5900000 S100.00(% 1 0.00 $500.00 § § 0.00 $150.0018 1 .00
3 |Void grouting by the cubic yard 2 oine}  $0.00 | NOBID H 2000005 1950015 390.00|| $275.00|§ 550.00 || $5.000.00 | $  10,000.00 $300.00 | 8 600.00
Traffic Control | . s -
4 |Flagman (each) 2 |peraay . §0.00| NOBID $500.00 | § 1,000.00; § 30060 | § 600.00 || §650.00 | § 1,300.00 $400.00 | § 800.00 11  $500.00 | § 1,000.00 |
5 |Arrowboard (each) 2 fperd $0.00| NOBID $250.00 | § 50000 || $1,300.00 | § 2,600.00 53500 | § 70.00 $150.00 | § 300.00 $500.00 | § 1,000.00
6 |Barricades (each) 2 lperds $0.00 ] NO BID §25.00 | § 5000(8 1950|8 39.00 50 |8 1.00 $2.00 | § 4.00 $50.00 ) S 100.00
7 |Lane dividers (each) 4 $0.00| NOBID $ 10000l 32405 12060 { $100.00 | 400.00 5250.00 | § lm $100.00 | § 400.00
8 |Variable message board 4 $0.00 | NOBID s 1400.00|/S 650.00|S 2,600.00 $55.00 | 8 220.00 $500.00 $100.00 | § 400.00
9 |Light tower 2 [perds $0.00 || NO BID 00| S 300001iS 195008 390.00 $2500| S 50.00 $150.00 | § 300.00 $500.00 | § 1,000.00
10 Easement access, additional less than 12" NO BID
diameter 100 _ [tinear foot $0.00§ ) 10.00 | § 1,00000((s 520(S 520.00 5150} § 150.00 §50.00 | § 5,000.00 51000 | S 0.00
1 Easement access, additional greater than | NO BID
12" diameter 100 jlinear foot $0.00 10.00 | § 1,000.00 1} § 650} S 650.00 $2.50 | S 250.00 550001 8 5,000.00 $5000 | 5 5,000.00
12 |Wellpointing / dewatering 1 jump sum $0.00| NOBID _ .00 | § 5,400.00 | § 4,540.00 | 5 4,540.00 || $4.500.00 | § 4,500.00 J{ $20,000.00 | §  20,000.00 || $10,000.00 10,000.00
Mobilization / Demobilization (projects in
13 |excess of $100,000), including Performance
and Payment Bond 100000}% 50.00 | NOBID 40%| S 08 loavs s 00 50%| § 5,000.00 mk S 500000 3.00%| §  3,000.00
lMobilizuuon / Demobilization (projects
14 |less than $100,000), without Performance
and Payment Bond 2_5000 % $0.00 NO BID 3.0%| § 750.00 1l 1S 2. &fHL00 50%] § .00 30 ﬁwl 5.00%| 1,250.08
TOTAL - GROUP 1, SECTIONE RO B> s .00 | I X T |LS__114,191.00 57 | S48 @
(items 1-14)
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BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS Lomzo Thenchioss
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation i BLD Services, LLC Hinterland Group, Inc. || Insituform Technologies,§  J.I.V. Incorporated Technologies South || VacVision Environmental
Services) Kenner, LA Riviera Beach, FL. LLC Chesterfield, MO Meﬁeﬁburg,__F_'_L Deerfield, FL LLC 1 lampa, FL
Est.
Annusl|  Unit of Extended | Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Description Size Qty § Measure | Pricing | Pricing | ML Pricing Pricing Priging Pricing || Pricing Pricing Pricing || Pricing Pricing |
—
GROUP E A
Method 2
Pipe Reconstruction - CIPP
|Cnred—!n—]’lace-Plge‘ L
1 Sanmitary sewer mains 8" diameter
7.5mm normal thickness (.295)
3 -5 500 r fool $0.00 = $ 210&.00 $ - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 | NO BID $0.00 NO BID
6 -9 500 foot $0.00 $  210,000.00)(s - NO BID $0.00 | NOBID $0.00 | NOBID 50.00 | NOBID
10'-12' 500 _|uinear foot $0.00 = s _21000000)s - NO BID 5000 NOBID s000| NOBID 5000 NOBD
13' - 18" 500 |uinear foot $0.60 $ 210,000.00 )i S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
i6' - 20" 500 |imear foot $0.00 $  210,000.00) § - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
21' - 25" 500 |linear foot $0.00 $  210,000.00) 5 - NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
26" - 30" 500  |linear foot $0.00 b 210,000& 3 - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
2 Sanitary sewer mains 10" diameter
7.5mm normal thickness (.295)
|3' -5 500 |itnenr foot $0.00 $ 21000000 S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID
6'-9' 500 Junear foot $0.00 $ 210,000.00 ) S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50,00 NO BID
10'-12" 500 _Junear toot $0.00 S 210000001s - NO BID 50.00 | NOBID $0.00| NOBID $0.00 |  NOBID
13'- 15 500 foot $0.00 $  210,000.00 5 - NO BID 30.00 NO BID $0.0 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
16' - 20° 500 foat $0.00 $  210,000.00 || S - NO $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
21'-25° 500 faat 50.00 5 21000000([s - NO BID $000| NOBID s000| NOBID NO BID
[267-30" 500 _|iiner foot $0.00 I S 210000005 - NO BID 50.00]  NOBID S000| NOBID 3000 NOBID
|
3 Sanitary sewer mains 2" diameter |
9mm normal thickness (.354)
3 -5 500 foat $0.00 §$  210,000.00 || § - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
' -9 500 ear fool $0.00 $  210,000.00 || S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
10'-12' 500 _junear foot 50.00 S _ 21000000 - NO BID 50.00 | NO BID $0.00 | NOBID §0.00 | NO BID
13' - 15" 500 _[unear foot 50.00 s 210000005 - NO BID $0.00 | NO BID $0.00| NO BID $0.00 | — NOBID
16 - 20" 500 finear foot $0.00 § 210,00000] % - NO BID 50.00 NO BID 506.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID
21' - 25° S00_|iinear foot $0.00 $  210,000.00 )| § - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
26" - 30" 500 [umear foot $0.00 $ 210,000.00 || § NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
4 Sanitary sewer mains 15" dlameter
10.5mm normal thickmess (.413)
3'-5 500 |linesr foot $0.00 NO BID 5 250@00.00 5 - NO BID .00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID
[6-9 500 _[itnear foat 50.00| NOBID 5 25000000l - NO BID 50.00 | O BID 5000] NOBID $0.00 | NOBID
10'-12" 500 {linear foot $0.00 NO BID § 250,000.00) S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.60 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
13'- 15" 500 ear foot $0.00 NO BID § 250,000.00) $ = NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID S&Qﬂ NO BID
16' - 20' 500 foot $0.00 | NO BID $_ 250000.00(S - NO BID 5000 | NOBID $0.00 | NO BID $0.00| _ NOBID
21' - 258' 500 foot 50.00 | NOBID (s 250000008 - NO BID $0.00| — NOBID $0.00|  NOBID $0.00 |  NOBID
26' - 30' 500 |inesrfoot | $6.801 NOBID | s 25000000]s - NO BID $0.00| NOBID s0.80| NOBID 00| NOBID

IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx



BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS Lanti Treachlcs
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation [ BLD Services, LLC mmm Hinterland Group, Inc. J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South VacVision mlvmmultﬂr
Services) Kenner, LA _akewood Raueh, F1 St.Petersburg, FL Deerfield, FL LLC Tampa, FL
Est. 3
Anoual Ukt of ‘hemiled Extended Extended Extended
Description Size Qy | Messure | Pricing ing | Pricing ||  Pricing [ P i
5 Sanitary sewer mains 18" dinmeter
13.5mm normal thickness (.531) = 14
s NOBID | sl _ 1 s600.00]s 30000000fs - NO BID s0.00| NOBID s0.00| NOBID 5000 NOBID
6-9 NO BID o= i i | _s60000]S 300,000.00 1 $ - NO BID §0.00 NQ BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 | NO BID
10' - 12' NOBID f  suaw| woviip B $600.00 | S 30000000 - NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID
13' - 15 NOBID | sS4 {=K $600.00 | §  300,00000 |8 = NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
16' - 20" NOBID |  sape| womp | $600.00 S  300,000.00 [ S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NC BID $0.00 NO BID
21' - 28' NO BID ) MK _i_$60000 |5 300,00000(5 - NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
26' - 30° NOBID | semo| _ 1 se0000]s 30000000((S - NO BID $0.00 |  NOBID 5000 NOBID _s0.00|__NOBID
¢ I!mmm - . —
6" sewer flow NOBID § T i 00| § 4,00000 1§ - NO BID $0.00 | NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
8" sewer flow NOBID |  sa@| =it $4.0018 12,000.00 | $ - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 | NO BID
|10" sewer flow NO BID 3 3 § $400|S 12000008 - NO BID 50.00 | NOBID $0.00 | NOBID $0.00| NOBID
12" gewer flow NOBD | E 1 s400fS5  1200000)s - NO BID 50.00|  NOBID $0.00] NOBID s0.00| NOBID
15" sewer flow NO BID L Nomn 55005  20,000.00 S - NO BID 50.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
18" sewer flow NO BID | ~$Ap o B 5500 1S 20,000.00 3| § - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
20" sewer flow NOBID § NIk = $500 |5  20,000.00 || § - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID __50.00 NO BID
24" sewer flow NOBID | s __ L $1200|S .00 I § = NO 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO $0.00 NO
30" sewer flow NOBID | _NO | _s1200ls 00(s - | NOBID $0.00 | NOBID $0.00| NOBID $0.00|  NOBID
36" sewer flow NO BID =} = $20.00 [ §  80,000.00 | § - NO BID 50.00 NO BID __50.00 NO BID $0.00 | NO BID
142" sewer flow NO BID x 2 G $20.00 |5 80,000.00 | $ - NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 | NQ BID
48" sewer flow NOBID § = I _s200]s s - NO BID $0.00 | NOBID $000] NOBID 5000 NOBID _
54" sewer flow NO BID Y L L 52000 | §  B80,000.000 % - NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
>54" sewer flow NOBID §  seon| » | s00{s 2000000|s - NO BID $0.00 | NOBID 5000 { NOBID 5000 _ NOBID
7 By-passing pumping pump sct up S
4" pump 5 pereach 50.00 NO BID == ! & 8750008 3,750.00 H - NO BID 50.60 | NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
6" pump 5 |pereach $0.00 NOBID § . = $750.00 | § 2{1’50.00 3 - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID
8" pump 5 lpereach s000| NoBID | el 00]s — 5000.00fs - NO BID 5000 | NOBID 50.00 | NOBID $0.00 | NO BID
10" pump 5 |pereach s0.00] NOBID || __Is120000(s 6o0000f[s - NO BID 50.00 |  NO BID 50.00| NOBID 5000 | NOBID
12" pump 5 [percach so00] mNommp | i _ I siso000]s  7.50000[is - NO BID __50.00| NOBID 50.00] NOBID $0.00 | NOBID
8 Pump Operation er hour/per —
4" pump 6 NOBID |  sesn| ~Nowmm $500.00 | § 3,000.00 || § - NOBID | $0.00 | NOBID 50.00 NO $0.00 NO BID
6" pump 6 NOBID § == 1 Sss00.00]S 3,00000 1S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID
r8" pump 6 NO BID 1 |1 - | 55000018 3,000.00 {i $ - NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.0 NO BID
10" pum 6 NO BID = = D $500.00 | § 300000l S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
12" pum & NOBID _f == = 0 s a NO BID S0.00| NOBID || S0.00| NOBID
e —— e ——— m—— —
TOTAL - GROUP 2, SECTION A NO BID MO v $ 8!337@0.0{1 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID
(items 1-8) — == el
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BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS

items 1-17)

(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation BLD Services, L1.C
Services) B Kenner, LA
Est.
Annual§  Unit of Extended
Description SizmeL Messure Pricins E
UP 2. SECTION B
tems )
Mechanical cutting for grease or mineral
1 deposits (heavier process than root cutting,
not as keavy as tuberculation cutting (all
sizes) 30 Jumear fool $0.00 NO BID
Main line air testing and grouting of joints >
2 |@"-24m 1000 les pige jnt]__ s0.00]  NOBIP
3 |Void grouting by the cubic yard 2 leapipejoim)  $0.00| NOBID
4 |Lateral cleaning 1000 _{iinesr foot $0.00 | NOBID
Traffic Control |
5 |Flagman (each) 2 |perday 50.00 | NOBID
6 |Arrowboard (each) 2 |perasy 50.00 | NOBID
7 |Barricades (each) 2 lperany 30.00 | NOBID
8 |Lane dividers (each) 4 $0.00 NO BID
9 |Variable message board 4 $0.00 NO BID
10 |Light tower 2 er $0.00 NO BID
11 |Hammer tap removal 5 |percach $0.00 | NOBID
Easement access, additional less than 12" >
1 diameter 100 |unear foot $0.00 WL
Easement access, additional greater than |
D 12" diameter 100 |tinear foot $0.00 WYL y
14 |Blind shot set up 50 IE each $0.00 NO BID
15 Wellpoinﬁn_gl dewatering 1 Jlump sem 50.00 NO BID
Mobilization / Demobilization (projects in
16 | axcess of $100,000), including Performance}
and Payment Bond 100000 |% 50.00 NO BID
Mobilization / Demobilization (projects
17 |less than $100,000), without Performance
and Payment Bond 25000 |% $0.00 NO RID
TOTAL - GROUP 2, SECTION B NO/BID

Lanzo Trenchless
Hinterland Group, Inc. || Insituform Technologies, J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South VacVision Environmental
Riviera FL I.I.CCMM_ FL Deer%ﬂ. LLC "gﬂ
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Tricing || Pricing 1 Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing P Pricing Pricing Pricing
5 900.00 (i $ - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID
s 4sowcells - | momm sog0| NOBID s000|  NoBD sogo | NOBID
$1,000.00 | § 2,000.00 ! $ - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
1000 | $  10,000004iS - NO BID 50.00 | NOBID $0.00 | NOBID 50.00 | NO BID
5 - NO BID
$50000 s 1.00000)s - NO BID 00| NOBID 50.00] NOBID 5000 | NOBID
525000 ) § 500.00 )| § - NO BID 50,00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
52500 | § 50.00{ 8 - NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
$2500 | § 100.00 || $ - NO BID $0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO $0.00 NO BID
S 1,400.00 |{ § - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
$150.00 | 5 300.00ts - NO BID §50.00 | NO BID 50.00 |  NO BID $0.00 | NOBID
53000 1 S 1,500.00 { § - NO BID 30.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID
100015 100000fls - NO BID T $0.00| NOBID gy RO
00015 1000005 - NO BID 50.00 i ] $0.00 | NOBID sog0| NOBID
5500005 2500000 5 - NO BID §0.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID 50.00 NO BID
$540000 | § 5400005 - NO BID 5000 | NOBID 5000 |  NOBID $000 | NOBID
40%i $ 400000015 - NOBID | 50.00] NOBID | 50004 NOBID 3000 ] NOBID |
30%| $ 750.00 | § - NOQ BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID S8.00 NO
3 99.900.00 | NO BID NO BID NO NO

IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xisx



BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS

(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation Insituform Technologies, |  J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South VacVision Environmental|
Services) LLC Chesterfield, MO St.Peters FL FL LIC T FL
— .
Annual|  Unit of Extended Extended Extended Extended
Duc_gpﬁon Size Qty ] Measure Pricin, Pricin| Pricin Pricing Pg!_:_ Pri
GROUP 3 - SECTION A
Li ole R jol
Method 1
anhole a
Col ion P jon o ol
1 Corrosion protection L
1/4" thickness (6mm) - 48" 40_|vertica foot 5 22.00]s  9280.00 $0.00 |  NO BID 50.00 | NOBID s30000 s 12,000.00
1/4" thickness (6mm) - 60" 20 [vertical foot §' $ 273.00]5  5.460.00] $0.00 NO BID $0.00 | NOBID 37500 [$  7,500.00
1/4" thickmess (6mm) - 72" 15 |vertical foot S 330005  4.950.00] $0.00 | NOBID $0.00 | NO BID $452.00 | § 780.00
2 Imjection Grouting
20 $§ 335.00|S  6.700.00 s0.00 |  NOBID $0.00 | NOBID $350.00 7,000.00
20 manhole S 615008 $0.60 | NO BID $0.00 |  NOBID $500.00 [§  10,000.00
20 manhote $ 100500 |5  20.100.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $600.00 | $  12,000.60
20 manh $ 134000 ]S 26,800.00 | 50.00 |  NO BID so00l NOBID | $700.00)S  14,000.00
20 rmanh $ 167500 [§  33,500.60 $0.00 | NO BID 5000 | NOBID $1,000.00 [ §  20,000.00
3 |vacuum | NPT — s 16750 )¢ _6,700.00 s0.00| _NOBID ﬂ_-!_ﬂ' NO BID nﬁmﬁ 6,000.00
4 |Removal of existing finer | |20 |rertica) foot §  610]S 122.00 $0.00 | NOBID $0.00| NoBID s175.00 |8 3,500.00
5 |Void | | 40 Jeubic yara s _snzools  20,080.00 $0.00 [ NO BID $0.00 | NOBID _S200.00S___ 800000
TOTAL - GROUP 3, SECTION A : 5 145,992.00 L _NOBID [L__NO BID . 106,780.04

(items 1-5)

IFB 15-1599BLS Sanitary Sewer Stormwater Line Manhole Rehab Serv.xlsx



BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS Tmn Treniilion
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation i BLD Services, LLC GMIL Coatings, LLE | Hinterland Group, Inc. || Insituform Technologies,|  J.T.V. Incorporated Technologies South VacVision Environmental
Services) Kesaer LA ood Ranch, FL Riviera FL LLC MO mﬁ%n Deerfield, FL LLC T FL
Est.
Amnval ] Unit of Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Description Size Qy |} Measure | Pricin Pricing Pritin Pri | Pricing | Pricing Priciug Pricing | Pricing Pricing |
GROUP 3, SE B = T
Line & Manhole Rehabiljtation -
Method 2
anhole Surfaci
S Rehabilitation =
1 lication - = = —
1/2" thickness (13mm) 40 [verticatioot]  $0.00] NOBID ; — 520000 |$ 8000001 31270 S 12508008 - NO BID 50.00 | NOBID $500.00 [ § 20,000,600
1" thickness (25mm 20 |fverticaifost]  $0.00| WO BID i dooieo) $23000]s _ 4,60000]s 363.00]S 7260005 - NO BID 5000 |  NOBID $900.00 | §  18,000.00 ||
2 (Bench /imvert repair | 20 fper mah se.00f NOBID | 3 $300.00 | g0000|s 25130]s  soz600ffs - | NOBID $0.00 | __NOBID $300.00|S _ 6,000.00
e T
3 Injection grouting = i —
Manhole depth 0' to 5' | 1 §$750.00 [§ 1500000 335.10(s J02.00lls - NO BID $0.00| NOBID 535000 S 7,000.00]
Manhole depth - 5'1" to 10' = N 5850.00 | S  17,00000[(S 61430 ]S  12286.00(s - NO BID 5000 | NOBID $500.00 [ $__ 10,000.00
Manhole depth - 10'1" to 15' a s — 1,200.00 [§  24,000.00|[s 100520 [  20,104.00[is - NO BID $0.00 | _NOBID $600.00 | $ _ 12,000.00
Manhole depth - 15' 1" to 20' A & ol 00|S  40,000.00['s 134030 |5  26806.00(5 - NO BID $0.00} NOBID 370000 | §  14,000.00
Manhole depth - 20'1" and over ; 5 $3.500.00 [ 70,000.00|S 1,675.40]S  33508.00(s - NO BID $0.00 | NOBID $1,000.00 [$ _20,000.00
4 [Void grouting | 1 _simpels __.“__“_ s800.00 |$  1600000f(s 31830fs  6366.00{s - [ NOBID s000] NoBID 5200005 4,000.00
5 [Vacuum jet cleaning ] 1 | 20 foer manho s000] NOBID §  Sesedels A $20000 | 400000/l 16750[% 335000fs - | NOBID 50.00 | NOBID $150.00 [ 3,000.00
6 [Removal of existing liner i il | 20 Jrertenitonc]  $0.00] NOBID | 510000 [S  200000(s  &10(S 12200fs - | NOBID $0.00| _ NOBID $175.00 [§  3,500.00
=
7 assing pumpi 8-72"  dismeter : —
8" sewer flow 3000 funear foot 50.00| NOBID e $4.00 |S  12,000.00/lS 840§  25200.00(§ - NO BID $0.00| NOBID 5200 (S 6,000.00
10" sewer flow 3000 |unearfot §  $0.00] NOBID |  sisals s400($ 1200000ks so0fs 26700.00)s - NO BID $0.00 | NOBID §2.00 [$  6,000.00
12" sewer flow 3000_|linear foot s0.00| NOBID | ol  sso0|S  12000000fs  1120[s  3360000[s - NO BID_ 50.60 | NOBID 2005 6,000.00]
15" sewer flow 4000 _[inear foot so.00] NOBID [ shaels S4.00 18  16000.00]s 14005 56.000.00)s - NO BID 50.00 | NOBID $500|$  20,060.00
18" sewer flow 4000 |umesrfoot §°  $000] NOBID §  Sausis ss00(s  2000000((s 1400]s S600000ffs - NO BID 50.00 | NOBID $8.00 S 32,000.00
20" sewer flow 4000 'umr.m so.0] NoBD § (= 55.00 |$  20,00000((s 2090 |5 83.600.00(s - NO BID 50.00 | NOBID $10.00 | S _ 40,000.00
24" gewer flow & 4000 _unear foot so.00] Nomm | sy 3 | sso0]s 200000015 20505 83.600.00( s - NO BID $0.00 | NO BID 52000 | S 50,000.00
30" sewer flow 4000_|linear foot so.00| NOBID | suasis $1200 |5 48,000.00['s 34605 138400.00fs - NO BID 50.00 | NOBID _$25.00 [ S 100,000.60
36" sewer flow 4000 |unear foot so00] NoBID | ssasls §12.00 [  4800000)S 3460 (S 1384000015 - NO BID $0.00 | NOBID 53000 | §  120,000.00
42" sewer flow 4000 _[inear foot s0.0u [ NOBID NOL6T e s2000 |5 80,00000)'s 3520)% 140.80000(ls - NO BID s00¢|  NO B $35.00 | §  140,000.00
48" sewer flow 4000 Junear foot 5000] NOBID §  Sa67|% $2000 |5  80000.00(S 37.70 |5 15080080l - NO BID $0.00 | _ NO BID $50.00 | $ 200,000.00
54" sewer flow 4000 _[tinear foot se00| NoBmD | = 52000 [S  80.00000ls 4130|5 16520000([3 - NO BID $0.00 | NOBID $75.00 | §  300,000.00
[>5" sewer flow 2000 _unear foot s000] NoBD | sexsls s2000{S  40000.00[ls 44705 8o4d00.00]s - NO BID $0.00 | NOBID $100.00 [ 200,000.00
8 Manhole rim replacement = e -
1-5 12‘{5.,.* $0.00| NoBID § | 2 | 5120000 [$  14400.00((S 139610 |5 1675320y - NO BID $0.00 | _NO BID 51,300.00 | $ _ 15,600.00
6-10 15 [per each se.00] NoBiD § == 580000 [§ 1200000 ||s 1.228.60 |S 18429005 - NO BID $0.00 | _ NOBID 51,300.00 [ $_ 19,500.00 |
11-20 15 each $0.00 [ NOBID [ $800.00 | $  12,000.00|S 100520 [S 1507800 - NO BID $0.00 [ NOBID §1,300.00 [ $ _ 19,500.00
20 plus 15 |pereach so00] _Nom {_sesmedis $800.00 | § 120000015 1.00520 |S 150780005 - NO BID 5000| NOBID $1,30000 | $ _ 19,500.00
TOTAL - GROUP 3, SECTION B N Bt oy E= (LS_ 745.000.00 § 1,387,076.2¢ {L__NO BID NO BID 5_1,441,600.00
(items 1-8) g
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BID FORM - IFB #15-1599BLS
(Sanitary Sewer, Stormwater, Line & Manhole Rehabilitation BLD Services, LLC oML mm
Services) Kenner, LA ' Lakewnod Raneh, |
Est. !|_ B e
Annusl||  Unit of Extended | | Eumsded
. Description Size Oty || Messure || Pricing | Pricin Pricing |
GROUP 3, SECTION C
Miscellaneous Items
Traffic Control : =

1 s0.00] NOBID | i

2 $0.00 NO BID alr= ¥

3 50.00 NO BID = -

4 30.00] NOBID § -

5 $0.00 NO BID 3 F

6 s000] NOBID |

= - " ‘;‘1 |7 oy
O B ! ~ 4]
7 50.00 NOBD § 7- A% &
¢ sl L

8 any sag0| NOBD 1

9 We]lmlnti_ng' / dewatering $0.00 NO BID
Mobilization / Demobillzation (projects in i & [T .

10 |excess of $100,000), including Performance) 2 -
and Payment Bond 100000)% $0.00 NOBID | pms |s |
Mobilization / Demobilization (projects ="y [E .

11 fless than $100,000), without Performance =5 e
and Payment Bond 25000 fv £4,00 NCRBID § —— 304,

TOTAL -GROUP 3, SECTION C NOBID |
. - () _l'. e
(items 1-11)
BID FORM SUMMARY BLD Servicer O a "
GROUP 1 NO BID 57 '
GROUP 2 NO BID '\}:' -
GROUP 3 NO DI .
Group i, Section A Ne-Bld ¥ g
Group 1, Section B No-Bid v .
Group 1, Section C Ne-Bid - 2
Group 1, Section D Mo Bid o '
Group 1, Section E Fie-Bid
' — #
Group 2, Section A S  Ne B
Group 2, Section B Cemdle [ =
] ==
Group 3, Section A vrtren .
Group 3, Section B Ne-Bid
Group 3, Section C ¢ NeBld  _ EEEEE
eI A
L]

Lanzo Trenchless
| Hinterland Group, In¢, || Insituform Techrologies. |  J.T.V, Incorporated Technologies South VacVision Environmental|
. Riviera Beach, FL LLC Cllesterﬂcl% MO St.Petersb FL Deerfield, FL LLC Tampa, FL
|
Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
i Pricing Pricing | P Prici Pricing Pricing || Pricing || Pricing |
5500.00 | § 1,000.00 [[§  300.00 | § 600.00 | S - NO BID NO BID |__$500.00|§__ 1,000.00
$250.00 | § 500.00§ $ 130000 )5 2.600.00 || § - NO BID 50.00] NOBID | $50000|8 1,000.00
$25.0018 500005 1950 |§ 3900 S - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $50.00 | § 100.00
D)% 100.00§  3250)8 130.00 || 8§ - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $100.00 | § 400.00
s 140000 )|S 64800 | § 2.592.00 || § - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $100.00 | § 400.00
$150.00 | 300008 19500)$ 39000 § - NO BID $0.00 NO BID $500.00 | § IM
: oap|S  LO00OOs 5204 5000 NO BID so00|  nomm siogo |5 L0000
10.00 s 1,000.00 }{ $ 650 |8 650.00 s . NO BID $0.60 NO BID $10.00 5 1,000.00
005 240000|S 4540005  dsde00lls - NO BID 5000 | NOBID 5100000 [5 100000
4.0% §  4,000.00 (i ] 10, LW di 0.0% NO BID 50.00 NO BID 3.0% 5 3,000.00
3.09% $ 750,00 [[IE8 3 2wl 0.0% NO BID §0.00 NO BID 4.0% $
L 5 Lt 00 |‘_:L'u'—'£ | NO BID n-%%- 3 10,900.00
' Hinterland Group Inc. Insituform Tech JTV Inc Lanzo Trenchless VacVision Enrironmentsl |
| 5§7,433,550.00 L9a¥h 571 b §7,141,956.00 B2 A2 454040 $8,325,950.00
|
X $8,936,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$992.450.08 § 15T 400 3y NO BID N1 BID $1.559.280.00
s LOTEAL00 | b |5 1,E38,040.00 | gyt MM | § 1,621, 166.00
$ 5,791,500.00 | 64810040 | § 5,296,000 00 | —————FI570u000 | § 5,981,500.00
$ 472400.04) || F——————83es00 | § 454,025.00 8—-——-—th s 491,800.00
$ 33,600.00 | F————— —dul st | 5§ 42,800.00 || F————1380iku | § 56,200.80
1] 63,400.00 ;-_—;—-—;ﬂ 3 114,191.00 § 35—~ -~ - = BET.LEABH 17;%
5 TARES0 0 | e _Gasn i 7.141.956.040 | ¢+ — - —— b S22 S 5L 83259
e == e = W ) B . o e —————
s A.BE7, 00100 Sa-ig No Bid R Riek No Hid
5 0, M) Teie B No Bid tﬂl No Bid
5 A AW Teadled N Bidd Pin-l.E Bid
5 B R L e — o ] No Bid o diied 4 186, TRU. B
3 TSN | e AR NR20 No Hid o Wi § LA 16080, 00
§ 1250000 | £ —— kAR Ni Bid T et y 1690000
3 T} [— e o i Nebid 1.5%5.780.00
#1 1 = - — = X
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